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-the smartest distance between 2 points
The smartest way to travel because it’s safer 
...more convenient... more economical. The 
next time you travel, travel Trailways, your
highway host from 

*Aik about free ui«
coast to coast.
ot now Continental Cameral.

SAMPLE LOW FARES

4-H Awards Made at Achievement Night;
Scouts to Hold Honor Court on May 25

By Mrs. K. G. Conner 
Phone 140M

LORANE — 4-H Achievement 
Night was held in the high school 
auditorium Friday evening spon­
sored by Lorane Parent-Teachers 
club. A short business meeting 
was held preceding the program 
with officers being elected for the 
coming year.

Mrs. Oren Jacobsen will serve 
as president; Mrs. Frank G. Ses­
sions. vice-president and Mrs. 
Wayne Coder was re-elected sec­
retary-treasurer.

The program opened with the 
flag salute and 4-H pledge. Doug­
las Burns brought in the Ameri­
can flag and Hazel Williamson 
carried the 4-H flag which was
made by the 4-H sewing 
stock members.

and live-

James 
leader, i 
monies.

Kotrc, camp cookery
of cere¿acted as master of cere- 

He introduced the local

Tew, second. Donna will receive 
a half camp scholarship from Lor­
ane PTC

Lively Livestock clu|>: Judy 
Conner, first; Robert Conner sec­
ond and Roberta and Douglas 
Burns tied for third. R.'bert Con­
ner will receive the PTC half 
camp scholarship as Judy already 
received one.

Busy Skillets Camp Cookery: 
John Meadows, first; Jack Wool­
ery. second. John will receive the 
PTC half camp scholarship.

Lorane Hereford club: Ned Pas-
co, first ; winner of PTC 
camp scholarship; Russell

loaders and Jack Gurton, county 
4-H agent.

The combined clul>s sang “She'll 
Be Coming Round the Mountain," 
followed by a demonstration on 
making "Pigs in a Blanket" by 
Jimmy Myers and John Meadows. 
Knot Demonstrated

Judy Conner and Caro) Cole­
man demons trail'd how to finish a j 
headscarf, then the combined ' 
group gave a club yell. Russell - 
Mitchell and Floyd Diess from the | 
Hereford club gave a knot tying 
demonstration and Jack Woolery 
and Billy Sayles explained how to 
make macaroni and cheese.

The combined group sang

half
Mit-
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NOTH E OF SHERIFF’S s \I E
tinel, a newspaper 01 
culation. printed and

general cir- 
aubhshed at

NOTICE is hereby that
by virtue of an execution and or-
der of foreclosure isued out

Cottage Grove, Oregon, and 
you be required to appear 
answer on or before the 18t) 
of June, 1953, the last day u

that 
and

pose of this sale to be 925 M bd 
tt. marked Douglas Fir No bid 
for less than $17.85 per M bd. ft. 
for the marked Douglas Fir, or a 
total purchase price of $16,511 25, 
will be considered. Minimum de-

of the Circuit Court of the State 
of Oregon for Lane County the 
20th day of May. 1953. upon and 
pursuant to a decree duly given 
and made by said Coutt the 18th 
day of May. 1953, in a suit pend-

ibed in said order 
first publication: May

21. 1953; date of last publication. 
June 11. 1953.

MAYNARD WILSON. ’Attorney 
for Plaintiff. 731 Main Street. Cot­

posit with bid, $1,450.00. SEALED 
BIDS All timber designated tor 
cutting on SW'.NE'^, WSNW^.

W1«. N4SWH. NWk
Sec 13, T. 20 S., R 6 W., 
estimated for the purpose 
sale to be 2085 M bd. ft.

SEU. : 
W M , 
of this

ing therein in
SCHNEIDER and

which W. A
MARY LOUISE

SCHNEIDER. were plaintiffs and 
W. W BROWN and MARGARET 
L. BROWN, husband and wife, 
and P. A. GENT were defendants, 
w hich execution and order of fore­
closure sale was to me directed

TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED
ST AT ES DEP A RTM E NT OF THE

Douglas Fir, 20 M bd. ft. Western
No bid for less than

or otherwise 
ting will lx

^T Timber marked 
designated for cut- 
offered for sale as

follows: BIDS will be received on

$19.15 per M Ixi. ft. for the Doug­
las Fir, $ 05 per M bd. ft. for the
West, tn Hemlock, or a total pur-
chase price of $40,028.75, will be 
considei > <1. Minimum deposit with 
bid. $2,650.00. All timber desig­
nated for cutting on SVjSE1», Sec. 
9. T. 16 S., R. 6 W„ W.M., esti­
mated for the purpose of this s»le 
to be 515 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir. 
No bid for less than $17.40 per M 
bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, or a 
total purchase price of $8,961.00, 
will b»’ ccnsidered. Minimum de- 
posit with bid. $1000.00. UPPER 
WILLAMETTE MARKETING 
AREA (1RAL AUCTION: GREEN 
SALE' All timlier designated for

as hereafter designated as 
or SEALED BIDS at 10 00 
PACIFIC STANDARD 
on June 18, 1953. by the

tracts 
ORAL
AM..
TIME.

the 
de-

and commanded me to sell 
real property hereinafterchell and Floyd Diess tied for sec­

ond place.
Mr. Gurton sjtoke briefly on 

benefits from 4-H club work and 
showed a motion picture "Cattle 
Country” made by the Union 
Pacific railway.

4-H girls served cookies and 
punch following the picture.
Junior-Senior Banquet

On Friday evening. May 22, the 
Junior Pirates of 1953 will enter­
tain the senior class with the an­
nual junior-senior banquet at the 
Lynwood cafe in Eugene.

The pirate theme will be 
carried out in table decorations 
menus, placecards and invitations. 
Richard Payne will welcome the 
seniors and Jimmy Singhose, pre­
sident of the senior class, will give 
the response.

Other guests will be school 
board members and their wives 
and teachers and wives.
Biu-cnlaiireute Set

Baccalaureate sermon f or 
eighth grade and high school 
garduates will be at Lorane 
Church of Christ with the Rev. 
Robert A. Green speaking on the 
subject “As Much As In Me Is."

It will begin at 7:30 p.m. Sun­
day, May 24 and there will be no 
Christian Endeavor or Adult 
Study classes that evening.

Boy Scout Court of Honor will 
be held in Lorane IOOF hall Mon­
day, May 25. A 7 p.m. potluck 
dinner will be served with parents 
and scout committee members as 
guests.

Awards which have been earned 
will be awarded later in the eve­
ning.

On Wednesday, May 27, the 
Senior class will present its Class 
Night program in the high school 
auditorium.

| Sunday will lie observed as

Grove has beeu assigned to the 
14th Infantry division at Fort 
Lewis, Wash,, for basic training. 
He is the son of Mr. and Mrs No­
va Avants and is a member of 
Company G, 130th Infantry Regi­
ment.

The first experimental aerial 
reconnaissance of troop move­
ments ifroma balloon! was made 
in May, .1862.

LEGAL NOTICES
NOTICE OF FIN \L 

SETTLEMENT

scribed to satisfy certain liens and 
charges in said decree specified, 1 
will on Tuesday, the 23rd day of 
June, 1953, at the hour of 10:00 
o’clock, A.M. at the southwest 
door of the County Court House 
in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, 
offer for sale and sell at public 
auction for cash, subject to re­
demption as provided by law, all

District Forester. Bureau of Land 
Management located at Room 212, 
Post Office Building. Eugene. Ore­
gon. Information concerning con-
dit ions of the including such

of the right, title and 
the defendants in said

interest 
suit and

of

all parties claiming by, through or
under them or any of them in or

items as qualification of bidders 
procedure for submitting bids, 
road access, marketing area re­
quirements, payments, and type of 
bond required, should be obtained
prior to flic

cutting on NW %
SWU, Sec 13 T. 30 S., R 1 W . 
W.M., estimated for the purpose 
of this sale to )>e 1995 M bd. ft. 
Douglas Fir, 65 M bd. ft. Western 
Hemlock, 15(. M bd. ft. Western 
Red Cedar. 25 M bd. ft. Incense 
Cedar No bid for less than $22.50 
l>er M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, 
$9.10 jier M bd. ft. for Hfr Wttt- 
ern Hemlock, $6.00 per m bd- ft. 
for the Western Red Cedar. $6 50

ale, from the above
The right ismentioned office, 

hereby reservedto the following described real 
property, to-w it:

Lots 3 and 4 in Block 6 of 
Grand Prairie Addition to the 
City of Eugene, as platted and 
recorded at page .50 of volume 
4 Lane County Oregon Plat 
Records, in Lane County, 
Oregon.
Dated this 20th day of May, 

1953.
SHERIFF LANE COUNTY, 

OREGON
By KENNETH D. BERGMAN,

nival defects in this advertisement 
and to reject any or all bids. The 
United States reserves the right 
to waive any informality in bids 
received whenever such waiver isNOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: 

That the undersigned Administra­
tor of the Estate of WILLIAM 
WALLACE McDOUGAI.L, also 
known as WILLIAM W. McDOU- 
GALL, Deceased, has filed his 
Final Account for final settlement 
of said estate in the Circuit Court 
of the State of Oregon for Lane 
County and that Monday, the 8th 
day of June, 1953, at 10:00 o’clock 
in the forenoon in the County 
Courthouse, Eugene, Lane County, 
Oregon, has been fixed by said 
Court as the time and place of 
healing of objections thereto and 
for final settlement of said estate.

I.ESTER E. BRISBANE. Admin­
istrator. RICHARD L. TH WING,

in interest the United
States. All volumes given 
limâtes and may be more

the

es

amounts. IN
OREGON: SI-

ft. for the InceWle Cf* 
total purchase price of 

will be considerisi 
deposit with bid, $4- 

40-2t-41

|x>r M bd. 
dar, or a 
$46,516,50, 
Minimum 
950.00.

USLAW RIVER MARKETING 
AREA: ORAL AUCTION: SAL­
VAGE SALES: All timber desig­
nated for cutting on SW'iNE'i, 
S'jNWU. N'nSWh, SW'iSW1*, 
NW'iSE'a, Sec. 1, T. 19 S„ R. 7 
W., W.M., estimated for the pur- 
|x>se of this sale to be 3461» M Ixi. 
It Douglas Fir, 90 M Ixi ft West­
ern Hemlock. 31:5 M bd. ft. West­
ern Red Cedar. No bid for less 
than $23.20 jx-r M bd. ft. for the 
Douglas Fir. $8.20 per M bd. ft. 
for the Western Hemlock, $6.85 
per M bd. ft. for the Western Red 
Cedar, or a total purchase price

“Home On the Range” and the 
program ended with a demonstra­
tion on making a pig delouser by 
Robert Conner and Robert Burns 
from the Lively livestock club.

Mrs. R. G. Conner, local leader, 
announced the following results 
of the Fair: Just So Gil 1 Sewing 
I: Connie Wyman and Judy Con­
ner, first; Lou Dell Doughty, sec­
ond and Trena Armitage and 
Johnnie Bell Johnson, third. Judy 
and Connie will each receive a 
half camp scholarship, one from 
Lorane PTC and one from Lorane 
Home Extension unit.

Sew Its Fun, Sewing II: Karen 
Lobek, first; Linda Coleman, sec­
ond and Barbara Coder, third. 
Karen will receive the half sum­
mer school scholarship from Lor- 
ane Grange.

Charmingly Yours, Sewing III: 
Donna Leach, first and Catherine

Attorney for Estate. 38-5t-42

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

40-5Í-44 I feputy.
-I MMOSS

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF 
THE STATE < )F < »REGI »N Ft >R 

THE COUNTY OF LANE
EDWARD P SABONJIAN, 

Plaintiff

14.10

Plu»

Salem
Portland

$9.80

Fed. Tom

WITH

family 
Curtin

Mill 
for a 
Frank

Arc and Acetylene

WELDING

(>.(><»
Northwest 
at Lorane 
a student

Christian College day
Church of 
from NCC

Christ and 
will bring

TRAILWAYS 
BUS DEPOT

811 Main, Cottage Grove Hotel 
Phone 88

Cottage Grove 
Welding Worses

Portable Welding Any Place 

1030 Madison —Phone 181-Y

the morning message.
Sunday was cleanup day at the 

IOOF cemetery and local IOOF 
members did a good job of getting 

! the cemetery in order for decora- 
I tion day.
! Mr. and Mrs. W. T. Moore and 
I Mr. and Mrs. C. B. Mitchell at­
tended the Pacific Northwest 
Shrine Convention at Ashland. 
They left Friday morning and re-

i turned home Sunday afternoon.
Mr. and Mrs. Chester Purdy 

I and Mr. and Mrs. Marion Purdy 
and Sandy Purdy attended the 
Show-de-O at the Eugene Fair­
grounds Sunday afternoon.

Todd Tennant attended the 
riding lesson session which is 
being given free at the Riding 
club grounds in Cottage Grove 
each Sunday afternoon at 1 p.m. 
Anyone may take these lessons 
whether or not he is a member of 
the riding club. The only require­
ment is that he must furnish his 
horse.

Measles are still taking a toll 
of people in the community both 
children and adults.

Mr. and Mrs. W. J. Leach and

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN 
that the undersigned has been ap­
pointed Executor of the Last Will 
and Testament of VIRGIL D. 
WHITE, Deceased, by the Circuit 
Court of the State of Oregon for 
Lane County, All persons having 
claims against said estate are 
hereby required to present the 
same, duly verified with proper 
vouchers, to the undersigned, at 
the law office of HERBERT W. 
LOMBARD, Wiser Building. Cot­
tage Grove, Oregon, 'within six 
months of the date of the first 
publication of this Notice. Dated 
and first published May 21, 1953.

VIRGIL FRANKLIN WHITE, 
Executor. HERBERT W. LOM-
BARD. Attorney. 40-5t-44
NOTICE OF SCHOOL ELEI TION 

UPON QUESTION OF
INCREASING TAX LEA Y OVER 

AMOUNT LIMITED BY 
SEI TION 11, ARTICLE XI.

STATE CONSTITUTION

Notice is hereby given that an
election will be held in Schoo) Dis­
trict No. U-14J of Lane County, 
State of Oregon, at Cottage Grove 
High Schoo' Cafeteria in said 
school district, I ,:■ the purpose of 
submittit , to the legal voters of 
said d -trict the r.ucstion of in- 
creasing the tax levy for the year
1956-54 < ci the
by section i 
Constitutio:

art
Creyón.

i unt 1 mited 
’c XI, of the

The reason Is merci rg such 
levy arc: 2 p.’ditioml teachers, 1

YOUR KITCHEN ECONOMICALLY

attended the carnival at 
and reported a fine time. 
Camp Birthday club met 
potluck dinner with Mrs 
Miracle Friday. Birthdays

of Mrs. Miracle and Mrs. Henry 
Tatum were celebrated. The af­
ternoon was spent with fancywork 
by the club members.

Subscribe to The Sentinel

additional Jani" icred costs
| of maintenance c e >o adding fa­
cilities. ’ z-

The amount of tax, in excess of 
the 6% limitation,-proiwsed to be 
levied for said year is $131,212 80

Dated this 41h day ol May. 1953.
W. L WORKMAN, 

” Board of
Attest :
CECIL CALDWELL,

District Clerk.

Chairman 
Directors.

m7-21

NOTICE OF 1953-51 BUDGET MEETING
Notice is hereby given that the Budget Committee ol the Southern 

Lane County Rurai Fire Protection District of Lane County. Oregon, 
has filed in the office of the levying board, to-Wit: The Board of Direc-
tors of said district, its detailed estimate of the total amount of money 
to be raised by taxes U[xm the taxable property with the said district 
as shown by the assessment roll last compiled by the County Assessor 
of I.ane County, Oregon, exclusive of timber land patrolled by the 
State Board of Forestry or in accordance with the rules and regula­
tions of the State Board of Forestry and not including and exclusive of 
railroad rights of way or improvements thereon or rolling stock mov­
ing thereon, and to be expended l»y said district lor all purposes lot 
the fiscal year July 1. 1953 to June 30, 1954, which estimates are asthe fiscal year July 1, 1953
follows:

EXPENDITl’RES:
Communication telephone,

JOHN N. LONG and THELMA G. 
LONG, husband and Wife, 

Defendants.
TO: JOHN N. LONG and THEL- 1)( $83,167.75, will be considered.
MA G. LONG, husband and wile, vimmnm deposit with bid. $4.-
defendants.

IN THE NAME (>FTHE STATE 
OF OREGON, You are hereby '

800.00. All timber designated for
cutting on E'a, E'áSE b NW'i,

See. 29, T. 16 S„
summoned and required to appear r 7 yy \v M.. estimated for the 
and answer the complaint of I)U1I>oS,. of this sale to be 9860 M 
plaintiff filed against you in thejijj n Douglas Fir, 5 M bd. ft. 
above entitled action on or before 1 Western Hemlock, 20 - M bd. ft.
the last day of the time prescribed Western Red Cedar. 

, L.....................................................1 . . , fl,.,, 0,1 ___in the order of publication, to-wit
On or before the 18th day ot June,

No bid for

A fill

less than $21.30 i>er M bd. ft. for
the Douglas Fir, $8.60 per M bd.

1953, and if you fail so to appear )t for the Western Hemlock. $7.05 
and answer, for want thereof, the IM,r m bd. ft. for the Western Red 
plaintiff will apply to the above Cedar .or a total purchase price of 
entitled Court for the relief prayed $210,202.00, will be considered.
for in the complaint, to wit : For 
a judgment in the sum of One 
Thousand Eighty Dollars plus in­
terest thereon at the rate of six 
percent from June 1, 1950, plus 
attorney fees in the amount of
Three Hundred Dollars and 
his costs and disbursements 
curred herein

for 
in­

This summons is published pur­
suant to an order made by the 
Honorable G. F. Skipworth, Cir­
cuit Judge of the State of Oregon, 
for County of Lane, on the 19th 
day of May, 1953, which order di­
rects this summons to be published 
once a week for four consecutive 
and successive weeks, five publi­
cations in the Cottage Grove Sen-

Minimum deposit with bid $8,- 
950.00. All timber designated for 
cutting on SW'-iSW'i. Lots 16

SWiSEh,and 13, NWkSE'i. Sw » 
Lot 17, Sec. 13. T. 15 S„ R. 7 W
W.M., estimated for the purpose 
of this sale to be 2275 M bd. ft. 
Douglas Fir, 35 M bd. ft. Western 
Hemlock. No bid for less than 
$19.80 per M bd. ft. for the Doug­
las Fir, $5.95 per M bd. ft. for 
-the Western Hemlock, or a total 
purchase price of $45,253.25, will 
be considered. Minimum deposit 
with bid, $2,900.00. All timber des­
ignated lor cutting on ESSWU, 
SWIiSEU, Sec. 31, T. 15 S„ R. 6 
W., W.M., estimated for the pur-

Electrical Wiring’ 
for Light, Heat ' 

and Power
Radiant and tan type 

electric heat
Kitchen and bath 
ventilating fans

Recessed lighting fixtures
Radio and TV Service

I

i

NELSON'S
Main Street and : 

River Road
on the West Side of Town

low" price may be 
a WARNING SIGNAL

DON’T BUY A 
PIG IN A POKE

Get a quality used (ar that is
PERSONALLY INDORSED AND GUARANTEED!

Just THE KIND of bright, gay, colorful 
kitchen you’ve always wanted—and the 
cost is amazingly low'. With dependable 
Colotyle TYLE-BORD quality, your walls 
stay bright and new—always easy to clean. 
Your choice of cheerful new Colotj lc

TYLE-BORD colors, created especially 
for Western living. What could give your 
home—your whole family—a bigger 
“lift”? Ask us about Colotyle TYLE- 
BORD to brighten your home today!

graph, radio and postage $ 
Office supplies, printing 
Election exjx-nse 
Sinking fund
Contract for protection
Emergency fund
Equipment

Total 
RECEIPTS:

Budget 
1953-54 

telc-
1 5.00

20.00
25.00

2.750.27
5.00O.00

500.00
875.00

$9,175.27

Ì950-51 1951-52 1952-53

$ 5.Q0 $ 5.00 $ 5.00
20 Ü0 20.00 20.00
25.00 25.00 25.00

3,687.58 2,991 82 3.249.58
3,125.(M) 5,000.00 5,(XN)00

50.00 250.00 250.00

$6,912.58 $8,29382 |8,519 M

To be raised by taxation
(3.0 mills levy on $3,058,424.00_
assessed valuation» $9,175.27

w hen you see a car advertised at a
"givc-away" prie«

member there mav lx
it’s wise to re- 

:i hidden reason
for that bargain, and you have no way 
of knowing what it is.
Our PERSONALLY INDORSED AND 
GUARANTEED.seal on late-model cars 
is your best proof of quality..?your pnxif
that our cars are sold exactly as

sented! And they are all reconditioned 
to perfection ... you'd be proud to own 
any one of them!
So shop where you can be sure! Come in 
and road test and ride test your favorite 
model. Choose in your own way, there’s 
no high pressure Pay as you drive, if you 
prefer! Down payment and monthly pay­
ments to fit your needs.

Special - f toek on Hand 
29c Sq. Ft. — Re¿;. Price 38c Sq. Ft

The outstanding indebtedness of this district is ..
These budget estimates may lie discussed with the Board of Direc­

tors, the levying board of said District, and any person subject to the 
proposed tax levy or levies will tie heard in favor of or against said

none.

SEE YOUR HUDSON DEALER

5£fl R 5 
• BUILDING SUPPLY 

tphan, »-cottage grove,ore.

proposed tax levy.
All [jersons are hereby notified that on Tuesday, the 2nd day of 

June, 1953, at 8:00 o’clock, in the afternoon of said day, at Walker 
Gym Building in said District, is the time and plafe set for such

LOOK FOR THIS SEAL

repre-

Your best used car buy carries this Seal 
of Quality on the windshield You'll 
find it only at your Hudson Dealer's!

discussions.
BUDGET COMMITTEE 
R. C. Oster. Chairman 
Albert E. Stacks 
William J Boyce 
Jacob Stalder 
Attest:
T R. Woolcott, Secretary 
Dated May 5, 1953,

BOARD OF DIRECTORS 
OF SAID DISTRICT

Charles Roner, President 
Vinal T. Randall. Secretary 
Attest:
Wayne E. Jenkins 
Lee C. Harrison

PETERSON-DULL MOTORS
1024 E. Main

«I
Ph. 613

“Look in classified under DON’T BUY A PIG IN A POKE 
for your best used car buys!”39-3tc-41


