

Where Butter Goes

Seventy-eight per cent of the butter produced is allocated to United States civilians. The 22 per cent of butter remaining is used as follows: 15 per cent for military uses, 6 per cent for lend-lease, and the small remainder for other special needs.

Paper Bags By the Million

Twenty paper bags per second, or 1,200 an hour, can be produced on the fastest paper bag machines in the plant of Union Bag & Paper Corporation in Savannah, Ga. This plant turns out 30 million paper bags of many sizes and types every day—seven billion a year.

MT. VIEW

Donald Patterson had the misfortune of having the small garden tractor and trailer fall over on him this last week but was lucky enough that no bones were broken. He received several bad bruises.

Jim Bridges would like to have several of the men come to the school house Saturday afternoon to help install the new slide for the school children. The school is getting more playground equipment so come out and help get it into use.

The parent-teacher club met at the school house Friday evening. Mrs. Bob Walls was elected treasurer. It was decided to have a question box for all problems of the school to be placed. Next meeting will be November 19th. This will be 4-H club meeting.

Neighborhood meeting will be at the home of Mrs. Ethel Seaver Nov. 3. At this time all members are asked to bring prints for quilt blocks which will be given to the Crippled Children Home in Eugene.

Mr. and Mrs. Monte Thornburg of Silk Creek were Sunday guests at the Herman Kanel home.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Boslaugh of Milwaukee and Mrs. Ralph Boslaugh of Cottage Grove were Sunday guests at the Mosby home.

Several children have been absent from school this week due to bad colds and the flu.

Mrs. Ethel Seaver is to be hostess for a Stanley party, Thursday morning at her home.

The New York Tribune was the first American paper to pass under corporate control.

—Subscribe To The Sentinel—

Elect

JOHN K. PRALL

Commissioner

For the best interests of Lane County

Taxes to a minimum

Jobs for returning soldiers

Protection of our forests

More and better roads for Lane County

**Ballot No. 38
Election Nov. 2**

World War I Veteran

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Regional Administrator, Bureau of Land Management, Region I, Swan Island Administration Building, Portland 18, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 a.m., Pacific Standard Time, November 9, 1948, for the purchase of all merchantable timber designated for cutting upon tracts and removal of the timber to be carried out in accordance with the forest practice rules approved on July 7, 1938, by the Secretary of the Interior. Each bid must state the amount per thousand feet, board measure, that will be paid for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber and a statement that the bidder will comply with local manufacturing requirements as hereinafter stated. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit. The deposit must be in cash or in the form of a certified check on a solvent bank and in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The amount of the deposit will be at least 20% of the first \$100,000.00 of the appraised value of the timber; an additional 10% of the next \$90,000.00; an additional 5% of the amount between \$10,000.00 and \$100,000.00; and an additional 3% of any amount in excess of \$100,000.00. The deposit will be returned to unsuccessful bidders upon the award of the bid; applied as part of the purchase price of the successful bidder; or retained as liquidated damages if the successful bidder does not within thirty days of acceptance of the bid execute contract and furnish satisfactory bond and satisfactory evidence of his ability to comply with the local marketing requirement. In sales over \$10,000.00, the successful bidder will be required to furnish a sworn financial statement in duplicate, showing ability to fulfill the financial requirements of the contract. In sales of \$5,000.00 or less, the deposit may be retained as a cash bond; in sales of more than \$5,000.00, surety bonds will be required as follows: more than \$5,000.00, but not more than \$10,000.00, at least 20% of the amount bid; more than \$10,000.00, at least 10% of the amount bid. In sales of \$10,000.00 or less, payment in full will be required prior to execution of the contract. In larger sales payments may be made in installments in accordance with contract payment schedule, dated March 1, 1948. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in the advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to the next highest qualified bidder when the officer authorized to approve the contract shall deem the right bidder unqualified to fulfill the contractual requirements of the advertisement. Timber sold in accordance with this advertisement must be manufactured within the marketing area as designated for each tract described below in accordance with the Orders of the Secretary of the Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. 2380 to 2390, Incl., dated December 11, 1946 and November 29, 1947, respectively. The United States has by agreement been given the right to authorize its purchasers to use certain roads and rights-of-way for the removal of timber. Each bidder should ascertain from the respective District Forester's office the location of the road or right-of-way covered by such agreement relating to the tract upon which he wishes to bid. It is the bidder's responsibility to determine for himself the extent to which such agreement will permit the use of the road or right-of-way subject to the payment of reasonable compensation to the assignor of the United States. Further information, including copies of the form of contract, bid forms and schedules of contract payments may be obtained at District Offices of the B.L.M., located at Salem, Eugene, Roseburg, Coos Bay, and Medford, or at the office of the Regional Administrator, Bldg. No. 1, Swan Island, Portland 18, Oregon. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 1st day of October, 1948. IN LANE COUNTY: SIUSLAH RIVER MARKETING AREA: T. 15 S., R. 7 W., W.M., Secs. 17, 18 and 20, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the SW 1/4 of Sec. 17, portion of the E 1/2 SE 1/4 of Sec. 18, portion of the N 1/2 NW 1/4 of Sec. 20, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 7035 M. feet Douglas Fir, 385 M. feet Hemlock, 70 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 1010 M. Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$12.68 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$5.74 per M.ft. B.M. for the Hemlock, \$4.00 per

M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, \$5.05 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$91,743.90, will be considered. The sale area consists of two blocks, surrounded by blazed lines, and connecting rights-of-way through seed reserves. One block contains 48.00 acres, made up of approx. 25.00 acres in the SE 1/4 SW 1/4, and approx. 3.5 acres in the SW 1/4 SW 1/4 of Sec. 17; approx. 3.0 acres in the NW 1/4 NW 1/4 and approx. 16.50 acres in the NE 1/4 NW 1/4 of Sec. 20. The second block contains approx. 50.00 acres, made up of approx. 16.25 acres in the SW 1/4 SW 1/4, approx. 10.5 acres in the NW 1/4 SW 1/4, approx. 13.5 acres in the NE 1/4 SE 1/4, and approx. 9.75 acres in the SE 1/4 SE 1/4 of Sec. 18. The connecting right-of-way are made up of approx. 40 acres in the NW 1/4 NE 1/4, and approx. 1.00 acre in the NE 1/4 NW 1/4 of Sec. 20; and approx. 1.6 acres in the S 1/2 SW 1/4 of Sec. 17. All other timber on the remaining 179 acres is reserved from cutting including blazed line trees. T. 18 S., R. 6 W., W.M., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NW 1/4 and portion of the N 1/2 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2320 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock, 25 M. feet Red Cedar, 950 Lineal Feet Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$11.35 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$5.40 per M.ft. B.M. for the Hemlock, \$4.05 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, \$5.05 per Lin.ft. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$26,533.75, will be considered. The roads which now traverse the sale area must be kept open to the satisfaction of the right of way permittee and the officer in charge of the sale. The sale area is described as follows: In the NE 1/4 NW 1/4, an area of approx. 28.1 acres lying North and West of a well-blazed line. In the NW 1/4 NW 1/4, an area of approx. 1.2 acres lying in the northeast corner and 2.8 acres lying in the southeast corner of the forty and respectively defined on the Southwest and Northwest by well-blazed lines. In the S 1/2 NW 1/4, an area of approx. 67.6 acres lying North and West of well blazed lines. In the NE 1/4 SW 1/4, an area of approx. 3.25 acres lying North of a blazed line and in the NW 1/4 SW 1/4, an area of approx. 1.0 acres lying in the northwest corner of the forty and bounded on the South and East of a blazed line. The total number of acres involved in this sale is 103.95, and all other timber, including the blazed trees themselves are reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 4 W., W.M., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S 1/2 NW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2720 M. feet Douglas Fir, 100 M. Feet White Fir, 175 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$10.10 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M.ft. B.M. for the White Fir, \$3.35 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$28,478.25; will be considered. 9-4t-12

SUMMONS

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR LANE COUNTY

JOHN NOWAK, a single person, Plaintiff,

vs.

F. D. WHEELER and EVA C. WHEELER, his wife; H. O. THOMPSON and MAE W. THOMPSON, his wife; J. W. WILSON and IDA A. WILSON, his wife;

The unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown, claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein. Defendants.

TO: F. D. WHEELER and EVA C. WHEELER, his wife; H. O. THOMPSON and MAE W. THOMPSON, his wife; J. W. WILSON and IDA A. WILSON, his wife; The unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown, claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiff filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication to-wit: On or before the 25th day of November, 1948; and if you fail to so appear and answer for want thereof, the plaintiff will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: That you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land and premises herein described, to-wit: Beginning at a point 17.82 chains North and 29.82 chains East of the Southeast corner

of the John Cochran Donation Land Claim No. 55, and running thence North 21° 00' East 3.38 chains, thence East 14.27 chains, thence South 65° West 8.46 chains, thence North 86° West 8.30 chains to the place of beginning, all in Section 27, Township 20 South Range 3 West of Willamette Meridian, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiff is the owner in fee simple of said real property as set out in the complaint herein, and that you and each of you be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim thereto, adverse to the plaintiff, and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem equitable.

This summons is published pursuant to an order made by Hon. G. F. Skipworth, Circuit Judge for Lane County, State of Oregon, on the 27th day of October, 1948, which order directs that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a newspaper of general circulation and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 25th day of November, 1948.

Date of first publication, October 28, 1948.

Date of last publication, November 25, 1948.

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs, Residence and Postoffice, Wiser Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. 12-5tc-16

MUSICAL ENTERTAINMENT BY BAND AND CHORUS

On Wednesday afternoon, November 10th, the elementary school band and chorus will present an afternoon of musical entertainment in the Jefferson school gymnasium, at 3:00 o'clock, under the direction of Miss Leum and Mr. Rickman. This will be a patriotic program in keeping with Armistice Day, and there will be no admission charge.

Sir Richard Burton

Sir Richard Burton, who was extremely prolific, wrote of his visits to Mecca and Medina. He was the first non-Moslem to make extensive notes on the holy cities and get out alive.

No Charge for Alterations



... and there's never an excess charge for dependable service we give you.

McKenzie Texaco Station
Phone 163
5th & Washington

CLOSE OUT ON INNER TUBE

SPECIAL PRICES ON
Tire Chains
Car Radios
Rubber Floor Matting
Lunch Kits
Anti-Freeze

Waker Auto Supply
Just Across the Bridge

TO CUT DOWN ON FUTURE REPAIR BILLS



Get **GENUINE FORD UNDERCOATING** for your car, now!

Genuine Ford Undercoating protects vital underbody units of your car against destructive rust and corrosion —helps prevent future repair bills. It is proof against road salts, acids and alkalis. Penetrates cracks and corners to help seal your car against drafts, fumes and dust. Reduces road and engine noises. Drive in today!

Floyd Githens Motors, Inc.

336 Main Cottage Grove, Ore. Phone 27

Dolcin Tablets

for

ARTHRITIS

RHEUMATISM

KELLY DRUG CO.

609 Main Phone 37

Wedding Announcements and Invitations — The Sentinel.

NOTICE TO VOTERS

For Mayor of Cottage Grove

It has been rumored that I have withdrawn as a candidate for mayor of Cottage Grove.

I am still in the race and am a Candidate For Mayor DEWEY WATKINS

Pd. Adv. 12-1tp

COME IN TODAY FOR DEMONSTRATION

Controlled Comfort



SMITH'S Furniture

Free Parking in Our Lot. 522 on Whiteaker Phone 101-L

Due to Illness

Dr. Arnold's Office

Will Be

CLOSED

For One Month

11-2tc-12

STOCK DISPOSAL

SALE

... FLOOR FURNACES

... OIL HEATERS

Come and Get Them at Our Wholesale Cost!

Famous "KRESKY" Make

HANSEN HEATING OIL CO.

Phone 84



AUTOMATIC \$39.85 BLANKET



Perfect gift for anyone!

Blissful **AUTOMATIC SLEEPING COMFORT**

GE AUTOMATIC BLANKET will be warmly appreciated, all winter long! It's downy-light, but warm as three blankets! Bedside Control (set once a season) keeps sleeping temperature "just right" automatically—no matter how the weather changes during the night. Choice of blue, rose, green, cedar. 72x86 inches. Put one on your gift list, now.

Launders beautifully. Carefully made to rigid General Electric safety standards, and approved by Underwriters' Laboratories, Inc.

Brisbane Electric

702 Main Phone 73

Balloon and Costume

DANCE

At the Cottage Grove Armory

Saturday, October 30th

With the

Arizona Ranch Hands

QUALITY FOOD BUYS

BEEF ROASTS (good beef) . . . lb. 45c
SHORT RIBS (good and lean) . . . lb. 39c
RIB STEAK (good beef) . . . lb. 65c
TREND . . . pkg. 16c
SUGAR (while it lasts) . . . 10 lbs. 79c
CHUNK or SLICED PINEAPPLE . . . 39c

Our prices are below the average all the time.

COME IN AND SEE FOR YOURSELF

DREW & MORIN MARKET

Ready to Serve **FOODS**

PHONE 55

TRY OUR DELIVERY SERVICE