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AIHNDINO TH! (2ND ENCAMPMENT of the Grand An y of the Republic, these six Union Army veterans 
brought a total of 617 years to the G A R. reunion in Gland Rapids, Mich. There are only 28 survivors in 
the entire U. 8. Left to right, are: Chas. L. Chappci, 102, Long Beach, Cal.; William H. Osborn, 104, Joplin, 
Mo.; John II. Grate, 103, Atwater, Ohio; Theo. A. Penland, 89, Portland, Ore.; Albert Woolson, 102, Duluth, 
Minn., and James A. Hard, 107, Rochester, N. Y« Hundreds of well-wishers greeted them. (Internatipnal)
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ihi, iii calling utlvnUon to the drive 
during National P irc Prevent ion 
Week Oct. 3 to 9. to eliminate 
lire hazard« He |M>inlx out that 
85 Jareent o| Ihe re|«>rtcd fires 
in Oregon during 1917 had match 
<•«, «mokeis, home heating system* 
or electriciiy a» contributing fiu-t

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: 
That the undersigned Administra­
trix of the Estate of CLARENCE 
HAYNES, Deceased, has filed her 
account for the final settlement of 
said Estate in the Circuit Court of 
the State of Oregon, for Lane 
County, and that Tuesday, the 
13th day of October. 1948, at the 
Circuit Court room of said Court, 
in the County Court House, in Eu­
gene. Oregon, at ten o'clock AM . 
has been by said Court fixed as 
the time and place for hearing ob­
jections thereto, and for final set­
tlement of said Estate.

OPAL HAYNES, Administra­
trix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD.

Sell it through the clasHified.

Attorney for Estate. 5-5t-9
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NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: 
That the undersigned Administra-1 
trix of the Estate of W. S. JEANS, 
Deceased, has filed her account for | 
the final settlement of said Estate 
n the Circuit Court of the State 
if Oregon, for Lane County, and 
that Tuesday, the 19th day of Oc­
tober, 1948, at ten o’clock in the 
forenoon, at the Circuit Court­
room in the County Court House, 
in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, 
has been fixed by said Court as 
the time and place for hearing ob­
jections thereto and for the final 
settlement of said Estate. GER­
TRUDE M. JEANS, Administra­
trix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD.

Homing hay is generally the fire 
source, Ross adds.

Home fires frequently occur at 
night trapping occupants of a 
home while they arc asleep The 
distance most farm nmidcnt« live 
from one another makes the pos­
sibility of a fnc being reported by 
■i neighbor extremely remote in 
com|>arison with city fires.

Ros« suggests that responsibil­
ity for disconnecting elecrical ap­
pliances and stove and furnace 
dampen adjustment s before re­
tiring at night lx- delegated to

Canby, Origon.
SUCCESSFUL LEGISLATOR ««a 
ADMINISTRATOR IJ YEARS — 
Pr„id«nf, Stat« Sanat« — Acting 
Governor. No ' “ * "

the extent to which such agree­
ment will permit the use of the 
road or right-of-way subject to the 
payment of reasonable compen- 
' at ion to the assignor of the 
United States. Further informa­
tion, including copies of the form 
of contract, bid forms and sched­
ules of contract payments may lx1 
obtained at District Offices of the 
B.LM . located at Salem, Eugene, 
Roseburg. Coos Bay. and Medford, 
or at the office of the Regional 
Administrator. Bldg. No. 1, Swan 
Island, Portland 18. Oregon. 
Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 
1st day of October, 1948. IN 
L A N E C Ô l N T Y SIUSLAW 
RIVER MARKETING AREA T. 
15 S.. R. 7 W . W M , Secs 17. 18 
and 20. all merchantable timber 
designated for cutting on a portion 
of the SW1« of Sec. 17, portion of

estimated for the purpose of this 
sale to be 2720 M. feet Douglas 
Fir, 100 M. Feet White Fir, 175 
M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for 
les* than $10.10 per M.ft.B.M. for 
the Douglas Fir. $4 20 per M ft. 
K M. for the White Fir. $3.35 per 
M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, 
or a total purchase price of $28.- 
478.25; will be considered. 9-4t-12

LEGAL NOTICES
NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE; 
Scaled bids, marked outside "Bid 
for Timber", and addressed to the 
Regional Admiiustrator, Bureau of 
Land Management, Region I, 
Swan Island Administration Build­
ing. Portland 18. Oregon, will be 
reieived until and opened at 
10:31) a m., Pacific Standard Time, 
November 9, 1948, for the pur­
chase of all merchantable timber

GENERAL ELECTRIC 
ALL-AUTOMATIC 
WASHERÀ

( ounty.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, 
in compliance with Sec. 111-908, 
OCLA to the legal voters of 
School District No. 45. of Ijine

02 Main

trained in the o|M-ration of the 
furnace is a loss when that (icison 
is absent, Ross |M>ints out. Fires 
are fr<«|uenlly the result of in- 
। «I« i u-ni-ed manipulation.

Despite the number of fires, 
pT»|>erty loss and deaths that have 
occurred from starting fires with 
kerosene, the practice continues, 
Ross adds.

Stat« Km«r(«ncy Board.
SUCCESSFUL BUSINESS MAN
Bank Dlrtctor. Dirtelo« Farmirt 
Fir« R«li«f A»»n. Director C«nby 
T«!«ohoiw Attn.

Before you buy »ny automatic wither, com­
pare it with tin« amazing General llniih All- 
Automatic Washer.

marvel at thia timesaving, worksaving wa slier 
you an automatic soak, Activator washing action, 
r rinsing, and high-speed damp-drying to thor- 
i ii get» many piece» dry enough io iron!
avher it c ompleti ly flexible, too. Stop it when 

»tart it where you want. And you can »kip

SPEC I AL SCHtMlL MEETING of 
said District will lx- heki at Jcffcr- 
M>n School, on the 29th day of 
OctoIxT, 1918, from 2 to 7 o'clock 
in the p.m., for the following ob- 
jccts: To vote on the question of 
consolidating Schisd LMbtricts No 
45 and 48, with an apportionment 
of assets and liabilities.

Dated this 21st day of Septem­
ber. 1!M8

C’EUIL E. BECK, Chairman 
Board of Directors.

ATTEST:
D M HUSTED, DistrictM'lerk 
LUCILLE'L. KIJNGE, Co. Schoo) 

Supt. and Ex-officio Sec. Dist.

aideration which will be paid for 
the timber and a statement that 
the bidder will comply with local 
manufacturing requirements as 
hereinafter stated. No bid for less 
than the appraised value will be 
considered. Each bid must be sub­
mitted in duplicate and be accom- 
panied by a deposit. The deposit 

'must be in cash or in the form of a 
certified check on a solvent bank 
and in favor of the Treasurer of 
the United States. The amount of 
the deposit will be at least 20% of 
the first $1,000.01) of the appraised 
value of the timber; an additional 
10% of the next $9,000.00; an ad- 
litinniil 5% of the amount between 

$10.000.00 and $100.000.00; and an 
additional 30 of any amount id 
excess of $100,000.00. The deposit 
will lie returned to unsuccessful 
bidders upon th«- award of the bid: 
applied as part of the put chase

NW'«NE*4 of Sec. 20. estimated 
for the purpose of this sale to be 
7035 M feet Douglas Fir, 385 M. 
feet Hemlock. 70 M. feet Western 
Red Cedar, 1010 M. Lineal Feet 
Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid 
for less than $1268 per M.ft.B.M. 
tor the Douglas Fir. $5 74 per M.ft. 
B M for the Hemlock. $4.00 per 

j M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red 
Cedar. $ 05 per Lin ft. for the 
Western R*«i Cedar Poles, or a 
total purchase price of $91,743.90, 
wii be considered. The sale area 
consists of two blocks, surrounded 
by blazed lines, and connecting 
rights-of-way through seed re­
serves. One block contains 48.00 
acres, made up of approx. 25 00 
acres in the SELSW1«, and ap­
prox. 3.5 acres in the SW'iSWL 
of Sec. 17; approx. 3.0 acres in the 
NWLNW'i and approx. 16.50 
acres in the NEL,NW1« of Sec. 20.

MOSBY CREEK
The Blue Mountain Mothers 

club met Thursday. Oct. 30, at 
the lunch room at the school house 
Mrs. Fay Taylor was elected 
chairman and Mrs. Fanny Bostick 
secretary. Mrs. Dorothy Wood­
worth and Mrs. Esther Ward were 
hostesses for the afternoon and 
served a delicious lunch of cake 
and coffee. Mrs. Millie Roby and 
Mrs. Elaine Roby will be hostesses 
for the next meeting which will 
be the third Thursday of every 
month after this. Mrs. Seidel. Mrs. 
Westerfield. Mrs. Millie Roby 
Mrs. Elaine Roby and Mrs. Phil­
pot were elected to make out the 
lunch menu for the next two 
months.

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Dugan spent 
this last week at Yakima. Wash­
ington visiting at the home of 
their son and daughter-in-law Mr. 
and Mrs. Leo Dugan.

Mrs. Fred Frost of Cottage 
Grove spent Friday night at the 
home of her brother Harry Castle 
while the men folks were in east­
ern Oregon hunting.

Mrs. Kitty McCoy of Silk Creek 
is staying at the Everett McCoy- 
home at Blue Mt. while Mr. and 
Mrs. McCoy arc in eastern Oregon.

Mrs. Floyd Jones spent last 
week visiting in Tillamook at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Eldon Jones. '

6-5t-10
,.,Pd P- 8. Hommo/Xl. Chm
306 S.W, Broodwoy. Portion^, Qr«^
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the successful bidder does not 
within thirty days of acceptance 
of the bid execute contract and 
furnish satisfactory bond and sat- 
isfactory evidence of his ability to 
comply yvith the local marketing

Bake Better

Bake Better

I

S H

requirement. In sales 
000.00. the successful 
be required to furnish 
■lanciai statement in

over $10,- 
bidder will 
a sworn fi- 

duplicate,
showing ability to fulfill the finan­
cial requirements of the contract. 
In sales of $5,000.00 or less, the de- 
posit may lie retained as a cash 
bond; in sales of more than $5.-
00000. 
quired 
000.00, 
00. at

surety bonds will be re- 
as follows: more than $5,- 
but not more than $10,000.- 
least 20'; of the amount

bid: more than $10,000.00. at least 
10% of the amount bid. In sales of 
$10,000.00 or less, payment in full 
will tie required prior to execution 
of the contract. In larger sales 
payments may be made in install­
ments in accordance with contract 
payment schedule, dated March 1, 
1948. The right is hereby reserved 
to waive technical defects in the 
advertisement; to reject all bids, 
or to award the timber for the 
amount of the highest bid to the

SWW; approx. 13.5 acres in the 
NE'«SE'«, and apptox. 9.75 acres 
in the SELSEU of Sec. 18. The 
connecting rights-of-way are made 
up of approx. .40 acres in the 
NW ’« NEand approx. 1.00 acre 
in the NELNW1« of Sec. 20; and 
approx 16 acres in the S'nSWK« I 
of Sec. 17. All other timber on the 1 
remaining 179 acres is reserved 
from cutting including blazed line 
trees. T. 18 S„ R. 6 W . W.M.. Sec. 
29. all merchantable timber desig­
nated for cutting on a portion of 
the NW1« and portion of the NS 
SW1«. estimated for the purpose 
of this sale to be 2320 M. feet 
Douglas Fir. 10 M. feet Hemlock. 
25 M. feet Red Cedar, 950 Lineal 
Feet Red Cedar Poles. No bid for 
less than $11.35 per M.ft.B.M. for 
the Douglas Fir, $5.30 per M.ft. 
B.M. for the Hemlock. $4.05 per 
M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar. $.05 
per Lm.ft. for the Red Cedar 
Poles, or a total purchase price of 
$26,533.75, will be considered. The 
roads which now traverse the sale 
area must be kept open to the sat­
isfaction of the right of way per­

hunting trip in eastern Oregon 
with three large bucks.

Mr- and Mrs. Fred Overton re­
turner! Friday from the coast 
where they have spent three 
weeks building a house on their 
lot there. They have bought a new
ton and one half

Mr. and Mrs. 
have a new baby 
day Sept. 30.

Mr. and Mrs.

Interstate truck. 
George Munsell 
girl born Thurs-

III
q.

Everett McCoy- 
returned Monday from eastern
Oregon with a nice buck.

Mrs. Lester Rearrick and chil­
dren visited a sister. Mrs. Grant 
Dulley of Knox Hill whiel their 
husbands were hunting in eastern 
Oregon.

mittee and the officer in charge of 
next highest qualified bidder when the sale. The sale area is described 
the officer authorized to approve as follows: In the NE'«NW1«, an 
the contract shall deem the high
bidder unqualified to fulfill the 
contractual requirements of the 
advertisement. Timber sold in ac­
cordance with this advertisement 
must lx* manufactured within the 
marketing area as designated for 
each tract described below in ac­
cordance with the Orders of the 
Secretary of the Interior, No. 
2285. and Nos. 2380 to 2390, Inch, 
dated December 11. 1946 and No­
vember 29. 1947, respect ively. The 
United States has hy agreement 
been given the right to authorize 
its purchasers to use certain roads 
and rights-of-way for the removal 
of timber. Each bidder should as­
certain from the respective Dis­
trict Forester's office the location 
of the road or right-of-way cov­
ered by such agreement relating 
to the tract upon which he wishes 
to bid. It is the bidder's respon­
sibility to determine for himself

area of approx. 28 1 acres lying 
North and West of a well-blazed 
line. In the NW*tNW!i, an area 
of approx. 1.2 acres lying in the 
northeast corner and 2.8 acres ly­
ing in the southeast corner of the 
forty and respectively defined an 
the Southwest and Northwest by 
well-blazed lines. In the S’tNW1», 
an area of approx. 67 6 acres lying 
North and West of well blazed 
lines. In the NE^SW1«, an area of 
approx. 3 25 acres lying North of 
a blazed line and in the NW1« 
SW« an area of approx. 1.0 acres 
lying in the northwest corner of 
the forty and bounded on the 
South and East of a blazed line. 
The total number of acres involved 
in this sale is 103.95, and all other 
timber, including the blazed trees 
themselves are reserved from cut­
ting. T. 19 S„ R. 4 W. W M.. Sec. 
33, all merchantable timber desig­
nated for cutting on the SHNW4,

BLACK TOP PAVING
Driveways — Streets — Parking Areas and Floor» 

All Work Guaranteed

Pass Creek Paving Co., Drain, Ore
Located at

Cottage Grove Sand and Gravel


