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SILK CREEK went lo Eugene Saturday to visit
Mr. mid Mrs Hob MeMurrick, son-in-law and daughter. Mr.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Johnson of Al- ',"'1 M Pullcske Mr Mox­
ley return«-«! home Sunday. Mrs. 
Moxley, accompanied by Mr and 
Mrs. Palleske and daughter, Miss

bany, were visitors Saturday at 
the home of Mr and Mrs George 
MeMurrick. whose children. Dun 
ny. Eva Lynn. George Jr, and Ann 
were returned home after attend* 
lug summer Bible school at Al­
bany.

Mr. and Mrs. George Moxley

Jo Ann. mid Mr. anil Mrs Frank 
Kirchoff, returned Tuesday.

M C Ibbers, of Ixm Angelos, 
was a visitor at the horno of Mr 
mid Mrs R. E. Poynter over the 
wook end

This is a picture of an AUTOMOBILE
And that's just the way you're going 
to find yourself In regard to a car if 
you don't take care of it. Don't 
BLANK your car out just for a little 
care-----bring it to us for a regular 
check-up.

IF YOU ACT BIFORE JULY 31

Russell’s Texaco Station
6th & Highwny 99

The annual school meeting for 
this district was held June 21st, 
with a large attendance Alvin 
Allen was re-elected director, mid 
Mis Ross Overholser re-elected 
clerk odync Matthews, running 
for rural si hool member for zone 5 
was given unanimous vote for re­
election.

Mrs. Martha Thoreson, a for­
mer resilient of this community, 
according to report, escaped from 
Hu- Vanport flood, rescuing five 
children. The apartment where
she lived was not destroyed al- 

| though Mrs. Thoreson lost many 
of her possgssions.

Mrs R<mh Overholser and ehil- 
<ln n, Corley and Uvona, attended 
the annual I looker-Lewis family 
reunion at Wolf Crci-k Sunday.

Mr mid Mrs George Taylor, of 
Placerville, Calif., uncle and aunt 
of Mrs. E. Whaley, are building 
a trailer court and store on high 
way 99 north of Cottage Grove.

Miles Kentner, nephew of Mr. 
and Mrs. George Kentner, has 
Iwen their guest while on vaca-

LEGAL NOTICES
NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE: 
Scaled bids, marked outside “Bid 
for Timber”, and address«*d to th«- 
Regional Administrator, Bureau of 
Land Management, Region I, 
Swan lalanrl Administration Build­
ing, Borland IX, Oregon, will be 
received until and opened at 10:30 
a m , Pacific Daylight Saving Time, 
July 20, 194X, for the purchase of 
ail merchantable timber «k-sig- 
natad for cutting ufMin tracts here, 
inafter described; the cutting and 
removal of th«- timber to be car­
ried out in accordance with the 
forest practice rules approved on 
•July 7, I93X, by th«- S«-cretary of 
the Interior. Each bid must state 
the amount per thousand feet, 
Ixiard measure, that will be pak! 
for each species and the total 
consideration which will tic |mid 
for th«- timber. No bid for Iras 
than the appraised value will be 
considered. Each bid must lx? sub-

|T 18 S R 7 w , See. 23, all mer-1 
charitable timber designated for 
cutting (,n the SE'.SW',. portion Elmer 
SW'aSE1*, all SE'aSE^. esti- house, 
mated for tJar purpose of this sale Sidney

DOREMA
Wilson ta remodeling hta

Bales attended a rural
to be 4595 M feet Douglas Fir, 15 school board meeting last wwk
M. fis t Hemlock, 20 M. feet West-i Week end guests at the Lot 
ern Red Cedar. No bid for less Wagner home were Shirley Wag-
than $13.50 per M ft B M. for th<* of Portland. Mr.and Mrs Rob- 
frouglas Fir, $4.60 per M.ft.B M ' rt Wagner and Erneat Wagner, 
for the Hemlock, >4 20 per M.ft- Mr. and Mrs. Elwyn Bales and 
B.M. for the Western Red Cedar,
or a total purchase price of $62,- 
1X5 50, will considered An area 
of approx. 5 acres of immature 
timber urrounded by a blazed line 
in the SW!4SE'4 is reserved from 
cutting T. 19 8„ R. 4 W., Sec. 33. 
all merchantable limber desig­
natili for cutting on the E%SW%,

family visited at the home of Sid­
ney Bales Sunday. Clorene re­
turned home with them to spend 
the week.

Mr. and Mrs. Davenport and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Bales 
and Mi. and Mrs. Hancock motor­
ed to th<- Umpqua Beach Sunday.

Mrs. Harrold Giliiand and fam-
estimated for the purpose of this dy visited with her grand perenta
*ale to lie 2295 M feet Douglas 
Fir. 25 M feet White Fir, 120 M 
feet Int ense Cedar, X5 M. feet Red 
Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid 
for less than $9X5 ¡x r M ft.B.M. 
for the Douglas Fir. $3 90 per M. 
ft.B.M for the White Fir, $3.45

Mr and Mrs. U. S. Bales one day 
last week.

A vanelie Wicks. Etale Rolfston, 
Richard Wicks and Bobbie Kelly 
motored to Eugene one day last 
week.

Mrs. Mary Crawford and chil-

Thurs . July f, IMA The Hentlael. Cottage Grew

Orris Mon ree spent 
end at home. -She is 
school at Monmouth.

George Chapman, an

the week 
attending

old timer.
visited the Rales and Doolittle 
homes Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Schroggins 
of Lebenon visited at the Lot 
Wagner home Sunday.

Busy Bee Club met with Ruby 
Wilson one day last week and 
tacked out a comforter.

Mr. and Mrs I. E. Barber of 
Bremerton. Washington are visit­
ing Mrs Barbers jiarents Mr. and 

i Mrs. U. S. Bales.

Accordion I

hstnietNp 
and Rentals 

LOUISE WALTHER J 
Ph| 116Y, Cottage Grov^ 

Affiliated with the 
EUGENE AOOORDION

CENTER
I’Li IH17-H, Eugene, Oregon

v MACK’S FIXIT SHOP

■A f

tion from the College at Corvallis
Mr mid Mrs Ralph Teeters of 

Cottage Grove were guests at th«- 
Arthur Woolcott home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. —

mitted in dupileate and be accom-
rw r- V« f. tz w t .. . Za ivi ri ry » rawiorn ana rnii-
d-i; and Red C edar. »90 per M. ,o ,he week wHh re)atjve8• ----- ------- —’ ------- rvtti * «-(Mil. ni.

panied by a depogit. The deposit ft.B M for the HemkM-k, or a total 
must Im- in the form of a certified purchase price of $23.430.00, will J 
check on a solvent bank and In be considered. T. 20 S„ R. 5 W . ‘o visit her daughter,
favor of the Treasurer of the See 19, an merchantable timber Lois Giles has returned
I nited States. The amount of th«' designated for cutting on the WVj from a visit in California. Her son
dc|XMit will be $5,900.00 provided NW'., estimated for the purpose ;,nd daughter-in-law returned
th«- total amount bid is over $5.- of ahis sale to lie .3730 M feet I wi,b ber. intending to make their

Glendale, visit«-«! O0000 «nd l<-ss than $50.000.00; | Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Hem kick, home here.
Mrs. Kittie McCoy over the week 11 ** $10,000.00 provided the 5 M feet Incense Cedar. No bi«i

-‘ ,o,al «mount bid is over $50,000.00 for less than $10.75 per M.ft.B M.
Mr. and Mrs Glen Sehän«-, of ,in<1 ,h«n $100,00000; it will for the Douglas fir, $4 30 per M 

Wn., while on their b*- 10'« of the amount bid when ft B M. for the Hemlock and In- 
visit«-d hta grand- ,h* hl ‘ 

mother, Mrs C. M. Dunham, last 
' w«o»k.

Pearl Sherer went by plane to

"(tent the week 
lake, enjoying a 

Mr and Mrs. 
son Wayne of

Curtis Hammond 
end at Ten Mil«- 
bit of fishing.
■Dale McCoy and CLOSED

end.

Bremerton,
honeymoon.

A. B. Cook and baby daughter, 
; of Bend, were week end visitors at 
the Hallie Cochran home Jimmie 
Cook, who had been visiting at 
the Cochran home, returned home 

. with hta parents.
Mr and Mrs. Alvin Allen, Ralph 

and Joyce. Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Duncan and ¡.ester, Mr. and Mrs 

. Boyd Allen and Judy Lee, with 
| Mr. and Mrs. Gale Lebow of Cot-

K» of the amount bid when ft.B M. for the Hemlock and In- 
the bid exceeds $100,900.00. If the cense Cedar, or a total purchase 
total amount bid Is less than $5,- price of $40.162.00, will be con- 
900 (W, the deposit shall be th«- sidered. T. 20 S„ R. 5 W„ Sec. 23, 
amount of the bid. The deposit all merchantable timber desig- 
will be returned to unsuccessful nated for cutting on the SE'a 
bidders; applied as a part of the SW1«. estimated for the purpose 
purchase price of tge successful of this sale to be 1350 M. feet 
bidder; or that portion of the de-

price of $40.162.00, will be con

Sandy Rinard is visiting her 
mother Mrs. Sherritt.

Leroy Cartright is building a 
house on the ground he purchased 
recently from Mrs. A vane lie 
Wicks.

July Í - July 8

posit, representing the minimum 
required by law, shall be retained 
ns liquidated damages if the high 
bidder does not execute contract

Douglas fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock, 
15 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for 
less than $12.10 per M ft.B.M. for 
the Douglas fir, $4.65 per M.ft 
B M for the Hemlock and Red

t Inge Grove, enjoyed a picnic Sun­
day at Cottage Grove Jake,

Durell, son of Mr and Mrs. 
Charles Ellenberg, cut his foot 
quite severely Saturday while cut- 

___ ___ 1MPA I ""K.Wo<K1 He was taken to a hos-

We will pay youTMO55 sSS"
for any old heater in trade

equipment of the district school to
provide instruction as well as en- 

I tertainment to the pupils.

ON A Nl*

HEMER'
L

we vuuranTee more neuf 
(*on your ata ail Saata» al aqvol alia) 

OR YOUR MONEY BACK
Oar summer »parlai ... far a hmitad 
lima only- pay V 30 Io »20.50 lor yovf

Grant and Duane Maddy accom­
panied a camping and fishing 
party to Diamond lake over the 
week end.

Mr. and Mrs R. J Wilson and 
; daughter. Janet, attend<*d the ro­
deo Sunday at Eugene.

Mr. and Mrs H. Whitlock. Mr 
mid M r s Robert Woolcott and 
Russell Woolcott of Cottage Grove 
were given a picnic supper at the 

¡home of Mr. and Mrs. Arthur 
Woolcott following the harvesting 
of hay on the Woolcott farm. Mon­
day Mr. Woolcott has been quite 

| ill for some time.

EASY TERMS:
08 low OS ^100 

IA WEEK

ln volva* vary, botad on old haalat and tita 
a* now Calamón You »ovo by o<»ing now 
After July 31 II will coti you vp to $20 50 Io 
got theta «amo modal» Sea vi today

'Rood this monay-bock gvarantaai Tty 
° Colemon 13 doyi It mutt give mote hoot 
taon yowl old oil hooter of equal «Ito. type, 
and ITU rating ... o» your money bach

< ITV MANAGER AT 
REEDSPORT ITS

Cecil H. Bennett, who has been 
acting as city manager of Reeds­
port for the past two years, of­
fered his resignation at the last 

¡City Council meeting He stated 
that he had accepted the position 
only in order to give the city an 
opportunity to try the city man-

• ager form of government.

and furnish satisfactory bond Cedar, or a total purchase price 
within thirty days of acceptance of of $16,428.00, will be considered, 
the bid or cannot furnish evidence 45-4t-48
of hta ability to comply with the 
local marketing requirement. This 
evidence must be submitted with 
the bid and shall conform with the 
requirements as set forth in this 
advertisement. In sales over $10.- 
000.00, the successful bidder will 
be required to furnish a sworn 
financial statement, in duplicate, 
showing ability to fulfill the terms 
of the contract. A bond on all 
sales will be required in an amount 
computed at the rate of at least 20 
per cent of the first $10.000.00 of 
the bid, plus 10 per cent of any 
additional amount of the bid in 
excess of $10.00000. Payment for 
timber will be required in advance 
of cutting, payment in full at the 
time of filing the contract being 
required in sales amounting to 
$10,000.00 or less. In larger sales, 
at the option of the Regional Ad­
ministrator, payment may be 
made in a number of installments 
scheduled to keep pace with the 
rate of timber cutting and payable 
upon demand from the Regional 
Administrator. The right is hereby 
reserved to waive technical defects 
in this advertisement; to reject all 
bids, or to award the timber for 
the amount of the highest bid to 
other than the highest bidder when 
nwessary, pursuant to the Act of 
August 28, 1937 i50 Stat. 874>, in 
order to provide a continued sup- 1 
ply of timber to local industry and

GROVE TAVERN

[oleman y IheOH-Sarmg Oil Heater
GROVE HARDWARE

Horse Breaking
Reasonable Price

Inquire
BAKER’S MOBIL STAT. 

9th and Oibbs — Phone 252Phone 18506 Main

COME ON IN

contribute to the permanence of 
the community which is dependent 
upon such industry. Timber sold 
in accordance with this advertise­
ment must be manufactured with­
in the marketing area as desig- 
nat<>d for each tract described be­
low in accordance with the Orders 
of the Secretary of the Interior, 
No. 22X5. and Nos. 2380 to 2390. 
Incl., dated .December 11, 1946 and 
November 29. 1947, respectively. 
Further information regarding 
this sale may be obtained at Dis­
trict Offices of the B.L.M. located 
at Salem, Eugene, Roseburg, Coos 
Ray. and Medford, or at the office 
of the Regional Administrator. W. 
H. Horning. Swan Island Admin­
istration Building, Portland 18, 
Oregon. Dated at Portland, Ore­
gon. this 11th day of June. 194«. 
IN LANE COUNTY: SIUSLAW 
MARKETING AREA: T. 15 S., R.
7 W„ Secs. 16 and 21. all mcr-j 
chantable timber designated for 
cutting on a portion of the SW4 
and W'aSEL, of Sec. 16, and por-1 
tion of Lots 1 and 2 (N’sNWL) 
of Sec. 21, estimated for the pur­
pose of this sale to be 472(1 M. feet 
Douglas Fir, 85 M. feet Hemlock. 
40 M. feet Western Red Cedar. 
1050 Lineal Feet Red Cedar Poles. 
No bid for less than $13.25 per 
M.ftB.M. for the Douglas Fir, $3- 
85 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock. 
$3.45 per M ft.B.M. for the West­
ern Red Cedar, $.05 per Lin.ft. for 
the Red Cedar Poles, or a total 
purchase price of $63,057.75, will | 
be considered. The sale area con­
sists of an area of approx. 94.5 
acres surrounded by blazed lines, 
made up of approx. 0.4 acres in 
the NWMSEIk, approx. 0.3 acres

Get the Most for 
Your Money! OPEN

Our cleaning is fine! Don’t worry about staining 
your clothes at the beach! We’N take out all 
spots, send your dresses home good as new.

Cottage Grove Cleaners
401 Main Phone 81

in the SW^SE’*, approx. 4.4 
acres in the NEHSWJ4, approx 
0.7 acres in the NWLSW1«, ap-1 
prox. 25.4 acres in the SW'aSWM 
and approx. 44.7 acres in the SEU 
SWV» of Sec. 16, and approx. 11.2 
acres in the NE'iNW'i and ap­
prox. 7.4 acres in, the NWSNW'« 
of Sec. 21. In addition an area of 
approx. 3.15 acres in the right-of- 
way through the SW'xSE1», the 
SE'mSWL, and the SWLSWL of 
Sec. 16 is included in the sale area. । 
T. 17 S„ R. 7 W„ Sec. 23. all mcr-i 
chantable timber designated for 
cutting on a portion of the NW1, 
NW'», estimated for the purpose 
of this sale to be 1005 M. feet 
Douglas Fir. No bid for less than 
$11.75 per M.ft.<B.M., or a totals 
purchase price of $11,808.75, will 
he considered. An area of approx. 
12 acres lying south and cast of a 
blazed line is reserved from cut­
ting Including blazed line trees.I

Thursday July 1

Booths for Ladies

When you bring your car in 
to us — You get the most 
service fora minimum of 
money. You d be surprised.

DRIVE YOUR CAR IN 
TODAY AND SEE FOR 

YOURSELF.

McKenzie Texaco 
Station

5th & Wash. Phone 163
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Now in stock...new 

PHILCO 
’48 Rodio Values!

1 ««"c0 .uh«"'' «

Easy Ttmt

NICHOLS RADIO 
& APPLIANCE 

LEE NICHOLS
812 Main St. Phone 317

IT'S A CINCH

To grow my garden without bugs anting up the
profit, for I use

INSECTICIDES
Md

BUG DUST

*

For protection against beetles, slugs and other 
garden pests.

From

B & H FEED STORE
6th and Washington
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