

ARTHRITIS
Mr. J. H. Casey:
In regard to Casey's Compound I cannot praise it enough for what it has done for me. For two years I had arthritis in my finger joints. It was so painful I could hardly stand to move my fingers, the joints were so stiff and sore. After taking 3 bottles of Casey's Compound I am free of pain and stiff joints.—Mrs. J. Stanley McLaughlin, Rte. 4, box 108, Salem, Oregon.
Ask Your Druggist or Write J. H. Casey
Box 731 . . . Portland, Ore.
26-4fe-29

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Administrator of the Estate of RALPH J. LONG, deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, Oregon, by an Order dated February 10th, 1948. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby notified to present the same, duly verified, with proper vouchers, to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Wiser Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of first posting of this notice. Dated and first published February 12th, 1948: RALPH J. LONG, Administrator, HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 27-5t-31

LEGAL NOTICES
NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE
Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Regional Administrator, Bureau of Land Management, Region I, Swan Island Administration Building, Portland 18, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 a.m., Pacific Standard Time, March 9, 1948, for the purchase of all merchantable timber designated for cutting upon tracts hereinafter described; the cutting and removal of the timber to be carried out in accordance with the forest practice rules approved on July 7, 1938, by the Secretary of the Interior. Each bid must state the amount per thousand feet of board measure, that will be paid for each species in the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be accompanied by a deposit. The deposit must be in the form of a certified check on a solvent bank and in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The amount of the deposit will be \$5,000.00 provided the total amount bid is over \$5,000.00 and less than \$10,000.00; it will be \$10,000.00 provided the total amount bid is over \$10,000.00 and less than \$100,000.00; it will be 10% of the amount bid when the bid exceeds \$100,000.00. If the total amount bid is less than \$5,000.00, the deposit shall be the amount of the bid. The deposit will be returned to unsuccessful bidders; applied as a part of the purchase price of the successful bidder; or that portion of the deposit, representing the minimum required by law, shall be retained as liquidated damages if the high bidder does not execute contract and furnish satisfactory bond within thirty days of acceptance of the bid or cannot furnish evidence of his ability to comply with the local marketing requirement. This evidence must be submitted with the bid and shall conform with the requirements as set forth in this advertisement. In sales over \$10,000.00, the successful bidder will be required to furnish a sworn financial statement, in duplicate, showing ability to fulfill the terms

of the contract. A bond on all sales will be required in an amount computed at the rate of at least 20 per cent of the first \$10,000.00 or the bid, plus 10 per cent of any additional amount of the bid in excess of \$10,000.00. Payment for timber will be required in advance of cutting, payment in full at the time of filing the contract being required in sales amounting to \$10,000.00 or less. In larger sales, at the option of the Regional Administrator, payment may be made in a number of installments scheduled to keep pace with the rate of timber cutting and payable upon demand from the Regional Administrator. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement, to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry and contribute to the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Timber sold in accordance with this advertisement must be manufactured within the marketing area as designated for each tract described below in accordance with the Orders of the Secretary of the Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. 2380 to 2390, inclusive, dated December 11, 1946 and November 29, 1947, respectively. Further information regarding this sale may be obtained at District Offices of the B.L.M. located at Salem, Eugene, Roseburg, Coos Bay, and Medford, or at the office of the Regional Administrator, W. H. Horning, Swan Island Administration Building, Portland 18, Oregon. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 30th day of January, 1948, IN LANE COUNTY: SUPER WILLAMETTE MARKET-ING AREA: T. 18 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 13 (SW 1/4 SW 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1840 M. feet Douglas fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 5 M. feet White Fir, 20 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$17.15 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$4.55 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and White Fir, \$4.15 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$31,866.50, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 4 (SW 1/4 SW 1/4), Lot 5 (SE 1/4 SW 1/4 SW 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5350 M. feet Douglas fir, 930 M. feet Hemlock, 70 M. feet Western Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$15.20 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$5.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$3.65 per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$86,923.00, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4 SW 1/4, por. NW 1/4 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3420 M. feet Douglas fir, 50 M. feet Hemlock, 340 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 8200 Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$11.85 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$3.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Western Red Cedar, \$0.5 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$42,224.00, will be considered. An area of approx. 12.5 acres in the NW 1/4 SW 1/4 lying west of a blazed line is reserved from cutting. IN LANE COUNTY: SIUSLAW MARKET-ING AREA: T. 18 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on por. N 1/2 SW 1/4, all SW 1/4 SW 1/4, por. SE 1/4 SW 1/4, por. SW 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2705 M. feet Douglas fir, 30 M. feet Hemlock, 85 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 4670 Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$12.55 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$3.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$3.10 per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, \$0.5 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a

total purchase price of \$34,549.75, will be considered. An area of approx. 91 acres lying north and east of a blazed line that runs generally east and west through the N 1/2 SW 1/4 and SE 1/4 SW 1/4, and generally north and south through the SW 1/4 SE 1/4, is reserved from cutting including blazed and posted line trees. T. 19 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the W 1/2 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2810 M. feet Douglas fir, 50 M. feet White Fir, 230 M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$9.45 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$3.60 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir, \$3.20 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$27,552.50, will be considered. 26-4t-29

John Deere Day In Eugene March 2
Byrle Hunter, manager of the Interstate Tractor and Equipment Co. of Eugene, announces that the firm's annual John Deere Day entertainment program for farmers will be held March 2nd in the 4-H Club building at the Lane County Fairgrounds. The event, originally scheduled to be January 8, had to be canceled due to flooded highways.
The John Deere Day program will include the showing of "Doctor Jim", a full length movie starring Stuart Erwin, popular Hollywood star, with a supporting cast of such other well known artists as Barbara Woodell, Hobart Cavanaugh, William Wright and Netta Parker. In addition there will be shown other new all talking educational pictures. They include "Keep Your Eye On The Soil", a soil maintenance picture that sounds a warning no farmer can afford to ignore. "Doubting Thomas"—an interesting story that will give equipment users some new slants on the John Deere models "A" and "B" tractors, and other short, informative movies.

MOSBY CREEK
The 4-H Cooking Club "Culinary Cakes," met last Friday afternoon at the home of Mrs. Crane of Walden. Patty Omyer was hostess for the day and the meeting was on the subject of "The Starch Cousins." The girls made spaghetti and meat balls as their demonstration.
Mrs. Ben Anderson spent the week end in Corvallis at the home of her son Paul and family. Paul is sick in bed with the mumps and Mrs. Anderson got acquainted with her new granddaughter Linda Elaine Anderson and visited her daughter and son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Ray Herndstedt of Corvallis.
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Overton have received word from their son, Pfc. Gene Overton, that he sailed for Guam on the 19th of February. Mrs. Berta McGuire and Leon

Lancaster took their father, Albert Lancaster, to Eugene to a hospital where he had an operation Sunday evening.
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Blackmore and son Ronnie were dinner guests Sunday at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Lester Rearrick.
LEGAL NOTICES
NOTICE TO CREDITORS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, has appointed Beulah A. McFerrin, Administratrix of the estate of Dale F. Hawkins, deceased. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present the same, duly verified, to said Administratrix at the Law Office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated and first published thereof February 19th, 1948.
Alta King, Attorney. Beulah A. McFerrin, Administratrix. 28-5t-32
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Miller and Mrs. Bessie Sutcliffe spent the week end at Olympia and Seattle with relatives and friends.

your WATKINS dealer
Will Be Over at Lorane
This Next Week.
WAIT FOR WATKINS
Tis Good — Tis Pure — It Pays
Yes, the people in Cottage Grove can have Watkins also.
Just call at (1408 Quincy) YOUR WATKINS DEALER.
Coda M. Pentico

Kiddies from Dairyland STORYBOOK
"X" stands for X-ray—the marvelous way
Of looking right through your body—but say!
If you drink lots of GROVE MAID MILK, your HEALTH speaks
The language of truth from your rosy cheeks.
Grove Maid Dairy
PASTEURIZED & HOMOGENIZED MILK & CREAM
PHONE 321 505 S. 5th ST.

Go Greyhound
New Air-Conditioned Coaches
7 Trips Daily to
San Francisco
ONE-WAY FARE, \$7.70
LOS ANGELES
ONE-WAY FARE, \$11.49
GO ONE WAY—RETURN ANOTHER
802 Main Street
Phone 97
GREYHOUND

of the contract. A bond on all sales will be required in an amount computed at the rate of at least 20 per cent of the first \$10,000.00 or the bid, plus 10 per cent of any additional amount of the bid in excess of \$10,000.00. Payment for timber will be required in advance of cutting, payment in full at the time of filing the contract being required in sales amounting to \$10,000.00 or less. In larger sales, at the option of the Regional Administrator, payment may be made in a number of installments scheduled to keep pace with the rate of timber cutting and payable upon demand from the Regional Administrator. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement, to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry and contribute to the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Timber sold in accordance with this advertisement must be manufactured within the marketing area as designated for each tract described below in accordance with the Orders of the Secretary of the Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. 2380 to 2390, inclusive, dated December 11, 1946 and November 29, 1947, respectively. Further information regarding this sale may be obtained at District Offices of the B.L.M. located at Salem, Eugene, Roseburg, Coos Bay, and Medford, or at the office of the Regional Administrator, W. H. Horning, Swan Island Administration Building, Portland 18, Oregon. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 30th day of January, 1948, IN LANE COUNTY: SUPER WILLAMETTE MARKET-ING AREA: T. 18 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 13 (SW 1/4 SW 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1840 M. feet Douglas fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 5 M. feet White Fir, 20 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$17.15 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$4.55 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and White Fir, \$4.15 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$31,866.50, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 4 (SW 1/4 SW 1/4), Lot 5 (SE 1/4 SW 1/4 SW 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5350 M. feet Douglas fir, 930 M. feet Hemlock, 70 M. feet Western Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$15.20 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$5.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$3.65 per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$86,923.00, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4 SW 1/4, por. NW 1/4 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3420 M. feet Douglas fir, 50 M. feet Hemlock, 340 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 8200 Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$11.85 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$3.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Western Red Cedar, \$0.5 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$42,224.00, will be considered. An area of approx. 12.5 acres in the NW 1/4 SW 1/4 lying west of a blazed line is reserved from cutting. IN LANE COUNTY: SIUSLAW MARKET-ING AREA: T. 18 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on por. N 1/2 SW 1/4, all SW 1/4 SW 1/4, por. SE 1/4 SW 1/4, por. SW 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2705 M. feet Douglas fir, 30 M. feet Hemlock, 85 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 4670 Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$12.55 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$3.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$3.10 per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, \$0.5 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a

ARC & ACETYLENE WELDING
Cottage Grove Welding Works
Portable Welding Any Place
1030 Madison Phone 181Y
24-tfxxx

FOR MORE Comfort
Occasional Chairs and Rockers
\$14.95 and up
BRESSLER'S
FOR FURNITURE

NEW! For the first time ever...
Refrigerated from Top-To-Bottom!
Kelvinator—of Course!
MORE SPACE FOR EVERYTHING!

- Spacious General Storage Compartment . . . plenty of shelf space!
- Magic Shelf—adjustable for bulky food storage!
- Large Crisper Drawer . . . 12 qts. total capacity!
- Kelvinator's exclusive new Fruit Freshener . . . Moist-Cold preservation.
- Cold-Ban Door Trim—clean, smooth . . . no visible screwheads!
- Trigger-action door latch . . . positive closing!
- Thirteen-point Temperature Control!
- Automatic Flood-light . . . non-glaring!
- 4 Big quick-action ice cube trays . . . with two built-in tray release and cube release levers.
- Kelvinator's famous Polarsphere mechanism . . . permanently lubricated . . . trouble-free performance!
- And many other brilliant features!

NEW! A 40-pound Frozen Food Chest!
Here's your wonderful new kitchen helper! Now you can serve "out-of-season" foods everyday . . . safe-store frozen meats, poultry, fruits, vegetables, desserts. Freeze your own, or buy them frozen—you'll always have the makings of a delicious meal!

NEW! "Moist-Cold" Fruit Freshener!
Here's what every busy housewife will go for . . . the big Moist-Cold Fruit Freshener! Holds a load of fruits—vegetables, too . . . keeps them deliciously cold and fresh! It tilts out at a touch. Kelvinator has it!

Model CM-48 shown above—Price
*Prices shown are for delivery in your kitchen with five-year protection plan. State and local taxes extra. Prices and specifications subject to change without notice.

Drew & Morin Market
We will remain open till 9 P. M. Friday

Bacon Jowls 39c	Tasty Kernel Cream Corn . . 2 - 35c
Sliced Bacon 45c (Broken Slices)	Milton Tender Peas 2 - 19c
Lard 2 lbs. 59c	Texas Gold Grapefruit Juice 2 - 19c
Shortening 39c lb.	Jady Jean Grapefruit . 18c
Beef Roasts 47c lb.	Lady Jean Orange Juice 46 oz. 27c
T-Bone Steaks 65c Good Beef	Trend (for your dishes and laundry) . . 2 - 33c
Stewing Hens 39c lb.	Monarch Coffee . . . 46c lb.
Royal Chef Clam Chowder . 2 - 39c	

TRY OUR DELIVERY SERVICE
Ready to Serve FOODS
616 Main — — — — — Phone 55

A GREAT COMBINATION
GOOD SERVICE
PLUS
Chrysler Corporation
MOPAR PARTS
FOR
Chrysler and Plymouth
CARS
PARTS
MOPAR
ACCESSORIES
LUBE TO THE RIGHT PLACE AND GET THE RIGHT PARTS
MIKE HUNT
Now in
Charge of Repair Shop
McCoy Motors
6th & Wash. Phone 64

Golden Rule Appliance
711 South Pacific Highway
Phone 703