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McLAUGHLIN
Plaintiffs,

8] deceased;

JVEY
HAZLETON,
the unknown heirs of

 widow; HAZEL MALTBY

" LOTTE

person; ROSA HAZLETON,

her

YHDE and ELIZA-
husband and
E. EVENSON;,
and
MeLAUGHLIN, husband

: the unknownl
IE MAY IRVIN and
IRVIN, her hus-
th deceased; the unknown
FRANCES MARION
the un-
'of HARRISON HAR-
AZLETON, deceased;'
a widow;
ﬂn unknown heirs of JOHN WES-
|LEY

HAZLETON, deceased;
§ JAMES
- MONROE HAZLETON, deceased; |
4 SCOTT HAZLETON, a
and
mvu C. MALTBY, her hus-
NIETA JONES, a widow;

AE HAZLETON and RALPH

N, her husband; CHAR-
BLAISDEL and M.
EL, her husband; SHIR-
BURKEHOLDER, a single

widow; HARRY B. HAZLETON
and JANE DOE HAZLETON, his
wife; LLOYD F. HAZLETON and
. MRS, LLOYD F. HAZLETON, his
wife; ERMA WEIR and JOHN
hubband

p—

DOE WEIR,

ALMANAC

FOR MOTORISTS
AUG. 21-27

ST |
'WASHINGTON FAIR
,August 21-24, Lewis Coun-
ty Furgrounds, midway be-
- tween Chehalis and Cen-

~ gralia, Washington,

¢ J County, Aug;ust 21-
123, Island, Columbia
;Cbunty, Oregon; Payette

, August 21-23, New

~ Plymouth, Idaho; Crook
2y (including Croolzed
;“"; Roundup), August

4, Prineville, Oregon;
County, August

.30, Canby, Oregon; Ska-
County (4-H Club),

ﬂﬁmmzmm Mt. Vernon,
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y DEANE E, HAZLETON and MRS.

: COURT OF DEANE L. HAZLETON and MRS.
OF OREGON FOR GEORGE WASHINGTON

HAZ-
LETON and GRACE HAZLETON,
his wife; ROYAL HAZLETON, a
single person; the unknown heirs
of R. HL HAZLETON, sometimes
known as ROYAL P, HAZLETON,
and MARTHA C. HAZLETON,
husband and wife, both deceased;
MAUDE M. THOMPSON and
'JAMES THOMPSON, her hus-
' band; WILLIAM F. CAREY and
| MABLE C. CAREY, his wile;
EMILIY J. HAMMER, some-
times EMILY AUMMER, JOSH-
UA BROWN, a single person;
ELLA MOSER and ED MOSER,
her husband; VERA L. BOYD and
CLARENCE C. BOYD, her hus-
band: J. H. GOODMAN and
MARY GOODMAN, his wife; un-
y known heirs of C. STEVENSON,,
deceased; GEORGE WALDEN and
EMMA WALDEN, his wife;
MARK WALDEN and ELSIE
WALDEN, his wife; JOHN WAL-
DEN and PEARL WALDEN, his
wife, PAUL' WALDEN and
GIRLIE WALDEN, his wife;
RALPH WALDEN and CLEMINE
WALDEN, his wide; ROY WALD-
EN, a single person; CLAUDE
WALDEN and EDNA WALDEN,
his wife;: KATE WALKER, a wid-
ow; FLETCHER C.
and SIBYL C. ENGLAND, his
wife; GILBERT R. WISEMAN

and JULIA WISEMAN, his wife; |

MARK K. JOHNSON, a widower;
RACHEL WALKER, a widow;
AMY COFFIELD and JOHN
COFFIELD, her husband; INA
GETZ and MOSES GETZ, her
| husband; JOHN WALKER ‘and
MARY WALKER, his wife;
CLARA WALKER, a widow; AL-
ONZO WALKER, a widower;
LLOYD WALKER, a single per-
son; WINSTON WALKER, a
single person; WIEEY WALKER,
{a single person; HENRY HOL-
MES, a widower; DORA WALK-
ER, a single person; NEVA
WALKER DOE and JOHN DOE,
her husband; RAY WALKER and
JANE DOE WALKER, his wife;
DAVID B. HOLMES, miner;
MARVENA HOLMES MARSH-
MARSHALL,
her husband; LORENE HOLMES
rWARD a divorced person; ZANE
{OLIVER HOLMES, a minor;
IFCHO LANE and PAUL LANE,
her husband; ‘GALE WALKER
and MARY WALKER, his wife;
BOYD WALKER and MARGAR-
ET WALKER, his wife; SIBYL
WALKER, a single person; MARY
JANE KANANN and BUD KAN-

a

ANN, her husband; BONNIE
BETH McCLINTOCK and TRESS
McCLINTOCK, her husband;

|CLELLA E. "WALKER BEN-
NETT and WILLIAM BENNETT,
 her husband; FRANCES CHRIS-
MAN, a widower; the unknown
heirs of WILEY A. CHRISMAN,
| deceased; the-unknown heirs of
|any of said parties, if any are de-
ceased, also all other persons or
parties unknown claiming any
right,
est in the real estate described in

the complaint herein, defendants.

TO: THOMAS PERRY HAZ-

'LETON and MARY P. HAZLE-

TON, his wife; MARY H. BROCK-
ELBANK, a divorced person; un-
known heirs of NELLIE MAY
IRVIN and ARCHIBALD IRVIN,
her husband; both deceased; the
unknown heirs of FRANCES
MARION HAZLETON, deceased;
the unknown heirs of HARRISON,
HARVEY HAZLETON, deceased;
KATE B. HAZLETON, a widow;
the unknown ‘heirs of JOHN
WESLEY HAZLETON, deceased;
,unknown heirs ‘of WILLIAM
HENRY HAZLETON, deceased;
the unknown heirs of JAMES

| MONROE HAZLETON, decessed;

DANAE E. HAZLETON and
RALPH HAZLETON, her hus-
band; ROSA HAZLETON, a wid-

ow; HARRY B. HAZLETON and
JANE DOE HAZLETON, his
wife; LLOYD F. HAZLETON and
MRS. LLOYD F. HAZLETON,
his wife; EMMA WEIR and JOHN
DOE WEIR, her husband;
DEANE L. HAZELTON and MRS.
DEANE L. HAZLETON, his wife;
 GEORGE WASHINGTON HAZ-

LETON and GRACE HAZLETON,

his wife; ROYAL HAZLETON, a
single person; the unknown heirs
lof R. H. HAZLETON, sometimes
known as ROYAL P. HAZLETON,
and MARTHA C. HAZLETOWN,
| hushand and wife, both decea<.d;
( EMILY J. HAMMER, sometimes
EMILY HUMMER; J. H. GOOD-
MAN and MARY GOODMAN, his
| wife; unknown heirs of C. STEV-
| ENSON, deceased: GEORCGE
| WALDEN and EMMA WALDEN,
| his wife;
{ ELSIE WALDEN, his wife; PAUL
WALDEN and GIRLIE WALLEN,
' his wife:
{ CLEMINE WALDEN, his wife;
ROY WALDEN, a single perso;
{ CLAUDE WALDEN and EDNA
WALDEN, his wife; MARK K.
| JOHNSON, a  widower; AMY
| COPFIELD and JOHN
FIELD, her husband: INA GETZ
and MOSES GETZ, her husband;
JOHN WALKER and MARY
WALKER, his wife; NEVA
WALKER DOE and JOHN DOE,
her husband; RAY WALKER and
JANE DOE WALKER, his wife:

ONZO WALKER, a widower:;
LLOYD WALKER, a single per-
son; WINSTON WALKER, a
single person; WILEY WALKER,
a single person; MARVENA
HOLMES MARSHALL and ——A
MARSHALL, her husband, LOR-|
ENE HOLMES WARD, a divorc-

ANN, her husband; P'RAN('IS
CHRISMAN, a widower; the un-,
known heirs of WILEY A. CHRIS-
MAN, deceased; the unknown

ENGLAND

title, estate, lien or inter-|

MARK WALDEN and |

RALPH WALDEN and|

COF- |

CLARA WALKER, a widow: AL-|

|MARY WALKER, his wife; AN-
|SIL  WALKER and LAURA
WALKER, ' his wife; SIBYL

any L m

also all olther per-
sons or parties unknown claiming
any right, title, estate, lien or in-
terest in the real estate described
in the Complaint herein,

DEFENDANTS
IN THE NAME OF THE
STATE OF OREGON: You are

hereby summoned and required to
appear and answer the Complaint
of the plaintiffs filed against you
in the above entitled suit on or
before the last day of the time
prescribed in the order of pub-
lication, to-wit: on or before the
'4th day of September, 197, and
if you fail to so appear and an-
swer, for want thereof the plaint.
iffs will apply to the above en-
titled Court for the relief prayed
for in the Complaint, to-wit: that
you, and each of you, be adjudged
to have no estate or interest what-
,soever in and to the land
premises herein described, to-wit:
Beginning at a point in the
northerly line of Main Street
in Cottage Grove, Lane Coun-
ty, Oregon, 163.56 feet north-
easterly from south corner of
County Survey 198, run thence
north 43° west 92 feet to a
point 5 feet distant from
northwesterly line of said
survey, thence north 65 feet,
more or less to south line of
Wall Street, thence east along
said south line 7921 feet to
the northwest corner of tract
of land conveyed to J. K.
Palmer by deed recorded on
page 115 of volume 66, Lane
County Oregon Deed Records,
thence south 3656 feet to
the southwest corner of said
Palmer tract, thence south-
ecasterly 18 1/3 feet to north-
erly corner of a tract convey-
ed to Annie Heinrich by deed
recorded on page 66 of volume
48, Lane County Oregon Deed
records, thence southwesterly
20 feet to west corner of said
tract; thence southeasterly
by direct line to peoint in
northerly line of Main street
60 feet northeasterly from be-
ginning, thence south 47
west along street 60 feet to
the place of beginning, in
Lane County, Oregon.
Beginning at a point 40 feet
East of the Northeast corner
of Lot one in Block *two in
Hazleton's Second Addition to
Cottage Grove, Oregon, as
platted and recorded at page
333 of volume N of Lane
County Oregon Deed Rec-
ords, and running thence
southerly 785 feet to the
Northwest corner of Lot Two
in Fractional Block three in
Hazleton's First Addition to
Cottage Grove, Lane County,
Oregon, as platted and re-
corded at page 288 of volume
G of Lane County Oregon
Deed Records, thence South
35°45' east 65 feet, thence
north 54°15° east 265 feet,
thence Northerly 114.5 feet to
a point 60 feet east of the
point of beginning, thence
West 60 feet to the place of
beginning, all in Lane Coun-
ty, State of Oregon.
Beginning at a point 3355
feet east and 36.49 feet south
of the Northwest corner of
County Survey No. 198 and
running thence North 43°
west 10 feet; thence south
47° west 10.72 feet; thence
west 13.34 feet; thence south
43° east 191/3 feet; thence
south 47° west 20 feet; thence
south 43° east 36 feet; thence
north 47° east 401/3 feet;
thence north 43° west 35 feet
to the place of beginning, in
Section 28, Township 20 South
Range 3 W.W.M., Lane Coun-
ty, State of Oregon.
Also:

eginning at the southwest
corner of intersection of West

Main and Wall Streets, in

Cottage Grove, Lane County,

Oregon; thence south 47°

west on the west line of West

Main Street 522/3 feet;

thence west 92/3 feet;

thence North 365/6 feet to
the south line of said Wall

Street and thence East 118

feet to the place of begin-

ning, all being in Lane Coun-

ty, State of Oregon.
and that the plaintiffs are the
owners in fee simple of said real
property as set out in the Com-
plaint herein, and that you, and
each of you, be forever enjoined
and debarred from asserting any
>laim whatsoever thereto adverse
to the plaintiffs; and for such
other and further relief as to the
Court shall seem just and equit-
able.

This Summons is published pur-
(suant to an order made by the
HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Judge
of the Circuit Court of the State
of Oregon for Lane County, on the
| 5th day of August, 1947, which

order directs that this Summons
| be published once a week for four | TAGE, her husband;
| successive weeks in the Cottage | BALES and MAUD H.
a weekly news-| his wife;
paper of general circulation print- | | divoreed person;
e and published in Cottage Grove, 'MUNSON.

Grove Sentinel,

and

of

B.M.. which will be offered for!
each species and the total consid-
eration which will be paid for the
timber. No bid for less than the
appraised value will be considered.
Each bid must be submitted in
duplicate and be accompanied by a
deposit in the form of a certified
check in favor of the Treasurer of
the United States. The deposit of

any successful bidder will be cred-

ited on the contract. Payment in
full at the time of filing the con-
tract is required in sales amount-
ing to $10,000.00 or less. For cop-
ies of the form of proposal, form
contract and bond, terms of
payment, amount of deposit re-

quired with bid, amount of bond

required with contract and other
information, application should be
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made to the address shown above
IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S, R.

6 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable tim. |
| ber

signated for cutting on the
NWESWY, SENSWY, and SW
WSEN, estimated for the purpose |
of this sale to be 1010 M. feet

| Douglas fir. No bid for less than

'dar Poles
$11.20 per M.ft.B.M. for the Doug-
las fir,
Hemlock, $2.50 per M.ft.B.M.

$3.00 per M.ft.B.M., or a total pur-
chase price of $£3,030.00, will be
considccad, T. 15 S, R. T W, Sec
15, all merchantable timber des-
ignated for cutting on a portion of
the SWILSWY, estimated for the

purpose of this sale to be 175 M

feet Douglas fir, 20 M. feet Hem-
lock, 5 M. feet Western Red Cedar,
120 Lineal Feet Western Red Ce-
No bid for less than

$2.95 per M.ft.B.M. for the
for

 the Western Red Cedar, $.05 per

Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar
Poles, or a total purchase price of
2,037.50, will be considered. An
area of approx. 34.7 acres lying
north and west of a creek flowing
through the sale area and lying
west of a blazed and posted re-

serve line is reserved from cutting,

including blazed and posted line
trees. T. 17T 8. R. 1 W, Sec. 3,
merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on the SE
NEY, and WSEY, estimated

for the purpose of this sale to be

1090 M. feet Douglas fir, 45 M
feet live Western Red Cedar, 110
M. feet dead Western Red Cedar

| No bid for less than $3.00 per M.

' Fir,

' per M.ft. BM. for the White

or

ft. BM. for the Douglas fir, $2.50
per M.ft. BM. for the live Western
Red Cedar, $1.00 per M.[t.BM
for the dead Western Red Cedar,
a total purchase price of $3.-

49250, will be considered. All

green trees in the SKUSEYNE 4%
and in the SHSWYSEY are re-
served from cutting. T
4 W., Sec.
ber designated for cutting on the
NYUNEY

20 S.. R.
5, all merchantable tim-

, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 1725 M.
feet Douglas fir, 75 M. feet White
295 M. feet Incense Cedar
No bid for less than $4.90 per M.
ft. B.M. for the Douglas fir, $2.75
Fir,
$2.40 per M.ft. B M. for the Incense

| Cedar, or a total purchase price of |

, $9,366.75, will be considered. All
| timber cut from the above des-

cribed areas must be manufac-
tured in the loeal marketing ares

| designated by the Bureau of Land

Management unless otherwise au-
thorized by the Regional Adminis-
trator. In case of two or more
identical bids for the same timber,
the successful bidder will be se-
lected on the basis of comparative
ability to produce immediately
lumber for the Emergency Veter-
ans Housing program and to fur-
ther the objectives of the Act of
August 28 1937. The right is here-

| by reserved to waive technical de-
' fects in this advertisement;

to re-
ject all bids, or to award the tim-
ber for the amount of the highest
bid to other than the highest bid- |
der when necessary, pursuant to
the Act of August 28, 1937 (50
Stat. 874), in order to provide a
continued supply of timber to lo-!
cal industry and contribute to the |
permanence of the community
which is dependent upon such in-
dustry. Dated at Portland, Ore-
gon, this 15th day of August, 1947.
W. H. Horning, Regional Admin-
istrator, Region 1, Bureau of Land
Management. 2-2tc-3 i

SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF

| THE STATE OF OREGON FOR

LANE COUNTY
CLARA RATLIFF, a widow; W.
M. HARPOLE and ROSETTA J.
' HARPOLE, husband and wife,
Plaintiffs,
Vs,
ALBERT LAND and VIVA LAND,
his wife; LESLIE LAND and
HATTIE LAND, his wife; CHES-
TER LAND and MRS. CHESTER
LAND, his wife; RALPH LAND
and GLADYS LAND, his wife; |
HOMER LAND and MAY LAND,!
his wife; RAYMOND LAND and
RUTH LAND, his wife; MYRTLE
ISAACSON and ARTHUR 1IS-
AACSON, her husband; NAOMI
PRESTAGE and RAY PRES-
FRANK C.|
BALES, |
L. R. EDMUNSON, a|
ELLA T. ED-|
a divorced person;

Oregon, and that you be required | WISTER MORRIS, a single per-|

1
I

to appear and answer on or before
the last day of the prescribed in
|said order, to-wit; on or before
| the 4th ay of September, 1947,
lDate of first publication August
Tth, 1947, Date of last publication
September 4th, 1947. HERBERT
|W. LOMBARD, Attorney for
+| Plaintiffs. Residence and Post Of-
fice address: Cottage Grove, Ore-

! 52-5¢t-4

| 20]‘1

| Sealed bids, marked outside “Bid
| for Timber”, and addressed to the
iRegional Administrator, Bureau

WALKER, a single person; MARY | of Land Management, Swan Island
JANE KANANN and BUD KAN-| Administration Building, Portland

18, Oregon, will be received until
nnd opened at 10:30 a. m., Pacific
| Standard Time Sept. 9, 1947 for
the purchase of timber upon tracts
hereinafter described; each bid

L

ed person; GALE WALKER and N()TICE OF TIMBER SALE. |

unt per M, feet,

son; unknown heirs of CHARLES
SCADDING, Trustee Sole, de-|
ceased; DIOCESE OF OREGON, o
non-profit corporation; BENJA-|
MIN DAGWELL, Protestant Epis.
copal Bishop of Oregon, a corpor-
ation, sole and successor in inter-|
est to BISHOP CHARLES SCAD- |
DING; the unknown heirs of any
of the above named persons or
parties, if any are deceased; also,
all other persons or parties un-
known claiming any right, title,
estate, lien or interest in the real
estate described in the Complaint
herein, Defendants.
Case No, 34120

TO: ALBERT LAND and VIVA
LAND, his wife; LESLIE LAND
and HATTIE LAND, his wife;
CHESTER LAND and MRS,
CHESTER LAND, his wife;
RALPH LAND and GLADYS
LAND, his wife; HOMER LAND

| husband; NAOMI

" | SCADDING,

estate

and MAY LAND, his wife; RAY-
| MOND LAND and RUTH LAND,
his wife; MYRTLE ISAACSON
and ARTHUR ISAACSON, her
PRESTAGE

and RAY PRESTAGE, her hus-
band: FRANK C. BALES and
MAUD H. BALES, his wife; WIS-

TER MORRIS, a single person;
unknown heirs of CHARLES
Trustee Sole, de-
the unknown heirs of any
of the above named persons
parties, if any are deceased; also
all other persons or parties
known claiming any right, title,
tate, lien or interest in the real
described in the Complaint
DEFENDANTS

IN THE NAME OF THE
STATE OF OREGON: You are
hereby summoned and required to
appear and answer the Complaint
of the plaintiffs filed against you
in the above entitled suit on or
before the last day of
prescribed in the order
cation, to-wit: on or before the

ceased;

ns

herein,

the time
of publi
18

day of September, 1947, and if you
fail to so appear and answer, for
want thereof the plaintiffs will ap-
ply to the above entitled Court
for the relief prayed for in the
Complaint, to-wit: that you, and

adjudged 1o have

whatsoever

each of you, be
no estate or interest
in and to the land or premises des
cribed herein:

Lot Three (3), Block Two (1),

D. G. McFarland's Fifth Addi

tion to Cottage Grove, L

County, Oregon

Lot One (1) in Block Six (6)
Plat of Georgetown,
the same is platted and recorded
at page 40 of volume 2, of Lane
County Oregon Plat Records, in

ane

in
Oregon, as

Lane County, Oregon
and that the plaintiffs are the
owners in fee simple of the re
spective portions of said property

as set forth in the Complaint here-
in; and that you, and each of you,
be forever enjoined and debarred
from :|-_-u-|1‘|m.: any claim whatev-
er thereto adverse to the plaintiffs
and for such other and further re
lief as to the Court shall seem jusi
and equitable.

This Summons is published
pursuant to an order made by the
HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Cir

cuit Judge of the State of Oregon
for Lane County, on the 19th day
of August, 1947, which order di-
rects that this Summons be pub
lished once a week for four
cessive weeks in the Cottage
Grove Sentinel, a weekly news.
paper of general circulation pub-
lished in Cottage Grove, Lane
County, Oregon, and that you be
required to appear and answer on
or belore the last day of the time
prescribed in said order, to-wit

sue

ion or before the 18 day of Septem-

ber, 1947 .Date of first publication

| August 21, 1947. Date of last pub-

lication Septernber 18th, 1947
HERBERT W. LOMBARD and
RICHARD L. THWING, Attor-
neys for Plaintiffs. Fesidence and
Post Office Address: Cottage
Grove, Lane County Oregon
L-5tc-6

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.
Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid
for Timber,” and addressed to the
Regional Administrator, Bureau of
Land Management, Swan Is-
land, Portland 18, Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A M. Pacific Standard Time,
September 9, 1947, for the purchase
of timber upon tracts hereinafter
described; each bid must state the
amount per M. [eet B.M., which
will be offered for each species and
the total consideration which will
be paid for the timber. No bid for
less than the appraised value will
be considered. Each bid must be
submitted in duplicate and be ac«

companied by a deposit in the form

| amount of deposit
|
or

un-'

'of a certified check in favor of
the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of any suc-
cessful bidder will be credited on
the contract. Payment in full at
the time of filing the contract is
required in sales amounting to
| $10,000.00 or less. For coples of the
form of proposal, form of contract
and bond, terms of payment,
required with
bid, amount of bond required with

contract and other information,
application should be made to the
address shown above, IN LANE
COUNTY: T. 188, R. 1 E, Sec
19, all merchantable timber desig
nated for cutting on the NEY

NWLY. Lot 1 (NWILUNWLK), Lot
2 (SWENWLY ), SENNWI esti
mated for the purpose ol this sale
to be 4125 M. feet Douglas fir
170 M. feet Hemlock, 115 M, feet
White Fir, 685 M. feet Western
Red Cedar, 15 M. feet Incensd
Cedar, 5775 Lin. Ft. Western Red
Cedar Poles. No bid for less than
$10.45 per M.ft.B.M. for the Doug
las fir, $2.75 per M.Mt.BM. for
the Hemlock and White Fir, $5.15
per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red
Cedar and Incense Cedar, $006 per
Lin.ft, for the Western Red Cedar
Poles, or a total purchase price
of $46.383.75. will be considered
I' I8 S R 1 W.. Sec. 23, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on Lot 1 (NEWNEY)
Lot 2 (NWYUNEW), Lot T ISW4

NE%), Lot 8 (SEMNEW). esti
mated for the purpose of this sal
to be 4095 M. feet Douglas fir,
15 M. feet Hemlock, 20 M. feet
Incense Cedar, 30 M, feet White
Fir 0 M. feet Red Cedar, 950
Lin. Lt. Western Red Cedar Pole

No bid for less than $10.40 per
M.It. B M. for the Douglas fir £3.10
per M.ft.B M. for the Hemlock and
White Fir, $2.75 per M.ItBM. for
the Incense Cedar, S3100 per M

ft.BM. for the Red Cedar, 300
per Linit. for the Western Red
Cedar Poles, or a total purchase
price of* $42,950.00, will be con-

is to be done by
tractor equipment
authorized in
the officer in charge
ile All timber cut fron
descril must be
manufactured in the local market
ing area designated by the Bureau
of Land Management unless othet
authorized by the
Admini In case of two or
more identical bids for the
timber, the successful bidder will
se¢lected on the i com
ibility to produce imme
Emergi
and to

Aot

sidered. Logging
caterpillar-type
unless  otherwise
writing

of 1t

hy

the above wil aren

wise ':l'.:ll-ll.li
traton
s
be basis «
parative
diately lumber for the
Veterans Housing program
further the objectives of the
of August 28 1937. The right |
hereby reserved to waive techni
cal defects in this advertisement
to reject all bids, or to award the
timber for the amount of the high-
est bid to other than the highest
bidder when neccessary, pursuant
to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50
Stat. 874), in order to provide a

ncy

PLUMBING
PHONE 26-F-2

If you want quick service

-

J. P. Walker

20 South 5th Street
48-tfe

WELDING

Acetylene and Electric
Steel Fabrication
Cast lron, Aluminum

ACME WELDING SERVICE

330 80. 10th ST.

FINE BREAD

TASTE IT !

Q Horn Sand & Gravel

QQ
'
\
— |
Rl !
!
continued supply of timber to local Live on a Polalo
industry and contribute to the One potato will supply 100 calo:
permanence of the communily ey or about one twenty-fifth of the
which Is dependent upon such in amount of calories recormimended for
dustry. Dated at Portiand, "r_- ROD, ' the average adult for dally eon.
this 1st day of August, 1847, W sumption. However, it is essential
H. Horning, Regional Administra- (hat a balanced ration be utilized.
tor, Region 1, Bureau of Land o
Management, Swan Island Admin
istration Hil:hhl‘uj_ Portland 18 ||
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WELDING =

NOTICE

TO CREDITORS
NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN
that 1 have been appointed Ad cottag. Grov.
ministrator of the » Extate of ROB w‘ld'n‘ work.
ERT ROYAL LINDEN, Deceased
All persons having claims against Portn.hle Weldinp; Any Plﬂ“ !
id Estate are required 1o pre- § 1030 Madison ~ Phone 181Y :
er vouchers, within six months ol | A tfexxx '
the date hereof, to me at the law
¢ Of Herbert W, la bard, W - -~ - — '
Building, Cottage Groy e .
kon ]
Dated and first published Aug c“. Pool'
ust 14, 1347. KARL K. MILI Ad
ministrator and HERBERT W Septlc Tanks
LOMBARD, Attorr -2

Cleaned i

If you want your job dome

Underground Sea Crulse

L o . W, et
one of the « t strel '
' ' A .. The unt A C. C. Simon
e e oy e O vy (] PDone 33  Free Inapection i
sy y expl ' S1LRB1n-5
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f Adelaide re P P S
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aergr nd sea i | Ly
collapsible boa! Pat’'s Saw and

Lawn Mower
Shop

e ——

Concrete Products

41 8. Oth Bt ;
Bullding Blocks, all slees; Pler - '
Blocks: Chimney Blocks; ete, We sre Bow prrpnred to do ]

Walerprooling.

Cecil C. Wooley

Main Street

Chain Saw Filing ’

AS WELL AS CROSS CUT,
CIRCLE & HAND SAWS.
tf LAWN MOWERS AND
OTHER TOOLS
SHARPENED.,

29 Ih-tx.

East

® TILLS
. ® MULCHES
* CULTIVATES

Increaiens Crop Yield

o e —

15% 1o 40% i
o Loyal Order of i
7 Seig Moose
Cuts 16" Swer™ ’
]
i
Pater i
Pendrg '
I

ﬂum&zt%%ow-

® Reconditions your soil, pre-
vents erosion, increases your
crop yield, M-E Garden Tiller
has been tried and proven
‘rom coast to coast, isfamous

i -, for ruge
.E

;"qs'\ ged cons
GARDEN TILLERS

Box 345 Phone 63
LODGE NO. 810

Lodge meets every Tuesday
night at 8:00 o'clock.

Auxiliary Every 1st & 3rd’
Thursdays, 8:00 P. M.

ROTARY

-
Club Hours
Closed all day Sundays

Open Monday thru Saturday '
4t012P. M.

_Satteriield's Taxi & Wrecker Service

24 hour service
Sth & Main Phone 294R

AR tfexx

Floyd Githens
Motors ln(

Main

Nhh &

Try

SWEDISH MASSAGE

for Rheumatism, Arthritis, S8ore Back, 8tiff Neck,

C. P. ARMSTRONG, Masseur

719 Birch Ave. Phone 395-L

COTTAGE GROVE REDI-MIX

Let us help you with your concrete
problems. Concrete $9.50 per yard.
Located at .

Ho-tfe



ncen.se

