

GOOD BLOCK WOOD

CALL
TED'S FUEL
318J1

19-tfc

ARC & ACETYLENE WELDING

Cottage Grove Welding Works
Portable Welding Any Place
1030 Madison Phone 181Y
24-tfexxx

PLUMBING

PHONE 26-F-2
If you want quick service

J. P. Walker

20 South 5th Street
48-tfc

Pat's Saw and Lawn Mower Shop

41 S. 6th St.
We are now prepared to do
Chain Saw Filing
AS WELL AS CROSS CUT,
CIRCLE & HAND SAWS.
LAWN MOWERS AND
OTHER TOOLS
SHARPENED.
29-tfexxx

Don't Read This!!

Unless You Need

ROOFING

or ROOF REPAIRING

...
FREE ESTIMATES
AND
ROOF INSPECTION
...

Northwestern Roof Co.

Call 16-F-24 or
Write V. L. Bassett
Disston Rt., Dorena

Loyal Order of Moose



Box 345 Phone 63
LODGE NO. 810
Lodge meets every Tuesday
night at 8:00 o'clock.
Auxiliary Every 1st & 3rd
Thursdays, 8:00 P. M.

Club Hours

Closed all day Sundays
Open Monday thru Saturday
4 to 12 P. M.

Try a Sentinel Want-ad.

SWEDISH MASSAGE

for Rheumatism, Arthritis, Sore Back, Stiff Neck.
C. P. ARMSTRONG, Masseur
719 Birch Ave. Phone 395-L

WELDING

Portable, Acetylene, Electric
Welding Supplies and Equipment

Acme Welding Service

R. P. Bash, mgr, 330 So. 10th St. Ph. 181J
27-tfexxx

Chain saw, Crosscut, Handsaw and Circular Saw Filing
and Grinding.

I grind hand and power lawnmowers by machine.

HOURS 7 TO 3.

ALISON SAW SHOP

North river road near Birch
29-tfc

Plunkett's Associated Service Station

Steam Cleaning

Trucks

Automobiles

Lumber Carriers

Gas - Oil - Tires - Lubrication

-- AUTOMOBILES WASHED --

North 9th St.

Phone 188L

29-tfexxx

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Regional Administrator, Bureau of Land Management, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A.M. Pacific Standard Time, July 8, 1947 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$10,000.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY; T. 18 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of Lot 13 (SE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 950 M. feet Douglas fir, 15 M. feet Hemlock, 5 M. feet White Fir, 135 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 1200 Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$10.55 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and White Fir, \$4.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, \$0.05 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$10,736.25, will be considered. An area of approx. 6.5 acres lying north and east of blazed line is reserved from cutting, including blazed line trees. The sale area is to be logged with caterpillar type tractor equipment, unless otherwise authorized in writing by the officer in charge of the sale. T. 18 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 11, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of Lot 4 (NW $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$), portion Lot 5 (SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1580 M. feet Douglas fir, 30 M. feet Hemlock, 80 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 25 M. feet Incense Cedar, 800 Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$10.45 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Western Red Cedar, \$3.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$0.05 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$17,078.50, will be considered. An area of approx. 17.49 acres lying between blazed lines in Lot 4 (NW $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$), and an area of approx. 17.00 acres lying south and east of a blazed line in Lot 5 (SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$), are reserved, including blazed line trees. T. 18 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the W $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, all E $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3315 M. feet Douglas fir, 10 M. feet fire-killed Douglas fir, 85 M. feet Hemlock, 40 M. feet Red Cedar, 1800 Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$7.90 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the fire-killed Douglas fir, \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, \$0.05 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$26,803.50, will be considered. All live timber is reserved from cutting in an area of approx. 20.5 acres lying north and east of road right-of-way in eastern part of the W $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, T. 19 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the W $\frac{1}{2}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2005 M.ft. Douglas fir, 180 M. ft. Hemlock, 80 M. ft. White Fir, 490 M. ft. Red Cedar, 65 M.ft. Incense Cedar, 5450 Lineal Feet Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$8.20 per M.ft. B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, White Fir, Red Cedar, \$3.50 per M.ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$0.05 per Lin.ft. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$19,941.00, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the E $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3500 M. feet Douglas fir, 60 M. feet White Fir, 70 M. feet Hemlock, 250 M. feet Red Cedar, 245 M. feet Incense Cedar, 6800 Lineal Feet Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$8.85 per M.ft.B.M.

for the Douglas fir, \$4.00 per M.ft. B.M. for the White Fir and Hemlock, \$3.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar and Incense Cedar, \$0.05 per Lin.ft. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$33,691.25, will be considered. T. 21 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NE $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$), Lot 2 (NW $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$), Por. Lot 3 (SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$), Por. Lot 4 (SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$), N $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, Por. S $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, Por. Lot 7 (NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), Por. Lot 8 (NW $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), all Lot 9 (SW $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), Por. Lot 10 (SE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), Por. Lot 5 (NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$), Por. Lot 6 (NW $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 12,050 M. feet Douglas fir, 300 M. feet Incense Cedar, 60 M. feet White Fir, 25 M. feet Hemlock, 85 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 1060 Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$4.20 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, White Fir, Hemlock, and Western Red Cedar, \$0.05 per Lin.ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$71,314.50, will be considered. The following described areas are reserved from this sale, including blazed line trees: (1) An area of approx. 78.99 acres delineated by blazed lines and comprising approx. 4.50 acres in Lot 4 (SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$), approx. 12.50 acres in Lot 3 (SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$), approx. 15.00 acres in Lot 7 (NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), approx. 6.00 acres in Lot 10 (SE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), approx. 31.99 acres in Lot 5 (NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$), and approx. 6.00 acres in Lot 6 (NW $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$). (2) An area of approx. 15.50 acres surrounded by blazed line and comprising approx. 3.50 acres in the SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, approx. 7.50 acres in the SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, approx. 2.50 acres in Lot 7 (NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), and approx. 2.00 acres in Lot 8 (NW $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$). Logging is to be done with caterpillar type tractor equipment on those portions of the sale area designated by the officer in charge of the sale. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the Bureau of Land Management unless otherwise authorized by the Regional Administrator. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative ability to produce immediately lumber for the Emergency Veterans housing program and to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry and contribute to the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 29th day of May, 1947. W. H. Horning, Regional Administrator, Bureau of Land Management. 43-4tc-46

INVITATION FOR BIDS FOR FIRE TRUCK AND EQUIPMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that the Common Council of the City of Cottage Grove, will receive written bids for purchase of fire truck including, two-ton capacity chassis, motor driven 500 gallon pumper and equipment, on the 16th day of June, 1947, at the hour of 8 o'clock p. m. in the Council Chamber, City Hall, Cottage Grove, Oregon. Detailed specifications therefore are on file with the City Recorder of Cottage Grove. Each bid must be accompanied by certified check equal to 5% of the amount bid, as guarantee a contract will be entered into. The Common Council of Cottage Grove reserves the right to reject any and all bids. Done by order of the Common Council.
D. J. Allen, City Recorder.
43-2tc-44

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Administratrix of the Estate of GEORGE C. FARMAN, Deceased, has filed her account for the final settlement of said Estate in the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 8 day of July, 1947, at the Circuit Court Room of said Court in the County Court House in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing of objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. LILLY FARMAN, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 43-5tc-47

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That MAXINE ATTRIDGE, has been appointed Administratrix of the Estate of VIRGIL L. ATTRIDGE, by the Circuit Court of the Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said Estate are required to present them, with proper vouchers, within six months from the 5 day of June, 1947, to the said Administratrix, at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Wiser Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. MAXINE ATTRIDGE, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 43-5tc-47

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That ELSIE M. WIESE, has been appointed Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of EARL E. WIESE, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon. All

persons having claims against said Estate are required to present them with the proper vouchers, within six months from the 15th day of May, 1947, to the said Executrix, at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Wiser Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. ELSIE M. WIESE, Executrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 40-5tc-44

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned NELSON J. NELSON, Jr., and A. W. HELLWELL, have been appointed Executors of the Last Will and Testament of JAMES A. DAVIS, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, and have duly qualified as such Executors. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby notified to present the same, duly verified as required by law, with proper vouchers, within six months of the first publication of this Notice to the Executors of said Estate, at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Wiser Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. NELSON J. NELSON, Jr., and A. W. HELLWELL, Executors. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Executors. 44-5tc-48

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO FILE SUPPLEMENTARY ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION

Notice is hereby given that a Special Meeting of the members of The First Christian Church of Cottage Grove, Oregon, will be held on the 29th day of June, 1947, at the hour of 11:00 o'clock A. M., at the Armory, Cottage Grove, Oregon, for the purpose of considering the following question: Changing the name of said Corporation to "Church of Christ, Cottage Grove, Oregon." Dated June 12, 1947.
B. H. Neet
Dan Clashy
W. M. Harpole
Trustees.
44-1t

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Administrator of the Estate of ALTA E. HART, Deceased, has filed his account for the final settlement of said Estate in the Circuit Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 8 day of July, 1947, at the Circuit Court Room of said Court in the County Court House in Eugene, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing of objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. C. L. SPRAY, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 43-5t-47

Near-Perfect Food
Milk is not a perfect food but it is the most nearly perfect food we have, according to nutritionists. Milk contains all the nutrients known to be essential in the diet but does not contain enough of some vitamins and minerals to supply body needs fully.

Chinese Invented Macaroni
Macaroni was invented by the Chinese and introduced into Europe by the Germans, who taught the Italians how to make it. But the Italians deserve the credit for appreciating macaroni for by the 14th century they were the only Europeans extensively eating it.

PROMPT SETTLEMENT OF CLAIMS



J.B. LEONARD INSURANCE SERVICE
WISER BLDG. 617 MAIN ST.
TEL. 34
COTTAGE GROVE RES. #4

Latham Was an Early Settlement

The first white man to settle in this part of the Willamette valley was James M. Chapin. After sailing for Portland from San Francisco in 1849, his boat became shipwrecked at the mouth of the Rogue river. Under Chapin's leadership the survivors made their way northward to the Coast Fork of the Willamette. Soon Chapin decided to make his home here and built a log house near the present site of the John Dugan home which was built a few years later. Chapin's log house was the only one in the locality and served as an oasis for travelers between Oregon and California. Mr. Chapin lived on his Coast Fork claim the remainder of his life and never married.

Other early settlers were William White who came about 1853, Joseph Sharp in 1871, O. P. Adams in 1856, and Lou McKibben, Sr., in 1889.

Mr. White settled on the north side of the river, farther upstream. To reach the road on the other side, the river had to be forded near his place. Later a bridge was built there and called the Mary White bridge, in honor of his wife. Their son, Will White, of Cottage Grove, remembers spending many hours on the river bank, as a small boy, watching railroad ties smash down the river, and the men trying desperately to prevent a jam.

Joseph Sharp opened a store in 1872, selling groceries and dry goods. He was the postmaster and the Latham Post Office was located in his store.

In the early days a stagecoach operated between Willamette Valley points and Southern Oregon, via Divide, and the Coast Fork road was one of its stops. After the railroad was built, Latham was an important stop for trains, there being no Cottage Grove until later.

The first Latham school was built on some land donated by Henry Small and was located in the place which is now across the highway and track from West's store. It was called the Small schoolhouse, named after Mr. Small, the great great grandfather of Gary Abene. The first teacher was John Arnold who afterward became president on what is now known as College Crest in Eugene. This college was later moved to Corvallis and was the beginning of what is now known as Oregon State college.

The early settlers had many good times together. Some of their games were different from those we have now. One such game was called "town ball," a favorite among the people. A player ran from one base to another, and if the ball was thrown across before him, he was out. But if some one on his side made a big hit and ran clear around without stopping, the player who was out would get to come back in the game again.

We wish to thank the following for giving us information: Will White, Wilbur McFarland, Mrs. Frances Goudie, Mrs. Lou McKibben, Mrs. Hickethier, E. McReynolds, Mrs. H. Sharp, and Mrs. J. Graham for letting us read her Cottage Grove Leader, dated 1889. (Gary Abene, Georgena McReynolds, Catherine Heath.

During the time and since this story was written other interesting facts have been revealed by pioneers. Sophronia Knox McFarland, mother of Wilbur, Warren and Frank, moved to Delight Valley in 1853 at the age of seven. A little later she attended the (Latham) Small school which was six miles from home. They rode horseback mostly. Later they built a house, near the bridge which is on Main street in Cottage Grove now, closer so the children could attend school easier. This house was a landmark for many years.

The mother of Mrs. Hattie Best of Portland, Mrs. Lou Thompson, kept house for her uncle James Chapin (Uncle Jim to everyone) and attended Latham school as Lue Burton before her marriage in 1870. Among her classmates were Mrs. Joe Sharp, Mrs. Mary Massy, Mrs. Love Allen, the two J. H. McFarlands who were cousins. One of them was the father of Wilbur, Warren and Frank. Among the teachers were Mr. Nevill and Robert M. Veatch, father of Mrs. Ermine Young.

Thurs., June 12, 1947 The Sentinel, Cottage Grove, Oregon Page 9

Mrs. Best started to school in 1879. Among her first schoolmates were Luke Knowlton, Portland; Wes Chrisman, C. G.; and his sister, Mrs. Kirk of Salem; Mrs. Olivia Eakin, Bill Brown, Hattie McFarland, Mary Hambrick, Lydia Van Buren of Cottage Grove; and two nephews of George Hawley, Walter and Henry. There were 72 pupils in that little school building when the district was divided and a two story school building was built at Cottage Grove. Other pupils at Latham in the early years were Addie McDole Veatch and Oscar McDole, Mrs. R. R. Giltner of Portland; Wm. Keyes of Eugene; and Ernest McReynolds of Divide.

DRAIN SHOWS BIG GAIN IN POPULATION

Compiled census of Drain, recently completed under the direction of Adam Lefor of the office of the Secretary of State, shows a population of 966. This is a 65.1 per cent increase over 1940, when

the population was 597. It is expected to increase the revenue the city will receive from the state by more than \$1,000 annually.

WATCH THIS SPACE NEXT WEEK



Want smart-looking roofs with long-lasting protection against all kinds of weather? Prepared-paper and metal roofs really slick up when you paint them with Standard Asbestos Roof Coating. Its fire-resisting quality is in its large percentage of long asbestos fibers and mica; and these allow stretching and bending without cracking. It's tops, too, for coating inside of fruit-storing sheds.



J. F. FINNERAN
PHONE 16
7th and Madison

A STANDARD OF CALIFORNIA PRODUCT



You can when you travel by Greyhound

Greyhound gives you service...where you want it...when you want it! For short or long trips it's the most convenient way to travel...numerous, well-timed schedules fit right into your travel plans. And remember, you go by Greyhound at less cost than any other way to travel.

NEW BUSES NOW IN SERVICE The first of Greyhound's new fleet of Super Coaches are now in service...many more are on the way. They're the latest and finest in highway transportation!

Agent: Earl Gaines Address: 802 Main Phone: 97



BROWNSVILLE PICNIC JUNE 19-20-21

SHADES OF PIONEERS!

It's time again for the annual trek to Brownsville to celebrate the coming of our forefathers to this valley.

A big time is in store for all...with entertainment aplenty. May we extend our Best Wishes for a successful celebration.

This advertisement is appearing in 25 newspapers within company service areas of Linn, Benton, Polk, Tillamook, Lincoln, Marion and Lane counties

Mountain States Power Co.
"A Self-Supporting, Tax-Paying Private Enterprise"

