
DEPARTMENT OF THE IN-! 
TERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND 
MANAGEMENT, Washington, D. 
C. Notici* is heretty given that

• LEGAL NOTICES INOTICE OF TIMBER SALE... W Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid
DEI ARTMENT OF THE IN- for Timber," and addressed to the 

TeRIOR, BUREAU OF LAND Chief Forester, O. and C. Admin- 
MANAGEM^NT. Washington, D. iatration, 901 Guardian Building, 
C. Notice is hereby given that Portland 4, Oregon, will bo receiv- 
•Mdcd bids, in duplicate, marked ed until and opened at 10:30 A M.|«»i J
OUtaide "Bid for Timber", and ad Pacific Standard Time December1 Portlanddressed to the Chief Forester. O. 4. 1946 for the purchase of timber ............ * '
and C. Administration. 901 Guard- upon tracts hereinafter described; 
4»n Building, Portland 4, Oregon, each bid must state the amount 
wi*1 ”•^received until and opened Per M feet BM., which will be of- 

a m" pBPific Standaid fered for each species and the total 
Timo, December 3, 1946. for the consideration which will be paid 
Brchaso of timber upon the tract i for the timber No bid for less than 

reinafter described au timber the apprised value will be con- 
mu«t be cut and removed within «dered. Each bid must be sub- 
pve year» from date of approval mitted in duplicate and lie ac- 
of contract, the cutting and re- companied by a deposit in the form 
moval to be carried out in accord-1 of. a certified check in favor of 
ancc with the Forest Practice the Treasurer of 
Rules approved July 7, 1938, by' ®—*“ ■
the Secretary of the Interior. Each 
bid must state the amount per 
thousand feet, board measure 
Which will be paid for each ape-' 
cies and the total consideration 
Which will be paid for the timber 
Each bid must be submitted in

sealed bills, IN DUPLICATE, 
(narked outside “Bid for Timber", 
and addrossed to the Chief For-
ester. O. ami C. Administration,

4, Oregon, will be received until
and opened at 10:30 a.m.. Pacific 
Sfandard Time. .DECEMBER 3. 
1946, for the purchase of timber 
upon the tracts hereinafter de­
scribed. All timber must be cut 
and removed within FIVE yekrs 
from date of approval of contract, 
the cutting and removal to be car­
ried out in accordance with the 
Forest Practice Rules approved 
July 7, 1938, by the Secretary of 
the Interior. Each bid must state

State« L nited the amount per thousand feet,
«tssfui h^?^L^i?L.SU<i’,board measure, which will be paid 
the mmr J ' p ' 60 On tor each and the total con-
the t^i iPa‘Vn^' ln fU »tderajion which will be paid for 
the time of filing the contract is • -
required in sales amounting to 
$2500 or less. For copies of the 
form of proposal, form of contract

Each bid must be submitted in «nd bond, terms of payment, 
duplicate and ba accompanied by a amount of deposit required with 
deposit of $5,000 00 in the form of’ bid, amount of bond required with 
a certified check on a National contract and other informatioa, 
Bank In favor of the Treasurer of application should be made to the 
the United States. The deposit will address shown above. IN LANE 
be returned to unsuccessful bid- COUNTY: T, 1« S., R. 1 E„ See 
tiers; applied as part of the pur- 23. all merchantable timber desig- 
chase price of successful bidders: nated for cutting on a portion of 
or that portion of the deposit rep- ‘ ---------
resenting the minimum required 
by law to be deposited shall be re-

the timber. Each bid must be sub­
mitted IN DUPLICATE and be 
accompanied by a dc|s»it of $5.- 
00000 in the form of a certified 
check on a National Rank io favor 
of the Treasurer of the United 
States. The deposit will be re­
turned to unsuccessful bidders; 
applied as part of the purchase 
price of successful bidders; or that

tained as liquidated damages if 
the successful bidder shall not ex­
ecute contract and furnish satis­
factory bond within 30 days of the

the N'iSE'^NWh, estimated for 
the purpose of this sale to be 140 
M. feet of Douglas Fir. No bid 
for less than $7.85 per M.ft.BM 
or a total purchase price of $1,- 
099.00, will be considered. The sale 
area comprises approximately 4

acceptance of his bid. Bond will ____ ___________ ___ ______
be required in the amount of $7.- in the NKSEKNWQ The balance 
600.00. Payment for the timber of the subdivision is reserved, in- 
will be required in advance of cut- eluding blazed line trees. T 19 S.. 
ting, payable at the option of the 
purchaser, either as one lump sum 
or in partial payments of not less 
than $3,000.00 each, scheduled to 
keep pace with the rate of timber

acres lying north ofa blazed line

portion of the deposit representing 
the minimum required by law to 
be deposited shall bi* retained ks 
liquidated damages if the success­
ful bidder shall not execute con­
tract and furnish satisfactory bond 
within 30 days of the acceptance of 
his bid. Payment for the timber 
will be required in advance of cut­
ting. payable at the option of the 
purchaser, either as one lump sum 
or in partial payments of not less 
than $5,000.00 each, scheduled to

R. 1 E., Sec. 1. al) merchantable 
timber designated for cutting on 
a por. SHNEKNEK, por S’, 
SWQNEK, all SEKNEK. por. 
S’zNELNW',. por. SUNWL

CRESWELL
Mrs. C. H. Atwood, Mr, and 

Mrs John Wright, and Mrs. Louisa 
Powell attendisi the funeral of 
Mrs Charity Ann Gamble in Ku-
gene TueadRy afternoon. Mrs. 
Gamble was the mother of Mrs. 
Howell's son-in-law.

Mi and Mrs C, A. Ongman and 
son Jerry of Klamath Falls vis­
ited recently with Mr and Mrs 
J. T Kerr. Mr. Ongman was a' 
buddj of Vernon Kerr while in the 
service.

The Camas Swale Club met 
Tuesday for an all day meeting 
with Mrs. Paul Reid and Mrs. Ted 
Napper in charge of the dinner 
Officers for the new year were 
elected as follows: President. Mrs. 
Paul Reid, vice president, Mrs 
Guy Calhoun, secretary-treasurer. 
Mrs. Lester Whitney; assistant
secretary-treasurer, Mrs. John 
Napper. Their Christmas meeting 
was planned for next time. The 
hostesses will be Mrs. Calhoun. 
Mrs V w. Johnston, and Mrs 
Whitney The program will be pre­
pared by Mrs E W. Hoagland, 
Mrs E. O. Smith, and Mrs. O. H 
Smith. The gift exchange will be 
planned by Mrs. C. Scarbrough 
and Mrs R F Scott. Mrs Ra» 
Henderson. Mrs. Ruth Schilt. Mrs 
Ray Andrews, and Mrs. A. H.
Holmes were guests.

Mr and Mrs. George Dcrsham 
Ji from Kilauia Kauki. Hawaii 
have been visiting with the Kerr 
ami Denham families Mr Kerr is 
the manager of a sugar plantation 
in Hawaii.

Mr and Mrs. T H. Borden visit­
ed last week-end with Mr. and 
Mr» Cyrus Williamson at Malin. 
Oregon where Mr. Williamson is 
teaching.

Mary Atqi Ziniker played a violin 
solo. Bob Easterling wax the auc­
tioneer and a variety of things 
were auctioned. The Girl Scouts 
served cake, pic, ice cream and 
coffee.

Word has Ixvn received of the 
birth of a son to Mr. and Mrs. Lr- 
Roy Coleman at Canoga Park. Cal, 
Saturday. Nov 9 Mrs Coleman
is the former Mary Jane B<, by ami 
both were former residents of 
Ctouwell.

Mrs Arthur Mogstad underwent 
a major operation at a Eugene 
hospital Wednesday and is report- 
<*d doing nicely.

About 50 members and friends 
enjoyed a pot-luck lunch and so 
rial evening al the Mason-Eastern 
Star hall Saturday evening. The 
Duniway family furnished enter­
tainment. A group from Oakridge 
was present and extended an in­
vitation to the entertainment to 
•x* presented by the Rebekahs of 
Oakridge next Saturday evening 
at Oakridge

Mrs. Lettie Good has taken over 
the magazine agency that has been 
handled by Miss Genevieve

Thompaon. Mrs. Goo<l can be 
reached nt the home of her aunt, 
Mrs Dora Martin

I he Methodist Ladies Aid is 
making final plans for their chick- 
cn-pie xupiHu and bazaar to be 
held nt the Grange hall Frldny, 
Nov 22. The bazaar will often at

11 and »11 \ mg will« -t n t h 
5:30,

Mt and Mrs L J Quigley. Mr 
and Mrs Ralph Rogers, Mrs C. I’ 
Kent, Mildred and Margaret

Vaughan, and film Wicks received following 
the 7th degree at the National
Grange meeting in Port land Inst 
week Other» attending from Cres­
well were Mrs Fhj Wicks, and 
Mrs Anna Grou»t*eek

('lotcidale club met Thursday 
afternoon and finished quilting one 
quilt and started another for Mrs. |

In
charge: decorations, Mr». Ruaael
Tendick und Mr» Oliver Jame*.
program, Mrs. Na »h and Mrs. 
Uxinard Tendick; rrfroahment», 
Mrs. Helen Hemmelgarn and Mra^ 
Celia Scott. '

Mr. and Mitt l.nn<| orLouella Parks, Plans Were made —..............
to quilt again this Thursday The ,lniwn»ville vlsihxl with hl» par-
next meeting will be Dec. 5 and
will be the Chriatma» meeting. The last Friday

••nt». Mr and Mrs B. A Mud

LET US STEAM CLEAN YOUR MOTOR 
GENERAL REPAIR WORK ON ALL CARS 

All Work Guaranteed
• ARC AND ACETYLENE WELDING

CUTTS BROS
M SO !0TH ST IS GARAGE

PHONE 168R

WEISFIELD’S Do It Again tritìi a Great

Pre-Christmas SURPRISE SALE
The VFW Auxiliary held their 

business meeting Monday evening 
and planned for the community 
< hristmas tree and program. Miu 
Myrtle Smith, Mrs C Scarbrough, 
and Mrs Harold Johnston were 
appointed to plan the program.

Mrs. Dale Pitcher attended the 
wedding of Harold Pitcher and 
Misu Jacqueline Flug at Reedsport 
Sunday Mr. Pitcher is a cousin 
of Dale Pitcher.

Henry Van Prooyen of Ashland 
visited last week end with his 
sister. Mrs. Mary Lindsay

Honor Rebekah lodge met in 
regular session Wednesday e v e- 
ning and one application for re-

keep pace with the rate of timber 
cutting and payable upon demand 
from the Chief Forester. The suc­
cessful bidder will be required, 
prior to the approval of the con­
tract, to furnish a sworn financial 
statement showing ability to ful­
fill the terms of the contract. For

cutting and payable upon demand 
from the Chief Forester. The sue- ....... ................. .
cesaful bidder will be required. SW1«, SEKSWQ. and N’aSEQ. 
prior to the approval of the con- estimated for the purpose of this i 
tract, to furnish a sworn financial sale to be 980 M. feet of Douglas 
statement showing ability to ful- Fir. No bid for less than S2.00 per 
fill the terms of the contract. For M.ft.B.M., or a total purchase 
copies of the fwm of proposal, Price of $1,960.00, will be consid- 
contract, bond, detailed timber es- ered Approx. 15 acres lying out- *11 .¡mher rut 7 'timates. cutting restrictions, and side blazed line in the S4NE5 d^cXTn™^ following 
other information, application NEK, with the exception of road turwj ,n ,h„ 1™,. 8 2e manuiac- 
should be made to the Chief For- oght-of-way; approx 9 acres ly- UïnLtJ b^he <7^” r“ aT 
ester. O. and C. Administration. ,ng nor,h of road in the S*2SWK 1 minore- i d Ad‘
All timber cut from the following ^EK. approx 14 acres lying north Tdescribed area must Ha and east of road in ttw> h001™ by th» Chxf Forester In

NWQ, all SWQNW'4. por. SEL 
NW>4, all NEKSWL. ESNW'4

copies of the form of proposal, 
contract, bond, detailed timber es­
timates. cutting restrictions, and 
other information, applications« 
should be made to the Chief For­
ester. O. and C. Administration.

described area must be manufac-
tuned in the local marketing area 
designated by the O. and C. Ad­
ministration, unless otherwise au­
thorized by the Chief Forester. In 
case of two or more identical bids 
for the same timber, the successful 
bidder will be selected on the basis 
of comparative ability to produce 
immediately lumber for the Emer- j 
gency Veterans Housing program 
and to further the objectives of 
the Act of August 28, 1937. The 
right is hereby reserved to waive 
technical defects in this advertise-

and east of road in the S4NE1.
NW»4; approx 4 acres lying’north S‘as<’.or ,wo or identical bids 
of road in the S^NW <.NWQ Um^r’8UCC<,SS,U,
approx 10 acres ly ing north and bJdder wUI 1)0 selected on the basis 
east of road in the SE'.NW1, ? comparattye ability to product* 

immediately lumber for the Emer-

of road in the S’iNWLNWQ;

are reserved from cutting or log­
ging. Only dead and down trees are

PORTABLE Electric PHONOGRAPHS
At Almost ’A PRICE I

instatement was read. Second 
nomination and election of officers 
for next year was held. Mrs. R M 
Carpenter was elected noble 
grand; Mrs. Kenneth McCoy, vice­
grand. Henrietta Allen, treasur­
er Mrs. Lester Whitney, financial 
secretary. A recording secretily 
will lie elected at the next meeting. 
Mrs. McCoy and Mrs. V. W. John­
ston will represent the lodge at a 
meeting in Eugene November 22 
io plan for the district installation 
to be held in January. Mrs. Sidney 
Looke. the Theta Rho advisor, ask­
ed for more cooperation from the 
Rebekahs in the girls' activities. 
Miss Lola Ringsdorf, Mrs. Cooked 
Mrs. McCoy and Mrs. Louise Fine ■ 
served refreshments.

The high school football players 
and their fathers enjoyed a turkey 
dinner at the high school Tuesday 
evening. Mrs. Ross Graham. Mrs. , 
Chas. Ellis. Mrs. Webb. Mrs St. 
Clair. Mrs. Wm. Shoop, and Mrs. 
Hopper cooked and served the din­
ner. Better than 40 fathers and 
sons attended.

gency Veteians Housing program 
and to further the objectives of 
the Act of August 28. 1937. The 
right is hereby reserved to waive 
technical defects in this advertise­
ment; to reject all bids, or to 
award the timber for the amount 
of the highest bid to other than 
the highest bidder when necessary, 
pursuant to the Act of August 
28, 1937 ( 50 Stat. 874), in order

to be logged in the por of the S>3 
NE*4NEU. the road right-of-way- 
in the SUNEUNEU. por. S>2 

¡SWUNEU. the SEUNEU. the 
NUNEUSWU, and the NW>4 
SE>4. T. 19 S.. R. 7 W . Sec. 35, 
all merchantable timber designat­
ed for cutting on a portion of the 
NWUSEU. estimated for the pur­
pose of this sale to be 90 M feet . H ■ ----- !
Western Red Cedar. No bid for 0 «’'?,'nUPd supply of
less than $3.00 per M.ft.B.M. ori ttnber L° ,OCal lndustry so as to 
a total purchase price of $270.00' thc Perfnanen<* °f the com- 
will be considered. Western Red 
Cedar is the only species included 
in this sale. All other species ,and 
twxi areas totalling approximately 

---- .............  *■»«,> *cres lying north and east of 
such industry. The timber volumes Wazed llnes are reserved from 
Mated herein are standing timber c«tt‘n£ T 20 R 3 W.. Sec. 1. 
estimatga and may be more or ay f*rehantable timber designat- 
less th«n the actual amount«. The............................. on a P°rtion of the
timber »al« area ic: Per. NHNEH SE of the E«4SE*4, es-
Por. SEKNEU, AU SWWNEu' tu?at*d for the Purpose of this 
All WHSEK, Sec. 33, T. 19 S„ R. “le ‘2 »* 2740 M feet Douglas 
5 W„ W. M. The timber offered for i,>T‘ ieet Wh>te Fir. 25 M. 
«ale contains th« following vol- ,^’ ^»«nse Cedar, 10 M feet 
umes in board measure; 9,910 M ’Ve8t<>rn R«d Cedar. No bid for 
feat Douglas fir, 310 M feet In- 088 ,han 5535 P*r M.ft.B.M. for 
cense Cedar, 45 M. feet Western Fir. $2.75 per M.ft.
Red Cedar, 80 M. feet Hemlock, Fir. $2.50 per

ment; to reject all bids, or to 
award the timber for the amount 
of the highest bid to other than 
the highest bidder when necessary,
pursuant to the Act of August 28, 
2937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to
provide a continued supply of tim-1 
ber to local, industry so as to as- 
MtVe the permanence of the com­
munity which is dependent upon

munity which is dependent upon 
such industry. The timber volumes
stated herein are standing timber 
estimates and may be more or less 
than the actual amounts. The first 
timber sale area is: Portions 
NEKNWK. Lot 6 (NWKNWK) 
All Lot 7 (SW^NWV*) SEL 
NW >4. SWKNEK. Sec. 7, T. 17 S„ 
R. 1 W., W.M. The timber offered 
for sale contains the following vol­
umes in board measure; 5.025 M 
feet Douglas fir. 165 M. feet Hem­
lock, 70 M. feet Western Red Ce­
dar, 180 M. feet Incense Cedar, 
55 M. feet White Fir, and 2400 
Lineal Feet Western Red Cedar 
Poles. No bid for less than $5.30

About ten Theta Rho girls en­
joyed a skating party at the Mid­
way rink Thursday evening. Mrs. 
Fred Nichols. Mr. and Mrs. Sidney 
Cooke, and Mrs. Ted Mogstad ac­
companied the girls.

Mrs. E. W. Hoagland entertained 
the Presbyterian Missionary So- 
cleiy at her home Thursday after­
noon. Mrs. Richard Campbell led 
te lesson which was "Making

poen lefl 
neo Cedar, 80 M. feet Hemlock *or lnc wn,te Fir. $2.50 per nJ"« Z’n /*" l,,an »‘fsson which was "Making 
1,825 Lineal Feet Western Red Ce- ~ for the Incense Cedar. r _ 2, ^uglas fir. Christian Influence felt within a
dar Poles. No bid for less than 53M„ M.ft.B.M. for the West- We^tero f n™1®!*' Plans were mad.- for
$5.40 per M.ft.B.M. for the Doug- ern Red “”al Purchase da^ and their table of articles to lx* sold
las Fir, $2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for In- ot »15.122.75. will be consid- hf^ ?kr' a"d 50025 per - ■ ■ ■
cense Cedar. Western Red Cedar cred An ar<*a of approximately 10.- eiX o , f ,hc vv<‘s,ern R^ and Hemiock, .„d $0.025^«> acres lying north of blazed line ^cC of’°‘a’ Purchase 
eal Ft. for the Western Red Cedar ,n the SE>4NEK is reserved from 27 867 W* 66 c0™“*'
poles, or a total purchase price of cutt,nS including blazed line trees. 1 09V „ n area uof approximately $54.647.12 will bi conside^ An Th 21 S" R 2 W, Sec. 13. all mer- of Z NW* ¿°r’
area of approximately 13.50 acres chantable timber designated for blazed InJ ,« ' *' bo“nfded by a 
in the centra) portion of NEK ^’“ng on the SE'4NE>4. esiimat- ' ,s ’*serv«l from cut-
bounded by a blazed line, js re- ™ the PurPose of this sale to 
served {pom cutting including Douglas Fir, 105
bluNd-ttna tiws. Fred W. Johnson , iet‘ Western Red Cedar, 20 M 
Acting Director 15-ltc , 1 ’Pcenw Cedar, 20 M feetII 1 I White Fir. 325 Lineal Feet wJ«t

Lineal Ft. for the Western Red

---- is reserved from cut­
ting, including blazed Jine trees. 
Bond will be required in the

at the Ladies Aid bazaar to be 
held December 6. There were nine ‘ 
members out.

»----- ■ White Fir, 325 Lineal Feet West­
ern Red Cedar Poles. No bid for 
less than $6.85 per M.ft.B.M for 
the Douglas Fir, $3.50 per M.ft. 
B.M. for the Western Red Cedar,

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN 

TJmt I have been appointed Exe 
cdtor of the La^t Will and Testa- '°r 1?? Western Red Cedar, 
rngflt ot EDD JENKS, Deceased, i B
Ap persons paving claims ^gajnst 
sajd Estaar« required to present 
th» tame duly verified, together 
with proper vouchers, within six 
months of the date hereof to me 
at the Law Office of HERBERT 
W. LOMBARD, Wiser Building. 
Cottage Grove, Oregon. Dated and 
first published November 21. 1946 
GOTTFRIED GRABER, Executor 
HERBERT W. LOMBARD and 
ALTA KING, Attorneys. 15-5t-19

A son was born to Mr. and Mrs. 
R M. Carpenter at a Eugene hos­
pital Sunday, November 10. The 
baby has been named Gary John.

The auction and program at the 
grade school Friday evening was 
well attended and about $260 was 
added to the fund for the new 
stove for the school kitchen. The 
gratle school orchestra and chorus 
presented several numbers. Royce 
Bartel played a violin solo, Marjor- 
le Ziniker_played a piano solo, and

line in NMiNW% is reserved from 
cutting, including blazed line trees. 
Bond will be required in the

HURRY! HURRY! HURRY! $S020CEILING 
PRICEamount of $4,000.00. The second 

timber sale area is: Por. Lot 4 
(NW’4NW!4), Por. Lot 5 (SW% 
NW%), AH Lot 3 (NEUNW^t 
All Lot 6 (SEHNW^) Sec 23 
T 18 S., R 1 W. W.M The tim­
ber offered for sale contains the 
following volumes in board meas­
ure; 5,465 M. feet Douglas fir, 25 
M. feet Hemlock, 5 M feet West­
ern Red Cedar, 40 M. feet White 
Fir. No bid for less than $6.85 per 
M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, $2 50 
per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock 
Western Red Cedar, and White 
Fir, or a total purchase price of 
$37,610.25, will be considered. An 
area of approximately 20.00 acres 
more or Jess, in the west side of 
Lots 4 and 5, Jxiunded by a blazed 
line, is reserved from cutting, in­
cluding blazed Jine trees. Bond will 
be required in the amount of $5 -

WHEN THESE ARE GONE THERE'LL BE

i Cedar. $2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the 
White Fir. $0.025 per Lin.ft for 

j fhe Western Red Cedar Poles, or a 
i total purchase price of $5,035 88 
will be considered. All timber cut 
from the above described areas 
must be manufactured in the local 
marketing area designated by the 
O. and C. Administration unless 
otherwise authorized by the Chief 
Forester. In case of two or more! 
identical bids for the same timber 

, successful bidder will be se-’
NOwe« TO CREDITORS ""to^p,‘Xe/ m'uircd ’he

00000 Th" """• »
tratrix of the Estate of Melvin T P^STam and to fur-Jackson, Deceased, by the Circuit' I August28 1937'Th °f ?
Court of the State of Oregon fnr ^UiUst 1937. The right is here- 
Lane County, by an order dated 1 served to waive technical de- Noveinber ^9, 1946. AU peraons ? hT

CBS 

within six months™SUpp,y of *i"’b«-»° local 
hereof, DgtJand fire. ,ndUStry 80 ° t0 a88Ure ’hp Pre-

fi, 1^ 'he community which
JACKSON, Adminiitratrix HFR n .^ende?,t Upon such l^try 
BERT W. LQmUrD AttoS at Portland, Oregon, this 

Attorney. 15th day of November, 1946 15-ltc - lS-Ot-19

NOTICE to CREDITORS

amount of «6,000.00. The fourth 
arca Portions ofN*4NW'i, SW'4NW'4, W'iSW’4 I 

Sec. 25, T. 21 S„ R. 3 W_, W.M^ । 
The timber offered for sale con­
tains the following volumes in 
board measure: 4725 M. feet Doug- 1 
las fir; 135 M. feet Western Hem­
lock; 370 M. feet Western Red 1 
Cedar; 180 M feet Incense Cedar; 
5880 Lineal Feet Western Red Ce- '

Poles. No bid for less than 
1 10 M.ft.B.M. for the Done.

is: Lot 1 (NE‘/4NE\r)^ w r.ir' $3 „
<NW>4NE'4). portion Lot 3 NE and WesternW NW %), Portion Lot 4 (W, .RhPd <>dar, $2.75 per M.ft.11 M for 
NW'4), SW^NW'j Sec 1 T 1R ’,h Jnc<,nse Cedar, and $0.025 per 
S„ R. 2 W . W.M. The timber of-1 ^«tern Red Cedar

p tim 'te"*1 f?r sale conlai™ the follow- 
‘ "V volumes in board measure.

NO MORE AT THIS AMAZING PRICE I

If* Hie surprise buy of the »eaion—this super portable 
electric record player that really does things for your 
favorite records! Plug it in anywhere—for bell-clear 
danceable music ... or just for listening. Take it every­
where—it's so easy to carry in it» »mooth, light-weight 
ea»e. See ill Hear itl At WEISFIELD’S now-but 
hurry, and bo one of the lucky one» to have one of 
these sensational phonographs.

Now Only

Act of y4NWH )/ Port

1 - -----w-— • •• ; 335 M.
feet Western Red Cedar, 225 M

Poles, or a total purchase price of 
$26,254.50, will be considered. An 
area of 12.00 acres, more or less, 
lying south of a blazed line in the 
NE1, NW %; an area of 4.50 acres, 
more or less, lying north and west 
of blazed line in the NW'/iNWU' 
an area of 6.50 acres, more or 
teas, lying east of blazed line in

LOOK AT THESE FEATURES .
• Haw high «farting tar^sa mofar
• Impravod driva mechanism far synchronous tp»ad 

operation
• High fidelity crystal plck-sp
• Automatic valuma control
• Teno control
• Spooialfy designed 3-tuhe eloefronie amplifier
• Durable pigskin or buff loetheroffe cose
• Estre long length cord, molded plug
• Equipped with dosed needle cup

Remember... At WEISFIELD’S f
YOU CAN BUY THIS | 

SENSATIONAL OFFER AT < 

ONLY 1.25 WEEK I

BmSTSÄ T'T 8.7‘e” Darrel Stott anss sysÆtn"•

. z !■ ilock, 5000 Lineal Feet Western 
Bed Cedar Poles. No bid for less .«• . 
than $5.90 per M.ft.B.M for the ^2'Ot blazed linp in 
Douglas fir, «3.00 per M ft B M ( SW*NW%; an area of 20.00 
for the Western Red Cedar $275 T”” Or lylnK *°uth
per M.ft.B.M. for White Fir In b,azed ,,ne in ,he NW'¿swS; and 
cense Cedar, and Hemlock and T °l 10 00 acrM- or Ison^« Z’ „ . wnuocK, and Iess |ying nor(h of bla2M

the SW%SW% are reserved from 
cutting, including blazed line trees. 
Bond will be required in the 
amount of $4,000.00. Fred W. John-

| _ , „ । $0.025 per Lin.Ft for the Western
I Stott and Max Ellis suf- Red Cedar Poles, or a total pur-

„ j an automobile I ehase price of $43,096.75 will be 
accident in Eugene Monday. The considered. An area of 24 00 acres •»««. « a.™,«,. jmw „ north o(Stott car was badly damaged.

15-ltc 881 Willamette, Eugene


