. g O Ny OF TIMBER SALE.. MRS, RALPH MILNE, his wife: within ten days from the ‘date of SUMMONS
l‘l“GAlJ N()ll l(‘l“b Seal ||I l|lllllll- IIH-II:nId”nfil bl Hid CLARA AYERS and service of this citation upon you In the Circuit Court of th
Ton |||||iu|. and addressed to the AYERS, her husbend, DONALD il personally sgrved within Lane State of Oregon for Lane County
NOWIER Q¥ TIMBER SALE. o0 Forester, O, and C. Admini-| LeROY SHAW, s Minor; PATRI- | County Oregon, or within twenty OSWALD J. THIEL and JEAN C.
Sealed bids, marked outside “Bid stration, 901 Guardian Building, CIA MAY SHAW, & Minor: C. A, days il personally served nin THEL, his wife Plaintiffs
for Timber,” and addressed to the Portland 4, Oregon, will b e DORAN andd MRS, ( \. DORAN, any other county in the Stal ol v
Chief Forester, ©. and . Admini celved until I”"" opened nt 10:30 his wifs the unknown heirs of Oregon, or il served by publication ERNEST REDFORD and DORRIS
stration, 901 Guardian  Bullding A M., Pacitiec Standard Time, Sept, any of the above persons or par- then  withis Iwenty-cight  days REDFORD. hi ANGES
Portland 4, Oregon, will be re 10, 1946 for the purchase of tim " if anv are deecn nlso all from the date of first pubalic it jon SNOOK  and MELVIN SNOOK.
00ived ‘Until and opened at 10:30 (. oo "seoks hereinafter dese othes persons or parties unknown of this citation, to show cause, i, o0 posiond. JAMES E RED-
AM., Pacilfic Standard Time cribed; each bid must state the claiming any right, title, estate, any exist, why said minos Baby FORI', 4 widower: HOMER RED-
Sept. 10, 1946 for the purchase of amount pér M, feet BM., which lien pr interest in the real estate Remington, should not be adopted FORD and MILDRED RED-
timber upon tracts , hereinafter |y 1 v deeered tor  each pecie nh--“l"-—l in the compluini by Ralph A. Kindler and Marion popn pis wite; STELLA IRENE
described; each bid must state the and the total considerntion which Defendants E. Kindler, and that her name be McCORMICK and M
amount per M. feet BM., which . b nald for the * timber. No TO: ROSELLEN LOCKWOOD. a changed from Baby Remington 10 ~opaMICK her husband
will be offered for each PECIeN big for Jess than the uppraised single person; PHILLIP MURPHY Janet Marion Kindler, as vrayed NORFLEET, .a widower
and the total consideration which 1.0 Wil be considered. Each bid and MRS PHILLIP MURPHY, his for in the petition herein SMITH, a widow; HERMAN
will be paid for the timber. No o0 0 ubmitted in duplieate and wife; HARRIETT MURPHY MI1 WITNESS my hand and seal gyoprps’ o SMITH, his
bid for less than the appraised be accompanied by a deposit in CHELL and MITCHELL, this 6ith day of August, 1946, W wife: 1IDA B. STOCKS. a widow
value will be considered. Each bid the form of a certilied check in her husband: TDA MURPHY B B DILLARD, County Clerk. By the unknown heirs of MAE KEL
must be submitted in duplicate fuvor of the Treasurer of the Unit- CHANAN amd BUCHAN- EVA L. DUCKWORTH T'-,.d) LER deceased MARVIN M«
and be accompanied by a deposit .4 &tates The deposit of -any suc- AN, her husband: ALICE TAY- DONALD R. HUSBAND. Atior RAE SCARBROUGH and MABEL
In the form of a certified check In cessful bidder will be eredited on LOR and FAYLOR, heriney for Petitioners. Date of First SCARBROUGH, his wife: DORO)-
favor of the Treasurer of the Unit the contract, Payment In full at ! husband ELLA AUSTIN and Publication August 14th, 1946 _I{THY L. WOLFE and
ed States. The deposit of any sue the time of filing the contract is AUSTIN, her husband 1-5t-5 WOLFE, her husband: LEWIS
cessful bidder will be credited on required in sales amounting to KATE SPARKS and SCARBROUGH and
the contract, Payment In full at $2.500.00 or less. For copies of the SPARKS, her husband; JAMES SUMMONS SCARBROUGH, his wife: un-
the time of filing the contract Ix form of proposal, form of contract MURPHY  and MRS h\'.'”."\j In the Circuit Court of the State | known heirs of EDWARD P, RED-
required in sales amounting 1o and bond, terms of payment, MURPHY his  wile -“\-.““I\ of Oregon for Lane County P. 8, FORD, deceased; unknown heirs
$2,500.00 or less. For coples of the ... 0" & deposit required with MURPHY, a single person; JES-|puRKOWSKI and NELLIE BU. of ROBERT HALL, deceased
form of proposal, form of contract bid, amount of bond required with SIE HIGGINS and g 4 jIII" KOWSKI, husband and wifs FRANCIS M. HORN and HAR-
and bond, terms of payment, contract and other information, GINS, her husband; KA '," _.‘_"‘ AL Plaintiffs, RIET HORN, his wife: CLAY H
amount of deposit required with application should be made to the PON and ‘,“ '\]."J“'," hes Ve ZUMWALT and GRACE E. ZUM-
bid, amount of bond required with nddress shown above, The volumes  husband; BARNEY ‘.']"\“ and CROW, a divorced person, WALT, his wife;: EDWIN L
contract and other information, | ojuen’ balow are standing timber MRS. BARNI Y GRAY, his wife: .0 MARTHA CROW, a divorced BALES and VIOLET M. BALES
application should be made to the estimates and may be more or )i LEONE WHITI mnd B l’: person; the unknown heirs of any his wife: SCHOOL DISTRICT No.
address shown above IN l-\'\-'"‘- than the actual amount N WHITI }'_" husband; LEE MOX of the above pamed persons or 191, Lane County, Oregon, a Mu-
COUNTY: T I5S. .1 W See, 1 LANECOUNTY: T 158 . R TW OM llrl'\"‘{“ H """'r"'d I""\””. partie i any are deceased: also nicipal "IJIIMH:P.IJN BOOTH-
all merchantable timber designated Sec. 25, all merchantable timber BOBI f”_l_”'-'\_‘j' £ and '\I_“'\ all other persons or parties un- KELLY LUMBER COMPANY, a
for cutting on the N'%WSE ', estim designated for cutting on a portion H( ll.:i‘.l.f .j l"-..\‘ﬂ E, his wife: \.l.| ’]- known claiming any right, title, Corporation MALCOLM A.
ated for the purpose of this sale 1o of Lot 3 (NEYSEY%), portion of LET TYRELL uand Y- estate, lien or intesest in the real HORN and CHLOA R HORN, his
be 3985 M. feet Douglas fir, '.I 0 M Lot 4 (SEWSE%), estimated for RELL, her husband; the unknown estate described in the complaint wife: LAND BANK COMMIS-
feet Weatern “."'I Cedar, 1556 M the purpose of this sale to be 315 helrs of any of the above l"'_r."'“' herein, SIONER, an agency of the United
feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \i" G0 tamped live Western Red |©F Parties, I any are deccased Defendant States; FEDERAL FARM MORT-
s‘r\!.| per MItB M. for the 1 vong Ceodily and 25 M. feet dead and also” all other e |'l'ul|- or [...[lj."\ TO) G. G. CR( W. a d vorced GAGE rl‘.l"!f’.:\'l'[“f\'. an agen-
las fir, $2.50 per M 1-,. B.M. for the down Western Red Cedar No bid unknown -.‘,|.'r.".r..'_ iny right, title, person, and MARTHA ( ]f,,-'\-. a cy of the United States: JOHN
Weatern Red Cedur, $3.00 per ML (00 0 an $2.75 per M.f1.B.M, °Mate, lien or interest In the real |4 o " person; the unknown | HOSTETTLER and
"MIl"r r- ”"';”": I; “I]"‘I |"'-'i lor the stamped live Western Red S55000. Gontrined in ”NI:I'I’nnllilf_'ll:'1.1:. heirs of any of the above named  H( ISTETTLER, his wife: CHRIS-
purchase price ol 324,001.00, will | ..., and $2.00 per M.ItL.BM . X s | peteons ' 08 parties, if any are de- TIAN HOSTETTLER and
be considered. T. 18 S8, R. 8 W, for the dead hand .:.\-\p Western l'\. ”“J '\_‘\}”' l:[' l{“I' ."\I;‘\i".. ceased; also all other persons or HOSTETTLER, his wife: N. A.
Sec. 27, all merchantable timber Red Cedar, or a total purchas OF OREGON: You are here o parties unknown claiming any ROWE, a widow: JOHN LAM-
designated for l“”.”u: g ”.”. K% price of $916.25, will be considered UG aae I“-“.””l v .:rllu.p.”- right, title, estate, lien or interest  BERTY and LAMBER-
SWKNWL and SENNWIY, e Western Red Cedar is the only spe B g ljh'. : ““ilql..m' ‘;’ .I ' in the real estate described in the TY, his wife;: PETER LAMBERTY
timated for 1?:. purpose of this cles included in the sale and only |-I.;mrrrll 1) hex I'un.‘r -u.-H:l‘ Jyou complaint herein, and LAMBERTY. his
fale fo be 2400 M. feet Douglas .\ ..'irees stamped USOC are to | I" the asove ontitied suit on o Defendants. | wife; FRANCIS LAMBERTY. a
fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock 5 M. 170 'O SOmPe ipprox. 4135  Defore the last ":- of the tune | 1 HE NAME OF THE | single person; NICHOLAS LAM-
qot Western Red Cedar. No bid| ..o, jving West of & blazed line Precribed e, OrGer Of DUbll- | SrATE OF OREGON: You. dre |BERTY and LAMBER-
for less than $£5.60 pet _-\l ft.BM running North and South through ‘I lll:-.-n If-' . ; :" I”‘--h‘l"’l'lli'l. _”": hereby summoned and required to | TY, his wife; RUDOLPH MEN-
for the Douglas fire "' 0 per M. | ) ySE%, and an area of ap- ;. . rl;'lhl ; II',‘”: ol ! g ' ‘”_"_I appear and answer the complaint | GER and MENGER, his
ft.BM. for the Hemlock and West- prox. 5.0 acres lying East of rosd if you ‘,.1| :“:“‘;l’r"',“_l .:.u ;"““I',.' of the plaintiffs filed against you wife: LOUISA MENGER. a sin-
ern Red Cedar, or a total purchase in the SEASE N are reserved. 1 T'.'I J\-\ ‘r" ll_" """ r '_' ':";:_'I‘”,““; in the above entitled suit on or be- gle person; JOHN MENGER and
price of $13.801.00, will be comsld- 1o, ¢ b 2 W "gecs 13 23 and vy B : b e '-'T 'rl (":‘;r. fore the last day of the time pre- MENGER, his wife:
ered. T. 18 S, R. 1 E, Sec. 23, all . " hantable timber desig- o ' ..""J.' _"" I""r“ gt A g _"l scribed in the Order of Publica- HERMAN N. MENGER and
merchantable timber designated o5 utting on the N%NE & "'I'.'f"‘ . ’I g ! 'I"_'_i\'l'" }'_'J'I tion of Summons, to-wit: on or MENGER, his wife; LE-
for cutting on portions :III rr..-‘ SW NE W NW SWi. . SWLSEY " " "'ll you ': "_r I“‘\r ir“ rT_ “_ '”\: before the 5th day of Se ptember, NA MENGER, a single person;
UWNWY, SWY, and SWLSEY Sec. 1 NWi,NEY%, SEUXNEY ‘1\ "II' - Ilt‘ -r-"- \_I'I. 1"‘ ‘ 1946; and if you fail so so appear ALFRED MENGER and ——
estimated for the purpose of this NWL, N :WSWY ., SWYKSEY%. and ‘].... I...r I.'r Ilrr‘ \‘Ilt“ ol son 8 ooy and answer, for want thereof the MENGER, his wife; the unknown
sale to be 3190 M. feet Douglas fin E%WSE W, Sec, 23; W% of Sec. 25 III.'_'.II_III ! ."\,' noint which is Plaintiffs will apply to the above heirs of NICHQLAS HOSTETT-
180 M. feet Hemlock, 30 M. feet estimated for the purpose of this ge .':.4 i'rll.'. -;.I.. rll - ; '\‘l‘ﬁlll. II- | entitled Court for the ielief pray- | LER, deceased: also the unknown
Western Red Cedar, 35 M. feet sile to be 2500 M. feet dead and W ,' ]”' _' '\-’l_l ””_ml ‘l i _':. ed for in the complaint, to-wit: heirs ot any of the above named
White ¥ir, and 1305 Lineal Feet of |4 0 "1y o1t 800 M. feet dead Lot & Blech Wy e whing r\-r- That you, and each of you, be ad- persons or parties, if any are de-
Western Red Cedar Poles, No bid i down Western Red Cedar. No rI‘; x "'I' = 'I.I.I' : ('.rlll,r' go Judged to have no estate or inter- ceased: also all other persons or
for less than §7.10 per M.Mt.HM bid for « than $1.00 per M (L.B. “'“ on ,.II"\‘rll'"_,, ol ," est whatsoever in and to the land | parties unknown claiming any
for the Douglas fir, $3.00 per M.f1 M. for the dead and down Douglas I.-'W' 1820 ]i Ir'_l_'llll\lu‘;’ .'r}d l-".“;“ ind premises herein described, to- ' right, title, estate, lien or interest
BM. for the Hemlock, “H.”:” fir and Western Red Cedar, or a ‘..I‘. -\,‘_ t of thi ~‘2.m|fll.\»-‘llr ‘.“”1.” wil in the real estate described in the
Red Cedar, and “1""_' Fir, $.025 1l purchase price of $3,000.00, ,'_, I,,‘.“,,”.,.: ]lm',. t‘J.--1-\\n 56 The North half of Lot 2 in Block complaint herein, Defendants.
per LinFt. for the Western Red will be ponsidered. All green tim ind  also i'iill.lrl" .le '\‘.\Ir|]"] 'uul' < in D. G, McFarlands Second TO: ERNEST REDFORD and
Cedar Poles, or a total purchase ber reserved. No slash disposal -,-:wllh_‘l_f \i-'.\l ol 1h--. ..\-“.I'”“t.h,' Addition te Cottage Grovegdmne DORRIS REDFORD, his wife;
PEIGh & §53,616.02, will be coneld- | ."\ 0 oesary. All timber cut from corner of County Survey No. 185, County, State of Oregon, and ANGES SNOOK and MELVIN
ered. The sale area includes ap the above described areas must be A i.rnrurlm" '.'..-'n-«.'- “\‘nll”l.h]- . more particularly described, to- SNOOK, her husband: HOMER
prox, 21.25 acres in the SW "“‘I\ manufactured in the local market: West 147 'I:"',,'. r”'_, West 160 24 wit: Beginning at the Northwest REDFORD and MILDRED RED-
"' approx 0.50 acre in the NE'§ Ing aren designated by the O, and [t theney \,.1.:}, 104.19 [eet .1” corner of said Lot 2, thence ' FX ?]{-I’_ his wile: S’I‘I-ILL;\ IRENE
SWi, approx. 2820 acres in NW Administration unless otherwise 45 noint -\.- ch is 813.72 feet South South 57 feet, thence East 120 McCORMICK and Mec-
s“"‘- approx $9.00 “_“ in the authorized by the Chief Forester ol Tl"r H:".:'.h"' t‘»‘ :.-'r.‘-.-r'lrl jl-‘ :l fcet thence North a7 feet, {“]R‘\ll(‘K' her h”‘hﬂnd:
SWLSWN, approx. 12 W ACIe® W I the unit prices bid are above Block 2 of the I‘nri\'m\ \Ill_l-_.l,”'\ thence West 120 feet to the NORFLEET, a widower: -
the SEXSW and approx. 13.00 those authorized by MPR 460, they  (hence West 312 feet thence South  Place of beginning, all in said SMITH, a widow; HERMAN
acres in the SWLSEY, bounded will be reduced to the maximum [I-'; foot Ih,.,;.,. West 25 feet Lot 2 Block 2 SMITH and SMITH, his
by blazed lines. The balance of the permitted under that order. In n’,,.m-‘. South 371.68 f,.,..r”||1,.,".". and that the plaintiffs are the wife; MARVIN McRAE SCAR-
subdivisions is reserved, including . . or more identical bids  West to the center of Hn-lrh:mm-l' owners in fee simple in said real BROUGH and MABEL SCAR-
blazed line trees. All timber cut for the same timber, the success- of the Coast Fork of the Willam- Property as set out in the Com- BROUGH, his wife: DOROTHY L.
from the above described areas ful bidder will be selected on the ette River: thence up the center of Plaint herein; and that you, and WOLFE and WOLFE,
must be manufactured in the local oo 50 LT further the ob- the channel of said River in a €ach of you, be forever enjoined her husband; LEWIS SCAR-
marketing area designated by the -

jectives of

the Act of August 28,

O, and C. Administration unless 1937. The right is hereby reserved

otherwise authorized by the Chief

. . o walve technical defects in this
oresater. If the unit prices |r||\“|.|[... advertisement; to reject all bids.
above those authorized by 1 Y or to award the timber for the

460, 1""')’ will be reduced to the
maximum permitted under that or
der. In case of two or more iden-
tical bids for the same timber, the
successful bidder will be selected
on the basis of ability to further
the objectives of the Act of Aug
ust 28 1937. The right is hereby
reserved to waive technical de
fects in this advertisement; to re
Ject all bids, or to award the tim-
ber for the amount of the highest
bid to other than the highest bid-
der when necessary, pursuant to
the Act of August 28 1937 (50
Stat. B74), in order to provide a
continued supply of timber to lo-
cal Industry so as to assure the
permanence of the community W. H
which is dependent upon such in-
dustry. Dated at Portland, Oregon,
this 2nd day of August, 1946,

52413

amount of the highest bid (o other
than the highest bidder when nee-
pursuant the Act of
August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874). in
order to provide a continued sup-
ply of timber to local industry so
as to assure the permanence of the
community which is dependent up
on such industry. Dated at Port-
land, Oregon, this 16th day of Aug-
ust, 16, W. H. Horning, Chief
Forester, O, & C. Administration

CREATY, 1o

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the
State of Oregon for Lane County
DAUGHERTY, Plaintiff,

Vs

ROSELLEN LOCKWOOD, a sin-
gle person; PHILLIP MURPHY
and MRS, PHILLIP MURPHY, his
wife; HARRIETT MURPHY MIT-
CHELL and MITCHELL,
her husband; 1DA MURPHY BU-
CHANAN and BUCHAN-
AN, her husband: ALICE TAY-
LOR and TAYLOR, her

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN
that I have been appointed Admin-
Istratrix of the Estate of AR-
THUR W. SLOAN, Deceased. All

persons having .claims against husband; ELLA AUSTIN and
AUSTIN, her husband;
sald Estate l‘m- n‘fu-l-“t-l'”'“ |‘m- KATE SPARKS and .
9 the samv vy monthe bt | SPARKS, her husband; JAMES
& Youchers within 6 months of y;pery “o0a MRS, JAMES
the date hereof to me at the law MURP ’ o LANCY
ffice of HERBERT W. LOM.| MURPHY, ‘his wife; NANC
(l’unn Wiser Building, Cottage | MURPHY, a single person; JES-

| SIE HIGGINS and HIG-

Dated and first published .Jnl_\'iflitlmq'”:)‘:;r hnshnnll;“!:'\4‘:"[1':!“\1\'/?‘5;
ﬁ-{sf“'l’f:”":‘f}“'I_.’:::"lf“‘ff' AT husband: BARNEY GRAY and
thur W Sloan. Decensed. HER.| MRS. BARNEY GRAY, his wife;

oy |MAUDE MeLAUGHLIN and
PESY ¥ JOMBARD, Atlorney. | FRANCIS | McLAUGHLIN,  her

{husband; LEONE WHITE and B.

T— [ O, WHITE, her husband; LIZZIE
REDITORS |C. DARLAND, a widow: MAR-

NI::I);I?’E}‘::?”: :.j“‘n that |h,.;|{iAIll'I'l‘ BROWN, a widfm.';‘ HAR-
undersigned has been appointed |OLD  WALD  and I\A.“'l"-YN
Administratrix of the Estate of | WALD, his wife; PHILIP WALD
ELDON RAY STEELE sometimes | and ROSLYN WALD, his wife;
known as ELDON STEELE, De-|[LUCILLE MILFORD and
ceased, by the Circuit Court of [ WAYNE MILFORD, her husband;
Lane County, Oregon. All persons | WILLIAM J. HOHL and OLIVE
having claims against said estate HOHL, his wife; l.l-.l\lnh\. M.
are hereby notified to present “““[: "l‘.:\!\'l(.hlnN and PHI'.[.'
same duly verified, with proper "A*:“"-““l"[\'.l.h"‘!‘ hl‘l?l?.'i‘mli AN-
vouchers, to the undersigned at the NIE M. HESS MESSERA and
law office of Herbert W, Lombard, | CHARLES MESSERA, her hus-
Wiger Building, Cottage Grove, band; FREDERICA TRAVIS SEA-
Oregon, within six months of the
date of the first publication of

Grove, Oregon.

| her husband; LEE MOXOM TRA- |

this notice. Dated and first pub- >, & di ! il
lished August 15, 1946, ORIS | TEAGUE and MRS. ROBERT |
STEELE. Administratrix. HER-

BERT W, LOMBARD, Attorney. RELL and TYRELL, her |

VIS, a divorced person; ROBERT | Change of Name Of BABY REM-

Southeasterly direction to a point
which is 2137 feet South of the
South line of Lot 5, Block 2 of the

Perkins  Addition; thence East
154.41 feet; thence North 28° 35
West to the place of beginning,

except that portion deeded to the
State of recorded in
Volume 201 page 496 Lane County
Oregon Deed Records: all in See-
tion 33, Township 20 South Range
3 West of the Willamette Merid-
ian

Also: All of Blocks 5 and 6 of
Milapoo Park, as platted and re-
corded in Vol. 7 page 5 Lane Coun-
ty Oregon Plat Records, in Cottage
Grove, Lane County, Oregon.

Also: Lots 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23,
24, 23, 26, 29, 30, 34 and 35 in
Block 3; and Lots 17, 18, 19, 20, 21,
22, 23 and 24 in Block 4 of Mila-
poo Park, as platted and recorded
in Vol. 7 page 5 Lane County Ore-
gon  Plat Records, in Cottage
Grove, Lane County, Oregon
and that the plaintiff is the owner
In fee simple of the respective por-
tions of said property as set out in
the Complaint herein; and that'
you, and each of you, be forever
enjoined and debarred from assert-
ing any claim whatever thereto ad-
verse to the plaintiff; and for such
other and further relief as to the
Court shall seem just and equit-
able,

This Summons is published pur-
suant to Order made by HON,
CARL F. WIMBERLY, Circuit
Judge of the State of Oregon for
Lané County, on the 14 day of
August, 186, which Order directs
that this Summons be published
once a week for four successive
weeks in the Cottage Grove Sen-
tinel, a newspaper of general cir-
culation printed and published in
Cottage Grove, Lane County, Ore-
gon; and that you be required to
apvear and answer on or before
the last day of the time prescribed
in said Order, to-wit: on or before |
the 12th day of September, 1946,
Date of first publication August
I5th, 1946, Date of last publication
September 12th, 1946, HERBERT
W. LOMBARD, Attorney for
Plaintiff. Residence and post office

Oregon as

address:  Cottage Grove, Lane
County, Oregon, 1-5t-35
CITATION

In the Circuit Court of the State

SHORE and S. H HI-IAHIIHI{F:.!UI Oregon for Lane County. In the

Matter of ‘the Adpotion and

INGTON, a Minor,

TEAGUE, his wife; VIOLET TY-|To Stanley E. Remington. In the

Name of the State of Oregon, Ynul

1-5t-5 | husband; RALPH MILNE and |are hereby required to appear

'required

[ Irom the 29th day of August, 1946

'Court of Lane County, Oregon, and

I Clourt

BROUGH and SCAR-
BROUGH, his wife; LAND BANK

and debarred from asserting any
claim whatsoever thereto adverse

to the plaintiffs, and for such oth- COMMISSIONER, an agency of
er and further relief as to the the United States: FEDERAL
Court may seem just and equit- FARM MORTGAGE CORPORA-
able TION, an agency of the United

This Summons is published pur.
suant to an order made by the
HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit
Judge for the State of Oregon for
Lane County on the 6th day of
August, 196, which order directs
that this Summons be published
once a week for four successive
weeks in the Cottage Grove Sen-
tinel, a weekly newspaper for gen-
eral circulation printed in Cottage
Grove, Lane County, Oregon, and

States; JOHN HOSTETTLER and
HOSTETTLER, his wife:
CHRISTIAN HOSTETTLER and
HOSTETTLER, his wife:
PETER LAMBERTY and —— -
LAMBERTY, his wife: FRANCIS
LAMBERTY, a single person;
NICHOLAS LAMBERT Y and
- LAMBERTY, his wife:
RUDOLPH MENGER and
MENGER, his wife: LOUISA
MENGER, a single person; JOHN

that you be required to appear on MENGER and — MEN-
or before the last day of the time GER, his wife: HERMAN N.
prescribed in said order, to-wit: MENGER and - - MEN-

on or before the 5th day of Sep-
tember, 1946. Date of first publi-
cation August Sth, 1946. Date of
last publication September 35th,
1946. HERBERT W. LOMBARD,
Attorney for Plaintiffs. Residence
and post office address: Wiser
Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon.
52-5t-4

GER, his wife; LENA MENGER,
a single person; ALFRED MEN-
GER and MENGER, his
wife; the unknown heirs of any
of the above named persons or
parties, if any are deceased: Aiso
all other persons or parties un-
known claiming any right, title, es-
tate, lien or interest in the real
estate described in the complaint
herein, Defendanis.
IN THE NAME OF THE STATE
OF OREGON: You are hereby
summoned and required to appear
and answer the complaint of the
plaintiffs filed against you in the
above entitled suit on or before the
last day of the time prescribed in
the order of publication, to-wit: |
on or before the 12th day of Sop-
tember, 1946, and if you fail to so
appear and answer for want there-
of the plaintiffs will apply to the
above entitled Court for the relief
prayed for in the complaint, to-
‘wit: that you and each of you be
adjudged to have no estate or
interest whatsoever in or to the
land and premises herein de-
scribed, to-wit: |

Beginning at a point on the East
line of the Hiram Coverdill Do- |
nation Land Claim No. 52, Notifi-
cation No. 767 Township 20 South |

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN:
That ELEANOR ELIZABETH
ZIMMERLY has 'been appointed
Executrix of the Estate of JOHN
WILLIAM ZIMMERLY, Deceas-
ed, by the Circuit Court of Lane
County, Oregon. All persons hav-
ing claims against said Estate are
to present them, with
proper vouchers, within six months

to the Executrix, at the Law Office
of HERBERT W, LOMBARD, Wi-
ser Building, Cottage Grove, Ore-
gon.  ELEANOR ELIZABETH
ZIMMERLY, Executrix. HER-
BERT W, LOMBARD, Attorney.

3-51-7

NOTICE OF FINAL
SETTLEMENT
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN,
That the undersigned Administra-
tor of the Estate of ALEXANDER

HORN, Deceased, has filed his Range 3 West Willamette Mer-
account for the final settlement  jdijan 10329 feet North 0° 11' East
of said Estate in the Circuit ’

from the Southeast corner there-
of and running thence North 0° 11|
East along said line of the claim
and the center of County Road No.,
T28 1114.1 feet to the center of
|County Road No. 380: thence
| North 89" 57" 30" West along cen-
| ter of the said road No. 380, 230.4
for hearing of objections thereto ', “"’,"“‘ N"”h, 6007 At
and for final settioment - of Rﬂid!”"‘"(‘(‘ North .89 90" East 2324 |
estate. MALCOLM A. HORN, Ad- | feet to the said East line of the
ministrator. HERBERT W. LOM- claim; thence North 0° 11' East |
BARD, Attorney, 3-5t.7 |along said East line 5889 feet, .

that Tuesday the 1st day of Octo-
ber, 196, at the Circult Court
Room of said Court in the County
House in Eugene, Lane
County, Oregon, at 10:00 o'clock in
the forenoon has been by said
Court fixed as the time and place

! spected at the premises. Dated and

20, 16 The Sentinel, (‘ﬂ Girove,

thence South 86" 35 West 7498 Thurs., Aug.

feet thenee sonth ) 21 West L =1
SR0.1 feet, thence South 89 " . m 3
30" West 1261.7 feet, thence South VA PSVC'IO C'IIC, Ll“ l R
1393 feet, thence North 89 V7 S—— - mm £

) West 466 feet, thence South .

1 i1’ XA West 4134 feet, thence .

South 35" 24° East 43 .4 feet thence

South O 027 3 West 1485 [eet to

the center of County Road No, 380

thence South 8’9 57 30 East

along the center of said road No

W, 2235 feet, thence South 0

25" West 550.1 feet, thenee South

BO® 13" 30" West 4656 feet to the delayed for a short time until new
R ght Bank of the Coast Fork

of the Willamette River, thence up

stream along said river bank South

) 11" West 4149 feet thenee
South 10° 15 30" East 7735 feet
thence South 1’9 57 30 East
1649.0 feet, thence North J° 07
East 605.0 feet, thence South 89
37" East 558.6 feet to the place of
beginning, in Lane County, Ore-
gon.

and that the plaintiffs are the
owners in fee simple of the said
property as set out in the com-
plaint herein, and that you and

each of you be forever enjoined
and debarred from asserting any
claim whatever thereto adverse to A 29-year-old Harvard Ph. D., whe
o s A et or helped select agents for OSS durin
the plaintiffs, and for such other '
and further relief as to the Court "¢ wor, has been nomed chief of o
SRS TRERE Funes '8 1O ol . - c/inical psychologists in Velerans Ade
shall seem just and o s = nistration’s hospitals and mental hye
This summons is published pur- a'eneclinics. He's Dr. James G, Miller,
suint to an order made by Hon formery of Cambridge, Mass.
Carl E. Wimberly, Circuit Judge

of the State of Oregon for Lane
County, on the 14th day of August,
1946, which order directs that this
summons be published once a vieek
for four successive weeks in the
Cottage Grove Sentinel, a news-

Fuiersna ddminisiraiien Flolegraph

Many Buslhesm
Violate Wage Act

Seattle Thousands of new

paper of general circulation pub- ton, Oregon and Alaska are esti-
lished in Cottage Grove, Lane mated to be in violation of wage

County, Oregon; and that you be stabilization regulations through

required to appear dnd answer on failure to apply for app

prescribed in said order, to-wit: Court, Chairman of the 12th Re-

tember, 1946. caid today.
Date of first publication August
15, 1946, such new businesses,

ber 12, 1946. HERBERT W. LOM- apply immediately to the regional
BARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs, | board for approval of their wage
Residence and Postoffice Address schedules or they will be subject
Wiser Bldg., Cottage Grove, Lane to severe penalties in the form
County, Oregon. 1-5t-5 of income tax disallowances. !

“The order requiring prior ap-
proval of wage schedules for new
businesses exempts employers of
eight or fewer workers but if the
employment rises above eight, ap- |
piication for approval of the en-
tire wage schedule must be filed
within 30 days,” McCourt pointed
out.

Copies of the wage regulations
governing new businesses and new
job rates may be secured from the
Regional Wage Stabilization Board
offices in Seattle or from the near-
ployer in Lane County is as stated  est Wage and Hour Division office
below : " of the U. S. Department of Labor. |

Frank P. Bigelow, 41-10: Brun- |
ner Dryer, 49-36; Eastern Lane Co.
Fire Patrol Ass'n, 41-21: Eugene
Fruit Growers Ass'n. ({Eugene) 6-
27; Eugene Fruit Growers Ass'n.

NOTICE OF SEASONAL
DETERMINATION

Notice is hereby given that the
employers listed below have been
determined to be seasonal employ-
ers within the meaning of Section
126-707 O.C.L.A. Any interested
party may request a hearing be-
fore the Commission within ten
days after final publication of this
notice. The “off-season” (in calen-
dar weeks) of each seasonal em-

pends upon the motive from which |
we act.—Samuel Johnson.

The mordlity of an action de-+

Now Liberalized 4

New amendments  liberalizing
the pational service life insurance
add numerous advantages for vets
erans holding G. 1. Insurance pol.
icies, but the Veterans Adminis.
tration is urging that inquiries be

Jforms and full information ean be
obtained and distributed, Frank
Sias, VA representative at Port-

land said today.

“As soon as the new material
is received, we will issue notices
inviting veterans’ inquiries, but at
'present these would only increase
the backlog of mail in the VA's
insurance service,” Sias advised,

About 60,000 policies in Oregon,
part of the 6,000,000 now in force
in the nation, are eligible for the
liberalized, peace-time benefits,
Ten million others that were per-
mitted to lapse throughout the U,
3. are still entitled to reinstate-

ment,

The new

amendments, Sis
pointed out, offer endowment types

of policies not included in the orig-

i

inal NSLI law, permit naming of

beneficiaries outside the restricted
classes allowed by the original
bill, offer lump sum payments and
disability benefits which
business enterprises in Washing- were not previously included,

Veterans now holding term in-
surance policies are advised to
roval of Eive¢ mature thought to their insur-

.. ance programs, since ample time
or before the last day of the time their wage schedules, John B, Mc- rﬂmaiﬁs ‘::r changes. Policies is-

M Bl A o 4 jep- gional Wage Stabilization Board, Sued before this year may be con-
on or before the 12th day of Sep-  giona age tiund witkout. s 1A
MecCourt said all operators of years from date of issue and poli-
employing cies created this year are good for
Date of last publication Septem- more than eight workers, should five years without converting.

total

y N
SAWMILL HELP
WANTED

Douglas Timber

Corp.

DRAIN, ORE.
1 ratchet setter; 2 trim saw men;
1 slab saw man; 1 operating mill-
sight; 1 pair contract car loaders;

5 green chain men,

(Junection City) 7-30: Thomas J.
Hart, 36-9; Hans C. Rasmussen,
4-25; Swift & Co., 7-20 & 27-39:
Washington Creamery Co., 26-38:

Western Lane Forest Protective
Ass'n., 42-21.
OREGON UNEMPLOYMENT

COMPENSATION COMMISSION

Dated and first published this |
29th day of August, 1946. Date of
last publication 12th day of Sep-
tember, 1946,

NOTICE OF SALE

Notice is hereby given that un-
der authority of the last will and |
testament of Christ C. Odenborg, |
deceased, tbe undersigned will on |
and after Friday Sept. 6, 1946,
proceed to sell at private sale for |
cash to the highest bidder subject
to confirmation by the Circuit
Court Lane Co. Or. the following
premises: Beginning at a point in
Sec. 33, Tp. 20, S. R. 3 W. of the
Will. Mer., 9 1/3 chains N. and 3%
chains E. and 20 feet N. and 150
feet E. of the Southwest corner
of the William Shields D.L.C. No.
56, thence East 107': feet to the
West side of Sixth St, thence
North 50 feet, thence West 107'%
feet, thence South 50 feet to the
place of beginning, situated in
Lane County, Oregon. Abstract of
title will be furnished. Bids may
be presented in writing either to
the undersigned executrix or at-
torney and premises will be sold
either with or without decedent's
household effects which may be in- |

Adults.

first published Aug. 8 1946. MA-
BEL GROVE, Executrix, Albany,
Or. 739 8. Main St. CLYDE C.
BRYANT attorney, Albany, Or.
52-5t-4

New Admission Prices

EFFECTIVE

SEPTEMBER 1st|

B4 .
ARCADE THEATRE

Children . . 20c
Adults.... 50¢

DIANE THEATRE
Thursday and Friday Nights

.o+ 35C

Cal’s Cash
‘Sample Prices

6.00 x 16 Recaps .

LIMIT

SAGINAW, OREGON

——— e e Tt TS

RECAP TIRES |
.. $1050 | H
6.00 x 16 Used . . . . $6.65

2 To A Customer
CAL’'S CASH STORE

Store Does It Ag

m o:vla‘:‘kbh for lhg ‘ ‘

K

het


increa.se

