

WE ARE THE EARTH MERCHANTS THAT SELL THE GOOD EARTH

Large 4 bedroom house on good paved street. 1/4 acre of ground. House has a 3 room apartment that rents for \$30.00 per month. This house is furnished with an electric refrigerator, stoves and furniture for house. Small stream runs through back of place year around. Barn, chicken house, fruit trees and a large garden plot. Price \$7500.00

60 acres, more or less. 8 acres under cultivation planted to hay. Rolling land, timber that is being taken off place now, revenue from timber goes to buyer. Orchard, berries, 1/2 acre in garden. Pasture, 4 room house, bath, toilet, telephone house, in fair condition. Barn, garage, chicken house, 25 head of ewes and 21 lambs, cow, hogs, 100 chickens, cattle. All this for only \$6000.00

100 acres, 38 acres good bottom land in hay, 40 M. ft. of good salable timber, 2 acres in subterranean clover, 5 acres sudan grass, large family orchard, apples, pears, cherries, grapes, berries, bulbs, roses. Good 2 bedroom house, linoleum throughout, new roof, running water in kitchen, toilet, cement back porch, 2 laundry trays, 4 stoves, Poles being set now for electricity. Motor driven well, springs, creek runs through place, brooder house, chicken house, rabbit hutches, hog house, barn bunk house, several other buildings. 2 locker boxes, some telephone poles cut and peeled. Good road, school bus, mail, milk and cream route by door. Price includes 2 pigs, chickens, calf, 3 good work horses and harness, plow, disc, harrow, drill, mower and rake. Illness in family reason for sale of this good farm. This place is ready for any one to take and make a living on. Price \$11,000.00

7 lots back of Cottage Grove High School, beautiful building site. 5 lots 50x140, 2 lots 50x120. Full price for all 7 lots only \$1250.00

50 acres 3 1/2 miles up Bennett Creek road. 1/4 mile frontage on good gravelled road. Electricity available, 2 good springs for gravity pressure water at building sites. Price \$2000.00

5 room modern house, living room, brkfst, nook, 2 bedrooms, bath. Located on a hill. Beautiful view. Hot and cold water. Electric range and wood circulator. Approx. \$2000.00 worth of lumber with place. 3 1/2 acres. Price \$6000.00

2 bedroom house, modern, kitchen, living room, complete bath, hot and cold water, electricity, this is a newly painted and attractive little home, close to town. Price \$4250.00 Terms.

house, barn, garage. 80,000 feet of timber. Price \$1600.00 house barn and garage. 80,000 feet of timber. Price \$1600.00

A beautiful home with lots of beautiful flowers, 8 room house, 4 bedrooms, living room, dining room, kitchen, bath complete. Corner lot. Beautifully landscaped. This house has a large fireplace. Wired for electric stove. Lot 50x120 feet. Price \$10,000.00 Terms.

16 acres 4 cultivated, 15 cleared, all level, 16 bottom land, 1/2 A. brush. Orchard, nuts, berries, garden, 10 acres pasture. Good chert soil. Well piped to house and barn. Electric pump. 4 room house, bath, electricity. Barn, chicken house, mash shed, garage. On good road. Good lily soil, and chicken ranch. Price \$10,750.00

NICE LITTLE HOME CLOSE IN
2 bedroom, living rm. Kitchen, Dining rm. and Bath Garage and Woodshed, Nice lawn, (Completely Furnished) ONLY — — — \$6500.00

ROY MASON, Real Estate Broker

617 Main—Room 216
Phone 355 Residence 265-Y

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A.M., Pacific Standard Time, July 9, 1946 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$25,000.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1365 M. feet Douglas Fir, 95 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 100 M. feet Hemlock, and 1050 lineal feet of Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar and Hemlock, and \$.025 per Lin. Ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$8,362.50, will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the S 1/2 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1635 M. feet Douglas fir, 80 M. feet Hemlock, 40 M. feet White Fir, 115 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 40 M. feet Incense Cedar, 1500 lineal feet of Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, White Fir, Western Red Cedar, and Incense Cedar, and \$.025 per Lin. ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total price of \$9,227.00, will be considered. T. 19 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the W 1/2 NW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 785 feet Doug-

las fir. No bid for less than \$5.20 per M.ft.B.M., or a total purchase price of \$4,082.00, will be considered. The sale area includes approximately 20 acres in the W 1/2 NW 1/4, bounded by a blazed line. T. 21 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4 NE 1/4, Por. SE 1/4 NE 1/4, Por. NE 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1020 M. feet green Douglas fir, 805 M. feet fire killed Douglas fir, 35 M. feet green Western Red Cedar, 165 M. feet fire-killed Western Red Cedar, 10 M. feet green Hemlock. No bid for less than \$6.95 per M.ft. B.M. for the green Douglas fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the fire-killed Douglas fir and green Hemlock, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the green Western Red Cedar, \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the fire-killed Western Red Cedar or a total purchase price of \$8,481.50, will be considered. An area of approximately 36 acres lying south and east of blazed line traversing through the NE 1/4 SE 1/4 and SE 1/4 of the SE 1/4 NE 1/4 is reserved from sale, including blazed line trees. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local market for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 14th day of June, 1946. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 45-2t-46

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That Worth Harvey as Administrator of the Estate of Sylvester C. Veach, Deceased has filed his Final Account and the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County has fixed Tuesday, the 16th day of July, 1946 at 10:00 A. M. in the forenoon in the Circuit Court Room at the County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, Oregon as the time and place for the hearing of objections thereto. All objections must be filed on or before said date. Dated this 6th day of June, 1946. WORTH HARVEY, Administrator. Harris, Bryson & Riddlebarger, Attorneys. 45-2t-47

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of LENORA E. MOUGHMER, Deceased, has filed her account for the final settlement of said estate in the Circuit for Eugene, County of Lane, Oregon, and that Tuesday the 6th day of August, 1946, at the Circuit Court Room of said Court in the County Court House in Eugene, Oregon, at 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing objections thereto and for final settlement of said estate. ZENNA MOUGHMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of LENORA E. MOUGHMER, Deceased. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 46-5t-50

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Administrator of the Estate of ALTA E. HART, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, Oregon, by an Order dated June 4th, 1946. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby notified to present the same duly verified with proper vouchers to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Wiser Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of the first publication of this notice. Dated and first published June 6th, 1946. C. L. SPRAY, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 45-5t-47

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That ROSS B. DEY has been appointed Administrator of the Estate of BEVERLY DALE DEY, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon. All persons having claims against said Estate are requested to present them, with proper vouchers, within six months from the 20th day of June, 1946, to the said Administrator at the law office of Herbert W. Lombard, Wiser Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. ROSS B. DEY, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 45-5t-49

RHEUMATISM and ARTHRITIS

I suffered for years and am so thankful that I found relief from this terrible affliction that I will gladly answer anyone writing me for information. Mrs. Anna Pautz, P. O. Box 825, Vancouver, Wash. P. Adv.—NUE-OVO Laboratories

WANT-ADS

FOR SALE

Our watch repair dept. is unequalled for their craftsmanship, speed and accuracy. All types of repairs done at MONAHANS. PH. 351. 45-tfxxx

2 ACRES FOR SALE with running water, 2 miles west of town, Gowdville, J. H. Thomas, Cottage Grove, Lorane route. 37-tfc

FOR SALE: Two Guernsey milk cows. Fresh last February. Call 232R. 45-tfxxx

FOR SALE: 150-200 good burlap sacks. W. C. Martin, Sentinel office. 43-1tp

FOR SALE: Simmons steel bed and springs. Call 36P2 after 6:00. 46-1tp

FOR SALE: 1938 Hudson. Good tires, good condition. 4 life guard tubes. 919 W. Main. R. S. Olson. 46-2tp-47

FOR SALE: Young milk cow, Ph. 204. 46-tfxxx

FOR SALE: 1942 Nash. Good condition. New tires. Call 125J. 46-1tp

FOR SALE: 1 tubular steel bed, wheelbarrow, electric DC toaster, ice skates. Inquire 1148 Taylor ave. Victor Hurdahl. 44-3t-46

There is still years of wear in your discarded jewelry. We replace and polish stones, new clasps, restring pearls and beads and size rings. They will look like new again at MONAHANS. PH. 351. 45-tfxxx

12 acres first class oats and vetch for sale, standing. Will sell reasonably. 1 mile west of town on Gowdville road. 1st place east of fish pond. 46-1tp

FOR SALE: 1 large 1/2 inch post drill; 1 complete water wheel and DeLo 700-Watt generator; 1 ram. Frank Medicine, Shady Brook, 7 miles south Cottage Grove. 45-tfc

FOR SALE: Late model wood range, coiled, in excellent condition. See evenings at 619 S. First. 45-2tp-46

FOR SALE: Five room house, completed except for decoration. Concrete garage. Spring water, hot and cold. John E. White, 10 miles out Lorane highway. At 243 North H. Street between 8:00 a. m. to 5:00 p. m. 46-2tp-47

FOR SALE: Loganberries, 1/4 mile north Row River Steel bridge. Old C. A. King ranch. Bring containers. Phone 1F5. A. M. Stacks. 46-2tp-47

FOR SALE: Model A rear end, 34 Master Chevrolet rear end, including housing; Pontiac transmission, 33 to 36, fits sixes and eights, Graham car transmission, 4 speed International transmission. Gheer Repair service, 926 Main street, Phone 310. 46-tfxxx

We carry the world's finest watches and will give you a liberal trade in allowance on your old watch. MONAHANS. PH. 351. 45-tfxxx

FOR SALE: Large circulating wood heater. Excellent condition. \$50.00 cash. J. P. Clements, 436 S. 10th St. 45-2tp-46

8 CHOICE DWELLING HOUSE lots, Chicago addition to Florence, 5 blocks the grade and high school. \$50 apiece. Inquire 212 N. 9th Cottage Grove. 45-3tp-47

FOR SALE: WOOD. Are best equipped to take care your wood needs. All wood 16 in. None over. Donald Connor, Texaco station, Walker. Phone 352J1. 45-3tp-47

FOR SALE: Modern records, slightly used. Various prices. For information phone Orlena Martin, 236J. 42-tfxxx

CHERRIES FOR SALE: Lambert, Royce, Bing and pie. 10c lb. You pick. Phone 35F12. 46-1tp

FOR SALE: FAT RED FRYERS, 3 1/2 lbs. average. Sell live weight only. Delivered in city in lots of 6 or more. Albert Martin. Phone 236J. 46-1tp

Your watch will look like new with a new gold, silver, steel, or sturdier leather watch band. It's an added protection to have a good band from MONAHANS. PH. 351. 45-tfxxx

FOR SALE: '45 model Thayer baby buggy. Excellent condition. Mrs. Lloyd Pleuard, 1330 South 4th Street. 45-2tp-46

CHERRIES FOR SALE: Royal Anne and Bing, 1/2 mile east Creswell. Phone 5F24. W. J. Stuart. 46-1tp

BABY BUGGIES, CRIBS, play pens and swings; play equipment for children; tarpaulins and tent sleeping bags; dishes and utensils; 5-piece bedroom suite of lined oak, \$225.00. Others from \$75.00 to \$140.00. Short's Furniture Store. 45-2tp-46

MONAHANS is your headquarters for all razor repairs, including new razors, heads and cases. Also ZENITH Hearing Aid batteries and radio batteries. PH. 351. 45-tfxxx

FOR SALE: 9 acres, 6-rooms modern house, 1/2 mile west of Lorane grange hall. \$3750.00. Earl W. Renfrow, Lorane, Box 7. 46-1tp-49

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 53 acres, 4 room house, electricity and phone. Several acres in oats and vetch. New barn. Interested in trading for town property. Henry A. Hess, B. B. Rt. Near London school. 45-3tp-47

FOR SALE: 1 saddle mare, gentle; 1 army saddle; good 6-00x16 tire; 1 small gas engine, good as new. 5 miles west Lorane route. W. H. Reeve. 46-1tp

NOTICE: My Easter lilies will soon be in full bloom. Come now and see them and order bulbs. George James, Disston route, Cottage Grove. 46-1tp

16 INCH BLOCK WOOD Also planer, 2-foot & slab. ROW RIVER FUEL CO. 326 South 5th St. 43-5tp-47

Come in and see our famous REYNOLDS Pen. Guaranteed to write four years without filling. Monahan's Jewelers. Ph. 351. 46-tfxxx

16 IN. BLOCK WOOD 2 FOOT WOOD AND SLAB Prompt Delivery KEELE BROTHERS FUEL COMPANY 560 S. 6th St. Phone 256J 44-6tp-49

FOR SALE: Royal Anne and Bing Cherries, 5c lb. You pick. H. A. Howe, North 6th St. Creswell. 46-2tp-47

FOR SALE: Sprayed cherries, 12c lb. Phone 192YX. 46-1tp

FOR SALE: 75 head sheep; 40 acres timber. E. C. Orwick, Saglew. 46-2tp-47

SPRAYED LAMBERTS, Royal Anne, Mozza and Kenish (pie) cherries for sale. You pick. Also boysenberries. Phone 17F11. Mrs. Hugh Trunnell. 46-3tp-48

FOR SALE: 8-year-old work mare 1600 lbs., good farm horse or logging, gentle and true to pull; washing machine motor, 1st class shape. 719 Birch. 46-2tp-47

FOR SALE: Young saddle horse. Telephone 220J or call 1707 West Main St. 46-6tp-51

FOR SALE: Federal logging truck with 4 cyl GMC Deisel motor, 5 speed trans. 6031 Brownline trans. 1941 Walker trailer, 18,000 lb. axle on an eight mile haul at \$40.00. This equipment is in A1 shape and has all new 10 and 11 hundred tires. Call 180J at M. & S. Auto Service, formerly George Krause garage, 1/2 mile north on highway 99. 46-1tp

FOR SALE: 1933 Desoto 4 door sedan, 1932 Ford 4 door sedan has good motor and tires. 1933 Chev. cpl. has good motor. Phone 180J. M. & S. Auto Service, 1/2 mile north on Highway 99. 46-1tp

FOR SALE: Balloon tire bicycles. Bud's Bicycle Shop. 1025 South 4th Street. 46-tfxxx

FOR SALE: Rodeo beauties, Pair black and white spotted Morgan pinto saddle horses, full brothers, geldings 6 & 8. Also new saddles and equipment. McKnight, route 1, Ferguson road, Junction City, Ore. 46-3tc-48

1 new 5 ft. mower for sale or trade on used car or good fresh cow and calf. Roy Stephens, 1/2 mile from Anlauf Lodge on Lorane highway. No Saturday calls please. 46-1tc

Miscellaneous

IF YOU would like to study piano, see Mrs. Leoma Fauquier (Fokay) 622 Whittaker. Phone 316L. Beginners preferred. 46-2tc-47

PAT'S SAW SHOP Moved to 41 South 6th St. Phone 146 45-2tp-46

I have paid all of Charley Epps debts to date, but am no longer responsible for any other than my own. Audrey Epps. 46-1tp

MARRIAGE LICENSES mailed. No medical examination. Save a trip and layoff from work. Vancouver Bridal Chapel, Vancouver, Wash. 41-6tp-46

New Shipment of Lightning portable adding machines at Sentinel office. They are as simple as dialing a telephone. Subtracts and multiplies too. Only \$12.95. See these machines at our office. Cottage Grove Sentinel. Phone 159. 46-1tp

WATER WELL DRILLING See your water well driller before you buy or install your pump. Pumps and supplies. J. H. Thomas Cottage Grove, Lorane Rte. 10-tfc

After July 1 I will be in my office every day of the week from 9 a. m. to 5 p. m. over Petersen's store. Phone 5. Dr. C. R. Simkins, Chiropractor. 46-5tc-50

TOO FAT? Get SLIMMER this vitamin candy way Have a more slender, graceful figure. No exercising. No laxatives. No drugs. With the simple AYDS Vitamin Candy Reducing Plan you don't cut out any meals, starches, potatoes, meat or butter. You simply cut them down. It's easier when you enjoy delicious vitamin fortified AYDS candy before meals. Absolutely harmless. In clinical tests conducted by medical doctors, more than 100 persons lost 10 to 25 lbs. average in a few weeks with AYDS Vitamin Candy Reducing Plan. 20-day supply of AYDS only \$2.50. If not delighted with results, MONEY BACK on your first box. Please KEELE DRUG

STRAYED from my place near steel bridge on Row River, a light colored Jersey cow, no horns. Reward for information. Harley Harms, 802 Gibbs Ave. 45-tfxxx

WILL LAUNDER curtains and put on stretchers. No pricillas. Phone 329Y. 46-3tp-48

PIANO LESSONS for the summer. Classical, modern or "Boogie Woogie." Orlena Martin, phone 236J. 42-tfc

HELP WANTED

WOMAN WANTED for laundry and cleaning work. Apply to Collins Laundry. Phone 44. 45-tfxx

HELP WANTED: 2 experienced logging cat punchers, one who can run yarder; also head loader that can climb. Year round work, houses available. Camp 30 miles from Canyonville at Drew. Wither Logging Company, Drew, Oregon. 45-2tc-46

WANTED: Service station attendant. Experienced man preferred. Phone 316Y or call at 136 Main street between 4:00 and 6:00 p. m. 46-1tp

WANT: Someone to trim walnut tree. H. C. Berge. 842 South 8th street. Phone 271Y. 46-1tp

PLANNER: Top wages and bonus. See Mr. Scott, Pass Creek Remanufacturing Co., Leona. 46-1tp

WANTED: Lady or couple to care for elderly lady. Receive rent and wages. Apply 1344 West Main. 46-1tp

HOUSEKEEPER WANTED: Middle aged preferred. Apply 305 S. 6th St. or phone 347R. 46-1tp

WORK WANTED

WORK WANTED: With new D-7 cat equipped with cable dozer and Hyster towing winch. Write Walter Haldahl, Route 2, Box 47B, Lebanon, Oregon. 46-3tp-48

WORK WANTED: For 16-year-old boy, vacation months. Room, board, wages. Mrs. Earl E. Thorp, Lorane route. 46-1tp

WANTED: Work for power saw. Failing. 759 South 8th Street. Phone 305L. 46-1tp

WORK WANTED: PAINTING or Paperhanging. C. M. Adams, 2 1/2 miles east on Mosby creek. No. 9th Sign shop. 46-2tp-47

ELECTRIC contracting. Brisbane Electric. 702 Main street. 35-tfc

TO TRADE

TO TRADE: 4 room house, bath, 1/3 acre; for larger house or within 3 miles of Cottage Grove. 822 S. 8th St. 45-2tp-46

WANT TO BUY

WANT TO BUY: Veal, beef and hogs, live or dressed. Kelly's Market. Phone 53. 33-tfc

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal and mutton. Bartels Market. Phone 55. 37-tfxxx

WANTED TO BUY, RENT OR LEASE: Two or three bedroom home in or near Cottage Grove. Have Portland property, would trade for same. Would rent an apartment. Call at 222 Cherry Court. 46-2tp-47

WANTED TO BUY: A good work horse. W. H. Reeve, Lorane route. 46-1tp

WANTED TO BUY: Used bicycles and parts. Will pick up. Bud's Bicycle Shop. 1025 So. 4th St. Phone 364. 43-tfc

SMALL ACREAGES -- CLOSE IN

2 acres bottom land—8 miles from city. Young fruit and 3/4 acre in garden. New 5 room house with bath. Garage and chix house. Price of \$5000. includes elec. range and water heater.

1 acre—4 room house with bath. Young fruit. Elec. pump. Garage and shed. Nice garden, strawberries. \$3900 includes butane stove and heating stove.

2 acres more or less. 2 miles from city on paved rd. Good garden and young fruit. 5 room house, bath, elec. water heater and wired for elec. range. Chix house and small barn. \$5500.

1 1/2 acre on Hi-way 99. 6 room house with bath. 2 elec. pumps, one for irrigation from stream. Fruit and berries. Double garage, chix houses with elec. \$4850.

3 room house in city. Large lot. Some fruit. \$2500. \$1000. down.

5 room house, bath. Nice kitchen. Fruit and grapes. Close to mill. \$3750 terms or \$3500. cash.

113 acres—35 in cult. bal. open pasture and wood. Fruit and berries. All fenced. 8 room house with bath. Newly renovated inside. 10 miles from city on paved rd. Barn, chix house and brooder, 500 capacity. Also small house with bath, now rented. Year round creek and springs. \$12,500.

2 acres—no buildings. Year round creek. 1 1/4 miles from town. Excellent bulb ground. \$1400.

MERL KING

with

RODMANS

701 Main st

Phone 216

Eagles Lodge Meets
EVERY WEDNESDAY
8:00 P. M. o'clock
EAGLES HALL
50-tfc

Moose Lodge Meets
Meets Every TUESDAY
Night, 8:00 o'clock
New Quarters, Main Street.
18-tfc

PAINTING
Interior or Exterior.
Contract or By Hour.
CALL 115-Y
COTTAGE GROVE
40-4tp-43

Stromberg-Carlson Radios
Console Combinations.
Come in, see them, hear them. The finest in radio reception and record reproduction. Also repair work on refrigerators and washing machines appreciated.
Mack's Fixit Shop
Phone 302 34-tfc

Garden and Field Seeds Fertilizers
Plant a Garden—Put in a Lawn.
Beidler Feed & Seed Store
30-tfxxx

Bud's Bicycle Shop
Complete 1-day Service
FREE PICKUP AND DELIVERY
Open Sundays and Evenings
1025 South 4th Street
Phone 364 43-tfc

1,000 hour Radio Battery Pack \$4.98
2 unit Fluorescent Kitchen light with radio filters \$6.98
Record changers \$24.95 to \$44.50 installed.
Duplex receptacles and switches.
Lots of wire and electrical supplies.
QUICK EFFICIENT SERVICE. ALL WORK GUARANTEED.
Creswell Radio & Electric Service
PHONE 17-F-15 CRESWELL, OREGON

McCOY MOTORS
Chrysler, Plymouth and International Sales and Service
6th and Wash. Phone 64

WANTED
Car Loaders and Unloaders and General Help
Lumber Remanufacturers
Walker. Phone 353J3 44-tfc

Pat's Saw and Lawn Mower Shop
41 S. 6th St.
We are prepared to sharpen saws—cross cut, skill and band, up to 1 1/2-in. circle. Hand saws sharpened and retooled. Lawn mowers and