

WE ARE THE EARTH MERCHANTS THAT SELL THE GOOD EARTH

Large 3 bedroom house in Harvey addition 1 mile from town. Desirable district, 2 1/2 acres of ground. House has 3 bedrooms, kitchen, dining room, living room, and complete bath. Just an ideal little farm. Nice barn and hen house. Price \$5000.00.

Close in, large home, 4 bedrooms, living room, dining room kitchen, bath. This house has a 3 room apartment with private entrance and bath, which rents for \$30.00 per month. Large lot, with fruit trees and grape arbor. Small barn and chicken house combined. Price \$7500.00

10 acres at Grants Pass, Oregon. 9 miles west off Grants Pass on lower river road. Good building site, school bus, mail route and milk route. Price \$750.00

110 acres, 25 acres sowed to permanent grass for pasture. O. S. C. tests ground 100% for berries or filberts. 5 room bungalow, electricity. 38x50 ft. hip roof barn. Two story poultry house for 500 chickens. Other out buildings. Woven wire fenced. Price \$10,000.00

100 acres 3 miles N. W. of Walker. 38 A. cultivated, 6 A. cleared. 38 A. in bottom land, 40 A. timber. 15 A. brush. 5 A. in oats. 2 A. in orchard, berries, garden, 60 A. in pasture. Garden. Good chilis soil. 5 room house, bungalow, toilet, wired for telephone, house in good condition. Hen house, rabbit hutches, bunk house, barn. Good road. 2 pigs, calf, chickens, lot of good timber. Price \$11,000.00

80 Acres more or less. 15 or 20 acres cleared and improved good rich soil. Nice orchard, but has not been cared for for some time. Some timber on place. Foundation for house. Cement blocks. Price \$2800.00

Small neat cottage on river. Large lot, for a beautiful little place come in and have us show you this place.

4 room log house, 2 bedrooms, living room, complete bath, garage, woodshed. All fenced. Very good soil, garden, 1 1/4 acres. Good spring, pressure system, creek through place. Price \$3450.00

22 Acres, Overlooking the Cottage Grove Dam Lake. Small house, good water. Price \$3500.00

1 lot 69 1/2 x 113.3 on good paved street, corner lot. Price \$800.00

New 4 room house, 2 bedrooms, living room, kitchen, bkfst. nook, large closets. Utility room. Shower and toilet, electricity. This ground is very good for lily bulbs. 40 Acres, more or less. Enough lily bulbs to plant an acre for and additional \$5000.00. Price \$9500.00

15 Acres, pear and filbert trees. Good old house with electricity. 2 wells, on the place and 1 electric pump. 2 bedrooms, living room, kitchen, and dining room combined. Fruit cellar. Chicken house, 24x50 barn for 2 cows, new, 2 nice brooder houses. Lots of fruit. Price \$5000.00

ROY MASON, Real Estate Broker

617 Main—Room 216

Phone 355

Residence 265-Y

Lif's Balloon
In 1933, helium succeeded after hydrogen and failed in lifting man to the still unsurpassed height of 13.71 miles above the earth, in the National Geographic society - army air corps balloon, Explorer II.

Youthful Criminals
Of recent murderers, 13 per cent are youngsters under 21; 30 per cent of the arsonists, 39 per cent of the robbers, 55 per cent of the burglars, and 65 per cent of the car thieves are youngsters under 21.

Eagles Lodge Meets
EVERY WEDNESDAY
8:00 P. M. o'clock
EAGLES HALL
50-tfc

Moose Lodge Meets
Meets Every TUESDAY
Night, 8:00 o'clock
New Quarters, Main Street.
18-tfc

PAINTING

Interior or Exterior.
Contract or By Hour.

CALL 115-Y
COTTAGE GROVE
40-4tp-43

Stromberg-Carlson Radios

Console Combinations.
Come in, see them, hear them. The finest in radio reception and record reproduction. Also repair work on refrigerators and washing machines appreciated.

Mack's Fixit Shop
Phone 302 34-tfc

Garden and Field Seeds Fertilizers

Plant a Garden—Put in a Lawn.

Beldler Feed & Seed Store
30-tfcxx

Bud's Bicycle Shop

Complete 1-day Service

FREE PICKUP AND DELIVERY
Open Sundays and Evenings
1025 South 4th Street
Phone 364 43-tfc

1,000 hour Radio Battery Pack \$4.98
2 unit Fluorescent Kitchen light with radio filters \$6.98
Record changers \$24.95 to \$44.50 installed.
Duplex receptacles and switches.
Lots of wire and electrical supplies.

QUICK EFFICIENT SERVICE. ALL WORK GUARANTEED.

Creswell Radio & Electric Service
PHONE 17-F-15 CRESWELL, OREGON

McCOY MOTORS

Chrysler, Plymouth and International Sales and Service

6th and Wash. Phone 64

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That Worth Harvey as Administrator of the Estate of Sylvester C. Veatch, Deceased has filed his Final Account and the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County has fixed Tuesday, the 16th day of July, 1946 at 10:00 A. M. in the forenoon in the Circuit Court Room at the County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, Oregon as the time and place for the hearing of objections thereto. All objections must be filed on or before said date.

Dated this 6th day of June, 1946.
WORTH HARVEY, Administrator.
Harris, Bryson & Riddlebarger, Attorneys. 43-5t-47

NOTICE TO CREDITORS IN PROBATE

Notice is hereby given that Hazel G. Losee, has been appointed executrix of the will and estate of Fred J. Losee, deceased, in Lane County, Oregon, said appointment made by the Circuit Court in the matter of probate. All persons having claims against said estate are required to present them duly verified as by law required to said executrix at the law office of Alta King, 613 Main street, Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, within six months from the date of first publication of this notice, this 23rd day of May, 1946. Hazel G. Losee, Executrix. 41-5t-45

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Administrator of the Estate of ALTA E. HART, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, Oregon, by an Order dated June 4th, 1946. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby notified to present the same duly verified with proper vouchers to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Wisner Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of the first publication of this notice. Dated and first published June 6th, 1946. C. L. SPRAY, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 43-5t-47

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that ROSS B. DEY has been appointed Administrator of the Estate of BEVERLY DALE DEY, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon. All persons having claims against said Estate are requested to present them, with proper vouchers, within six months from the 20th day of June, 1946, to the said Administrator at the law office of Herbert W. Lombard, Wisner Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. ROSS B. DEY, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 45-5t-49

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.
Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A.M., Pacific Standard Time, July 9, 1946 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. ft. B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2,500.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract

RHEUMATISM and ARTHRITIS

I suffered for years and am so thankful that I found relief from this terrible affliction that I will gladly answer anyone writing me for information. Mrs. Anna Pautz, P. O. Box 825, Vancouver, Wash. Pd. Adv.—NUE-OVO Laboratories

TOO FAT?

Get SLIMMER this vitamin candy way
Have a more slender, graceful figure. No exercising. No laxatives. No drugs. With the simple AYDS Vitamin Candy Reducing Plan you don't cut out any meals, starches, potatoes, meats or butter, you simply cut them down. It's easier when you enjoy delicious (vitamin fortified) AYDS candy before meals. Absolutely harmless.
In clinical tests conducted by medical doctors, more than 100 persons lost 14 to 18 lbs. average in a few weeks with AYDS Vitamin Candy Reducing Plan.
30-day supply of AYDS only \$2.50. If not delighted with results, MONEY BACK on very first box. Phone
KELLY DRUG

Stains, Dullness Vanish from DENTAL PLATES

Kleenite ends messy, harmful brushing. Just put your plate or bridge in a glass of water and a little Kleenite. Presto! Stains, denture odor, discolorations disappear. Your teeth sparkle like new. Ask your druggist today for Kleenite.

KLEENITE the Brushless Way
Get KLEENITE today at KELLY DRUG CO. and all good druggists 45-2t-46

WANT-ADS

FOR SALE

FOR SALE: Home at 31 S. 12th street. Inquire at 45 S. 12th St. 38-tfcxx

Our watch repair dept. is unexcelled for their craftsmanship, speed and accuracy. All types of repairs done at MONAHANS. PH. 351. 45-tfcxx

2 ACRES FOR SALE with running water, 2 miles west of town, Gowdyville. J. H. Thomas, Cottage Grove, Lorane route. 37-tfc

FOR SALE: Two Guernsey milk cows. Fresh last February. Call 232R. 45-tfcxx

FOR SALE: 150-200 good burlap sacks. W. C. Martin, Sentinel office. 43-1tp

FOR SALE: Good wagon, small accordion, 1 1/2 hp Fairbanks engine. Quimby, below dam. Phone 39F24. 45-1tp

FOR SALE: 1929 Ford; flat bed for truck with rack. Frank Treadwell, Airport Tourist camp. 45-1tp

and bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1365 M. feet Douglas Fir, 95 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 100 M. feet Hemlock, and 1050 lineal feet of Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar and Hemlock, and \$0.25 per Lin. Ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$8,362.50, will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the S 1/2 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 720 M. feet Douglas fir. No bid for less than \$6.35 per M. ft.B.M. or a total purchase price of \$4,572.00, will be considered. The sale area is made up of approximately 23 acres in the southern portion of the S 1/2 SW 1/4, bounded by a blazed line. T. 19 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 23, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N 1/2 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1635 M. feet Douglas fir, 80 M. feet Hemlock, 40 M. feet White Fir, 115 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 40 M. feet Incense Cedar, 1500 Lineal feet of Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, White Fir, Western Red Cedar, and Incense Cedar, and \$0.25 per Lin. ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total price of \$9,227.00, will be considered. T. 19 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the W 1/2 NW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 785 feet Douglas fir. No bid for less than \$5.20 per M.ft.B.M., or a total purchase price of \$4,082.00, will be considered. The sale area includes approximately 20 acres in the W 1/2 NW 1/4, bounded by a blazed line. T. 21 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4 NE 1/4, Por. SE 1/4 NE 1/4, Por. NE 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1020 M. feet green Douglas fir, 805 M. feet fire killed Douglas fir, 35 M. feet green Western Red Cedar, 165 M. feet fire-killed Western Red Cedar, 10 M. feet green Hemlock. No bid for less than \$6.95 per M.ft. B.M. for the green Douglas fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the fire-killed Douglas fir and green Hemlock, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the green Western Red Cedar, \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the fire-killed Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$8,481.50, will be considered. An area of approximately 36 acres lying south and east of blazed line traversing through the NE 1/4 SE 1/4 and SE cor. of the SE 1/4 NE 1/4 is reserved from sale, including blazed line trees. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement, to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 14th day of June, 1946. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 45-2t-46

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom home, basement, furnace, Venetian blinds, wired for electric range. Double garage. Possession soon. 225 N. 10th. Phone 209-J. 45-1tp

FOR SALE: 2 Chevrolet wheels; 2 16-inch tires and tubes, all for \$25.00. Inquire 333 N. Lane, phone 295L. 45-1tp

FOR SALE: 1 tubular steel bed, wheelbarrow, electric DC toaster, ice skates. Inquire 1148 Taylor ave. Victor Hugdahl. 44-3tc-46

There is still years of wear in your discarded jewelry. We replace and polish stones, new clasps, restringing pearls and beads and size rings. They will look like new again at MONAHANS. PH. 351. 45-tfcxx

FOR SALE: 5-room circulator heater. Mrs. E. E. Remington, Anlauf. 45-1tp

FOR SALE: 1 large 1/2 inch post drill; 1 complete water wheel and Delco 700-Watt generator; 1 ram. Frank Medine, Shady Brook, 7 miles south Cottage Grove. 45-tfc

FOR SALE: Late model wood range, coiled, in excellent condition. See evenings at 619 S. First. 45-2tp-46

We carry the worlds finest watches and will give you a liberal trade in allowance on your old watch. MONAHANS. PH. 351. 45-tfcxx

FOR SALE: Large circulating wood heater. Excellent condition, \$50.00 cash. J. P. Clements, 436 S. 10th St. 45-2tp-46

8 CHOICE DWELLING HOUSE lots, Chicago addition to Florence. 5 blocks the grade and high school. \$50 apiece. Inquire 212 N. 9th Cottage Grove. 43-3tp-47

FOR SALE: WOOD. Are best equipped to take care your wood needs. All wood 16 in. None over. Donald Connor, Texaco station, Walker. Phone 352J1. 43-5tp-47

FOR SALE: Modern records, slightly used. Various prices. For information phone Oriana Martin, 236J. 42-tfcxx

FOR SALE: 2 formal, size 14; 2 bathing suits, small and medium; 2 pairs ladies' pumps, size 5 1/2. Phone 168Y, 131 Lane St. 45-1tp

FOR SALE: FAT RED FRYERS, 3 1/2 lbs. average. Sell live weight only. Delivered in city in lots of 26 or more. Albert Martin. Phone 236J. 45-tfcxx

Your watch will look like new with a new gold, silver, steel, or sturdy leather watch band. It's an added protection to have a good band from MONAHANS. PH. 351. 45-tfcxx

FOR SALE: '45 model Thayer baby buggy. Excellent condition. Mrs. Lloyd Pleuard, 1330 South 4th Street. 45-2tp-46

FOR SALE: 1 table; fruit jars, wide mouth; 1 bedstead, springs and 2 mattresses; 15 gal. crock jar; 5 gal. glass jug; 1 scythe; 10 half-gal. jars dill pickles. 416 S. 10th St. 44-2tp-45

BABY BUGGIES, CRIBS, play pens and swings; play equipment for children; tarpaulins and tent sleeping bag; dishes and utensils; 5-piece bedroom suite of lined oak, \$225.00. Others from \$75.00 to \$140.00. Short's Furniture Store. 45-2tp-46

MONAHANS is your headquarters for all razor repairs, including new cords, heads and cases. Also ZENITH Hearing Aid batteries and radio batteries. PH. 351. 45-tfcxx

FOR SALE: 2 kitchen cabinets and sink, new; roller canary and small phonograph. 245 Columbia Court. 45-1tp

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 53 acres, 4 room house, electricity and phone. Several acres in oats and vetch. New barn. Interested in trading for town property. Henry A. Hess, B. B. Rt. Near London school. 45-3tp-47

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 1936 Studebaker pickup. C. G. Williams, west of Cottage Grove dam. 45-1tp

FOR SALE: Matched black team 1500 each, fine workers and ready to go, 8 years old; 1 eight-year-old gray mare 1600 lbs.; 1 sorrel mare 1700 lbs., unbroken, 6 years old, none better. Priced to sell. Phone 9F13, W. E. Wheeler, 6 miles east of town, between Row River and Mosby Creek. 44-2tp-45

16 INCH BLOCK WOOD Also planer, 2-foot & slab. ROW RIVER FUEL CO. 320 South 5th St. 43-5tp-47

HOMES -- INVESTMENTS

House and lot, close in. Some fruit and garden. Three room house has elec. garage. \$2500.

15 acres—no buildings—13 miles from city on paved rd. Bus to schools. Half tillable. \$1500.

Cafe and bus depot—15 stools and 3 booths. All elec. equipment and refrigeration. Doing good business in small town. Price of \$8500 includes equipment, building and lot 60x150. 2 Standard gas pumps.

7 room modern house—close in. Three bedrooms and complete bath up, 4 rooms and lavatory down. Wired for elec. range. Utility room, fruit room and garage with concrete range. Utility room, fruit room and garage with concrete floors. Concrete foundation. Immediate possession. \$7500.

Approx. 2 acres—2 miles from city on paved rd. Bus to grade and high school. 5 room house, complete bath, two bedrooms. Nice kitchen, wired for elec. range and water heater. Good garden. Chix house small barn and garage. \$5500.

MERL KING

with

RODMANS

701 Main st:

Phone 216

FOR SALE: Lady's ice shoe skates, white leather, size 6, slightly worn. Phone 183Y. 45-1tp

FOR RENT: Sleeping room, 1239 West Main street. 45-1tp

FOR RENT: Floor sanders. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 21-tfcxx

Miscellaneous

I am no longer responsible for debts other than my own. Charley Epps. 45-1tp

New Shipment of Lightning portable adding machines at Sentinel office. They are as simple as dialing a telephone. Subtracts and multiplies too. Only \$12.95. See these machines at our office. Cottage Grove Sentinel. Phone 159.

Girl attending school wants ride to Eugene daily before 9:00 a. m. Call 119R. 45-1tc

MARRIAGE LICENSES mailed. No medical examination. Save a trip and layoff from work. Vancouver Bridal Chapel. Vancouver, Wash. 41-6tp-46

New Shipment of Lightning portable adding machines at Sentinel office. They are as simple as dialing a telephone. Subtracts and multiplies too. Only \$12.95. See these machines at our office. Cottage Grove Sentinel. Phone 159.

WATER WELL DRILLING See your water well driller before you buy or install your pump. Pumps and supplies. J. H. Thomas Cottage Grove, Lorane Rte. 10-tfc

STRAYED from my place near steel bridge on Row River, a light colored Jersey cow, no horns. Reward for information. Harley Harms, 802 Gibbs Ave. 45-tfcxx

FAT'S SAW SHOP Moved to 41 South 6th St. Phone 146 45-2tp-46

PIANO LESSONS for the summer. Classical, modern or "Boogie Woogie." Oriana Martin, phone 236J. 42-tfc

WILL THE PARTY who borrowed our 100-foot steel tape please return same? Short's Furniture Store. 45-1tp

WANTED

Car Loaders and Unloaders and General Help

Lumber Remanufacturers
Walker. Phone 353J3 44-tfc

Pat's Saw and Lawn Mower Shop
41 S. 6th St.

We are prepared to sharpen saws—cross cut, circle and band, up to 1 1/2-in., skid. Hand saws sharpened and retooled. Lawn mowers and other tools sharpened. Phone 146. 33-4tp-tfc

16 IN. BLOCK WOOD 2 FOOT WOOD AND SLAB Prompt Delivery

KELLEE BROTHERS FUEL COMPANY
560 S. 6th St. Phone 256J 44-6tp-49

TO TRADE

TO TRADE: 4 room house, bath, 1/3 acre; for larger house in or within 3 miles of Cottage Grove. 822 S. 8th St. 45-2tp-46

HELP WANTED

WOMAN WANTED for laundry and cleaning work. Apply to Collins Laundry. Phone 44. 45-tfcxx

HELP WANTED: 2 experienced logging cat punchers, one who can run yarder; also head loader that can climb. Year round work, houses available. Camp 30 miles from Canyonville at Drew. Witcher Logging Company, Drew, Oregon. 45-2tc-46

WORK WANTED

WORK WANTED: PAINTING or Paperhanging. C. M. Adams, 2 1/2 miles east on Mosby creek. 44-4tp-47

ELECTRIC contracting. Brisbane Electric. 702 Main street. 35-tfc

WANT TO BUY

WANT TO BUY: Veal, beef and hogs, live or dressed. Kelly's Market. Phone 53. 33-tfc

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal and mutton. Bartels Market. phone 53. 37-tfcxx

WANTED TO BUY: Good used electric washing machine. Phone 316L or 380. 44-ttc

WANT TO BUY: Good young fresh cow. See W. C. Martin at Sentinel office. 43-tfcxx

WANTED TO BUY: Used bicycles and parts. Will pick up. Bud's Bicycle Shop. 1025 So. 4th St. Phone 364. 43-tfc

WANTED: One load green manure. Phone 154R. 43-3tc-45

Wool & Mohair Wanted

Top market prices paid at all times. For prices call phone 3, Farmer's Union Store or 21F15, Yoncalla, collect, for D. C. Wilson. Receiving days, Tuesdays. 32-tfcxx

FOR RENT

FOR RENT: Desirable storage space for short or long term. One small room and one large room now available. Phone 99, Jess Lansing, for rates. COTTAGE GROVE STORAGE WAREHOUSE CO. 42-6tc-47

LOTS--HOUSES FOR SALE

I have several choice city lots for sale in Cottage Grove's new addition, north of the high school and east of South Tenth street. Also have three old houses, containing a lot of good lumber, which I will sell very reasonable.

A. L. WOODARD

42-4tp-45