

Notice of School Meeting

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN to the legal voters of Union High School District No. 14, of Lane County, State of Oregon, that a SCHOOL MEETING of the said district will be held at Director's Room, Union High School Building, the 15th day of May, 1946, at 7:30 o'clock p. m., for the purpose of discussing the budget for the fiscal year, beginning July 1, 1946, and ending June 30, 1947, hereinafter set forth, and to vote on the proposition of levying a district tax.

Schedule I Estimated Receipts and Available Cash Balances

	TOTAL ALL FUNDS	GENERAL FUNDS	BOND INTEREST AND SINKING FUNDS	RESERVE FUNDS
Estimated Receipts from				
1. Delinquent Taxes	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 4,700.00	\$ 300.00	
2. Vocational Education	2,300.00	2,300.00		
3. High School Tuition	1,000.00	2,000.00		
4. Elementary Transportation	900.00	900.00		
5. Other Sources	600.00	600.00		
13. Transfer from Reserve Fund	10,000.00	10,000.00		
15. Estimated Total Receipts	\$19,800.00	\$19,500.00	\$ 300.00	
16. Estimated Available Cash Balance	13,000.00	13,000.00		
17. Estimated Total Receipts and Available Cash Balance	\$32,800.00	\$32,500.00	\$ 300.00	(\$1,980.85 Not Available)

Schedule II—General Fund Estimated Expenditures

ITEM	ESTIMATED EXPENDITURES FOR THE FISCAL YEAR 1946-47	BUDGET ALLOWANCE FOR THE FISCAL YEAR 1945-46	EXPENDITURES FOR THE LAST YEAR OF THE FISCAL YEAR 1944-45	SECOND YEAR TOTALS 1945-46
I. GENERAL CONTROL				
1. Personal service:				
(1) Superintendent	\$ 2,900.00	\$ 2,550.00	\$ 2,400.00	
(2) Clerk	375.00	350.00	211.50	
(3) Office Help	850.00	700.00	600.00	
2. Supplies	135.00	135.00	119.33	
3. Elections and publicity	125.00	125.00	113.20	
4. Legal service (clerk's bond, audit, etc.)	75.00	75.00	92.20	
5. Other expense of general control	75.00	75.00	65.10	
6. Total Expense of General Control	\$ 4,535.00	\$ 4,010.00	\$ 3,601.33	\$ 3,418.59

II. INSTRUCTION—Supervision

1. Personal service:				
(1) Principal and Superintendent	\$ 3,450.00	\$ 3,250.00	\$ 2,899.92	
(4) Office Help	550.00	400.00	350.00	
2. Supplies, principals and supervisors	150.00	150.00	149.01	
5. Total Expense of Supervision	\$ 4,150.00	\$ 3,800.00	\$ 3,398.93	\$ 2,907.49

III. INSTRUCTION—Teaching

1. Personal service:				
(1) Teachers	\$42,500.00	\$36,000.00	\$29,836.88	
(2) Substitute Teaching	350.00	300.00	247.00	
2. Library supplies, repairs	50.00	50.00	48.00	
3. Supplies (chalk, paper, etc.)	1,000.00	1,200.00	1,394.56	
7. Total Expense of Teaching	\$43,900.00	\$37,500.00	\$31,546.53	\$27,340.05

IV. OPERATION OF PLANT

1. Personal service:				
(1) Janitors and other employees	\$ 3,450.00	\$ 3,075.00	\$ 2,981.25	
2. Janitors' supplies	500.00	500.00	326.80	
3. Fuel	1,225.00	1,225.00	1,075.67	
4. Light and power	800.00	800.00	719.54	
5. Water	200.00	200.00	100.00	
6. Telephone	100.00	100.00	85.15	
7. Gas	100.00	100.00	77.90	
8. Other expense of operation	100.00	100.00	79.81	
9. Total Expense of Operation	\$ 6,475.00	\$ 6,100.00	\$ 5,446.12	\$ 5,218.24

V. MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS

1. Repair and maintenance of furniture and equipment	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 287.84	
2. Repair and maintenance of:				
(1) Buildings and Grounds	1,000.00	1,900.00	476.90	
(2) Grounds from Reserve Fund	5,000.00			
(3) Reserve Fund—Bldgs. & Grounds	2,500.00	900.00	2,200.00	
4. Total Expense of Maintenance and Repairs	\$ 8,850.00	\$ 3,150.00	\$ 2,964.74	\$ 1,500.64

VI. AUXILIARY AGENCIES

1. Health service:				
(1) Personal service (nurse, etc.)	\$ 180.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 90.00	
(2) Supplies and other expenses	50.00	50.00	2.60	
2. Transportation of pupils:				
(1) Personal service	4,230.00	3,780.00	3,768.85	
(2) Supplies and other expenses	1,200.00	900.00	980.20	
(3) Repair and replacement of busses	1,800.00	1,450.00	998.40	
3. Other auxiliary agencies:				
(1) Insurance	600.00	400.00	454.96	
(2) Industrial Accident Fees	70.00	70.00	70.00	
(3) Agricultural Department Trans.	250.00	250.00	274.99	
(4) Reserve Fund—Replacement of Busses	2,000.00	900.00	4,500.00	
(5) Replacement Busses from Reserve Fund	3,000.00			
4. Total Expense of Auxiliary Agencies	\$13,380.00	\$ 7,980.00	\$11,140.00	\$ 6,576.02

VII. FIXED CHARGES

1. Insurance	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,854.35	
(2) Retirement	2,800.00			
4. Total Fixed Charges	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,854.35	\$ 2,302.36

VIII. CAPITAL OUTLAYS

4. New furniture, equipment and replacements	\$ 700.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 337.91	
5. New furniture, equipment and replacements from Reserve Fund	2,000.00			
6. Other capital outlays:				
(1) Library books	450.00	450.00	417.68	
(2) Reserve Fund—Replacement Equipment	500.00	1,000.00	700.00	
7. Total Capital Outlays	\$ 3,650.00	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 1,455.59	\$ 2,063.16

IX. DEBT SERVICE—NON-BONDED

1. Interest on warrants	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00		
3. Total Debt Service, Non-bonded	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00		

X. EMERGENCY

Total Schedule II—General Fund—Total estimated expenses for the year—sum of items I-6, II-5, III-7, IV-9, V-4, VI-4, VII-4, VIII-7, IX-3, X	\$90,780.00	\$67,780.00	\$61,407.59	\$51,826.55
---	-------------	-------------	-------------	-------------

Schedule III—Bond Interest and Sinking Fund

1. Principal on bonds (include negotiable interest-bearing warrants issued under section 111-1016, O. C. L. A.)	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	
2. Interest on bonds	3,500.00	3,500.00	3,280.63	
3. Total Schedule III—Debt Service—Bonds and Interest	\$11,500.00	\$11,500.00	\$11,280.63	\$10,120.88

SCHEDULE V—Special Improvement Fund (Serial Levy, Etc.)

SPECIAL IMPROVEMENT FUND—2-mill special levy

1. New buildings	\$9,845.40			
2. Alteration of buildings (not repairs)				
3. New furniture, equipment and replacements				
4. Assessments for betterments				
7. Total Schedule V—Special Improvement Fund	\$9,845.40			

Schedule VI—Summary of Estimates of Expenditures, Receipts and Available Cash Balances, and Tax Levies

	TOTAL ALL FUNDS	GENERAL FUND TOTAL	BOND INTEREST AND SINKING FUND TOTAL	SPECIAL IMPROVEMENT FUND TOTAL
Total estimated expenditures	\$112,125.40	\$90,780.00	\$11,500.00	\$9,845.40
DEDUCT:				
Total estimated receipts and available cash balances (Schedule I)	32,800.00	32,500.00	300.00	
Amount necessary to balance the budget	79,325.40	58,280.00	11,200.00	
ADD:				
Estimated amount of taxes that will not be collected during the fiscal year for which this budget is made	5,000.00	4,700.00	300.00	
Total estimated tax levies for ensuing fiscal year	\$84,325.40	\$62,980.00	\$11,500.00	\$ 9,845.40
Analysis of estimated tax levies:				
Amount inside 6% limitation	\$57,814.84			
Amount outside 6% limitation	5,165.16			

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County CHARLES C. GILHAM and EDITH GILHAM, husband and wife, Plaintiffs,

vs.
The unknown heirs of ALBERT E. TOZIER, deceased; VALENTINE B. HARRIS, a widow; HENRIETTA HARRIS LOEP and FRED C. LOEP, her husband; CORA HARRIS KENDALL, a widow; FLORA HARRIS LINN, a widow; the unknown heirs of CHARLES O. HARRIS, deceased; the unknown heirs of WILLIAM O. HARRIS, deceased; JESS BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; DAVID BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; EDDIE BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; ALMA BURGESS, a single person; H. A. HOWE and GERTRUDE HOWE, his wife; KATE NEVADA BASSETT HUNT, a widow; PAULINE BASSETT MIZE, a widow; GUY A. BASSETT and ELIDA BENDER BASSETT, his wife; OLIVE DAVIS BASSETT, a widow; the unknown heirs of any of the said parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein,

Defendants.
TO: The unknown heirs of ALBERT E. TOZIER, deceased; VALENTINE B. HARRIS, a widow; HENRIETTA HARRIS LOEP and FRED C. LOEP, her husband; CORA HARRIS KENDALL, a widow; FLORA HARRIS LINN, a widow; the unknown heirs of CHARLES O. HARRIS, deceased; the unknown heirs of WILLIAM O. HARRIS, deceased; JESS BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; DAVID BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; EDDIE BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; ALMA BURGESS, a single person; H. A. HOWE and GERTRUDE HOWE, his wife; KATE NEVADA BASSETT HUNT, a widow; PAULINE BASSETT MIZE, a widow; GUY A. BASSETT and ELIDA BENDER BASSETT, his wife; OLIVE DAVIS BASSETT, a widow; the unknown heirs of any of the said parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein,

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the Complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the Order of Publication, to-wit: on or before the 2nd day of May, 1946; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit:

That you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in and to the land and premises herein described, to-wit:
Beginning at a point 329.5 feet South and 1493.7 feet West of the Northeast corner of the Southeast quarter of the Northeast quarter of Section 8, Township 22 South Range 3 West of Willamette Meridian, said beginning point being 300 feet South 66° 31' East of the Easterly boundary line of the 60-foot right of way of the Cottage Grove-London Road as now in use, thence from said beginning point run West 71.8 feet, thence North 66° 31' West 235 feet to the East boundary line of said County Road right of way, thence South 23° 29' West following said Easterly boundary of said County Road 100 feet, thence South 66° 31' East 300 feet, thence North 23° 29' East 128 feet to the place of beginning, in Lane County, Oregon.

Beginning at the quarter corner between Sections 8 and 9, Twp. 22 S. R. 3 West, W. M.; thence North 990.5 feet more or less to a point on the section line 329.5 feet South of the Northeast corner of the SE¼ NE¼ of Section 8, thence West 1565.5 feet; thence North 66° 31' West 235 feet more or less to the easterly boundary of the County Road; thence in a Southwesterly direction following said East boundary of said County Road 1166 feet more or

LEGAL NOTICES

less to the quarter line of Section 8; thence East 2240 feet more or less to the place of beginning, all in Lane County, Oregon.
Beginning at a point on the quarter-quarter line of Sec. 8, Twp. 22 S. R. 3 West, W. M., 624 feet West of the center of the NE¼ of said Section 8, said point being 214 feet West of the Westerly boundary of the County Road; thence South 23° 29' West 39½ feet; thence South 66° 31' East to the Westerly boundary of the County Road; thence South 23° 29' West following the said Westerly boundary of said County Road 1299½ feet more or less to the quarter line; thence West following said quarter line 55 feet more or less to the center of the present channel of the Coast Fork of the Willamette River; thence following down the center of the channel of said river in an irregular Northerly direction 1400 feet more or less to the quarter-quarter line; thence following the said quarter-quarter line 110 feet more or less to the place of beginning and embracing ¼ acres, more or less, in Section 8, Twp. 22 S. R. 3 W. W. M. in Lane County, State of Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of said real property as set out in the Complaint herein, and that you and each of you be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs; and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem just and equitable.

This summons is published pursuant to an order made by the HONORABLE G. F. SKIPP, WORTH, Judge of the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County on the 2nd day of April, 1946, which order directs that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation, printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: On or before the 2nd day of May, 1946.

Date of first publication April 4, 1946.
Date of last publication May 2, 1946. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs, Residence and Post Office address: Wisner Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. 34-5t-38

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.
Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A. M. Pacific Standard Time, May 14, 1946 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described: each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N¼ NE¼ and NE¼ NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3740 M. feet Douglas Fir, 35 M. feet Hemlock, 230 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 215 Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$3.60 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Western Red Cedar, \$7.50 ea. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$14,287.75, will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 23, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N¼ NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3370 M. feet Douglas Fir, 115 M. feet Hemlock, 105 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 60 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft. B.M. for the Hemlock and Western Red Cedar, \$7.50 ea. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a

LEGAL NOTICES

total purchase price of \$19,972.50, will be considered. T. 18 S. R. 1 W., Sec. 9, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NE¼ NE¼), Lot 2 (NW¼ NE¼), Lot 5 (SW¼ NE¼), and the SE¼ NE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3760 M. feet Douglas fir, 95 M. feet Hemlock, 395 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 125 M. feet Incense Cedar, 150 M. feet White Fir, 180 Western Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M. ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, Western Red Cedar, and White Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$7.50 ea. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$23,605.00, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 17, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S¼ NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2585 M. feet Douglas fir, 235 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 4 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine, 80 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Western Red Cedar and Hemlock, \$7.85 per M.ft.B.M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, or a total purchase price of \$12,530.15, will be considered. All Sugar Pine trees not stamped USOC are reserved from cutting. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4355 M. feet Douglas fir, 355 M. feet Hemlock, 430 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 200 M. feet Incense Cedar, 235 Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$4.60 per M.ft. B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Western Red Cedar, \$2.25 per M. ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$7.50 ea. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$22,621.75, will be considered. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 5th day of April, 1946. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 35-4t-38

NOTICE OF SCHOOL ELECTION UPON QUESTION OF INCREASING TAX LEVY OVER AMOUNT LIMITED BY SECTION 11, ARTICLE XI, STATE CONSTITUTION
Notice is hereby given that an election will be held, in School District No. U-14 of Lane County, State of Oregon, at Music Room, Union High School Building, on May 15 from 2 p.m. to 7 p.m. in said school district, for the purpose of submitting to the legal voters of said district the question of increasing the tax levy for the year 1946-47 over the amount limited by section 11, article XI, of the Constitution of Oregon.
The reasons for increasing such levy are:
Increased cost of services, equipment, and operation. Provision for Retirement Fund for employees, made mandatory by recent legislation.
The amount of tax, in excess of the 6% limitation, proposed to be levied for said year is \$5,165.16.
Dated this 17th day of April, 1946.
Attest:
H. B. FERRIN, District Clerk.
C. A. BEIDLER, Chairman Board of Directors.

NOTICE OF SCHOOL ELECTION TO VOTE ON A SERIAL LEVY OF TAXES FOR IMPROVEMENTS UNDER CHAPTER 453, OREGON LAWS 1945.
Notice is hereby given that an election will be held in School District No. 14 of Lane County, State of Oregon, at the music room of Union High School Building in said district on Wednesday,

LEGAL NOTICES

May 15, 1946 from 2 o'clock P.M. to 7 o'clock P.M., for the purpose of submitting to the legal voters of said district the question of voting a two mill serial levy of taxes for improvements under chapter 453, Oregon Laws 1945 as follows:

Shall School District No. U-14, Lane County, under the provisions of Chapter 453, Oregon Laws, 1945, authorize the district school board to levy for one year, beginning July 1, 1947 a special district tax levy of two mills to provide a fund for construction, improvement, betterment and repair of school plants and school premises, and for replacement of equipment and busses, and the acquisition of additional land for the same as needed in order to provide more adequately for the public school population of said district, and to use state or federal matching funds should they become available; said levies shall be outside the limitation imposed by Article XI, Section 11 of the Oregon constitution.

Dated this 17th day of April, 1946.
Attest:
H. B. FERRIN, District Clerk.
C. A. BEIDLER, Chairman Board of Directors.

VETERANS OF FOREIGN WARS
Cottage Grove Post No. 3473
Meets First and Third Wednesday, 8:00 P. M.
All overseas veterans invited to join. 35-tfxx

PAINT CONTRACTOR
SPRAY OR BRUSH
Specializing in Ranch Houses and Buildings
Free Estimates
EARL RENFROW
Phone 27-F-6
Box 7, Lorane, Oregon 32-tfxx

Stromberg-Carlson Radios
Console Combinations.
Come in, see them, hear them. The finest in radio reception and record reproduction. Also repair work on refrigerators and washing machines appreciated.
Mack's Fixit Shop
Phone 302 34-tfe

Pat's Saw and Lawn Mower Shop
218 S. Pac. Highway
We are prepared to sharpen saws—cross cut, skill and band, up to 1½-in. circle. Hand saws sharpened and retooled. Lawn mowers and other tools sharpened. 33-4tp-36

USE 666
Cold Preparations
LIQUID, TABLETS, SALVE, NOSE DROPS
Caution—Use Only As Directed. 6-38

RHEUMATISM and ARTHRITIS
I suffered for years and am so thankful that I found relief from this terrible affliction that I will gladly answer anyone writing me for information. Mrs. Anna Pautz, P. O. Box 825, Vancouver, Wash.

Pd. Adv.—NUE-OVO Laboratories
Remove Stains, add New Spirit to
DENTAL PLATES
NO BRUSHING
Kleenite ends messy, harmful brushing. Just put your plate in a glass of water, add a little Kleenite, Presto! Stains, discoloration and denture odors disappear. Your teeth sparkle like new. Ask your druggist today for Kleenite.

Get KLEENITE today at KELLY DRUG CO. and all good druggists
TOO FAT?
Get SLIMMER this vitamin candy way
Have a more slender, graceful figure. No exercising. No fastings. No drugs. With the simple AYDS Vitamin Candy Reducing Plan you don't cut out any meals, starches, pastries, puddings, butter, you simply cut them down. It's easier when you enjoy delicious (vitamin fortified) AYDS candy before meals. Absolutely harmless. In clinical tests conducted by medical doctors more than 100 persons lost 15 to 25 lbs. average in a few weeks with AYDS (Kleenite). 30-day supply of AYDS only \$2.95. If not delighted with results, MONEY BACK on very first box. Please.

Indebtedness

1. Amount of bonded indebtedness (include all negotiable interest-bearing warrants issued under section 111-1016, O.C.L.A.)	\$114,500.00
2. Amount of warrant indebtedness on warrants issued and endorsed "not paid for want of funds"	None
3. Amount of other indebtedness	None
4. Total Indebtedness (sum of items 1, 2, 3)	\$114,500.00