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LET'S DON'T DEVELOP A LUXURY WE CAN'T AFFORD

This week a lady came into our office pretty well wronght
up over the fact that so far the business people or merchants
here apparently have taken little or no interest in maintaining

the rest room at the city hall. She thought it

Was expensive

for the rural people to have to furnish the room and then tak:
time off to supervise it. We agreed with her, more particularly
if' she sets any value on her time and effort. While we hold no
brief for the business man or merchant. we rather think that
the negligence, if it might be called that is due to the fact that

the average merchant does not know the problems connected

with the operation of the waiting room, nor has he understood

how the projeet is supposed to

operate, If he did, we feel sire

that the projeet would have his support

From what we know of the waiting room, we

think the

manner of its operation is more or less of in the experimental

stage and once the *‘bugs”

are

worked out of it, all the assist.

ance necessary will be forthcoming.

Personally we can’t see why the services of a
supervisor is necessary, whether the

full time

supervisor donates her

time or is paid for it, to keep the building in order. We can’t
feature some rural mother coming into the rest room and mark
ing or defacing the halls or paint or wood \\ul‘}f of the room
or permitting her children to do so. Some supervision might be

necessary, but this could be done by the building
even though it might be necessary to booest his

caretaker,
sala ry a bit

We have suggested that such an arrangement might be work
ed out with the city or building owner, if the location is chang-

l‘d.

We have been interested in a project of this sort for some

time and have made some inquiries as to how

might be operated.

such a plaee

We have not heard of a community successfully operating
a project of this kind on a full time supervisor. Under the pres.
ent wage scale, it’s a luxury we could not afford.

. CRESWELL

W. C. Adams served as instal-
ling officer at an open meeting of
the Veterans of Foreign Wars
Monday evening at the IOOF hall
Hays Burke was installed as
Post Commander; George H. Mil-
ler, senior vice commander; Sid-
ney Cook, junior vice commander;
Allan Good, quartermaster; Del-
bert Jones, judge advocate; Dav-
id Casper, chaplain; Burnell Jones,
Romas Casper, Orval Wilmot,
trustees. New recruits were Cal-
vin Taylor and Floyd Babcock.
M. G. Chapman of Springfield
was a visitor. A social time fol-
lowed the business meeting.

Miss Arleta Syphers, employed
in the navy supply depot at Oak-
land, California visited this week

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Hanson were
guests this week of Mr. and Mrs.
F. B. Good. They are moving from
Inglewood, California to Bend and
on their way home to move
goods.

P. E. Kelsey of Havre, Montana
visited recently with his sister,
Mrs. L. J. Quigley.

E

formerly
operating the
Snack Shack south of the Shell
Service station. They serve full
meals specializing in fried chick-
en.

Irl Land, second son of Mrs.

companied by Martin Hartman of
the Camas Swale district.

Miss Watrine Spencer, teacher
in the high school! at Pendleton,
and her fiance, Jack Harris, of
San Francisco, spent the week end
at the home of Miss Spencer's
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. O
Spencer.

Fred Trumbly, Norman Skaggs
and J. R. Miller attended a meet-
ing of the Wimawhala Encamp-
ment of the IOOF lodge at Salem
Friday evening and observed the
30th anniversary of the lodge
there.

Mrs. H. S. Joslin, Creswell cor-
respondent for the Sentinel, who
has been a patient for some time
at the Eugene hospital, was re-
turned to her home Wednesday
and is much improved in health.

Georgia and Catherine Lytle
and Mrs. Harry Van Winkle of
Swiss Home ‘entertained Friday
afternoon at a party for their
sister Patricia’s seventh anniver-
sary. Mrs. H. E. Walther, Patri-
cia’s school teacher, was a special
guest with Mrs. K. Duyck and

Mrs. C. I. Kent and 20 young
folk. Games supplied entertain-
ment until serving time.

Miss Lucile E. Kent, daughter
of Mr. and Mrs. C. 1. Kent, is hav-
ing a vacation from her work in

. Salem and is visiting friends in

lowa.

Miss Beatrice Barrie is visiting
her father, Clarence Barrie, and
sister, Mrs. E. D. Grousbeck, and
family. She is employed by the
Western Union at Fort Ord, Cali-
fornia.

Lieutenant and Mrs. Norman
Green are guests of his parents,
Mayor and Mrs. E. A. Green.
They have recently completed a
short course at the University of

Washington at Seattle.

Will Consider Subdividing Our

Country home—T7881 acres—

Delight Valley (or will sell all in
one unit),

1. Large modern house, beauti-
ful shade trees, lawn and shrub-
bery. Good road, electricity, phone,
school bus, etc. Linoleum in all

ning room and
living room (17x27), 2 large porch-
es; garage with concrete floor, 4

and workshop. swim-
ming tank 20x46 feet. Deep dril-
led well, abundant fine water, au-
tomatic new pump. About three

acres of land, well fenced. Fine
neighborhood. Some furniture may
be included.

2. About 75 acres fine farm land,
cleared; 3 creeks; 3 bridges: 4
concrete dams; 3 barns: gas house
with visible pump; chicken house,
etc. Excellent building sites.
Electricity; phone; school bus, etec.
2 cream routes; family orchard:
2 acres young walnuts: stock and
equipment may be included. Wat-
er rights filed.

Those interested leave name and
address and phone number at
Sentinel Office and owner will

contact you this week end. Terms
's to & down or cash. C. E. Brown
(owner), "

THE SENTINEL, COTTAGE GRGVE, OREQON

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS
In the Circuit Court of the State
of Oregon for Lane County.
NETTIE GAWLEY; BENJAMIN
N. GAWLEY and CLEONE 1
GAWLEY, husband and wife,

Plaintifts,
VS,
L. HATTIE HART and HARRY
HART, her husband; HERBERT

COCHRAN amd ANGELINE
COCHRAN, his wife; GERTRUDE
AGNES WARFEL and ORVILLE
M. WARFEL, her husband; MEL-
BA MAY ROSS and WILLIAM
CLIFFORD ROSS, her husband;

'HARRY HART, Administrator of

the estate of LILLIE ORPURD;
the unknown heirs of any of the
above named persons or parties,
if any are deceased; also all other
persons or parties unknown claim-
ing any right, title, estate, lien or
interest in the real estate des-
cribed in the complaint herein,
Defendants.
TO: HERBERT COCHRAN and
ANGELINE COCHRAN, his wife;
the unknown heirs of any of the
above named persons or parties,
if any are deceased; also all other
persons or parties unknown claim-
ing any right, title, estate, lien or
interest in the real estate describ-
ed in the complaint herein,
Defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE
STATE OF OREGON: You are
hereby summoned and required to
appear and answer the complaint
of the plaintiffs filed against you
in the above entitled suit on or
before the last day of the time
prescribed in the order of publi-
cation, to-wit: on or before the
25th day of April, 1946. And if you
lau to so appear, and answer, for
want thereof the plaintiffs will
apply to the above entitled Court
for the relief prayed for in the
complaint, to-wit: that you, and
each of you, be adjudged to have
no estate of interest whatsoever
in or to the land and premises
herein described, to-wit:

Lot 1, Block 6, Jones Addition

to Cottage Grove, Lane Coun-

ty, Oregon, excepting the

North 65 feet of the West half

thereof,

Beginning at the Northwest

corner of Lot 1, Block 6,

Jones Addition to Cottage

Grove, Lane County, Oregon,

thence East 120 feet; thence

South 65 feet; thence West

120 feet; thence North 65

feet; being the North 65 feet

of the West half of Lot 1,

Block 6, Jones Addition to

Cottage Grove, Lane County,

Oregon, by an estate in en-

tirety.
and that the plaintiffs are the
owners in fee simple of the res-
pective portions of said property,
as set out in the complaint here-
in. That you, and each of you, be
forever enjoined and debarred
from asserting any claim what-
ever thereto, adverse to the plaint-
iffs, and for such other and fur-
ther relief as to the Court may
seem just and equitable.

This summons is published pur-
suant to an order made by HON-
ORABLE G. F. SKIPWORTH.
WORTH, Circuit Judge of State
of Oregon for Lane County, on the
26th day of March, 1946, which
order directs that this summons
be published once a week for four
successive weeks in the Cottage
Grove Sentinel, a newspaper of
general circulation, printed at
Cottage Grove, Lane County, Ore-
gon; and that you be required to
appear and answer on or before
the last day of the time prescrib-
ed for said order, to-wit: on or
before the 25th day of April, 1946,

Date of first publication, March
28, 1946. Date of last publication,
April 25, 1946, HERBERT W,
LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaint-
iffs. Residence and Post Office Ad-

dress: Wiser Building, Cottage

Grove, Oregon. 33-51-.37
SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the

State of Oregon for Lane County

CHARLES C. GILHAM and
EDITH GILHAM, husband and
wife, Plaintiffs.

VS,
The unknown heirs of ALBERT
E. TOZIER, deceased:
TINE B. HARRIS, a widower:
HENRIETTA HARRIS LOEP and
FRED C. LOEP, her husband:

CORA HARRIS KENDALL, a,

widow; FLORA HARRIS LINN, a
widow; the unknown heirs of
CHARLES O. HARRIS, deceased:

the unknown heirs of WILLIAM |

1 O. HARRIS, deceased; JESS
BURGESS and

BURGESS, his wife; DAVID
BURGESS and — BUR- |

GESS, his wife; HUGH BURGESS
and -

wife;, EDDIE
— ————— BURGESS, his wife:
ALMA BURGESS, a single per-
son; H . A. HOWE and GER-
TRUDE HOWE, his wife: KATE
NEVADA BASSETT HUNT, a
widow; PAULINE BASSETT
MIZE, a widow; GUY A. BAS-
SETT and ELLDA BENDER BAS.-
SETT, his wife; OLIVE DAVIS
BASSETT, a widow: the un-
known heirs of any of the said
parties, if any are deceased; also,
all other persons or parties un-
known claiming any right, title,

| estate, lien or interest in the real
| estate described in the Complaint |
| herein, |

Defendants. |
TO: The unknown heirs of
RERT F. TOZIER, decensed: |

VALEN- |

BURGESS, his
BURGESS and

iy A - -
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VALENTINE B HARRIS, a
a widower; HENRIETTA- HAR
RIS LOEP and FRED C. LOEP,
her husband; CORA HARRIS
KENDALL, a widow; FLORA
HARRIS LINN, a widow: the un-
known heirs of CHARLES O
HARRIS, deceased: the unknown
heirs ‘of WILLIAM O. HARRIS,
deceased; JESS BURGESS and

. BURGESS, his wife:
HUGH BURGESS and

BURGESS, his wife: DAVID
BURGESS and BUR-
GESS, his wile; EDDIE BUR-
GESS and BURGESS,

his wife; ALMA BURGESS | a
single person; H. A, HOWE and
GERTRUDE HOWE, his wife:
KATE NEVADA BASSETT
HUNT, a widow; PAULINE
BASSETT MIZE, a widow: GUY
A, BASSETT and ELIDA BEND-.

ER BASSETT, his wife; OLIVE
' DAVIS BASSETT, a widow; the

unknown heirs of any of the said

parties, if any are deceased; also,
all other persons or parties un-
known claiming any right, title,

estate, lien or interest in the real
estate described ! the Complaint
herein,
Defendants,
IN THE NAME OF THE STATE
OF OREGON: You are herehy
summoned and required to appear
and answer the Complaint of the
plaintiffs filed against you in the
above entitled suit on of before
the last day of the time prescrib-
ed in the Order of Publication,
to-wit: on or before the 2nd day
of May, 1946; and if you fail to so
appear and answer, for want
thercof the plaintiffs will apply
to the above entitled Court for
the relief prayed for in the Com-
plaint, to-wit:
That you and each of you be ad-
Judged to have no estate or inter-
est whatsoever in and to the land
and premises herein described,
to-wit:
Beginning at a point 3295 feet
South and 1493.7 feet West of
the Northeast corner of the
Southeast quarter of the North-
east quarter of Section B8,
Township 22 South Range 3
West of Willamette Meridian,
said beginning point being 300
feet South 66° 31' East of the
Easterly boundary line of the
60-foot right of way of the Cot-
tage Grove-London Road as
now in wuse, thence from said
beginning point run West 718

feet, thence North 66° 31° West .

235 feet Yo the East boundary
line of said County Road right
of way, thence South 23° 29
West following said Easterly
boundary of said County Road
100 feet, thence South 66° 31’
East 300 feet, thence North 23°

29° East 128 feet to the place
of beginning, in Lane County,
Oregon.

Beginning at the quarter corn-
er between Sections 8 and 9
Twp. 22 S. R. 3 West, W. M:
thence North 990.5 feet more or
less to a point on the section
line 3295 feet South of the
Northeast corner of the SEY
NE'% of Section B, thence West
1565.5 feet; thence North 66°
41" West 235 feet more.or less
to the ecasterly boundary of the
County Road: thence in a
Southwesterly direction follow-
ing said East boundary of said
County Road 1166 feet more or
less to the quarter line of Sec-
tion 8; thence East 2240 feet
more or less to the place of
beginning, all in Lane County,
Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the
quarter-quarter line of Sec. 8,
Twp 22 8. R. 3 West, W. M.,
624 feet West of the center of
the NE'% of said Section 8,
said point being 214 feet West
of the Westerly boundary of
the County Road; thence South
23° 29 West 39'% feet: thence
South 66° 31’ East to the Wes-
terly boundary of the County
Road; thence South 23° 29° West
following the said Waesterly
boundary of said County Road
1299 feet more or less to the
quarter line: thence West fol-
lowing said quarter line 55 feet
more or less to the center of
the present channel of the Coast
Fork of the Willamette River:
thence following down the een-
ter of the chennel of sald river
in an irregular Northerly direc-
tion 1400 feet more or less to
the quarter-quarter line; thence
following the said quarter-quar-
ter line 110 feet more or less to

the place 6f beginning and em- |

fracing 4'% acres, mare or less,

in Section 8, Twp. 22 8. R. 3 W,

W. M. in Lane County, State of

Oregon.
and that the plaintiffs are the
owners in fee simple of sald real
property as set out in the Com-
plaint herein, and that you and
ecach of you be forever enjoined
and debarred from asserting any
claim whatever thereto adverse to
the plaintiffs; and for such other
and further relief as to the
Court shall seem just and equit-
able.

This summons is published per-

(suant to an order made by the

HONORABLE G. F. SKIP-
WORTH, Judge of the Circuit
Court of the State of Oregon for
Lane County on the 2nd day of
April, 1946, which order directs
that this Summons be published
once a week for four successive
weeks in the Cottage Grove Sen-

eral eirculation, printed and pub
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lished in Cottage Grove, Lane
County, Oregon and that you be
required to appear and answer on
or before the last day of the time
prescribed in said order, to-wit:
On or before the 2nd day of May,
1948
Date
4, 196
Date of last publication May
2, 1948, HERBERT W. LOM-
BARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs
Residence and Post  Office ad-
dress: Wiser Building, Cottage
Grove, Oregon J4-51-38.

of first publication April

NOTICE

WHEREAS in Chapter XXVI
Oregon Code 1930 and amend-
ments thereto, it is declared to
be the duty of every person, firm,
copartnership, company and cor
poration owning, leasing, occupy-
ing, possessing or having charge
of or dominion over any land,
place, building, structure, wharf,
pier or dock which is Infested
with ground squirrels and other
noxious rodents or predatory ani-
mals, or as soon as the presence
of the same shall come to his,
their or its knowledge, at once to
proceed and to continue in good
faith to exterminate and destroy
such rodents by poisoning, trap-
ping or other appropriate and ef-
fective means; and

WHEREAS gray digger ground
squirrels (Citellus deuglasil) are
noxious rodents in Lane County,
Oregon

Now, therefore, all of such per-
sons, firms, copartnerships, cor-
porations and companies owning
or having dominion over land in
sald Lane County, Oregon, are
hereby required to take steps to
exterminate sald gray digger
ground squirrels (Citellus doug-
lasii) within thirty days from the
date aof the first publication of
this notice. Il such steps are not
taken, a person or persons ap-
pointed by the County Court of
sald Lane County will enter upon
said lands and proceed to exter.
minate said gray digger ground
squirrels (Citellus douglasii) and
the cost of said extermination will
be levied against said lands.

The County Agricultural Agent
hereby designates Monday, April
15, as a day to be known as
“squirrel paisoning day” through-
out the said Lane county, and it
is hereby recommended that poi-
soned barley, as prepared by the
undersigned and representatives
of the U S Fish and Wildlife
Service, bé used for the purpose
of such extermination. Such poi-
soned barley may be secured from
the undersigned at his office In
Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, at
approximately the cost of prepara-
tion.

Date of first publication of this
notice April 4, 1946

(Signed) O. S. FLETCHER
County Agricultural

34-31-36 Agent

NOTICE OF HEARING

OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice is hereby given that the
undersigned Administrator of the
Estate of EMMA C. LOCKWOOD,
Deccased, has filed his final ac-
count for the final settlement of
said Estate in the Circuit Court
for Lane County, Oregon, and that
Tuesday, the Tth day of May,
1946, in the Circuit Court Room |
of said Court, at the County Court
House at Eugene, Lane County,
Oregon, at ten o'clock in the
forenoon, has been by said Court
fixed as the time and place for
the hearing of objections thereto,

and for final settlement of said
Estate. WALDO LAYNG, Ad-
ministrator, HERBERT W. LOM-

BARD, Attorney. 34-51-38.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that AL-
VIN J. KAMMAN has been ap-
pointed Administrator of the Es-
tate of CLELAND F. KAM-
MAN, deceased, by the Circuit
Court of Lane County, State of
Oregon. All persons having claims
against said estate are required to
present them, with proper vouch-
ers, within six (6) months from
the 2nd day of March, 1946, to
the said Administrator, at the law
office of HERBERT W. LOM-|
BARD, Wiser Building, Cottage '
Grove, Oregon. ALVIN J. KAM- /|
MAN, Administrator. HERBERT |
W. LOMBARD, Attorney. '
34-51-38. |

NOTICE TO CREDITORS |
Notice is hereby given that L.
E. ODELL has been appointed Ad- |
ministrator with the will annexed, |
of the estate of JOSEPH M.
|ODELL, deceaged, by the Circuit
Court of Lane Coupty, State of |
Oregon. All persons having claims |
against said estate are required to |
present them, with proper vouch-
ers, within six (6) months from |
the 4th day of April, 1946, 10 the
said Administrator in the law of- |
fice of HERBERT W, LOMBARD, |
Wiser Building, Cottage Grove,
| Lane County, Oregon. L. E,
ODELL, Administrator with the
will annexed of the estate of
JOSEPH M. ODELL, deceased.
HERBERT W. LOMBARD, At-|
torney for Estate, 34-51-38. |
——— —

NOTICE OF HEARING OF i
, FINAL ACCOUNT .
| NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVI-Z.':|
| That the undersigned Executor of

AL- [tinel, a weekly newspaper of gen-| the Last Will and Testament of |

lin'!'t' (1. i

il-'l'l‘.\ SMITIH GETTYS,

Victory

Fuel Company

—FREE!—

One load wood free for eve
You specify

Mill run, part slab, part block
CARL BONE, Mgr.

Ph. 273-Y

ten loads ordered April 1.15,

me of delivery,

$0.00

J-de-30
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ed, has signed his account for the
final settlement of sald estate in
the Circuit Court of Lane Coun-
ty, Oregon, and that Tuesday, the
23rd day of April, 196 in the
Circuit Court Room of the Coun-
ty Court House in Eugene, Ore-
gon at ten o'clock in the forenoon
has been, by the sald Court, fixed
as the time and place for hearing
of objections thereto, and for a
final settlement of said estate,
CHARLES GETTYS, Executor
HERBERT W, LOMBARD, Attor-
ney for estate 32-51.36

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE,
Sealed bias, marked outside “Bid
for Timber,” and addressed to the
Chief Forester, O, and C. Admin-
istration, 901 Guardian Bullding,
Portland 4, Oregon, will be receiv-
ed until and opened at 10:30 A. M
Pacific Standard Time, May 14,
196 for the purchase of timber
upon tracts herejpafter described
each bid must -x.'ulv the amount
per M, feet BM., which will be of-
fered for each species and the total
consideration which will be paid
for the timber. No hid for less than
the appraised value will be con-
sidered. Each bid must be sub-
mitted in duplicate and be ac-
companied by a deposit in the form
of a certifled check In favor of
the Treasurer of the United
States.. The deposit of any suec-
cessful bidder will be credited on
the contract. Payment in full at
the time of filing the contract is
required in sales amounting to
£2500 or less. For coples of the
form of proposal, form of contract
and bond, terms of payment,
amount of deposit required with
bid, amount of bond required with
contract and other information,
apwication should be made to the
address shown above. IN LANE

COUNTY: T.15S. R. 8 W, Sec
31, ali merchantable timber de-
signated for cutting on the N'g-
NE4% and NEWNWL, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
3740 M. feet Douglas Fir, 35 M
feet Hemlock, 230 M. feet West

ern Red Cedar, 215 Western Red
Cedar Poles. No bid for less than
£.60 per M.t BM. for the Doug-
las Fir, $250 per M.Mt.BM. for
the Hemlock and Western Red
Cedar, $75 ea. for the Western
Red Cedar Poles, or a total pur-
chase price of $14.287.75, will be
considered. T, 18 S, R. 1 E,, Sec
23, all merchantable timber desig-

nated for cutting on the N'g-
NWli, estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 3370 M feet

Douglas Fir, 1156 M. feet Hemlock,
105 M. feet Western Red Cedar,
60 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for
less than $5.75 per M.It.BM. for
the Douglas Fir, $250 per M.fi.
BM. for the Hemlock and West-
ern Red Cedar, 875 ea. for the
Western Red Cedar Poles, or a
totad purchase price of $19, 972.-
50, will be considered. T. 18 S, R,
1 W, Sec. 9, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
Lot 1 (INEWNEY), Lot 2 (NW4-
N!‘:’. ), Lot § |S“"-¢N":‘. ), and
the SEYWNEY, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 3760 M
feet Douglas fir, 95 M. feet Hem-
lock, 395 M. feet Western Red
Cedar, 1256 M. feet Incense Cedar,
150 M. feet White Fir, 180 West.-
ern Cedar Poles. No bid for less
than $575 per M.ft.BM. for the
Douglas fir, $250 per M. ft.B.M.
for the Hemlock, Western Red
Cedar, and White Fir, $2.00 per
M.ft.BM. for the Incense Cedar,
$.75 en. for the Western Red Ced-

|ar Poles, or a total purchase price

of $23,605.00, will be considered.
T.228., R. 1E, Sec. 17, all mer-
chantable timber designated for
eutting on the S"eNWY%, estimat-

ed for the purpose of this sale to

be 2685 M. feet Douglas fir, 235
M. feet Western Red Cedar, 4 M
feet stamped Sugar Pine, 80 M
feet Hemlock., No bid for less than
$4.50 per MALBM. for the Doug-
lus fir, $2.73 per MIMBM. for
the Western Red Cedar and Hem
lock, STRS per M. BM. for the
stamped Sugar Pine, or & total
purchase price of $12.530.15, will
be considered All  Sugar Pine
trees not stamped USOC are re-
served from cutting. T, 22 8., R
Jd W, See. 1, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the SWi, estimated for the pur
pose of this sale to be 4958 M
feet Douglas fir, 355 M. feet Hem-
lock, 430 M. feet Western Red
Cedar, 200 M. feet Incense Cedar,
235 Western Red Cedar Poles. No
bid for less than $460 per M.t
B.M. for the Douglas fir, $2.50 per
MftBM. for the Hemlock and
Western Red Cedar, $2.25 per M
M.BM. for the Incense Cedar, £.75
en. for the Western Red Cedar
Poles, or a total purchase price of
$22,621.75, will be considered. All
timber cut from the above des-
eribed areas must be manufactur-
ed In the loeal marketing area
designated by the O, and C. Ad-
ministration unless otherwise nu-
thorized by the Chief Forester
If the unit prices bid are above
those authorized by MPR 460,
they will be reduced to the maxi-
mum permitted under that order,
In case of two or more dentieal
bids for the same timber, the suc-
ceasful bidder will be selected on
the basis of ability to further the
objectives of the Act of August
28, 1937, The right s hereby re-
served to walve technical defects
in this advertisement; to reject
nll bids, or to award the timber
for the amount of the highest bid
to other than the highest bidder
when necessary, pursuamt to the
Act of August 28 1937 (50 Stat
K74), in order to provide a contin-
ued supply of timber to local in-
dustry so as to assure the perma-
nence of the community which s
dependent upon such  industry
Dated at Portland, Oregon, this
S5th day of April, 1946. W. H.
Horning, Chief Forester, O. and
C, Administration 54138

NOTIUCE OF FINAL ACCOUNT

Estate No, RR03
In the Circuit Court of the
State of Oregon for the county of
Lane. Department of Probate
IN THE MATTER OF THE )
ESTATE OF )
FLORENCE ANN STEEVES )
Deceased. )
Notice is hereby given that the
undersigned, as Executrix of the
estate of Florence Ann Steeves,
deceased, has filed her final ac-
count in the office of the County
Clerk of Lane County, Oregon,
that Tuesday, the 30th day of
April, 1946, at the hour of 1:30
p. m. of said day, in the Cireuit
Court Room of the Circuit Court
of the State of Oregon for Lane
County has been appointed by
sald Court as the time and place
for the hearing of objections
thereto and the settlement there-
of,
Dated March 20, 1946,
Date of first publication, March
21, 1846.
Date of Last publication, April
18, 1946,
EDNA A. JESMER,
Executrix of the estate
of Florence Ann Steeves,
deceased,

EARL F. G. HURLBURT,
Attorney at Law,

714 Porter Building,

Portland, 4, Oregon,

Attorney for Executrix,  32.51-36
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Lee Nichols
RADIO HEADQUARTERS

New Home and Auto Radios Are
Coming in Every Week.

8ilex Coffee Makers
Heating Pads
Iron Cords

Electric Heaters

Bathroom Light Fixtures

Light Bulbs, 10 to 300
Watts

Flash Lights

Carl Aerials, all types

Germicidal Lamps and
and Fixtures

Heat and Sun Lamps
Desk Lamps

Bed Lamps

Table Lamps

Pin-up Lamps
Batteries of all kinds

!ﬁchols Radio & Electric

Main Street

Phone 317
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