

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. LEE J. TREADWELL and HOMER PRESCOTT, Plaintiffs vs. GEORGE TARR, a widower; DONNA TARR, a minor; LUCY R. SMITH, a widow; PAUL SMITH and VIOLA SMITH, his wife; CHARLES S. SMITH, a single person; ELIZABETH SMITH, a widow; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

Defendants.

TO: GEORGE TARR, a widower; DONNA TARR, a minor; ELIZABETH SMITH, a widow; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or before the 27th day of December, 1945; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof, the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: that you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land or premises herein described, to-wit:

Lots 2 and 7, Block 5, Georgetown Second Addition as the same is platted and recorded in Volume 2 page 62, Lane County Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon. Lot 1 of Block 5, Georgetown Second Addition to Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of the respective portions of said property as set out in the complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs; and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem just and equitable.

This summons is published pursuant to an order made by HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge of the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 22nd day of November, 1945, which order directs that this summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation, published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 27th day of December, 1945. Date of first publication November 22nd, 1945. Date of last publication December 27th, 1945. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs. Residence and Post Office address: Cottage Grove, Oregon. 15-5t-19.

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. J. F. HOFFMAN and EMMA A. HOFFMAN, husband and wife, Plaintiffs vs.

GEORGE TARR, a widower; DONNA TARR, a minor; LUCY R. SMITH, a widow; PAUL SMITH and VIOLA SMITH, his wife; CHARLES S. SMITH, a single person; ELIZABETH SMITH, a widow; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

Defendants.

TO: GEORGE TARR, a widower; DONNA TARR, a minor; ELIZABETH SMITH, a widow; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or before the 27th day of December, 1945; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof, the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: that you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land or premises herein described, to-wit:

LEGAL NOTICES

Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of the said property as set out in the complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs; and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem just and equitable.

This summons is published pursuant to an order made by HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge of the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 14th day of November, 1945, which order directs that this summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 27th day of December, 1945. Date of first publication November 22nd, 1945. Date of last publication December 27th, 1945. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs. Residence and Post Office address: Cottage Grove, Oregon. 15-5t-19.

NOTICE OF HEARING OF FINAL ACCOUNT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the undersigned Executor of the Last Will and Testament of JOHN GRABER, Deceased, has filed his account for final settlement of said Estate in the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 20th day of December, 1945, in the Circuit Court Room of said Court, in the County Court House at Eugene, Oregon, at 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. GOTTFRIED GRABER, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 15-5t-19.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of E. EARLE CONE, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, Oregon; all persons having claims against said estate are hereby required to present same duly verified with proper vouchers to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon within six months of the date of the first publication of this notice. Dated and first published November 22, 1945. LOUISE E. CONE, Executrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 15-5t-19.

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. GEORGE JAMES, Plaintiff vs.

ERNEST SEARS and ZELMA SEARS, his wife; GEORGE RALPH SEARS and EMMA SEARS, his wife; SHERMAN MORSE, a widower; Unknown heirs of WILLARD JONES and KATE JONES, both deceased; OLIVE JONES DOE and JOHN DOE, her husband; MINNIE JONES ROE and JOHN ROE, her husband; TONY SEARS, a single person; WILEY SEARS, a single person; CLARENCE SEARS, a single person; FRANK PORTER and MRS. FRANK PORTER, his wife; RALPH PORTER, his wife; CLARA SMITH and SMITH, her husband; NINA SEARS, a widow; JEAN LYONS and ADEN LYONS, her husband; GEORGE HAROLD SEARS, a single person; ALICE SEARS, a minor; LEE SEARS, a minor; HELEN SEARS, a minor; LULU M. CHAPMAN and W. V. CHAPMAN, her husband; FRANK W. SEARS and MINNIE SEARS, his wife; PEARL WILLIAMS and WILLIAMS, her husband; CLARENCE SEARS, a single person; EDNA BRUMFIELD and LARRY BRUMFIELD, her husband; ANDY SEARS and SEARS, his wife; TOM SEARS and LENA SEARS, his wife; LAWRENCE MCCONNELL, a widower; DELLA ILLER and JOHN ILLER, her husband; HATTIE YANCEY MOTT and MOTT, her husband; WALTER SEARS and EDITH SEARS, his wife; LILLIE FIX and BEN FIX, her husband; ROSY JEFEKE and JEFEKE, her husband; AGNES PERRIN and PERRIN, her husband; IVA SOUTHWALD DOE and JOHN DOE, her husband; LORENA SOUTHWALD ROE and JOHN ROE, her husband; JACK SOUTHWALD, a single person; also, the unknown heirs of any of the said parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein.

Defendants.

TO: The unknown heirs of WIL- LARD JONES, Deceased; the unknown heirs of KATE JONES, Deceased; OLIVE JONES DOE and JOHN DOE, her husband; MINNIE JONES ROE and JOHN ROE, her husband; TONY SEARS,

LEGAL NOTICES

a single person; WILEY SEARS, a single person; FRANK PORTER and MRS. FRANK PORTER, his wife; RALPH PORTER and MRS. RALPH PORTER, his wife; CLARA SMITH and SMITH, her husband; GEORGE HAROLD SEARS, a single person; PEARL WILLIAMS and WILLIAMS, her husband; ANDY SEARS and SEARS, his wife; LILLIE FIX and BEN FIX, her husband; ROSY JEFEKE and JEFEKE, her husband; AGNES PERRIN and PERRIN, her husband; IVA SOUTHWALD DOE and JOHN DOE, her husband; LORENA SOUTHWALD ROE and JOHN ROE, her husband; also, the unknown heirs of any of the said parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiff filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or before the 20th day of December, 1945, and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof, the plaintiff will apply to the above entitled court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: that you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in and to the land and premises herein described, to-wit:

Beginning at the most southerly southwest corner of the William Cribbin Donation Land Claim No. 40, Township 20 South, Range 2 West of Willamette Meridian, in Lane County, Oregon, thence north 12.08 chains to the southerly boundary of the O. P. & E. Railroad right of way, thence north 77° west following said southerly boundary line of said right of way 16.10 chains, thence south 7.50 chains to the center of a stream known as Row River, thence south 52° east 17.20 chains to a point in or near the center of said stream, thence south 83° east 2.17 chains, thence north 2.30 chains to the place of beginning, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiff is the owner in fee simple of said premises as set out in the complaint herein, and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiff, and for such other and further relief as to the court may seem just and equitable.

This summons is published pursuant to an order made by Honorable G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge for Lane County, Oregon, on the 20th day of November, 1945, which order directs that this summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel a newspaper of general circulation, printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 20th day of December, 1945. Date of first publication November 22, 1945. Date of last publication December 20, 1945. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiff. Residence and Post Office Address: Cottage Grove, Oregon. 15-5t-19.

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL ACCOUNT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That the undersigned Executor of the Last Will and Testament of SUSANNA C. WELLS, Deceased, has filed his account for the final settlement of said estate in the Circuit Court of Lane County, Oregon, and that Wednesday the 2nd day of January, 1946, in the Circuit Court Room of said Court in the County Court House in Eugene, Oregon, at 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing of objections thereto and for final settlement of said estate.

WORTH HARVEY, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 16-5t-20

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

I have been appointed as Administrator of the Estate of GEORGE STEVEN TAYLOR, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, by an order dated September 11, 1945. All persons having claims against said Estate are requested to present them, with proper vouchers, within six months of the date hereof to the undersigned, at the offices of Herbert W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. Dated and first published November 29, 1945. Date of last publication December 27, 1945. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 16-5t-20

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

Notice is hereby given that Lil-

LEGAL NOTICES

lian J. Taylor, Executrix with the WILL annexed, of the ESTATE of Ida Katherine Taylor, deceased, has filed her final account in the Circuit Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed the 31st day of December, 1945, at 1:30 o'clock P. M. in the Court Room of said Court in the Court House at Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon.

First publication dated 29th day of November, 1945. LILLIAN J. TAYLOR, Executrix. ALTA KING, Attorney for Estate. 16-5t-20

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A. M. Pacific Standard Time, January 8, 1946 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 25, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2075 M. feet Douglas Fir, 105 M. feet Hemlock, 30 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$4.90 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$10,505.00, will be considered. The sale area is approx. 65 acres located in the southern portion of the quarter section and bounded by a blazed line. All other trees, including blazed line trees, are reserved from cutting. Logging is to be done by Caterpillar type tractor unless otherwise specified by the officer in charge of the sale. All timber cut from the above described area must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement: to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 3rd day of December, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 17-4t-20

DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or before the 17th day of January, 1946. Date of first publication December 20th, 1945. Date of last publication January 17th, 1946. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for plaintiffs. Residence and Post Office address: Cottage Grove, Oregon. 19-5t-23

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. FLORENCE BROWN, Plaintiff vs.

FRANK BROWN, Defendant. IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby required to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before four weeks from the date of first publication of this summons, or for want thereof the plaintiff will take a decree against you that the marriage contract now existing between aforesaid plaintiff and defendant be forever dissolved, set aside and held to naught. This summons is published once a week for four consecutive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a newspaper published at Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon by order of Hon. G. F. Skipworth, Judge of said Court, dated December 13, 1945 and is first published December 20, 1945. WARD W. WINTERMEIER, Attorney for Plaintiff. Residence and Post Office address, Eugene, Oregon. 19-5t-23

SUMMONS.

In the Circuit Court for the State of Oregon for Lane county. G. W. HASTINGS and MAMIE HASTINGS, his wife, Plaintiffs vs.

MARGUERITE MOSBY, a widow; HUBERT MOSBY, a single person; MABEL KERNS and JACK W. KERNS, her husband; PHILIP MOSBY, a single person; DORA HANDS and RALPH HANDS, her husband; BERNICE BOSLAUGH and RALPH BOSLAUGH, her husband; LITA BOSLAUGH and HAROLD BOSLAUGH, her husband; GERALD MOSBY, a single person; JEAN LONG, a widow; G. H. MOSBY and MILDRED MOSBY, his wife; WADE MOSBY and LUELLA MOSBY, his wife; MARY S. MOSBY, a widow; DAVID CLAYBORN MOSBY and POLLY HATCH MOSBY, his wife; ROBERT HARRY MOSBY and FERN MOSBY, his wife; GEORGE S. MOSBY, a single person; MIL- LARD M. MOSBY and MILDRED M. MOSBY, his wife; DARREL K. MOSBY and WINNIFRED E. MOSBY, his wife; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

Defendants.

TO: PHILIP MOSBY, a single person; DORA HANDS and

LEGAL NOTICES

RALPH HANDS, her husband; LITA BOSLAUGH and HAROLD BOSLAUGH, her husband; DAVID CLAYBORN MOSBY and POLLY HATCH MOSBY, his wife; GEORGE S. MOSBY, a single person; the unknown heirs of any of said parties if any are deceased; and also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

Defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or before the 17th day of January, 1946, and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof, the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever in and to the land and premises herein described, to-wit:

Southwest quarter of the southwest quarter of Section 7, Township 21 South Range 2 West of the Willamette Meridian, in Lane County, State of Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of said described property, and the whole thereof as set out in the complaint herein, and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs, and for such other and further relief as to the Court may seem just and equitable.

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. FLORENCE BROWN, Plaintiff vs.

FRANK BROWN, Defendant. IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby required to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before four weeks from the date of first publication of this summons, or for want thereof the plaintiff will take a decree against you that the marriage contract now existing between aforesaid plaintiff and defendant be forever dissolved, set aside and held to naught. This summons is published once a week for four consecutive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a newspaper published at Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon by order of Hon. G. F. Skipworth, Judge of said Court, dated December 13, 1945 and is first published December 20, 1945. WARD W. WINTERMEIER, Attorney for Plaintiff. Residence and Post Office address, Eugene, Oregon. 19-5t-23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of LOYD S. CRAWFORD, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, Oregon; all persons having claims against said estate are hereby required to present the same duly verified with proper vouchers to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Wiser Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon within six months of the date of the first publication of this notice. Dated and first published December 13th, 1945. SADDIE HILAH CRAWFORD, Executrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 18-5t-22

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A. M. Pacific Standard Time, January 8, 1946, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any suc-

LEGAL NOTICES

cessful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2,500.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 17 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE¼, SE¼ and SE¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1585 M. feet Douglas Fir, 90 M. feet Live Red Cedar, 115 M. feet Fire-killed Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock and 36 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.00 per M.ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Live Red Cedar and Hemlock, \$1.50 per M. ft.B.M. for the Fire-killed Red Cedar and \$75 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$8,362.00, will be considered. Logging is to be done by caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by the officer in charge of the sale. T. 19 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NW¼, NE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 520 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock and 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir and \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$1,870.00 will be considered. All trees in two areas totaling approximately 13.75 acres and bounded by blazed line are reserved from cutting, including blazed line trees. T. 21 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼, SW¼ and SW¼SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1525 M. feet Douglas Fir and 20 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.20 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir and \$2.50 per M.ft. B. M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,930.00 will be considered. Approximately 12 acres in a blazed line is reserved from cutting, including blazed line trees. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement: to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon this 17th day of December, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 19-2t-20

DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication of summons, to-wit: on or before the 17th day of January, 1946; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: that you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the lands and premises herein described, to-wit:

Lots 8, 9 and 10 in Block 3 of Cooper and Randall's Addition to Cottage Grove, as platted and recorded at Page 27 of Volume 3 Lane County, Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of said real property, as set out in the complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs, and for such other and further relief as to the Court may seem just and equitable.

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. FLORENCE BROWN, Plaintiff vs.

FRANK BROWN, Defendant. IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby required to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before four weeks from the date of first publication of this summons, or for want thereof the plaintiff will take a decree against you that the marriage contract now existing between aforesaid plaintiff and defendant be forever dissolved, set aside and held to naught. This summons is published once a week for four consecutive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a newspaper published at Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon by order of Hon. G. F. Skipworth, Judge of said Court, dated December 13, 1945 and is first published December 20, 1945. WARD W. WINTERMEIER, Attorney for Plaintiff. Residence and Post Office address, Eugene, Oregon. 19-5t-23

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Administratrix of the Estate of GEORGE BJORSET, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, Oregon, by an Order dated December 18, 1945. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby notified to present the same duly verified with proper vouchers to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Wiser Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of the first publication of this notice. Dated and first published December 20, 1945. DORRIS L. BJORSET, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 19-5t-23

USE 666

Cold Preparations LIQUID, TABLETS, SALVE, NOSE DROPS

Caution—Use Only As Directed

6-38

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane county. WILLIAM B. CHAFFEE and ELIZABETH V. CHAFFEE (sometimes known as Elizabeth V. Chaffee), his wife, Plaintiffs vs.

J. A. WELLS and MRS. J. A. WELLS, his wife; LINA F. CHAPIN, a widow; W. R. BERNARD and MRS. W. R. BERNARD, his wife; MRS. JOHN A. ARMSTRONG and JOHN A. ARMSTRONG, her husband; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein.

Defendants.

TO: J. A. WELLS and MRS. J. A. WELLS, his wife; LINA F. CHAPIN, a widow; W. R. BERNARD and MRS. W. R. BERNARD, his wife; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein.

DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication of summons, to-wit: on or before the 17th day of January, 1946; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: that you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the lands and premises herein described, to-wit:

Lots 8, 9 and 10 in Block 3 of Cooper and Randall's Addition to Cottage Grove, as platted and recorded at Page 27 of Volume 3 Lane County, Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of said real property, as set out in the complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs, and for such other and further relief as to the Court may seem just and equitable.

This summons is published pursuant to an order made by HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge for the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 18th day of December, 1945, which order directs that this summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a newspaper of general circulation printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon; and that you, and each of you, be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 17th day of January, 1946. Date of first publication December 20th, 1945. Date of last publication January 17th, 1946. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for plaintiffs. Residence and post office address: Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon. 19-5t-23

Moose Lodge Meets

Meets Every TUESDAY Night, 8:00 o'clock Petersen's Hall 18-tf

COLD WAVE PRICES SLASHED

The Charm-Kind COLD WAVE

Each tin contains 3 full ounces of Salvo-type solution, 60 Curls, 60 end pieces, cotton applicator, neutralizer and complete instructions.

Cottage Grove Pharmacy

632 Main Phone 244 16-4t-19

BRONCHIAL COUGHS!

or Bronchial Irritations Due to Cold. Buckley's Famous "CANADOL" Mixture Acts Like a Flash. Spend a few cents today at any good drug store for a bottle of Buckley's CANADOL Mixture (triple action). Take a couple of sips at bedtime. Realize its instant powerful effective action spread thru throat, head and bronchial tubes. It starts at once to loosen up thick, choking phlegm, soothe raw membranes and make breathing easier. Sufferers from those persistent, nasty irritating coughs or bronchial irritations due to colds and flu, Buckley's brings quick and effective relief. Don't wait—get Buckley's Canadol today. You get relief instantly.

Kelly Drug