

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific War Time, Sept. 4, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of Lot 11 (SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$), por. Lot 12 (SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$), por. Lot 10 (SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$), por. Lot 14 (NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), por. Lot 15 (NW $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), por. the SW $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$, por. Lot 16 (SE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 6485 M. feet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.80 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Hemlock, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$24,758.00, will be considered. The sale area is approximately 154.98 acres bounded by blazed lines. Within this sale area there are three small areas totaling about seven acres also bounded by blazed lines, which are reserved from cutting. T. 17 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE $\frac{1}{4}$, N $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, and N $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5250 M. feet Douglas Fir, 105 M. feet Red Cedar, 35 M. feet dead Red Cedar, 35 M. feet Hemlock, 135 M. feet Incense Cedar, 45 M. feet White Fir, 35 Red Cedar poles. No bid for less than \$3.90 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.25 per M. ft. B.M. for the Red Cedar, \$1.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the dead Red Cedar, \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar and White Fir, \$75 ea. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$21,211.25, will be considered. An area of approximately three acres in the W $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$ and an area of 38 acres in the N $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ are reserved from cutting. T. 22 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 240 M. feet Douglas Fir. No bid for less than \$5.70 per M.ft.B.M., or a total purchase price of \$1,368.00, will be considered. The sale area is approximately thirteen acres North and West of Brice Creek and South and West of a blazed line. Logging is to be done by Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by the Forester in charge of the sale. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 13th day of August, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 1-21-2

Moose Lodge Meets

Meets Every TUESDAY
Night, 8:00 o'clock
Petersen's Hall 18-tfc

Brisbane Electric
YOUR GENERAL ELECTRIC
DEALER

We will have a complete line of General Electric appliances, automatic washers and everything electrical, as soon as they are put on the market.
WE ALSO DO ELECTRICAL
WIRING

Brisbane Electric
1049 E. Main Phone 73
47-tfc

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF HEARING OF
FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Administratrix of the Estate of WALTER ROBINSON, Deceased, has filed her account for the final settlement of said Estate in the Circuit Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 28th day of August, 1945, at the Circuit Court Room of said Court, in the County Court-house, Eugene, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon, has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for the hearing of objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. BEULAH E. ROBINSON, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 50-51-2

SUMMONS

Case No.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR LANE COUNTY, PAUL RADTKE and ELIZABETH ANN RADTKE, his wife Plaintiffs,
vs.
CATHERINE LENTZ and JOHN DOE LENTZ, her husband; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein, Defendants.

TO: CATHERINE LENTZ and JOHN DOE LENTZ her husband; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein, DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the Order of Publication, to-wit: on or before the 23rd day of August, 1945; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatever in or to the land and premises hereinafter described, to-wit:

Lots Nine (9) and Ten (10), Block Four (4) of the Second Addition to Georgetown, as platted and recorded at page 62 of volume 2, Lane County, Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of the aforesaid described real property as set out in the Complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs; and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem just and equitable.

This Summons is published pursuant to an order made by the HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge of the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 24th day of July, 1945, which order directs that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation, printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 23rd day of August, 1945.

Date of first publication July 26th, 1945. Date of last publication August 23rd, 1945. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs. Residence and Post Office address, Cottage Grove, Oregon. 50-51-2

NOTICE OF HEARING OF
FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Executor of the Last Will and Testament of SARAH E. RAWLINGS, Deceased, has filed his account for the final settlement of said Estate in the Circuit Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 31st day of August, 1945, in the Circuit Court Room in the County Court House in Eugene Lane County, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon, has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. WORTH HARVEY, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 51-51-3

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that RAYMOND S. TRASK has been appointed Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ABBIE D. TRASK, Deceased, by the Circuit Court for Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said Estate are required to present them, with the proper vouchers, within six months from the 9th day of August, 1945, to the said Executor at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. RAYMOND S. TRASK, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 52-51-4

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF SALE ON
EXECUTION

BY VIRTUE of an Execution issued out of and under the seal of the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, upon a judgment rendered and docketed in the said Court on the 3rd day of July, 1945, in a suit wherein ERNEST H. GILDERSLIEVE is the Plaintiff, and LILA E. GILDERSLIEVE is the Defendant, in favor of said Plaintiff and against said Defendant, for the sum of \$150.00 and \$400.00, with interest thereon at the rate of 6% per annum from the 3rd day of July, 1945, and costs of \$42.50, which Execution was directed and delivered to me, as Sheriff in and for said County of Lane, State of Oregon, I have levied upon all right, title and interest of the said Defendant, LILA E. GILDERSLIEVE, in and to the following described real estate, to-wit:

All that part of the following described tract of land, on the southerly side of the county road and which lies between the right of way of the county road and the center of the channel of Row River, the tract herein conveyed containing 1.3 acres more or less, said tract of land being described as follows: Beginning at a point 1110 feet east and 1630 feet south of the $\frac{1}{4}$ corner between sections 31 and 32 T. 21 S. R. one West of W.M., run thence south 62 degrees and 15 minutes west 450 feet to the center of the channel of Row River, thence up the channel of said river and in a southeasterly direction 220 feet, thence north 62 degrees and 15 minutes east 600 feet, thence north 29 degrees west 210 feet, thence south 62 degrees and 15 minutes west 210 feet to the point of beginning, containing 3 acres more or less, excepting therefrom the county road, all in the southwest quarter of section 32, in T. 21 S. R. one West of Willamette Meridian, in Lane County, Oregon.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That I, the undersigned, as Sheriff Pro Tem, will sell the above described real property to the highest bidder for cash at public auction at the Southwest Front Door of the County Court House, in the City of Eugene, County of Lane, State of Oregon, on the 31st day of August, 1945, at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. of that day, to satisfy the said Execution together with interest and costs thereon. Dated August 2, 1945. O. E. CROWE, Sheriff Pro Tem, Lane County, Oregon. 49-51-51-3

DISTRICT LAND OFFICE, ROSEBURG, OREGON. Notice is hereby given that on July 12, 1944, Pope & Talbot, Inc., McCormick Terminal, Portland 9, Oregon, filed exchange application Roseburg 022911, under the Act of July 31, 1939 (53 Stat. 1144) for, as amended, the NW $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 29, W $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, W $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 31, T. 7 S., R. 6 W.; the S $\frac{1}{2}$ Sec. 25, N $\frac{1}{2}$ Sec. 35, T. 7 S., R. 7 W.; S $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 1, Lots 3 and 4, S $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 3, N $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 9, and NE $\frac{1}{4}$, N $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, Sec. 11, T. 8 S., R. 7 W.; all of Sec. 1, Lot 9 Sec. 3, all of Sec. 9, and all of Sec. 11, T. 15 S., R. 7 W., W. M., containing 4,464.61 acres, in lieu of the S $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, SW $\frac{1}{4}$, NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$, S $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 6, NW $\frac{1}{4}$, W $\frac{1}{2}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 22, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 28, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 34, T. 7 S., R. 6 W.; all of Sec. 6, N $\frac{1}{2}$, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 8, NE $\frac{1}{4}$, E $\frac{1}{2}$ W $\frac{1}{2}$, Lots 1, 2, 3, 4 Sec. 18, T. 15 S., R. 6 W.; N $\frac{1}{2}$ Sec. 26, NW $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 34, T. 7 S., R. 7 W.; N $\frac{1}{2}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 4, NW $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 10, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 11, T. 8 S., R. 7 W.; S $\frac{1}{2}$ N $\frac{1}{2}$, S $\frac{1}{2}$ Sec. 26, all of Sec. 34, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, W $\frac{1}{2}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$, S $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 36, T. 14 S., R. 7 W.; Lot 1, S $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 2, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ S $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 4, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ S $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 8, all of Secs. 10, 12, 16, 18 and 20 T. 15 S., R. 7 W.; NE $\frac{1}{4}$, S $\frac{1}{2}$ Sec. 24, NE $\frac{1}{4}$, SW $\frac{1}{4}$ Sec. 26, and W $\frac{1}{2}$ Sec. 36, T. 15 S., R. 8 W., W. M., Oregon, containing 9,689.98 acres. This notice is for the purpose of allowing all persons having bona fide objections to the proposed exchange an opportunity to file their objections in this office within 45 days from the date of first publication, together with evidence that a copy thereof has been served on the proponent, Richard McElligott, Register. First publication August 9, 1945. 52-51-4

NOTICE OF FINAL
SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Administrator of the Estate of GLEN H. PHELPS, Deceased, has filed his account for the final settlement of said Estate in the Circuit Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 6th day of September, 1945, in the Circuit Court Room in the County Court House in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. GLEN H. PHELPS, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 52-51-4

LEGAL NOTICES

AMENDED SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. H. A. HAGEN and HELEN HAGEN, his wife; L. A. BACHELDER, a widower, Plaintiffs,

vs.
The unknown heirs of R. H. HAZLETON and MARTHA HAZLETON, his wife, both deceased; THOMAS PERRY HAZLETON and MARY P. HAZLETON, his wife; MARY BROOKELBANK, a divorced person; the unknown heirs of NELLIE MAY IRVIN and ARCHIBALD IRVIN, her husband, both deceased; the unknown heirs of FRANCIS MARION HAZLETON, deceased; the unknown heirs of HARRISON HARVEY HAZLETON, deceased; KATE B. HAZLETON, a widow; the unknown heirs of JOHN WESLEY HAZLETON, deceased; the unknown heirs of JAMES MONROE HAZLETON, deceased; DORA SCOTT HAZLETON, a widow; HAZEL MALTBY and GROVER C. MALTBY, her husband; NIETA JONES, a widow; DANAE HAZLETON and RALPH HAZLETON, her husband; CHARLOTTE BLAISDEL and M. BLAISDEL, her husband; SHIRLEY BURKHOLDER, a single person; ROSA HAZLETON, a widow; HARRY B. HAZLETON and JUNE DOE HAZLETON, his wife; LLOYD F. HAZLETON and MRS. LLOYD F. HAZLETON, his wife; ERMA WEIR and JOHN DOE WEIR, her husband; DEANE L. HAZLETON and MRS. DEANE L. HAZLETON, his wife; GEORGE WASHINGTON HAZLETON and GRACE HAZLETON, his wife; ROYAL HAZLETON, a single person; OTTO FREDRICKSON and MARY FREDRICKSON, his wife; E. J. MILLER and JAMES F. MILLER, her husband; R. S. CATHEY and SARAH ANN CATHEY, his wife; CITY OF COTTAGE GROVE, a municipal corporation; COTTAGE GROVE ADJUSTMENT BUREAU, a corporation; FREDERICA TRAVIS SEASHORE and S. H. SEASHORE, her husband; LEE MOXON TRAVIS, sometimes called GOULD BRYAN TRAVIS, a divorced person; EUNICE A. STUDLEY, a widow; LESLIE ENGRAM and MAUDE ENGRAM, his wife; M. L. SCOVELL, Guardian of ELEANOR HINDS DANFORD and PAUL DANFORD, her husband; NELLIE COOPER and COOPER, her husband; GEORGE WALDEN and EMMA WALDEN, his wife; MARK WALDEN and ELSIE WALDEN, his wife; JOHN WALDEN and PEARL WALDEN, his wife; PAUL WALDEN and GIRLIE WALDEN, his wife; RALPH WALDEN and CLEMINE WALDEN, his wife; ROY WALDEN, a single person; CLAUDE WALDEN and EDNA WALDEN, his wife; KATE WALKER, a widow; FLETCHER C. ENGLAND and SIBYL C. ENGLAND, his wife; GILBERT R. WISEMAN and JULIA WISEMAN, his wife; MARY K. JOHNSON, a widow; RACHEL WALKER, a widow; AMY COFFIELD and JOHN COFFIELD, her husband; INA GETZ and MOSES GETZ, her husband; JOHN WALKER and MARY WALKER, his wife; DORA WALKER, a single person; NEVA WALKER DOE and JOHN DOE, her husband; RAY WALKER and JANE DOE WALKER, his wife; CLARA WALKER, a widow; ALONZO WALKER, a widower; LLOYD WALKER, a single person; WINSTON WALKER, a single person; WILEY WALKER, a single person; ANSIL WALKER and LAURA WALKER, his wife; SIBYL WALKER, a single person; MARY JANE KANANN and BUD KANANN, her husband; BONNIE BETH MCCLINTOCK and TRESS MCCLINTOCK, her husband; CLELLA E. WALKER BENNETT and FRANCIS CHRISTMAN, a widower; the unknown heirs of any of said parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein.

DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the Amended Complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the Order of Publication, to-wit: on or before the 6th day of September, 1945; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof, the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in and to the lands and premises herein described, to-wit:

PARCEL 1: Lot Four (4), Block Two (2) Hazletons Addition, Cottage Grove, Oregon, also beginning at the most Southerly corner of Lot Four (4), Block Two (2) Hazletons Addition, Cottage Grove, Oregon, and running thence North 35° 45' West 120 feet, thence South 54° 15' West 48.75 feet, thence South 35° 45' East 120 feet, thence North 54° 15' East 48.75 feet to the point of beginning, and being in Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon.

PARCEL 2: Lots One (1) and Two (2), Block Two (2), Hazletons Addition, Cottage Grove, Oregon, also beginning at the most Southerly corner of Lot Three (3), Block Two (2) Hazletons Addition and running thence North 35° 45' West 120 feet; thence North 54° 15' East 14.25 feet; thence South 35° 45' East 120 feet; thence South 54° 15' West 14.25 feet to the point of beginning, and being in Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon.

WARD, a divorced person; MARVENA HOLMES MARSHALL and MARSHALL, her husband; the unknown heirs of any of said parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein.

DEFENDANTS.

TO: The unknown heirs of R. H. HAZLETON and MARTHA HAZLETON, his wife, both deceased; THOMAS PERRY HAZLETON and MARY P. HAZLETON, his wife; the unknown heirs of NELLIE MAY IRVIN and ARCHIBALD IRVIN, her husband, both deceased; the unknown heirs of FRANCIS MARION HAZLETON, deceased; KATE B. HAZLETON, a widow; the unknown heirs of JOHN WESLEY HAZLETON, deceased; unknown heirs of

LEGAL NOTICES

WILLIAM HENRY HAZLETON, deceased; the unknown heirs of JAMES MONROE HAZLETON, deceased; DANAE HAZLETON and RALPH HAZLETON, her husband; M. BLAISDEL; ROSA HAZLETON, a widow; HARRY B. HAZLETON and JUNE DOE HAZLETON, his wife; LLOYD F. HAZLETON and MRS. LLOYD F. HAZLETON, his wife; ERMA WEIR and JOHN DOE WEIR, her husband; DEANE L. HAZLETON and MRS. DEANE L. HAZLETON, his wife; GEORGE WASHINGTON HAZLETON and GRACE HAZLETON, his wife; ROYAL HAZLETON, a single person; OTTO FREDRICKSON and MARY FREDRICKSON, his wife; E. J. MILLER and JAMES F. MILLER, her husband; R. S. CATHEY and SARAH ANN CATHEY, his wife; LEE MOXON TRAVIS, sometimes called GOULD BRYAN TRAVIS, a divorced person; LESLIE ENGRAM and MAUDE ENGRAM, his wife; M. L. SCOVELL, Guardian of ELEANOR HINDS DANFORD and PAUL DANFORD, her husband; NELLIE COOPER and COOPER, her husband; GEORGE WALDEN and EMMA WALDEN, his wife; MARK WALDEN and ELSIE WALDEN, his wife; PAUL WALDEN and GIRLIE WALDEN, his wife; RALPH WALDEN and CLEMINE WALDEN, his wife; ROY WALDEN, a single person; CLAUDE WALDEN and EDNA WALDEN, his wife; KATE WALKER, a widow; FLETCHER C. ENGLAND and SIBYL C. ENGLAND, his wife; GILBERT R. WISEMAN and JULIA WISEMAN, his wife; MARY K. JOHNSON, a widow; RACHEL WALKER, a widow; AMY COFFIELD and JOHN COFFIELD, her husband; INA GETZ and MOSES GETZ, her husband; JOHN WALKER and MARY WALKER, his wife; DORA WALKER, a single person; NEVA WALKER DOE and JOHN DOE, her husband; RAY WALKER and JANE DOE WALKER, his wife; CLARA WALKER, a widow; ALONZO WALKER, a widower; LLOYD WALKER, a single person; WINSTON WALKER, a single person; WILEY WALKER, a single person; ANSIL WALKER and LAURA WALKER, his wife; SIBYL WALKER, a single person; MARY JANE KANANN and BUD KANANN, her husband; FRANCIS CHRISTMAN, a widower; LORENE HOLMES

LEGAL NOTICES

WARD, a divorced person; MARVENA HOLMES MARSHALL and MARSHALL, her husband; the unknown heirs of any of said parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein.

DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the Amended Complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the Order of Publication, to-wit: on or before the 6th day of September, 1945; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof, the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in and to the lands and premises herein described, to-wit:

PARCEL 1: Lot Four (4), Block Two (2) Hazletons Addition, Cottage Grove, Oregon, also beginning at the most Southerly corner of Lot Four (4), Block Two (2) Hazletons Addition, Cottage Grove, Oregon, and running thence North 35° 45' West 120 feet, thence South 54° 15' West 48.75 feet, thence South 35° 45' East 120 feet, thence North 54° 15' East 48.75 feet to the point of beginning, and being in Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon.

PARCEL 2: Lots One (1) and Two (2), Block Two (2), Hazletons Addition, Cottage Grove, Oregon, also beginning at the most Southerly corner of Lot Three (3), Block Two (2) Hazletons Addition and running thence North 35° 45' West 120 feet; thence North 54° 15' East 14.25 feet; thence South 35° 45' East 120 feet; thence South 54° 15' West 14.25 feet to the point of beginning, and being in Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon.

LEGAL NOTICES

and that the plaintiffs, H. A. HAGEN and HELEN HAGEN, his wife, are the owners in fee simple of Parcel 1; and that the plaintiff, L. A. BACHELDER, is the owner in fee simple of Parcel 2 as set out in the Amended Complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the respective plaintiffs; and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem just and equitable.

This Amended Summons is published pursuant to an order made by HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge for the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 7th day of August, 1945, which order directs that this Amended Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 6th day of September, 1945.

Date of first publication August 9th, 1945. Date of last publication September 6th, 1945.

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs. Residence and post office address: First Nat'l Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. 52-51-4

A man should never be ashamed to own he has been in the wrong, which is but saying in other words that he is wiser today than he was yesterday.—Pope.

Chemistry Professor: "What is the outstanding contribution chemistry has made to the world." Student: "Blondes." — Greensboro, N. C., Textorian.

Eagles Lodge Meets

EVERY WEDNESDAY
8:00 P. M. o'clock
EAGLES HALL
50-tfc

Attention
Cottage Grove
Veterans

ON SUNDAY, AUGUST 26, OWNER WILL BE ON PREMISES FROM 10 TO 5 P. M. TO OFFER FOR SALE FIVE RECENTLY COMPLETED MODERN HOMES TO VETERANS OF WORLD WAR II THAT MEET QUALIFICATIONS FOR G. I. LOAN. FOR THOSE VETERANS WHO QUALIFY, NO DOWN PAYMENT WILL BE REQUIRED. PURCHASE PRICE ABOUT \$28.23 PER MONTH, INCLUDING INTEREST AT 4½%, PLUS TAXES AND INSURANCE.

Open Sunday, August 26

10:00 A. M. TO 5:00 P. M.

10th & TAYLOR STREETS, COTTAGE GROVE, ORE