

LEGAL NOTICES

AMENDED SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the state of Oregon for Lane county.
LOIS TILTON, Plaintiff,
vs.
GENE TILTON, Defendant.

TO: GENE TILTON, Defendant. IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby required to appear and answer the Amended Complaint of the above named plaintiff in the above entitled suit now on file with the Clerk of the above entitled Court within four weeks of the date of the first publication of this Amended Summons, to-wit: on or before July 26th, 1945; and you are hereby notified that if you fail to appear and answer said Amended Complaint as hereby required, for want thereof the plaintiff will apply to the Court for the relief prayed for in her Amended Complaint, to-wit: for a decree of this Court dissolving the marriage contract of the plaintiff and defendant, and for a further decree awarding to the plaintiff the care, custody and control of EUGENE MILLS TILTON, a son; EDWARD LEE TILTON, a son; LESTER FRANK TILTON, a son; and DENNIS DEAN TILTON, a son, and for such other and further relief as to the Court may seem just and equitable. This Amended Summons is published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation published at Cottage Grove in Lane County, Oregon, by order of the HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Judge of the above entitled Court, made herein on the 26th day of June, 1945. The date of the first publication of this Amended Summons is the 28th day of June, 1945. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiff. Residence and Post Office Address: Cottage Grove, Oregon. 46-51-50

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

I have been appointed as Administratrix of the Estate of CLAYTON M. BOYKIN, Deceased, by the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, by an order dated June 26th, 1945. All persons having claims against said Estate are requested to present the same, with proper vouchers, to the undersigned at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date hereof. Dated and first published June 28th, 1945. EUGENE T. GREGG, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 46-51-50

NOTICE OF PRIVATE SALE

Estate No. 4201

In the County Court of the State of Oregon, for the County of Clatsop.

IN THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF

CRYSTAL LAINE, DECEASED.

NOTICE is hereby given that under and by virtue of an order of the above-entitled Court made on the 18th day of June, 1945, the undersigned, will, from and after the 3rd day of August, 1945, proceed to sell the following described real estate belonging to said estate, situate in Lane County, Oregon, to-wit:

The undivided one-fifth interest of the estate of Crystal Laine, deceased, in and to:

Beginning at a point 29.57 chains north and 520 feet east from the southerly southwest corner of Donation Land Claim No. 55, in Township 20, South Range 3 West of Willamette Meridian, thence run east 404.92 feet to the westerly right of way line of a County Road, thence north 28° 30' east said right of way line 431.0 feet to the northerly line of Lot 1, in the Division of the Robert Cochran Estate in Cottage Grove as platted and recorded in Volume 2, Page 41, Lane County, Oregon, Plat Records in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, thence north 61° 30' west 718.04 feet to the easterly right of way line of the Pacific Highway, thence south 54° 20' west along said right of way line 201.74 feet, thence south 47° 30' east 269.6 feet, thence south 432.9 feet to the point of beginning; in Lane County, Oregon;

a one-fifth interest of which property belongs to the Estate of Crystal Laine, who is also named as Crystal Scarbrough Laine, at private sale, in the City of Astoria, Clatsop County, State of Oregon, at the law office of Frank Spittle, Attorney, 410 Spexarth Building, Astoria, Oregon.

Terms of sale will be cash on delivery of the deed or such other terms as the administrator may deem best.

Dated and first publication this 5th day of July, 1945.

THE UNITED STATES NATIONAL BANK OF PORTLAND (OREGON), Administrator of the estate of said deceased. 47-51-51

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific War Time, August 7, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 6 W., Secs. 29 and 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the E½SE¼ of Sec. 29, and the N¼NW¼ and SE¼NW¼ of Sec. 33, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3950 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet Red Cedar, 15 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$13,145.00, will be considered. T. 17 S., R. 2 E., Sec. 11, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NE¼SW¼, and portion of the NW¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 275 M. feet Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M., or a total purchase price of \$1,375.00, will be considered. Only trees stamped USOC are included in the sale. T. 17 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N¼NE¼, NE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 270 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock, 5 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$695.00 will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 4 (NW¼NW¼), Lot 5 (SW¼NW¼), and Lot 11 (NE¼SW¼), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1510 M. feet Douglas Fir, 130 M. feet Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock, 45 M. feet Incense Cedar, 5 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$4.40 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, Hemlock, and White Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$6,991.50, will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N¼NE¼, SE¼NE¼, N¼NW¼, SW¼NW¼, and NE¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4000 M. feet Douglas Fir, 140 M. feet Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$17,560.00, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 6 (NE¼NW¼), Lot 7 (NW¼NW¼), SW¼NW¼, and SE¼NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4545 M. feet Douglas Fir, 55 M. feet Hemlock, 70 M. feet Incense Cedar, 195 M. feet Red Cedar, 120 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$3.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar and Red Cedar, \$75 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$15,756.00, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 3 (NE¼NW¼), Lot 4 (NW¼NW¼), S¼NW¼, and SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 7105 M. feet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 135 M. feet Red Cedar, 75 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.10 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, Red Cedar, and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$22,335.50, will be considered. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 23rd day of July, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 50-21-51

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific War Time, August 14, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 17 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S¼NW¼ and N¼SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4210 M. feet Douglas Fir, 320 M. feet Red Cedar, 35 M. feet Hemlock, 95 M. feet Incense Cedar, 90 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$3.90 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar and Hemlock, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar and White Fir, \$75 ea. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$17,662.75, will be considered. All timber cut from the above described area must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 23rd day of July, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 50-21-51

NOTICE OF HEARING OF FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Administratrix of the Estate of WALTER ROBINSON, Deceased, has filed her account for the final settlement of said Estate in the Circuit Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 28th day of August, 1945, at the Circuit Court Room of said Court, in the County Court-house, Eugene, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon, has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for the hearing of objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. BEULAH E. ROBINSON, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 50-51-2

SUMMONS

Case No.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR LANE COUNTY, PAUL RADTKE and ELIZABETH ANN RADTKE, his wife Plaintiffs,

vs.
CATHERINE LENTZ and JOHN DOE LENTZ, her husband; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein, Defendants.

TO: CATHERINE LENTZ and JOHN DOE LENTZ her husband; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein, Defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the Order of Publication, to-wit: on or before the 23rd day of August, 1945; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatever in or to the land and premises hereinafter described, to-wit: Lots Nine (9) and Ten (10),

LEGAL NOTICES

Block Four (4) of the Second Addition to Georgetown, as platted and recorded at page 62 of volume 2, Lane County, Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of the aforesaid described real property as set out in the Complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs; and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem just and equitable.

This Summons is published pursuant to an order made by the HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge of the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 24th day of July, 1945, which order directs that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation, printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 23rd day of August, 1945.

Date of first publication July 26th, 1945. Date of last publication August 23rd, 1945. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs. Residence and Post Office address, Cottage Grove, Oregon. 50-51-2

WANT-ADS

PUBLIC AUCTION

SUNDAY, JULY 29, 1:30 P. M.

Cottage Grove

1 mile out South 6th Street

FURNITURE

Beds, chairs, antique table, chest of drawers, battery cabinet radio, other articles.

FARM MACHINERY

2 Fordson tractors, harrows, plows, hand cultivator, hoes, garden hose, brooders, incubators, harness, etc.

LIVE STOCK

1 six year old Shetland pony, well broke, a real little trick horse; about 12 head good class saddle horses.

Bring in what you have to sell. All cattle brought in must be tested before sale.

Ice cream and cold drinks

BOY MASON, AUCTIONEER 50-11c

WANTED: Lady for part time office work. Apply Mountain States Power Co. 50-11c

FOR SALE: Two bed room modern home, has lots of fruit trees and nice garden ready for use. Sell furnished or unfurnished. Chicken house and chickens. Some fine pre-war stoves, complete beds, Grunow radio, sewing machine, davenport and chair, some canned fruit and jars. Most anything a family would want. Possession as quickly as possible. 1543 Ash Ave. 50-21p-50

LOST: Very small black female dog, with brown feet, about 2 miles from Cottage Grove on Division rte. Child's pet. Reward. Call Edward's store, 4215, Culp Creek, or write Paul Arthur, Culp Creek. 50-31c-52

ARC WELDING and machinery repairing. Saginaw-Welding and Repair Shop. 47-41p-50

Do you want help from your aches and pains? Then see Dr. Simkins, chiropractor, over Peterson's store. Phone 5. 47-11c

SHEEP for sale or let on shares. John G. Murry. Phone 39F16. 46-61-21p-51

FOR SALE-13 acres, 1 1/2 miles west of town, between Gowdyville and Lorane highways; electricity; electric water system, deep well. House, 5 rooms downstairs; 2 unfinished rooms upstairs, built-in practically new, chix house, 500 hen capacity; barn, 3 cow capacity. Some young fruit trees; year round stream for irrigation. Cream, mail and school bus routes. Read Hemeway. Ph. 2-F-23. Cottage Grove. 48-31p-50

SPENCER Corsetiere, Mrs. Enid Burch will be in Cottage Grove on July 27th. For information or appointment write Box 66 % Sentinel. 49-21p-50

Rubber Stamps Phone 15 9 The Sentinel

FOR SALE: Red Fryers, live weight, at old Glass place east of high school. Peter Fetter. 48-31p-50

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal, mutton and chickens. Bartels Market, Phone 55. 37-11c

MEN WANTED

Operating Mill Wright, Log Deck Man, Log Slip Man, Scaler and Pondsaw Man, Oiler. Blue Mountain Lumber Co., located 4 miles east of Cottage Grove. Transportation furnished from Cottage Grove. 45-11c

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-11c

MACK'S FIXIT SHOP

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-11c

WE MAKE GASOLINE and fuel storage tanks. O. K. Welding and Forge Shop. 21-11c

FOR SALE: Vilmar Court Apts. One 4-room, 5-b-room apts. all furnished and rented. Will make some one good deal on this. Will pay for self in few years. Phone 246 or see me at Eagle Cigar store after 6:00 evenings. C. E. Neet. 40-11c

OFFICE DESKS HOME DESKS

Yes, you'll find both at Callahan's Furniture Store, Eugene. One is specially priced \$70, ladies 9-drawer desk \$59.75. All hardwood at Callahan's. 49-21c-50

FOR SALE-13 acres, 1 1/2 miles west of town, between Gowdyville and Lorane highways; electricity; electric water system, deep well. House, 5 rooms downstairs; 2 unfinished rooms upstairs, built-in practically new, chix house, 500 hen capacity; barn, 3 cow capacity. Some young fruit trees; year round stream for irrigation. Cream, mail and school bus routes. Read Hemeway. Ph. 2-F-23. Cottage Grove. 48-31p-50

SPENCER Corsetiere, Mrs. Enid Burch will be in Cottage Grove on July 27th. For information or appointment write Box 66 % Sentinel. 49-21p-50

Rubber Stamps Phone 15 9 The Sentinel

FOR SALE: Red Fryers, live weight, at old Glass place east of high school. Peter Fetter. 48-31p-50

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal, mutton and chickens. Bartels Market, Phone 55. 37-11c

MEN WANTED

Operating Mill Wright, Log Deck Man, Log Slip Man, Scaler and Pondsaw Man, Oiler. Blue Mountain Lumber Co., located 4 miles east of Cottage Grove. Transportation furnished from Cottage Grove. 45-11c

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-11c

MACK'S FIXIT SHOP

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-11c

WE MAKE GASOLINE and fuel storage tanks. O. K. Welding and Forge Shop. 21-11c

FOR SALE: Vilmar Court Apts. One 4-room, 5-b-room apts. all furnished and rented. Will make some one good deal on this. Will pay for self in few years. Phone 246 or see me at Eagle Cigar store after 6:00 evenings. C. E. Neet. 40-11c

OFFICE DESKS HOME DESKS

Yes, you'll find both at Callahan's Furniture Store, Eugene. One is specially priced \$70, ladies 9-drawer desk \$59.75. All hardwood at Callahan's. 49-21c-50

FOR SALE-13 acres, 1 1/2 miles west of town, between Gowdyville and Lorane highways; electricity; electric water system, deep well. House, 5 rooms downstairs; 2 unfinished rooms upstairs, built-in practically new, chix house, 500 hen capacity; barn, 3 cow capacity. Some young fruit trees; year round stream for irrigation. Cream, mail and school bus routes. Read Hemeway. Ph. 2-F-23. Cottage Grove. 48-31p-50

SPENCER Corsetiere, Mrs. Enid Burch will be in Cottage Grove on July 27th. For information or appointment write Box 66 % Sentinel. 49-21p-50

Rubber Stamps Phone 15 9 The Sentinel

FOR SALE: Red Fryers, live weight, at old Glass place east of high school. Peter Fetter. 48-31p-50

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal, mutton and chickens. Bartels Market, Phone 55. 37-11c

MEN WANTED

Operating Mill Wright, Log Deck Man, Log Slip Man, Scaler and Pondsaw Man, Oiler. Blue Mountain Lumber Co., located 4 miles east of Cottage Grove. Transportation furnished from Cottage Grove. 45-11c

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-11c

MACK'S FIXIT SHOP

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-11c

TIMBER WANTED

WANTED: Fir and cedar poles and piling, all sizes. Quote prices f.o.b. shipping point, earliest shipment. Niedermeyer-Martin Co., Spalding Bldg., Portland, Zone 4, Ore. 50-71c-4

FOR SALE: Pre-war splash back kitchen sink. 39 North M street. 50-11p

FOR SALE: Key shop with 4 wheel lawn mower grinder, key machine, key blanks, equipped for work. M. E. Prine, Saginaw, Ore. 50-21p-51

FOR SALE: Fir timber, logging and piling. E. C. Orwick, Saginaw, Ore. 50-21p-51

FOR SALE: Boysen and Youngberries, J. P. Jones, B B Rte., 1 1/2 miles above London Store. 50-11p

WANTED: For mill: Planer feeders, car loaders and green chain men. For woods: Buckers and fallers. Family houses available or bus service each day. Row River Lumber Co., Phone 4335 39-11c

FOR RENT: Floor sanders and waxers. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 21-11cxxx

WATER WELL DRILLING See your water well driller before you buy or install your pump. Pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23, J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Ore. 10-11c-xxx

FOR SALE: Partly furnished nice large 10 room house, close in, new roof and paint, fruit and nuts. Ideal for apartments, corner lot 100x100. Ideal neighborhood. Selling on account of sickness. 307 Quincy avenue. 50-21p-51

FOR SALE: About 40 tons baled oat and vetch hay, below ceiling price. 2 miles east of Creswell. Phone 4F5. A. W. Bartel. 49-21c-50

WANTED: Man or woman for Western Union clerical work. \$22.23 per week. Call S. P. station. 49-21p-50

Rickard Accounting Service

Auditing - Tax Service

Cottage Grove Hotel

Phone 60

HELP WANTED: Man to put on roofing. Mary Lee, Lorane route, Gowdyville Road. 50-21p-51

ESTRATED FROM MY PLACE: 3 weeks ago, spotted Guernsey cow, halter and rope. Mrs. Hollis Mathew, Box 381, city. 48-21p-49

New stock mimeograph supplies at Sentinel office. 44-11c-21

TELEPHONE 301, THEO CANNAS, Watchmaker, 14 So. 6th street. 44-11c

ELECTRICAL WIRING

Brisbane Electric

Phone 73 1049 East Main

WANTED: In Cottage Grove, modern three bed room house, corner lot preferred or small acreage close in. Will pay cash. Write and let me know what you have. E. F. Simpson, Sutherlin, Ore., 1 mile west of Sutherlin. 49-21p-50

FOR SALE OR RENT: 80 acres, 3 miles east of Curtin. Spring water in house. Irrigation from spring or creek. Garden, fruit. Furnished or unfurnished. R. P. Jones, Curtin, Ore. 49-21p-50

FOR SALE-13 acres, 1 1/2 miles west of town, between Gowdyville and Lorane highways; electricity; electric water system, deep well. House, 5 rooms downstairs; 2 unfinished rooms upstairs, built-in practically new, chix house, 500 hen capacity; barn, 3 cow capacity. Some young fruit trees; year round stream for irrigation. Cream, mail and school bus routes. Read Hemeway. Ph. 2-F-23. Cottage Grove. 48-31p-50

SPENCER Corsetiere, Mrs. Enid Burch will be in Cottage Grove on July 27th. For information or appointment write Box 66 % Sentinel. 49-21p-50

Rubber Stamps Phone 15 9 The Sentinel

FOR SALE: Red Fryers, live weight, at old Glass place east of high school. Peter Fetter. 48-31p-50

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal, mutton and chickens. Bartels Market, Phone 55. 37-11c

MEN WANTED

Operating Mill Wright, Log Deck Man, Log Slip Man, Scaler and Pondsaw Man, Oiler. Blue Mountain Lumber Co., located 4 miles east of Cottage Grove. Transportation furnished from Cottage Grove. 45-11c

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-11c

MACK'S FIXIT SHOP

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-11c

WE MAKE GASOLINE and fuel storage tanks. O. K. Welding and Forge Shop. 21-11c

FOR SALE: Vilmar Court Apts. One 4-room, 5-b-room apts. all furnished and rented. Will make some one good deal on this. Will pay for self in few years. Phone 246 or see me at Eagle Cigar store after 6:00 evenings. C. E. Neet. 40-11c

OFFICE DESKS HOME DESKS

Yes, you'll find both at Callahan's Furniture Store, Eugene. One is specially priced \$70, ladies 9-drawer desk \$59.75. All hardwood at Callahan's. 49-21c-50

FOR SALE-13 acres, 1 1/2 miles west of town, between Gowdyville and Lorane highways; electricity; electric water system, deep well. House, 5 rooms downstairs; 2 unfinished rooms upstairs, built-in practically new, chix house, 500 hen capacity; barn, 3 cow capacity. Some young fruit trees; year round stream for irrigation. Cream, mail and school bus routes. Read Hemeway. Ph. 2-F-23. Cottage Grove. 48-31p-50

SPENCER Corsetiere, Mrs. Enid Burch will be in Cottage Grove on July 27th. For information or appointment write Box 66 % Sentinel. 49-21p-50

Rubber Stamps Phone 15 9 The Sentinel

FOR SALE: Red Fryers, live weight, at old Glass place east of high school. Peter Fetter. 48-31p-50

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal, mutton and chickens. Bartels Market, Phone 55. 37-11c

MEN WANTED

Operating Mill Wright, Log Deck Man, Log Slip Man, Scaler and Pondsaw Man, Oiler. Blue Mountain Lumber Co., located 4 miles east of Cottage Grove. Transportation furnished from Cottage Grove. 45-11c