

LEGAL NOTICES

AMENDED SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the state of Oregon for Lane County.
LOIS TILTON, Plaintiff,

vs.
GENE TILTON, Defendant.

TO: GENE TILTON, Defendant. IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby required to appear and answer the Amended Complaint of the above named plaintiff in the above entitled suit now on file with the Clerk of the above entitled Court within four weeks of the date of the first publication of this Amended Summons, to-wit: on or before July 26th, 1945; and you are hereby notified that if you fail to appear and answer said Amended Complaint as hereby required, for want thereof the plaintiff will apply to the Court for the relief prayed for in her Amended Complaint, to-wit: for a decree of this Court dissolving the marriage contract of the plaintiff and defendant, and for a further decree awarding to the plaintiff the care, custody and control of EUGENE MILLS TILTON, a son; EDWARD LEE TILTON, a son; LESTER FRANK TILTON, a son; and DENNIS DEAN TILTON, a son, and for such other and further relief as to the Court may seem just and equitable. This Amended Summons is published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation published at Cottage Grove in Lane County, Oregon, by order of the HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Judge of the above entitled Court, made herein on the 26th day of June, 1945. The date of the first publication of this Amended Summons is the 28th day of June, 1945. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiff, Residence and Post Office Address: Cottage Grove, Oregon. 46-51-50

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

Notice is hereby given that Arch D. Wilson, Administrator of the Estate of Anna E. Wilson, deceased, has filed his Final Account in the Circuit Court of Lane County, and said Court has fixed the 24th day of July, 1945, at 11:00 A.M. in the Court Room of said Court in the Court House, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon. First Publication, June 21, 1945. Arch D. Wilson, Administrator. Alta King, Attorney. 46-51-49.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

I have been appointed as Administrator of the Estate of CLAYTON M. BOYKIN, deceased, by the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, by an order dated June 26th, 1945. All persons having claims against said Estate are requested to present the same, with proper vouchers, to the undersigned at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date hereof. Dated, and first published June 28th, 1945. PEGGY T. GREGG, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 46-51-50

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that CHARLES GETTYS has been appointed Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ETTA SMITH GETTYS, deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon. All persons having claims against said Estate are requested to present them, with the proper vouchers, within six months from the 28th day of June, 1945, to the said Executor at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. CHARLES GETTYS, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 46-51-50

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned has been appointed Administrator of the Estate of AUSTIN ALFRED GREER, deceased, by the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, by an order dated June 26, 1945. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby notified to present the same, duly verified, to the undersigned at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of the first publication of this Notice. Dated and first published June 28, 1945. C. F. MAX, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 46-51-50

NOTICE OF PRIVATE SALE

Estate No. 4201
In the County Court of the State of Oregon, for the County of Clatsop.
IN THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE OF
CRYSTAL LAINE, DECEASED.
NOTICE is hereby given that under and by virtue of an order of the above-entitled Court made on the 18th day of June, 1945, the undersigned, will, from and after the 3rd day of August, 1945, proceed to sell the following described real estate belonging to said

LEGAL NOTICES

estate, situate in Lane County, Oregon, to-wit:

The undivided one-fifth interest of the estate of Crystal Laine, deceased, in and to:

Beginning at a point 29.57 chains north and 520 feet east from the southerly southwest corner of Donation Land Claim No. 55, in Township 20, South Range 3 West of Willamette Meridian, thence run east 404.92 feet to the westerly right of way line of a County Road, thence north 28° 30' east along said right of way line 431.0 feet to the northerly line of Lot 1, in the Division of the Robert Cochran Estate in Cottage Grove as platted and recorded in Volume 2, Page 41, Lane County, Oregon, Plat Records in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, thence north 61° 30' west 718.04 feet to the easterly right of way line of the Pacific Highway, thence south 54° 20' west along said right of way line 201.74 feet, thence south 47° 30' east 269.6 feet, thence south 432.9 feet to the point of beginning; in Lane County, Oregon;

a one-fifth interest of which property belongs to the Estate of Crystal Laine, who is also named as Crystal Scarborough Laine, at private sale, in the City of Astoria, Clatsop County, State of Oregon, at the law office of Frank Spittle, Attorney, 410 Spexarth Building, Astoria, Oregon.

Terms of sale will be cash on delivery of the deed or such other terms as the administrator may deem best.

Dated and first publication this 5th day of July, 1945.

THE UNITED STATES NATIONAL BANK OF PORTLAND (OREGON), Administrator of the estate of said deceased. 47-51-51

NOTICE OF SALE ON EXECUTION

BY VIRTUE of an Execution issued out of and under the seal of the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, upon a judgment rendered and docketed in the said Court on the 3rd day of July, 1945, in a suit wherein ERNEST H. GILDERSLLEEVE is the Plaintiff, and LILA E. GILDERSLLEEVE is the Defendant, in favor of said Plaintiff and against said Defendant, for the sum of \$150.00 and \$400.00, with interest thereon at the rate of 6% per annum from the 3rd day of July, 1945, and costs of \$42.50, which Execution was directed and delivered to me, as Sheriff in and for said County of Lane, State of Oregon, I have levied upon all right, title and interest of the said Defendant, LILA E. GILDERSLLEEVE, in and to the following described real estate, to-wit:

Undivided one-half interest in and to the following:
Beginning at a point 1110 feet east and 1630 feet south of the ¼ corner between sections 31 and 32 T. 21 S. R. one West of W.M., run thence south 62 degrees and 15 minutes west 450 feet to the center of the channel of Row River, thence up the channel of said river and in a southeasterly direction 220 feet, thence north 62 degrees and 15 minutes east 600 feet, thence north 29 degrees west 210 feet, thence south 62 degrees and 15 minutes west 210 feet to the point of beginning, containing 3 acres more or less, excepting therefrom the county road, all in the southwest quarter of section 32, in T. 21 S. R. one West of Willamette Meridian, in Lane County, Oregon.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That I, the undersigned, as Sheriff Pro Tem, will sell the above described real property to the highest bidder for cash at public auction at the Southwest Front Door of the County Court House, in the City of Eugene, County of Lane, State of Oregon, on the 17th day of August, 1945, at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. of that day, to satisfy the said Execution together with interest and costs thereon. Dated July 19, 1945. O. E. CROWE, Sheriff Pro Tem, Lane County, Oregon. 49-51-1

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE
Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A.M., Pacific War Time, August 7, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 6 W., Secs.

LEGAL NOTICES

29 and 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the E½SE¼ of Sec. 29, and the N½NW¼ and SE¼NW¼ of Sec. 33, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3950 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet Red Cedar, 15 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$13,145.00, will be considered. T. 17 S., R. 2 E., Sec. 11, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NE¼SW¼, and portion of the NW¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 275 M. feet Douglas Fir, no bid for less than \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M., or a total purchase price of \$1,375.00, will be considered. Only trees stamped USOC are included in the sale. T. 17 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N½NE¼, NE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 270 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock, 5 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$695.00 will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 4 (NW¼NW¼), Lot 5 (SW¼NW¼), and Lot 11 (NE¼SW¼), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1510 M. feet Douglas Fir, 130 M. feet Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock, 45 M. feet Incense Cedar, 5 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$4.40 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, Hemlock, and White Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$6,991.50, will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N½NE¼, SE¼NE¼, N½NW¼, SW¼NW¼, and NE¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4000 M. feet Douglas Fir, 140 M. feet Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$17,560.00, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 6 (NE¼NW¼), Lot 7 (NW¼NW¼), SW¼NW¼, and SE¼NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4545 M. feet Douglas Fir, 55 M. feet Hemlock, 70 M. feet Incense Cedar, 195 M. feet Red Cedar, 120 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$3.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar and Red Cedar, \$7.50 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$15,756.00, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 3 (NE¼NW¼), Lot 4 (NW¼NW¼), S½NW¼, and SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 7105 M. feet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 135 M. feet Red Cedar, 75 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.10 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, Red Cedar, and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$22,535.50, will be considered. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 26, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 16th day of July, 1945. W. H. HORNING, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 49-21-50

Cleaning Basket

An easily carried cleansing-basket, equipped with such items as soap, brushes, short-handled brushes, sponge, clean and lintless dust cloths, and chamois, will save the homemaker time as she goes from one room to another in housecleaning.

FERTILIZER

Large shipment of lawn and garden fertilizer now ready. Get yours.

BEIDLER FEED and SEED STORE.

26-TFC

WANT-ADS

ARC WELDING and machinery repairing. Saginaw Welding and Repair Shop. 47-4tp-50

TO EXCHANGE: Food locker in Eugene for one in Cottage Grove. Phone 111R. 47-3tp-49

Do you want help from your aches and pains? Then see Dr. Simkins, chiropractor, over Petersen's store. Phone 5. 47-tfc

SHEEP for sale or let on shares. John G. Murry. Phone 39F16. 46-6t-2tp-51

LOCKER BOXES

FOR RENT

At Diston Post Office. Apply to J. S. Carr. 45-6tp-50

WANTED: 2 or 3 bedroom furnished house. Adults only. Address R. E. Scheider, P. O. Box 471. 47-3tp-49

WE MAKE GASOLINE and fuel storage tanks. O. K. Welding and Forge Shop. 21-tfcxx

FOR SALE: Vilmar Court Apts. One 4-room, 5, 8-room apts, all furnished and rented. Will make some one good deal on this. Will pay for self in few years. Phone 246 or see me at Eagle Cigar store after 6:00 evenings. C. E. Neet. 40-tfcxx

MACK'S FIXIT SHOP

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. Phone 302. 37-tfc

MEN WANTED

Operating Mill Wright, Log Deck Man, Log Slip Man, Scaler and Pondsaw Man, Oiler. Blue Mountain Lumber Co., located 4 miles east of Cottage Grove. Transportation furnished from Cottage Grove. 45-tfcxx

WANTED: For mill: Planer feeders, car loaders and green chain men. For woods: Buckers and fallers. Family houses available or bus service each day. Row River Lumber Co., Phone 4375. 39-tfc

FOR RENT: Floor sanders and waxers. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 21-tfcxx

WATER WELL DRILLING—See your water well driller before you buy or install your pump. Pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23, J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Ore. 10-tfc-xxx

FOR SALE: Partly furnished nice large 10 room house, close in, new roof and paint, fruit and nuts. Ideal for apartments, corner lot 100x100. Ideal neighborhood. Selling on account of sickness. 307 Quincy avenue. 48-2tp-49

Charter No. 5642

REPORT OF CONDITION OF THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF COTTAGE GROVE, IN THE STATE OF OREGON, AT THE CLOSE OF BUSINESS ON JUNE 30, 1945

(Published in response to call made by Comptroller of the Currency, under Section 5211, U. S. Revised Statutes.)

ASSETS	
Loans and discounts (including \$48.77 overdrafts)	84,230.93
United States Government obligations, direct and guaranteed	2,488,950.00
Obligations of States and political subdivisions	1,461,226.76
Corporate stocks (including 3,000.00 stock of Federal Reserve bank	3,000.00
Cash, balances with other banks, including reserve balance, and cash items in process of collection	750,837.90
Bank premises owned \$11,350.00, furniture and fixtures \$3,185.55	14,535.55
Other assets	25,693.46
TOTAL ASSETS	4,828,474.60

LIABILITIES	
Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations	3,020,461.43
Time deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations	940,523.70
Deposits of United States Government	395,457.94
Deposits of States and political subdivisions	180,118.61
Other deposits (certified and cashier's checks, etc.)	2,016.01
TOTAL DEPOSITS	\$4,538,577.69
Other liabilities	14,845.93
TOTAL LIABILITIES	4,553,423.62

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS	
Capital Stock: Common stock, total par	50,000.00
Surplus	50,000.00
Undivided profits	175,050.98
TOTAL CAPITAL ACCOUNTS	275,050.98
TOTAL LIABILITIES AND CAPITAL ACCOUNTS	4,828,474.60

MEMORANDA

Pledged assets (book value):
United States Government obligations, direct and guaranteed, pledged to secure deposits and other liabilities

Other assets pledged to secure deposits and other liabilities

TOTAL

Secured liabilities:
Deposits secured by pledged assets pursuant to requirements of law

TOTAL

State of Oregon, County of Lane, ss:
I, H. E. EAKIN, Vice President and cashier of the above-named bank, do solemnly swear that the above statement is true to the best of my knowledge and belief.

H. E. EAKIN, Vice President and Cashier.
CORRECT—Attest:
C. B. STEPHENSON
J. H. MACKIE
V. O. STEENROD
Directors.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 3rd day of July, 1945.
MARVEL L. ECCLES,
Notary Public.
My Commission Expires June 1, 1948.

FOR SALE: Modern home, 5 rms and bath, lots of builtins. Screened in back porch with stationary tubs. Extra lot. Terms. Immediate possession, 647 North 9th street. Inquire 141 M. street. 49-1tp

FOR SALE: About 40 tons baled oat and vetch hay, below ceiling price. 2 miles east of Creswell. Phone 4F5. A. W. Bartel. 49-2tc-50

FOR SALE: 1932 4 door Plymouth sedan, price \$100. E. F. Adams, Diston route, 2½ miles east of town. 49-1tp

WANTED: Man or woman for Western Union clerical work, \$22.23 per week. Call S. P. station. 49-2tp-50

FOR SALE: 45 good ewes, \$6.50 per head. H. M. Bell, 2½ miles east on Row River. Phone 9F2. 49-1tp

PUPPIES: Cocker-Shepherd cross. Free, to those who will give them a good home. 1542 Ash Ave. 49-1tc

ROTARY PUMP FOR SALE. 1½ inch outlet. \$17.50. Inquire at Sentinel office. 49-2tp

FOR SALE: Feed barrels. Doleman's bakery. 49-1tc

WOMAN WANTED: Doleman's Bakery. 49-1tc

FOR SALE: 1 Wade drag saw with 2 blades; 1 medium size outboard motor. Les Brisbane, 1049 E. Main St. 49-1tc

Rickard Accounting Service

Auditing — Tax Service

Cottage Grove Hotel

Phone 60

FOR SALE: Modern 2 bedroom home, fruit trees. Close in. 1543 Ash. 48-2tp-49

FOR SALE: 1 child's crib with new wool mattress, \$10.00. Revolving strawberry barrel of oak and well made, \$4.00. One folding camp bed and mattress, \$10.00. Mrs. N. J. Nelson, 131 South 7th St. 48-2tc-49

HELP WANTED: Man to put on roofing. Mary Lee, Lorane route, Gowdville Road. 48-2tp-49

ESTRAYED FROM MY PLACE: 3 weeks ago, spotted Guernsey cow, halter and rope. Mrs. Hollis Mathew, Box 381, city. 48-2tp-49

New stock mimeograph supplies at Sentinel office. 44-tfc-21

TELEPHONE 301, THEO KANGAS, Watchmaker, 14 So. 6th street. 44-tfcxx

ELECTRICAL WIRING

Brisbane Electric

Phone 73 1049 East Main

Don't Fail to See This—

100x100 lot with 5 room house with elec., chicken house and store room. 8 fruit trees and 8 varieties of berries. 50 chix and wood and garden go with the place if taken at once. Priced to sell at \$2100.00 cash.

6 room house with full basement and furnace, fireplace, three bedrooms, lots of builtins. Nice location. \$5200.00.

Small house, one mile from city. City water and elec. Nice kitchen. \$2000.00. Terms.

Bean or bulb land—23 acres—three miles from city. All fenced. Water rights. \$5200.

MERL KING

with

RODMANS & HILTON

701 Main st:

Phone 216

FOR SALE: One 1939 model General Electric table radio with transformer. Inquire 927 South 6th St., city. 49-1tc

FOR SALE: Boysen and Youngberries, J. P. Jones, B B Rte., 1½ miles above London Store. 49-1tp

WANTED: Man to cut wood on shares, power saw. House furnished. W. B. Irvin, Drain Oregon. 49-1tp

SPENCER Corsetiere, Mrs. Enid Burch will be in Cottage Grove on July 27th. For information or appointment write Box 66 % Sentinel. 49-2tp-50

125 ACRE FARM fully equipped for sale or lease. Good sale, plenty water. Write P. O. Box 221, Drain, Ore. 49-1tp

WANTED: In Cottage Grove, modern three bed room house, corner lot preferred or small acreage close in. Will pay cash. Write and let me know what you have. E. F. Simpson, Sutherlin, Ore., 1 mile west of Sutherlin. 49-2tp-50

FOR SALE—1 acre, two room cabin, garage, on good gravel road. Mail and school bus. \$600.00. Elect. soon. Write P. O. Box 478. 49-1tp

FOR SALE: 6 foot McCormick grain binder. A. Woolcott, phone 22F5. 49-3tp-51

FOR SALE: Red Fryers, live weight, at old Glass place east of high school. Peter Fetter. 48-3tp-50

EASTER LILY BULBS and bulb-lets for sale by one of the oldest and largest growers in Oregon. Inquire now for November delivery. J. D. Bergen, Box 656, Coos Bay, Ore. 48-4tc-51

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal, mutton and chickens. Bartels Market. Phone 55. 37-tfcxx

ANNOUNCING
Opening of
Oak Grove Acres

For sale, 2 acre home sites in beautiful oak setting only 1½ miles from city limits on paved highway. Some used lumber available. Also 1 modern 7-room house with bath, on 2 acres on paved highway. Low prices and terms can be arranged. For information call owner, 2F11. 49-1tp

FOR SALE OR RENT: 80 acres, 3 miles east of Curtin. Spring water in house, irrigation from spring or creek. Garden, fruit. Furnished or unfurnished. R. P. Jones, Curtin, Ore. 49-2tp-50

FOR SALE: Small Cletrac. F. Roydon, 5 miles west of Creswell, Route 1, Box 449. 49-1tp

OFFICE DESKS
HOME DESKS
Yes, you'll find both at Callahan's Furniture Store, Eugene. One is specially priced \$70, ladies 9-drawer desk \$59.75. All hardwood at Callahan's. 49-2tc-50

FOR SALE—13 acres, 1½ miles west of town, between Gowdville and Lorane highways; electricity; electric water system, deep well. House, 5 rooms downstairs, 2 unfinished rooms upstairs, built-ins practically new, chix house, 500 hen capacity; barn, 3 cow capacity. Some young fruit trees; year round stream for irrigation. Cream, mail and school bus routes. Read Hemenway, Ph. 2-F-23. Cottage Grove. 48-3tp-50

FOR SALE: Guernsey cow, fresh two months; 1 bay saddle horse, 7 years old; 1 two year old pinto stallion. Call 1425 Birch avenue after 5 evenings or Sundays. 49-1tp

FOR SALE: 1 Shorthorn cow, 8 years old; two sucking calves, 4 months old; 2 pair calves 4 months old; black Jersey bull 2 years old. Geo. Reichel, Blackbutte route, 5 miles. 48-2tp-49

FOR SALE: Four good milk cows, 1 mile above Culp Creek. William Earnshaw. 48-3tp-50

MILL WORKERS WANTED—24 Sawyer, ratchet setter, pond saw man, off bearer, lumber piler. \$1.00 per hour low. Emery Harris Lumber Co., three miles east on Mosby Creek road. 48-4tc-51

FOR SALE OR LEASE—WOOD BUSINESS

With or without truck.

See Gray at 616 South 7th after 5 p. m. 47-tfc

Buy and Save Rent

Two bed room house, woodshed, barn, chicken house and fruit trees. Approximately ¾ acre.

New two bed-room home, living room 15x18