

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF HEARING OF FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Executor and Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of SAMUEL K. ADAMS, Deceased, have filed their account for the final settlement of said Estate in the County Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 19th day of June 1945, at the County Court Room of said Court in the County Court House in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing of objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. WORTH HARVEY, Executor. NORMA G. MILLER, Executrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate.

40-51-44.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A.M., Pacific War Time, June 5, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE 1/4 SW 1/4, S 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3815 M. feet Douglas Fir, 50 M. feet Incense Cedar, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 160 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.90 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$15,363.50, will be considered. T. 15 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 13 (NE 1/4 SE 1/4), and NW 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2420 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet Hemlock, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.70 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$9,059.00, will be considered. Reserve areas as follows are bounded by blazed lines: Approx. 2 acres on NW 1/4 SE 1/4 and Approx. 3 acres and two acres on Lot 13, T. 17 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S 1/2 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1740 M. ft. Douglas Fir, 115 M. ft. White Fir, 40 M. ft. Incense Cedar, 15 M. ft. Hemlock, 320 M. feet Red Cedar, 60 Red Cedar poles. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir and Incense Cedar, \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$8,068.75, will be considered. All logging to be done by Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 18 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 5 (NE 1/4 NE 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1225 M. feet Douglas Fir, 20 M. feet Hemlock, 35 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.60 per M.ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,520.00, will be considered. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 12th day of May, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration.

40-21-41

LEGAL NOTICES

National Forest Timber for Sale

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and not later than 2:00 P.M., June 11, 1945, for all the live and dead timber designated for cutting located on an area embracing about 80 acres within S 1/4 Section 8 and the NE 1/4 NE 1/4 Section 18, T. 22 S., R. 1 E., W.M., Brice Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, estimated to be 4,000,000 feet B.M., more or less, of Douglas-fir, 43,000 feet B.M., more or less, of western hemlock, 250,000 feet B.M., more or less, of western redcedar, 35,000 feet B.M., more or less, of Sugar Pine and an unestimated amount of white fir, and white pine. No bid of less than \$5.55 per M feet for Douglas-fir, and \$2.25 per M feet for western hemlock, white fir, and western redcedar, and \$4.75 per M feet for sugar pine and white pine will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for the stumpage, a co-operative deposit of \$0.15 per M feet B.M. to be used by the Forest Service for paying the cost of slash and snag disposal, and co-operative deposit of \$0.25 per M feet B.M. to cover the cost of tree planting, seed sowing and forest improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement, will be required. \$5,000 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, or District Ranger, Disston, Oregon. Before final award, the high bidder will be required to make a satisfactory showing of financial ability to carry out the agreement. Bids with rates in excess of those permissible under MPR 460 will be reduced to the allowable maximum in making the award. 39-21-41. m10-24

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ALICE M. JACKSON, Deceased, has filed his account for the final settlement of said Estate in the County Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday the 19th day of June 1945, in the County Court Room, County Court House, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing of objections thereto and for final settlement of said Estate. BEN ABSHER, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney.

40-51-44

NOTICE OF SCHOOL ELECTION UPON QUESTION OF INCREASING TAX LEVY OVER AMOUNT LIMITED BY SECTION 11, ARTICLE XI, STATE CONSTITUTION.

Notice is hereby given that an election will be held in School District No. 45 of Lane County, State of Oregon, at Cottage Grove in said school district, for the purpose of submitting to the legal voters of said district the question of increasing the tax levy for the year 1945-46 over the amount limited by section 11, article XI, of the Constitution of Oregon.

The reasons for increasing such levy are:

The levy within the constitutional limitation is based on the highest levy within the last three years plus 6%, this amount being \$8,995.15, which amount is not sufficient to pay the cost of operation of the school as provided for in the budget of the district from July 1, 1945 to June 30, 1946.

The amount of tax, in excess of the 6% limitation, proposed to be levied for said year is \$25,269.85. Dated this 22nd day of May, 1945.

Attest:

H. B. FERRIN,
District Clerk.
W. L. WORKMAN,
Chairman Board of Directors.

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

Notice is hereby given that Alta King, Executor with the Will annexed of the Estate of Margaret E. Tompkins, deceased, has filed his Final Account in the County Court of Lane County and said Court has fixed June 26th, 1945, at 2:00 o'clock P. M. in the Court Room of said Court in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing and considering and acting thereon. First Publication, May 24th, 1945.

ALTA KING,
Executor.

Protein Value

The nutritive value of a protein depends primarily on its amino acid composition. Most proteins are composed of about two dozen different amino acids combined in a variety of ways. When we eat proteins we are eating amino acids. Eight of these amino acids are nutritionally essential factors.

WANT-ADS

WE HAVE MOVED to 5 West Main street in old Heck Grocery building. Cabinet work, crating, glazing, furniture repair. Home Service. George Foster, prop. 5 West Main street. 38-tfxx

FOR SALE OR TRADE: Fresh cows; will also buy fresh cows and springers. Ray Graves, Lorraine route, Hazelton Road. 35-12tp-47.

WANTED: Five-inch top fir piling, long lengths. Telephone AT-water 4341, quantity can supply. Niedermeyer-Martin Co., Spalding Bldg., Portland, Ore. 39-7tc-45.

FOR SALE: 1937 Plymouth motor. Also 1 springtooth harrow. Henry Cooper, Dorena, Oregon. 40-3tp-42.

WANT TO RENT: 3 bedroom unfurnished house after July 1st. Could exchange similar rental in Eugene. Write Box 66 c/o GDF, City. 40-3tp-42.

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal, mut-ton and chickens. Bartels Market. Phone 55. 37-tfxx

MACK'S FIXIT SHOP

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. 37-tfc

Rickard Accounting Service

Auditing — Tax Service

Cottage Grove Hotel
Phone 60

WANTED: For mill: Planer feeders, car loaders and green chain men. For woods: Buckers and fallers. Family houses available or bus service each day. Row River Lumber Co., Phone 4375. 39-tfc

WANTED: Five inch top long Fir Piling. Telephone collect quantities can supply. Niedermeyer-Martin Co., Portland, Oregon. Telephone ATwater 4341. 37-5tc-41

REMODELING, Cabinet work, cement work, brick work, call 707 North 10th Street, city. 39-tfxx

FOR SALE: 25 weaner and feeder pigs. Ray Graves, out Lorane highway, 4th house on Hazelton Road. 38-4tp-41

WANTED: Does anybody have a Ford or Chevrolet of the late 20's stored on their farm or garage for sale? If so, communicate with Orville White or Harry Austin of the Row River Lumber Co., Dorena. They will come and get it and pay cash. 40-2tp-41

WOOD, prompt delivery, just starting. Donald Connor, phone 30F14. 39-3tp-41

WATER WELL DRILLING

See your water well driller before you buy or install your pump. Pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23, J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Ore. 10-tfc-xxx

FOR SALE: Good upright piano. Box 437, city. 41-1tp.

Professional Cards

FUNERAL HOMES

KARL K. MILLS, Mortician.
Phone 202

SMITH FUNERAL CHAPEL
—Phone 101. 6

DENTISTS

DR. W. E. LEBOW—Dentistry
—No. 1 Omer Apartments
Cottage Grove, Ore. Phone 35

PHYSICIANS

H. AXLEY, Physician and Surgeon—Evenings by appointment. Over Kem's for Drugs. Cottage Grove, Oregon.

DR. KATHERINE SCHLEEF,
M. D.—Physician and Surgeon. Apartment 10, Omer Apartments. Phone 247.

ATTORNEYS

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney at Law. First National Bank building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. Phone 94.

ALTA KING — Lawyer, 613 Main street. Office phone 2543; Res. phone, 28F31, Cottage Grove, Ore.

INSURANCE

TITLE ABSTRACT CO., 881 Oak St., Eugene, Ore. Edward F. Bailey, Pres. Abstracts, Title Insurance, Escrows.

H. K. METCALF
Fire, auto, life, casualty insurance. Phone 1153, Cottage Grove, Ore. 23-tfc.

FOR SALE: 1934 Chevrolet truck. Long wheel base, flat bed. Berl Hamilton, Addison Mill camp, 3 miles south of Lorane. 40-2tp-41

WANT TO RENT: four or five room furnished house, two small children. Good references. Chas. Dhabolt, call 254R. 40-tfxx

FOR SALE: Villaret Court Apts. One 4-room, 5, 8-room apts, all furnished and rented. Will make some one good deal on this. Will pay for self in few years. Phone 246 or see me at Eagle Cigar store after 6:00 evenings. C. E. Neet. 40-tfxx

BLOCK and SLAB MIXED

\$4.00 Delivered

Full Cord

Call

R. B. GRAY
178-L
Victory Fuel Co.

WANTED: Responsible woman to care for child this summer, 8 to 5. Call phone 132Y, after 6:00 p. m. 41-1tp

FOR SALE: Formal dress size 18; lavender spring or winter coat size 20. Both new. 89 South River Road. 41-1tp

HELP WANTED: Men, women or high school students, to hoe Easter Lily bulbs. Top wages. Transportation furnished from town. William Norris on W. A. Hemenway ranch. Phone 2F22. 41-ttc

Wool and Mohair

Highest cash price for your wool and mohair. Will be received each Tuesday at Farmer's Union Store, Cottage Grove. D. C. Wilson, phone 3 or call Yonealla collect, phone 21F15. 36-tfxx

WE MAKE GASOLINE and fuel storage tanks. O. K. Welding and Forge Shop. 21-tfxx

FOR RENT: Floor sanders and waxers. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 21-tfxx

FOR SALE: Good five gallon cow, \$65.00 if taken at once. A. J. Balsiger, phone 13F13. 41-1tp.

WILL PAY CASH for late model Chevrolet in good condition. A. J. Balsiger, Phone 13F13. 41-1tp.

MOTORCYCLE for sale: 74 Harley Davidson. Norland Powell, 1059 East Madison Ave. 41-1tp.

FOR SALE OR TRADE: Colt's 38 S. P. 6 in. barrel, belt, shells, holster. Peter Thoreby, Rat Creek, Dorena. 41-1tp.

FOR SALE: 1 Colonial range; 1 wood circulating heater; 1 9x12 wool rug with pad; 1 Victory davenport. E. E. Chestnut, South 6th St. Cottage Grove. 41-1tc.

FOR SALE: Evinrude 5 hp outboard motor. Perfect condition. Cash talks. See Chas. Hall. 41-2tc-42

LOST: Girl's glasses, tortoise shell rims. Reward. Mrs. Oscar Flaten phone 40F2. 41-1tp.

FOR SALE: Guernsey cows, fresh-ly lately. J. E. Blackmore, phone 19F14. 41-1tp.

WANTED: Setting of Buff Orpington eggs. Phone 16F32, Cottage Grove. 41-1tc.

I WILL NOT BE responsible for any bills made by any other than myself. Otis D. Pooler. 41-3tp-43

FOR SALE: Good milk cow. Milking. Otis D. Pooler, mile north Black Butte. 41-2tp-42

TO GIVE AWAY: 1 year old male, part Spaniel at 1603 Ash avenue. Call evenings after 4:00. 41-1tp.

FOR SALE: Home Comfort range; washing machine; dining table. 404 South 2nd street. 41-1tp.

WANTED: Late model electric stove. Must be in A-1 condition. W. S. Barbee, General Delivery, Cottage Grove. 41-1tp

FOR SALE: Majestic range, good condition. Priced reasonable. Also bedstead and springs. 221 South 16th street, city. 41-1tp

FOR SALE: Service station; small living quarters. Inquire 408 N. 8th. 41-1tp

HEAVY FRYERS for sale: Max Bird, 112 South 6th St. 41-1tc

FOR SALE: Fine young team, gentle, about 1350 lb each. New heavy Russett harness and harrow; nice gentle pinto shetland pony, bridle and saddle; also 4-year-old Kentucky saddle horse, chestnut sorrel, partly broke. Roy Stephens, Lorane Rte., three-fourths mile northwest of Anlauf Lodge. 41-1tc

TELEPHONE

301

THEO KANGAS
Watchmaker

14 S. 6th St.

41-tfc

Retirement Insurance

One acre—5 miles N.W. of Cottage Grove on good country rd. Bus to grade and Hi-schools. 2 room log cabin, garage and wood shed. Immediate possession. Priced for quick sale. \$500.00.

Four room house in city. Large lot. Large living room, nice kitchen, bedroom and bathroom but no fixtures. \$2100 cash 2 lots on paved street. Foundation laid for house, small chix house. Fruit trees. \$750. takes both lots.

One acre—14 miles East—new modern house, city water, bath, two bedrooms. Small barn and chix house. Garden. \$2650.00.

MERL KING

with

RODMANS & HILTON

701 Main st:

Phone 216

FOR SALE: 1930 Chevrolet motor, completely overhauled. Clark's Super Service Station. 129 N. 9th St. Phone 252. 41-1tc

FOR SALE: Nice, five room residence 1 1/2 lots on good street close in. Arnest Real Estate & Ins. 41-1tc

FOR SALE: McCormick mower. Boone Humphrey, phone 33F4, Cottage Grove. 41-2tp-42

FOR SALE: A livable 2 room house; 2 lots, each 50x100; electricity, water. \$950.00, terms. Box 397, city. 41-1tp

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to thank our friends and people of Cottage Grove, especially Mrs. Wm. Petersen, for their kind assistance and help at the time of our loss by fire. Mr. and Mrs. Odell Heath. 41-1tp

FERTILIZER

Large shipment of lawn and garden fertilizer now ready. Get yours.

BEIDLER FEED
and
SEED STORE

Net Curtains
Never throw net curtains away just because they are torn. Dip squares of net in cold starch, apply to the torn part on the wrong side of the curtain, and iron with a hot iron. The net will adhere to and blend with the original curtain in such a way that the tear will hardly be visible.

For
**Fire,
Life,
Auto,
Liability,
Annuities**
or other forms of
INSURANCE

Phone 115-J

H. K. Metcalf

MARTIN MOTORS

Pontiac Sales and Service

NEW HOMES FOR SALE

NOW AVAILABLE

LOCATED ON TAYLOR STREET

No Priorities... No Red Tape
Anyone may buy and move right in

Alice J. Breedlove

Phone 126R

1120 West Main

with

Culp & Lake, Realtors
EUGENE

36 East 11th St.

Phone 3420