

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County.

ALFRED M. WHITE and ELSIE MAY WHITE, husband and wife; CLARIS A. ABEENE and HERMA M. ABEENE, husband and wife, Defendants,

vs.
The unknown heirs of ALBERT E. TOZIER, Deceased; VALENTINE B. HARRIS, a widower; HENRIETTA HARRIS LOEP and FRED C. LOEP, her husband; CORA HARRIS KENDALL, a widow; FLORA HARRIS LINN, a widow; JESS BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; DAVID BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; HUGH BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; EDDIE BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; ALMA BURGESS, a single person; H. A. HOWE and GERTRUDE HOWE, his wife; KATE NEVADA BASSETT HUNT, a widow; PAULINE BASSETT MIZE, a widow; GUY A. BASSETT and ELIDA BENDER BASSETT, his wife; OLIVE DAVIS BASSETT, a widow; the unknown heirs of any of the said parties, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein, Defendants.

TO: The unknown heirs of ALBERT E. TOZIER, Deceased. VALENTINE B. HARRIS, a widower; HENRIETTA HARRIS LOEP and FRED C. LOEP, her husband; CORA HARRIS KENDALL, a widow; FLORA HARRIS LINN, a widow; JESS BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; DAVID BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; HUGH BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; EDDIE BURGESS and BURGESS, his wife; ALMA BURGESS, a single person; KATE NEVADA BASSETT HUNT, a widow; PAULINE BASSETT MIZE, a widow; GUY A. BASSETT and ELIDA BENDER BASSETT, his wife; OLIVE DAVIS BASSETT, a widow; the unknown heirs of any of the said parties, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein, DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the Complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the Order of Publication, to-wit: on or before the 24th day of May, 1945; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in and to the land and premises herein described, to-wit:

The Northeast Quarter of Northwest Quarter, Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon. Beginning at a point on the Easterly boundary of the Coast Fork County Road one-fourth mile South and 1664 feet West of the Northeast corner of Section Eight (8), Township Twenty-two (22) South, Range Three (3) West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, State of Oregon.

LEGAL NOTICES

Testament of SUSANNA C. WELLS, Deceased, by the County Court of Lane County, State of Oregon. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby required to present the same, duly verified with proper vouchers, to the undersigned at the law office of Herbert W. Lombard, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of date of first publication of this Notice. Dated and first published April 26, 1945. WORTH HARVEY, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 37-51-41

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

Notice is hereby given that Axel N. Berggren, Administrator for the Estate of Elmer Berggren, deceased, has filed his Final Account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed the 29th day of May, 1945, at 2:00 o'clock P. M. in the Court Room of said Court, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon. First Publication, April 26th, 1945. Axel N. Berggren, Administrator. Alta King, Attorney. 37-51-41

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

IN THE COUNTY COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR THE COUNTY OF LANE. Estate No. 8804

Notice is hereby given, that the undersigned, Edna A. Jesmer, has been appointed executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased, by the above entitled Court. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present the same, duly verified as by law required, to the undersigned at the office of the Cottage Grove Sentinel in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice.

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Forest Exchange No. 022965, United States Department of the Interior, District Land Office, Roseburg, Oregon, April 18, 1945. Notice is hereby given that John F. Gallagher, Shawano, Wisconsin, did, on this date, make application under the act of March 20, 1922 (42 Stat. 465) to select certain timber from portions of Secs. 3, 10, 11, 15, 21, and 22, T. 21 S., R. 1 E., W. M., Umpqua National Forest, Lane County, Oregon, in exchange for lots 1 and 2, SW 1/4, NE 1/4, NW 1/4, Sec. 4, T. 6 S., R. 36 E., W. M., Whitman National Forest, Union County, Oregon. Any and all persons claiming the lands selected, or having bona fide objections to the exchange, should file their protests on or before June 11, 1945. C. F. Spaulding, Acting Register. 38-51-42

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

IN THE COUNTY COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR THE COUNTY OF LANE. Estate No. 8803

Notice is hereby given, that the undersigned, Edna A. Jesmer, has been appointed executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the estate of Florence Ann Steeves, deceased, by the above entitled Court. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present the same, duly verified as by law required, to the undersigned at the office of the Cottage Grove Sentinel in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice.

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Florence Ann Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

Notice is hereby given that Wayne Taliaferro, Administrator of the Estate of Anna Chapman, deceased, has filed his Final Account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed the 12th day of June, 1945, at 2:00 o'clock P. M. in the Court Room of said Court, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon. First Publication, May 10th 1945. Wayne Taliaferro, Administrator. Alta King, Attorney. 39-51-43

NOTICE OF HEARING OF FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Executor and Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of SAMUEL K. ADAMS, Deceased, have filed their account

LEGAL NOTICES

for the final settlement of said Estate in the County Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday, the 19th day of June 1945, at the County Court Room of said Court in the County Court House in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing of objections thereto, and for final settlement of said Estate. WORTH HARVEY, Executor. NORMA G. MILLER, Executrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 40-51-44

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A.M., Pacific War Time, June 5, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE 1/4, SW 1/4, S 1/2 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3815 M. feet Douglas Fir, 50 M. feet Incense Cedar, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 160 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.90 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$15,363.50, will be considered. T. 15 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 13 (NE 1/4, SE 1/4), and NW 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2420 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet Hemlock, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.70 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$15,363.50, will be considered. T. 15 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 13 (NE 1/4, SE 1/4), and NW 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2420 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet Hemlock, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.70 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$15,363.50, will be considered.

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

EDNA A. JESMER, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament and of the Estate of Abel Hurbert Steeves, deceased. EARL F. G. HURLBURT, Attorney: 714 Porter Bldg., Portland, Oregon. First publication May 3, 1945. Last publication May 31, 1945. 38-51-42

WANT-ADS

WE HAVE MOVED to 5 West Main street in old Heck Grocery building. Cabinet work, crating, glazing, furniture repair. Home Service. George Foster, prop. 5 West Main street. 38-tfexx

FOR SALE OR TRADE: Fresh cows; will also buy fresh cows and springers. Ray Graves, Loran route, Hazelton Road. 35-12tp-47.

WANT TO LEASE: By the year pasture land. Ray Graves, Loran route. 37-3tp-39

WOOD

Planer Ends For Sale
We Deliver
Cottage Grove Mfg. Co.
Phone 56

Attention! Home Buyers...

10 room modern house—6 lots, fine location, close in. \$5500. Two bedroom modern home, large lot, nicely located on paved street, nice lawn, concrete walks. \$3750.00.

173 3-10 A. farm—9 A. seeded to clover. More land can be cultivated, balance in young timber and pasture. 2 creeks through pastures, spring water in house. 4 room house, barn 32x40, double garage, woodshed, fruit and separating room, hog house, chix house, family orchard, numerous farming implements. 9 cows, 6 calves, Hereford bull, and chickens go with deal.

SEE OR CALL

ALICE J. BREEDLOVE
1120 West Main Phone 126-R

Culp & Lake, Realtors
36 East 11th St. Eugene, Oregon Phone 3420

WANTED: Cattle, hogs, veal, mutton and chickens. Bartels Market. Phone 55. 37-tfexx

MACK'S FIXIT SHOP

Washing machines, refrigerators, lawn mowers and electric appliances repaired. 1101 East Main. Your work appreciated. 37-tfc

WANTED: For mill: Planer feeders, car loaders and green chain men. For woods: Buckers and fallers. Family houses available or bus service each day. Row River Lumber Co., Phone 4375. 39-tfc

FOR SALE: 2x2's for turkey roosts. Geo. Foster, 5 West Main. 39-2tc-40.

WANTED: Five inch top long Fir Piling. Telephone collect quantities can supply. Niedermeyer-Martin Co., Portland, Oregon. Telephone Atwater 4341. 37-5tc-41

REMODELING, Cabinet work, cement work, brick work, call 707 North 10th Street, city. 39-tfexx

FOR SALE: 25 weaver and feeder pigs. Ray Graves, out Loran highway, 4th house on Hazelton Road. 38-4tp-41

WANTED: Does anybody have a Ford or Chevrolet of the late 20's stored on their farm or garage for sale? If so, communicate with Orville White or Harry Austin of the Row River Lumber Co., Dorena. They will come and get it and pay cash. 40-2tp-41

Choice Lots and Acreage FOR SALE

We are offering for sale 40 choice lots and some acreage for sale in a new residential district north and east of the Union high school. Some of the lots are located on Tenth street, others on Woodard avenue to be opened and improved. Lot sizes 66x152 feet. A discount if two or more lots are taken. Acreage can be subdivided to suit purchaser.

BUY NOW AND GET YOUR CHOICE

A. L. WOODARD, Owner

Mrs. Alice Breedlove with Culp and Lake 40-4tp-43

FOR SALE: 8 acres with new 5 room house, barn, chicken house, electricity. One mile above Culp Creek, Chester G. Colson. Culp Creek, Ore. 39-2tp-40

WOOD, prompt delivery, just starting. Donald Connor, phone 30F14. 39-3tp-41

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ALICE M. JACKSON, Deceased, has filed his account for the final settlement of said Estate in the County Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday the 19th day of June 1945, in the County Court room, County Court House, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon has been by said Court fixed as the time and place for hearing of objections thereto and for final settlement of said Estate. BEN ABSHER, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 40-51-44

Wool and Mohair

Highest cash price for your wool and mohair. Will be received each Tuesday at Farmer's Union Store, Cottage Grove. D. C. Wilson, phone 3 or call Yoncalla collect, phone 21F15. 36-tfexx

WE MAKE GASOLINE and fuel storage tanks. O. K. Welding and Forge Shop. 21-tfexx

RENT: 500 Ac. pasture for cattle, sheep, goats. Monthly. Also 240 acres for 1 year. Do not write, come in see C. Dvorak, Curtin, Ore. 36-4tp-39.

FOR RENT: Floor sanders and waxers. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 21-tfexx

WATER WELL DRILLING. See your water well driller before you buy or install your pump. Pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23, J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Ore. 10-tfc-xxx

Attention-Home Buyers

FOR SALE: New modern two bed-room homes, quiet location. Terms. Buy and move in.

FOR SALE: Modern four bedroom home, nicely located, close in, woodshed and garage. Price \$4000.00.

Lots, Small Acreage, Several Farms for sale.

SEE OR CALL

Alice J. Breedlove
1120 West Main—Phone 126-R
with

Culp & Lake, Realtors

36 East 11th St.—Phone 3420
Eugene, Oregon

FOR SALE: New 1/6 h.p. electric motor. Clark's Super Service Station. 40-1tc

FOR SALE: Baby bed in excellent condition. Clark's Super Service Station. 40-1tc

WANTED: One ratchet setter for power set works; one log slip man. Mill capacity 60 M located four miles east of Cottage Grove at Walden Station. Transportation furnished from Cottage Grove. Blue Mountain Lumber Co. 40-1tc Hill. 40-1tp

CARD OF APPRECIATION. The Blue Mountain Lumber Company wishes to express its appreciation to those people who assisted in extinguishing the recent fire in our mill. We wish especially to thank the Cottage Grove Fire Department and Police Department. Blue Mountain Lumber Co. 40-1tc

FOR SALE: Good young cow, milking shorthorn. Second calf. \$80.00. Phone 21F2. Albert A. Hull. 40-1tc

FOR SALE: Guernsey-Holstein cow, giving 5 gallons. A. J. Bal-siger, phone 13F13. 40-1tc

FOR SALE: 1934 Chevrolet truck. Long wheel base, flat bed. Berl Hamilton, Addison Mill camp, 3 miles south of Loran. 40-2tp-41

FOR SALE: Deering mowing machine in good running order. Inquire Ailyn Markham, Cooley Hill. 40-1tp

TAKEN FROM MY PLACE: May 12, black Shepherd pup, brown and white markings. Red harness. Reward. H. D. Myers, Loran route. 40-1tp

FOR SALE: All leather baby buggy; baby bed, blankets and quilts. All practically new. 1543 Ash avenue. 40-1tp

WANT TO RENT: four or five room furnished house, two small children. Good references. Chas. Dhabolt, call 254R. 40-tfexx

FOR SALE: Good cow and heifer calf. \$85.00. A. S. Lancaster, 6 miles out Mosby Creek, phone 16F5. 40-1tp

RETURNED VETERAN, wife and child desire one or two bedroom furnished house to rent. Tel. 151. 40-1tp

FOR SALE: Guernsey cow, fresh 2 months, stake broke. \$75.00. Glenn Flatters' Texaco Station or after 5 p. m. at 1425 Birch avenue. 40-1tp

FOR SALE: Trailer axle, wheels and tires. 118 North 6th street. 40-1tp

FOR SALE: Vinars Court Apts. One 4-room, 5, 2-room apts, all furnished and rented. Will make some one good deal on this. Will pay for self in few years. Phone 246 or see me at Eagle Cigar str after 6:00 evenings. C. E. Neet. 40-tfexx

1929 MODEL A FOR SALE: Good tires, spare, \$175.00. Myrtle E. Prine, Saginaw. 40-1tp

REGISTERED BERKSHIRE boar service. O. M. Patten. Phone 13F2. 40-1tp

FOR SALE: 14 foot Main Line trailer house, flame cook and heat. Also 2 hole hot plate and toaster, both for \$15.00. Lee F. Montgomery, Woodson's Auto Court, Cottage Grove. 40-1tp

FOR SALE: Bicycle in good condition. 1126 Birch avenue. Phone 242L. 40-1tc

BLOCK and SLAB MIXED

\$4.00 Delivered

Full Cord

Call

R. B. GRAY

178-L

Victory Fuel Co.

FOR SALE: One 2 section harrow; one new range, hot water tank and fittings; steel cot; single bed mattress; wood heater; pitcher pump; 1935 International rear axle complete with wheels; 2 Dodge rear truck springs; roll of pre-war barb wire, new; small cream separator; miscellaneous articles. Phone 35F3. 40-1tp

FOR SALE: Table model electric radio. Call Cottage Grove hotel. 40-1tc

LOST: 11 foot pike pole below dam, Wednesday morning. Pole marked USED: \$1.00 reward if returned to Walter R. LaLonde, Cottage Grove dam. 40-1tc

WANTED: Cook stove small enough for trailer house. Electric razor for sale. 460 South 10th street. 40-1tp

FILMS Developed and Printed

2-day Service

Cottage Grove Pharmacy

FERTILIZER

Large shipment of lawn and garden fertilizer now ready. Get yours.

BEIDLER FEED

and SEED STORE

1/2 acre—one mile from City—5 room modern house has wall to wall carpets, elec. water heater, wired for elec. range, venetian blinds throughout, city water. \$5200.00. Terms.

1/2 acre—1 1/2 miles on South 6th St. 5 room house with elec. Elec. pump. Some fruit and berries. Garage, workshop and chix house, barn. \$2500. \$1500.00 down.

Ideal for the fishermen: 1200 feet on the Umpqua River and 600 feet on Hiway 38. \$2100.

6 room modern house on paved street, close to schools. Nice lawn and shrubbery \$4250. Terms.

MERL KING

with

RODMANS & HILTON

701 Main st:

Phone 216