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M ft B M. fo r the Douglas F ir, STATE O F OREGON: You are I the County Court of Lane County. 
$2.50 per M ft.B.M. fo r the Hein- hereby summon,*,! and required to Oregon, has set the time mid place 
lock, or a tota l purchase price of up|u.*ar and answer the complaint

w ill be considered. T. of the p la in tiff hied against you 
Subscription Rates, Cash in Advance 22 S.. R. 3W., Sec. 3, a ll mer- in the above entitled suit on or

In  Lane-Douglas Counties............... ................... ..........,, ....... i  year 12.00 L’banlable tim ber designated to r before the last uay of the time
In  Lane-Douglas C ounties....  ..... ...... .......  „  6 months $125 cu,UnS 0,1 the N Et», E l »N W \*. prescribed in the order of publi-
In  Lane-Douglas Counties .. .....................  3 months S 7 5 'and NV»S E '«* ‘» tinw ted  fo r the cation of summons, to -w it: on or
Outside T h i, D istrict ....................................................  , J  2  <* th *  *»*• «*’ >»’ ^ # 5  M before the 26th day of October,

t-. , ............... .......................... ...... 1 J8ar ®^*® feel IXiuglas F ir. 40 M. feet Hem- 1914, and if  you fad to so apiiear
d 2 ? ‘S E ‘S,nCt .......~ ........... ... ................................  ® months $1.50 Jock. 113 M. feet Red Cedar, and answer fo r want (hereof the

Outside This D is tric t ...................................................... —  3 months $.90 173 M. feet Incense Cedar. 35 M. p la in tiff w ill apply to the above
feet W hite F ir. No bid fo r less entitled Court tor the relief pray*(Exceptions to men and women in armed forces 

| In U. S. A : 1 year $2.00; 6 months $1.30; 3 months $1.00.
Overseas: 1 year $1.50; 6 months $1.00.

Foreign rates on application. No subscription accepted fo r less than 3 
months. Im portant: In changing address notify us immediately and 

:<lve former as well as present address.
Entered at Cottage Grove, Oregon, as second class matter.

. . „ i J S r t *  .  NATIONAL EDITORIAL—
.  p i i  njM ^ A S S O C I A T I O N
> n u s jt1|'44s4ii»u»< W

than $3.30 per M .ft.B.M . fo r the 
Douglas F ir. $2 50 per M .ft.B  M 
fo r the Hemlock .itnd Red Cedar. 
$2.00 per M .ft.B M . fo r the In ­
cense Cedar, $2.25 per M .ft.B.M. 
fo r the W hite F ir. o r a to ta l pur­
chase price of $24 598.75, w ill be 
considered. T. 22 S. R 3 W . See 
11, a ll merchantable tim ber des­
ignated fo r cutting on the SI» 
S E 1«, estimated fo r the purpose 
of this sale to be 25S0 M. feet

K as F ir, 100 M. feet Hemlock.
I. feet Red Cedar. No bid fo r 

less than $5.23 per M.ft.B.M. for 
the Douglas F ir  $2.00 per M .ft 
B.M fo r the Hemlock and Red

THE BURKE BILL
The ( ulifornia wine interests art* behind the move to defeat 

the Burke lull, which would place the sale ol’ p ine in state li­
quor stores and thus stop the sale of wine over fourteen percent
to minors. I nder the present setup there is nothing to stop a Cedar or a total purchase price 
minor from buying fnrtifi,*«! wine at any store silling it. where- °f $13.945 03, w ill be considered, 
as if wine was ph: ed on sale at a state liquor store, the state
liquor .-omniiss-on would have control o f its sale and could regu-

A ll tim ber cut from  each of the 
above described areas must be 

local mar- 
the O. 
unless

late it. The .claim in advertising carried on by the so-called mer- C m ? . ? =?. 
chants ill newspapers, on bill boat,Is and oyer th, radio that this and Y  ^ £ £ ¡ . > 1 1  ..
■■ w ou ld  prevent a p e -o n  se rv ing  w ine  in Ins horn re fe rr in g  otherwise authorized by the Chief 

.s the “ jo t te r  ’ i ;  the bunk and w.:s adopted  fa r  the purpl.se  Forester. I f  the unit prices bid
bill would pt 
to as

,ol mide-«<lju<j ft»«, vo tent are above those authorized by
The 1943 leg is la tu re  passed the B u rke  b il l  a fte r  h ea lin g  tea- MPR 460, they w ill be reduced 

tim o n y  from  law  e iito ieem ent o ffic e rs  th a t w ines were c ru e lly  lo  ’ be maximum perm itted under 
hab it fo rm in g  and th a t cons ide rab ly  m ild  o r  aggravate ,! insan- ’ ^a’ order. In case of two or more 
i fy  resu lted from  its  use. W ine  fu r th e r  o ffe rs  a chance to  these ‘Lentical bids fo r the same tint- 
lo o k in g  fo r  a:» inexpensive w ay o f g e tt in g  d ru n k  and o ffe rs  m ore t>or’ ,he ,ucccssiul bidder w ill be
than the usual tem ptations to the youth for its reason. selected on the basis of compara­

tive importance to the war pro­
gram and ab ility  to fu rthe r the 
objectives of the Act o f August 

1937. The right is hereby re­
ed to waive technical defects 

in th is advertisement; to reject 
a ll bids to award the tim ber for 
the amount of the highest bid to 
other than the higest bidder when

ed fo r in the complaint, to -w it: 
that you, and each of you, he ad­
judged to have no estate or in te r­
est whatsoever in or to the land 
and premises here it described, to- 
w it:

Beginning at a |x>int on the 
south line of Section 8, 445 
feet west o f the quarter cor­
ner between Sections 8 and 
17 and 40 feet westerly at 
righ t angles from the W A. 
Woodard Lumber Company 
railroad «enter line as con­
structed Upon the grcqnd. 
thence west 875 feet more or 
less to the 1 16 corner, thence 
north 1320 feet, thence east 
666 feet, more or Uss. to a 
point 40 feet westerly at right 
angles t r im  the W. A Wood­
ard Lumber Company railroad 
center line, thence southerly 
paralle ling the said railroad 
center line and 40 feet west­
erly from  said center line to 
the place of beginning and em­
bracing 20 acres, more or less 
in Section 8, Twp. 22 South 
Range 3 West W. M „ Lane 
County, Oregon. Subject to 
the existing County Ruud 
righ t of way through same.

Southwest one • quarter 
(SW *«) of Southwest one- 
quarte r iS W ’* i  Section Eight 
(8 » Township Twenty-Two 
(22) South Range Three (3) 
West W illam ette Meridian, as 
platted r.nd recarde,I in Lane 
County, Oregon. Containing 

40 acres, more or less, 
and that the p la in tiff is the own-

RIGHTS*AND RIGHTS
Human lights vs, property rights! There’s a good political 

battle cry. Any fair-minded American is likely to declare him- s e n ' 
self for putting  Unman rights first. A little thought, however, 
may start some trouble in finding distinctions and definitions.
The right ta earn a living must be a human right. But wages.
food clothing and shelter, the prime elements of a living, are necessary. pursuant to the Act of
property! Out might find it interesting to make a list of an August 28. 1937 ( 50 S tat. 874», in er in fee simple to said real prop-
A m eriean 's  reas nable o r  guaranteed r ig h ts , and then see w hich  order to provide a continued sup- e rty  as set out in the complaint

fur the hearing to be h«d for 
said Final Account at the hour of 
ten o'clock a. tit.. Tuesday, Octo­
ber 31, 1944. and a ll persons hav­
ing any objections thereto shall 
file  the same In w riting  1)1 or be­
fore the time fo r said henrutg. 
DOROTHY COVALT, Adm inis­
tra trix . HERBERT W. LOM- 
BARD. A ttorney 7 - j l - l l

In the C ircu it Court of the 
State of Oregon fo r Lane county. 
FRANCIS M ,LAU G H  U N  and 
MAUDE M. EAEG H l.IN . his wife.

IX 'fendiiuts,
VR.

HORACE MANN and L l ’ELLA  
MANN, his w ife: the unknown 
heirs of any *tf the ubovc tutmed 
|k*rsons or parties, i f  any are de­
ceased; also, a ll other persona or 
parties unknown claim ing «ny 
right, title , estate, lien or in te r­
est in the real vs:.dp dytcrilx ’d in 
the complaint herein.

Defendants.
TO: HORACE MANN AND LU-

ELLA MANN, his w ife: the un­
known heirs ol any ot the ulxivc 
named persons or parties, i f  any 
are deceased: also, a ll other per­

sons or parties unknown claiming 
any right tirft*. «state, lien or in­
terest in the real estate describ­
ed in the complaint he ein,

Defendants.
IN  TH E  N AM E OF TH E  

STATE .OF OREGON: You are 
hereby summoned and required to 
appear and answer the complaint 
of the p la in tiffs  filed against you 
in the above entitled suit on or 
before the last day of the time 
prescribed in the order of publi­
cation. to -w it: on o r before the 
ninth day of November. 1944: and 
if  you fa il to so ap|ieur and an­
swer, lo r want thereof, the p la in t­
iffs  w ill apply to the above e n titl*

cd Court for the relief prayed fo r ' 
in the complaint, to -w it: that you, 
and each of you, lie adjudged to 
have no estate ot interest whatso­
ever in o r to the land or premises 
herein dcscribcsl, lo -w it:

South H alf of fztt No 4 In
Block No 2 In D. (J. McFar­
land's Second Addition to Cot­
tage Grove, in I « ie County, 
State of O r e g o n .

and that the pl m tlffs are the 
owners In fee simp e of said prop­
e rty  as set out in the complaint 
herein. And I hat jou , and each of 
you, be fonw »r en|olned and de­
barred from  ass, .■••ng any claim 
whatsoever lite r, to  alverse to the 
p la in tiffs , and fo r such other mid 
fu rthe r re lie f as to the C ourt' 
shall seem just anil equitable

TltLs summons was publish,*,! un­
der an o lder made by the 1ION. 
'1 F SKIPW ORTH. C ircu it Judge 
fo r the State of Oregon, fo r Lane 
County, on the 10th day of <X*- 
tober, 1941. which order directs 
that tlilx stintmons Is* published 
once a we,*k fo r four successive 
weeks in the Cottage Grove Sen­
tinel. a w eekly newspa|M*r of gen-, 
oral circulation printed in Cottage 
Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and 
that you he required toappeur and 
answer on or before the last day 
of Ihe time preserllnsl in said o r­
der, to-w it : on or before the ninth 
(lay of Novcmltcr. 19-14

Date of firs t publication 4X*to- 
ber 12. 1914. .Date of Iasi publica­
tion November 9. 1941 HERBERT 
\v  LOMBARD, ikttoi nt > for 
p la in lifjs . Residence and post o f­
fice address Cottage Grove. Lane 
County, Oregon. •i .'ii-i.i

l* i( Crop
The total pig crop umounled to 

iai.W47.tMM» 4imd In 1043 a i com- 
pured with the previous high rec­
ord of 104.MU.ti00 In the preceding
year. '

VITAMINS THE WAY
YOU WANT THEM

More »nd more Hmtllee are hua- 
tng to BAX. the Complete* Vllamla 
Ctpeule. Io> their vitamins. They 
hud BAX mote cenrenteet lo lake 
— )usl ooe tley capsule each day — 
no need lo lake aevefaf labia is. 
Mora Important la Ihla (act:

’ tach BAX capsule aupplies at 
least lha lull adult minimum dally 
lequlremanl ot the Important vita­
mins needpd la human nulrltloe. 
Why pay m ore-and  peihapa get 
leas?

MCKESSON'S

BAX
nt( YIIAMIN c m w i

IS D*IS’ S t t F F lt . . . .  • • •
10 OATS* SUPPLY... U  71
10 OATS' JUPPLY . . I I  IO
110 DAYS’ S U P P IT ...1 4 .1 0

DEALER'S NAME HER!

Kelly Drug
II S  T I M E

T O  C H A N G E

ones can clearly he defined as either human or property rights. 
The conclusion may he that the words of a 
often have more sound than meaning—Farm

ply of tim ber to local industry so herein; and that you. and each of 
nioined and de-a p o lit ic a l slogan as to assurc ’ he permanence of the you. be forever 

J o u rn a l
land, Oregon, this 16th day of 
October, 1944. W. H. Horning, 

Some firm s  over the sta te  are now posting  notices to th e ir  em- Chief Forester. O. and C. Admin- 
ployes in fo rm in g  th e ir  employes tha t a three percent tax  on a ll » tra tion . 10-2tc-U.
paychecks of that firm will become effective January  1, 1945 if -----  -----.............——   --------
the Towmend gross tax is approved by the voters on November NOTICE OF G l'A R D IA N ’8 SALE 
7th and that this tax on paveheeks may later become five per
cent, if the tax  is boosted five percent o.i other commodities.

PAY CHECK TAX

community which is dependent up- barred from  asserting any claim 
on such industry. Dieted at Port- whatever thereto adverse to the 

p la in tiff: and for such other and 
fu rthe r re lie f as to the Court may
see just and equitable.

This summons is published pur­
suant to order made by HON. G. 
F. SKIPW ORTH. C ircu it Court 
Judge fo r the State of Oregon fo r 
Lane County, on the 26th day o fNOTICE IS HEREBY G IV EN :

That under authority  of the Coun- September. 1944. which order di- 
O n it In te rfe r in '»  ’  Cour’  of the State of Oregon rects that this summons be pub-

°  fo r Lane County, duly made and lished once a week fo r four suc-
What politieK can do for pest-war jobs is to get out o f the way entered on the 26th day of Septem- cessive weeks in the Cottage

and flash the  green lig h t th a t w i ll  release the dam m ed-up en- ber. 1914, the undersigned Guard- Grove Sentinel, a newspaper of
ergies of the Aineri an people.— B a ke r D-H . ¡an of the Estates of CARM EN Kmeral circulation, printed in

M AR IE  DAMEW OQD and CAR- Cottage G r o ^  |zm e County. State
So dieffttion is only to last for the duration. But hew long will GL ANN DAMEc/OOD,

the duration be continued after the war .'—Junction City Times. seH at private sale
. . . - g ----- --  ■r — ■ • —■  ----------- = =  _• — -  ——------ -- highest bidder fo r cash

course of business, a llN O T IC E  O F  T IM B E R  S A L E
Sealed b id s ,  marked outside 52 00 per M .ft.B .M . fo r the Red fo llow ing described property, 

“ Bid fo r Timber,” and addressed Cedar, or a to ta l purchase price w it: 
to the Chief Forester, O and C. of $4,800, w ill be considered.
Adm inistration, 901 G u a r d ia n  Timber to be logged w ith  Cater- 
Building, Portland, Qregon w ill be p illar-type trac to r unless other- 
roceived un til 2:30 p.m. Pacific w-ise authorized by Forester in 
W ar Time, Npwsnber 7. 1944 charge of sale. T. 17 S. R. 7W „ 
fo r the purchase of tim ber upon Sec. LI, and merchantable tim ber 
tracts hereinafter describe^!; each designated fo r cu tting  on the 
bid must state the amount per M. N E '«S E U  and S fs S E 'i,  estimated 
feet B.M., which w ill be offered fo r the purpose of th is sale to be 
fo r each species and the to ta l con- 2535 M. feet Douglas F ir, 15 M. 
sidcration which w ill be paid fo r feet Hemlock, 160 M. feet Red 
the timber. No bid fo r less than Cedar, 10 M. feet W hite F ir, 35 
the appraised value w ill be con- Red Cedar poles. No bid fo r less 
sitiered. Each bid must be sub- than $3.75 per M .ft.B.M. fo r the 
m itted in duplicate and be accom- Douglas F ir, $2.50 per M .ft.B.M. 
panied by a deposit in the form  of fo r the Hemlock and Red Cedar, 
a certified check in favor of the $2.00 per M .ft.B.M . fo r the W hite 
Treasurer of the United States. F ir. $.75 each fo r the Red Cedar 
The deposit of any successful bid- Poles, or a tot^il purchase price 
dcr w ill be credited on the con- of $9,999.00 w ill be considered, 
tract. Payment in fu ll at the T. 18 S.. R. 1 W „ Sec. 1, all mer- 
time of filing  the contract is re- chantable designated fo r cutting  

on Lot 5 (N E '/ iN E U l and Lot 6 
(N W U N E 14), estimated fo r the 
purpose of this sale to be 4080

quired in sales amounting to 
$2500 or less. For copies of Jlhe 
form  of proposal, form  of contract
and bond, terms of payment. M. feet Douglas F ir, 345 M. feet
amount of deposit required w ith  
bid, amount of bond required w ith  
contract and other information, 
application should be made to the 
address shown above.
IN  LAN E COUNTY: T. 15 S„ R. 
1 W., Sec 7, a ll merchantable

Hemlock, 5M. feet Incense Cedar. 
50 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid 
fo r less than $5.00 per M.ft.B.M. 
for the .Douglas F ir, $2.50 per 
»M.fGB.M. fo r the Hemlock. $1.50 
per M .ft.B.M. fo r the Incense 
Cedar, $2 00 per M ft.B .M . for

Each an undivided 1/24 in­
terest in Southeast Q uarter 
of Northeast uuartcr, Section 
5. Township 20 South Range 
4 West W illam ette Meridian, 
Lane County. Oregon.

Each an undivided 1/72 in­
terest in North ha lf of the 
Southeast quarter and the 
southeast quarter of the 
Southeast quarter of Section 
17 in Township 20 South o f 
Range 4 W’est of the W illam ­
ette Meridian, Lane County, 
Oregon.

Each an undivided 1/72 in­
terest in and to lots 4, 5 and 
6 in Section 2, except tract to 
Jack Rodman, or as owned by 
Jack Rodman, and Lot 1, Sec­
tion 11, a ll in Township 20 
South, Range 5 West of W ill­
amette Meridian, as shown by 
the o ffic ia l survey thereof, 
being the same premises con­
veyed to R. W. Cooper and 
shown in  Book 188, Page 232. 
Deed Records of Lane .County, 
Oregon.

Each an undivided 1/72 in­
terest in and to the West H alf 
of West H  Sec. 2, Township 
20, Range 5 West of the W ill­
amette Meridian in Lane 
County, Oregon. ”
Said sale w ill be made on the 

27th day o f October, 1944, and 
bids w ill be received a t the Law

minors, of Oregon, a rT  that you be re­
to the QUired to apiiear and answer on 
in the or ■Ix’ fore the last day of the time 

of the prescribed in said order, to -w it: 
Io. on o r before the 26th day of Oc­

tober, 1944. Date of firs t publica­
tion September 28. 1944. Date of 
last publication October 26, 1941. 

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, 
A ttorney fo r P la in tiff. 

Residence and Post Office Ad­
dress: Cottage Grove, Lane Coun­
ty. Oregon. 7 -5 M I

N O T H  E  O F  F IN A L  
S E T T L E M E N T

Notice is hereby given 
DOROTHY COVALT. th< 
signed, as A dm in is tra trix  
Estate of GEORGE RAYMOND 
BOW MAN, Deceasi'd, have filed 
w ith  the County C lerk o f Lane 
County, State ot Oregon, my 
F inal Account, and that by order

that I. 
under- 
of the

Allen P. Wheeler
Republican Candidate 

f ir

County Commissioner
Lr.nc County, Orejca 

Age 43
FFESENT COUNTY 

COMMISSIONER
• J

Bo.n and Educate 1 in Lane 
County. Farm Owner and 

Taxpayer

THIS YEAR....

OF REPUBLICAN CANDIDATES 
IS PUBLISHED 

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE- 
S A V E  F O R  t tE F E R E N C E  N O V - 7

Fo« v i c i e r ;

For If. S. Senator

WAYNE L. MORSE

tim ber designated fo r cu tting , the Red Cedar, or a to ta l pur- 
on Lot 3 (N W ^ iS W Iii) , and lot chase price of $21,370.00, w ill be 
4 (SW *4SW !4). estimated fo r considered. T im ber to be logged
the purpose of this sale to w ith  Caterpillar-type tracto r un- 
be 3430 M. feet Douglas F ir, 85 less otherwise authorized by For-
M. feet Red Cedar. 55 M. feet ester in,charge of sale. T. 19 S., o ffice  of Herbert W Lombard
hA?n ^ 7 ^  a r  M n  r m  ’T  h L W 'u SCC' 15, .“ ‘1 merchantablc F irs t National Bank Build,ng. Cot- 

than S3.75 per M.ft..B.M. fo r the tim ber designated fo r cu tting  on tage Grove Oreeon u n til -i r ea  Douglas F ir. $2.00 per M .ft.B.M . all o f the N E U S E ’i ,  portion of X b ' e  bkI h a X n  raceived 
fo r the Red Cedar, $1.50 per the SEI4SWA4 and of the S &  GEORGE D AM EW f/O D  C.uard- 
M.ft.B.M. fo r the license Cedar, SE1«, estimated fo r the purpose ¡ark HERBERT W LOMBARD 
o r a tota l purchase price of $13. of thus sale to be 3030 M. feet Attorney fo r G u a rd ia n  7 5t t i115.00, w ill be considered. T imber Douglas F ir, 30 M. feet Hemlock. —  Y Guardian.----- 7 -u t- lL
to be logged w ith  Caterpillar-type No bid fo r less than $5.00 per
tracto r unless otherwise author- M .ft.B  M. fo r the Douglas Fir, 
i|ed by Forester

S U M M O N S

GOOD NEWS, B U T -

tW I PRODUCTION BOARD’ S IH R  SURVEY 

o r  PURCHASES BY AUTO JUNKYARDS 

(HOWS 7» PERCENT FIVER CARS BEINC 

SCRAPPED THAN IN 19A2-A]

F o p  I.’. B. Senator 
CUY CORDON

Leslie M. Scott

STATE AND COUNTY CANDIDATES

Wartime Stop and Go Still Scraps 
Somebody’s Car Every Minute >LANE COUNTY (Fourth District)

For State Representative, 14th District
JOHN R. SNELLSTROM

For State Representative, 14th District
TRUMAN A. CHASE

For State Representative, 14th District
EARL H. HILL

,*n,I ,cha^ ge per M i  B.M. fo r the H em -, In the C ircu jt Court o f th
Sec. 3. kx.k; o r a to ta l purchasing price sta te  of Oregon fo r Lane County.,

in  ¿ r i / « w v  c° n8,d?redJ D AD D IE  SUGG, a widow
(N W '4  In Ihe SEViSW ^i only trees wnman

ie. T. 17 S„ R. 1 W , 
merchantable tim ber

ted fo r cu tting  on Lot j  (N W '4  In the BEt4SW% only 
P ffe 'i), and Lot 1 (N E i^ N E li j ,  blazed and marked w ith  orange 
estimated fo r the purpose of this markers are Included in the sale
sMe toajB*2785 M

3 Î

woman, P la in tiff,
vs.

ARTHUR F. W ILCO X and MARYMHe to ^ r .2 7 8 5  M. feet Douglas In the S fcS E K  only trees North JANE W ILCO X h l .  w i ^  w n  
Fir. 220 M. feet Incense Cedar, of a blazed line are to be cut. T. w i t i r ? L J  a n n  ’ iY n p
2«) M feet Red Cedar. No bid 20 S.. R. 2W „ Sec 3. all mer- WOOD h ^ i i  u
W  less than $5.00 per M .ft.B.M. chantable tim ber designated fo r heirs o f anv o f the ahovpUrierinn? f 4  the Douglas F ir. $1.50 per cu tting  on Lot 5 tS W -4NW'/t i, or anv
M ift.B.M . fo r the Incense Cedar, estimated fo r the purpose of this aisn .,ii n»h»r i, n «• '$2.00 per M .ft.B.M. fo r the Red sale to be l l« 0  M feet IXiuglas V j  e ! Z , ‘ F 
Cedar, or a to ta l purchase price F ir. 65 M. (ee't Hemlock. J i f  " ny r '«h l ' ,IUc

eatate, lien or interest in the real
------------- , -----  vzcuar, rw?a ueaar estate

Timber to be logged w ith  Cater- Poles. No bid fo r less than $5.25 herein uetennants
pillar-type tractor unless other- per M.ft.B.M. fo r the Douglas F ir. TO- .ARTHUR F  W If f ’f )X '» n d  
wise authorized !»  Forester in $2.50 per M .fbB.M . for *’ ”  U IL C O X  and

Cedar, $.75 each W IL L IA M  WOOD

or . K 775.00. be «ed

authorized by Forester 
>ale. T

1, all merchantable tim ber fo r 
fo r cu tting 

N W k S W U , estimated

$2.50 per M .ft.B.M. fo r the Hem- MARY i a n f  w i i / y i v  r,* r charge of sale. T  17 S„ R. 7 W., lock - aA NE W ILCOX, his w ife;

S h c llu b r ic a t io n  can he lp  y o u r 
ca r escape the to l l  o f W a rtim e  
Stop and G o. T h is  specia l sys­
tem  o f c a r m a in tenance  g ives 
you lu b r ic a t io n  acco rd in g  to 
m a n u fa c tu re r ’s re c o m m e n d a ­
tions . B eyond  tha t, i t  inspects 
h id de n  p a rts  w he re  w ea r s ta rts  
. . .  and re p o rts  on th e ir  c o n d i­
tio n . Y o u r specia l re ce ip t shows 
e x a c tly  w ha t's  heen done . . . 
w ha t m ore  sh o u ld  he done  to

GET THESE TESTS for 
STOP and GO WEAR

A, thay lubricate, Shal< a»- 
p u t, ,•> , , , , «»amine . , . 
check far hidden Stop and 
Go wear at e iten lia l point,. 
Your receipt ,h o w , what they 
find . . .  I ,  a valuable "con- , 
dition" report on yeur car.

For District Attorney
For Commissioner.....
For Sheriff 
For Clerk 

For Assessor 
1 Fcr Coroner 
For Surveyor 
For Judge

WILLIAM BARTLE 

ALLEN WHEELER j 
C. A. SWARTS 

W. B. DILLARD 

BERT HULEOAARD
PHIL BARTHOLOMEW 

. P M MORSE 

CLINTON HURD

and Red 
the Red Cedar and AN N

doaignated fo r cutting in the tota l purchase price o f $6 631 50 known hfU rs^of’nnv*n f< ih  h?" 
N W -cS W t estimated fo r the w ill be considered. T. 21 ' s  r ' ?a? i " \ f  In y
purpose of this sale to be 915 M 3 W., Sec. 33, a ll merchantablc e ra s ? "  ateJ> dll other w r ^ n ,  or 
E k  5  M 5 S  J  HT  tim ber designated for cutting on parties unknown claim ing any 

• M. feet Red Cedar. No Lot 1, estimated fo r the purpose right tit le  estate lien or interest
' « . ’ S ’ K :  B

Sec. Poles, or
Gasoline Pietri 
Ike* Attack Sir'* 
(fitti I  Ornp

Rfî A<t* PopithlifiJn Cinte Control C om m ittw  
Vxgun butldifty, FotHootl, Oregon, (.uri Mo«ef, Exc '’•w.

purpl.se

