

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF GUARDIAN'S SALE

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That under authority of the County Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, duly made and entered on the 26th day of September, 1944, the undersigned Guardian of the Estates of CARMEN MARIE DAMEWOOD and CAROL ANN DAMEWOOD, minors, will sell at private sale to the highest bidder for cash in the course of business, all of the following described property, to-wit:

Each an undivided 1/24 interest in Southeast Quarter of Northeast quarter, Section 5, Township 20 South, Range 4 West, Willamette Meridian, Lane County, Oregon.

Each an undivided 1/72 interest in North half of the Southeast quarter and the southeast quarter of the Southeast quarter of Section 17 in Township 20 South of Range 4 West of the Willamette Meridian, Lane County, Oregon.

Each an undivided 1/72 interest in and to lots 4, 5 and 6 in Section 2, except tract to Jack Rodman, or as owned by Jack Rodman, and Lot 1, Section 11, all in Township 20 South, Range 5 West of Willamette Meridian, as shown by the official survey thereof, being the same premises conveyed to R. W. Cooper and shown in Book 188, Page 232, Deed Records of Lane County, Oregon.

Each an undivided 1/72 interest in and to the West Half of West 1/2 Sec. 2, Township 20, Range 5 West of the Willamette Meridian in Lane County, Oregon.

Said sale will be made on the 27th day of October, 1944, and bids will be received at the Law Office of Herbert W. Lombard, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, until a reasonable bid has been received. GEORGE DAMEWOOD, Guardian. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Guardian. 7-5t-11.

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. D. ADDIE SUGG, a widow Plaintiff,

vs.

ARTHUR F. WILCOX and MARY JANE WILCOX, his wife; WILLIAM WOOD and ANN JANE WOOD, his wife; the unknown heirs of any of the above persons or parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein. Defendants.

TO: ARTHUR F. WILCOX and MARY JANE WILCOX, his wife; WILLIAM WOOD and ANN JANE WOOD, his wife; the unknown heirs of any of the above persons or parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein. Defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiff filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication of summons, to-wit: on or before the 26th day of October, 1944, and if you fail to so appear and answer for want thereof the plaintiff will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: that you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land and premises herein described, to-wit:

Beginning at a point on the south line of Section 8, 445 feet west of the quarter corner between Sections 8 and 17 and 40 feet westerly at right angles from the W. A. Woodard Lumber Company railroad center line as constructed upon the ground, thence west 875 feet more or less to the 1/16 corner, thence north 1320 feet, thence east 666 feet, more or less, to a point 40 feet westerly at right angles from the W. A. Woodard Lumber Company railroad center line, thence southerly paralleling the said railroad center line and 40 feet westerly from said center line to the place of beginning and embracing 20 acres, more or less in Section 8, Twp. 22 South Range 3 West W. M., Lane County, Oregon. Subject to the existing County Road right of way through same.

Southwest one-quarter (SW 1/4) of Southwest one-quarter (SW 1/4) Section Eight (8) Township Twenty-Two (22) South Range Three (3) West Willamette Meridian, as plotted and recorded in Lane County, Oregon. Containing 40 acres, more or less.

and that the plaintiff is the owner in fee simple to said real property as set out in the complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiff; and for such other and

LEGAL NOTICES

further relief as to the Court may see just and equitable.

This summons is published pursuant to order made by HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Court Judge for the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 26th day of September, 1944, which order directs that this summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a newspaper of general circulation, printed in Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon, and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 26th day of October, 1944. Date of first publication September 28, 1944. Date of last publication October 26, 1944. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiff. Residence and Post Office Address: Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon. 7-5t-11.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that I, DOROTHY COVALT, the undersigned, as Administratrix of the Estate of GEORGE RAYMOND BOWMAN, deceased, have filed with the County Clerk of Lane County, State of Oregon, my Final Account, and that by order of the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, has set the time and place for the hearing to be had for said Final Account at the hour of ten o'clock a. m., Tuesday, October 31, 1944, and all persons having any objections thereto shall file the same in writing at or before the time for said hearing. DOROTHY COVALT, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 7-5t-11.

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. FRANCIS McLAUGHLIN and MAUDE McLAUGHLIN, his wife, Defendants,

vs.

HORACE MANN and LUELLA MANN, his wife; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein. Defendants.

TO: HORACE MANN and LUELLA MANN, his wife; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein. Defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or before the ninth day of November, 1944; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof, the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the complaint, to-wit: that you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land or premises herein described, to-wit:

South Half of Lot No. 4 in Block No. 2 in D. G. McFarland's Second Addition to Cottage Grove, in Lane County, State of Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of said property as set out in the complaint herein. And that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatsoever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs, and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem just and equitable.

This summons was published under an order made by the HON. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge for the State of Oregon, for Lane County, on the 10th day of October, 1944, which order directs that this summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation printed in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the ninth day of November, 1944.

Date of first publication October 12, 1944. Date of last publication November 9, 1944. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for plaintiffs. Residence and post office address Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon. 9-5t-13.

NOTICE OF SALE

TRACT OF LAND IN COTTAGE GROVE

The Oregon State Highway Commission has for sale a triangular tract of land in Block 22 of Long and Landers Addition to Cottage Grove, in the vicinity of Fifth Street and Quincy Avenue, which tract would be suitable for a service station site.

Scaled bids for the purchase of this tract will be received by the State Highway Commission in the Stock Exchange Room, first floor, Imperial Hotel, Portland, Oregon,

LEGAL NOTICES

at 9:00 a. m., Tuesday, October 24, 1944.

Proposal forms and full information for bidders may be obtained at the office of the State Highway Commission, State Office Building, Salem, Oregon.

Each bid must be submitted on a proposal form obtained from the State Highway Commission, and must be accompanied by a certified check or bank draft in an amount not less than ten percent (10%) of the amount bid.

The right is reserved to reject any or all proposals or to accept the proposal deemed best for the State of Oregon.

OREGON STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION.

By: H. B. GLAISYER, Secretary.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Scaled bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O and C Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon will be received until 2:30 p.m. Pacific War Time, November 7, 1944 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above.

IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 3 (NW 1/4 SW 1/4), and lot 4 (SW 1/4 SW 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3430 M. feet Douglas Fir, 85 M. feet Red Cedar, 55 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$13,150.00, will be considered. Timber to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 17 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 2 (NW 1/4 NE 1/4), and Lot 1 (NE 1/4 NE 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2785 M. feet Douglas Fir, 220 M. feet Incense Cedar, 260 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$14,775.00, will be considered. Timber to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 17 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 11, all merchantable timber designated for cutting in the NW 1/4 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 915 M. feet Douglas Fir, 50 M. feet Hemlock, 50 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,800.00, will be considered. Timber to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 17 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 11, and merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4 SE 1/4 and S 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2535 M. feet Douglas Fir, 15 M. feet Hemlock, 160 M. feet Red Cedar, 10 M. feet White Fir, 35 Red Cedar poles. No bid for less than \$3.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir, \$7.50 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$9,990.00 will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 5 (NE 1/4 NE 1/4) and Lot 6 (NW 1/4 NE 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4080 M. feet Douglas Fir, 345 M. feet Hemlock, 5M. feet Incense Cedar, 50 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$21,370.00, will be considered. Timber to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 19 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on all of the NE 1/4 SE 1/4, portion of the SE 1/4 SW 1/4, and of the S 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3030 M. feet Douglas Fir, 30 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$15,225.00 will be considered. In the SE 1/4 SW 1/4 only trees

Wants

40 acres—4 1/2 miles West—10 in cult. bal. wood and pasture. All fenced. Filberts, family orchard. Water piped to house from spring. Barn, chix house. Price of \$3200.00 includes horse, chickens, tools and buzz saw. Merl King with Rodman's and Hilton, Phone 216. 10-1t.

WOMAN WANTED: for bakery work. Good pay. Convenient hours. Doleman's Bakery. 10-1t.

FOR RENT: Furnished upstairs apartment. Utilities furnished. Apply to 1329 West Main St. 10-1tp.

MEN WANTED: One log haul man, two yard men. Top wages. Transportation furnished from Cottage Grove and Drain. Apply at

blazed and marked with orange markers are included in the sale. In the S 1/2 SE 1/4 only trees North of a blazed line are to be cut. T. 20 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 5 (SW 1/4 NW 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1160 M. feet Douglas Fir, 65 M. feet Hemlock, 130 M. feet Red Cedar, 72 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, \$7.50 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$6,631.50, will be considered. T. 21 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 370 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$1,505.00, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4, E 1/2 NW 1/4, and N 1/2 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 6795 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet Hemlock, 115 M. feet Red Cedar, 175 M. feet Incense Cedar, 35 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$3.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$24,598.75, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 11, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S 1/2 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2580 M. feet Douglas Fir, 100 M. feet Hemlock, 100 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$5.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$13,945.00, will be considered. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 16th day of October, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 10-2tc-11.

mill or at 111 Madison avenue, Cottage Grove. Lovegren Lumber Co. 10-1tc.

FOR SALE: Circulator heater, practically new. Lee Nixon, 1265 East Adams. 10-1tc.

We buy, sell trade anything of value. Open Sundays & evenings. Creswell Trading Post, Phone 116. 10-4tp-13-tfc.

WATER WELL DRILLING See your water well driller before you buy or install your pump. Pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23, J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Ore. 10-tfc-xxx

FOR SALE: 4 year old cow. Gentle easy to milk. \$50.00. Frank Richardson, Harvey Road. 10-1tp.

HELP WANTED: Lady to care for invalid lady and light house work. Two adults. Phone 110R or 112J. 10-1tp.

TO GIVE AWAY: Small black young female part Spaniel dog. 311 First St. 10-2tp-11.

DO YOUR PAINTING and paper hanging now by first class painter. O. G. Clark, Box 121, City. 10-4tp-12.

FOR SALE: Will sacrifice very fine davenport and chair set for \$198.00 cash. 110 North River Road, city. 10-1tp.

I WILL NOT BE RESPONSIBLE for any bills contracted by any one but myself, Pvt. William E. Simpson. 10-3tp-12.

FARMERS DESKS, Office desks Blankets and Heaters. Ladies desks—filing cabinets Callahan's Furniture Store, Eugene 8-4tc-11.

WANTED: 10 to 25 acres to buy with 6 to 8 room house, water and electricity. Will lease for long time or purchase outright. Land for pasture and some cultivation will be suitable. c/o Roy Lyon, 1630 Ash Ave., City. 8-4tp-11.

WATCHMAKER Watch and clock repairing. All work guaranteed. Open evenings. "Ted Kangas"—1542 Ash Ave. 8-tfcxxx

NOTICE: Jack McKee has been employed at Bill's Barber Shop, Cottage Grove Hotel, afternoons and all day Saturdays. 8-tfcxx

WANTED TO RENT: High school teacher, wife and one son wish lease or permanent rental of comfortable two bed room home. Can furnish excellent references. Kindly contact A. M. Mason, Grove court motel. 6-tfc.

WANTED: For mill: Planer feeders, car loaders and green chain men. For woods: Buckers and fallers. Family houses available or bus service each day. Row River Lumber Co., Phone 4335. 39-tfc.

Fertilize your lawn now. We can supply you with all kinds of field and pasture seeds, Beidler Feed and Seed Store, phone 57. 9-tfc.

HELP WANTED: Woman or girl for general house work. Room, board, good wages. 136 North 8th St. 10-4tc-13.

STROUT SELLS REAL ESTATE. Over 75,000 sales made thru nationwide advertising. BUYERS FROM EVERYWHERE—List your farm, home, land, etc., with our Representative, A. D. Mitchell, 1126 Birch Ave. Phone 71, Cottage Grove, Ore. 7-tfc.

HAVE THAT STOVE repaired now before cold weather. Cottage Grove Foundry. 3-tfc.

FOR SALE OR TRADE: For 1 or 1 1/2 h.p. engine, one Johnson "Iron Horse" washing machine engine. Light motorcycle engine preferred. John Overholser, Lorane route. 9-2tp-10.

Designed for Living

400 acre stock ranch—10 miles East of Cottage Grove, on good country road, 22 acres tillable, bal. pasture and timber, some piling. Family orchard and filberts. Barn, large two story chicken house. New 5 room modern house, plywood finish inside, fireplace, bath, dandy kitchen, inlaid linoleum in living room and kitchen. Elec. Priced to sell at \$8000.00. Will give some terms.

One acre—just 12 miles from Cottage Grove, close to store and on school bus line. Double garage and chix house. Five room modern log house with fireplace, elec., bath, hot and cold water. Really a beautiful place. \$2650.00.

One acre with three room house, 1 1/2 miles on South 6th St. Elec. Fenced. \$1050.00. 1/2 acre more or less, three miles from city limits. Three room house with elec. and water, newly decorated inside. Material to complete exterior. Stationary tubs. Close to mills and store. \$1050.00.

MERL KING with

RODMANS & HILTON

701 Main st.

Phone 216

2 bedroom home—modern, newly decorated, new linoleum on kitchen, 2 bedrooms can be finished upstairs, 2 large lots, beautiful shade trees garage and woodshed. VACANT; BUY AND MOVE IN.

Very neat home, modern, ground 114x120, raspberries, boysenberries and several fruit trees, chicken house and yard, woodhouse, garage. \$2750.00, cash, possession when bought.

We have other town properties and farms for sale.

SEE OR CALL

Alice J. Breedlove

1120 W. Main—Phone 126 R

with

Culp & Lake, Realtors

36 East 11th St. Phone 3420

Eugene, Ore.

FOR SALE: 18 bred does. Must sell at once. Cheap. Lawrence Prime, Saginaw. 9-2tp-10.

FOR SALE: 1 team A-1 horses. Or will trade for young sheep; also have weaner and feeder pigs. L. R. Goodwin, 1/2 mile south London Store. 9-3tp-11.

HOUSE WIRING

Prompt Service BRISBANE ELECTRIC 1049 E. Main Phone 73 9-2tc-10

HELP WANTED: 3 laborers wanted. Inquire Cottage Grove Lumber Co. 2-tfc.

FOR SALE: 8 bundles of No 2 shingles. See W. C. Martin at Sentinel office. 10-tfc.

FOR SALE: Extension dining table and six upholstered chairs. Good 7 tube radio. Pair of metal laundry trays on castors. Call at cabin 10, Woodsons Auto court. 10-1tp.

FOR SALE: One Ford tractor; two bottom plow; disk. \$200. Mrs. Glen Adams, old Lorane Road. 10-1tp.

LOST: Pair tortoise rim glasses. Reward if returned to Chas. Boslaugh at Square Deal Barber Shop. 10-ttc.

FOR SALE: A few New Zealand white does. C. F. Maxon, 817 South 3rd street. 10-1tp.

FOR SALE: Heater and small range. Both in excellent condition. Lambert Jacobs, Gowdville. 10-1tp.

FOR TRADE: 2 Jersey-Guernsey heifers, one coming 2 and one coming 3 years. Will trade for young milch cow. Will Norwood, Latham. 10-1tp.

THANK YOU

Having found my heifers, thanks to a fifty dollar reward, I wish to express my appreciation to the following men who so kindly gave their time and effort in my behalf: Alfred White, Walt Pitcher, Elliott and Roy Jones, Slim Talbot. 10-ttc.

"THANK YOU"

A heartfelt "Thank You" to the many friends and relatives, who through their deeds of loving kindness comforted us during our recent sorrow. Also our deep appreciation to the various organizations who paid such beautiful tribute to our loved one.

Indeed, to him who always gave so much, has it likewise been returned, with full measure, pressed down and running over.

Mrs. Robert Shields and family Mrs. Grover Devine and family Mrs. Mary M. Wilson. 10-ttc.

WANTED: Ties or short timber hauling. D. F. Roddy, Route 1 Creswell. 10-1tp.

LOST: Toulouse geese, some with green or yellow bands. Liberal reward for information regarding same. O. E. Vrooman, Rt. 1, Creswell. Former Beach ranch. 10-1tp.

WANTED TO RENT: 3 bedroom unfurnished house. Will lease and take full responsibility. Urgent. 1536 So. 6th street, Phone 45. 10-3tc-13.

LOAN WANTED: On 354 acres farm well located in northern Douglas county and well secured. Write O. K. Box 66, city. 10-1tp.

Cottage Grove lodge Loyal Order of Moose No. 810 meets every Tuesday evening 8:00 p. m. at Phillips hall.

Kidneys Must Work Well

For You To Feel Well

24 hours every day, 7 days every week, never stopping, the kidneys filter waste matter from the blood. If more people were aware of how the kidneys must constantly remove surplus fluid, excess acids and other waste matter that cannot stay in the blood without injury to health, there would be better understanding of why the whole system is upset when the kidneys fail to function properly. Burning, scanty or too frequent urination sometimes warns that something is wrong. You may suffer nagging backache, headaches, dizziness, rheumatic pains, getting up at night, swelling. Why not try Doan's Pills? You will be using a medicine recommended the country over. Doan's stimulates the function of the kidneys and help them to flush out poisonous waste from the blood. They contain nothing harmful. Get Doan's today. Use with confidence. At all drug stores.

DOAN'S PILLS



EDGAR SMITH
A Successful Oregonian
for U. S.
SENATOR

Paid Adv. Mr. Smith Goes to Washington Club
L. M. Burton, Sec'y, Corbett Bldg. Portland



DEFEAT PROHIBITION

That's "The Joker" that "slipped in" the Burke Bill. Yes, "The Joker" says you cannot serve guests at your club or even in your own home without severe penalty. Don't let "the dyes" put it over again in 1944 as they did in 1918.

Beat "The Joker" Vote 313X NO

Paid Adv. THE ANTI-PROHIBITION COMMITTEE OF OREGON
G. J. McPherson, Chairman, Pearson-4th Ave. Bldg., Portland