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notice o r  niieniif*m HU t
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, 

that by v irtue  o f un execution nml 
order of sal»- Ixsued out of the c i r ­
cuit Court of the Stole of Ore­
gon fo r Lane County August 22, 
194-1 upon and fiurauant to u de> 
cree duly given and made by Mild 
court August 22, 1944 in unit
therein (lending In which The 
Kind National Bank of Eugene, 
of Eugene. Oregun. wax p la in tiff! 
and Approved Flax Company, a 
corporal ton, win» defendant which 
onler of »ale waa to me directed 
and commanded me to a ril the 
real untU |n,ixoiia l property here­
ina fte r deacrlbed w ith  their ap­
purtenances, to satisfy cei tain 
liens and charges In said decree 
specified, I w ill on Friday, (he 
22nd ilay t i l Heptemlier, 1944 ,,t 
one o'clock I ’ . M. at the front 
laouthwcNtl door of the County 
Courthouse in Eugei^, I^ane 
County, Oregon, o ffe i for sal»- and 
sell in public 'auction for caxh, 
subject to nalemptlon an provld- 
»•»I by luw, the follow ing (l<-s<-rlb»-<l 
real and |x-r»onul property, lo u d :

Beginning nt a point 1.1 HI 
chain» eaat of the northwest 

corner of Section 7 of Township
17 South of Itange 4 West 
of the W illam ette Meridian; 
and running thence Sooth ¡Mi 
chain», east -I chains, south 
It) chains to Hie center line of 
»aid Section 7. thence West on 
»aid center line 5 HH chain», 
more or l<*»», to a »tone in th>- 
»outhwe»t lunik of Clear 
Lake, the* flee north to the 
southwesterly luink of Clear 
Ia»ke. thence north to Him 
southwesterly edge of t ha- 
channel o f »aid lake, thence 
northwesterly along the line 
of xaial channel to it» In ter­
section w ith  the west line of 
Section 7, thence north to the 
center of the channel of Mild 
lake, thence northwesterly 
fo llow ing »aid center (me of 
channel to It*  intersection 
w ith  the north line of Sb-ctinn 
12. Township 17 South, Range 
5 We>t anil thence ta u t 21 59 
chains to the place of begin­
ning In Lane County, Oregon, 
containing 56 5o acre», more 
or less
Ti»gether w ith  the building», 
structure«, plan«« and fixture« 
thereon located, and the tene­
ments, hereditaments ami ap­
purtenance« thereunto be­
longing or in anywise apper­
taining.
A ll fu rn itu re , fivtures, tools, 
machine», machinery, ap|u«ra* 
tu», utensils, implements ami 
equipment used or kept or 
Intended fo r  use in carrying 
on the bu»ine«s heretofore 
conducted by the defendant 
on the above o»*»crlbcd real 
property Including, but w ith ­
out prejudice to the general­
ity  at the foregoing desrnp- 
flon of personal property the 
follow ing described personal 
property, to w i t :
13 Montgomery Ward Wagons
1 McCormick jseering Trac­

tor. Model 1W4, .Serial No.
BI 12258

1 O live r 70 Tractor, Serial 
No. 306SQ5

1 Chevrolet T ruck w gin pole 
Ar Winch a ttc lun t. M otor No. 
215043249
I Chevrolet T ruck w. gin pole 

A winch a ttchm t, Motor No.
T699246

al water pump, size 2 4 , Im­
peller 14 4 ”

I I-.Icetrir driven 
Model 6ii|9 
7552N

I American push 
truck

I Portatile platform , looo- 
fsiund He'll»-», Mortis make

1 Size 2 Ray t i l l  Burner, No. 
39677. Type AP 10

I McCormick Deering Bay 
Baler, siZ(. 17x22, No. 12896
1 Fully ei|uip|M'd Scutching 
machine No. (_ consisting 
of 2 breakers and 2 ¡»eaters
2 42-lnch 2Kin»-h scutching 
machine breaker»

1 complete tow cleaning ma­
chine

1 implement tra ile r
.1 flekl binders
About 600 ton» ut flax straw
Als.ut 175,000 His of s»utch- 

log tow
A ll of said im i ami personal 

properly w ill be »„|,j 
I be |M-rsonal profN-rty w ill not la- 
on view at the filaci- of safe hoi 
U|s>n I he request ut any proposed 
bidder | w ill on the dal.- preced­
ing »aid »ale exhibit any of said 
personal property lo 
••d purchaser.

water pump, 
Serial No.

type hand

any propos-

DATED this 24th day of Aug­
ust, 1944.

<». E CROWE, Sheriff 
pro-tem of Lum- County, 
Pregón 2-5t-6

MITII E (IE FINAL 
SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, 
D ial HARRY CASTLE, Adminis­
tra to r of the Estate of NELDA 
1 AS ll.E , Deceaiu-d, has lih-d 
herein hi« Einal Account w ith  the 
< bunty Court, Lam- County, State 
of Oregon, and said Court has 
fixed and appointed Friday, the 
29th day of September, 1941 at the 
hour of 10 o’clock a. m. io the 
County Court Roam, County 
Court House, Eugene. |j»ne Coun­
ty, State of Oregon, os the time 
ami plucc for th»- hearing of ob­
jections, if any, to the Final Ac­
count ami Final Settlement of said 
estate. Dated and firs t published 
August 31, 1944. HARRY CAS­
TLE. Administrator. HERBERT 
W LOMBARD, Attorney.

3-5t-7.

Ty|ie A 
3 phase, 

R P M.

M o r s e  Motor, 
1 HP. 3 filia»»-, 
220 volt. No.

I Fairbunk» Morse ] IIP  Mo­
to r 3. phase MO, cycle 220 
volt. No. 418217, R P M. 
1730;

1 Falrbanks Motor,
No. f 18248, HP.
220 Volt, lit) cycle 
1730;

1 Kuirbunks 
tyfie “ Q ",
60 cycle.
418991. RP.M 1730

7 Falrbanks Morse, 1 I I I
phase, MO cycle, Motors

1 Century Motor, 15 IIP  
phase, 60 cycle 220 volt, 
RPM 1760, No. F 60776

1 Century Motor, 1 HP. 60 
cycle, 220 volts. No. W21 

1 Falrbanks Morse induction 
niolor. Tyf»c "O " No »99120

3 H l

3

DISTRICT L A N  D ( lEEICE. 
ROSEBURG, OREGON, Notice is 
hereby given that on May 4, 1944. 
Thomas N ami Ida II. Hollund, 
Route 5. Eugene. Oregon filed ex­
c h a n g e  up|ih<-ntion Roseburg 
022893 under the Act of July 31, 
1939 <53 st.it m i ,  fo r the 
S W .N W 4  sec. 29. T. 1» S„ R 
5 W., W .M . Oregon, containing 
40 acres, in lieu of the S E '*S W ‘» 
sec 25. T. 20 S„ R 4 W , W.M 
( >regon containing 40 acres. This 
notice is for the purfiOKC of a l­
lowing all fs-rsons having bona 
fid«- object am to i h»- proporu-d ex­
change an opportunity to file  
their objection! in Oils office, to­
gether w ith evidence that a copy 
thereof has lx-en served on the 
applicant«, w ith in  ¡10 days from 
tin- date of firs t publication. 
GE<>RGE F I N L E Y. Register. 
Frist publication September 7, 
1944.______________________4-5t-8

NOTH E TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY G IV EN : 
That the undersigned lias been 
appointed Adm inistratrix »if the 
Estate of W ILBER T O. W ILSON. 
Deceased, by the County Court of 
Lam* County by an order dated 
September 8. 1944 A ll persons
having claims aguinet said estate 
are hereby notified to present the 
same, duly verifu-d, w ith  profier 
vouchers, to the umlcrsigncd nt the 
E iw  Office of Herbert W. Lom­
bard. First National Bank Budd­
ing, ('u llage Grove, Oregon, w ith in  
six months of the date of the firs t 
publication of this notice. Dated 
ami firs t published September 14. 
1941 M ABELLE C. WILSON, A,l- 
in in i» lr;itrix . HERBERT W. LOM ­
BARD, Attorney.

5-5»-9.

LEGAL NOTICES
Port land, Oregon, w ill be re,<-ive»l 
un lll 2:30 p. in., Pacific W ar Time, 
< a-ioli»-r 3, 19-44, fo r the pur­
chase of tim ber upon tracts here­
inafter described; »-och hid must 
state tin- amount per M. f»-et B M . 
which w ill be offered fo r each 
»la-ea-s ami the to ia l consideration 
which w ill is- paid fo r the timber. 
No hid for less than th«- apprais­
ed value w ill la- considered. Each 
bid must be submitti-d in dupli­
cate an<l is- accompanied by a »!<•- 
|M»sii in the form of a certified 
check in favor of the Treasurer 
of I lie United Slates. The (ie|M>sit 
of any successful bidder w ill lie 
credited on the contract. Payment 
In lu ll a t the time of filin g  the 
contract Is required in sales 
amounting Io $2560 or less. For 
copies »if the form  of pro|x>sul, 
form  of contract and bond, terms 

of payment, amount of deposit rc- 
quin-d w ith  bid, amount of bond 
n-qulred w ith  contract and other 
information, a jip licatlon should be 
made Io I lie address »hown above. 
IN  LAN E OOUNTY: T  18 S „ R 
7 W., Se<-. 17, a ll merchantable 
iiinlier designated fo r ru ttin g  on 
tie- S W 'kS E 1», estimated fo r the 
purpose ut this sale Io be 670 M. 
Rs-t Douglas F ir, 50 M feet Rc<l 
(\s la r. No bid fo r less Hum $5 50 
per M. I l B. M. fo r Hie Douglas 
Fir, $150 per M, ft. B. M fo r 
the R»-d Ci-dar, or a to ta l pur­
chase price of $3,760.00, w ill la- 
considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W , 
Sec 11, a ll merchantable tim ls-r 
designated for »-Utting on the 
S E 4 N E ’ «, and N L-S E 1», i-stima- 
t»-d fo r Hu- purpose of this sale 
to la- 3345 M feet Isiuglas F ir, 
190 M. feel Hemlock. 370 M. 
feet R»sl Cedar, 10 M. feet In ­
cense Cislar. No bid fo r less than 
$5.25 |»-r M .lt R.M. fo r the Doug­
ins Eir, $2.00 jie r M ft B M. fo r 
the Ile ip lix  k und R»-»l Ci-dar. $1.50 
p»-rM ft.B.M . fo r the Irf-ense Ce­
dar, or a tota l purchase price of 
$18,696.25, w ill lx- considered. A ll 
tim ber cut from each ut the above 
doscrilx-d ar»*us must lx- manu­
factured in the local m arketing 
area designated by the O. and C. 
Adm inistration unless otherwise 
authouzi-d by the Chief Forester. 
I t  th«- unit priees hid ure above 
those authorized liy MPR 460, 
they w ill he reduced to the m axi­
mum perm itted under that order. 
In case of two o r m»»re identical 
bids fo r Hie same tim lx-r, the suc­
cessful bidder w ill be selected on 
the basis of romparative impor­
tance to the w ar program and 
ab ility  to fu rthe r the objectives 
of Hie Act of August 28, 1937. The 
right is hereby reserved to -waive 
technical defects in this adver­
tisement; to r«-J»-ct a ll bids, or to 
award I he tim ix-r to r th«- amount 
of th»- highest hid to other than 
the highest tinkler when necessary, 
pursuant to the Act o f August 
28, 1937 ( 50 S lat. 874', in order 
to provide a continued supply of 
tim ber to locul industry so as to 
assure the permanence of the 
community w hich is dependent u(i- 
<in such industry. Dated at P ort­
land. Oregon, Hus 9th day of Sep- 
ti-mlx-r, 1944, W. II. Horning, 
Chief Forester, O. At C. Adm inis­
tration.___________________ 5-2t-6.

NOTICE OF FINAL 
HETTLKMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY G IVEN : 
That P H ILO  W ILLA R D , Execu­
tr ix  of the Last W ill and Testa­
ment of (). H W ILLA R D . De- 
ce ised, has filed herein her F ina l 
Account w ith  th»- County Court, 
Lane County, State of Oregon, and 
said Court has fixed and appointed 
Tuesday, the 17th »lay of October, 
1944 at the hour of 10 o’chick 
a. m. in  the County Court Room, 
County Court House, Eugene, 
Lane County. State of Oregon, as 
the time and place fo r the hear­
ing of objections, i f  any, to the 
Final Account and fina l settle­
ment of said »-state. Dated and 
firs t published Scptemtx-r 14, 1941. 
PH ILO  W ILLAR D , Executrix. 
HERBERT W. LOMBARD. A tto r­
ney^________ 5-5t-9.

1
60 cycle, RPM 17X5

Westinghouse Motor, '■» 
HP, 3 phase, RPM 3500 

1 General Ek-ctri»- induction 
Motor, Type 1, 60 cycle, 10 
HP, 1140 RPM 

1 Fairbanks Induction Motor, 
Type "Q  ", 5-25 IIP . 3 phase, 
60 cycle, RPM 1470 Blow­
er Type

1 General E lectric Mot»<; 
7'i» HP, Induction type 60 
cycle, RPM 1160, No.
5578196

1 Falrhnnks Morse Induction 
Motor, 7 ‘ » HP, 50 cycle, 
RPM 960, No. 338518

1 General E lectric Induction 
Motor, 7 4  HP, 60 cycle, 
RPM 1160, No. 557957H

I Kieneriil E lectric Induction 
Motor, 30 IIP , 60 cycle, 
RPM 1200, No. 14113815, 
Tyfie "K T "

1 1 HP Motor, Master Make 
No. 37

9 Tow Shakers
17 Bernard Flax Pulling Ma­

chines
2 Binders w ith  gasoline eng. 

attchm cnt, Ser.
1 Skillsaw  Portable Klee, 

blower w. 50' cord, No. 
29670, Model X

1 Sturtevant Blower, size' 55, 
No, 0251 I?

3 Whlppers, Nos. 029, 030, 031 
1 Adams leaning wheel grad­

er No. 7, serial No. 2-167
1 Fairbanks Mörse Centrifug-

notice de seasonal 
determination

Notice is hereby given that the 
employers listed below have la-en 
determined Io lie seasonal »-mploy- 
ers w ith in  Hie meaning of Sect ion 
126-707 O.C L A. Any interested 
party may roquest a hearing be­
fore the Commission w ith in  ten 
days a fter final publication of this 
notice. The "off-8»*ason”  (in calen­
dar weeks) of each Reasonal cm 
ploycr in Lane County is aa stated 
below:

E'rank P Bigelow, 40-10; Brun­
ner Dryer, 47-32; Eastern Lane 
County Eire Patrol Ass'n., 41-20; 
Eugene Em it Growers Ass'll.. 
I Eugene), 1-24; Eugen»> Eru ii 
(¡rowers Ass'n. (Junction C ity ), 
1-29; Thomas J Hart, 36-9; Hans 
C. Rasmussen, 1-25; Western Lane 
E'oresl Protective Ass n., 42-21: 
W illam ette Valley Seed Co. 43-25.

( )RKGON U N EM PLt)YM ENT 
COMPENSATION COM­
MISSION

Dated and firs t published this 
14th day of September, 1941. 
Date of last publication 28th day 

of September, 1944.
5-31-7.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE
Sealed b id s ,  marked outside 

"Bid fo r T im ber," and addressed 
to Hie Chief Forester, O and C. 
Adm inistration, 901 G u a r d ia n  
Building. Portland. Oregon w ill be 
received un til 2:30..p.m. Pacific 
War Time, October 3, 1944
for the purchase of tim ber U|xm 
tracts hereinafter described; each 
bid must slate the amount per M. 
feet B.M., which w ill be offered 
for each species and I he to ta l con- 

. sideration which w ill lie paid fo r 
timber. No bid fo r less than 

the appraised value w ill lx- con­
sidered. Each bid must be sub­
m itted in duplicate and be accom­
panied by a deposit in the form  of 
a certified check in favor of the 
Treasurer of Hi»- United States. 
The deposit of any successful bid­
der w ill lx- credited on the con­
tract. Payment in fu ll at the 
time of filing  Hie eontraet is re­
quired in sales amounting to 
$2500 or less. For copies of the 
form of proposal, form of contract 
and bond, terms
amount of deposit 
hid. amount of bond required w ith

NOTICE OF T IM BER  SALE. 
Scaled bi»is, marked outside "B ill 
for T im lx-r ", and adilressed Io the 
Chief Forester, O. and C Admln- 
istrution, 901 Guardian Building,

W  a n t a d s
FOR SALE: Nice Chester White 

g ilt 2<X) ¡Miun»ls or better,
$25.00. Odus William.«, Lorane 
route, phone 2F2. 6 -ltp

FOR Sale; Good tan w inter coat 
size 14, s ligh tly  used. $10.00.

Odus W illiams, Lorane Route, 
phone 2F2 6 - ltp

FOR KALE: 12 ewes and 20 lambs.
W ill sell cheap. Boone Humph­

rey. 2 'z miles oul Row River
Road

FOR KALE: Y’/i acre place, 2 
Ix-droom house; double garage: 

chicken house; e lectricity. 2*/i 
miles east .Collage Grove, firs t 
house east of steel bridge on Row
River Road. Any day except Sat­
urday. 6 - llp

FOR RENT: 
housekeeping

Avenue.

E’OR KALE: .Small nwxk-rn 3-room 
house. Independent water sys­

tem; acre ground, just outside 
c ity  lim its. Inquire at 531 Adams
Ave. 6-1 tp.

FOR SALE OR RENT. 534  acres, 
27 farm  land, 264  pasture; 

house; barn; large new chicken 
house, water pip»-d to house; go»xi 
orchard; team; wagon; harness, 
some t iiim  machinery; hay. One
20 acre farm  fo r rent. W. W.i Chrisman, 710 South 3rd street. 
Phone 145L. _________ 6. ltp .

FOR RENT: The Combs ranch 3 
miles south London. (Jood build­

ings, pasture and some tillab le  
land: well and cr«-ek. Mrs. Roy
Hutchison, Knox H ill, Cottage 
Grove. 6 -ltp .

UP stairs ligh t 
room 225 Adams 

6 -ltp .

W AN TED : Farm er telephone.
Phone 463. D rain collect. 6 -ltc.

FOR SA LE : 80 acre ranch, good 
buildings, orchard, v ln e . y a r d  
plenty of running water. Six miles 
south on 99. L. A. Crane, Lorane 
route. 6 -ltp .

FOR SALE : Used thr»-e horse 
disc. McLaughlin's Furn iture

Store. 6 -ltp .

TOR SALE J»-rs»-y - Guernsey
milch cow, coming 4. Fresh 3

months. Don Owen, 1627 West
Main. 1 tp.

FOR KALE: Two lots on paved 
street w ith  4 room old house. 3 

blocks from  K. P. Depot. 129 5th
St., Phone 117R, Cottage Grove.

____________ 6-3tp-8

LOST on West Main. Mexican 
fire  opal ring Has sentimental 
value. Reward. Mrs. Wm. Prager, 
1428 Ash Avenue, Phone 226R. 
_______________________ 6-2tp-7.

FOR SALE: Two good Jersey- 
Guernsey m ilch cows. 13 white 

leghorn hens and about th ir ty  
broilers. J. N. Freeman, 1 4  miles 
above forestry camp. 6 -ltp .

FOR SALE.’ : 1 »-ombination wood 
and el«*ctric Lang range. $195.00.

C. E. Neet. phone 246 or 74..
6 -ltp .

FOR SALE: Prunes. $1.00 per 
bushel. U-pick. Anna Burkett,

Divide. _  ___________ 6-ltp .

LOST: Small brown and white 
toy eollie dog from  Charles Ron-

»•r home, 1KI9 W Main. Ei iday. 
She answers to the name of ’T o y ” . 
Reward offered*
W AN TED : Custom plowing. O. 
M. Patten. Phone 13-F-2 4-3tp-6.

SHEEP FOR SALE o r w ill let on 
shares. Mrs. John M urry, Black- 1

butte route, phone 39F16. 5-21p-6

E L ÍX IR  SANDING  Wanted. H. W 
Perkins, 104 N orth  6th St 

_______ _________ 5-3tp-7.;

E'OR SALE: 15 tons grxxi red oats, 
2 4 c  per (»und. John Van N ort- 

w ick, phone 147R. 5-2tp-6

E'OR S A LE  o r let on shares. 37 
<-wes and one buck Curtis Veatch, 
Phone 6E'3, Creswell. 5-3tp-7.

W AN TED : For m ill: Planer feed­
ers, car loaders and green chain 

men. For woods: Buckers and 
fa lle n . Fam ily houses available 
o r bus service each »lay. Row
R iver Lumber C o , Phone 43J5.

39-tfc.

PADS ... PADS
We now have a supply of 5x8 

and 3x5 pads but they won't last 
long. Get yours now. The Senti­
nel. 51-tfexxx

.SPECIALS
Blankets Bed Spreads — $14 

mattress selling at $10.95. Calla- 
han's F urn iture  Store. 3-4tc-6

E'OR SALE: 7 room modern house, 
unfinished, 4  acre ground. EYir- 

nished o r unfurnished. Call 9F22.
_____ ______ 4‘3lP'6-

W IL L  PAY CASH fo r a good 
búngalo piano. Don Kahler,

| phone 17ET1.____________ 6-2tc-7.

FOR SALE: Modern two bed 
room house, close to grade and 

, high schools. 616 South 7th St.,
Cottage Grove. 1-tfcxx

WOMEN W A N TE D : fo r laundry 
work. Apply Coilins Laundry, 

phone 44. 50-tfcxxxx

HELP WANTED: 
wanted. Inquire

Lumber Co.

3 l a b o r e r s
Cottage Grove 

2-tfc.LOST OR STRAYED: 9 months 
old Guernsey bull calf. Please 

notify  Rufus Parsons, 2 4  miles 
up Bennett Creek or w rite  Box
411, c ity. 6 -ltp .
W AN TED  TO REiNT: Highschool 
teacher, w ife  and one son wish 
lease or permanent rental of com­
fortable two bed room home. Can 
f u r n i s h  excellent
K ind ly contact A. M. Mason, « -
Grove court motel. 6-tfc. . . . .  . ...--------------- -------LOST: Gold link  bracelet w ith
W A N TE D : .Battery radio. E’hone green stones at Safeway Store 

38F21 between the hours of Saturday. Valued as keepsake

W AN TED  TO RENT: By Los
Ar>gcles couple 2 bedroom house 

or larger w ith  elec-tricity prefer­
ably in country. W ill post bond, 
pay bonus and furnish bank refer­
ences.

Call Granada 843 Los Angeles 
references^ Exchange, collect. J. W. Keene.

5-2tc-6

9:30 a. m and 3:00 p. m. 6 -ltp .

FOR SALE. Young O. I. C. sow.
W. H. Reeve, 5 miles west. Cot­

tage Grove. 6 -ltp .

E'OR SALE: 5 weeks old Guernsey 
heifer ca lf from fine cow. $12.00 
i f  taken at one-. Mrs. M artin  
Olson. Saginaw. 6 -ltc .

from  service man overseas. Return 
to Safeway or call 168Y. 5-2tp-6.

FOR SALE: 1931 
goo»i condition.

Chevrolet coupe 
Phone 247.

6-ltc.

FOR SALE : 4 months old Jersey- 
Guernsey heifer ca lf from  regis- 
lered stock. W. C. M artin  at Sen- 
tinc l office._________________4 -ltp

LEGAL NOTICES

FOR SALE: Six room house w ith  
bath, large screened in porch.

2 lots. L ights and water. Varie ty 
of fru it trees. Inquire at 719 Birch 
Ave. 6-ltp .

HAVE T H A T  STOVE repaired 
now before cold weather. Cot­

tage Grove Foundry. 3-tfc

W ILL EXCIIA?I3E 120 acres 15 
miles north of Grants Pass fo r 

mixierni house in Cottage Grove.
E. J McMullen. 638 N orth  10th 
St. 5-2tp-6.

HOUSE AND LOT fo r sale 
quire 721 Washington Ave.

 5-2tp-6.

2 bedroom  hom e, close in, lo t  60x120, $2200 00 T erm s 

O th er C ity  a n d  su b u rb a n  hom es fo r  sale. See o r Call

Alice J. Breedlove
1120 W M ain — P hone 126 R 

w ith

C u l p  &  L a k e ,  R e a l t o r s
36 E a s t  11th S t P hone 3420 

E u g en e , Ore.

GOD IS 
M Í

GO-PILOT
Jiy COL.

ROBERT L. SCOTT
W SU F ts tu rra .

(Continued from  page 2) 
sly to see riiy American

friend.
Through the doorw.-addted a dark, 

dirty little man—evidently a former 
fruit-vendor in New York. He saw 
me, stopped his Croatian talk, threw 
out his arms, and cried, "Son of a 
beetch! Son of a beetch!” To my 
discomfiture, that was the only Eng­
lish he seemed to know. But I 
halved my steak with him and pat­
ted him on the back as he tried to 
talk, and in the end I guess his com­
patriots really thought their friefid 
spoke American anyway. I could 
hear them calling me Americar.ski.

I  continued on, keeping clear of 
the tourist routes, and finally, after 
a forty-five-day trip from Cherbourg, 
I  rode into Constantinople. Here I 
came close to getting in a real jam. 
Back through my life I had concen­
trated on scouting, archery, and fly­
ing—anything but girls. 1 could re­
member crossing the street to keep 
from having to talk to them. But 
that real bashfulness was far behind 
me. Now I had about gone to the 
other extreme; I had found dates in 
Paris, Venice, and other cities, and 
had had a fine time.

Before reaching Turkey, I  had 
been warned by the head of the 
American Express in Sofia that I 
should be very careful in Istanbul 
and should confine myself to the 
Americanized Turks in and around 
the Pera part of the city. They told 
me above all to stay clear of Ga- 
lata—the old Greek and Turkish sec­
tion. As luck ruled, however, my 
first acquaintance was from Galata, 
and that night 1 headed for the city 
of the veiled women.

Well, even with right ideas the 
men in that quarter had the wrong 
idea. I saw the danger just in 
time, and even then I had to jump 
through a window—glass and all— 
into an alley. I can hear the yells 
even these years afterwards as I 
ran through Galata back to Pera for 
my motorcycle. Stopping at the ho­
tel Just long enough to check out. I 
was off in more dust for Scutari and 
East in Asia to Ankara.

So raising the veil of a Moslem 
female shortened my stay in Con­
stantinople. Even in my return to 
the West from Ankara, I found a 
way to dodge the city on the Helles­
pont by getting a Black Sea steam­
er and crossing North ot Istanbul to 
land at Varna in Bulgaria. From 
here I crossed the Danube at Rust- 
chuk and went to Bucharest.

My -spirits had risen a little after 
missing the Turkish knives in Ga­
lata, but here 1 found a cablegram 
awaiting me. The Comptroller Gen­
eral had ruled that the Economy 
Act of June, 1932. affected all offi­
cers on leave. He had decided that 
I, like many others, was on leave 
without pay. My orders were to 
report to the nearest American Em­
bassy for duty; I remember that 
they were signed by McColl. I sent 
my champagne back and ordered 
beer, for the money for this trip 
had been borrowed against my three 
months' leave pay. Here I was, 
thousands of miles from home and 
Randolph Field, where my flying 
training would start. If I reported 
to some ground officer in Europe, I 
would probably never get to fly.

Anyway, just to make sure, I 
hopped on my motorcycle that night 
and headed for Texas by way of 
Budapest — Linz — Bingen-on-the- 
Rhine—and Paris. I sold the motor­
cycle in Cherbourg and ooarded the 
Bremen for a quick trip home I  
had used pay that I was expecting 
to get during leave, and I'd be pay- 

. Ing the bank for a long time. But 
I resolved right then and there that 
I would pay that money back from 
the Air Corps at Randolph Field and 
not from some desk in an Embassy.

And so I came at last to the Air 
Corps Training Center at Randolph 
Field, Texas.

I t ’s hard to describe my feelings 
as I walked into the North gate ot 
that field and down the nearly mile- 
long road to the Bachelor Officers 
Building, where. I was to report. It  
seemed that all my life I had wait­
ed for this moment. Now at last 
the great day was at hand when I 
would begin my government flying 
training There above me against 
the blue Texas sky I could see the 
roaring airplanes in their Army col­
ors. As my feet carried me into the 
field I  could hear the rhythm of the 
steps seeming to say in cadence, 
‘This is it! This is what I ’ve waited 
for all the days of my life!”

In October, 1932, I was assigned 
to Lieut. Ted Landon for primary 
flying training. I imagine this as­
signment was about as momentous 
for him as it was for me—for ufter 
alt I must have been quite a prob­
lem, w ith all I thought I knew about 
flying and the eagerness with which 
I approached military aviation.

iTO CONTINUED)

10 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for 
less than $5.50 per M .ft.B.M . fo r 
the Douglas Eir. $3.1X1 per M.ft. 
B.M. fo r the Hemlock, $2.00 per 
M .ft.B.M . fo r the Red Cedar, 
$75 ea. fo r the Red Cedar Poles, 
or a to ta l purchase price of 
$9,140.00, w ill be considered. A ll 
tim ber cut from the above de- 
cribed ar»-a must lx> manufactured 
in the local m arketing area 
designated by the O. and C. Ad­
m in istration unless otherwise au­
thorized by the Chief Forester. 
I f  the unit prices bid are above 
those authorized by MPR 460, 
they w ill be reduced to the m ax-' 
imurn perm itted under that order. 
In case of two or more identical 
bids fo r the same timber, the 
successful bidder w ill be selected 
on the basis ol comparative im - ! 
(mrtance to the war program and 
a b ility  to fu rthe r the objectives 
of the Act of August 28. 1937. 
The right is hereby reserved to i 
waive technical defects in this 
advertisement: to reject a ll bids, I 
o r to award the tim ber fo r the I 

of payment, amount of the highest bid to other j 
required w ith  than the highest bidder when!

necessary, pursuant to the Act of

Special Values
in

Reg. $24.50 sellers

Reg. $24.00 sellers 
Special a t $16.50

Several to choose 
from

Präger Hardware
and

Furniture Store
contract and other information, I August 28, 1937 ( 50 Stat. 871), j 
application should he made to the | in order to provide a continued!

- '-.• '-•Zr i -  •if»1

address shown above.
IN  LAN E COUNTY: T. 15 S„ R. 
8 W., Sec. 35, a ll merchantable 
tim ber designated fo r cutting  on 
Hie S E 4 S E 4 , estimated for the 
pur|x>se of this sale to lx» 1515 M. 
feet 'Douglas F ir, 140 M. feet 
Hemlock, 190 M. feet Red Cedar,

supply of Hmtx»r to l»x-al Indus-. 
try  so as to assure the perman­
ence of the community which is 
dependent U|x>n such industry. 
Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 
19th day of September, 1944. W. 
H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and 
C. Administration. 6-ltc.
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IT S THE TELEPHONE RUSH.
Every night thousands of service 
men and womeq dash to the near­
est telephones to talk with families 
and friends at home. Most of the 
Long Distance calls from camps and 
naval stations are crowded into a 
few short hours.

Many circuits are likely to be 
c awded at that time and it helps 
a lot when you keep the lines clear 
from 7 to 10 for service men and 
women.

Buy W ar Bonds for Victory

THK PACIFIC TILEPHONK AND TELEGRAPH COMPANY
5 2 4  M ain  P h o n e  S3


