

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County.
HENRY H. WHITWER, and
LILLIE E. WHITWER, his wife,
Plaintiffs,
vs.

ARLETTA ADAMS, as Administrator of the Estate of CHARLES W. CURRY, Deceased; ARLETTA ADAMS, a widow; CHARLES SUTTON, a widower; MARIAN SUTTON, a widow; ELSIE SUTTON, his wife; VERDA MILLER, her husband; CLARENCE SUTTON and NELLIE SUTTON, his wife; ROBERT HOFFMAN, a widower; PAUL HOFFMAN, a single person; FLOYD HOFFMAN, a single person; ELVA DAVIDSON and JOHN DOE DAVIDSON, her husband; JOHN HOFFMAN, a single person; CELIA ANDERSON and JOHN DOE ANDERSON, her husband; COLE O'NEAL CALLOWAY and ETHAN CALLOWAY, her husband; KATE CURRY, a widow; CLARENCE CURRY and MARY CURRY, his wife; WILLARD CURRY and MARY JANE CURRY, his wife; MINNIE CURRY, a widow; NO-RA CURRY, a single person; CHARLES CURRY, a single person; ELLEN JONES and JOHN DOE JONES, her husband; NEO-MA CURRY, a single person; ROBERT CURRY, a single person; MARY JANE CURRY DOE and JOHN DOE, her husband; LEE CURRY, a single person; RUTH CURRY, a single person; ORA CURRY, a single person; MAGGIE CURRY, a single person; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein; JOHN SUTTON, a widower.

Defendants
TO: ROBERT HOFFMAN, a widower; PAUL HOFFMAN, a single person; JOHN HOFFMAN, a single person; CELIA ANDERSON and JOHN DOE ANDERSON, her husband; KATE CURRY, a widow; CLARENCE CURRY and MARY CURRY, his wife; WILLARD CURRY and MARY JANE CURRY, his wife; MINNIE CURRY, a widow; NO-RA CURRY, a single person; CHARLES CURRY, a single person; ELLEN JONES and JOHN DOE JONES, her husband; NEO-MA CURRY, a single person; ROBERT CURRY, a single person; MARY JANE CURRY DOE and JOHN DOE, her husband; LEE CURRY, a single person; RUTH CURRY, a single person; ORA CURRY, a single person; MAGGIE CURRY, a single person; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased, also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the Complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or before the 7th day of September, 1944, and if you fail to so appear and answer for want thereof, the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land and premises herein described, to-wit:

Beginning at a point 74 and 18 4/3 rods north of a point 15.56 chains south 89° 53' east from the southerly line of the corner of the W. T. Osburn Donation Land Claim No. 41, thence north 143° 21' 22" rods, thence north 89° 53' west 44 rods, thence south 143° 21' 22" rods and thence south 89° 53' east 44 rods to the place of beginning, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of the said described property as set out in the Complaint herein, and that you and each of you be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever there-in, adverse to the plaintiffs, and for such other and further relief as to the Court may seem just and equitable.

This summons is published pursuant to an order made by the Honorable G. F. Skipworth, Circuit Judge of the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 9th day of August, 1944, which order directs that this summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation, printed and published at Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 7th day of September 1944. Date of first publication August 10, 1944. Date of last publication September 7, 1944. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs, residence and postoffice address, Cottage Grove, Oregon.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF ADMINISTRATOR'S SALE OF REAL PROPERTY

Notice is hereby given that, under authority of an order made by the County Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, duly made and entered on the 9th day of August, 1944, the undersigned Administrator of the Estate of ALBERT HESS, Deceased, will sell at private sale all of the following described property, to-wit:

The Northwest Quarter of the Southwest Quarter of Section Three in Township Twenty-three South of Range Three West of the Willamette Meridian, in Lane County, State of Oregon, containing forty acres.

Said sale will be made on and after the 7th day of September, 1944, and bids will be received at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, until a reasonable bid shall have been received; said sale to be made for cash. HENRY HESS, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 52-51-4

NOTICE OF SHERIFF'S SALE
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that by virtue of an execution and order of sale issued out of the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County August 22, 1944 upon and pursuant to a decree duly given and made by said court August 22, 1944 in suit therein pending in which The First National Bank of Eugene, of Eugene, Oregon, was plaintiff, and Approved Flax Company, a corporation, was defendant which order of sale was to me directed and commanded me to sell the real and personal property hereinafter described to satisfy certain liens and charges in said decree specified, I will on Friday, the 22nd day of September, 1944 at one o'clock P. M. at the front (southwest) door of the County Courthouse in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, offer for sale and sell at public auction for cash, subject to redemption as provided by law, the following described real and personal property, to-wit:

Beginning at a point 13.84 chains east of the northwest corner of Section 7 of Township 17 South of Range 4 West of the Willamette Meridian; and running thence South 30 chains, east 4 chains, south 10 chains to the center line of said Section 7, thence West on said center line 5.88 chains, more or less, to a stone in the southwest bank of Clear Lake; thence north to the southwesterly bank of Clear Lake; thence north to the southwesterly edge of the channel of said lake, thence northwesterly along the line of said channel to its intersection with the west line of Section 7, thence north to the center of the channel of said lake, thence northwesterly following said center line of channel to its intersection with the north line of Section 12, Township 17 South, Range 5 West and thence East 21.59 chains to the place of beginning in Lane County, Oregon, containing 56.50 acres, more or less.

Together with the buildings, structures, places and fixtures thereon located, and the tenements, hereditaments and appurtenances thereunto belonging or in anywise appertaining. All furniture, fixtures, tools, machines, machinery, apparatus, utensils, implements and equipment used or kept or intended for use in carrying on the business heretofore conducted by the defendant on the above described real property including, but without prejudice to the generality of the foregoing description of personal property the following described personal property, to-wit:

13 Montgomery Ward Wagons
1 McCormick Deering Tractor, Model 1W4, Serial No. BH2258
1 Oliver 70 Tractor, Serial No. 306805
1 Chevrolet Truck w. gin pole & Winch attachmt, Motor No. 215043249
1 Chevrolet Truck w. gin pole & winch attachmt, Motor No. T699246
1 Fairbanks Morse 1 HP Motor 3, phase 60, cycle 220 volt, No. 418217, R.P.M. 1730;
1 Fairbanks Motor, Type A No. 118248, — HP, 3 phase, 220 volt, 60 cycle, R.P.M. 1730;
1 Fairbanks Morse Motor, type "Q", 1 HP, 3 phase, 60 cycle, 220 volt, No. 418994, RPM 1730
7 Fairbanks Morse, 1 HP, 3 phase, 60 cycle, Motors
1 Century Motor, 15 HP, 3 phase, 60 cycle 220 volt, RPM 1760, No. F 60776
1 Century Motor, 1 HP, 60 cycle, 220 volts, No. W21
1 Fairbanks Morse induction motor, Type "O" No. 899120 3 HP, 60 cycle, RPM 1735
1 Westinghouse Motor, ½ HP, 3 phase, RPM 3500
1 General Electric induction

LEGAL NOTICES

Motor, Type 1, 60 cycle, 10 HP, 1140 RPM
1 Fairbanks Induction Motor, Type "Q", 5-25 HP, 3 phase, 60 cycle, RPM 1470—Blower Type
1 General Electric Motor; 7½ HP, induction type 60 cycle, RPM 1160, No. 5578196
1 Fairbanks Morse Induction Motor, 7½ HP, 50 cycle, RPM 960, No. 338518
1 General Electric Induction Motor, 7½ HP, 60 cycle, RPM 1160, No. 5579578
1 General Electric Induction Motor, 30 HP, 60 cycle, RPM 1260, No. 14113815, Type "KT"
1 HP Motor, Master Make No. 37
9 Tow Shakers
17 Bernard Flax Pulling Machines
2 Binders with gasoline eng. attachment, Ser.
1 Skilaw Portable Elec. blower w. 50' cord, No. 29670, Model X
1 Sturtevant Blower, size 55, No. 62502
3 Whippers, Nos. 027, 030, 031
1 Adams leaning wheel grader No. 7, serial No. 2467
1 Fairbanks Morse Centrifugal water pump, size 2½, impeller 14½"
1 Electric driven water pump, Model 6019, Serial No. 7552N
1 American push type hand truck
1 Portable platform, 1000-pound scales, Morris make
1 Size 2 Ray Oil Burner, No. 38677, Type AP 10
1 McCormick Deering Hay Baler, size 17X22, No. 12896
1 Fully equipped Scutching machine No. 1, consisting of 2 breakers and 2 beaters
2 42-inch 28-inch scutching machine breakers
1 complete tool cleaning machine
1 implement trailer
3 field binders
About 600 tons of flax straw
About 175,000 lbs. of scutching tow

All of said real and personal property will be sold en masse. The personal property will not be on view at the place of sale but upon the request of any proposed bidder I will on the date preceding said sale exhibit any of said personal property to any proposed purchaser.

DATED this 24th day of August, 1944.
O. E. CROWE, Sheriff
pro-tem of Lane County,
Oregon. 2-51-6

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.
Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, September 19, 1944, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M. which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above.

IN LANE COUNTY: T. 21 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 370 M. feet Douglas fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M. ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$1,505.00, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE¼, E½NW¼, and N½SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 6795 M. feet Douglas fir, 40 M. feet Hemlock, 115 M. feet Red Cedar, 175 M. feet Incense Cedar, 35 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$3.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$24,598.75, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 11, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N½NE¼, and SW¼NE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4410 M. feet Douglas fir, 100 M. feet Hemlock, 375 M. feet Red Cedar, 90 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$5.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.00 per M.ft. B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$24,237.50, will be considered. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That HARRY CASTLE, Administrator of the Estate of NELDA CASTLE, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Account with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed Friday, the 29th day of September, 1944 at the hour of 10 o'clock a. m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Account and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published August 31, 1944. HARRY CASTLE, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 3-51-7.

Wants

HOP PICKERS

We are now registering pickers at the J. W. Seavey yard, route 1, Springfield. Begin picking about September 1st. 160 acres of irrigated river bottom hops. Clean yard. Three weeks picking. Price for picking, 3½ cents lb. Cabins and tents furnished for campers. Store on ground. Phone Springfield 8525 for further information or write J. W. Seavey Hop Co., Route 1, Springfield. 2-2tc-3.

IMPROVED GOLDEN Bantam sweet corn. Roy S. Hands, Phone 1F2, ½ mile north of steel bridge on Delight Valley road. 2-3tp-4.

WANTED: 48 base piano accordion. Phone 15F22. 2-2tp-3.

HELP WANTED: 3 laborers wanted. Inquire Cottage Grove Lumber Co. 2-tfc.

WANTED: Man with drag saw to cut wood on shares or by cord. Phone 13F22. 2-2tp-3.

FILING SHOP OPEN in Veatch building, 27 So. 6th St. Filing cross cut saws our specialty. 2-3tp-5.

FOR RENT: The Combs ranch 3 miles south London. Good buildings, pasture and some tillable land; well and creek. Mrs. Roy Hutchison, Knox Hill, Cottage Grove. 3-1tp.

FOR SALE

Three room house, corner lot.

Two-bedroom house. Two lots on corner.

Four-bedroom house, 1-1-3 acre family orchard. Close in.

A. D. MITCHELL

1126 Birch—Phone 71

WATER WELL DRILLING

See your water well drill before you buy or install your pump. Pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23, J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Ore. 36-tfc.

All kinds of welding, both electric and acetylene. Machinery repairing and blacksmithing. O. K. Welding Shop, in new location, 10th and Jefferson. 1-tfc.

WANTED: For mill: Planer feeders, car loaders and green chain men. For woods: Buckers and fallers. Family houses available or bus service each day. Row River Lumber Co., Phone 4335. 39-tfc.

WANT TO RENT: Farm, 10 or more acres tillable, pasture, fair buildings. Electricity. Within 10 miles of Cottage Grove. E. F. Brown, Gen. Del. Cottage Grove. 2-2tp-3.

LEGAL NOTICES

O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 26th day of August, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 3-2t-4.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That HARRY CASTLE, Administrator of the Estate of NELDA CASTLE, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Account with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed Friday, the 29th day of September, 1944 at the hour of 10 o'clock a. m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Account and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published August 31, 1944. HARRY CASTLE, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 3-51-7.

FOR SALE: Six room house with bath, large screened in porch. 2 lots. Lights and water. Variety of fruit trees. Inquire at 719 Birch Ave. 3-1tp.

FOR SALE: Grass hay, oat and straw. All baled. Roy Hutchison. 3-1tp.

ROOM AND BOARD: For 2 working men, 1142 Birch Avenue. Mrs. Don Clabby. 3-1tc.

FOR SALE: Modern two bed room house, close to grade and high schools, 616 South 7th St., Cottage Grove. 1-tfcxx

WOMEN WANTED: for laundry work. Apply Collins Laundry, phone 44. 50-tfcxxx

BOSWELL SPRINGS
Bathe in our calcium water. Beneficial for all forms of rheumatism. Competent attendants. Call or write for information to Boswell Hotel, Yoncalla, Oregon. 52-4tc-3.

HELP WANTED: Woman or girl. Permanent place, good wages, 136 North 8th St. tfc

ARC WELDING: up to an inch or thicker. C. L. Evenson's Shop, Gowdville, Foot Mountain. Phone 2F5. 52-4tp-3

FREE SHEET
With purchase of good Serta mattress at Callahan's Furniture Store, Eugene. 1-3tc-3.

FOR SALE: Barn for lumber. You tear down. About 6 miles from Cottage Grove, Row River Road. Telephone 5-F-12. Alsea Hawley. 1-3tc-3.

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom house, bath, electricity. About 1 acre land. 4½ miles south Cottage Grove on Pacific highway. Terms. Telephone 5-F-12. Alsea Hawley. 1-3tc-3.

FOR RENT—Floor sanders, waxers and a vacuum cleaner. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 33-tfc.

PADS — PADS
We now have a supply of 5x8 and 3x5 pads but they won't last long. Get yours now. The Sentinel. 51-tfcxxx

FOR SALE: Used Maytag gas motor. Brisbane Electric, 1049 East Main, phone 73. 3-1tc

THREE-FORTHS ACRE, fenced, new five room house and garage on good road, 2½ miles east of town. Inquire 4th house east steel bridge, Row River. J. M. Cole. 3-1tp.

HAVE BOUGHT PLACE known as the Max Kruse place. Order your Elberta peaches now. Henry C. Hansen, B.B. Rt. Phone 37F23. 3-1tp.

FOR SALE: Trailer house, 600-16 tires, \$150. Paul Hirst. Write Box 322, City. 3-1tp.

FOR SALE or would let on shares, 50 head of sheep. Also White Leghorn hens. Mrs. John G. Murry, Black Butte route, Cottage Grove, Oregon. 3-1tp.

FOR SALE: Used doors, windows and frames. 435 South River road. Phone 111-JX. 3-1tc.

FOR SALE: Good used toilet. Inquire at 31 North Fifth St., Cottage Grove. 3-1tc.

WANTED TO RENT: Furnished house or apartment within city limits. Adults. Box 505 City. 3-2tp-4.

FOR SALE or exchange for property in vicinity of Klamath Falls: 300 acre sheep ranch, neat 5 room house and other buildings. Address MD, Box 66, Cottage Grove. 3-1tp.

FOR SALE: Used Wesco automatic electric shallow well pump with pipe fittings and foot valve, \$60.00. C. E. Brown, Phone 244. 3-1tc.

SPECIALS
Blankets—Bed Spreads — \$14 mattress selling at \$10.95. Callahan's Furniture Store. 3-4tc-6.

LOST: Brown marble effect fountain pen with black top. Name "Ole Stolt" inscribed. Reward \$1.00. Sentinel office. 3-1tp.

FOR SALE: Gravenstein apples and Bartlett pears, \$1.50 bushel. You pick. Fred Laubach, 2 miles west. 3-1tp.

5-room house in excellent condition, newly decorated inside and out, new roof, concrete foundation, underground sprinkling system, wired for range. Two bedrooms, bath, dinette, lovely kitchen. Lct 50x180. If you have \$4000.00 cash don't miss this.

170 acres of timber and grazing land—springs and year-round creek—priced for quick sale \$1500.00.

40-acres 4½ miles west—10 acres tillable—all fenced—6 room old house, with water piped from a spring, barn, chix house. Family orchard, filberts and walnuts. Wood. Price \$3500 with terms.

6 acres all fenced with woven wire, some wood, close to school and on Hi-school bus line. Has two houses, both with bath and hot and cold water, dandy built-in kitchens. 15 miles East. \$3500.00. terms.

MERL KING

with

RODMANS & HILTON

701 Main st:

Phone 216

FOR SALE: My property at 132 North 7th St. Two 50x100 lots, high and dry. Fine for business or close in residence property. Price \$5000. Write Mrs. Mae Ostrander at P. O. Box 205, Eugene, or Box 218A Rt. 4, Eugene, Ore. 3-3tp-5

FOR SALE: 4 reg. yearling Romney bucks. 1 2-yr-old reg. Romney buck. H. K. Metcalf. Phone 115J. 3-2tp-4

TO GIVE AWAY: 9-months-old male dog, cross between terrier and Spaniel. Call Friday or after Tuesday morning next week, 624 North 10th St. 3-1tp

WANTED TO RENT: 2 or 3 bedroom modern house, immediately if possible by reliable party. R. I. Aubrey, East Madison St. 3-1tc

FOR SALE: 1 oak dining table; 1 iron frame springs; 2 nice oak parlor chairs; fruit jars; heavy cupboard; miscellaneous canned fruit. 1 mile out south 6th St. Look for signs. 3-1tp

MEN WANTED
Wanted 1 log haul man; 2 yard men. Top wages. Transportation from Cottage Grove and Drain. Lovgren Lumber Company, Curtin, Oregon. Apply at mill during working hours or 111 Madison St., Cottage Grove, after 7:00 p. m. 3-1tc.

WANTED: 1 racket setter; 1 edgerman. Good pay. Six day week. Phone 100, Cascade Lumber Company. 3-1tp.

WANTED TO LEASE OR RENT: 5 room modern house or larger. Will guarantee good care. Phone 159. 3-1tp

FOR SALE: Walnut davenport table. Inquire 141 Third St. 3-1tc

FOR SALE: ¾ h. p. heavy duty electric motor. 1004 Villard Court, phone 168-R. 3-1tc

LOST: Will person finding naval identification card please return to Sentinel Office or Walter Fraser. Phone 1F6, Reward. 3-1tc.

FOR SALE: Royal portable typewriter. Mrs. C. J. Kem 3-1tp

FOR SALE: 3 year old Guernsey heifer, fresh J. W. Graham, Black Butte route, 2 miles south. Phone 21F12. 3-1tp

HELP WANTED: Men or women 18 to 35, part or full time. Inquire local Safeway manager. 3-1tc

FOR SALE: Petite prunes and sweet corn. Order in advance. Hugh Trunnell, phone 17F11. 3-1tc

I CAN IDENTIFY the person who picked up a new inner spring mattress on the Disston Road Sunday, August 27. Return to 85 South River Road and no questions, otherwise, I'm going to the police. 3-1tc

FOR SALE: Baby calf. Van's Dairy, Box 292, City. 3-1tp

FOR SALE: Bartlett pears, \$1.00 bushel, you pick, or \$1.50 picked. Bring containers. Martin P. Olsen, Saginaw. 3-1tp.

FOR SALE: Bartlett pears, 50c bushel. Bring containers and pick. John Trunnell. Phone 17F14. 3-1tp.

Hand Test
Experienced gardeners test soil with a squeeze. If the soil sticks together it is too wet. If it falls apart, it is ready.

Hog Cholera
Hog cholera outbreaks in the U. S. last year, as reported, were about one-fourth greater than in 1942. Veterinarians attribute this increase to the fact that there were more hogs on farms.

Soil Stirred
Weeds will never grow in a garden if the soil is kept stirred with a hoe or cultivator. In loose, sandy soil, a rake or toothed cultivator will do the stirring; in heavier soil, a hoe may be necessary.

Military Nursing
Military nursing, as it is known today, had its rise as a result of the Crimean war.

Watch Your Kidneys!
Help Them Cleanse the Blood of Harmful Body Waste
Your kidneys are constantly filtering waste matter from the blood stream. But kidneys sometimes lag in their work—do not act as Nature intended—fail to remove impurities that, if retained, may poison the system and upset the whole body machinery.

Symptoms may be nagging headache, persistent headache, attacks of dizziness, getting up nights, swelling, puffiness under the eyes—a feeling of nervous anxiety and loss of pep and strength. Other signs of kidney or bladder disorder are sometimes burning, scanty or too frequent urination.

There should be no doubt that prompt treatment is wiser than neglect. Use Doan's Pills. Doan's have been winning new friends for more than forty years. They have a nation-wide reputation. Are recommended by grateful people the country over. Ask your neighbor!

DOAN'S PILLS

Professional Cards

FUNERAL HOMES
KARL R. MILLS, Mortician.
Phone 202

SMITH FUNERAL CHAPEL
—Phone 101. 6

DENTISTS
DR. W. E. LEBOW—Dentistry
—No. 1 Omer Apartments
Cottage Grove, Ore. Phone 35

PHYSICIANS
H. AXLEY, Physician and Surgeon—Evenings by appointment. Over Kem's for Drugs. Cottage Grove, Oregon.

DR. KATHERINE SCHLEEF,
M. D.—Physician and Surgeon. Apartment 10, Omer Apartments. Phone 247.

ATTORNEYS
HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney at Law. First National Bank building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. Phone 94.

ALTA KING — Lawyer, 613 Main street. Office phone 254J. Res. phone, 28F31. Cottage Grove, Ore.

INSURANCE
TITLE ABSTRACT CO., 881 Oak St., Eugene, Ore. Edward F. Bailey, Pres. Abstracts, Title Insurance, Etc.

MATERNITY HOMES
BUTLER MATERNITY HOME
—136 N. 8th St. Phone 176Y. 41

129 North 9th Street

Phone 252

Clark's Super Service

ELECTRIC and GAS WELDING

With Pick-up and Delivery Service

EXPERT AUTO REPAIRS

All Work Guaranteed

5-PLY TIRES — BATTERIES — ACCESS