

ROYAL NEIGHBORS

The Royal Neighbors met Tuesday night in the Eagles hall for a business meeting. Mrs. Frye was a visitor and Mrs. Cora Teeters, a

charter member, was present. Refreshments were served by Edna Burleson and Peggy Stickrod. A birthday cake in honor of Rosa Currin was served. The Camp also presented Mrs. Currin with a gift.

Sight Destroyers

Syphilis and gonorrhea are among the major destroyers of sight, and these diseases are responsible for more than 15 per cent of blindness in the United States.

Notice of School Meeting

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN to the legal voters of School District No. 45, of Lane County, State of Oregon, that a SCHOOL MEETING of the said district will be held at Auditorium of Jefferson building on the 12th day of May, 1944, at 8:00 o'clock P. M. for the purpose of discussing the budget for the fiscal school year, beginning July 1, 1944, and ending June 30, 1945, hereinafter set forth.

BUDGET

Schedule I	Estimated Receipts and Available Cash Balances	General Fund
1	Estimated available Cash Balance at beginning of fiscal year for which this budget is made	\$ 6,000.00
2	Estimated Receipts from Delinquent Taxes during fiscal year for which this budget is made	2,000.00
3	Estimated Receipts from County School Fund	9,000.00
4	Estimated Receipts from Elementary School Fund	5,000.00
5	Estimated Receipts from State Irreducible School Fund	1,100.00
15	Estimated Receipts from Other Sources	500.00
16	Estimated Total Receipts and Available Cash Balance	\$24,200.00

Schedule II—General Fund	Estimated Expenditures	Expenditures and Budget Allowance for Six Months of Current School Year	Expenditures for Three Fiscal Years Next Preceding the Current School Year
ITEM	Elementary School Estimated Expenditures for the Current School Year	Expenditures in Detail	Expenditures in Detail
		7-1-43 to 1-1-44	1943-1944 1942-1943 1941-1942 1940-1941

I. GENERAL CONTROL:					
1. Personal service:					
(1) Superintendent	1,620.00	\$ 759.96	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 1,399.92	
(2) Clerk	300.00		300.00	240.00	
(3) Stenographers and other office assistants	350.00	260.00	300.00	650.00	
(4) Compulsory education and census	100.00	90.00	90.00	50.00	
2. Supplies	120.00	41.15	120.00	106.90	
3. Elections and publicity	100.00	97.63	50.00	69.30	
4. Legal service (clerk's bond, audit, etc.)	75.00	87.50	80.00	83.40	
5. Other expense of general control:					
(1)	100.00	36.28	100.00	72.77	
6. Total Expense of General Control	2,765.00	\$ 1,372.54	\$ 2,560.00	\$ 2,672.29	\$ 2,596.11

II. INSTRUCTION—Supervision					
1. Personal service:					
(1) Principals	2,300.00	\$ 833.30	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 1,800.00	
(2) Vice Principal	1,836.00	666.65	1,600.00	1,374.96	
(3) Stenographers and other office assistants	600.00	75.00	500.00		
2. Supplies, principals and supervisors	100.00	50.40	100.00	103.00	
5. Total Expense of Supervision	\$ 4,836.00	\$ 1,625.35	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 3,277.96	\$ 3,236.99

III. INSTRUCTION—Teaching					
1. Personal service:					
2 teachers at \$ 3,600.00					
3 teachers at 1,752.00					
3 teachers at 1,704.00					
7 teachers at 11,508.00					
1 part-time teacher 1,160.00					
1 part-time teacher 864.00					
Teachers:	\$27,500.00	\$ 9,111.05	\$23,400.00	\$17,730.00	
Substitute teaching	300.00		350.00		
2. Library supplies, repairs	30.00	15.20	30.00	15.95	
3. Supplies (chalk, paper, etc.)	950.00	286.75	950.00	813.24	
4. Textbooks	700.00	503.55	700.00	694.03	
5. Post-War Reserves—Supplies			200.00		
6. Other expense of teaching	50.00	5.05	50.00	9.36	
7. Total Expense of Teaching	\$29,530.00	\$ 9,921.60	\$25,680.00	\$19,262.58	\$19,314.59

IV. OPERATION OF PLANT					
1. Personal service:					
(1) Janitors and other employees:					
Head Janitor \$1,440.00					
Part-time Janitor 980.00					
Summer work 480.00					
2. Janitors' supplies	450.00	186.79	450.00	443.38	
3. Fuel	600.00	54.00	500.00	436.50	
4. Light and power	400.00	104.70	400.00	368.84	
5. Water	110.00	4.64	110.00	86.78	
6. Telephone	80.00	35.55	80.00	70.67	
7. Gas	50.00	10.22	50.00	18.21	
8. Other expense of operation	50.00	1.59	50.00		
9. Total Expense of Operation	\$ 4,640.00	\$ 1,497.49	\$ 3,890.00	\$ 3,484.08	\$ 3,729.01

V. MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS					
1. Repair and maintenance of furniture and equipment	\$ 250.00	\$ 67.73	\$ 250.00	\$ 120.61	
2. Repair and maintenance of buildings and grounds	700.00	385.93	500.00	467.88	
Post-War Furniture and Equipment	200.00				
(2) Post-War Reserve Bldgs. & Gds	500.00		200.00		
3. Other expense of maintenance and repairs			100.00		
4. Total Expense of Maintenance and Repairs	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 453.66	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 588.49	\$ 1,421.53

VI. AUXILIARY AGENCIES					
1. Health service:					
(1) Personal service (nurse, etc.)	\$ 360.00		\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	
(2) Supplies and other expenses	40.00		40.00	17.48	
4. Total Expense of Auxiliary Agencies	\$ 400.00		\$ 400.00	\$ 377.48	\$ 385.16

VII. FIXED CHARGES					
1. Insurance	\$ 500.00		\$ 500.00	\$ 759.63	
Ind. Acct. Fees	50.00	25.00	25.00	25.00	
4. Total Fixed Charges	\$ 550.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 525.00	\$ 784.63	\$ 776.98

VIII. CAPITAL OUTLAYS					
4. New furniture, equipment and replacements	\$ 400.00	\$ 81.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 225.67	
Post-War Reserve, equipment and replacements	350.00		100.00		
6. Other capital outlays					
(1) Library books	300.00	42.83	300.00	274.43	
7. Total Capital Outlays	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 123.83	\$ 700.00	\$ 500.10	\$ 562.14

IX. DEBT SERVICE					
1. Interest on warrants	\$ 25.00		\$ 50.00		
3. Total Debt Service	\$ 25.00		\$ 50.00		

X. EMERGENCY					
	\$ 1,000.00		\$ 1,000.00	\$ 295.80	

Total Schedule II—General Fund—Total estimated expenses for the year—sum of items 1-6, II-5, III-7, IV-8, V-4, VI-4, VII-4, VIII-7, IX-3, X

	\$46,446.00	\$15,019.47	\$40,055.00	\$30,947.61	\$32,318.31	\$28,612.89
Schedule VI—Summary of Estimates of Expenditures, Receipts and Available Cash Balances, Tax Levies						
ESTIMATION OF TAX LEVY						
Total estimated expenditures						\$46,446.00
DEDUCT:						
Total estimated receipts and available cash balances (Schedule I)						24,200.00
Amount necessary to balance the budget						22,246.00
DEDUCT: (Nil)						
Balance to be raised by taxation						
ADD:						
Estimated amount of taxes that will not be collected during the fiscal year for which this budget is made						2,000.00
Total estimated tax levies for ensuing fiscal year						24,246.00
Analysis of estimated tax levies:						
Amount inside 6% limitation						\$ 8,485.99
Amount outside 6% limitation						\$15,760.01

Indebtedness					
1. Amount of bonded indebtedness (include all negotiable interest-bearing warrants issued under Section 111-1016, O. C. L. A.)	NONE				
2. Amount of warrant indebtedness on warrants issued and endorsed "not paid for want of funds"	NONE				
3. Amount of other indebtedness	NONE				
4. Total Indebtedness (sum of items 1, 2, 3)	NONE				

Dated this 17th day of April, 1944.
Signed: WORTH HARVEY, District Clerk
W. L. WORKMAN, Chairman, Board of Directors
Approved by Budget Committee April 17, 1944.
VICTOR CHAMBERS, LLOYD H. GRIGGS
JOHN A. LONG, GLADYS HALL
GEO. W. MATTHEWS, JOE T. SMITH
ROY E. SHORT, ALVIS WICKS
Signed: R. P. BOYCE, Secretary Budget Committee
W. L. WORKMAN, Chairman Budget Committee

South Lane-North Douglas Market Page

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. GLADYS V. LINDSAY and W. C. LINDSAY, her husband, Plaintiffs,

vs. SAMUEL W. McILVAINE and AGNES McILVAINE, his wife, and the unknown heirs of any of the above named parties, if any are deceased; also, any other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in Plaintiff's Complaint on file herein.

Defendants. TO: SAMUEL W. McILVAINE and AGNES McILVAINE, his wife, and the unknown heirs of any of the above named parties, if any are deceased; also, any other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in Plaintiff's Complaint on file herein.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the Complaint of the Plaintiffs filed herein against you in the above entitled suit on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or before the 18th day of May, 1944; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the Plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: that you, and each of you, be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatever in or to the lands and premises herein described:

Lots 3 and 6 and the North one-half of lots 2 and 7 in Block 1 of the Original Plat of the Town of Cottage Grove, as platted and recorded at page 288 of Volume G Lane County Oregon Deed Records, in Lane County, Oregon; and that the Plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of said property as set out in the Complaint herein; and that you, and each of you, be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim thereto adverse to the Plaintiffs; and for such further relief as to this Court shall seem just and equitable.

This Summons is published pursuant to an order made by the Honorable G. F. Skipworth, Circuit Judge of the State of Oregon for Lane County, on the 11th day of April, 1944, which order directs that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation published at Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 18th day of May, 1944. Date of first publication April 20, 1944; date of last publication May 18, 1944.

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs, Residence and Post Office address: First National Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon, 36-51-40

NOTICE OF SCHOOL ELECTION UPON QUESTION OF INCREASING TAX LEVY OVER AMOUNT LIMITED BY SECTION 11, ARTICLE XI, STATE CONSTITUTION.

Notice is hereby given that an election will be held in School District No. 45 of Lane County, State of Oregon, at office of Superintendent in Jefferson building, polls to be open from two o'clock P. M. to seven o'clock P. M. on Friday May 12, 1944 in said school district, for the purpose of submitting to the legal voters of said district the question of increasing the tax levy for the year beginning July 1, 1944 and ending June 30, 1945, over the amount limited by Section 11, Article XI of the constitution of Oregon.

The reasons for increasing such levy are: The levy within the constitutional limitation is based on the highest levy within the last three years plus 6%, this amount being \$2,485.99, which amount is not sufficient to pay the costs of operation of the school as provided for in the budget of the district from July 1, 1944 to June 30, 1945.

The amount in excess of the 6% limitation, proposed to be levied for said year is \$15,760.01.

Dated this 17th day of April, 1944.

Attest: WORTH HARVEY, District Clerk. W. L. WORKMAN, Chairman Board of Directors.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned have been appointed as Executor and Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of SAMUEL K. ADAMS, Deceased by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said

estate are hereby required to present the same, duly verified, with proper vouchers, to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of first publication of this notice. Dated and first published April 20, 1944. WORTH HARVEY, Executrix. NORMA G. MILLER, Executrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 36-51-40.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

Sealed Bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration 901 Guardian Building Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, May 9, 1944, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described: each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by the deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above, IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 2 (SW 1/4 NW 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1470 M. feet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$5.00 per M. ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$7,440.00, will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 11, all merchantable timber, designated for cutting on a portion of the SE 1/4 SW 1/4, a portion of the NW 1/4 SE 1/4, a portion of the SW 1/4 SE 1/4, and the SE 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1900 M. feet Douglas Fir, 15 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$7,630.00, will be considered. The sale area is the SE 1/4 SE 1/4, and those portions of the NW 1/4 SE 1/4, SW 1/4 SE 1/4, and the SE 1/4 SW 1/4, which lay south and east of the ridge top survey. All other trees are reserved from cutting. T. 22 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 5, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1145 M. feet Douglas Fir, 60 M. feet Hemlock, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$3,861.25, will be considered. T. 19 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the N 1/2 NW 1/4, the SW 1/4 NW 1/4, and the NW 1/4 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2405 M. feet Douglas Fir. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, or a total purchase price of \$9,620.00, will be considered. Only trees marked USOC and laying south and west of the Siuslaw River are to be cut. Logging to be done with caterpillar type tractor unless otherwise designated by the District Forester. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the E 1/4 SE 1/4 NW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 730 M. feet Douglas Fir, 50 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$3,020.00, will be considered. All timber in each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration, unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 22nd day of April, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 37-21-38

the Estate of PERRY WILSON, Deceased, has filed his account for the final settlement of said Estate in the County Court for Lane County, Oregon, and that Tuesday the 30th day of May, 1944, at the Court Room of said Court in the County Court House in Eugene, Oregon, at ten o'clock in the forenoon, has been set by said Court as the time and place for hearing objections thereto and for final settlement of said Estate. LYMAN E. ADAMS, Administrator, HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 37-51-41

NOTICE OF MEETING OF BOARD OF EQUALIZATION

Notice is hereby given that the county board of equalization of and for Lane County, Oregon, will attend at the court house in said county on the second Monday of May, the same being the 8th day thereof, 1944, and publicly examine the assessment roll and correct all errors in valuation, description of qualities of lands, lots or other property assessed by the assessor; and it shall be the duty of persons interested to appear at the time and place appointed.

Dated this 10th day of April, 1944. WELBY STEVENS, County Assessor. 35-31-37

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That the undersigned has been appointed as Executor of the Last Will and Testament of CHARLES EDWARD McNEAL, Deceased, by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby required to present same, duly verified with proper vouchers, to the undersigned at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon, within six months of the date of the first publication of this Notice. Dated and first published April 13, 1944. CARLTON RAYMOND, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 35-51p-39.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that Lovina Pearle Safley has been appointed by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon as Administratrix of the Estate of Joseph F. Safley, deceased, of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby required to present them, duly verified as by law required to said Administratrix at the Law Office of Alta King, 613 Main St., Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months from the date of first publication of this notice, April 13th, 1944.

Lovina Pearle Safley, Administratrix. Alta King, Attorney. 35-51p-39

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County. C. W. DAVIS and LILLIAN M. DAVIS, his wife, Plaintiffs,

vs. EDWARD G. FORSTEN and MARY JANE FORSTEN, his wife, VICTOR BRANDT and MARY JANE BRANDT, his wife, the unknown heirs of any of the above named parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Plaintiffs' Complaint on file herein.

Defendants. TO: EDWARD G. FORSTEN and MARY JANE FORSTEN, his wife, VICTOR BRANDT and MARY JANE BRANDT, his wife, the unknown heirs of any of the above named parties, if any are deceased; also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in Plaintiffs' Complaint on file herein.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned and required to appear and answer the Complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above entitled suit, on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order for publication, to-wit: on or before the 25th day of May, 1944; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof, the plaintiffs will apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: that you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land and premises herein described, to-wit:

Lots Five and Six (5 and 6) in Block Five (5) of D. G. McFarland's Addition to Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon.

and that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple of the said

WOOD

PHONE 178-L

Victory Fuel Co.

premises as set out in the Complaint herein, and that you and each of you be forever enjoined and debarred from asserting any claim whatever thereto adverse to the plaintiffs; and for such other and further relief as to the Court shall seem just and equitable.

This Summons is published pursuant to an order made by the Hon. G. F. Skipworth, Circuit Judge of Lane County, Oregon, on the 27th day of April, 1944, which order directs that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a newspaper of general circulation published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 25th day of May, 1944. Date of first publication April 27th, 1944. Date of last publication May 25th, 1944.

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiffs, Residence and Post Office: Cottage Grove, Lane County, Ore. 37-51p-41.

7:30 SALAD SERVED
A 7:30 salad was served the Duration club Wednesday evening by Mrs. Harold Spriggs at the home of Mrs. Roy Short after which the regular meeting was held and a social evening enjoyed by the group. The next meeting will be held at the home of Mrs. Faye Stewart, May 3.

BOOKKEEPER

Logging or L