

South Lane-North Douglas Market Page

WOOD

We have purchased the Blue Mountain Fuel Co. from Norman Williams and are prepared to give you quick service on your orders for block and slab wood. We appreciate your business.

Blue Mountain Fuel Company

by Eastburn & Hixson
Phone 19-F-13
25-1f-25p

FOR SALE—

BABY CHICKS

White Leghorns, New Hampshires, Geo. M. Petersen Hatchery, Rt. 1, Eugene, Oregon. 12-fte

FOR SALE: Baled oats and rye grass hay, \$35 ton delivered in ton lots or over. C. E. Brown, Delight Valley. 29-1te

FOR SALE: Weaner pigs; 4 year old Percheron mare, sound, very gentle, or will trade for cattle. Arnold Duerst, phone 19F4. 33-2tp-34

FOR SALE: Three milk cows and two purebred Chester White brood sows to farrow about May 1. Roy Hutchison, Mosby Creek. 34-1te

FOR SALE: 79-acre farm, 58 acres in cultivation. Fairly extensive set of buildings. Oiled road. High school bus. Five miles out on Mosby Creek. Roy E. Hutchison. 34-1te

FOR SALE: One set Boston Breeding harness. Good condition. Call 1327 Ash Avenue evenings. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: Electric or hand driven McCormick - Deering separator. \$75.00 E. L. Bales, Dorana, Phone 9F33. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: Chevrolet radio, practically new. Fits all car models. \$35.00. Mrs. Chas. Niehaus, 9th and Lincoln. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: 3 milk cows, 1 yearling heifer and 1 three months old heifer calf. Call after 5:00 p. m. Harry Elfvig, 7 miles east on Row River. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: Dairy type Durham heifers with calf by side. Also fat castrated pigs. C. H. Haight, Phone 38F12. 34-2tp-35

FOR SALE: 2 milk cows and 2 heifers. C. H. Maxwell, north Turbilly Store. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: 5 acres, 3 miles east of town, large garden plot, small new orchard, year around creek, good 4-room house, electricity, hot and cold water. \$3,000. Phone 29F3. 34-1te

FOR SALE: House trailer, 1942 Roll-away factory built, Coleman gas stove with oven, ice box, venetian blinds. Vacuum brakes. Excellent condition. C. P. Vincent, cabin 5 at Woodson's Auto Court. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: Potatoes on the Tison-Fuhrer farm, Earliest of All and other varieties. Raised on river bottom soil. 34-3tp-36

OFFICE DESKS, files, chairs, hatracks—Callahan's Furniture Store, Eugene. 34-4te-37

MEN'S CALK BOOTS for sale, size 10½. Slightly used, \$10.00. 31 South 12th St. 34-1tp

HORSES FOR SALE: Span young mares, weight 1700 to 1800 pounds, \$300. Jane D. Powell, Lorane, Oregon. 34-2tp-35

FOR SALE: Good lot, small house, 6th Street near school. Short's Bargain Store. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: 2 young heifers with calves by side. Good milkers. Z. N. Harvey, 5 miles out on Mosby Creek. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: 2 acres more or less, 6 room house with elec. and city water, new shower and fixtures. Small barn, family orchard, 1½ acres river bottom ground. Low taxes. \$2800. Some terms. Rodman's, 701 Main. 34-1te

FOR SALE: 21 Acres, 6 miles South on London Rd. Overlooks the Cottage Grove Dam, 4 room house, no elec. Spring water. All fenced. House needs some repairs but livable as is. Few fruit trees. Wood. \$1600.00 cash or \$1750.00 with \$700.00 down. Merl King with Rodman's Phone 216 34-1te

FOR SALE: My home on corner 1237 Ash and M. 2 lots; 7 rooms; good bath and shower; garage and woodshed. Also small anvil and 2 hammers \$10.00. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: Electric hand saw \$100. H. A. Searcy, Black Butte Route, 1½ miles out highway 99. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: Stewart Warner 6 tube cabinet electric radio. Call O. K. Supply Shop. 34-1tp

FOR SALE: Large modern wood circulating heater. Almost new. Must be sold by Friday. 230 North 1 Street. 34-1te

FOR SALE: New Hampshire Red hens. For immediate sale. Will deliver. Telephone 9-F-43. Mrs. Lot Wagner. 34-1te

FOR SALE: Medium size oil circulator, 100 gallon storage tank and plumbing. Telephone 117-J. 34-1tp

FOR RENT—

FOR RENT: 3-room furnished cabin, including utilities. Reed's Service Store, 3½ miles south on highway 99. 32-1te

FOR RENT: 3 room down stairs apartment with bath. Lights, water and wood furnished. 1627 West Main St. 34-1tp

WANT TO BUY—

WANTED: 4 or 5 h.p. air cool gas motor, G. L. Partney, Disston Route, Thornton Lane. 33-2tp-34

WANTED TO BUY: Good two-wheel trailer with 600x16 tires. A. L. Crist, North River road. 34-1tp

WANTED: Will pay cash up to \$3,000 for 2 bedroom house and lot, modern plumbing, garage and woodshed. Would prefer vicinity of East Main across railroad tracks. Phone 29F3. 34-1te

WANTED: Electric motor for washing machine. Mrs. J. D. Hodges, Curtin, Oregon. 34-1tp

WANTED: Cast iron scrap. Will pay ceiling prices. Cottage Grove Foundry. 23-1te

WANTED—

PAINTING - PAPERHANGING, free estimate, fair prices. Phone 6F4, E. L. Wade. 31-4tp-34

WANTED: PAINTING, PAPER HANGING and repairing. C. M. Adams, 2½ miles out Mosby Creek. 30-1te

WANTED: Boarders and roomers at 1329 West Main Street. Also apartment for rent. Phone 220L. 34-1tp

WANTED TO RENT: House, prefer in town. Axel Westberg, 109 North River Road. 34-1tp

WANTED: Bids on 20 cords 3 foot wood, old growth or other by May 1st. To be delivered into basement of Latham schoolhouse by September 1st. Edith Kenady, clerk. Black Butte Route. 34-2tp-35

WANTED TO RENT: 2 bedroom house, unfurnished. F. A. Baker, 38 South 12th St. 34-1tp

WANTED: Painting and paper-hanging. H. A. Searcy, Black Butte Route, 1½ miles out highway 99. 34-1te

WANTED: Am home again and expect to be in the market for wool and mohair as usual. Also want about 50 goats. J. W. Veatch, telephone 174-J. 33-3tp-35

MISCELLANEOUS—

TAKEN UP: Bay mare with balzard face. Owner may have same by paying for ad. Phone 28F3. 34-1te

TO TRADE: City property valued at \$2,000 for or apply as down payment on farm or acreage. Must have creek and good building site and be within 7 miles of Cottage Grove. Call 178L. 34-1te

WATER WELL DRILLING, pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23. J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Oregon. 42-1te

25 Years Experience. Clean, neat work. Paperhanging, painting. C. Maxson, 817 So. Third St. 50-1te

All kinds of welding, both electric and acetylene. Machinery repairing and blacksmithing. O. K. Welding Shop, in new location, 10th and Jefferson. 1-1te

FOR RENT—Floor sanders, waxers and a vacuum cleaner. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 33-1te

LEGAL NOTICES

WHEREAS in Chapter XXVI Oregon Code 1930 and amendments thereto, it is declared to be the duty of every person, firm, partnership, company and corporation owning, leasing, occupying, possessing or having charge of or dominion over any land, place, building, structure, wharf, pier or dock which is infested with ground squirrels and other noxious rodents or predatory animals, or as soon as the presence of the same shall come to his, their or its knowledge, at once to proceed and to continue in good faith to exterminate and destroy such rodents by poisoning, trapping or other appropriate and effective means; and

WHEREAS gray digger ground squirrels (Citellus douglasii) are noxious rodents in Lane County, Oregon.

Now, therefore, all of such persons, firms, partnerships, corporations and companies owning or having dominion over land in said Lane County, Oregon, are hereby required to take steps to exterminate said gray digger ground squirrels (Citellus douglasii) within thirty days from the date of the first publication of this notice. If such steps are not taken, a person or persons appointed by the county court of said Lane County will enter upon said lands and proceed to exterminate said gray digger ground squirrels (Citellus douglasii) and the cost of said extermination will be levied against said lands.

The County Agricultural Agent hereby designates Monday, April 17, as a day to be known as "squirrel poisoning day" throughout the said Lane County, and is hereby recommended that poisoned barley, as prepared by the undersigned and representatives of the U. S. Fish and Wildlife Service, be used for the purpose of such extermination. Such poisoned barley may be secured from the undersigned at his office in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, at approximately the cost of preparation.

Date of first publication of this notice April 6, 1944.
(Signed) O. S. Fletcher
County Agricultural Agent
34-3tp-36

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944.

March 23, 1944. WORTH HARVEY, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 32-5t-36

NOTICE OF HEARING FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given by the undersigned Administratrix of the estate of Jesse A. Griffin, deceased, that the County Court has fixed the hour of ten o'clock A. M. of April 20th, 1944, at the Chambers of the County Court in the Lane County Court House, in the city of Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place of hearing objections to the final account of said administratrix, and the settlement thereof.

ANNIE E. ADAMS, formerly Annie E. Petrie, administratrix of said estate. 32-5t-36

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Forest Exchange No. 022883, United States Department of the Interior, District Land Office, Roseburg, Oregon, February 29, 1944. Notice is hereby given that David T. Jones, Santee, Oregon, did, on this date, make application under the act of March 20, 1922 (42 Stat. 465), as amended by the act of February 28, 1925 (43 Stat. 1090), to select certain timber from portions of Secs. 13 and 24, T. 19 S., R. 4 E., W. M., Williams National Forest, Lane County, Oregon, in exchange for the W½NE¼, SE¼NW¼, NW¼SE¼, Sec. 32, T. 19 S., R. 27 E., SE¼NE¼, NE¼SE¼, Sec. 7, N½SW¼, Sec. 8, T. 20 S., R. 27 E., E½SE¼, Sec. 26, E½NE¼, Sec. 35, T. 20 S., R. 26 E.; NE¼NE¼, Sec. 10, T. 22 S., R. 27 E., W. M., Ochoco National Forest, Harney County, Oregon. Any and all persons claiming the lands selected, or having bona fide objections to the exchange, should file their protests on or before April 10, 1944. C. F. Spaulding, Acting Register. 31-5t-35

March 8th, 1944. Karl K. Mills was by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, appointed Administrator of the Estate of Elvira Blake, deceased. All persons having claims against said Estate are required to present them, with proper vouchers, duly verified, as by law required to said Administrator, at the Law Office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon, within 6 months from date of first publication of this Notice, March 9th, 1944. Karl K. Mills, Administrator. Alta King, Attorney. 30-5te-34

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

March 8th, 1944. Karl K. Mills was by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, appointed Administrator of the Estate of Elvira Blake, deceased. All persons having claims against said Estate are required to present them, with proper vouchers, duly verified, as by law required to said Administrator, at the Law Office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon, within 6 months from date of first publication of this Notice, March 9th, 1944. Karl K. Mills, Administrator. Alta King, Attorney. 30-5te-34

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that HILDRED B. DUNLEVY, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of JOHN DUNLEVY, Deceased, has filed herein her Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon; and said Court has fixed and appointed Tuesday, the 11th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944. HILDRED B. DUNLEVY, Executrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 30-5t-34

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, April 11, 1944, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 295 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$892.50, will be considered. All trees marked USOC are reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1745 M. feet Douglas Fir, 90 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock, 210 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$1.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,471.25, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2345 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$6,468.75, will be considered. All timber in each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration, unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 1st day of April, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 34-1t

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, April 11, 1944, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 295 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$892.50, will be considered. All trees marked USOC are reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1745 M. feet Douglas Fir, 90 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock, 210 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$1.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,471.25, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2345 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$6,468.75, will be considered. All timber in each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration, unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 1st day of April, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 34-1t

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, April 11, 1944, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 295 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$892.50, will be considered. All trees marked USOC are reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1745 M. feet Douglas Fir, 90 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock, 210 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$1.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,471.25, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2345 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$6,468.75, will be considered. All timber in each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration, unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 1st day of April, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 34-1t

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, April 11, 1944, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 295 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$892.50, will be considered. All trees marked USOC are reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1745 M. feet Douglas Fir, 90 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock, 210 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$1.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,471.25, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2345 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$6,468.75, will be considered. All timber in each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration, unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 1st day of April, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 34-1t

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, April 11, 1944, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼SW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 295 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$892.50, will be considered. All trees marked USOC are reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1745 M. feet Douglas Fir, 90 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock, 210 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$