

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that WORTH HARVEY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of ADOLPH PEARSON, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon, and said Court has fixed and appointed the 25th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a.m. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 23, 1944. WORTH HARVEY, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 32-5t-36

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Administratrix of the Estate of GEORGE RAYMOND BOWMAN, Deceased by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against the said estate are hereby notified to present the same, duly verified, with proper vouchers, to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of the first publication of this notice. Dated and first published March 2, 1944. DOROTHY COVALT, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 29-5t-33

NOTICE OF HEARING FINAL ACCOUNT

Notice is hereby given by the undersigned Administratrix of the estate of Jesse A. Griffin, deceased, that the County Court has fixed the hour of ten o'clock A. M. of April 20th, 1944, at the Chambers of the County Court in the Lane County Court House, in the city of Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place of hearing objections to the final account of said administratrix, and the settlement thereof. ANNIE E. ADAMS, formerly Annie E. Petrie, administratrix of said estate. 32-5t-36

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Forest Exchange No. 022883, United States Department of the Interior, District Land Office, Roseburg, Oregon, February 29, 1944. Notice is hereby given that David T. Jones, Surtex, Oregon, did, on this date, make application under the act of March 20, 1922 (42 Stat. 465), as amended by the act of February 28, 1925 (43 Stat. 1090), to select certain timber from portions of Secs. 13 and 24, T. 19 S., R. 4 E., W. M., Williamette National Forest, Lane County, Oregon, in exchange for the W $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NW $\frac{1}{4}$, NW $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$, Sec. 32, T. 19 S., R. 27 E., SE $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, NE $\frac{1}{4}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$, Sec. 7, N $\frac{1}{2}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$, Sec. 8, T. 20 S., R. 27 E.; E $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$, Sec. 26, E $\frac{1}{2}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, Sec. 35, T. 20 S., R. 26 E.; NE $\frac{1}{4}$ NE $\frac{1}{4}$, Sec. 10, T. 22 S., R. 27 E., W. M., Ochoco National Forest, Harney County, Oregon. Any and all persons claiming the lands selected, or having bona fide objections to the exchange, should file their protests on or before April 10, 1944. C. F. Spaulding, Acting Register. 31-5t-35

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that HILDRED B. DUNLEVY, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of JOHN DUNLEVY, Deceased, has filed herein his Final Report with the County Court, Lane County, State of Oregon; and said Court has fixed and appointed Tuesday, the 11th day of April, 1944 at the hour of 10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon, as the time and place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the Final Report and Final Settlement of said estate. Dated and first published March 9, 1944. HILDRED B. DUNLEVY, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 30-5t-34

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, April 11, 1944, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each

LEGAL NOTICES

bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW $\frac{1}{4}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 295 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$892.50, will be considered. All trees marked USOC are reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S $\frac{1}{2}$ SE $\frac{1}{4}$, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1745 M. feet Douglas Fir, 90 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock, 210 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$1.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,471.25, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S $\frac{1}{2}$ SW $\frac{1}{4}$, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2345 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$6,468.75, will be considered. All timber in each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration, unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 25th day of March, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 33-2t-34

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

March 8th, 1944, Karl K. Mills was by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, appointed Administrator of the Estate of Elvira Blake, deceased. All persons having claims against said Estate are required to present them, with proper vouchers, duly verified, as by law required to said Administrator, at the Law Office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon, within 6 months from date of first publication of this Notice, March 9th, 1944. Karl K. Mills, Administrator. Alta King, Attorney. 30-5t-34

OIL TEST NEAR OAKLAND SLATED

An early start on previously announced plans for oil exploration east of Oakland is indicated by filings of 39 land leases recently by the Phillips Petroleum corporation of Bartlesville, Oklahoma. The company has filed leases at the office of the Douglas county clerk, covering about 20,000 acres in the area east of Oakland, where prospects have been planned. The company recently abandoned a test near Coquille, where tools were lost after reaching a depth of 6,900 feet. It has been planned to carry the well to 7,100 feet, but it was decided to abandon the project rather than incur the expense of recovering the tools and continuing the boring for only 200 additional feet. Further exploration in the Coos county area is to be made, however, according to reports from that area. Roseburg News Review.

Smokeless Furnace

There's a new coal furnace now which burns even soft coal without smoke. And it saves up to a fourth on fuel. A down-draft forces unburned smoke through the glowing coals, where it's consumed, and only the smokeless gases that don't foul your line go up the chimney.

Wanted! Men and Women Who Are Hard of Hearing

To make this simple, no risk hearing test. If you are temporarily deafened, bothered by ringing buzzing head noises due to hardened or coagulated wax (cerumen), try the Ourine Home Method test that so many say has enabled them to hear well again. You must hear better after making this simple test or you get your money back at once. Ask about Ourine Ear Drops today at

Kem's and drug stores everywhere

South Lane-North Douglas Market Page

WOOD

We have purchased the Blue Mountain Fuel Co. from Norman Williams and are prepared to give you quick service on your orders for block and slab wood. We appreciate your business.

Blue Mountain Fuel Company
by Eastburn & Axelson
Phone 19-F-13
25-tf-25p

FOR SALE—

BABY CHICKS

White Leghorns, New Hampshire, Geo. M. Petersen Hatchery, Rt. 1, Eugene, Oregon. 12-tfc

FOR SALE: Small oil heater, \$30.00. Phone 178L. 23-tfc

FOR SALE: Baled oats and rye grass hay, \$35 ton delivered in ton lots or over. C. E. Brown, Delight Valley. 29-1tc

FOR SALE: 1936 Oldsmobile sedan, radio, heater, good rubber. \$300. Inquire first house below Cold Spring Camp, Drain, Oregon. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: Weaner pigs, 10 cents per pound. Frank S. Chapman, Thornton Corners. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: We have a supply of 17 inch tires grade 1 and grade 3; also 16 inch grade 1. Richfield Service, Drain. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: Wearer aluminum teakettle, nearly new; artistic lawn seat and table. 432 North 10th St. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: Weaner pigs; 4 year old Percheron mare, sound, very gentle, or will trade for cattle. Arnold Duerst, phone 19F4. 33-2tp-34

FOR SALE: 1937 V-8 60 Ford, 90% rubber. Fair shape. Guy L. Bettis, Disston route, 1 mile out. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: Seventy 10 months old New Hampshire Red pullets from trap nested stock. Phone 35F12. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: Three milk cows and two purebred Chester White brood sows to farrow about May 1. Roy Hutchison, Mosby Creek. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: 79-acre farm. 58 acres in cultivation. Fairly extensive set of buildings. Oiled road. High school bus. Five miles out on Mosby Creek. Roy E. Hutchison. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: One set Boston Breeding harness. Good condition. Call 1327 Ash Avenue evenings. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: Pre-war davenport; spring cot; corner what-not; bath tub; laying hens. Mrs. Max Kruse, Black Butte Route. Telephone 37-F-23. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: 2 wheel trailer. \$25.00. Porter place, 2 1/2 miles south on highway. 33-1tc

FOR SALE: 50 Hansen strain White Leghorn pullets, laying 60%. \$1.25 each. Call 224 after 6:00 p. m. 33-1tc

FOR SALE: 6 room modern house. Lot 63 1/2 x 156 feet. Inquire at 136 North 6th Street. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: Child's Simmons crib and mattress. Excellent condition. Metal woven springs. \$15.00. E. L. Wade, West Main, telephone 6-F-4. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: 1 full size and one twin size bed springs and mattresses; small heater; New Zealand White rabbits. Ace Gregg, telephone 25-F-12. 33-1tp

FOR SALE: Montag circular heater, same as new. \$55.00; also cream separator. Inquire at 128 North H Street. 33-1tp

WANT TO BUY—

WANTED TO BUY: Small building to be moved or lumber. Baker, 38 South 12th Street. 33-1tp

WANTED TO BUY: Piano; also girl's pre-war bicycle, balloon tires. Baker, 38 South 12th Street. 33-1tp

WANTED: 4 or 5 h.p. air cool gas motor, G. L. Partney, Disston Route, Thornton Lane. 33-2tp-34

WANTED TO RENT—

WANTED: to rent: House with electricity and some pasture. C. M. Adams, Disston route, Cottage Grove. 30-tfc

WANTED: Furnished or partly furnished apartment or house. Call Dr. John Monahan, phone 100. 31-tfc

Sentinel Want Ads Full

FOR RENT—

FOR RENT: 3-room furnished cabin, including utilities. Reed's Service Store, 3 1/2 miles south on highway 99. 32-tfc

FOR RENT: 4 room furnished apartment on Main Street. Upstairs. Inquire 129 South 5th St. Telephone 117-R. 33-1tc

UPSTAIRS Furnished apartment for rent. Adults preferred. 626 Main street. 33-1tc

HELP WANTED—

Responsible Eugene family with children needs housekeeper. Experience not required. Write P. O. Box 112, Eugene, Ore. 28-6tp-33

WANTED: Woman for Bakery work. Doleman's Bakery. 33-1tc

WANTED: To hire trailerman for piling trailer, close to Cottage Grove. Steady work. Good wages to right party. Call Eugene Auto Court, starting Monday. Phone 622 Springfield. 33-1tp

WANTED: High school girl after 4:30 p. m. to help at the Butler maternity home, 136 North 8th St. 33-1tp

WANT TO LEASE—

WANTED TO LEASE for year or more, small stock farm for 20 cattle and 30 sheep. Reasonable amount of farm land. Electricity preferred. R. E. Carlisle, Disston route. Phone 9F13. Also weaner pigs for sale. 32-2tc-33

LOST AND FOUND—

LOST: Umbrella taken from Baptist Church Mch. 8th. Please return to Mrs. G. R. Walden, 624 Gibbs Ave. 33-1tp

WANTED—

WORK WANTED: For remodeling and building, see W. Pynch. Telephone 5-F-4. 31-3tp-33

PAINTING - PAPERHANGING, free estimate, fair prices. Phone 6F4, E. L. Wade. 31-4tp-34

WANTED: PAINTING, PAPER HANGING and repairing. C. M. Adams, 2 1/2 miles out Mosby Creek. 30-tfc

WANTED: Cast iron scrap. Will pay ceiling prices. Cottage Grove Foundry. 23-tfc

Wanted: SCRAP PAPER. We pay 30 cents per 100 pounds for newspapers and magazines tied in bundles or in cardboard boxes. Junk ground on Mosby Creek. 32-2tp-33

MISCELLANEOUS—

TO GIVE AWAY: Mother and six Terrier puppies. Grove Court Motel, Cottage 14. 33-1tp

WANTED: Am home again and expect to be in the market for wool and mohair as usual. Also want about 50 goats. J. W. Veatch, telephone 174-J. 33-3tp-35

WATER WELL DRILLING, pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23. J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Oregon. 42-tfc

25 Years Experience. Clean, neat work. Paperhanging, painting. C. Maxson, 817 So. Third St. 50-tfc

All kinds of welding, both electric and acetylene. Machinery repairing and blacksmithing. O. K. Welding Shop, in new location. 10th and Jefferson. 1-tfc

FOR RENT—Floor sanders, waxers and a vacuum cleaner. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 33-tfc

NATURE'S REMEDY

CAPE GLOUCESTER, New Britain, (Delayed)—It's no trick at all for Marines to waterproof their jungle hammocks when leaks develop from whippings inflicted by savage tropical storms. They've found a tree which yields a milky sap similar to rubber latex. The sap is tapped into a can. When heated, the moisture evaporates, leaving a gummy, rubbery substance which patches leaks in a jiffy.

TIME-SAVER

Rather than spend time dicing potatoes by hand, keep an empty baking powder can for the purpose. By punching a few holes in the bottom of the can to let out

You Can't Sell It —
If You Don't Tell It

Films Developed
and Printed

25c and 8
Exposures

REPRINTS 3c EACH.
Guaranteed Work.

Thrift-Wise

Cottage Grove, Ore.

Unspoiled Country Side

15 1/2 acres on Hi-way 99 North, two large chicken brooder houses, barn, year round creek, five room house with bath and water, no elec. All in cult. \$4500.00 Terms. Four miles from Cottage Grove. 25 acres, no buildings, on Hi-way 99 North, yr. round creek. \$2600.00. 5 room house on 50x70 lot, lots of built-ins, elec., city water, piped for gas. House is clean and can have immediate possession. \$2000.00 cash. 6 room newly decorated house with 2 acres of ground, just outside city limits barn, family fruit, elec. and city water, no bath. River bottom ground. Low taxes. Price \$2650.00 cash.

MERL KING
with

701 Main St. RODMANS Phone 216

LOGGERS and MILLWORKERS: IT'S UP TO US TO "PASS THE AMMUNITION"!



THIS IS OUR MOST CRITICAL YEAR! The attack is under way — on all fronts! Our own troops and allies will need 34 billion board feet of lumber this year. Over 16 billion board feet — nearly half of the total — will go into wood boxes and crates and paper cartons to move ammunition, guns, food, and other supplies up to the battle fronts.

There is no need to tell you that the men and women of the Western forests

are going to supply the lion's share of wood for war again in 1944. This is the Northwest's mightiest "MUST!" We have the timber, the equipment, and the timbermen of experience. It is up to all of us to "pass the ammunition!"

A RUNNING START! Loggers and millworkers of the Douglas Fir region can be proud of their record for the first quarter of 1944. Timber production is well ahead of that for the same period of 1943. But the war needs are also greater than ever before. Let's tell the world — "We'll keep 'em booming!"

The Bohemia Lumber Sales Co.
J. H. Chambers & Son
Cottage Grove Lumber Company
Row River Lumber Company
Scott Lumber Company

AT FIRST
SIGN OF A
COLD
USE **666**
666 TABLETS, SALVE, NOSE DROPS