

WANT-ADS

FOR SALE—

FOR SALE: 4 big shoats, 2½ miles out on Mosby Creek. Phone 29F12. W. E. Post. 10-1tc

FOR SALE: A few more year old White Leghorn hens, Hollywood strain, \$1.00 or \$1.25 choice. Odus Williams, first house west of W. A. Hemenway place. 10-2tp-11

FOR SALE: O.I.C. Weaner pigs, \$7.50 each. Also baled straw, 5 miles southeast Cottage Grove on Z. N. Harvey place. 10-2tp-11

FOR SALE: Breeding rabbit does, Lowell Coffey, Row River Mill. 10-2tp-11

FOR SALE: 22 Automatic Pistol, Hi-Standard, Model B. 8-inch circle saw, bench and ½ h. p. motor. 7 milk goats, 2 milking very good, sell cheap. C. F. Skarratt, Hayhurst Valley, Yoncalla. 10-2tp-11

FOR SALE: Good small house, easily moved, \$100.00. Emery Harns, 3 miles east on Mosby Creek road. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: Two twin beds, complete, like new. Call at 721 Washington Ave. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: 1930 Chevrolet Coupe, fair rubber, \$75.00 cash. Roy Graham, Lorane Rt. 11-2tp-12

FOR SALE OR TRADE for small place near Cottage Grove, Eugene or Creswell, 7 room home in North Bend, 2 blocks city hall and two blocks Main street. Sewer all paid. Write 1812 Meade Avenue, North Bend, Oregon. 11-1tc

FOR SALE: 71 acre ranch, wood truck, buzz saw, and model A roadster. A. L. Williams, Walden. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: 3½ yards all wool navy blue coat material, 54 inches wide, also silk lining, cheap. 432 North 10th St. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: Colored fryers, 2½ to 4 pounds. W. E. Bradford, 1½ miles out 6th St., 1st house on left Moody road. 11-2tp-12

FOR SALE: 25 does, young ones, hutchers. C. M. Adams, 2½ miles east, Diston route. 11-2tp-12

FOR SALE: Chrysanthemums for all occasions. Mrs. R. C. McNew, Knox Hill. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: 1 dozen New Hampshire Red pullets. Call 123-YX, Cottage Grove. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: Cross cut saw, 343 2nd St. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: 1930 Model A coupe, good motor and rubber. E. A. Boswell, Black Butte route. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: 75 to 90-pound feeder pigs \$10.00 each. H. A. McCormack, ½ mile west Walker Store. 11-2tp-12

FOR RENT—

FARM HOUSE FOR RENT after November 1st. J. W. Veatch, Phone 174J. 10-2tp-11

FURNISHED CABINS for rent by week or month, utilities furnished, oil heat and gas ranges. Inquire Reed's Service Store, 3¼ miles south on 99. 1-1tc

FOR RENT—Floor sanders, waxers and a vacuum cleaner. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 33-4tc

TRAILER HOUSE FOR SALE: Sleep four, first class condition, new tires, Butane gas extra, Butane tank, air brakes. Can be seen at 198 North River Road. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: Steel range with coils, heater, both good shape, miscellaneous articles. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: 3 year old registered Hereford bull, J. B. Talbot, telephone 39-F-12. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: Governor Winthrop mahogany colored desk, \$25.00. J. B. Talbot. Telephone 39-F-12. 11-1tp

FOR SALE: Trailer with fair 30x3½ tire and good tube. W. C. Martin, Sentinel office. 11-1tc

MISCELLANEOUS—

WHO IS JESUS CHRIST? Hear Bible Institute of the Air, Monday, Wednesday, Friday, 8:00 a. m. 11-1tp

WATER WELL DRILLING, pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23. J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Oregon. 42-1tc

25 Years Experience. Clean, neat work. Paperhanging, painting. C. Maxson, 817 So. Third St. 50-1tc

All kinds of welding, both electric and acetylene. Machinery repairing and blacksmithing. O. K. Welding Shop, in new location, 10th and Jefferson. 1-1tc

PERMANENT WAVE, 59c! Do your own Permanent with Charm-Kurl Kit. Complete equipment, including 40 curlers and shampoo. Easy to do, absolutely harmless. Praised by thousands including Fay McKenzie, glamorous movie star. Money refunded if not satisfied. Cottage Grove Pharmacy. 2-10tp-12

WANTED TO RENT—

WANT TO RENT: Two bed room house. See or write Perry Northway, 434 South 6th street. 11-1tp

WANT TO BUY—

WANT TO BUY: Modern three bedroom house in city. Phone 26J2. 10-5tp-12

WANTED: Miter box and saw. Address box 281, Cottage Grove. 9-1tc

WANTED: Small upright piano. Telephone 9F2. 11-1tp

HELP WANTED—

HELP WANTED: Saw mill workers, top wages. Emery Harris, 3 miles east Cottage Grove. 11-1tp

LOST AND FOUND—

FOUND: Pair red leather gloves. Identify, pay for ad. Mrs. E. R. Darnell, Lorane Rt. 11-1tc

LOST: August 7, brown Shepherd, white markings, 2 miles below London, reward. Mack Macauley, Black Butte Rt. 11-1tp

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Bldg., Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, November 9, 1943, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 17 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4080 M. feet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 40 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$14,428.75, will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE¼SW¼, and SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5330 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$3.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$17,330.00, will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 19, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE¼NE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1255 M. feet Douglas Fir, 65 M. feet Hemlock, 110 M. feet Red Cedar, 10 M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$3.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.75 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, Red Cedar, and White Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,746.25, will be considered. All timber in each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration, unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 23rd day of October, 1943. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 11-2t-12

NOTICE. After this date, I will not be responsible for any debts contracted other than by myself. Cecil Reigel. 10-3tp-12

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that L. Harold Potts has been appointed by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, as administrator of the estate of George W. Potts, deceased, of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby required to present them, duly verified as by law required to said administrator, at the law office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months from the date of first publication of this notice, September 30th, 1943. L. HAROLD POTTS, Administrator. 7-5t-11

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

Forest Exchange No. 022842, United States Department of the Interior, District Land Office, Roseburg, Oregon, September 6, 1943. Notice is hereby given that George W. Seyforth, Mondovi,

LEGAL NOTICES

Wisconsin, did, on this date, make application under the act of March 20, 1922 (42 Stat. 465), to select certain timber from portions of Secs. 13 and 24, T. 19 S., R. 4 E., W. M., Willamette National Forest, Lane County, Oregon, in exchange for the SE¼, Sec. 2, T. 8 S., R. 31 E., W. M., Whitman National Forest, Grant County, Oregon. Any and all persons claiming the lands selected, or having bona fide objections to the exchange, should file their protests on or before November 2, 1943. GEORGE FINLEY, Register. 7-5t-11

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

Notice is hereby given that North Harvey, executor with the will annexed of the estate of Harriet L. Leonard, deceased, has filed his final account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed the 2nd day of November, 1943 at 2:00 o'clock P. M. in the Court room of said Court, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon. WORTH HARVEY, Executor. ALTA KING, Attorney. 7-5t-11

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that CORNELIA TAYLOR has been appointed as Administratrix of the Estate of F. G. TAYLOR, deceased, by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said Estate are required to present them with the proper vouchers within six months from the 21st day of October, 1943, to the said Administratrix at the law office of Herbert W. Lombard, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. CORNELIA TAYLOR, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 10-5tc-14

SUMMONS

Case No. 29687
In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County.

CITY OF COTTAGE GROVE, a Municipal Corporation, Plaintiff,

vs.

MARIE SCHMIDT and JOHN SCHMIDT, her husband; MARGARET SHELburne, a single person; CHRISTINE BAKER and GLEN S. BAKER, her husband; J. E. PERRIN and CLARA J. PERRIN, his wife; WILLIAM L. BIDWELL, a Widower; ROBERT L. KRUSE and MARY JANE KRUSE, his wife (first and full name unknown); MARY DICKEY and JOHN DOE DICKEY, her husband; JAMES O. RANDALL and LAURA E. RANDALL, his wife; DONALD C. REAMS and LUCILLE E. REAMS, his wife; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein. Defendants.

TO: MARIE SCHMIDT and JOHN SCHMIDT, her husband; MARGARET SHELburne, a single person; CHRISTINE BAKER and GLEN S. BAKER, her husband; J. E. PERRIN and CLARA J. PERRIN, his wife; WILLIAM L. BIDWELL, a Widower; ROBERT L. KRUSE and MARY JANE KRUSE, his wife (first and full name unknown); MARY DICKEY and JOHN DOE DICKEY, her husband; JAMES O. RANDALL and LAURA E. RANDALL, his wife; DONALD C. REAMS and LUCILLE E. REAMS, his wife; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons or parties, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein. DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned to appear and answer the Complaint of the Plaintiff filed against you in the above entitled suit, on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: On or before the 4th day of November, 1943, and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the Plaintiff will apply to the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land described herein, to-wit: Beginning at a point 525 feet south, 203¼ feet west of the northeast corner of County Survey No. 185, thence west 100 feet, thence south 187¼ feet, thence east 128¼ feet, thence north 43 feet 7¼ inches, thence west 28¼ feet, thence north 143 feet 7¼ inches to the place of beginning, all in Section 33, Township 20 South, Range 3 West of the Willamette Meridian, in Lane County, Oregon. Lot 8 in Block 20 of Long and Landless Addition to Cottage Grove, as platted and recorded at Page 42 of Volume 2 of Lane County Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon.

LEGAL NOTICES

Lot 9 in Block 2 of Stouffer's Addition to Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, as platted and recorded at Page 551 of Volume 25 Lane County Oregon deed Records, Lots 1, 2, 3, and 4 in Block 3 of Second Addition to Georgetown, as platted and recorded at Page 62 of Volume 2, Lane County Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon. Lot 1 in Block 5 of D. G. McFarland's Third Addition to Cottage Grove, as platted and recorded at Page 32 of Volume 2 Lane County Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon.

West Half (W½) of Lot One (1), Block Five (5), Plat of Jones's Addition to Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon.

That the Plaintiff is the owner in fee simple of said described property as set out in the Complaint herein, and that you and each of you be forever enjoined, restricted and debarred from asserting any claim thereto adverse to the Plaintiff, and for such other and further relief as to this Court shall seem just and equitable.

This Summons is published pursuant to an order made by Hon. G. F. Skipworth, Circuit Judge for Lane County, Oregon, on the 7th day of October, 1943, which order directed that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said order, to-wit: on or before the 4th day of November, 1943. Date of first publication October 7, 1943. Date of last publication November 4, 1943. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiff. Address and Post Office: First Nat'l Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. 8-5t-12

SUMMONS

Case No. 29691
In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County.

W. L. WORKMAN, Plaintiff,

vs.

JACOB HEINRICH ZWEIDLER, BERTHA TRACHSLER-ZWEIDLER, HEINRICH ZWEIDLER, HERMANN ZWEIDLER, HEDWIG ARN, MATILDA ARN, EMILIE ARN, HANS RICHARD ARN, VERENA SOPHIA ARN, MARIE LUISE-EISELE, ROSA LUISE EISELE, KARL EISELE, OTTO EISELE, JOHANNES EMANUEL STAHEL, BERTHA KLARA FRICK, FRIEDA STULZ-STAHEL, JACOB PAUL STAHEL, LAURA IDA EHRSSEN-STAHEL, LUISE LYDIA MEURER-STAHEL, JACOB EHRSAM, MAX EHRSAM, WALTER EHRSAM, LYDIA LULLY EHRSAM, THEODOR ZWEIDLER; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein. Defendants.

TO: JACOB HEINRICH ZWEIDLER, BERTHA TRACHSLER-ZWEIDLER, HEINRICH ZWEIDLER, HERMANN ZWEIDLER, HEDWIG ARN, MATILDA ARN, EMILIE ARN, HANS RICHARD ARN, VERENA SOPHIA ARN, MARIE LUISE-EISELE, ROSA LUISE EISELE, KARL EISELE, OTTO EISELE, JOHANNES EMANUEL STAHEL, BERTHA KLARA FRICK, FRIEDA STULZ-STAHEL, JACOB PAUL STAHEL, LAURA IDA EHRSSEN-STAHEL, LUISE LYDIA MEURER-STAHEL, JACOB EHRSAM, MAX EHRSAM, WALTER EHRSAM, LYDIA LULLY EHRSAM, THEODOR ZWEIDLER; the unknown heirs of any of the above named persons, if any are deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein. DEFENDANTS.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned to appear and answer the Complaint of the Plaintiff filed against you in the above entitled suit, on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: On or before the 4th day of November, 1943; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the Plaintiff will apply to the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land described herein, to-wit: East 40 feet of Lot 1, Block 4 in D. G. McFarland's Fifth Addition to Cottage Grove, as platted and recorded in Volume 2, Page 56, Lane County Oregon Plat Records, in Lane County, Oregon. and that the Plaintiff is the owner in fee simple of said described property as set out in the Complaint herein, and that you and each of you be forever enjoined, restricted and debarred from asserting any claim thereto adverse to the Plaintiff, and for such other and further relief as to this

LEGAL NOTICES

Court shall seem just and equitable.

This Summons is published pursuant to an Order made by Hon. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge for Lane County, Oregon, on the 7th day of October, 1943, which order directed that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said Order, to-wit: on or before the 4th day of November, 1943. Date of first publication October 7th, 1943. Date of last publication November 4th, 1943. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiff. Address and Post Office, First Nat'l Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. 8-5t-12

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Administrator of the Estate of PERRY WILSON by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present the same duly verified to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, within six months from the date of first publication of this notice. Dated and first published October 7, 1943. LYMAN E. ADAMS, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 8-5tc-12

SUMMONS

In the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County.

W. E. QUINN, a widower, Plaintiff,

vs.

The unknown heirs of NELLIE IRWIN and ARCHIBALD IRWIN, her husband, both deceased; the unknown heirs of GEORGE L. GILFREY, a Widower, Deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein. Defendants.

TO: The unknown heirs of NELLIE IRWIN and ARCHIBALD IRWIN, her husband, both deceased; the unknown heirs of GEORGE L. GILFREY, a Widower, Deceased; also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein. Defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby summoned to appear and answer the Complaint of the Plaintiff filed against you in the above entitled suit, on or before the last day of the time prescribed in the order of publication, to-wit: on or about the 4th day of November, 1943; and if you fail to so appear and answer, for want thereof the Plaintiff will

Professional Cards

FUNERAL HOMES

KARL K. MILLS, Mortician. Phone 202

SMITH FUNERAL CHAPEL—Phone 101. 6

DENTISTS

DR. W. E. LEBOW—Dentistry—No. 1 Omer Apartments Cottage Grove, Ore. Phone 35

PHYSICIANS

H. AXLEY, Physician and Surgeon—Evenings by appointment. Over Kem's for Drugs. Cottage Grove, Oregon.

DR. KATHERINE SCHLEEF, M. D.—Physician and Surgeon. Apartment 10, Omer Apartments. Phone 247.

ATTORNEYS

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney at Law, First National Bank building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. Phone 94.

ALTA KING—Lawyer, 613 Main street. Office phone 254J; Res. phone, 28F3J, Cottage Grove, Ore.

INSURANCE

TITLE ABSTRACT CO.—881 Oak St., Eugene, Ore. Edward F. Bailey, Pres. Abstracts, Title Insurance, Escrows.

HARRY K. METCALF, representing Hartford Fire & Casualty Co., and Equitable Life Insurance Society. Phone 115-J. 35

MATERNITY HOMES

BUTLER MATERNITY HOME—136 N. 8th St. Phone 176Y. 41

LEGAL NOTICES

apply to the above entitled Court for the relief prayed for in the Complaint, to-wit: That you and each of you be adjudged to have no estate or interest whatsoever in or to the land described herein, to-wit: Lot 3 in Block 10 of Creswell, as platted and recorded at Page 540 of Volume H Lane County Oregon Deed Records, in Lane County, Oregon.

and that the Plaintiff is the owner in fee simple of said described property as set out in the Complaint herein, and that you and each of you be forever enjoined, restricted and debarred from asserting any claim thereto adverse to the Plaintiff; and for such other and further relief as to this Court shall seem just and equitable.

This Summons is published pursuant to an Order made by Hon. G. F. SKIPWORTH, Circuit Judge for Lane County, Oregon, on the 7th day of October, 1943, which order directed that this Summons be published once a week for four successive weeks in the Cottage Grove Sentinel, a weekly newspaper of general circulation printed and published in Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon; and that you be required to appear and answer on or before the last day of the time prescribed in said Order, to-wit: on or before the 4th day of November, 1943. Date of first publication October 7th, 1943. Date of last publication November 4th, 1943. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Plaintiff. Address and Post Office, First Nat'l Bank Bldg., Cottage Grove, Oregon. 8-5t-12

NOTICE OF ADMINISTRATORS SALE OF REAL PROPERTY

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that by authority of an Order of the County Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, duly made and entered on the 5th day of October, 1943, the undersigned Administrator of the Estate of AMANDA C. HULL, Deceased, will sell at private sale for cash, or for part cash and part credit, the following described real property, to-wit:

Beginning at a point 5.83 chains

LEGAL NOTICES

South and 7 links West of the Southeast corner of the Charles W. Boren D.L.C. No. 37, and running thence South 27.43 chains to the Section line between Sections 7 and 8; thence East along said line 4.73 chains to the Southeast corner of Section 7; thence North 12.20 chains to the South boundary of the Marlon Martin D.L.C. No. 41; thence East along said boundary 15.04 chains to the most eastern Southeast corner of this tract; thence North 15.07 chains to the Northeast corner; thence West 19.96 chains, more or less, to the place of beginning, containing 35.67 acres of land, more or less, all in Sections 7 and 8, Township 21 South, Range 3 West of Willamette Meridian, Lane County, Oregon.

Said sale will be made on and after the 4 day of November, 1943, and bids will be received at the office of Herbert W. Lombard, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, until a reasonable bid shall have been received, said sale to be subject to confirmation by the Court. ALBERT HULL, Administrator of the Estate of AMANDA C. HULL, Deceased. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Administrator. 8-5t-12

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that Tunis Van Prooyen, executor of the last will and testament of Tillie Van Harken, deceased, has filed his final account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed the 16th day of November, 1943, at 10:00 o'clock A. M. in the Court room of said Court, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon. Tunis Van Prooyen, executor. Herbert W. Lombard, attorney. 9-5t-13

RADIO REPAIRS

By Dexter Somers

318 Main

SPECIAL OFFER TO BRING "OLD GLORY" to Every Reader of THE SENTINEL



Would You Like This 3x5 FT. AMERICAN FLAG?

As a reader of this paper, we are offering you an amazing opportunity to own a glorious, large "Stars and Stripes". Made of fine, durable cotton bunting, with individually sewed stripes. Stars stamped in fast colors on a rich, blue background. This beautiful flag, when opened to its full majestic spread, measures FIVE feet long by THREE feet wide.

OUR SPECIAL OFFER TO YOU

Show your neighbors that you're true blue "and proud of it"—by flying "Old Glory" on every American holiday. This great flag can be yours now—as a reader of this paper—at the very special price of only \$1.19, mailed POSTPAID to your home.

Tell The World You're Glad That You're An American

MAIL TODAY

READER'S COUPON

COTTAGE GROVE SENTINEL

25 N. 6th—Phone 159

Please send me one of your 5 ft. x 3 ft. American flags at your special Reader's offer price of \$1.19 postpaid.

NAME

ADDRESS

CITY STATE

STARS AND STRIPES FOREVER

If you are not a subscriber to the Sentinel send \$1.40.