

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That Charles McKibben and Louis McKibben as Executors of the Estate and Last Will and Testament of Eliza J. McKibben, Deceased have filed their Final Account and the County Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County has fixed Monday, the 8th day of February, 1943 at the hour of 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon in the County Court Room at the County Court House, Eugene, Oregon as the time and place for hearing objections. All objections must be filed on or before said date.

Dated this 29th day of December, 1942.
CHARLIE McKIBBEN,
LOUIS McKIBBEN,
Executors.
Harris & Bryson,
Attorneys. 20-5t-24

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, February 9, 1943, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 19 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the E½NE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3425 M. feet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 70 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$13,872.50 will be considered. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 4th day of January, 1943. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 21-4t-24

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that CHARLES BYRON McFARLAND, as Executor of the Last Will and Testament of C. A. McFARLAND, Deceased, has filed herein his final account in the County Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, and has fixed Tuesday, the 9th day of February, 1943, at the hour of Ten o'clock in the forenoon, at the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, Oregon as the time and place for hearing objections. All objections thereto must be filed on or before said date. Dated January 7, 1943. CHARLES BYRON McFARLAND, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of C. A. McFARLAND, Deceased. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 21-5t-25

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned has been appointed Executor of the Estate of IDA M. MILLER, deceased, by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present the same duly verified with proper vouchers to the undersigned at the Law Office of Herbert W. Lombard, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon within six months of the date of the first publication of this notice. Dated and first published January 14, 1943. LORENZO P. SANFORD, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 22-5t-26

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That WILLIAM ERNEST LEBOW, as Executor of the Last Will and Testament and Codicil of MARGUERITE M. JOHNSON, Deceased, has filed his final account in the County Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, has fixed Tuesday the 16th day of February, 1943, at the hour of 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon in the County Court Room at the County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, State of Oregon as the time and place for hearing objections. All objections thereto must be filed on or before said date. Dated and first published January 14, 1943. WILLIAM ERNEST LEBOW, Executor. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 22-5t-26

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That OSCAR McDOLLE, as the Administrator of the estate of BERT McDOLLE, deceased, has filed herein his final account, and the County Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County has fixed Tuesday, the 23rd day of February, 1943, at the hour of 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing objections. All objections thereto must be filed on or before said date. Dated January 21, 1943. OSCAR McDOLLE, Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 23-5t-27

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned have been appointed as Administrator and Administratrix of the Estate of HARRY L. GRUBE, Deceased, by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby notified to present the same duly verified with proper vouchers to the undersigned at the Law Office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon within six months from the date of the first publication of this notice. Dated and first published January 21, 1943. RAYMOND GRUBE and TWILA L. STEWART, Administratrix and Administrator of the Estate of HARRY L. GRUBE, Deceased. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 23-5t-27

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That MARY JOSEPHINE PHILLIPS as Administratrix of the Estate of ROBERT PHILLIPS, Deceased, has filed herein her final account in the County Court of the State of Oregon for Lane County, has fixed the 23rd day of February, 1943, at the hour of 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon in the County Court Room, County Court House, Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the place for the hearing of objections; all objections thereto must be filed on or before said date. Dated and first published January 21, 1943. MARY JOSEPHINE PHILLIPS, Administratrix. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 23-5t-27

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, February 9, 1943, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 15 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW¼ NW¼ and W¼SE¼NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2295 M. feet Douglas Fir, 245 M. feet Hemlock, 155 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$9,857.50 will be considered. T. 18 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE¼ NE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2030 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$5.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$11,172.50 will be considered. To be logged with caterpillar tractor unless otherwise directed by the District Forester. T. 18 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 2 (NW¼ NE¼) and Lot 3 (NE¼NW¼), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 405 M. feet Douglas Fir. No bid for less than \$5.00 per M.ft.B.M., or a total purchase price of \$2,025.00, will be considered. All trees except Douglas Fir stamped USOC reserved from cutting. To be logged with caterpillar tractor. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 26th day of January, 1943. 24-2t-25

Cursing and yelling on a London street was Clancy holding a doorknob in his fist. "Them damn Nazis will pay for this—blowin' a saloon right out of me hand!"—Ohio Motorist.

Rating for Dating

Maybe it's due to the shortage of something—dates are now on the ration list at the University of Oregon. "A" cards, good for one date a week, are issued to those with below-average grades. Here the scholastic chairman is handing an "X" card (unlimited dates) to a prospective Phi Beta Kappa.



Ex Libris... By William Sharp

THE SECRET WAR...



UNKNOWN TO GERMANY A SECRET RADIO SET UP FOR THE TRANSMISSION OF U.S. MILITARY DATA WAS UNDER THE CONTINUAL SUPERVISION OF THE FBI...

SABOTAGE by MICHAEL SALTER & ALBERT E. KAHN

How About That? Women love the lie that saves their pride, but never an unflattering truth.—Gertrude Franklin Atherton.

Paint Used for Camouflage A new paint now used for camouflage is made from soybean protein, and is similar to casein paint.

AN AMAZING OFFER! YOUR MONEY BACK if Dr. Parker's Corn Remover fails to remove any painful corn or callous. Only 35¢ at Cottage Grove Pharmacy.

Like to go window shopping?

Suppose the windows of all the stores were empty.

That's something like saying, "Suppose there were not advertising."

Advertising tells you what's to be had. It is just like show windows—only more convenient.

It saves your time. It saves time for people with things to sell. That's important these days.

The Sentinel

Buy, Sell, Rent or Trade Thru A Sentinel Wantad,

They Are Inexpensive

RATES: 2 cents per word for 1st insertion, 1 cent per word for subsequent insertions. Minimum charges: 1st insertion 30 cents, subsequent insertions, 25 cents each insertion. Service charge of 15 cents additional will be added for want ads charged after Thursday. Keyed ads 25 cents extra. Card of thanks, resolutions, etc., take same rate as want ads.

FOR SALE—

C. E. RUTH, District Agent for TUALATIN VALLEY NURSERY. Fruit, nut and shade trees, ornamental shrubbery. Sales yard on Henderson Avenue, W. Springfield. Mail address, R. 4, Box 307, Eugene, Oregon. 22-12t-31

BABY CHICKS

White Leghorn, New Hampshire, from 2 and 3 year old hens. Our neighbors, Lane county poultrymen, purchased more than 90,000 from us last season. Geo. M. Peterson Hatchery, Eugene, Oregon. Route 1. 23-13t-35

FOR SALE: Young roan Durham bull, \$80.00. Noble Elliott, six miles up Mosby Creek, telephone 16F11. 23-2t-24

PRUNES, clean, sweet, medium size Potittes, 100 lbs. F. O. B. \$6.50. 13 lbs. \$1.00. Extra choice Italian Prunes, 1b. 10c. G. A. Lindbloom, Roseburg. 23-3t-25

FOR SALE—Bale grain hay. Also dry wood. D. Quaglia, Cottage Grove, Disston route, on Mosby creek. 24-1t-1p

FOR SALE: Baled oats and Vetch hay. E. J. Sears, Delight Valley, phone 35F22. 24-1t-1p

FOR SALE—1 red milking strain Durham-Guernsey cow, second calf, coming fresh Feb. 1. G. Bion Smith, Delight Valley. 24-1t-1p

FOR SALE—Sorrel horse, coming 7, 1400 to 1500 lbs. 17 hands high, broke to ride or work. A fine animal. \$100.00. G. Bion Smith, Delight Valley. 24-1t-1p

NOTICE

If you have a ranch around Cottage Grove with good buildings, water and electricity and you would sell on terms, I am interested. Write 2407 Willamette St., Eugene, or Phone 2577-M, Eugene. 24-1t-1p

FOR RENT—

FOR RENT: 6-room house completely furnished, close in, some fruits. See W. B. Johnston, 22 South 5th St., Telephone 58. 24-1t-1p

LOST—

LOST: Dark brown leather fur-lined top glove. Please return to Russell Porterfield, 104 North I street. 24-1t-1p

LOST: Yellow gold bracelet with initials M. de L. C. Reward, Call 44. 24-1t-1p

MISCELLANEOUS—

WANTED: To buy a row boat. Wayne Jenkins, Disston route, Cottage Grove. 24-1t-1p

WANTED TO RENT: Furnished house or apartment for 3. Telephone 121-L. 24-1t-1p

FOR GOOD HOT FOOD try the Broadway Cafe, across from the Miner Building, Eugene, Oregon. 23-3t-25

FOR RENT—Floor sanders, waxers and a vacuum cleaner. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 33-tfc

All kinds of welding, both electric and acetylene. Machinery repairing and blacksmithing. O. K. Welding Shop, in new location, 10th and Jefferson. 1-tfc

GAS, ELECTRIC WELDING, truck winches made, etc. If it's a repair job, get our estimates. Cottage Grove Boiler and Welding Co. Madison Street. Phone 181Y. 1-tfc

25 Years Experience. Clean, neat work. Paperhanging, painting. C. Maxson, 817 So. Third St. 50-tfc

WATER WELL DRILLING, pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23. J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Oregon. 42-tfc

U. S. Sugar Beet Crop The U. S. sugar beet crop is expected to be about 13,000,000 tons, which is 26 per cent larger than the 1941 crop. The Ohio beet crop also is approximately 26 per cent better than that harvested last year.

AT FIRST SIGN OF A COLD USE 666 666 TABLETS, SALVE, NOSE DROPS

Four marines were playing bridge in a hut on Wake Island. Suddenly another leather-neck burst into the room and shouted: "The Japs are landing a force of about 200 men down on the beach!"

The four bridge-playing marines looked at one another. Finally one said, "I'll go. I'm dummy this hand."—Excavating Engineer.

It is said that Hitler went to consult an astrologer and asked, "On what day will I die?" The astrologer assured him he would die on a Jewish holiday.

"Why are you so sure of that?" he demanded. "Any day on which you die will be a Jewish holiday," responded the astrologer.

"I SAT UP IN BED trying to get a little sleep. Stomach upset. Since using ADLERKA I feel so good! Am 64 years old and do my own work." (E.P. Okla.) If gas is stomach or intestines bothers YOU, try ADLERKA today.

Kem's For Drugs, Kelly Drug Company, and Cottage Grove Pharmacy.

Professional Cards

FUNERAL HOMES

KARL K. MILLS, Mortician. Phone 202

DENTISTS

DR. W. E. LEBOW—Dentistry—No. 1 Omer Apartments Cottage Grove, Ore. Phone 35

PHYSICIANS

H. AXLEY, Physician and Surgeon—Evenings by appointment. Over Kem's for Drugs, Cottage Grove, Oregon.

DR. KATHERINE SCHLEEF, M. D.—Physician and Surgeon. Apartment 10, Omer Apartments. Phone 247.

ATTORNEYS

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney at Law, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. Phone 84

ALTA KING—Lawyer, 613 Main street. Office phone 2541; Res. phone, 28F31, Cottage Grove, Ore.

TITLE ABSTRACT CO., 881 Oak St., Eugene, Ore. Edward F. Bailey, Pres. Abstracts, Title Insurance, Escrows.

SENSATIONAL READING BARGAINS FOR THESE "Stay-at-Home" Times

THIS NEWSPAPER (1 YEAR) and SIX GREAT MAGAZINES FOR BOTH NEWSPAPER and MAGAZINES \$400

GROUP A—Select Two

- Better Homes & Gardens 1 Yr.
- Woman's Home Comp. 1 Yr.
- American Home 1 Yr.
- Click 1 Yr.
- Official Detective Stories 1 Yr.
- American Girl 1 Yr.
- Open Road (12 Iss.) 14 Mo.
- Pathfinder (weekly) 1 Yr.
- Screenland 1 Yr.
- Silver Screen 1 Yr.
- Sports Afield 1 Yr.

GROUP B—Select Two

- True Story 1 Yr.
- Fact Digest 1 Yr.
- Flower Grower 6 Mo.
- Modern Romances 1 Yr.
- Christian Herald 6 Mo.
- Outdoors (12 Iss.) 14 Mo.
- Parents' Magazine 6 Mo.
- Science & Discovery 1 Yr.
- The Woman 1 Yr.
- Pathfinder (weekly) 26 Iss.

GROUP C—Select Two

- American Fruit Grower 1 Yr.
- American Poultry Jnl. 1 Yr.
- Farm Journal & Farmer's Wife 1 Yr.
- Household Magazine 8 Mo.
- Nat. Livestock Producer 1 Yr.
- Poultry Tribune 1 Yr.
- Mother's Home Life 1 Yr.
- Capper's Farmer 1 Yr.
- Successful Farming 1 Yr.

THIS NEWSPAPER (1 YEAR) and SIX GREAT MAGAZINES FOR BOTH NEWSPAPER and MAGAZINES \$350

GROUP A—Select Three

- True Story 1 Yr.
- Fact Digest 1 Yr.
- Flower Grower 6 Mo.
- Modern Romances 1 Yr.
- Modern Screen 1 Yr.
- Outdoors (12 Iss.) 14 Mo.
- Christian Herald 6 Mo.
- Parents' Magazine 6 Mo.
- Pathfinder (weekly) 26 Iss.
- Science & Discovery 1 Yr.
- The Woman 1 Yr.

GROUP B—Select Three

- American Fruit Grower 1 Yr.
- American Poultry Jnl. 1 Yr.
- Farm Journal & Farmer's Wife 1 Yr.
- Household Magazine 8 Mo.
- Nat. Livestock Producer 1 Yr.
- Poultry Tribune 1 Yr.
- Mother's Home Life 1 Yr.
- Capper's Farmer 1 Yr.
- Successful Farming 1 Yr.

THIS NEWSPAPER (1 YEAR) and ANY MAGAZINE LISTED BOTH FOR PRICE SHOWN

All Magazines Are For 1 Year

- American Fruit Grower \$2.25
- American Girl 2.75
- American Home 2.75
- American Magazine 3.25
- American Mercury 3.60
- American Poultry Jnl. 2.15
- Better Cook's & Hom'g 3.60
- Better Homes & Gardens 2.75
- Capper's Farmer 2.25
- Child Life 3.25
- Christian Herald 3.00
- Click 3.60
- Collier's Weekly 3.25
- Column Digest 3.25
- City Gentleman (2 Yrs.) 2.50
- Fact Digest 2.50
- Farm Jnl. & Fm's Wife 2.15
- Flower Grower 3.00
- Household 2.40
- Hygia 3.25
- Liberty (weekly) 4.10
- Look (every other week) 3.25
- Modern Romances 3.50
- Modern Screen 2.50
- Nature (10 Iss., 12 mo.) 3.60
- Official Detective Stories 3.00
- Open Road (12 Iss., 14 mo.) 2.75
- Outdoors (12 Iss., 14 mo.) 2.50
- Parents' Magazine 3.00
- Pathfinder (weekly) 2.75
- Popular Mechanics 3.75
- Poultry Tribune 2.15
- Redbook Magazine 3.25
- Screenland 2.75
- Silver Screen 2.75
- Science & Discovery 2.90
- Sports Afield 2.75
- Successful Farming 2.25
- True Story 2.50
- The Woman 2.60
- Woman's Home Comp. 2.75
- Your Life 3.60

IT'S FUN TO BE "STAY-AT-HOMES" WITH SO MUCH GOOD READING

COUPON FILL IN AND MAIL TO THIS NEWSPAPER TODAY

Check magazines desired and enclose with coupon.

Gentlemen: I enclose \$..... Please send me the offer checked, with a year's subscription to your paper.

NAME.....

STREET OR R.F.D.....

POSTOFFICE.....