

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING

Gertrude D. Mather, administratrix of the estate of George E. Mather, deceased, has filed her final account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed October 6, 1942, at 2 o'clock P. M. in the Court Room of said Court in the Court House at Eugene, Lane county, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing and acting thereon.

First publication, September 3, 1942.

GERTRUDE D. MATHER,
ALTA KING Administratrix
Attorney 3-547

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, That the undersigned, THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF EUGENE (Oregon), has been appointed Administrator of the Estate of HOMER C. NELSON, Deceased, by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against the said Estate must present the same duly verified on or before six months to the Administrator at its place of business, 806 Willamette Street Eugene, Oregon. Dated and first published September 10, 1942. THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF EUGENE (Oregon), Administrator. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney. 4-51-8

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

"Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, October 13, 1942 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 17 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 21, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW 1/4 and NE 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4430 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet Hemlock, 75 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Red Cedar, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$14,607.50, will be considered. All Douglas Fir less than 30 inches, and Hemlock and Red Cedar less than 14 inches DBHOB reserved from cutting. Parts of the NE 1/4 SE 1/4, as designated by the District Forester to be logged with caterpillar tractor. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 14th day of September, 1942. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 5-41-8

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, October 13, 1942, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S 1/4 SW 1/4 and SW 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5160 M. feet Douglas Fir, 35 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$21,982.50, will be considered. All trees less than 14 inches DBHOB reserved from cutting. To be logged with caterpillar tractor except in areas designated by the District Forester. The right to waive technical defects and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 26th day of September, 1942. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 7-21-8

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, October 13, 1942, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 18 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S 1/4 SW 1/4 and SW 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5160 M. feet Douglas Fir, 35 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.25 per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$21,982.50, will be considered. All trees less than 14 inches DBHOB reserved from cutting. To be logged with caterpillar tractor except in areas designated by the District Forester. The right to waive technical defects and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 26th day of September, 1942. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration. 7-21-8

There is a fuel shortage, but not a shortage of old papers for building fires. Get old papers at Sentinel office, 10c a bundle. If you don't we'll use 'em ourselves.

LEGAL NOTICES

Statement of the Ownership, Management, Circulation, Etc., Required by the Acts of Congress of August 24, 1912, and March 3, 1933.

Of Cottage Grove Sentinel, published weekly at Cottage Grove, Oregon, for October 1, 1942.

State of Oregon, County of Lane, ss.

Before me, a notary public in and for the State and County aforesaid, personally appeared W. C. Martin, who, having been duly sworn according to law, deposes and says that he is the publisher of the Cottage Grove Sentinel, and that the following is, to the best of his knowledge and belief, a true statement of the ownership, management, etc., of the aforesaid publication for the date shown in the above caption, required by the Act of August 24, 1912, as amended by the Act of March 3, 1933, embodied in section 537, Postal Laws and Regulations, printed on the reverse of this form, to wit:

1. That the names and addresses of the publisher, editor, managing editor, and business manager is W. C. Martin, Cottage Grove, Oregon.

2. That the owner is: W. C. Martin, Cottage Grove, Oregon.

3. That the known bondholders, mortgages, and other security holders owning or holding 1 percent or more of total amount of bonds, mortgages, or other securities are: None.

W. C. MARTIN, Owner.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 25th day of September, 1942.

RUTH DeLONG, Notary Public for Oregon.

NOTICE OF SALE

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That by virtue of an Order of the County Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, duly made and entered of record in the matter of REBECCA A. MEDLEY, deceased, the undersigned, Executrix, will on and after 10:00 o'clock a. m. on the 30th day of October, 1942, offer for sale, and sell at private sale, the following described real estate belonging to said estate, to-wit:

Parcel A. The South sixteen and one-half (S. 16 1/2) feet of Lot One (1) in Block Four (4), all in Manitou Park, in Lane county, Oregon.

Parcel B. Beginning at the southwest corner of Lot Two (2) in Block Four (4) in Manitou Park, running thence west to the center of the channel of the Coast Fork River; thence in a northeasterly direction following down the center of the channel of said Coast Fork River to a point due west of the Northwest corner of said Lot Two (2) in Block Four (4) in said Manitou Park; thence east to the northwest corner of said Lot Two (2) in Block Four (4) in said Manitou Park; thence south Fifty (50) feet to the place of beginning, in section 28 Township 20 South Range 3 West Willamette Meridian, Lane County, Oregon.

Parcels A and B being described in Transfer Certificate of Title No. 6117 Volume 10 Folium 541 Certificate of Title Registrar Lane County, State of Oregon, and Parcel B also being included in Transfer Certificate of Title No. 9373 Volume 16 Folium 192 Certificate of Title Registrar Lane County, State of Oregon.

Parcel C. Lot No. Two (2) in Block No. Four (4) in Manitou Park as platted and filed of record in the office of the County Clerk of the County of Lane, and State of Oregon.

Bids will be received and sale will take place at the Law Office of Herbert W. Lombard, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon.

Terms of sale: Cash in hand, or part cash and part credit. Abstract of Title to be furnished to date.

Dated October 1, 1942. MARY ADELIA HATCH, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of REBECCA A. MEDLEY, Deceased. HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 7-51-11

RUBBER FOOTWEAR RATIONED

Rationing of rubber footwear was effective midnight, September 29th. Rubber footwear will be rationed much in the same manner as tires and tubes. Footwear of this type will be issued only to individuals who demonstrate that their work is necessary for the war effort and those whose working conditions require such footwear. Applicants who can qualify will be issued a certificate, which when presented to the dealer, will enable them to buy the needed rubber footwear.

To Relieve Misery of

GOLDS
Take 666
LIQUID, TABLETS, SALVE, NOSE DROPS

WANT-ADS

NEW WANT AD RATES

On September 1st, we found it necessary to adjust our want ad rate structure to meet increasing production costs. On and after September 1st, the following rates shall apply: First insertion: 15 word or three line minimum, 30 cents. For all lines over three add 10 cents per line. Second insertion: Minimum charge up to and including five lines or 25 words, 25 cents per insertion, and for all lines exceeding 5 add 5 cents per line. A five percent discount will be made for cash on ads running three times or more. Where ads are charged a 15 cent service charge will be made and a 25c charge will also be maintained on keyed ads.

Resolutions, cards of thanks, etc., will be charged for at the rate of ten cents per line, with a 50 cent minimum charge maintained as formerly.

FOR SALE—

A REAL SOUND home and income property consisting of 4 Apts., completely furnished. Total income \$100.00 per mo. 75x130 ft. corner lot. Deal with owner at a sacrifice price and some terms. 1104 Washington Ave. 4-41p-7

IMPROVED ELBERTA Peaches, \$1.00 to \$2.00 per bu. Small supply of Hales and Muirs. Squashes of all kinds. Melons, onions and green peppers. 7 miles north of Coberg on the river road. Gerald Detering. 7-11p

RADIO TUBES and service—Dexter Somers, 405 Main Street. 7-21c-8

FOR SALE—Twenty-six good breeding ewes. Oscar McDole, Black Butte route. 7-31p-9

FOR SALE—Fat young ducks, excellent for frying, 75c. Mrs. Asa Keller, 911 South River Road. 7-11p

FOR SALE—My home at 709 Washington Avenue. Might consider renting. Call evenings. 7-11p

FOR IMMEDIATE SALE—Four 15x700 tires, wheels and tubes; two 17-600 tires and tubes. No breaks. All in good condition. H. W. Hubbell, 516 South 3rd St. 7-11p

FOR RENT—

EXCELLENT STORAGE space for furniture, autos, household goods of all kinds at reasonable rates in private rooms or open storage. We have an excellent equipment. Cottage Grove Storage Warehouse Co., phone Jesse Lansing, Cottage Grove 99. 39-11c

FOR RENT: Modern three room cottage, wired for electric range. Garden spot and fruit available. Ideal for couple. Mile out on South 6th. See W. C. Martin at Sentinel office. 3-11c

FOR RENT—Floor sanders, waxers and a vacuum cleaner. The Grove Hardware, phone 18. 33-11c

FURNISHED CABINS For Rent by week or month, utilities furnished, oil heat and gas ranges. Inquire Reed's Service Store, 3 1/2 miles south on 99. 3-11c

3 AND 4 ROOM CABINS for rent. Water and lights furnished. Very attractive prices. Five miles south on Highway 99. Lucky Bayn, Pass Creek Service Station, phone 5F21. 5-11c

FOR RENT, SALE OR TRADE: Two farms. W. W. Chrisman, 710 South 3rd St. 7-11p

FOR RENT—Upstairs apartment, partly furnished, by Chas. Armstrong, 1329 West Main. 7-11p

FOR RENT—Furnished apartment. Reasonable rent. Three rooms and bath. 409 North 8th street. 7-11p

Professional Cards

FUNERAL HOMES

KARL K. MILLS, Mortician. Phone 202

DENTISTS

DR. W. E. LEBOW—Dentistry—No. 1 Omer Apartments Cottage Grove, Ore. Phone 35

PHYSICIANS

H. AXLEY, Physician and Surgeon—Evenings by appointment. Over Kem's for Drugs. Cottage Grove, Oregon.

DR. KATHERINE SCHLEEF, M. D.—Physician and Surgeon. Apartment 10, Omer Apartments. Phone 247.

ATTORNEYS

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney at Law. First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. Phone 94.

ALTA KING—Lawyer, 613 Main street. Office phone 264J; Res. phone, 28F31, Cottage Grove, Ore.

TITLE ABSTRACT CO.—881 Oak St., Eugene, Ore. Edward F. Bailey, Pres. Abstracts, Title Insurance, Escrows.

FOR RENT—Three room downstairs furnished apartment with bath. Private entrance. Lights and water. 1627 West Main. 7-11p

HELP WANTED—

SALESWOMEN: Positions available as service station saleswomen. Previous experience not essential. Opportunity for valuable training. Apply to the Shell Oil Co., Inc., 9th and Main St. 7-11c

WANTED—

WANTED—Good 17 inch tire. Will pay \$25.00. LeRoy Whaley, Disston route. 7-11p

WANTED to buy good used sewing machine and kitchen cabinet. Mrs. Oscar Stewart, Black Butte route. 7-11p

WANTED—Motorcycle with fairly good tires. Phone 2F2. 7-11p

WANTED—Small tractor in good condition, either rubber or steel wheels. See W. C. Martin at Sentinel office. 3-11c

WANTED—Car loaders \$5.00 a car. Approximately \$1.00 per hour. House available. Drain, Ore. Inquire Sandlin Auto Court. 7-11c

TO TRADE—

TO TRADE—Five room house in Cottage Grove for Medford property. Inquire Sentinel office. 6-21p-7

TIMBER WANTED—

WANTED—Oak and Fir Ship Knees, all sizes; also 7-inch top 110-ft. Fir Piling. Quote prices, earliest shipment. Niedermeyer-Martin Lumber Co., Portland, Oregon. 6-31c-8

MISCELLANEOUS—

GAS, ELECTRIC WELDING, truck winches made, etc. If it's a repair job, get our estimates. Cottage Grove Boiler and Welding Co. Madison Street. Phone 181Y. 1-11c

RADIO and Appliance repairs by Dexter Somers at Nelson Electric shop, 405 Main Street. 5-21c-6

WATER WELL DRILLING, pumps and supplies. Phone 26F23. J. H. Thomas, Oakland, Oregon. 42-11c

REAL ESTATE and AUTOMOBILE INSURANCE. Representative of E. A. Strout. Listings wanted. W. F. Burgess, Yoncalla, Oregon. 40-11c

All kinds of welding, both electric and acetylene. Machinery repairing and blacksmithing. O. K. Welding Shop, in new location, 10th and Jefferson. 1-11c

LANDMARK AT OAKLAND BURNED

One of Douglas county's landmarks, the Haines hotel at Oakland, was destroyed Monday afternoon by a fire which required the combined services of the Oakland and Sutherlin fire departments to control.

Fire on the roof of the three-story wooden structure, built about 50 years ago, was discovered about 1 p. m. The blaze consumed the top floor and damaged the remainder of the building to such an extent that repairs are believed to be impossible.

Every ton of iron and steel scrap salvaged save two tons of iron ore, one of our most precious national resources. Get in your scrap.

AN AMAZING OFFER!

YOUR MONEY BACK if Dr. Parker's Corn Remover fails to remove any painful corn or callous. Only 35c at Cottage Grove Pharmacy.

Headlines You'll Never Read in a Free Press—

State Confiscates Church Property

That's a headline that wouldn't make pleasant reading in this country, any more than it has in some nations. The right to attend church, to worship as we see fit, is a right of first importance.

Suppose, next Sunday, instead of going to church you were required to hear the voice of a dictator telling you that all your old ideas of right and wrong were based on fairy tales.

Suppose your favorite clergyman was held in a concentration camp because his views differed from those of the dictator.

You adults, brought up with the fear of God in your hearts, might see your children learning allegiance to a new god, a false god.

Freedom of worship would be gone. But before that, another freedom would have vanished—the freedom of the press.

It isn't a pretty picture. But it has happened. To say that all freedoms are closely related to or dependent upon the freedom of the press is not ofered in boastful spirit.

This newspaper sees this fact as a solemn responsibility, conscious that it must always be first on the firing line against any assault upon the American way of life.

This week, Newspaper Week, we remind you readers that you're in a partnership with us to protect ALL freedoms.

Cottage Grove Sentinel

Businessmen—Let's talk about death! Let's not dodge the issues—let's face facts. A lot of good American fighting men may soon have to die for want of scrap! Oregon must yield 100,000 tons.

IF YOU FAIL SOME BOY WILL DIE!

WE'RE talking facts, remember! Such as the fact that steel for every tank, ship and gun must be made of 50% scrap. And the terrible fact that America's mills are

starving for this scrap—without enough on hand for even 30 days more production!

Which puts it up to you!

Monday, October 5, starts the big scrap metal drive. And you, as a business man, have a double job to do. Clean out your home—and

scour your place of business, factory, office or store... for every single bit of scrap.

And when you see the stockpile grow—for the mills to take when it's needed—be glad that you've done your part... that your work may have saved some boy from a needless death!

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★
Watch The Sentinel for details of the big scrap drive and what you must do to help
Newspapers' United Scrap Metal Drive