

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION.

Forest Exchange 022674, United States Department of the Interior, District Land Office, Roseburg, Oregon, November 22, 1941. Notice is hereby given that Louis M. Bliss and Anna L. Bliss, Route No. 2, Corvallis, Oregon, did, on November 15, 1941, make application under the act of March 20, 1922 (42 Stat. 465), to select certain timber from approximately 13 acres comprising portions of Sections 19, 20, 21, 22, 27, 28, 29 and 30, T. 19 S., R. 4 E., W. M., Willamette National Forest, Lane County, Oregon, in exchange for the NE 1/4 SW 1/4, S 1/4 SW 1/4, SE 1/4 NW 1/4, NE 1/4 SW 1/4, N 1/4 NW 1/4 SW 1/4, N 1/4 SE 1/4 SW 1/4, and E 1/4 SW 1/4 SE 1/4 SW 1/4, Sec. 8, T. 17 S., R. 11 W., W. M., Siuslaw National Forest, Lane County, Oregon. Any and all persons claiming the lands selected, or having bona fide objections to the exchange should file their protests on or before Dec. 30, 1941.

GEORGE FINLEY,
Register.

16-5t-20

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING.

Notice is hereby given that Nona Kelly, administrator de bonis non, of the estate of Florence Kelly, deceased, has filed her final account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed January 6, 1942, at ten o'clock in the forenoon in the Court room of said Court, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place of hearing, considering and acting thereon.

Date of first publication, December 4, 1941.

NONA KELLY,
Administrator de bonis non.
ALTA KING,
Attorney.

17-5t-21

NOTICE OF UNION HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 14 BOND ELECTION.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That at the Union High School District No. 14 Bond Election hereby called to be held in the Music Room at the Union High School building in and for the said Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, State of Oregon, on Tuesday, the 6th day of January, 1942, between the hours of 2:00 o'clock p. m. and 7:00 o'clock p. m., there will be submitted to the legal voters thereof the question of contracting a bonded indebtedness of the district in the sum of Six Thousand and No/100 Dollars (\$6,000.00) for the purpose of providing funds with which to complete the payment of the cost of erecting, equipping and furnishing a school building on property owned by the district, the same being payment for extras in the erection of a Union High School building under and pursuant to a judgment entered in the Circuit Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, in the case of Joseph H. Anderson vs. Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon, case No. 2748 and dated November 8, 1941.

The vote on said question to be by ballot upon which shall be the words "Bonds" "Yes" and "Bonds" "No" and the voters shall place a cross "X" between the word "Bonds" and the word "Yes" or between the word "Bonds" and the word "No" which indicates his choice.

The polls for the reception of the ballots east for or against the contracting of said bonded indebtedness will, on said day and date and at the place aforesaid, be opened at the hour of 2:00 o'clock p. m. and shall remain open until the hour of 7:00 o'clock p. m. of the same day when the same shall be closed.

By order of the District School

Professional Cards

FUNERAL HOMES

KARL K. MILLS, Mortician.
Phone 202

DENTISTS

DR. W. E. LEBOW—Dentistry
—No. 1 Omer Apartments
Cottage Grove, Ore. Phone 35

PHYSICIANS

H. AXLEY, Physician and Surgeon—Evenings by appointment. Over Kem's for Drugs. Cottage Grove, Oregon.

DR. KATHERINE SCHLEEF,
M. D.—Physician and Surgeon. Apartment 10, Omer Apartments, Phone 247.

ATTORNEYS

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney at Law, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, Phone 94.

ALTA KING—Lawyer, 613 Main Street, Office phone 2541; Res. phone, 28F31, Cottage Grove, Ore.

NICK GRANOFF—Lawyer. Phone 90. 613 Main St. 2

TITLE ABSTRACT CO., 881 Oak St., Eugene, Ore. Edward F. Bailey, Pres. Abstracts, Title Insurance, Es-crows.

LEGAL NOTICES

Board of Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon, made this 19th day of December, 1941.

CHARLES BEIDLER, Chairman of Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon.

Attest:
WORTH HARVEY, Clerk of Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon.
12-18-41-12-25-41

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.

Notice is hereby given that Mae C. Ostrander has been appointed by the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, as administratrix of the estate of William H. Ostrander, deceased, in Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby required to present them duly verified as by law required to said administratrix at the law office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of this notice.

Date of first publication being December 18, 1941.
MAE C. OSTRANDER,
ALTA KING, Administratrix
Attorney 19-5t-23

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, General Land Office, O. and C. Administration, Portland, Oregon. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, January 13, 1942, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 16 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 65 M. feet DD Fir, 3210 M. feet DC Fir, 4255 M. feet DA Fir, 345 M. feet Hemlock, 340 M. feet Red Cedar, 240 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the DD Fir and Red Cedar, \$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the DC Fir, \$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the DA Fir, \$1.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Hemlock, \$7.5 ea. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$20,317.50 will be considered. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids, is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 8th day of December, 1941. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration.

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING.

Notice is hereby given that Emma Aubrey Smith, executrix, with the will annexed of the estate of Malinda Aubrey, deceased, has filed her final account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed January 13, 1942, at 2 o'clock in the afternoon in the court room of said Court, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon.

Date of first publication, December 11, 1941.

Date of last publication, January 8, 1942.
EMMA AUBREY SMITH,
ALTA KING, Executrix
Attorney 18-5t-22

UNITED STATES Department of the Interior, General Land Office, O. and C. Administration, Portland, Oregon.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE
Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, Jan. 13, 1942, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms

To Relieve
Misery of
666
LIQUID
TABLETS
SALVE
NOSE DROPS
COUGH DROPS
Try "Rub-My-Tum"—a Wonderful Laxative

LEGAL NOTICES

of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 16 S., R. 1 E., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the E 1/4 SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1330 M. feet Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B.M., or a total purchase price of \$3,990.00 will be considered. All trees 22 inches and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. Timber to be felled away from areas of young growth. T. 17 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW 1/4 NW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 140 M. feet DA Fir, 180 M. feet DB Fir, 255 M. feet DC Fir. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the DA Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the DB Fir and DC Fir, or a total purchase price of \$1,290.00 will be considered. All trees 16 inches and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. T. 18 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE 1/4 NE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3057 pieces Douglas Fir Piling, as follows: 1464 pcs., 84,230 lin. ft. at \$0.01 per ft., 794 pcs., 59,550 lin. ft. at \$0.0125 per ft., 643 pcs., 54,655 lin. ft. at \$0.015 per ft., 115 pcs., 10,925 lin. ft. at \$0.02 per ft., 35 pcs., 3,675 lin. ft. at \$0.025 per ft., 6 pcs., 690 lin. ft. at \$0.03 per ft. No bid for less than \$2,737.56 the total purchase price, will be considered. Area to be logged with horses or caterpillar tractor. All trees except those branded USOC are reserved from cutting. Consult the District Ranger in Eugene for further information. T. 19 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 33, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the E 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 395 M. feet DB Fir, 1910 M. feet DC Fir, 5 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the DB Fir, \$2.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the DC Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$5,877.50, will be considered. All trees 14 inches and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 19, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW 1/4 NW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 640 M. feet Yellow Fir, 1510 M. feet Red Fir, 30 M. feet Red Cedar, 40 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Yellow Fir, \$2.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the Red Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the Red Cedar, \$7.5 ea. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$5,770.00 will be considered. T. 20 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW 1/4 NE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1000 M. feet DA Fir, 90 M. feet DC Fir, 95 M. feet Red Cedar, 15 M. feet Incense Cedar, 355 M. feet Hemlock, 25 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$4.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the DA Fir, \$2.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the DC Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the Red Cedar, \$1.25 per M. ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$1.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Hemlock, \$7.5 ea. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$4,760.00 will be considered. All trees 14 inches and less DBHOB, Incense Cedar 34 inches and less DBHOB, Red Cedar 12 inches and less DBHOB, and Hemlock 22 inches and less DBHOB, reserved from cutting. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids, is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 22nd day of December, 1941. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That the undersigned, Maude R. Wheeler, has been appointed by the County Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of THOMAS C. WHEELER, sometimes known as T. C. WHEELER, Deceased, by an order bearing date the 23rd day of December, 1941. All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby notified and required to present the same duly verified to the undersigned at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, on or before six months from the date of first publication of this notice. Dated and first published December 25, 1941.
MAUDE R. WHEELER, Executrix Last Will and Testament THOMAS C. WHEELER, sometimes known as T. C. WHEELER, Deceased.
HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Executrix 20-5t-24

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That the undersigned, Maude R. Wheeler, has been appointed by the County Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, Executrix of the Last Will and Testament of THOMAS C. WHEELER, sometimes known as T. C. WHEELER, Deceased, by an order bearing date the 23rd day of December, 1941.

All persons having claims against said Estate are hereby notified and required to present the same duly verified to the undersigned at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, on or before six months from the date of first publication of this notice. Dated and first published December 25, 1941.

MAUDE R. WHEELER, Executrix Last Will and Testament THOMAS C. WHEELER, sometimes known as T. C. WHEELER, Deceased.
HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Executrix 20-5t-24

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that an application has been made to the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, for the change of names as follows: Name of Anna Marie Peterson to be changed to Anna Marie Sefarly and name of Robert D. Peterson to be changed to the name of Robert D. Sefarly.

A hearing on said application has been set for the County Court Room in the Court House in Eugene, Oregon, at 10 o'clock A. M. on the 15th day of January, 1942, and all persons are hereby notified to offer and show cause if any they have on or before the time of said hearing why the said petition should not be granted.

CLINTON HURD, Judge of the County Court of Lane County, Oregon. 20-1tc

CHRISTIAN SCIENCE CHURCHES

"YES the Universe, Including Man, Evolved by Atomic Force?" was the subject of the Lesson-Sermon in all Churches of Christ, Scientist, on Sunday, December 21.

The Golden Text was, "God hath spoken once; twice have I heard this; that power belongeth unto God" (Ps. 62:11). Among the citations which comprised the Lesson-Sermon was the following from the Bible: "In the beginning God created the heaven and the earth. And God said, 'Let us make man in our image, after our likeness. So God created man in his own image, in the image of God created he him; male and female created he them. 'And God saw everything that he had made, and, behold, it was very good' (Gen. 1:1,2,6,27,31).

The Lesson-Sermon also included the following correlative passages from the Christian Science textbook, "Science and Health with Key to the Scriptures" by Mary Baker Eddy: "The universe of Spirit reflects the creative power of the divine Principle, or Life, which reproduces the multitudinous forms of Mind and governs the multiplication of the compound idea man. Infinite Mind creates and governs all, from the mental molecule to infinity" (p.567).

Drive on Bath Slips

Round bottomed bathtubs contribute heavily to the 5,000,000 injuries occurring in homes. To reduce this toll the United States Housing authority recommends tubs with bottoms as flat as consistent with proper drainage.

Biggest Island

Australia is the largest island in the world—so big, in fact, that it is often referred to as a continent. It contains 2,974,581 square miles. Despite the fact that Australia could easily support 150,000,000 people, only about 6,000,000 persons live there and most of the interior is still unexplored.

DON'T TAKE THIS LYING DOWN . . .



When men are fighting and dying, you must do your part. Be sure you enlist your DOLLARS FOR DEFENSE. Back our armed forces—and protect your own life—with every single dollar and dime you can.

America must have a steady flow of money pouring in every day to help beat back our enemies.

Put Dimes into Defense Stamps. And put Dollars into Bonds. Buy now. Buy every pay day. Buy as often as you can.

Don't take this lying down.

WANT-ADS

RATES: Five cents per line or one cent per word, with minimum charge of 25 cents. Three insertions for the price of 2 1/2, if paid in advance. Want ads will be charged only where firms or individuals have established credit. Send money to insure insertion. If charged add 15c. Keyed ads 25c extra. Card of thanks 50c if not over 50 words, if over 50 words, cards of thanks will be charged at the regular rate. Copy must be in Wednesday to insure insertion.

WISHING all of our patrons a Merry Xmas and Happy New Year. Mr. and Mrs. Charles P. Armstrong, 1521 Ash Avenue, phone 103-Y. 20-1tp

WORK WANTED—WANTED — Washing and ironing to do. Inquire at Knox Hill Service Station. 20-2tp-21

FOR RENT—

STORAGE SPACE FOR RENT: For furniture, automobiles and merchandise of all kinds. Cottage Grove Storage Warehouse Co., 103 North Lane Street. See Jesse Lansing, 32 South 10th St. or Twin Oaks Co. at Eugene. 14-tfc

FOR RENT to small family, 4-room house — bath, electricity, garden spot, privilege of cows. Four miles south of Cottage Grove. For appointment telephone 5F12, Alsea Hawley. 18-3tp-20

FOR RENT—3-room modern cottage at Airport Tourist Court, 1/2 mile south. 19-3tp-21

FOR RENT — Partly modern, newly decorated, furnished house. Inquire at Paris Breedlove's store on South 6th St., Cottage Grove. 20-1tp

FOR SALE—

FOR SALE — Coil for Montag burner in excellent condition; 100 to 200 feet of 2x12 lumber, like new, also about 50 feet of new hardwood flooring. See W. C. Martin at Sentinel office. 14-1tc

HENS DRESSED ready for oven. R. W. Hill, Saginaw. Phone 28F5. 19-3tc-21

PLACE FOR SALE, close in or will trade for place out of town a mile or so. Apply to 122 Third Street. 20-1tp

FOR SALE—Model T Ford, new battery, cheap. Leaving town. Phone 28F5. 20-1tc

FOUND—

FOUND—A black and white umbrella at the post office. Owner may have same in exchange for payment of this ad. 20-1tc

TO GIVE AWAY—

TWO KITTENS to give away. Part Persian. 1521 Ash Ave. Phone 103Y. 20-1tp

MISCELLANEOUS—

WELDING Gas Electric Cottage Grove Welding and Boiler Works, Madison Street. Phone 181-Y. 26-tfc

FLOOR SANDING—

Work guaranteed to satisfy. Experienced operator. A. W. Shofstall, 624 No. 10th St. Phone 211R or contact Claude Sherman. 1-tfc

All kinds of welding, both electric and acetylene. Machinery repairing and blacksmithing. O. K. Welding Shop, in new location, 10th and Jefferson. 1-tfc

25 Years Experience. Clean, neat work. Paperhanging, painting. C. Maxson, 518 So. Douglas, where the tracks cross 6th St. 50-tfc

FOR STOMACH FLU and that all-gone feeling, see Dr. Simkins, chiropractor, over Petersen's, phone 17-tfc

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR

Wiring and Rewiring Agents for Berkeley Pumps. Leon C. Godard, 405 Main St., phone 156-L-201. 10-tf

START THE NEW YEAR with Swedish Baths and Massage. 1521 Ash Ave. Phone 103Y. 20-3tp-22

Does Not Like Horses

One of the most prolific writers of Hollywood "Westerns" is Betty Burbridge, says the American magazine. In 10 years she's turned out more than a hundred of what the film folks call "giddyap" movies. But strangely enough, this author of horse operas writes only from hearsay—she just does not like horses.

CITY COURT

Arraigned in city court the past week were: George Machen, forfeited \$10.00 bail on charge of drunkenness; W. A. Gerrard, forfeited \$10.00 bail on charge of drunkenness.

Stranded—He's

We've all heard of job-getting stunts, but here's one that takes the cake. A young man wrote 81 notes, mailed them in 81 bottles to 81 advertising agencies. The notes read: "Stranded! . . . on an island in Cambridge . . . a college graduate . . . Will work like h— for passage into port . . . Have you room in the hold for a man who can prove he's worth his salt?" P. S. It worked.

\$1.50
ST. FRANCIS
HOTEL
A FAMILIAR PLACE
5 W 11th AVE AT MAIN
CONVENIENT
COMFORTABLE
ECONOMICAL
PORTLAND, ORE.

THIS WILL BE OUR BUSIEST CHRISTMAS—
We deeply appreciate your most helpful cooperation. You are helping us to help you.
We want you to know that we are meeting this emergency with everything we've got, but in these critical times delays are bound to occur. Our lines are carrying a tremendous volume of traffic—in the last few days they have been the busiest in Pacific Coast history. It is necessary, of course, that in all instances, our lines be readily available for telephone calls important to Defense.
Your considerate thoughtfulness in not making other than the most urgent calls is an inspiration to all of us who are earnestly endeavoring to uphold the finest traditions of telephone service.
May we also ask you to lend us a hand over the Holiday Season by not sending greetings by Long Distance.
Thank you.

THE PACIFIC TELEPHONE AND TELEGRAPH COMPANY
524 Main Street—Telephone 83
Loose Leaf Supplies—all kinds. The Sentinel.

Merchants!
SALESBOOKS
GREEN-BAK
MADE RIGHT PRICED RIGHT
We sell them!
PLACE YOUR NEXT ORDER WITH US
The Sentinel
Phone 159

POPEYE, THE RECRUITING OFFICER, HAS FOOD FOR THOUGHT!

POPEYE: AHOY, SWAB, YA LOOKS LIKE A MILLION BUCKS!
P-SS-T-POPEYE: IT MUST COST PLENTY TO BUY A NAVY UNIFORM LIKE THAT!
ARF-ARF: YA GETS UNIFORMS FREE WHEN YA ENLISTS AN' FREE FOOD AN' NO DOCTOR OR DENTIST BILLS!
GEE, THEN IN TH' NAVY THE PAY IS GRAY!
NEXT DAY
SOME HOSTESS!! I'M GLAD I ENLISTED, BUT YOU SURE GOT THE GRAY!
Your pay in the Navy is gravy
No rent to pay. No food to buy. No doctor's or dentist's bills. Even movies and other entertainment are free. And when you first enlist, the Navy gives you \$118.00 worth of uniforms!
And if you want to learn a trade, the Navy is the place to do it. There are forty-five odd trades you can learn . . . training that's worth hundreds of dollars the first year.
The Navy offers the chance of a lifetime to young men. If you are 17 or over, get a free copy of the illustrated booklet "LIFE IN THE U. S. NAVY," from the Navy Editor of this newspaper. Simply write or call.
SERVE YOUR COUNTRY! BUILD YOUR FUTURE! GET IN THE NAVY NOW!