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An Incident as Soviet Farmers Harvest Crop Under Fire legal notices

RATES: Five rrn ln  ,ter line or 
one cent per Word, w ith  m inimum 
charge of 25 cents Three Inser­
tion* (in the p ll ie  ul 2'». If |»tl(l 
In advance. W a n t  adx w ill tie 
charged only where flnnn or In- , 
d ividual* have ealubliohed credit. 
Send money lo  Inaurv Inaertlon. If  
charged add 15c. Keyed uda 25c 
extra Curd of thunk* 50c If not 
over 50 word*, If over 50 word*, 
eardx of fhnnkx w ill be charged 
at the regular rale. Copy niuxt la­
in WednoHilny to Iriaure Inaertlon

Help Wanted
/ x z s ^ z ' z

HOP PICKERS W ANTED W ill 
l»ay $2.00 W rite  Sinaia B roth­

er«, Ila rrlahnrg. Oregon 2-.3lp -I

Work Wanted
EXPEIKKNCED I.ADY Wl*h.-x 

washing and Ironing, hont or 
day work. Cottage Grove Hotel.
Apt. 302 .F lip

For Sale
SALE 
12 wiad

Practically 
rug Phone

new Hi
2 .Mi-J

________________________ 52-311. 1

FOR SALE- Barred Rock Ei \
era, 22c u lb. live weight C.

Turner. 2 ml. eaxl of Cottage 
(•rove on M<mhy Creek rontl 
_________________________ l-3tp-3!
T A K IN G  O R D ER S f o r  Gokk-n 

Bantam sweet com fo r cunning.
Ha* been treated to prevent ear 
worm*. Roy 8. Hand*, phone 1F2. 
S m ile north of steel bridge -»n 
Row river. l-3 tp-3

Et»R SALE Modern xix-rtxxn 
house w ith  kit 88x20-3 Ju*t out- 

aide of c ity  lim it«  on Washington
Ave Price reasonable. Enxl Kelly, 
phone 9FI5. l-12tp-12

i ' 'R SALE- Fruit Jara, 40c per 
do». Also kitchen cabinet, price

*100, RIH W hitaker Ave, 3- Up

BEANS FOR CANNING, 4 c l* 
Ih. Delivered. Call at 714 No. 

laiUgla* Ave I-U p
PIANO  L it t le  spinet, lovely tone.

bargain, «¡ash or Mime terms to 
responsible party. D. W. Cook,
1224 8, E. "Mib Ave., Portland. 
_____________ ____________ 3- Up

QET YOUR C AN N IN G  CORN 
and pear« now Mr*. Roy Ken­

nedy, Miaiby Cr«*-k Phone 18F2.
3 -ltp

- «m m »—>■' .M M — -1 ■■■— mi — fc»

H i l t  SALE 40 acre« ck«*e to 
town Small down |uiymcnt 

<iood term* .38 acre* clone to
l io u *e , garage and liarn 
clear. $3.500, $1.000 eo«h.

In  t r im  rare asalnot llm r  and N arl panrer«, Ih r»«  Soviet farm ers »omewhere behand fro n t continue harveatln« operation despite^ menace 
of G erm an plane downed on farm . W here crop* can't be harvested, Soviet are destroying them s i port of "acorcbed ea rt“ policy. 

. Paswti by autssow censer.l

Want to Hunt
W ANTED Unfurnished house io 

rent by September 6th Four in 
fam ily Write- Ed llh  Bowman,
Oakland, Oregon. 3 - llp

Wanted to Buy
W AN TED  2500, 26-inch red ce­
dar «hake«. C. E. Brown, la-llght 
Valley, phone 4<iFS or 241 3-ltC<X\ZVZ'X.Z*/'»''»Z

For Kent,z\ysz -WVAA -e* *-/VA
HOUSE FOR RENT or sale. In ­

quire at 141 Th ird  St. l-3tc-3
MODERN HOUSE EoR 

918 West Main Si
Smith, 324 Aibim* SI

LEGAL NOTICES LEGAL NOTICES LEGAL NOTICES
of "The E ir*t Methodist Episcopal 
Church of Cottage Grove." und to 
transact a ll *u«-h other busin«-«* a* 
properly pertain* to anti I* Oon- 
n<*-t«*l w ith  such proposal.

This m«*-tlng I* called by onler 
o f the Board of Trust«*-«.

Dated August 21, 19-11.
S. L. M AC KIN .
LO W ELL TEDFORD,
JOHN S. M ARKHAM  
MRS. ARTHUR WiXJLCOTT, 
ANDREW  GERARD.
F. EARL CONE.
W AYNE MONROE. 2-2t-3

I own 
Some 
term« on bulan«*'

-

George S. Sm ith 
3-3» p-5

FOR SALE—Two Blackface rams 
W J. While, near Mary Whit«'

brklge Phone 265-R. 3 -ltp

F o il  SALE One very gentle 3 
year old colt. Weight aboul 1300 
lb* Abo tomato««, petite prune», 
kale j da nt». Mr. and Mr*. Hugh 
TrqnneU, phone 17-F-I1. 3-3tp-3
i r i F i A i T '  ’('osl Imn beating 

«lone. Price $4 00. Call nt MIS
W hitaker Avenue. 3 -ltp

FOR SA LE Monarch combina­
tion wood und electric range.'

Priced reasonable. Ace Gregg. Lo­
rane route. 3 -ltC '

EOR SALE Several 32x32 and 
28x28 window*. A I » o window 
frame« W. (C, M artin  at Sentinel 
office. 3-tfc

W H ITE  DUCKS fo r «ale. ( 'n il 
236J 3 -ltc

RENT 
See Joe T. 

Phone 183R. 
3 - llp

FOR RENT Em rnslu il sb « ping 
room, suitable fo r two men.

Bath, hot and cold water. 1104 
Washington St. 3 - ltp

Board and Koorn
W AN TED  Room anti board, pre­

fer east «Ide of lawn, claae in
Now paying $23 00 a month. II. B 
Halley, 236 Adam* St., Collage 
Grove. l-3 tp-3

Ixjst and Found
LOST L ight brown b ill fold lost 

in or near Diane theatre Satur­
day n ight. Reward if  return«*!
James Espy, .3-13 Washington Ave.

3 - llp

LOST Ladle« W altham  wrist 
wutcli, F rid ay  night. Suitable 

reward fo r return. Franc«*» L.
Nichols. 843 Birch Ave. 3 - llp

Corona Portable«. The Sentinel.

LEGAL NOTICES
NOTICE O1 FINAL 

SETTLEMENT

NOTICE TO (REDITORS.

NOTICE IS HEREBY G IVEN 
that the undersigned has been ap- 
l«>int««l A dm in is tra trix  of the es­
tate of ERED KELLY , deceased, 
by on order of the County Court 
of Lane County. State of Oregon. 
l*-aring dale of August 27. 1941.

A ll persons h a v in g  claims 
against the said estate art- hereby 
requir«*! to present the same duly 
verified lo the un«iersign<*l at th<- 
law office of HERBERT W. LO M ­
BARD. F i r s t  National Bank 
Building, Cottage Grove, Lone 
County, On-g<>n. w ith in  six months 
from the date of the firs t puhlica- 
tion of this notiix*.

Dated and firs t published Aug­
ust 28, 1941.

Date a >1 last publication Sep- 
te in t*-r 25. 1941.

NONA KELLY . Adm in istra­
tr ix  of the Estate of ERED 
KELLY , dt*x*is<*l. 

HERBERT W. LOMBARD,
A ttorney fo r Adm in istra trix.

• 3-5t-7

NOTICE OF SALE OF NEGO­
TIABLE SCHOOL WARRANTS

EoR SALE Canning com. 
W right. Phone 30FI1.

Miscellaneous

n  E
3-Ite

KEEP W E LL  by seeing D r C. R. 
Slmkins. Chiropractor, over Peter­
sen’s. Phone 5. 52-tfc

WELDING
Electric Gnu

Cottage Grove Welding and Boil­
er Works. Madison Street. Phone 
181-Y. 26-tfc

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR
W iring and Rewiring 

Agents fo r Berkeley Pumps. 
I-eon C. Cexlurd, 405 Main St., 

phone 156 I. 201. 10-tfc

25 Yeurs Experience. Clean, neat 
work. Pa|*-rhanging. jiainting.

C, Maxson, 518 So. Douglas, 
pre ihe tracks cross 6th St.

50-1 fc
wher

A ll kinds of welding, both elec- 
trie  and acetylene. Machinery re­
pairing and hlaeksinithing. O. K. 
Welding Shop, in new location, 
H)th and Mqdlson. ______1-tfc
FT JR A L L  DISORDERS of nerves 

and circulation try  Swedish
Massage. Churles P. Armstrong. 
1321 Ash. phone 103Y. 1-61 p-6

FLOOR SANDING—
W ork guaranteed to satisfy. Ex­

perienced operator. A. W. Shof- 
stall. 624 No 10th St. Phone 21IR 
o f con met Claude Sherman. 1-tfc
W RINGER ROLLS AND PARTS 

fo r a ll makes washing machines 
and vacuum cleaner«. W ASHING
Machine service co., sao 
W illam ette St., Eugene, Oregon.

3-Htp-8

goSdD IN VE S TM E N T property 
at 803 North 9th street, fu lly  

furpIsUi'd. 51.400. Rodman's Real 
Esftte . 3 - ltc

Khgruved, prtntefl o r processed 
wedding announcements fo r sale 
by The SenllneL

NO TICE IS HEREBY GIVEN 
That the undersign«-«! has filed 
herein his final account nt Exec­
u tor of the Last W ill and Testa­
ment of ESTELLA I. SALToN . 
deceused, w ith  the Cbunty Court 
of Lane County. State of Oregon, 
and an order has b«*-n made and 
entered of record d irecting this 
notice and se lling  Ihe 23rd day «if 
September, 1941, nt the hour «if 
ten o'clock A. M. of said day as 
the time, and the County Court 
Room in the County Court House 
at Eugene. Lane County, Oregon, 
as the pin«-«- fo r the hearing of ob­
jections, if any to the final ac­
count and fina l sell lenient of said 
estate.

Dated and firs t published this 
21st day of August, 1941.

Dale of Iasi publication Sep­
tember 18. 1941.

WORTH HARVEY. Execu­
to r  of Ihe IjisI W ill und 
Testament of ESTELLA I. 
SALTON, deceased. 

HERBERT W. LOMBARD
Attorney fo r Executor. 2-51-6----------------------

NOTICE OF SI’fXTAL MEET­
ING TO FILE HUPPLEMENT-
ARY ARTICLES OF INCOR­
PORATION TO  CHANGE
NAME.

notice is ntnfcnY given 
To 111«- members of The F irst 
Methodist Episcopal Church of 

; Cottage Grove that a special 
meeting of the members of said 
church w ill I*- held ul its meeting 
place, Main Street, Cottage Grove,, 
Lane County, Slate of Oregon, at 

| eight o’clock P. M. on M onday,1 
September H, 1941.

The said special meeting is ca ll­
ed for the purpose of considering 
and acting u|>on a proposition to 
adopt and file  supplementary a rt­
icles of IneoriMirnlioii fo r the pur­
pose of changing Ihe name of said 
corporation to "The Meth(xlisl 
Church of Cottage Grove” instead

Notice Is hereby given that 
seal«*! bids w ill be received by the 
undersign«*! u n til th«- Ixiur of 7:30 
o ’ckM'k p-.m . on the 15th day of 
September, 1911. and iinni«*lialely 
thereafter publicly opened by the 
Sch<Mil D is tric t Board o f School 
D is tric t No 75. I j in c  County, Ore­
gon at school house. Black Butte 
Route, Cottage G r o v e ,  Lane 
County, State of Oregon, fo r an 
issue of negotiable warrants of 
said School D istrict in the amount 
o f Three Thousand ($3,000.001 
Iio lla rs, said warrants to be dat«-d 
September 14. 1943. and to mature 
as follows:

$1,000.00 on Sept«-mher 15. 1943
$1,000.00 on September 15, 1944
$1.000.00 on September 15, 1945 

interest on said warrants to be 
payable semi-annually, prlncii al 
and Interest payable al the office 
o f Ihe County Tn-asurer of Lane 
County, Slat«- of Oregon.

Said negotiable warrants were 
duly authorized at an election 
held on the 22nd «lay of July. 1911.

Bidders are requetted to indi­
cate the rate of inten-st al which 
they w ill accept said w arrants at 
par or premium and accrued in­
terest.

The bids must be unconditional 
and a certified cheek for Two 
Hundred ($200.001 Dollars must 
accompany each bid. The Board 
reserves ihe right lo  reject any 
and a ll bids.

E L IZA B E TH  L. CLARK, ( ’ lerk 
School D istric t No. 75 
Lane County, Oregon

3-3t-5

iTN ITE D  S T A T E S  DEPART­
M EN T OF TH E  INTERIO R, Gen­
eral Land Office, O. and C. Ad­
m in istration, Portland, Oregon 
Senled bids, marked outside "B id 
fo r T im ber,”  and addressed to the 
Cheif Forester, () and C. Adminis­
tration, 410 Custom House, P ort­
land, Oregon, w ill lx- received un­
t i l  10:30 A. M.. Pacific Time, Sep. 
9. 1941, fo r Ihe purchase of tim ­
ber upon tracts hereinafter dcs-,

cribt-d; each hid must state the 
amount per M. feet B M , which 
w ill be offered fo r each species 
and the tota l consideration which 
w ill be paid fo r the timber. No 
bid fo r less than the appraised 
value w ill be consider«*!. Each hid 
must lx- submitted in duplicate 
and lx- accompanied by a deposit 
in the form  of a certified check 
in favor of the Chief Forester of 
the O. and C. Adm inistration. The 
deposit of any successful bidder 
w ill be credited on the contract. 
Payment in fu ll at the time of 
filing  the contract is required in 
sales amounting to $2500 or less. 
For copies «>f the form of propos­
al, forrn of contract and liond, 
terms of ixiyment, amount of de- 
posit required w ith  bid, amount 
of lx»nd nxpiired w ith  contract 
and other information, application 
should I*- mad«- to th«- address 
shown alxni- IN LANE CO U N ­
TY: T. 16 S . R 1 W Sec 21. a ll 
merchantable tim laa designated 
fo r cu tting  on the S '-jS W L , N E ’« 
SE%. E 'xNW W SEJk, S 'xSE*«, 
«•stimat«*! fo r the pprpose of this 
sale to lx- 3485 M. feet DA F ir. 
3915 M. feet DB Fir. 115 M Te-t 
R«*l Cedar. 130 M f«-et Hemlock, 
290 R«*l Cedar Pides. No bid for 
less than $3.00 per M fo r the DA 
F ir. $2.50 per M. fo r the DB F ir. 
$1.50 per M fo r the Red Cedar, 
$1.00 per M. fo r the Hemlock, 
$.75 ea. fo r th«- Red Cedar Poles, 
or a to ta l purchase price of $20.- 
762.50 w ill I*- considered. Douglas 
F ir  and Hemlock 22 inches and 
less DBHOB, and Red Cedar 14 
inches and less DBHOB. reserved 
from cutting. Area to be logged 
w ith  ca terp illa r tractor. Rwtson- 
ahle care to be taken in logging 
and fa lling  tim ber in order to pro­
tect reserved stands. T. 16 S.. R. 
2 W., Sec. 31, a ll merchantable 
tim ber designated for cu tting  on 
the Et», estimated for the purpos- 
of thus sale to he 3975 M. feet 
DA F ir, 5087 M. feet IK ’ F ir, 720 
M. feet Red Cedar. 405 M feet 
Incense Cedar. 65 M. f«*-t Hcm- 
lock, 791 R«*i Cedar Poles. No 
bid fo r less than $2.50 per M. fo r 
the DA Fir, $2.00 |>er M. fo r the 
IX ' F ir, $1.50 per M. for the R«*l 
('«-dar. $1.25 per M. fo r the In ­
cense Cedar, $1.00 per M. fo r the 
Hemkx-k. $.75 ra. fo r the Rial 
Cedar Poles, or a tota l purchase 
price of $22,356.00 w ill lx- con­
sidered. Red Cedar 12 inches and 
less DBHOB, and u ll other species 
22 inches and less DBHOB re­
served from cutting. Area to be 
logged w ith  ca terp illa r tractor. T. 
18 S „ R. 1 E.. S«-c. 7. a ll mer­
chantable tim ber designated for 
cu tting  on the E 'jS W 1«, and 
S E L . estimated for the purpose 
of this sale to 1«- 6699 M. f«*-t 
Yellow F ir, 80 M feet Red Cedar, 
468 M. feet Hemlock, 40 M. feet 
Incense Cedar. No bid fo r less 
than $3.50 per M. fo r the Yellow- 
F ir. $1.50 per M. fo r the Red 
Cedar, $1.00 per M. fo r the Hem­
lock and Incense Ct-dar, or a tota l 
purchase price of $24,074.50 w ill 
he considered. «Ml trees 24 inches 
anti less DBHOB reserved from 
cutting. T. 18 S„ R. 8 W., Sec. 21. 
a ll merchantable tim ber designat­
ed fo r cutting  on the S W 1«, esti­
mated fo r the purpose o f this sale 
to lx- 905 M feet IX ’ F ir, 3755 M. 
feet DA F ir, 60 M feet Hemlock, 
10 M feet Red Cedar. No bid for 
less than $2.00 per M. fo r the IX ' 
F ir. $3.00 per M fo r the DA Fir. 
$1.00 per M. fo r the Hemlock, 
$1.50 per M. fo r the Red Cedar, 
or a to ta l purchase price of $13,- 
150.00 w ill be considerejL Douglas 
F ir  and Hemlock 22 inlhes and 
lt-ss DBHOB. and Red Cedar 31 
Inches and less DBHOB rest-rved 
from cutting. T. 20 S.. R. 2 W „ 
See. 25. a ll merchantable tim ber 
designated fo r cutting on the 
N W 'i,  estimated fo r the purpose 
of this sale to be 4570 M. feet DA 
F ir , '2130 M feet DB F ir. 460 M. 
feet Red Cedar, 40 M. feet In ­
cense Cedar, 310 M. feet Hem- 
kx-’k, 905 Rod iCedar Poles. No 
bid fo r less than $3.50 per M. for 
the DA F ir, $1.00 per
DB F ir, $1.50 per M. fo r the Red 
and Intense Cedar. $1.00 ,x-r M. 
for the Hemlock. $.75 ea. fo r the 
Red Cedar Pole*, or a to ta l pur­
chase price of $24,123.75 w ill be 
consider«*!. The righ t to waive

technical defects, and to reject 
any and a ll bids, is reserved. 
Dated at Portland. Oregon, this 
4th day of August, 1941. W. H. 
Horning. Chief Forester, O and 
C Adm inistration.________ 52,4t-3

U N ITE D  STATES DEPART­
M EN T OF TH E INTERIOR. Gen­
eral I^and Office, O. and C. Ad­
m inistration. Portland. Oregon.— 
Sealed bids, mark«*! outside "B id 
fo r T im ber” , and addressed to the 
Chief Fon-ster. O. and C. Adm in­
istration, 410 Custom House, P ort­
land. Or«-gon, w ill be received un­
t i l  10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, Sep­
tember 16, 1941. fo r the purchase 
of tim ber upon tracts hereinafter 
described; each hid must state the 
amount per M feet B M., which 
w ill lx- offered fo r each species 
and the to ta l consideration which 
w ill lx- paid fo r the timber. No bid 
fo r less than the appraised value 
w ill be considered. Each bid must 
be submitt«-d in duplicate and be 
.accompanied by a deposit in the 
form  of a certified check in favor 
of the C hief Forester o f the O. and 
C. Adm inistration. The deposit of 
any successful bidder w ill be 
credited on the contract. Payment 
in fu ll at the time of filing  the 
contract is required in sales 
amounting to $25tX) or less. For 
copies of the form of proposal, 
form of «-ontract and bond, terms 
of payment, amount of deposit re­
quired w ith  hid, amount of bond 
required w ith  contract and other 
information, application should be 
made to the address shown above. 
IN  LAN E COUNTY: T. 16 S „ R.
1 E „ Sec. 35. a ll merchantable 
tim fx-r designated fo r cutting on 
the S E L . estimated fo r the pur­
pose of this sale to be 3285 M. 
feet DA and DB F ir. No bid fo r 
less than $3.00 per M. fo r the DA 
and DB F ir, o r a to ta l purchase 
price o f $9.855 00 w ill be consider­
ed. Douglas F ir  30 inches and less 
DBHOB and a ll Hemlock and Red 
Cedar is reserved from cutting. T. 
17 S.. R. 7 \V., Sec. 11. a ll m er­
chantable tim ber designat«*! fo r 
cu tting  on the N »»N W L. estimat- 
«*1 fo r the purpose of this sale to 
lx- 98(1 M. f«*-t DA F ir. 70 M. feet 
R«*l Cixlar. No bid fo r less than 
$275 ppr M. fo r -he DA F ir, $1.50 
per M. fo r the Red Cedar, or a 
to ta l purchase price of $2,800.00 
w ill h«- considered. A ll trees 22 
inches and less DBHOB are reserv- 
i-d from cutting. T. 17 S.. R. 7 W., 
Secs. 13 and 23, a ll merchantable 
tim ber desi.mated fo r cutting on 
th e .S W L S W L  of Sec. 13 and 
NE 'xN ’EU Sec. 23, estimated fo r 
the purpose o f this sale to be 1215 
M feet DA Fir. 20 M feet Red 
Ci-df"-. No bid fo r less than $2.75 
rx-r M. fo r the DA F ir, $1.50 per 
M fo r the R«*l Ct-dar, or a to ta l 
purchase price of $3,371.25 w ill be 
eonsi<lcred A ll trees 22 inches and 
less DBHOB are reserved from 
cutting. T. 18 S., R. 1 W.. Sec. 9. 
a ll merchantable tim ber designat­
ed fo r cutting on the W 'tN E 1* , 
S E t iN E 1* .  estimated fo r the pur­
pose o f this sale to be 2920 M. 
feet DA F ir, 20 M. feet W hite F ir, 
125 M. feet Red Cedar, 55 M. feet 
Incense Cedar, 180 Red Cedar 
Poles No bid fo r less than $3.00 
>cr M. fo r the DA F ir. $1.00 per 
M. fo r the W hite F ir  and Incense 
Cedar, $1.50 per M. fo r the Red 
Cedar, $.75 each fo r the Red I 
Cedar Poles or a to ta l purchase 
price of $9,157.50 w ill tie consider­
ed. A ll IViuglas F ir, W hite F ir  and 
Incense Cedar 22 inches and less 
and Red Cedar 12 inches and less 
DBHOB are reserved from cut- 
ling. T. 19 S.. R. 2 W.. Sec. $3. all 
merchantable tim ber designated 
for cu tting  on the E ’ - jN E L , e s ti- ' 
mated fo r the purpose of this sale 
lo  lx- 1670 M. feet DB Fir. 15 M. 
feet Incense C«*lar, 30 M. feet 
Heml«x'k, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. 
No bid fo r less than $3.00 per M 
fo r the DB F ir. $1.50 jx-r M. for 
the Incense Cedar and R«-d Cedar, 
$1.00 per M. fo r the Hemlock, or 

M. fo r the a to ta l purchase price of $5,077.50 
*' '  w ill be considered A ll trees 22 

inches and less DBHOB an- re­
served from cutting. T. 19 S„ R.
5 W., Sec. 29. a ll m erchantable1 
tim ber designated fo r cutting on 
the W W s ,  NWHSW14, esti-

mah-d for the purpose of this sale 
to fx- 2285 M feet IX ' Fir. 1215 
M feet DA F ir No bid for less 
than $2 00 per M for the DC Fir. 
$2.50 per M. for the DA F ir, or a 
t 'ita l purchase price of $7.682 50 
w ill be consider«*! A ll Douglas 
F ir  22 inches and less DBHOB and 
a ll other species are reserved from 
cutting  T. 20 S . R 1 W . Sec. 3. 
a ll merchantable tim ber designat- 
«■d for cutting  on the E '^ N E L , 
N E tiS E 'i« . estimat«*! fo r the pur- 
p«xie of this sal«' to be 1085 M feet 
DC F ir. 835 M feet DA F ir 40 M 
feet Red Cedar. 10 M. feet In ­
cense Cedar, 106 R«*l Cedar Poles. 
No bid for less than $2.00 per M 
fo r the DC and DA Fir. $1.50 per 
M fo r the Red Cedar, $1.00 per 
M. fo r the Incense Cedar. $.75 
each fo r the R«*l Cedar Pol«'«, or 
a tota l purchase price of $3.989 50 
w ill be considered. A ll Douglas 
F ir  and Incense Cedar 22 inches 
and less, and a ll Red Cedar 12 
inches and lew  DBHOB are re­
served from cutting. To be logged 
w ith  ca terp illa r tractor. T. 20 S.. 
R. 2 W.. Sec. 13. all merchantable 
tim ber designated fo r cutting on 
the N ’/ iS W L , estimated fo r the 
purpose of this sale to be 780 M. 
f«*-t DA F ir, 1165 M. feet I>B Fir, 
1.30 M. feet Hemlixtk, 145 M. feet 
Red Cedar, 35 M. f«-*»t Incense 
Cedar. .360 Red Cedar Pole*. No 
bid fo r less than $2.50 per M. fo r 
the DA and DB F ir. $1.00 per M 
fo r the Hemkxtk, $1.75 per M. fur 
the Red Cedar, $1.50 per M for 
the Incense Cedar. $.75 each for 
the Re«l Cedar Poles, or a total 
purchase price of $5,568.75 w ill 
be considered. T. 21 S.. R. 4 W.. 
Sec. $5. a ll merchantable tim ber 
designated fo r cu tting  on tne 
W taS W ‘4. estimated fo r the pur­
pose of this sale to be 285 M. feet 
DA F ir. 560 M feet DB F ir, 465 
M. feet DC F ir, 45 M. feet Red 
Cedar, 25 M. feet Incense Cedar, 
15 M. feet Hemlock. 20 M. feet 
White F ir, 255 Red Cedar Poles. 
No bid for less than $2.25 per M. 
fo r the DA and DB F ir. $2.00 per 
M fo r the DC F ir. $1.50 per M. 
fo r the Red Cedar and Incense 
Cedar, $1.00 per M. fo r the Hem­
lock and W hite F ir. $.75 each fo r 
the Red Cedar Poles, or a to ta l 
purchase price of $3,162.50 w ill be 
considered. A ll species 22 Inches 
and less and Red Cedar 12 inches 
and less DBHOB are reserved 
from cutting. The righ t to waive 
technical defects, and to reject 
any and a ll bids, is reserved. Dat­
ed at Portland. Oregon, this 25th 
day of August 1941. W. H. Horn­
ing. Chief Forester, O and C. Ad- 
m inist ration. ____________3-2t-4

ALDER SAWDUST VA LV ED  
FOR GARDEN M ULCHING

The use of alder sawdust as a 
substitute fo r peat moss in re­
taining moisture in garden and 
lawn soils has been practiced fo r 
several years on a small scale by 
some nurserymen and gardeners. 
George Otten. landscape engineer 
w ith  the State Highway depart­
ment, has done considerable ex­
perimental work along these lines 
and is quite enthusiastic about the 
possibilities of this practice. In 
addition the State Forestry de­
partment is carrying on an experi­
ment to determine the effective­
ness of the sawdust in mulching 
seed beds at the nursery.

Not .Mach DHJerence
D airy cows do not drink mucl 

more water in hot weather than tr 
cool weather.

Orange flake ice cream at Gus­
tafson’s of course. 3 -ltc-4 i

Pedestrian Protection—
l f e ’p D > e rs  See Y o u ! #

SHOW WHITE 
■ AT N IG H T

.1. gK ■mill_____
Drivers Will See You 

Much Sooner

The s m a r t  pedestrian today 
knows that white  reflects light, 
therefore he wears or displays 
sfxnething white when walking at 
night, according to the State T ra f­
fic  Safety Division.

Photo courtpsy Oregon State 
motor Association.

A treat awaits you if you have 
not tried  our Oriental delight ice 
cream. Gustafson’s of course.

3 ltc-41

“ Words Are Not Big Enough
to praise ADLER1KA. Am 55 and 
travel; always carry A D LE R IK A  
w ith  me.”  (G. D.-Calif.> Gas bloat­
ing, sour stomach, spells of con­
stipation quickly relieved thru  AD­
LER IKA . Get it  TODAY.

Cottage Grove Pharmacy, Ke lly 
Drug Co., Kern’s for Drugs.

Professional Cards
FU N ER AL HOMES

KA R L K. M ILLS, Mortician. 
Phone 202

RUSSELL E. SM ITH, Funeral 
D irector. Cottage Grove, Ore. 
phone 101.

DENTISTS

DR. W. E. LEBOW — Det.dstry 
-N o . 1 Omer Apartments 

Cottage Grove. Ore. Phone 35 

PHYSICIANS

H. AXLEY, Physician and Sur­
geon — Evenings by appoint­
ment. Over Kem’s fo r Drugs. 
Cottage Grove. Oregon.

DR. KATHERINE SCHLEEF, 
M. D.— Physician a n d  Sur­
geon. Apartment 10, Omer 
Apartments. Phone 247. 

ATTORNEYS

HERBERT W. LOMBARdTaG 
torney at Law. First Nation­
al R a n k  building. Cottage 
Grove. Oregon. Phone 94.

ALTA  K IN G  — Lawyer, 613 
Main s t r e e t .  O ffice phone 
254J; Res. phone, 28F31, 
Cottage Grove, Ore.

NICK GRANOFF Lawyer. 
Phone 90. 613 Main St. -2'

T IT L E  ABSTRACT CO., 881 
Oak St., Eugene, Ore. Ed­
ward F. Bailey, Pres. Ab­
stracts, T itle  Insurance,r Es­
crows.

FALL TERM OPENS TUESDAY, 
SEPTEMBER 2

New times call for new ways and
EUGENE BUSINESS COLLEGE

is recognized as a school that keeps abreast of the times.

NEW LOCATION
364 East Broadway Phone 666 Eugene, Oregon

PLACE YOUR NEXT ORDER 
W IT H  US „

The Sentinel *
Phone 159


