

WANT-ADS

RATES: Five cents per line or one cent per word, with minimum charge of 25 cents. Three insertions for the price of 2½, if paid in advance. Want ads will be charged only where firms or individuals have established credit. Send money to insure insertion. If charged add 15c. Keyed ads 25c extra. Card of thanks 50c if not over 50 words. If over 50 words, cards of thanks will be charged at the regular rate. Copy must be in Wednesday to insure insertion.

For Sale or Trade

FOR SALE

5-room modern home, garage, electric water system. Large lot 188x270. Price \$2000. FHA terms.
5-room modern home, garage, electric water system. Lot 112x388. Price \$1900. FHA terms.
5-rooms, one acre, on Row river road. House is 4 years old. Price \$1500. \$150 cash. Bal \$20 per mth.
6 rooms, modern, 4 years old. Double garage, small barn, chix house. Cabin 800 ft. Row river frontage. 12 acres. \$3500, terms.

JAMES A. SCOTT, Builder.

GOOD PIANO for sale or rent. Also for rent, sleeping room with bath and board if desired. Close in. 942 Ash Ave. 41-3tc-43

SMALL FARM FOR SALE. See L. J. McCoy at McCoy Motors 41-3tc-43

FOR SALE—Baled out and vetch hay. \$8.00 per ton in ton lots. Cottage Grove, phone 241 or 4232. 28-tfc

FOR SALE—1941 Studebaker 5-passenger Deluxe coupe. Radio and heater. Price \$925.00. Driven 4000 miles. H. C. Taylor, So. 1st and Harrison. 41-3tp-43

FOR SALE OR TRADE for ranch modern 7-room residence. 4 nice bedrooms, double plumbing, clear. Convenient to schools and business center. Good income possibility for couple. See owner at 709 Washington avenue. 42-3tp-44

FOR SALE—Good five acre tract, modern house, ½ mile north on highway. See O. O. Veatch. 43-4tp-46

FOR SALE—Stock ranch, 225 A. 40 A. in cultivation, 65 A. timber, balance pasture, fenced. 6-room rustic house, 3 barns; 2 chickenhouses, one sheep shed, year around springs, orchard, mail route. H. S. bus route on Mosby creek road. Write Box 22 c/o Sentinel. 43-1tp

HORSE FOR SALE or trade for fresh cow. Alvis England, 7 miles out Row River Road. 43-1tp

FOR SALE OR TRADE for livestock: Milwaukee mower, \$12; McCormick Binder, \$25. Phone 38-F-12. C. H. Haight. 43-1tc

For Rent

FOR RENT—Four-room house with water in the house, five miles east on Mosby Creek. H. C. Gleaser. 43-3tp-45

MODERN FURNISHED cabin with utilities, \$7.50 per week. Reed's Service Store, 3 miles south on highway. 43-1tc

FOR RENT—One 2-room, one 3-room cottage. Airport Court, ¼ mile south of town. 43-1tp

STORAGE SPACE FOR RENT: For furniture, automobiles.

Professional Cards

FUNERAL HOMES
KARL K. MILLS, Mortician, Phone 202

RUSSELL E. SMITH, Funeral Director, Cottage Grove, Ore. phone 101.

DENTISTS
DR. W. E. LEBOW—Dentistry, No. 1 Omer Apartments, Cottage Grove, Ore. Phone 35

DR. C. H. KIME, Dentist—Office in First National Bank Building, Phone 10. Cottage Grove, Oregon.

PHYSICIANS
H. AXLEY, Physician and Surgeon—Evenings by appointment. Over Ken's for Drugs, Cottage Grove, Oregon.

DR. KATHERINE SCHLEEF, M. D.—Physician and Surgeon. Apartment 10, Omer Apartments. Phone 247.

ATTORNEYS

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney at Law, First National Bank building, Cottage Grove, Oregon. Phone 94.

ALTA KING—Lawyer, 613 Main street. Office phone 254; Res. phone, 28F31, Cottage Grove, Ore.

TITLE ABSTRACT CO., 881 Oak St., Eugene, Ore. Edward F. Bailey, Pres. Abstracts, Title Insurance, Escrows.

household goods, merchandise of all kinds at 2½¢ per square foot for long term lease. 4½¢ per square foot rental for merchandise requiring quick turn. Small rooms available for long term leases. Cottage Grove Storage Warehouse Co., 33 North Lane Street. For space call Jesse Lansing, 32 South 10th, or Twin Oaks Builders Supply Co., Eugene. 41-4tc-44

BRING THIS ADV. WITH YOU.

get your discount of 10% if you bring this with you.
\$50 purchase you get \$5 discount or a \$20 purchase you get a \$2 purchase.

Nelson's paint for only \$1.59 and it's the biggest, best paint value you ever had—and if you are not satisfied, you get your money back. At Callahan's.

Gas washer, \$59.75. Lawn swing \$27.50. Lawn chairs, 98c. 50 cent stools, 29c. and for the June bride, a cedar chest \$19.74 and \$23.74 at Callahan's.

Bed room furniture \$39.75. Dining table with 6 chairs \$44.50, and a fine breakfast table with 4 chairs, \$10.95. Shop with Callahan's Furniture Store, Heilig Theatre Building. 43-1tc

LOST on highway near Saginaw, man's coat containing dental plate. Finder please phone 28F13. 43-1tc

Miscellaneous

REGISTERED Guernsey bull for service. Will deliver bull to ranches. Sunrise Dairy, phone 1-F-13. 43-6tc-48

FOR ALL disorders of the nerves and circulation, try Swedish massage. Chas. P. Armstrong, 1521 Ash. Lady Attendant. 42-3tp-44

WELDING

Electric Gas
Cottage Grove Welding and Boiler Works, Madison St. 26-tfc

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR
Wiring and Rewiring
Agents for Berkeley Pumps.
Leon C. Godard, 405 Main St., phone 156-L-201. 10-tfc

FOR LOW PRICES and the best in painting, papering and repair work see or write Maxon, Disston Rte., Cottage Grove, Ore. 34-tfc

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF ANNUAL SCHOOL MEETING.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN To the legal voters of Union High School District No. 14 of Lane County, State of Oregon, that the ANNUAL SCHOOL MEETING of said District will be held in Music room of Union High School building, Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon, between the hours of two o'clock P. M. and seven o'clock P. M. on the fourth Monday in June, being the 23rd day of June, A. D. 1941.

This meeting is called for the purpose of electing one director to serve five years.
Dated this 27th day of May, 1941.

Attest:
WORTH HARVEY, District Clerk.
CHARLES A. BEIDLER, Chairman Board of Directors. 43-1tc

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That the undersigned has been appointed by the County Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, Administratrix of the estate of ROSE RUEGGER, deceased, by an order bearing date the 3rd day of June, 1941.

All persons having claims against the estate of said ROSE RUEGGER are hereby requested to present the same duly verified to the undersigned at the law office of HERBERT W. LOMBARD, First National Bank Building, Cottage Grove, Oregon, on or before six months from the date of the first publication of this notice.

Dated and first published June 5, 1941.

Date of last publication July 3, 1941.
PAULINE RUEGGER, Administratrix of the estate of ROSE RUEGGER, deceased.
HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Administratrix. 43-5t-47

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT.

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned has filed herein her final account as the administratrix of the estate of GEORGE F. GAROUTTE, sometimes known as FRANK GAROUTTE, deceased.

LEGAL NOTICES

with the County Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, and an order has been made and entered of record directing this notice and setting the 8th day of July, 1941, at the hour of 10:00 o'clock a. m. of said day as the time and the County Court room in the County Court House at Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the said final account and final settlement of said estate.

Dated and first published this 5th day of June, 1941.
Date of last publication July 3rd, 1941.

ANNIE ELIZABETH GAROUTTE, Administratrix of the Estate of GEORGE F. GAROUTTE, sometimes known as FRANK GAROUTTE, deceased.
HERBERT W. LOMBARD, Attorney for Estate. 43-5t-47

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING.

Notice is hereby given that Alta King, administrator of the estate of Clarence Edgar Freeland, deceased, has filed his final account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed the 17th day of June, 1941, at 2 o'clock P. M. in the Court room of said Court, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon.

Date of first publication May 15, 1941.
Date of last publication June 12, 1941.

ALTA KING, Administrator.
40-5t-44

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.

Notice is hereby given that the County Court, Lane County, Oregon, has appointed Pauline Elmore as administratrix of the estate of Elizabeth A. Sutherland, deceased, in Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are required to present them, duly verified, with the proper vouchers as by law required, to said administratrix at the law office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months from the date of first publication of this notice.

Date of first publication being May 8, 1941. Date of last publication being June 5, 1941.

FRED KELLY, Administrator.
ALTA KING, Attorney for Estate. 39-5t-43

UNITED STATES Department of the Interior, General Land Office, O. and C. Administration, Portland, Oregon.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, June 12, 1941, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each

LEGAL NOTICES

bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Chief Forester of the O. and C. Administration. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above.

IN LANE COUNTY: T. 17 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 21, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 455 M. feet DA Fir, 460 M. feet DC Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.00 per M. for the DA and DC Fir, \$1.50 per M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$1,805.00, will be considered. All trees 22 ins. and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE¼NE¼ and SE¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 915 M. feet DC Fir, 1560 M. feet DA Fir, 80 M. feet Red Cedar, 35 M. feet Hemlock, 5 M. feet Incense Cedar, 135 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M. for the DC Fir, \$2.75 per M. for the DA Fir, \$1.50 per M. for the Red and Incense Cedar, \$1.00 per M. for the Hemlock, \$7.50 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$6,612.50, will be considered. Douglas Fir and Hemlock trees 22 ins. and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE¼NE¼ and NE¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 650 M. feet DC Fir, 1785 M. feet DA Fir, 75 M. feet Red Cedar, 55 M. feet Hemlock,

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.

Notice is hereby given that Fred Kelly has been appointed by The County Court of Lane County, Oregon, as administrator of the estate of Florence Kelly, deceased, in Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby required to present them, duly verified as by law required, to said administrator at the law office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of first publication of this notice.

Date of first publication being May 8, 1941. Date of last publication being June 5, 1941.

FRED KELLY, Administrator.
ALTA KING, Attorney for Estate. 39-5t-43

UNITED STATES Department of the Interior, General Land Office, O. and C. Administration, Portland, Oregon.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, June 12, 1941, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each

Original Estimate and Accounting Sheet

FOR USE IN PREPARING THE ANNUAL BUDGET

Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon.

This original estimate shows estimated receipts and in parallel columns the unit costs of the several services, material and supplies for the three fiscal years next preceding the current year, the detailed expenditures for the last one of said, three preceding fiscal years and the budget allowances and expenditures for six months of the current year. See Section 69-1104, Oregon School Laws.

ESTIMATED RECEIPTS.

Estimated balance on hand at the beginning of the fiscal school year (July 1, 1941) for which this estimate is made

To be received for Vocational Education (State and Federal Funds) \$ 102.00

To be received from the Non-High School District for Tuition \$ 2,100.00

To be received from other sources, including land sales and delinquent tax \$ 500.00

To be received from other sources \$ 500.00

TOTAL ESTIMATED RECEIPTS \$ 3,202.00

GENERAL CONTROL—

Personal service:

Superintendent \$ 2,100.00

Clerk 250.00

Stenographers and other office assistants 500.00

Supplies 120.00

Elections and publicity 75.00

Legal service (clerk's bond, audit, etc.) 600.00

Other expense of general control 75.00

Total Expense of General Control \$ 3,720.00

INSTRUCTION—SUPERVISION

Principal \$ 1,836.00

Supplies 150.00

Total Expense, Supervision \$ 1,986.00

INSTRUCTION—TEACHING

Personal service: Teachers \$20,400.00

Supplies 1,300.00

Other expense of teaching 5.00

Total Expense of Teaching \$21,700.00

OPERATION OF PLANT

Personal service:

Janitors and other employees \$ 1,995.00

Janitors' supplies 550.00

Fuel 1,200.00

Light and power 850.00

Water 200.00

Telephone 100.00

Gas 50.00

Other expense of operation 100.00

Total Expense of Operation \$ 5,045.00

MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS

Repair and maintenance of furniture and equipment \$ 300.00

Repair and maintenance of buildings and grounds 2,189.50

Total Expense of Maintenance and Repairs \$ 2,489.50

AUXILIARY AGENCIES

Library books \$ 375.00

Health service: (nurse, etc.) 180.00

Supplies and other expenses 50.00

Transportation of pupils:

Personal service 2,970.00

Supplies and other expenses 1,570.00

Repair and replacement of busses 1,600.00

Total Expense of Auxiliary Agencies \$ 6,745.00

FIXED CHARGES

Insurance \$ 1,558.00

Total Fixed Charges \$ 1,558.00

CAPITAL OUTLAYS

New sites \$ 342.85

New buildings 100.00

New furniture, equipment and replacements 2,225.10

Other capital outlays 2,646.79

Total Capital Outlays \$ 3,314.74

DEBT SERVICE

Principal on bonds \$ 6,000.00

Principal on warrants 3,735.50

Interest on bonds 996.15

Interest on warrants 400.00

Transfers to sinking fund 80.50

Total Debt Service \$ 10,135.50

EMERGENCY

Total \$ 55,679.00

TOTALS \$ 31,668.31

\$ 27,563.50

\$ 285,578.19

\$ 36,354.57

RECAPITULATION

Total estimated expenses for the year \$ 55,679.00

Total estimated receipts \$ 3,202.00

Balance, amount to be raised by district tax \$ 52,477.00

115 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M. for the DC Fir, \$2.75 per M. for the DA Fir, \$1.50 per M. for the Red Cedar, \$1.00 per M. for the Hemlock, \$7.50 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$6,625.00, will be considered. Douglas Fir and Hemlock trees 22 ins. and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. T. 22 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 21, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼ of Lot 11, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 150 M. feet DC Fir, 85 M. feet DA Fir, No bid for less than \$2.00 per M. for the DC Fir, \$3.00 per M. for the DA Fir, or a total purchase price of \$555.00, will be considered. Trees 22 ins. and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated this 23rd day of May, 1941. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 42-2t-43

Notice of School Election To Approve Budget

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN To the legal voters of Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon, that an election will be held in the Music Room, Union High School Building, Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon, in said Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon, on the 23rd day of June, 1940, between the hours of 2:00 o'clock P. M. and 7:00 o'clock P. M. of said day, for the purpose of submitting to the legal voters of said district the question of approving the budget for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 1941, and ending June 30, 1942, as heretofore approved by the budget committee and the Board of Directors of said district, and to vote on the proposition of levying a tax for the year 1942.

The reason for such election is that it is necessary that the budget be approved by the legal voters of said district to eliminate any question as to the tax levy for the year 1942 over the amount limited by Section 11, Article XI of the Constitution of Oregon, and to raise sufficient revenue for the purposes as set forth in the said budget hereinafter set forth.

The budget and the amount to be levied for the year 1942 as heretofore approved by the budget committee and the Board of Directors is as follows:

BUDGET

ESTIMATED RECEIPTS

Estimated balance on hand at the beginning of the fiscal year (July first) for which this budget is made \$ 102.00

To be received for Vocational Education (State and Federal Funds) 2,100.00

To be received from the Non-High School District for Tuition 500.00

To be received from other sources, including land sales and delinquent tax 500.00

TOTAL ESTIMATED RECEIPTS \$ 3,202.00

ESTIMATED EXPENDITURES

GENERAL CONTROL:

Superintendent \$ 2,100.00

Clerk 250.00

Office assistants 500.00

Supplies 120.00

Elections and publicity 75.00

Legal service (clerk's bond, audit, attorney fees, etc.) 600.00

Other expense 75.00

Total Expense of General Control \$ 3,720.00

INSTRUCTION—SUPERVISION