

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING.

Notice is hereby given that E. M. Babcock, administrator de bonis non, of the estate of Morton F. Babcock, deceased, has filed his final account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed June 3rd, 1941, at 10 o'clock A. M. in the Court Room of said Court in the Court House at Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing and acting thereon.

Dated this 1st day of May, 1941.
E. M. BABCOCK, Administrator, de bonis non.
ALTA KING, Attorney. 38-5t-42

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That the undersigned has filed his final account as the Administrator of the Estate of ADELIN SAFLEY, Deceased, with the County Court of Lane County, State of Oregon, and an order has been made and entered of record directing this notice and setting the 3rd day of June, 1941, at the hour of ten o'clock A. M. of said day as the time, and the County Court Room in the County Court House at Eugene, Lane County,

LEGAL NOTICES

Oregon, as the place for the hearing of objections, if any, to the said final account and the final settlement of said estate.

Dated and first published this 1st day of May, 1941.
Date of last publication May 29, 1941.

DELBERT SAFLEY, Administrator of the Estate of ADELIN SAFLEY, deceased.

HERBERT W. LOMBARD, SIDNEY A. MILLIGAN, Attorneys for Estate. 38-5t-42

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING.

Notice is hereby given that Alta King, administrator of the estate of Clarence Edgar Freeland, deceased, has filed his final account in the County Court of Lane County, Oregon, and said Court has fixed the 17th day of June, 1941, at 2 o'clock P. M. in the Court room of said Court, in Eugene, Lane County, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing, considering and acting thereon.

Date of first publication May 15, 1941.

Date of last publication June 12, 1941.

ALTA KING, Administrator. 40-5t-44

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.

Notice is hereby given that Fred Kelly has been appointed by The County Court of Lane County, Oregon, as administrator of the estate of Florence Kelly, deceased, in Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are hereby required to present them, duly verified as by law required, to said administrator at the law office of Alta King, 613 Main Street, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six months of the date of first publication of this notice.

Date of first publication being May 8, 1941. Date of last publication being June 5, 1941.

FRED KELLY, Administrator.
ALTA KING, Attorney for Estate. 39-5t-43

UNITED STATES Department of the Interior, General Land Office, O. S. C. Administration, Portland, Oregon. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 410 Custom House, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Time, June 12, 1941, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Chief Forester of the O. and C. Administration. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond

LEGAL NOTICES

required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN LANE COUNTY: T. 17 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 21, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S½NW¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 435 M. feet DA Fir, 460 M. feet DC Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.00 per M. for the DA and DC Fir, \$1.50 per M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$1,805.00, will be considered. All trees 22 ins. and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE¼NE¼ and SE¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 915 M. feet DC Fir, 1560 M. feet DA Fir, 80 M. feet Red Cedar, 35 M. feet Hemlock, 5 M. feet Incense Cedar, 135 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M. for the DA Fir, \$2.75 per M. for the DC Fir, \$1.50 per M. for the Red and Incense Cedar, \$1.00 per M. for the Hemlock, \$.75 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$6,612.50, will be considered. Douglas Fir and Hemlock trees 22 ins. and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. T. 19 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE¼NE¼ and NE¼SE¼, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 650 M. feet DC Fir, 1785 M. feet DA Fir, 75 M. feet Red Cedar, 55 M. feet Hemlock, 115 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M. for the DC Fir, \$2.75 per M. for the DA Fir, \$1.50 per M. for the Red Cedar, \$1.00 per M. for the Hemlock, \$.75 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$6,625.00, will be considered. Douglas Fir and Hemlock trees 22 ins. and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. T. 22 S., R. 1 W., Sec. 21, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW¼ of Lot 11, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 150 M. feet DC Fir, 85 M. feet DA Fir. No bid for less than \$2.00 per M. for the DC Fir, \$3.00 per M. for the DA

LEGAL NOTICES

Fir, or a total purchase price of \$555.00, will be considered. Trees 22 ins. and less DBHOB reserved from cutting. The right to waive technical defects, and to reject any and all bids is reserved. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 23rd day of May, 1941. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration. 42-2t-43

NOTICE OF ANNUAL SCHOOL MEETING.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN to the legal voters of School District No. 45 of Lane County, State of Oregon, that the ANNUAL SCHOOL MEETING of said District will be held at Auditorium of Jefferson building; to begin at the hour of two o'clock P. M. and close at the hour of seven o'clock P. M. on the third Monday in June, being the 16th of June, A.D. 1941.

The meeting is called for the purpose of electing one Director to serve three years and one Director to serve five years.

Dated this 27th day of May, 1941.

Attest:
WORTH HARVEY, District Clerk.
VINAL T. RANDALL, Chairman Board of Directors. 42-1t

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.

Notice is hereby given that the County Court, Lane County, Oregon, has appointed Pauline Elmore as administratrix of the estate of Elizabeth A. Sutherland, deceased, in Lane County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are required to present them, duly verified, with the proper vouchers as by law required, to said administratrix at the law office of Alta King, 613 Main street, Cottage Grove, Oregon, within six

months from the date of the first publication of this notice. The date of first publication being May 29, 1941.

PAULINE ELMORE, Administratrix.
Attorney for Estate. 42-5t-46

NOTICE OF REDEMPTION OF CITY HALL BONDS.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That on July 1, 1941, City Hall

Bonds Nos. 37, 38, 39, 40 and 41 will be redeemed by the City of Cottage Grove at the office of the City Treasurer, Cottage Grove, Oregon. All of said bonds will be taken up, redeemed and cancelled on said date at par value and the interest thereon shall cease on the 1st day of July, 1941.
Dated May 29, 1941.
EARL C. BALLEW, City Treasurer of Cottage Grove, Oregon. 42-1t

Notice of School Election To Approve Budget

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN To the legal voters of Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon, that an election will be held in the Music Room, Union High School Building, Cottage Grove, Lane County, State of Oregon, in said Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon, on the 23rd day of June, 1940, between the hours of 2:00 o'clock P. M. and 7:00 o'clock P. M. of said day, for the purpose of submitting to the legal voters of said district the question of approving the budget for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 1941, and ending June 30, 1942, as heretofore approved by the budget committee and the Board of Directors of said district, and to vote on the proposition of levying a tax for the year 1942.

The reason for such election is that it is necessary that the budget be approved by the legal voters of said district to eliminate any question as to the tax levy for the year 1942 over the amount limited by Section 11, Article XI of the Constitution of Oregon, and to raise sufficient revenue for the purposes as set forth in the said budget hereinafter set forth.

The budget and the amount to be levied for the year 1942 as heretofore approved by the budget committee and the Board of Directors is as follows:

BUDGET	ESTIMATED RECEIPTS
Estimated balance on hand at the beginning of the fiscal year (July first) for which this budget is made	\$ 102.00
To be received for Vocational Education (State and Federal Funds)	2,100.00
To be received from the Non-High School District for Tuition	500.00
To be received from other sources, including land sales and delinquent tax	500.00

TOTAL ESTIMATED RECEIPTS \$ 3,202.00

GENERAL CONTROL:	ESTIMATED EXPENDITURES
Superintendent	\$ 2,100.00
Clerk	250.00
Office assistants	500.00
Supplies	120.00
Elections and publicity	75.00
Legal service (clerk's band, audit, attorney fees, etc.)	600.00
Other expense	75.00
Total Expense of General Control	\$ 3,720.00

INSTRUCTION—SUPERVISION	
Principal	\$ 1,836.00
Supplies	150.00

Total Expense, Supervision \$ 1,986.00

INSTRUCTION—TEACHING

Teachers:	
1 at \$1,830.00	\$ 1,830.00
1 at \$1,600.00	1,600.00
2 at \$1,470.00	2,940.00
1 at \$1,350.00	1,350.00
3 at \$1,250.00	3,750.00
2 at \$1,300.00	2,600.00
2 at \$1,200.00	2,400.00
2 at \$1,170.00	2,340.00
2 at \$795.00	1,590.00
Supplies	1,300.00

Total Expense of Teaching \$21,700.00

OPERATION OF PLANT

Janitors and other employees:	
1 at	\$1,125.00
1 at	600.00
Extra summer work	270.00
Janitors' supplies	550.00
Fuel	1,200.00
Light and power	850.00
Water	200.00
Telephone	100.00
Gas	50.00
Other expense of operation	100.00

Total Expense of Operation \$ 5,045.00

MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS

Repair and maintenance of furniture and equipment \$ 300.00

Repair and maintenance of buildings and grounds 2,189.50

Total Expense of Maintenance and Repairs \$ 2,489.50

AUXILIARY AGENCIES

Library books	
Health service (nurse, etc.)	\$ 375.00
Supplies and other expenses	180.00
Transportation of pupils:	
Bus Drivers: 4 at \$585.00	\$ 2,340.00
1 at	540.00
Extra	90.00
Supplies and other expenses	1,570.00
Repair and replacement of busses	1,600.00

Total Expense of Auxiliary Agencies \$ 6,745.00

FIXED CHARGES

Insurance \$ 1,558.00

Total Fixed Charges \$ 1,558.00

CAPITAL OUTLAY

New furniture, equipment and replacements \$ 300.00

Total Capital Outlay \$ 300.00

DEBT SERVICE

Principal on bonds \$ 6,000.00

Interest on bonds 3,735.50

Interest on warrants 400.00

Total Debt Service \$10,135.50

EMERGENCY

Total \$ 2,000.00

RECAPITULATION

Total estimated expenses for the year \$55,679.00

Total estimated receipts, not including proposed tax 3,202.00

Balance, amount to be raised by district tax \$52,477.00

INDEBTEDNESS

Amount of bonded indebtedness \$143,800.00

Amount of warrant indebtedness on warrants issued and endorsed "not paid for want of funds" None

Amount of other indebtedness None

Total Indebtedness \$143,800.00

Dated this 19th day of May, 1941.

Signed: C. A. BEIDLER, Chairman, Board of Directors

WORTH HARVEY, District Clerk

Approved by Budget Committee May 19, 1941.

WORTH HARVEY, Secretary Budget Committee.

Advisory Committee: C. A. BEIDLER, Chairman Budget Committee.

F. J. ANDERSON, Directors: F. EARL GAROUTTE,

ALBERT A. HULL, ROY S. HANDS,

S. L. MACKIN, GEORGE McREYNOLDS,

GEO. W. MATTHEWS, CLYDE E. WRIGHT.

LEE WILLIAMS.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN To the legal voters of Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon, that a school meeting of said district will be held in the music room, Union High School Building, Cottage Grove, Lane County, Oregon on the 23rd day of June, 1941, at eight o'clock P. M. for the purpose of discussing the budget for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 1941, and ending June 30, 1942, as heretofore set forth, and as approved by the Budget Committee.

Dated May 29, 1941.

WORTH HARVEY, Clerk, Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon.

CHARLES A. BEIDLER, Chairman, Board of Directors, Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon.

m29-j5

Notice of School Meeting

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN to the legal voters of School District No. 45, of Lane County, State of Oregon, that a SCHOOL MEETING of the said district will be held at the auditorium of Jefferson Building on the 2nd day of June, 1941, at 7:30 o'clock p. m., for the purpose of discussing the budget for the fiscal school year, beginning July 1, 1941, and ending June 30, 1942, hereinafter set forth.

BUDGET	ESTIMATED RECEIPTS
Estimated balance on hand at the beginning of the fiscal school year (July first) for which this budget is made	\$16,000.00
County School Fund	8,000.00
Elementary School Fund	3,000.00
State Irreducible School Fund	1,000.00
To be received from other sources, including land sales and delinquent taxes	600.00

TOTAL ESTIMATED RECEIPTS \$28,600.00

ESTIMATED EXPENDITURES

GENERAL CONTROL	
Superintendent	\$ 1,400.00
Clerk	240.00
Stenographers and other office assistants	540.00
Census	50.00
Supplies	100.00
Elections and publicity	75.00
Legal service (clerk's bond, audit, etc.)	150.00
Other expense of general control	100.00

Total Expense of General Control \$ 2,655.00

INSTRUCTION—SUPERVISION

Principal	
Vice Principal	\$ 1,800.00
Supplies	1,275.00

Total Expense, Supervision \$ 3,175.00

INSTRUCTION—TEACHING

Teachers Salaries:	
1 at \$1,200.00	\$1,200.00
6 at \$1,150.00	\$6,900.00
3 at \$1,120.00	\$3,360.00
2 at \$1,100.00	\$2,200.00
2 at \$1,050.00	\$2,100.00
2 at \$1,020.00	\$2,040.00
2 at \$650.00	\$1,300.00

Supplies 835.00

Textbooks 900.00

Total Expense of Teaching \$20,835.00

OPERATION OF PLANT

Janitors: 1 at	
1 at	\$1,125.00
Extra summer work	\$500.00
Janitors' supplies	450.00
Fuel	550.00
Light and power	500.00
Water	120.00
Telephone	90.00
Gas	40.00
Other expense of operation	100.00

Total Expense of Operation \$ 3,925.00

MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS

Furniture and equipment \$ 300.00

Building and grounds 1,650.00

Total Expense of Maintenance and Repairs \$ 1,950.00

AUXILIARY AGENCIES

Library books \$ 275.00

Health service: \$360.00

Nurse—Salary \$ 40.00

Supplies \$ 400.00

Total Expense of Auxiliary Agencies \$ 675.00

FIXED CHARGES

Insurance \$ 760.00

State Ind. Accident Fees 50.00

Total Fixed Charges \$ 810.00

CAPITAL OUTLAYS

New furniture, equipment and replacements \$ 700.00

Total Capital Outlays \$ 700.00

DEBT SERVICE

Principal on bonds NONE

Interest on bonds NONE

Interest on warrants NONE

Transfers to sinking fund NONE

Total Debt Service NONE

EMERGENCY

Total \$ 1,000.00

RECAPITULATION

Total estimated expenses for the year \$35,725.00

Total estimated receipts, not including proposed tax \$28,600.00

Balance, amount to be raised by district tax \$ 7,125.00

INDEBTEDNESS

Amount of bonded indebtedness (include all negotiable interest-bearing warrants issued under section 111-1016 O. C. L. A.) NONE

Amount of warrant indebtedness on warrants issued and endorsed "not paid for want of funds" NONE

Amount of other indebtedness NONE

Total Indebtedness NONE

Dated this May 5th, 1941.

Signed: WORTH HARVEY, District Clerk.

VINAL T. RANDALL, Chairman, Board of Directors.

Approved by Budget Committee May 5, 1941.

Signed: WORTH HARVEY, Secretary, Budget Committee.

VINAL T. RANDALL, Chairman, Budget Committee.

Advisory Committee: JOE T. SMITH, JOE E. UMPHREY, ALVIS WICKS, W. L. WORKMAN.

PARIS B. BREDLOVE, J. H. CHAMBERS, JOHN A. LONG, S. T. ROSE, ROY E. SHORT.

m8-m29

Original Estimate and Accounting Sheet

FOR USE IN PREPARING THE ANNUAL BUDGET

Union High School District No. 14, Lane County, Oregon.

This original estimate shows estimated receipts and in parallel columns the unit costs of the several services, material and supplies for the three fiscal years next preceding the current year, the detailed expenditures for the last one of said three preceding fiscal years and the budget allowances and expenditures for six months of the current year. See Section 69-1104, Oregon School Laws.

ESTIMATED RECEIPTS.

Estimated balance on hand at the beginning of the fiscal school year (July 1, 1941) for which this estimate is made \$ 102.00
To be received for Vocational Education (State and Federal Funds) \$2,100.00
To be received from the Non