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LEGAL NOTICES | LEGAL NOTICES | LEGAL

NOTICE TO ( weDITORS,

Notice |Is

hereby given that on

the 1dth day of April, 1941. Mary

Mosby was appointed adminis
tratrix, of the estate of Robert H
Moshy, deceased, by the County
Court of Lane County, Oregon

All persons having claims against
sild estate are required to present
them, duly verified, with the prop-
er vouchers, to sald administra-
Irix at the law office of Alta King,
B13 Main Street, Cottage Grove,
Lane County, Oregon, within six
months from the first publication
ol this notice, April 17th, 1941,
MARY 8. MOSRBY,
ALTA KING Administratrix,
Atlorney, Iﬂi-.”:f'--lll‘

NOTICOE TO CREDITORS,
NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN,
That the undersigned has been ap-
pointed administrator of the es-
PHELIA SALING, some-
NETTIE SALING, deceas-
ed, by the County Court of Lane
County, State of Oregon, by an

tale of
timis

order bearing date the 14th day of
April, 1941,
All persons having claims

against sald estate are hereby re-
quired to present the same duly
verified, to the undergigned at the
law office of HERBERT W. LOM-
BARD, First National Bank bulld-
ing, Cottage Grove, Lane County,
State of Oregon, within six months
from the date of the first publica-
tion of this notice
Dated and first published April
17, 1941
Date of last publication May 15,
111
SAMUEL SHORTRIDGE, Ad
ministrator of the Estate of
PHELIA SALING, some-
times NETTIE SALING,
Ieevased
HERBERT W. LOMBARD,
SIDNEY A. MILLIGAN,

Attorneys for Estate, 36-51-40

NOTICE TO BIDDERS,

NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN
Fhat the City of Cottage Grove
will receive sealed bids at the of-
fice of the City Recorder, City
Hall, Cottage Grove, Oregon, until
seven-thirty P. M. May 5, 1941,
tor the purchase of forty (40)
corgds of four-foot wood delivered
nnd stacked at rear of City Hall,
Cottage Grove, Oregon, Please
state price per cord and whether
slab or forest wood.

The right is reserved to re ject
any and all bids

L. W. COINER,

37-21-38 City Recorder,

NOTICE TO BIDDERS,

NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN
Fhat the City of Cottage Grove
will receive sealed bids at the of-
fice of the City Recorder, City
Hall, Cottage Grove, Oregon, un-
til seven-thirty P. M, May 5, 1941,
for the purchase of one 165-gallon
asphalt heating kettle equipped
with two-burner fuel ol heater,
thermometer and mounted on two-
wheeled solid tire trailer, com-
plete, f.o.b Cottage Grove, Oregon,

Fhe right is reserved to reject
any and all bids

L. W. COINER,

AT-21-38 City Recorder.,

NOTICE OF FINAL [
SETTLEMENT. !

NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN
That the undersigned has [I'l!'{l’
herein her final account as the
Ancillary Administratrix of the
estate of ROSANNA NEWLAND,
also known as ROSE NEWLAND,
deceased, with the County Court
of Lane County, State of Oregon,
and an order has been made and
entered of record directing this
notice and setting the 27th day of
May, 191, at the hour of ten
o'clock A. M. of said day as the |

. 1
Professional Cards

FUNERAL HOMES ’

KARL K. MILLS, Mortician.
Phone 202

RUSSELL E. SMITH, Funeral

Directar. Cottage Grove, Ore,
phone 101,

NOTICES |

time, and the County Court Room State of Oregon, and an order has
in the County Court House at Eu- been made and entered of record
gene, Lane County, Oregon, s the directing this notice hnd setting
place for the hearing of objections, the Jdrd day of June, 1941, at the
il any, to the sald final account hour of ten o'clock A. M. of said
and the final settlement of said day as the time, and the County
estate Court Room in the County Court
Dated and first published House at Eugene, Lane County,
24th day of April, 1941 Oregon, as the place for the hear-
Date of last publication May 22, ing of objections, if any, to the
11 said final account and the final
MAY AUBREY THIES, Ancil- settlement of sald estate
lary Administratrix of the Ex- Dated and first published this
tate of ROSANNA NEW- 15t day of May, 1941
LAND, also known as ROSE  Date of last publication May 29,

this

NEWLAND, Deceased 1941,
HERBERT W. LOMBARD, DELBERT SAFLEY, Admin
Attorney for Administratrix. istrutor of the Estate of
A7-51-41 ADELINE SAFLEY, de-
— ceased.

UNITED STATES DEPART-' HERBERT W LOMBARD,
MENT OF THE INTERIOR, Gen- SIDNEY A. MILLIGAN.
eral Land Office, O, and C. Ad- Attorneys for Estate
ministration, Portland, Opregon,
Sealed bids, marked outside “Bid
for Timber," and addressed to the
Chief Forester, O. and C. Admin-
Istration, 410 Custom House, Port- Notice is hereby given that E
land, Oregon, will be recelved un- M. Babcock, administrator de
HI10:30 A, M., Pacific Time, May bonis non, of the estate of Morton
13, 1941, for the purchase of tim- F Babcock, deeeased, has filed his
ber upon tracts hereinafter des- final account in the County Court

A8-51-42

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING,

eribed; each bid must state the of Lane County. Ore

J Y. Uregon, and said
amount per M, feet BM., which ' . g . . p
will be offered for each species Court has fixed June 3rd, 1941, at

10 o'clock A. M. in the Court
Room of said Court in the Court
House at Eugene, Lane County
Oregon, as the time and place for

and the total consideration which
will be paid for the timber. No
bid for less than the appraised
vilue will be considered. Each bid
must be submitted in  duplicate hearing and acting thereon

and be accompanied by a deposit Dated this 1st day of May, 1941
in the form of a certified (‘hm‘l; E. M. BABCOCK, Adminis-
in favor of the Chief Forester o , N

the O and C. Administration. The ALTA ';(’;;:‘Ilii'\”l:::_::yn”n

——

deposit of any successful bidder & 38-5t-42

AANTADS

RATES: Five cents per line or
one cent per word, with inimuimn
charge of 25 cents I'hree  Insep
tions for the price of 2%, if paid
in advance. Want ads will be

charged only where firms or in-
dividuals have established ecredit
Send money to insure insertion. If
charged add 15¢. Keyed ads 28¢
extra. Card ol thanks 50¢ if not
over 50 words, If over 50 words,
cards of thanks will be charged
at the regular rate. Copy must be
in Wednesday to insure insertion.

-,

For Sale or Trade

e S P

TOWN PROPERTY for sale, or
trade for small acreage, close in
104 No. Sixth. 36-3tp-38

FOR SALE -Baled oat and vetch
hay. $8.00 per ton in ton lots.
Cottage Grove, phone 241 or 42J2.

28-tfe

FOR SALE Brahma hatching

eggs. Own a flock of these
beautiful chickens. Dorena road,
fourth house on right after cross-
ing steel bridge, 36-3tp-38

FOR SALE--8 acres, % acre of
strawberries, '4 acre phenomen-
al berries; 6 room house, two large

chicken houses, good garden
ground. $1200 cash; $1500, $500
down, balance $20 month. 5 miles
out Lorane highway. Write F. E.

Mecum, Springfield, Rt. 2.
37-3tp-39

will be credited on the contract,
Payment in full at the time of fil-
Ing the contract is required In
sales amounting to $2500 or less
For copies of the form of proposal,
form of contract and bond, terms
of payment, amount of deposit re-
quired with bid, amount of bond
required with contract and other
information, application should be
made to the address shown above.
In LANE COUNTY: T. 18 8., R.
1 W, Sec, 5, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
SWYKSWY and NWY SE\, esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to be 820 M. feet DA Fir, 395 M.
feet DC Fir, 60 M. feet Red Cedar,
BO M. feet Hemlock, 30 M. feet

Prolect Sunburn

The mineral gramules which are
embedced in the surface of asphalt
shingles do more than provide them
with rich, vibrant color, for they
also add to their fire-resistance and
protect the weather-proofing asphalt
coating beneath them from sunlight
and the oxidizing effects of the alr.

Ol Doublea
The new oll “cracking" process |
permits the petroleum Industry to
obtain twice as much gasoline from
8 barrel of erude oil as formerly.
Thus the gasoline production of

White Fir, No bid for less than ¥nown oll reserves has been
$2.25 per M. for the DA Fir, $2.00 %ubled.

wr M. for the DC Fir, $1.50 per —_——

M. for the Red Cedar, $1.00 per ‘Kudsy’ Plants

M. for the Hemlock and White
Fir, or a total purchase price of
D il gemterd T38| e Dbe- s e e
able timber designated for cutting ©onserving 'M improving fertility
on E% /1s. estimated for the ' ©f the soll “at a price which they
purpose of this sale to be 935 M. can afford o pay.”

feet Red Fir, 40 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $2.00 Masonlo Lodges

per M. for the Red Fir, $1.50 per The membership of Masonle

M. for the Incense Cedar, or a'
total purchase price of $1,930.00 r::':s’.;:?: United States in 1920

will be considered. Trees less than
22 inches DBHOB reserved from
cutting. T, 19 S, R. 2 W., Sec. 27,
all merchantable timber designat-
ed for cutting on SEYWNE\, esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to be 959 M. feet Douglas Fir, 60
M. feet Red Cedar, 30 M. feet
Incense Cedar, 65 M, feet White
Fir. No bid for less than $2.00 per
M, for the Douglas Fir, $1.00 per
M. for the Red Cedar, Incense
Cedar, and White Fir or a total
purchase price of $2,073.00 will be
considered, T. 20 S, R. 6 W., Sec
13, al] merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on E%SW Y and
WILSEY, estimated for the pur-
st of this sale to be 1495 M. feet
JA Fir, 2405 M. feet DB Fir, 40
M. feet Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hem-
lock, B0 Red Cedar Poles. No bid
for less than $2.25 per M, for the
DA Fir, $2.00 per M. for the DB
Fir, $150 per M. for the Red
Cedar, $1.00 per M. for the Hem-
lock, $.75 ea. for the Red Cedar
g):t';ﬁ '?{ - :::ll?l Pil:‘(‘ha;:':m:mr you need money for any purpose,
Douglas Fir 22 inches and less Phome, write or come in and see
DBHOB reserved from cutting. |us today.

The right to waive technical de- : .

fects and to reject any and all Calklns Flnme CO.
bids is reserved. Dated at Port-| (Eugene's La st H Owned
land, Oregon, this 18th day of | ' © pem e e Owne
April, 1941. W. H, Horning, (‘hiel‘.mﬁ Miner Bldg. Eugene, Oreg.

J ), . i -
'l'k(::;tmtor. O, and C Adn!il;nj:r;a License S-225-M-212 Phore 1206
. 38-5t-42

Alabama Is growing 1,000,000
kudzu plants at {ts state prison

——

Planted in Pines
Thousands of acres of land in the
South teo poor for crops are being
planted In pines for possible use in
the section's paper industry,

Are You Single
or Married?

Both families and individuals
qualify for our cash loan service,
To apply for a loan in a dignified
confidential manner just tell us
how much you need (8£50-8$100-
$200 or more) and answer a few
simple questions. Cash is advanced
without delay.

Repayment terms are easy. $6.72
per mo. repays a $100 loan includ-
ing all charges in 20 months.
Other amounts in proportion. If

for long term lease.

FOR SALE - Attractive home in-

cluding 1'% acres of land with
beautiful grounds. Also 19-acre
ranch on Row river 12 miles from
town. Bargain prices for cash. In-
quire 141 Third or phone 221-J.

38-3tc-40 '

FOR SALE Russell’'s purebred
Plymouth Rock chickens. Five
miles east of Cottage Grove on

Row River. Mrs. A. L. Hart.
38-3tp-40

FOR SALE — Three-quarter bed,

springs and mattress. Also large
bed springs. Apply
River Road, corner of Ash. 38-1tp

SALE SALE SALE

Used gas washer, $49.75. Wood

range, $19.75; used piano, $59.75:

used rocker, $1.95. Callahan's Sale |

Eugene.

NEW wardrobe, $£149; moth
robe to hang cloths, $1.98. $2.49
blankets $1.29; pillows, 69¢c.
$£110 Davenport and chair, $69.75.
Try Callahan's Anniversary Sale,
Heilig Theater Bldg. 38-1tc

For Rent

A S

SLEEPING ROOMS for rent or!

board and room at 343 South
3rd Street. 35-4tp-39

STORAGE SPACE FOR RENT:
For furniture, automobi
household goods, merchandise
all kinds at 2%c per square foot
4'%c per
square foot rental for merchan-
dise requiring quick turn. Small
rooms available for long term
leases, Cottage Grove Storage
Warehouse Co., 33 North Lane
Street. For space call Jesse Lans-
ing, 32 South 10th, or Twin Oaks
Builders Supply Co., Eugene.

FOR RENT--Good house about 6

miles east of Cottage Grove on
Row River road. Bath, telephone,
garden, pasture for cow. Alsea
Hawley, phone 5F12. 38-3tp-40

FOR RENT —Four-room furnished
house. 727 North 9th. Phone
269L. 38-1tc
FOR RENT--2-room unfurnished
apartment. Lights and water

furnished. 518 So. Douglas Ave,
38-1tp

NOTICE OF FINAL

SETTLEMENT,

NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN |
That the undersigned has filed
herein his final account as the Ad-
ministrator of the estate of ISA-
BELL JENKINS, deceased, with
the County Court of Lane County, |
State of Oregon, and an order has
been made and entered »~f record
directing this notlce and setting

109 North

35-5t-39

FOR RENT - 1--2«roomm modern

cabin, $25.00 month, wood, wa-
ler, lights furnished. Walker's
Lodge, 4"Miles north of Cottage
Grove on 99 38-1tp
Want to Rent

e T R e

WANTED TO RENT: modern fur

nished place for two adults
avallable about May 10, Phone
Cottage Grove 45-J-2. a8-1te

WWMIN
Work Wanted

"‘““"““WWHVVU“\’M
WANTED - Housework to do. Wil

work by the hour or part time
work in town only, Call at Sen-
tinel office, 38-11p
FOR CARPENTER WORK, con-

tract or day remodeling or new
work and shingling, experienced
in all kinds. See Arthur Robison,
Saginaw, Ore, 38-3tp-40

FOR LOW PRICES and the best
in painting, papering and repair
work see or write Maxon, Disston
Rte., Cottage Grove, Ore 3-tfe

5 Lost and Found

LOST —White leather purse on
East Main. Contains driver's li-
cense, two dollars in change. Re-
turn to Helen Dunn, Lorane high
school gr Sentinel office. 38-1tp

Board and Room

.

BOARD, ROOM, laundry. Mrs.
Dan Clasby, 1142 Birch Ave.,
Cottage Grove. 38-1tp

Miscellaneous

$200 PRIZES, $50 in trophies and
Ribbons. Classes for purebred
lambs, single and pen of 3 fat
lambs—FF.A., 4-H and open
Benton, Linn and Lane Counties,
May 17. For information write
Junction City Lamb Show. 38-1tc

ACID ROBS you of your strength
and slows you down. Chiroprac-
tic removes the cause. C. R. Sim-
kins, over Petersen's. Phone 5,
34-tfc
FOR ALL disorders of the nerves
and circulation, try Swedish
' massage. Chas. P. Armstrong, 1521
Ash. Lady Attendant. 36-3tp-38

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR
Wiring and Rewiring
Agents for Berkeley Pumps.
Leon C. Godard, 405 Main St.,
phone 156-L-201. 10-tfe

SEE TRAXLER,
! m”m and ex
A_hqﬁngumhm )

WELDING
Electric Gas
|Cottage Grove Welding and Boil-

IRIGHT oUT

OF THE AIR

camemmeametsemsmees eme By GARLE PERRIS cccmes b

YONNIE BosweLL
+ will be heard every Thursday
night on the Bing Crosby hour
over CBS for the entire summer

pictured here

She doesn’t believe in vacations
and while others may drop out oc-
casionally so the popular Connie
will keep right on singing.

. . .

Dalores Gillen, full grown dra-
matic actress who takes the role
of five-year-old Barry on “Joyce
Jordan — Girl -Interne,” recently
received a letter from a Provi-
dence, R. I,

nouncing he had written a play, | to be

he did [lrl--hr'f the revolt 'h.‘
would overthrow the Yugoslavian
government a week before it hap-
pened

- - -

Twenty-one times in five years
of broadcasting —that's how often
Alice Frost, star of the CBS “Big
Sister” program, has been re-
newed,

- - -

Diminutive 13.year-old Olive
Major, soloist on the Eddie Cantor
program and a native of Cali-

play producer, an-|fornia, had to come to New York

fully appreciated by the

“Daddy’s Boy," especially for the | movie people. Since returning to

oungster. He wanted full particu-
ars about Barry's height, weight,
color of hair, parents’ name, and
name of his afc.-m! X
L]

Radio Row is calling Don Voor-
hees, pictured here, the musical
magician, because he concludes

the “Cavalcade of America” music
Monday nights in one NBC studio
and then is on the air a minute
later from another studio ei'ght
blocks away with his m fea-
turing James Melton Francia
White. b

Raymond Gram Swing. commen-
tator heard Mondays and Fridays
at 10 pm., edst, over Mutual,

Manhattan with the banjo-e

comic, Olive is being approached

frequently reiardins screen tests,
L

Abbott and Costello are expect-
ed to increase the popularity of
the Charlie McCarthy show, though
it is one of the top rated air shows.
The comedy team is heard Sun-
days at 8 pm., edst, over the
NBC-Red network.

- L L]

Don’t be surprised if Jack Benny,
pictured here, has Kay Francis as
a guest on his Sunday night pro-

E:: via NBiCl soon. Kay has “t.
signed to appear opposi

Jack in “Charley's Aunt,” so
Benny’s likely to invite her over

rarely ventures predictions. But

Honey Declines
Missouri bee keepers are worried
lest the people of the nation have
lost their “‘sweet tooth.” Demand
for honey has declined and one of
the best honey producing seasons is
. in prospect,

Volley Ball
In 1805 William G. Morgan, then
physi¢al director at the Y. M. C. A
in Holyoke, Mass., invented volley
ball

anyday to “get acquaints

' Pennsylvania Produces Most Steel
Pennsylvania produces nearly half
the steel of the country. -

““Words Are Not Big Enough
to praise ADLERIKA. Am 55 and
travel; always carry ADLERIKA
| with me.” (G. D.-Calif.) Gas bloat-
. ing, sour stomach, spells of con-
| Stipation quickly relieved thru AD-
| LERIKA. Get it TODAY.

| Cottage Grove Pharmacy, Kelly

|er Works. Madison St. 26-tfc

i Drug Co., Kem’s for Drugs.

Chedks

Come ~ = ‘a running’®

Try enclosing a return envelope with your first-
of the month statements. You'll be surprised
with results obtained in speeding up collections.

Regular MAIL WELL envelopes or the Notice-
to-Pay envelopes, printed with your return
address, cost so little when you consider the
results. Ready cash means discounted bills and
a better credit rating.

ENTISTS the 13th day of May, 1941, at the|
. L =~ |/ hour of 10:00 o'clock a. m. of said| A business reply per-
DR. W. E, Ll:BOW;—Dmﬂhtlg |day as the time and the County! mlt.muyounothh;

~No. 1 Omer
Cottage Grove, Ore. Phom 35
DR. C. H. KIME, Dentist—Of-
fice In First National Bank

Building, Phone 10. Cottage
Grove, Bregon.

You enclose a return
envelope with your
statement and on all
returns from this city
you pay 3¢ each - - 4¢

{Court room in the County Court |
|House in Eugene, Lane County.
| Oregon, as the place for the hear-|
|ing of objections, if-any, to lhef
sald final account and the flnall
isettlement of sald estate, !

Dated and first published this |

BUSINESS REPLY ENVELOPE

JOHN DOE & CO.
145 MAIN STREET

PHYSICIANS '
— and Sur. || 10th day of April, 1941. on all returns from VOUR Sowa. onere
H. AXLEY iclan | Date of last publication May 8, | out of town. "

| 1041, |

RICHARD G. JENKINS, Ad-| Let us show youthe MAIL WELL Notice to-Pay envelopes. "

Cottage Grove, Oregon. ||
____ATTORNEYS | ;"3'2',';;{;}? ¢ ,?{g;,';:ﬂ."’p‘,’fj * () ; Many firms are using them specially printed for statement
torney 8t Lan_Firet Natio. !}lERB::e!:';'ed\;V LOMBARD r '] and return envelope combined.
a w. al | . Y |
al Bank bullding, Cottage |~ Attorney for Administrator. | PLACE YOUR NEXT ORDER e
m‘ - - - — - - I

R B ™ ova e WITH US
254J; Res. phone, 1, SETTLEMENT. ,
Cottage Grove, Ore.

' °
g - ' NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN |
JE ABS 0., 88 : I h e n t n
”(I,;: S‘?., g&g;; ((;,(.,.’ Ed! That the undersigned has filed his Se l el

The Sentinel

ward F. Bailey, Pres. Ab- ||/final account as the Administra- Pour gunaranice Phone 159
stracts, Title Insurance, Es- |[tor of the Estate of ADELINE Phone 159 o! guanty
Crows. SAFLEY, Deceased, with the-J |
S———— Counly Court of Lane  County, | " -




