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HDPE Plastic Pipe: 8”, 12”,
21”  available.  Call  for
prices.  Cornelius,  OR.  Jeff
503-341-4289

Gondola  Shelving:  140'
available,  32'  rows,  $1320
per row. Hubbard, OR. 503-
981-3557, 503-981-7517

7'x8'  Ex-Military  Freezer:
clean, $1500 OBO. Can de-
liver.  Clatskanie,  OR.  503-
728-2310

740 Miscellaneous

$$  Mortgage  Money:
Farms and other commer-
cial real estate properties.
Low bank or private mon-
ey. Millions available. Call
Salem, OR. 971-600-4327

710 Loans & Financing
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950 Nursery Stock 
 IF YOU HAVE A BEEF  -

 sell it in next week’s Capital Press!

•New Crop Red Clover Haylage•
•New Crop Grass Haylage•
Top  quality,  4x4  round
bales.  Call  to  reserve your
bales.  McMinnville,  OR.
971-241-3267

Jefferson  Hazelnut  Trees:
#1  caliper  and height,  light
rooted, approximately  5000
at $2.95 each.  Dayton, OR.
503-437-4833

High  Quality  Orchard
Grass:  1st cutting,  1200
pound  bales,  barn  stored,
no  rain,  $160/  ton.
Prineville,  OR.  541-233-
0773

HEMP SEED AND
PLANTS:

Otto  ll  Hemp  seed  and
plants  tested  by  state  to
meet  all  requirements.
Seed, $1. Plants, $4. Silver-
ton, OR. 503-873-5940

Delivery Driver Needed
Crop Production Services is
looking for a Delivery Driver
for  our  Cornelius,  Oregon
location.
Description:
Handles  and  delivers  bulk
and packaged fertilizer  and
chemicals,  performs  daily
vehicle inspections, handles
and  delivers  packaged
chemicals,  cleans  and
maintains  equipment,  as-
sists  mechanic,  may main-
tain  maintenance  records,
and  other  duties  as  as-
signed.
Requirements:
High  School  diploma  or
demonstrated experience in
vocational  agricultural  or  a
combination  of  education
and work  experience. Valid
driver's  license  and current
CDL  required  (Class  A).
DOT- minimum age require-
ment is  21 years.  Must be
able  to  work  60-65  hour
weeks including weekends.
To apply visit:
www.cpsagu.com and click
the "Careers" tab.

High  Quality  Horse  Hay,
stock  hay.  We Buy,  Sell  &
Haul  All  Types  of  Hay:  Er-
ickson  Trucking,  Burney,
CA. 530-949-9298

Hay for Sale: 2016 1st thru
3rd  cutting,  3X4  bales,
$115- $150/ ton. 2- string al-
falfa  bales,  $9  each  or
$180/  ton.  Call  541-567-
1609.

Private  company  currently
seeking to fill  one Forester/
Forestry  tech position. This
is  a  full  time  position  that
will  start  September  1,
2017.  Wages will  be  com-
mensurate with experience.
Forestry background and or
Forestry  degree  is  prefer-
able. 
PRIMARY  RESPONSIBILI-
TIES:

Conduct stand exams and
prepare  prescriptions  for
vegetation  control,  animal
damage  control  and  tree
planting, etc.

Perform  forest  inventory
sampling  employing  both
variable  and  fixed  radius
plots.  Collect  information
and  process  data  on  per-
sonal computers.

 Assist  with  slash  piling,
pile  burning  or  other  slash
disposal activities.

 Perform contractor super-
vision  to  ensure  contract
compliance  and  quality  as-
surance. Some "hands  on"
tree  planting,  herbicide  or
brush disposal work may be
required.

Maintain records and maps.
 Harvest unit layout.
 Other duties as assigned. 

The ideal candidate will  be
highly  motivated  and  work
well with limited supervision
in  a  variety  of  terrain  and
weather  conditions.  A  valid
driver's  license  and  good
driving history are required.
Submit  your resume and 3
references  by  July  30th,
2017  by  responding  to
forestryassist@gmail.com
or mailing to:
Forestry Assistant
PO Box 586
Cottage Grove, OR 97424

 LIME  & LIME  &
 DOLOMITE DOLOMITE

 Marion Ag Service, Inc. Marion Ag Service, Inc.
 41 Years Experience Hauling & Spreading

 7746 St. Paul Hwy. • St. Paul, OR

 1- 800-648 -2718
 503-633-4561 or 503-678-5932

 www.marionag.com
 support@marionservice.desk-mail.com
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 WHEN YOU’RE READY TO 
 LIME - WE’VE GOT IT

 READY FOR YOU!

 WHEN YOU’RE READY TO  WHEN YOU’RE READY TO 
 LIME - WE’VE GOT IT LIME - WE’VE GOT IT

 READY FOR YOU! READY FOR YOU!

 • 8 High Flotation Applicators Ready

 • Orchard & Berry Applicators

 Four Locations Throughout 

 the Willamette Valley
 • 2 Locations in St. Paul

 • Broadacres      • Brooks

 Four Locations Throughout  Four Locations Throughout 

 the Willamette Valley the Willamette Valley
 • 2 Locations in St. Paul

 • Broadacres      • Brooks

 Call Today for Prices
 & Volume Discounts.

 Call Today for Prices Call Today for Prices
 & Volume Discounts. & Volume Discounts.

 WE’LL GET ‘ER DONE!! WE’LL GET ‘ER DONE!! WE’LL GET ‘ER DONE!!

Hazelnut Trees: McDonald,
Jefferson,  Yamhill,  Saca-
jawea, York, Eta, Theta, Fe-
lix.  Dayton,  OR.  503-864-
4422

 NOTICE: Oregon  Lands-
 cape Contractors Law
 (ORS 671) requires that all 
 landscape contracting bus-
 inesses to be licensed with 
 the Landscape Contractors 
 Board.  This four (4) digit 
 number assures the busi -
 ness has a bond, insurance 
 and an associated land -
 scape contractor who has 
 fulfilled the testing and 
 experience requirements 
 for licensure. For your pro -
 tection, verify & check a 
 license status on our web: 
 www. lcb.state.or.us or call 
 (503) 986-6561 before hir -
 ing a landscape business.
 Landscape Maintenance 
 companies do not have to 
 be licensed to perform 
 maintenance functions on 
 your already installed 
 landscape.

 660-1-52-2/#13

Grass  Hay/  Timothy  Or-
chard  Blend:  2  tie.  Banks,
OR. 503-314-8484

660 Services 660 Services

Good First Cutting Orchardgrass:
3- tie small or 3x4 big bales.
$125-  $200/  ton,  several
hundred ton available.  Myr-
tle  Creek,  OR.  541-591-
2758

LOGGING COMPANY
 HIRING

RDL  Northwest  has  2  full
time  positions  available.
Choker  setter  and  chaser.
6  months  experience  and
valid  driver's  license  re-
quired.  Benefits  available
after  probationary  period.
Lebanon,  OR.  Please  con-
tact  RDL  NW  at  541-451-
3177.

For Sale: 35 Acres of Grass
Hay:  buyer  to  cut  in  June.
Mulino,  OR.  503-829-9615
503-550-1821

DWARF MEYER
 LEMON TREES:

2  to  3  gallon.  Wholesale
prices.  2017  Inventory
clearance.  Grown  and
raised  in  Oregon!  Monroe,
OR.  719-661-8706

FEEDER HAY
All types. Alfalfa, Grass and
Straw.  Call  for  price  which
will  include delivery. Ephra-
ta, WA. 360-305-9798

Blueberry Plants: Duke and
Legacy,  3 years old $2.50.
Scio, OR.
westfarminc@gmail.com

Betaseed  is  the  leading
Sugarbeet  seed  brand  for
growers  in  North  America.
We  are  looking  for  a  full
time Agricultural Administra-
tor to work in our Tangent,
OR  facility.   This  job  pro-
vides clerical support to the
Commercial  Manager.  You
will  track  invoices,  record
budget  related  information,
prepare check requests, op-
erate  equipment  for  field
production  activities  and
much  more!  A  Bachelor's
degree and valid driver's li-
cense  is  required;  AG
knowledge is  a plus. Some
travel  is  needed.  Betaseed
offers a robust benefit pack-
age  that  includes  PTO,
401k,  Medical,  and  much
more!!  Review  a  complete
job  description  and  submit
your application at 
www.betaseed.com. 

 660-1-52-4/#13

 NOTICE: 
 Oregon Construction 

 Contractors Law
 (ORS 701) requires that all 
 businesses that advertise 
 remodeling, repair, home 
 improvement or new con -
 struction be licensed with 
 the Construction 
 Contractors Board. An 
 active license means the 
 contractor is bonded and 
 insured.

 Verify a contractor’s 
 license and complaint

 history at 
 www.hirealicensed

 contractor.com
 503-378-4621

CHEAP FEED
BOTTOM  DAMAGED  3x4
GRASS  STRAW  BALES,
$20  PER  TON.  "MORE  "
DAMAGED  BOTTOM
BALES  AVAILABLE  FOR
FREE!  SALEM, OR. 541-
223-1176

JW  Kerns  Inc.,  Klamath
Falls, OR is seeking a Field
Service Technician for piv-
ot  irrigation equipment.  Job
Responsibilities: Troubleshoot
and  repair  mechanical  electri-
cal irrigation systems; Multitask
and  prioritize;  Demonstrate
self-starter initiative.  Qualifica-
tions: Electrical/ Mechanical
background;  Computer
skills;  Customer  service
skills.  Irrigation  experience
a plus.  Email resume to:
jwkernsinc@jwkernsinc.com

Central Oregon Hay: Deliv-
ered. Portland Area. 20 ton
minimum. 503-703-5462Blueberry  Plants  (20)  vari-

eties: 1, 3, 7 gallon, 6' field
grown.  Raspberry,  Marion,
Boysen,  Currants.  Whole-
sale  pricing.  Canby,  OR.
503-730-4788
jimgeiselman@canby.com
www.canby.com/morningshade

 Here is your opportunity to be responsible for 

 the welfare of Dairy Heifers within the feedlot 

 by managing all activities involved in the 

 shipping, receiving, processing, doctoring, 

 daily care and moving of cattle in a manner 

 that ensures maximum  performance. This key 

 position is critical in managing  relationships 

 with existing dairy customers and identifying 

 and developing new dairy customers.

 Dairy Heifer Manager – 
 Simplot Feeders

 Pasco, Washington Area

 590-26-2-3/#17

!"#$%&'#(#)*+,!! Bachelor’s Degree from 
 4  year   college is preferred. Ability to discuss 

 animal nutrition  & recommend to customers.

 For more details & to apply, please visit our 

 website at  http://www.simplot.com/careers  JOB 

 ID #4352. Simplot offers competitive benefits/

 salaries.

3rd Cutting Premium Dairy
Alfalfa.  2nd cutting Alfalfa
with  some Blue  Grass.  All
big  bales,  no  rain,  barn
stored.  Call  for  delivered
prices.  Christmas  Valley,
OR. 541-408-6747

Irrigation Service Technician/
Mechanic: We are a full ser-
vice agricultural dealership.
Willing to train the right indi-
vidual.  Mechanical,  irriga-
tion and fabrication skills  a
plus. Clean driving record a
must. Full time position with
benefits.  Wage will  depend
on  experience.  Immediate
opening.  Please  send  re-
sume to
patrickd@ernstirrigation.com
or to PO Box 490, St. Paul,
OR.  97137,  attention:
Patrick.

 • P OND  C ONSTRUCTION  • I RRIGATION , 
 W ILDLIFE  & D AIRY  • S ITE  P REP .       

 • L AND  C LEARING  • L ASER  L EVELING  
 • D UMP  T RUCKING  • L OG  H AULING    

 • A LL  P HASES  O F  E XCAVATING

 • LICENSED • BONDED

 • INSURED
 CCB# 84747

 (503)  829-2985
 Mt. Angel, OR

 VANDERBECK

 TRUCKING & 

 EXCAVATING 

 INC.

 660-22-5-1/#7

2017  Hay:  2-  tie  orchard
grass,  small  bales,  $220/
ton.  Alfalfa,  small  bales,
$220/ ton. Big bale orchard
grass  hay  3x3x8,  $65/
bale.  Delivery  available.
Terrebonne,  OR.  541-480-
2881 no texts

BALING TEAM
LAV  Ag-Services,  LLC:  lo-
cated  in  Albany,  OR.  is
looking for  2  qualified  indi-
viduals  for  summer  work
(July/  August) to be part of
our  baling  team.  We  are
looking for tractor drivers to
operate the baler and rake.
Preferably  18 years of  age
or older, but would consider
16  to  17.  Good  pay  and
hours. Please contact Greg
Riches  at 503-507-2031 or
email:
griches@lakesideag.com

2017  1st Cutting:  orchard
grass  in  chambered  block
stacks,  barn  stored,  $175/
ton.  Monument,  OR.  541-
934-2423

AGRICULTURAL EMPLOYERS/
EMPLOYEES:  Nationwide
Agri-Business, & Production
Career  Opportunities.
Hansen  Agri-PLACEMENT.
308-382-7350. View
www.hansenagriplacement.com

BARE ROOT
HAZELNUT TREES:

We  have  up  to  (30,000)
bare  root  Yamhill  hazelnut
trees that  will  be ready  for
2017-  2018 planting.  Along
with:  York,  McDonald,
Sacajawea and Webster for
pollenizors.  541-979-7739
Sherfy Farms, Albany, OR.
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 BREEDEN LOG CO.
 Land Clearing, Road  

 Constr., Ripping, Ponds, Site 
 Prep, Utilities, Bridges

  503-843-2981
 503-435-7098 cell

 CCB#130229, Lic., Bonded, Insured
   Sheridan, OR

Ground Support Truck Driver:
For  aerial  applicator,  mini-
mum class B, CDL with Haz-
Mat  endorsement,  full  time,
year  round  employment.
Full  benefit  package,  profit
sharing,  bonus,  vacation,
mechanical skills a plus, trav-
el  expenses  paid.  Self-moti-
vated, team player. Newberg,
OR. 503-538-9469

950 Nursery Stock 

2- TIE ALFALFA BALES
1st  cutting,  100  pound
bales.  Nice  leafy  flakes,
some  sun  bleach,  barn
stored,  $140/  ton.  Dayton,
WA. 509-386-7014

1st Cutting  2017  Orchard-
grass:  $225/  ton.  Hidden
Valley,  Klamath  Falls,  OR.
541-892-1964

1000  Supers  6-5/8”:  New
and Used, deeps and com-
mercial  extracting  equip-
ment.  Lots  of  miscella-
neous.  Amboy,  WA.  360-
263-2425

990 Hay, Straw, Forage
930 Bees LAMB WESTON

 FROZEN FOODS DIVISION
 We are currently accepting applications for our upcoming 

 2017 Harvest at our Paterson, WA facility.

 SEASONAL POSITIONS:

 • Harvest Operator:   $13.50 p/hr + $.50 p/hr Incentive
 • Truck Driver:  $16.50 p/hr + $2.00 p/hr Incentive
 • TL Harvest Ops (Harvest Ops Shift Supervisor):  

 $30.00 p/hr + Housing Allowance + Bonus

 REGULAR YEAR ROUND POSITIONS:

 • Mechanic (Harvest) M2– Regular FT:  $20-$30 DOE
 • Ag Operations  Specialist  – Salaried FT – Salary is DOE

 Interested individuals may apply online at 
 www.lambweston.com/about/careers 
 or contact J Macias at 509-875-2474 

 or email at j.macias@lambweston.com
 Lamb Weston is an equal opportunity employer and considers qualified 
 applicants for employment without regard to race, color, creed, religion, national 
 origin, sex, sexual orientation, gender identity and expression, age, disability, 
 veteran status or any other protected factor under federal, state or local law.
 As part of our pre-employment process, we conduct a background check as well 
 as hair follicle drug screen.  26-2/#6

AG FENCE CREW LEAD
Hiring Crew Lead to install
agriculture  fencing  through
I-5 corridor in Washington. 1
year construction/  fence in-
stallation  preferred.  Re-
quired:  WA driver's license,
clean  driving  record  and
drug  testing.  Local  to  Gig
Harbor.  Must  be able  to  lift
100  pounds,  use  hand and
power  tools,  work  outdoors
and communicate effectively
with clients and co- workers.
Contact 253-851-5494

FREE RENT AND UTILITIES!
Caretaker/  Fire  Watch:
Your RV.  Remote site has
hookups,  great  view  on
wildlife  refuge,  Klamath
County,  OR.   Horses  and
dogs okay. 503-702-1555
gordoncjones@gmail.com

Organic  Cane  Sugar  for
Animal  Feed:  by  the  bag,
$0.25 per pound. Additional
discounts  for  orders  over
450  pounds.  Available  for
pick-  up  at  GloryBee  800-
456-0913.  Ask  for  Factory
Store. 29548 B Airport Rd.,
Eugene, OR. 97402

 Call in your
 classified ad

 by Wednesday.
 10:00...Display   (bordered)   Ad 
 Noon......................Line Ad 

 AUCTION DEADLINE
 Tuesday @ 5 pm

 Toll free   1-800-882-678 9
 Fax   (503) 370-4383

 www.capitalpress.com

 Don’t
 Forge t
 Don’t Don’t

 Forge t Forge t

CERTIFIED ORGANIC
 ALFALFA

Feeder  and  Dairy  Quality.
Tests  available.  Call  for
price,  includes  delivery.
Ephrata, WA. 360-305-9798

ORGANIC FERTILIZER:
PotentGrow  5-2-2  organic
fertilizer pellets. New on the
market!  Product  of  Wash-
ington  State.  WSDA  ap-
proved  organic  and  Clean
Green  certified.  Made from
organic  Chicken  Litter  and
Canola  Seed  Meal.  Avail-
able in bulk, 1-ton totes, 25
pound  bags  and  1  gallon
buckets.  Tangent,  OR.  For
pricing  and  freight  quotes
call 360-941-6560 or e-mail:
info@potentgrow.com

AG EQUIPMENT TECH
NEEDED

Tech  with  electrical,  hy-
draulic,  transmission,  air
conditioning and engine ex-
perience  needed  at  our
Fruitland  location.  Great
wage and benefit  package.
Contact  Wayne  208-452-
2593, email resume to
w.martin@mtvieweq.com
or  mail  to:  Mountain  View
Equipment,  1380 N Whitley
Drive,  Fruitland,  ID 83619

 Seeking Full or Part-time Cattle Truck Driver
 Must have valid driver’s license.  No CDL?? 

 No problem. Training available.  Very competitive 
 compensation. DOE $50K - $75K annually. 

 Insurance benefit and aggressive 401K profit 
 sharing plan.  Very flexible schedule. 

 Residing in Madras not necessary.
 Call:   541-475-6681 

 Email:   NortonCattleCompany@gmail.com

 NORTON  CATTLE  COMPANY NORTON  CATTLE  COMPANY NORTON  CATTLE  COMPANY
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590 Help Wanted Bag  Sewing  Machine:
Newlong NP-7, never used,
$475.   9'  bucket  elevator
with 5” cups, new 220v mo-
tor,  $1000  firm.  Dayville,
OR. 541-806-6865

CHICKEN MANURE AND/
OR LITTER

For  sale  in  truckload  lots,
delivered.  Tangent,  OR.
Call  360-941-6560  or  e-
mail: info@potentgrow.com

980 Organic890 Fertilizer

TOEPFER LOGGING, INC.
Timber  Harvesting,  Slash
Piling,  Reforestation:  high
quality forest and land man-
agement  services.  Certified
professional logger. Over 50
years in the timber industry
Stayton, OR. 503-769-5505 

Titan  Oat  Seed: $26/  per
100  lbs.  In  totes.  $30/  per
100 lbs. In 50 lb. bags. De-
livery  available  for  a  fee.
Adrian OR. 208-697-3483

The Christmas Tree Com-
pany: Is  now buying fields
of  trees,  all  species  and
sizes.  Cash  deposit  now
and paid in full  before har-
vest.  Quality  Christmas
Tree Services too. Please
call 503-880-5820. Thank you. 

USED NURSERY 
CONTAINERS:

Used, but  reusable nursery
containers. All sizes. Inven-
tory changes daily.  Call  for
current  availability  and
prices. Sawyer Farms, Scio
OR. 503-769-3417, 
juddsfarm@wvi.com 
(also, wanted used containers)

PLEASANT HILL
 DEVELOPMENT LLC

Land  clearing,  pond  build-
ing,  ripping,  logging,  li-
censed,  bonded,  insured
CCB#  213829,  financing
options available. Sheridan,
OR. 971-241-0344

Seasonal Truck Drivers:
Agriculture  company  in
Kelseyville, CA seeking ex-
perienced  Class  A  truck
drivers  for  grape  harvest
from  mid-  August  through
approximately November 1,
2017.  Doubles  and  DMV
printout required. Pay DOE.
Email resume to:
h.harvesting@gmail.com  or
mail:  PO  Box  1462,
Kelseyville,  CA   95451  or
pickup  application  at  3495
Benson  Ln.,  Kelseyville,
CA. 707-279-0650

SEED GARLIC
Hawk Ridge Garlic Farms is
now  taking  pre-orders  for
our  2017 crop. Order  early
for the best selection of Cer-
tified Naturally Grown garlic.
541-866-8586, Email at:
hawkridgegarlicfarm@gmail.com
www.hawkridgegarlicfarm.com

Field Representative
Spokane Seed Company is
seeking a full time field rep-
resentative to join our team.
Candidate must have strong
work  ethic  and  excellent
communication  skills  with
growers.   Provides  consul-
tation  on  best  agricultural
practices  in  raising  pulse
crops, including food safety,
crop evaluation, purchasing,
and quality assurance from
field to packaging. Must be
able  to  work  in  a  team-
based environment with ex-
tended hours during harvest
season. The candidate must
be a self- starter,  have ex-
cellent  verbal  and  written
communication skills, strong
organizational,  mathemati-
cal,  and  computer  skills.
Agricultural  background
and/  or  degree  preferred.
Employment  includes  full
benefits/  profit  sharing.
Please  send  resume  to
cshrope@spokaneseed.com

Quality VNS Alfalfa Seed:
$2.50/  lb.  Chris  Kreggers,
Touchet, WA. 509-394-2400

Sold Nursery
125  acres  solid  set:  30'x2”
pipe  with  spike  couplers,
24”  risers  with  2.5  GPM
Nelson  Rotators.  1  to  100
pipes,  $25 each. Over 100,
$20  each.  Sublimity,  OR.
503-769-7127

KD Electric
Residential,  Commercial,
solar  installs,  LED  lighting
upgrades.  Call  Kevin  Diet-
rich  503-385-7960.  ccb
#212885.  Salem,  Silverton
and  surrounding  areas  in
Oregon

RETIRING
 LAND FOR SALE

34  Acres.  Beautiful  views.
Property overlooks Mayfield
Lake  in  Mossyrock,  WA.
Excellent  flat  Christmas
tree,  horse  farm, etc.   with
well-drained  soil.   Partially
planted  1-  5  year  stock  of
Noble,  Fraser,  Nordmann,
and  Douglas  fir.   An  addi-
tional 6 acres Nobles plant-
ed  this  spring.  Will  carry
contract.   360-983-3267
evenings or leave message.

Horseshoeing & Trimming
Emmett, ID. 208-963-1104

Compost  2  Year  Old
Screened:  no  manure,  $9
yard,  1000  yard  minimum.
Dayton, OR. Bob  503-969-
9545

Pasture Seed $1/ lb.  Lawn
Seed  $1/  lb.  Wheat  Straw
$80/ ton.  Grass hay $120/
ton. Wheat $6/ bag. Rickre-
all, OR. 503-623-6922

 590-1-52-2/#13

 NOTICE
 It is unlawful employment 
 practice for any employer or 
 employment agency to print 
 or circulate or cause to be 
 printed or circulated any 
 statement, advertisement or 
 publication, or to use any 
 form of application for em-
 ployment, or to make any 
 inquiry in connection with 
 prospective employment 
 which expresses directly or 
 indirectly any limitation, 
 specifications, as to race, 
 religion, color, sex, national 
 origin, or by age between the 
 ages of 18 and 65, or any 
 intent to make only such 
 limitation, specification or 
 discrimination, unless based 
 upon bona fide occupational 
 qualification.

951 Nursery Eq. & Supplies

FARM HELP WANTED
Looking  for  full  time  hired
hand, Klamath Falls, OR to
help  with  our  hay  farming
operation,  heavy  farm
equipment  skills  required.
Class  "A"  CDL  preferred.
Salary negotiable. Call 509-
961-9693

Cover  Crop  Seed,  Native
Seed and more. Clean and
quality.  Sudan  grass  on
special.  Albany,  OR.  Call/
text Alana Kenagy 541-905-
2111

McDonald Hazelnut Trees:
#1, $6.25. Available to order
now! Dayton, OR. 503-437-
4833

870 Seed

Greenbriar  Ag  Manage-
ment Offering Professional
Christmas  Tree  Services:
Experienced,  quality  work,
planting through harvesting,
stump grinding.  Sales,  bro-
kering,  licensed  &  bonded
contractor.  Farm  &  Forest
Labor License #10628 Stay-
ton, OR. 503-932-2323
greenagmngt@wvi.com

Fence Installed
With Hydraulic Post Driver:

503-859-2804
www.statewidefence.net

New  Zealand,  non-climb
horse,  sheep  &  goat,  field
fence,  barbed  wire,  deer
and game fencing, rail fenc-
ing and gates. Serving Ore-
gon  Since  1993.
CCB#93256

Western  Art:  Framed  print.
Bucking  horse  scene.
Signed.  Artist  Robert  Ab-
bett,  $250.  McMinnville,
OR. 503-883-9683

Grandma's  1800s  Crafts-
man  Style  Rocker:  with
spring  cushion  seat,  $250.
McMinnville,  OR.  503-883-
9683 

770 Antiques & Collectibles

Safety and Human
Resources Officer

Progressive  Northern  Cali-
fornia  Strawberry  Nursery
Corporation  is  seeking  a
safety  and  human  re-
sources  officer  for  its  Cali-
fornia  operation.  Duties  in-
clude  coordinating  safety
training for all  company lo-
cations, working with insur-
ance providers, staying cur-
rent on laws and regulations
relevant  to  Human  Re-
sources  and  Safety,  and
managing  employee  per-
sonnel  issues.  Successful
applicant will be highly moti-
vated and able to work with
groups.  A  college  degree
and  experience  in  agricul-
ture  is  required.  Ability  to
speak Spanish is a big plus.
Salary will be based on ex-
perience. Send cover  letter
and resume to
info@lassencanyonnursery.com
by July 10, 2017
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 CONFIDENTIAL 
 SERVICE

 If you respond to a “Blind Box” 
 ad with a dept. (box) number, 
 but you wish to protect your 
 identity, follow this procedure:
 •  Enclose your reply in an 

 envelope.
 •  Address the envelope to:

 CONFIDENTIAL SERVICE (TSR)
 Capital Press
 P.O. Box 2048

 Salem, OR 97308
 •  Include a note, separate from 

 your response, listing the firms 
 you do not want to see your 
 letter.

 •  If the advertiser is one you’ve 
 listed, your letter will be 
 destroyed.

Rainbow  Trout-  Fingerlings
to  Trophy.  Oregon  and
Washington delivery.  Island
Springs Hatchery, Portland,
OR. 503-621-3565

CHRISTMAS TREE LOT
SUPPLIES

SELLING  ALL  MY  LOT
EQUIPMENT.  TENTS,
HOWEY  ELEVATOR,  3
HOWEY  BALERS,  ONE
CHAIN  DRIVE.  BENIKYS,
BARRELS  AND  POLES,
LIGHTS 110V x  100', COL-
ORED  LIGHTS,  4  AND  6
WHEEL POLARIS QUADS,
CHAIN  SAWS,  DRILLS
HAND,  2  LARGE  DRILLS,
AND  1200  REBAR
STANDS  1/2  PRICE.
GRANTS PASS, OR. CALL
541-659-7818

Wagontire,  OR.  needs  a
resident caretaker. 541-430-
0766

DRAINAGE SOLUTIONS
Increase  yields,  provide
deeper root growth, improve
soil  aeration,  reduce  com-
paction,  decrease  soil  ero-
sion.  Creekside  Valley
Farms Serving Oregon and
Washington. 503-864-4422

   
 DAIRY NEEDS

 HERD MANAGER
Raw milk  dairy near  Sand-
point,  ID.  needs herd man-
ager  to  milk  cows 2  times
per day six days per week,
clean cow pens, assist with
moving  cows,  manage  irri-
gation, fix equipment and all
other tasks necessary to run
a  successful  direct-to-con-
sumer and wholesale dairy.
Good pay and housing pro-
vided.
www.pleasantmeadowcreamery.com.
Call Paul at 208-597-2086.

Rainbow  Trout  for  Pond
Stocking:  Statewide  deliv-
ery.  Brian  Trout  Ranch,
Sandy, OR. 503-668-7861

JEFFERSON HAZELNUT
TREES

We are currently taking or-
ders  for  Jefferson  hazelnut
start's.  They  will  be  ready
this December- January we
have Eta and Theta pollina-
tors  also.  Trees  will  be
$4.50  each  for  Jefferson
and $5.50 each for the polli-
nators.  Lebanon,  OR.  Call
or text Tim 541-409-6751

Cash  Paid.  Top  Prices.
Christmas Tree Fields. Any
Condition.  Oregon,  Wash-
ington.  503-873-6774, 503-
551-5809

CDL TRUCK DRIVERS
NEED  3  CDL  TRUCK
DRIVERS  FOR  FRUIT
HAULING  8/10/2017  TO
11/2/2017. Short hauls, long
hour. Free RV site. Bridge-
port, WA. 509-686-3241

Bulk Water Hauling
Potable  water  hauling.  For
households,  farms,  busi-
nesses,  swimming  pools.
Serving the Willamette Val-
ley  OR.  area  New  Day
Trucking.  Call  541-905-
3755

1500 to 1800 Nordmann Fir:
6'  to  8',  Grade  #1,
Cornelius,  OR.  503-250-
2740

Ranch  Hand  Wanted:  2000
head  yearling  operation
Northwest  OR.  Must  know
cattle, be able to work cattle
on  horseback and  maintain/
install  electric  fencing.  Full
time. Competitive pay, DOE.
Call 503-369-1907

Oregon Aquaculture Asso-
ciation: Licensed  Oregon
Fish  Producers,  trout  &
warm water, u-catch
www.oregonaquaculture.org

EMERALD GREEN ARBORVITAE:
rooted  cuttings  and  2-1/4",
liners  available.  Forest
Grove, OR.   Call  503-359-
7540

RANCH MANAGER
Cow/ calf and crop farming
operation  in  Moapa,  NV
seeking  Ranch  Manager.
Health benefits and housing
provided. Visit:
www.hiddenvalleyranchcattle.com
for job details.
To apply send resume to:
hvrcattle@gmail.com.
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   Weds. @ 10AM

 503-364-4798
 FAX 503-364-2692
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 Weds. @ Noon

 503-364-4431
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 The 
 Capital  Press

 sales team 
 is here to 
 serve you!

 • Real 
 knowledge

 • Real 
 people

 • Real 
 results!

 JoAnn Vanderwey
 SW Idaho 

 & NE Nevada
 (208) 880-4334

 Carl Bamford
 SW Willamette Valley
 SW & Central Oregon

 (541) 521-9008

 Stacey Righter
 Portland  (Eastside)
 & W Washington
 (503) 871-7956

 Greg Hains
 California

 & W Nevada
 1-800-882-6789

 Matt Petrie
 SE  Idaho,

 Montana and
 Utah

 (208) 880-0455

 Nicole Frazier
 NE Oregon, 

 E Washington
 & N Idaho

 509-999-3130

 Brittany Steele
 NW Oregon

 (503) 871-7957
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