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 CALL 

 US TODAY!
 CALL 

 US TODAY!

 Concealed Fastener Products

 Exposed Fastener Products

 12” TIGHT LOCK STARTER STRIP • PATENT #09291821

 16” TIGHT LOCK STANDING SEAM METAL ROOFING PANEL

 12” TIGHT LOCK STANDING SEAM METAL ROOFING PANEL

 2’ CORRUGATED PANEL 2 1/2”

 2’ DELTA RIB PANEL

 2’ WEST COAST PANEL

 3’ WEST COAST PANEL

 3’ TUFF RIB PANEL

 3’ DELTA RIB PANEL

 Since 1987

 Sales: 1-800-470-4660 • 503-844-8688 • Fax 503-693-1547

 www.NorthAmericanMetal.com

 Buy
 Mill

 Direct

 Buy
 Mill

 Direct

 Boom 
 Truck 

 Delivery

 Boom 
 Truck 

 Delivery

 1-800-470-4660 1-800-470-4660 1-800-470-4660

 SUMMER special! SUMMER special!
 3’ wide metal  roofing & siding
 $ 1 49

 / LF   Galvalume/Galvanized
 $ 1 49

 $ 1 65 / LF   for select colors
 28, 26 & 24 GA available

 3’ R-PANEL & 3’ PBR  PANEL
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 LEMKEN is a successful, family owned business with a 235 year history. We are one of Europe’s leadin g manufacturers of 

 plows, cultivators, drills and sprayers, with headquarters in Germany. Our turnover exceeded $300 mi llion in 2015. Our 

 strong focus to increase our market share in the USA creates an opening for an

590 Help Wanted 590 Help Wanted

 “ BEST FARM PAPER AROUND! ”
 Gerald Stanton • Granite Falls, Wash.

 Subscribe! Call 1-800-882-6789

 Savings are Savings are

 at Capital Press
 1-800-882-6789
 www.capitalpress.com

 hot! hot! hot!

Large  row  crop  farm  in
Prosser, WA. is looking for an
experienced  Diesel  Mechanic
to  repair  semis,  pickups,  and
farm equipment. Job requires
keeping  daily  records,  time
management skills  and  the
ability to read, speak and under-
stand English fluently. Call  509-
786-4236,  Fax  509-786-4536,
email michelle@munnfarms.com

K4  Teaching  Position:
Small  rural  school  in  east-
ern  Oregon,  housing  and
benefits  provided.  Riley,
OR.  For  information  go  to
www.teachingjobs.com key-
word Suntex. To apply con-
tact  Julie  at  541-573-3229
or  email  jopie@century-
tel.net 

Ranch Hand:
600  cow ranch near  Con-
don,  OR.  is  looking  for
someone to help ride, feed
cattle and calve heifers this
winter  and  handle  general
ranch  work.  Respectful
working  environment  with
good housing provided, rea-
sonable  hours  and  pay
DOE.  Must be professional,
experienced  and  conscien-
tious,  willing  to  ride  in  all
kinds  of  weather  and
demonstrate  a  willingness
to work cattle in a calm and
quiet manner. If you are fin-
ishing  school  for  the  year
and  thinking  about  laying
out for a spell to earn some
money, this might be an op-
portunity  that  will  interest
you if  you know cattle and
horses.  Job  starts  Sept.  1,
2016. Contact: jb1.ranch@-
comcast.net

Hazelnut  Operation:  Seek-
ing  individual  with  knowl-
edge  of  hazelnut  spraying,
fertilizing and irrigation sys-
tems,  oversee  contract  la-
bor  crew,  mechanical  and
basic  math skills.  Compen-
sation  DOE.  Central
Willamette  Valley.  Send  re-
sume to:
helpwanted@capitalpress.com,
subject line: RB40 

FARM LABOR/
OPERATOR NEVADA

Tasks include handling leaf
cutter  bees,  trapping  go-
phers,  operating  tractor,
combine,  field  chopper,
truck etc.  Alfalfa seed and
peppermint  farm  located  in
Orovada  NV.  Housing  in-
cluded.  Clay 775-623-8448

 TREASURE VALLEY STEEL, INC.
 STEEL ROOFING & SIDING

 Manufacturing Zee & Cee Purlins In-House  • Custom Cut Exact Lengths

 • Standing Seam
 • 2 ft. Delta Rib
 • 3 Ft. Pro Panel
 • 3 ft. Tuff Rib Panel

 40 Year Full Paint Warranty • WeatherX Paint System

 • 25 Colors
 • Custom Trim
 • 2-1/2” Corrugated
 • Delivery Available

 • Full Soffitt Line
 • 3 ft. Gulf Coast Panel
 • 3 ft. PBR Panel
 • COR-TEN

 Since 1982

 510-27-5-4/#17

WANTED RANCH MANAGER
AND FARM HANDS:

333 Ranch LLC in northeast
Nevada  is  offering  a  great
opportunity  for  skilled  indi-
viduals.   We  are  currently
seeking  a  working  ranch
manager  with strong cattle,
irrigation  and  hay  produc-
tion skills.  We are also hir-
ing farm hands with experi-
ence  in  equipment  opera-
tion,  irrigation,  hay  produc-
tion  and  farm  mechanics.
Salary  and  compensation
package  based  on  experi-
ence.   Please  send  cover
letter  and  resume  to
uscfence@yahoo.com

 We deliver 

 your message 

 to the West’s 

 Ag Audience!

 800-882-6789
 or go to

 www.capitalpress.com

 REACH 
 YOUR  AG 

 CUSTOMERS
 with 

 • Flyers

 • Mobile

 • Websites

 • Newspaper

 • E-newsletters

 • Custom 
 Publications

 • Ag Business 
 Directory

Controller/ Agriculture:
The  Dolsen  Companies,  a
well-established,  diverse
family  owned, Yakima area
company  seeks  an  experi-
enced controller  to join our
team. Must have a minimum
of  a  Bachelor's  degree  in
Accounting,  5 years  of  ac-
counting  experience  and
would  prefer  a  CPA.  This
candidate  will  work  closely
with and report to the CFO.
Responsibilities  include
General  Ledger  account
reconciliations,  preparation
of  journal  entries  and
monthly  Financial  State-
ments,  financial  analysis,
federal and state tax work,
oversight of internal controls
and  other  duties  as  as-
signed.  Desired  skills  in-
clude  good  interpersonal
and  communication  skills,
being  a  self-starter,  detail-
oriented,  able  to work in a
group  or  independently,
good organizational, analyti-
cal,  and  computer  skills,
and  able  to  multi-task  and
manage deadlines.  Send  re-
sume, cover letter and references to:
hiringmgrtdc@gmail.com

Washington State Univer-
sity  Klickitat  and Skama-
nia County  Extension Di-
rector:  This is a 12-month,
non-tenure,  promotion track
faculty  position  at  the rank
of  Assistant  or  Associate
Professor.
Required: Earned Master's
degree in a discipline relat-
ed to agriculture, natural re-
source management or ap-
propriate  Extension  area.
To apply visit: http://www.w-
sujobs.com.  Position
#123523. Screening begins
July 11, 2016. Contact Gina
Ord  at  gina.ord@wsu.edu
with  any  questions.
EEO/AA/ADA.

 www.minerpolebuildings.com
 17825 Painter Loop NE

 Hubbard, OR 97032
 Oregon ccb# 133899

 WA License #ronmisc975ja

 •  Custom buildings

 •  Personal riding arenas

 •  Shops and garages

 •  Clearspans up to 100’

 The scope of our service offering 
 ranges from building only the 
 shell to completing a turnkey 
 project. If you don’t already have 
 a design or plan, we’re happy to 
 create a design that fits your 
 needs and specifications.

 •  Boarding facilities

 •  Stall barns

 •  Warehouses

 •  Hay storage

 Post Frame Kits  •  Installation  •  Design
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 888.453.5964

CONSTRUCTION
 OPERTATORS/ LABOR

Current openings for opera-
tors, pipe layers, top hand &
general  labor.  Current
driver's license and own re-
liable  transportation  re-
quired.  Excellent  wage and
benefit  package,  wage
DOE.  Apply  in  person,
Northwest  Earthmovers,
Inc.  13600  SW  Galbreath
Dr.,  Sherwood,  OR.  8AM-
5PM  Monday-Friday.  A
Drug  Free  and  Equal  Op-
portunity Employer.
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 METAL ROOFING & SIDING
 � Prompt Service � Contractor Pricing 

 � Delivery Available � Volume Discount
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 HALSEY, OR � (541) 632-4260

 AGRICULTURAL � RESIDENTIAL � COMMERCIAL

CATTLE/ HAY RANCH
HAND- OREGON

Responsibilities include cat-
tle  handling,  feeding,  calv-
ing,  and  haying.  General
ranch maintenance, fencing,
machine operation, and re-
pair skills required. Must be
honest,  clean,  dependable,
and a self-starter.  Required
to  pass  a  drug  test  and
have a valid drivers license.
Housing available and other
benefits.  Call  the  Manager
at  541-462-3036 evenings.

590 Help Wanted

Wanted: 2,000- 5,000  Cul-
tured Noble Fir: 5' to 8', 500
cultured Douglas Fir 6' to 7',
360-513-7822

WANTED  2'-10'  Noble/
Nordmann  Fir  Fields:  We'll
pay  cash!  Silverton,  OR.
Contact: 503-873-6774

Now  Buying  Christmas
Trees: All  species.  Cash
Buyer.  Any  location  wel-
come. 503-880-5820

 Adam Barker
 OWNER/OPERATOR
 ORccb #206866

 971-237-4403
 abarkerbuildings

 @gmail.com
 Lafayette, OR

 BARKER
 BUILDINGS

 SPECIALIZING IN:

 • POLE BUILDINGS
 • STEEL BUILDINGS
 • ARENAS SHOPS
 • GARAGES
 • LEAN TOS & ADD-ONS
 • CONCRETE & 
 • EXCAVATION

 510-27-5-4/#7

 25 YEARS IN THE 
 POLE BUILDING 

 BUSINESS

GENERAL MANAGER
NEEDED:

We are seeking an individu-
al  with  exceptional  talent
and a proven track record to
be the General Manager of
a  large  family  farming  and
ranching operation.  The in-
tegrated company produces
cattle,  sheep  and  wheat,
and  manages  timber  hold-
ings, land development and
hunting grounds. The Gen-
eral  Manager  will  oversee
day-to-day  management  of
the  company including  key
customer,  vendor  and  sup-
plier relationships. This per-
son  will  be  responsible  for
development  of  innovative,
high-performance  teams
and  achieving  specific  fi-
nancial  goals.  Responsibili-
ties  also  include  develop-
ment and implementation of
annual budgets. Attendance
and  participation  at  board
meetings,  including  prepa-
ration of reports, will be very
important.  The  General
Manager  will  work  closely
with  the  Chairman  and
Board  on  financial  and
strategic plans. Salary to be
determined based on expe-
rience. Please contact Cun-
ningham  Sheep  Company
in Pendleton, OR. to obtain
a full job description and in-
structions on how to apply.
Office: 541-276-6391
Email: csheepco@gmail.com 

Greenbriar  Ag  Management
Offering  Professional
Christmas  Tree  Services:
Experienced,  quality  work,
planting through harvesting,
stump grinding.  Sales,  bro-
kering,  licensed  &  bonded
contractor.  Farm  &  Forest-
Labor License #10628 Stay-
ton,OR. 503-932-2323
greenagmngt@wvi.com

FLATBED TRUCK DRIVER:
Freedom Precast is looking
for  an experienced  Flatbed
Truck  Driver  with  Class  A
commercial  license.  With
doubles endorsement to de-
liver  concrete  products  in
Oregon.  May  also  operate
forklift, load trucks, and oth-
er  labor  activities  at  plant.
Full-time, shift varies. Home
evenings.  Salem, OR. 541-
515-0451
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 IF YOU HAVE A BEEF  -
 sell it in next week’s Capital Press!

 CAPITAL PRESS CLASSIFIEDS
 GET RESULTS! C l a s s i f i e d s   1 - 8 0 0 - 8 8 2 - 6 7 8 9  JUHR CONSTRUCTION CORP.

 503-658-2306

 • Agricultural

   • Recreational

      • Industrial

 FAX 503-658-0599 • BB#88367
 Building in Oregon Since 1946  28-2/#8

 PRE-ENGINEERED ALL STEEL 
 BUILDINGS

 Visit us on the web at www.juhrconstruction.com

Attention  Christmas  Tree
Growers:  Complete  man-
agement services available.
Planting,  cultivation  and
harvesting.  Also,  sales
available. High quality work,
Licensed  and  bonded,
backed by 50 years experi-
ence,  BTN  of  Salem,  OR.
503-881-8610.

FARM  PRODUCTION  MAN-
AGER:  Idaho. Needs 5+ Years
Management  Experience
$100,000.  308-382-7351
www.hansenagriplacement.com
EH-6423

570 Christmas Trees 590 Help Wanted510 Farm Buildings 510 Farm Buildings510 Farm Buildings 510 Farm Buildings 510 Farm Buildings 510 Farm Buildings
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