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 R & M Steel Co.   866-454-1800
 45 Years of Manufacturing Excellence

 www.rmsteel.com  26-2/#17

510 Farm Buildings

Executive Director Opening:
Klamath Water Users Asso-
ciation seeks a self-motivat-
ed,  productive  individual  to
provide  leadership  and
oversight  to  the  organiza-
tion's  constituents  with  re-
gard to natural resources is-
sues,  with an emphasis on
water resources and power
costs.  The position covers
Association  administration,
policy  development,  strate-
gic  planning,  evaluation  of
technical  material,  commu-
nications,  and  a  variety  of
other policy and water-relat-
ed work. Salary will be com-
mensurate  with  education,
qualifications,  and  experi-
ence.  KWUA also offers a
competitive employee bene-
fit package.  Klamath Falls,
OR.  For  more  information,
go to www.kwua.org

 Equipment & Harvest Manager

 California Sun Grower Services harvests tomatoes on 
 over 80,000 acres and supplies tomatoes to processing 
 facilities in Central CA. We provide custom 
 transplanting and other farm services, and we farm our 
 own operations and joint venture farming operations. 
 We are seeking an Equipment & Harvest Manager to 
 provide leadership and organizational competency for an 
 operating unit within Cal Sun’s transplanting and 
 harvesting business in the Los Banos area. Successful 
 candidate will have competency in large-scale 
 agriculture mechanical harvesting, transplanting, crop 
 production, and extensive experience in maintaining and 
 repairing farming and harvesting equipment, and be 
 bilingual in English and Spanish for hiring, training, and 
 organizing personnel. This position is for a hands-on 
 professional who enjoys working on a peer level with 
 talented and committed colleagues. Pay expected to be 
 $75-100K base (DOQ). Apply online at 

 www.morningstarco.com.
 590-42-11-1/#T2D

 TREASURE VALLEY STEEL, INC.
 STEEL ROOFING & SIDING

 Manufacturing Zee & Cee Purlins In-House  • Custom Cut Exact Lengths

 • Standing Seam
 • 2 ft. Delta Rib
 • 3 Ft. Pro Panel
 • 3 ft. Tuff Rib Panel

 40 Year Full Paint Warranty • WeatherX Paint System

 • 25 Colors
 • Custom Trim
 • 2-1/2” Corrugated
 • Delivery Available

 • Full Soffitt Line
 • 3 ft. Gulf Coast Panel
 • 3 ft. PBR Panel
 • COR-TEN

 Since 1982
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SEED CONDITIONING
MANAGER:

We are looking for a quali-
fied  individual  to  oversee
and  operate  all  aspects  of
conditioning turf grass seed
from  the  field  to  the  bag.
Must  be  able  to  maintain
and repair equipment.  This
person  will  supervise  pro-
duction assistants and man-
age  quality  control.   Also
will lead a team of 5-20 em-
ployees  in  conditioning,
blending,  receiving,  and
shipping  seed.   Overtime
and  some  possible  shift
work.  The job is located in
Woodburn,  OR.   Salary
DOE  plus  medical/  dental
and  profit  sharing.   Fax  or
email.  503-982-4832  
ryegrass.cm@gmail.com

 FOREMAN WANTED:
Triple Creek Ranch in Elko
County Nevada is seeking a
foreman. This is a hands on
position.  Must be proficient
at farming, haying, pivot irri-
gation,  flood  irrigation,
equipment  maintenance,
cattle  and  general  ranch
work.  Must have good com-
munication skills. Very com-
petitive  salary  package.
Ranch pickup for ranch use
One week of paid vacation
annually. Housing.
Please  send  cover  letter
and  resume  to:
uscfence@yahoo.com

Food/  Retail  Managers:  lo-
cal Federal employment op-
portunity! Coffee shop man-
ager,  26K-28K.  Assistant
operations  manager,  33K-
35K. Federal benefits pack-
age!  3  years  management
experience.  Portland,  OR.
Send resume to:
canteenrecruiter@gmail.com

 SESVANDERHAVE USA a worldwide leader in 
 sugar beet seed production and sales is seeking 
 a qualified Agronomist/ Field Representative for 
 it’s Oregon and Washington production areas. A 
 Bachelor’s Degree in an Agriculture/ Plant 
 Based Program along with 5 years of seed 
 production experience is preferred. A candidate 
 must work well independently and work as part 
 of our production team. A majority of your time 
 will be spent outdoors but proficiency with 
 Microsoft Office is required. Significant travel is 
 required to various production regions. A 
 successful candidate must possess a valid 
 driver’s License and be able to lift 50 pounds to 
 complete the assigned duties.

 Please send resume and cover letter to: 
 SESVANDERHAVE USA 

 PO Box 9274, Brooks, OR 97305
 or to: us.humanresources@sesvanderhave.com  5
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 Seed Production Representative: Seed Production Representative: Seed Production Representative:

Manager 1-Farm/ Facility:
The purpose of this position
is  to  maintain  facility
grounds,  equipment,  and
buildings. This individual will
support  research  faculty
with field chemical  applica-
tions, farming practices, and
record  keeping  as  well  as
supervise  and  coordinate
staff  schedules  including
temporary  labor  and  stu-
dents.  Position  located  in
Klamath  Falls,  OR.  Job
posting  closes  November
16th, 2015. To view the com-
plete posting and to apply, visit:
http://jobs.oregonstate.edu/ap
plicants/Central?quickFind=68662 

DAIRY  POSITIONS:  Nation-
wide. Extremely Good Employ-
ers.  Excellent  pay/  benefits.
308-382-7370.  Review  Web-
site: www.hansenagriplacement.com

 M ETAL  R OOFING
 AND  S IDING

 A GRICULTURAL  • C OMMERCIAL
 I NDUSTRIAL  • R ESIDENTIAL
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 FALL special! FALL special!
 3’ wide metal 

 roofing & siding
 $ 1 49 / LF   Galvalume/Galvanized
 $ 1 49

 $ 1 65 / LF   for select colors
 28, 26 & 24 GA available

 CALL 

 US TODAY!
 CALL 

 US TODAY!

 Concealed Fastener Products

 Exposed Fastener Products

 12” TIGHT LOCK STARTER STRIP • PATENT #09291821

 16” TIGHT LOCK STANDING SEAM METAL ROOFING PANEL

 12” TIGHT LOCK STANDING SEAM METAL ROOFING PANEL

 2’ CORRUGATED PANEL 2 1/2”

 2’ DELTA RIB PANEL

 2’ WEST COAST PANEL

 3’ WEST COAST PANEL

 3’ TUFF RIB PANEL

 3’ DELTA RIB PANEL

 Since 1987

 Sales: 1-800-470-4660 • 503-844-8688 • Fax 503-693-1547

 www.NorthAmericanMetal.com

 Buy
 Mill

 Direct

 Buy
 Mill

 Direct

 Boom 
 Truck 

 Delivery

 Boom 
 Truck 

 Delivery

 1-800-470-4660 1-800-470-4660 1-800-470-4660

Field Sales Agronomist
Madras, OR.:

Do you have an Agronomy
or Agribusiness degree? Do
you  have  demonstrable
knowledge  of  agricultural
production  and  practices?
Do  you  have  a  strong
knowledge  of  both  herbi-
cides and fertilizers? If  you
said  “yes”  to  all  of  these
questions AND you have a
proven  sales  track  record,
we  want to hear  from you!
Grow  your  career  with
Wilbur-Ellis,  a  strong  and
profitable industry leader of-
fering  competitive  compen-
sation,  tremendous  growth
and development opportuni-
ties, and a people-first work
environment!  Apply  online:
http://www.wilburellis.com/
Careers/Jobs/Pages/Field-
Sales-Agronomist,-Madras-
OR.aspx 
OR  email  your  resume  to
ddefreece@wilburellis.com

510 Farm Buildings 510 Farm Buildings

HERBICIDE FOREMAN /
APPLICATOR

Hiring for a horticulture fore-
man/  herbicide  applicator.
Our  company  since  1993
has  an  amazing  history  of
naturalization  restoration
projects.   We  need  task-
based passionate people for
planting and herbicide appli-
cation as well as great lead-
ership.  Washougal,  WA.
Please  apply  from our  on-
line  application  at
www.LKECORPORATION.com
and send resume to:
jobs@Lkecorporation.com

Cowboy Needed: 
Someone  who  can  ride
Colts and fix fences.  East-
ern  Oregon.  Call  541-493-
2456

 Field Technician 

 J.R. Simplot Company

 Grandview, ID

 •  Participate in a personalized training 

 program to develop competencies in 

 selling appropriate product and supplies 

 to customers. 

 •  Learn support operations through 

 functions such as blending, delivery, 

 equipment setup and maintenance.

 For additional details and to apply, please 

 visit our website at  www.simplot.com/careers . 

 Search  Job ID 2778 . We offer competitive benefits/

 salaries. EOE/AA employer.
 590-45-2-4/#17

 GROWER SOLUTIONS

FARM MECHANIC:
Full time mechanic on fami-
ly owned farm. Wage based
on training and experience.
Benefits offered after proba-
tionary  periods  met.  Basic
knowledge of hydraulic and
electrical  systems,  and
some light welding required.
Junction-City, OR. 541-954-
6692

Greenbriar  Ag  Management
Offering  Professional
Christmas  Tree  Services:
Experienced,  quality  work,
planting through harvesting,
stump grinding.  Sales,  bro-
kering,  licensed  &  bonded
contractor.  Farm  &  Forest-
Labor License #10628 Stay-
ton,OR. 503-932-2323
greenagmngt@wvi.com

590 Help Wanted

 JUHR CONSTRUCTION CORP.
 503-658-2306

 • Agricultural

    • Recreational

       • Industrial

 FAX 503-658-0599 • BB#88367
 Building in Oregon Since 1946

 Visit us on the web at www.juhrconstruction.com

 PRE-ENGINEERED ALL 
 STEELBUILDINGS

 46-1/#8

FIELD REPRESENTATIVE:
Small  family-owned  and
managed company, located
in the mid-Willamette Valley
area of Oregon, is seeking a
highly  qualified  person  as
their  Field  Representative.
This  should  be  considered
by the applicant as a long-
term career opportunity.
If  interested,  please  send
resume/ cover letter to:
k.holcomb@rcbinternational.com

DeJong  Hydraulic  Jaw
Tree  Baler:  Updated  with
Evergreen twine cans, Hon-
da engine, $7,500.  25' Belt
Tree  Conveyor: with  Hon-
da engine, $1,500. Monroe,
OR.  541-915-1234  or  541-
953-4890

WANTED NOBLE BOUGHS:
Overgrown Noble Fir,  NON
Sheared  in  last  3-5  years
wanted.  Cornelius,  OR.
503-583-3163

Attention  Christmas  Tree
Growers:  Complete  man-
agement services available.
Planting,  cultivation  and
harvesting.  Also,  sales
available. High quality work,
Licensed  and  bonded,
backed by 50 years experi-
ence,  BTN  of  Salem,  OR.
503-881-8610.

WANTED  Buying  Cultured
Noble Fir 4'-10': Also Natu-
ral Nobles 6'-20'. WANTED
tree  shaker.  Eagle  Creek,
OR. 503-705-1710

5'-8' Field Run Douglas Fir:
Truck loads available. Mon-
roe,  OR.  541-915-1234  or
541-953-4890

Agronomist/ Field
Representative:

Blue Mt. Seeds, inc., Imbler,
OR.,  an independent grass
seed  production  company
and  retail  Ag  fertilizer  &
chemical  supply  company
located  in  Union  county,
Northeast  Oregon  is  seek-
ing  a  qualified  Agronomist/
Field  Representative.   The
ideal  candidate  would pos-
sess  a  Crop  Science/
Agronomy  degree,  have
good initiative,  strong com-
munication  skills,  good
computer  skills  and  be  a
team player that works well
with  customers  and  other
employees.   A  successful
candidate  must  also  pos-
sess  a  valid  Driver's  Li-
cense  with  a  clean  DMV
record.  Blue Mt. Seeds of-
fers  competitive  salary,
100% paid health insurance
for  employee  and  family,
and  retirement  benefit  with
3% matching. Send resume
to: bill@bluemtseeds.com

 46-1/#6

 AG  MECHANICS/TECHNICIANS

 The Northwest’s largest 
 Ag Dealer is looking to 
 hire several positions! At 
 SS Equipment , we pride 
 ourselves in providing 

 class products backed by the highest level of 
 parts and service support.

 Qualified candidates should possess 
 experience with farm equipment, a keen 
 attention to detail, the ability to prioritize 
 work, and safety-minded work habits.

 Openings include full-time positions with 
 benefits in the following dealerships: WA 
 state (Quincy, Othello, &  Walla Walla); OR 
 state (La Grande, Lakeview, Hermiston, &
 Albany). Paying top wages and benefits, 
 DOE.

 For more information, contact Ron Belt, 
 Director of Service at (509) 851-8752 or by 
 email at ron.belt@sseqinc.com.

 MD  BUILDERS  INC.
 BETTER BUILDINGS, BETTER PRICES.

 971-237-7407
 mike@md-builders.com • CCB 159246
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 CUSTOM POLE BUILDINGS
 Riding Arenas, Straw Sheds, Shops

 Excavation, Concrete

(750) 6-9'  Premium Grand
Fir and (200) 6 -9' Concolor
Fir:  @ $12.50 CBL. Airway
Heights, WA. 509-701-5388

AGRICULTURAL  POSI-
TIONS: ALL FEES PAID BY
OUR  EMPLOYERS.  308-
382-7351.  REVIEW  OUR
WEBSITE.
www.hansenagriplacement.com

FIELD REPRESENTATIVE:
Field  Representative  Bean
&  Pea  Seed  production;
Kimberly,  Idaho.  Kimberly
Seeds  International  LLC  is
looking for a field represen-
tative with experience in the
bean & pea seed production
industry.  Applicants  need
2+ years experience in field
production  of  seeds,  great
people  skills,  computer
skills, and the ability to com-
municate  with  both  the
growers  and  management.
Must  have  a  clean  DMV
record.  We offer a competi-
tive  salary  and  benefits
package including health in-
surance  and  401K  with  a
company  match.  Please
contact Brad or Phil at 208-
423-5529 or Email:
pbelnap@kimberlyseeds.com

(3,000)  Grand  Fir:  5-8',
$5.00 on the stump. Salem,
OR. 503-999-8866

WANTED  (400+)  Premium
& #1 Only: Noble Fir, Nord-
mann  and  Frasier,  4-15'.
Snohomish,  WA.  206-446-
6560

Agricultural  Equipment
Dealership: is seeking com-
petent  parts manager.  Mail
resume to P.O. Box 299, El-
topia, WA. 99330.

 NORDMANN FIR:
Premium quality  4'-15',  full
cultured  or  unsheared.
Nordmann  Fir  Boughs:
$500/  ton.  Rochester,  WA.
360-789-1911

Nordmann  Fir  Christmas
Trees:  1st Harvest.  Salem,
OR. 503-390-0669

 Turf Farm Manager
 JB Instant Lawn is 

 seeking a working 
 manager with experience in turf 

 management to be accountable for the 
 sod (production, maintenance and 

 harvest), wholesale nursery, customer service 
 and trucking divisions of our Redmond, Washington farm. 
 The qualifications are: strong leadership & communication 

 skills, a team player, enjoy outdoors, perform physical 
 activities and have a great understanding of our 

 customers’ needs.  Ability to speak Spanish a benefit.  
 Competitive wages & benefits offered.   Submit resume & 

 salary requirements to  greenteam@jbinstantlawn.net.

 45-4/#T2D

(200) Noble Fir: 6-12', (100)
Utility  Trees:  $9.00/each.
(100)  Natural  Nobles:  10',
$30/each.  (600) Grand Fir:
6-7', $14/each. 7-8', $17.50/
each. (100)  Nordmann: 7-
9'.  Hillsboro,  OR.  503-849-
7322

Farming  Opportunity!:  Re-
cent  experience  with  hay
equipment  and  operation,
pivot  irrigation,  fencing,
some  cattle,  practical  vet.
House, salary,  some bene-
fits.  Fort  Rock,  OR.  541-
576-2236

 Adam Barker
 OWNER/OPERATOR
 ORccb #206866

 971-237-4403
 abarkerbuildings

 @gmail.com
 Lafayette, OR

 BARKER
 BUILDINGS

 SPECIALIZING IN:

 • POLE BUILDINGS
 • STEEL BUILDINGS
 • ARENAS SHOPS
 • GARAGES
 • LEAN TOS & ADD-ONS
 • CONCRETE & 
 • EXCAVATION

 510-45-4-4/#7

 25 YEARS IN THE 
 POLE BUILDING 

 BUSINESS

Looking  For  a  Good  Deal:
on trees and Christmas tree
lot  supplies/  stands.  San
Antonio, TX. 210-337-8032

(200) 6-7' Noble Firs: lightly
tipped,  CBL,  $18  each.
Stayton, OR. 503-851-3851

Farm/  Livestock  Assistant:
Nevada. $50,000.  See our
website  for  position  details
EH-6071  308/382-7399
www.hansenagriplacement.com 

Howey  Elevator:  works
good,  newer  engine,
$1,750.   Molalla,  OR. 503-
829-4150

(2,000)  Beautifully Sheared
Noble Fir:  nice color,  tall  to
12', not too wide, $12/ tree
U-harvest.  Sherwood,  OR.
area. 650-799-9555

MECHANIC:
Full  time mechanic  needed
for farm in Carlton, Oregon.
Requires  valid  driver's  li-
cense.  Employer  paid
health  insurance.   Fax  re-
sume  to  503-852-9512  or
mail to P.O. Box 808, Carl-
ton, OR  97111.

570 Christmas Trees

Howey Christmas Tree El-
evator: Honda  engine,
$2,750. Sublimity, OR. 503-
932-9934, 503-932-9910.

Hawaii  Hydroponic  Green-
house  Tomato/  Cucumber
Grower:  Send  resume and
salary  requirements  to:
kawamatafarms@gmail.com

Agricultural Branch Manager
Helm, CA.:

Do you have a proven track
record  in  sales  manage-
ment  and  financial  goal
achievement? Are you pas-
sionate  about  agriculture
with  a  Bachelor's  degree
and at least 5 years' experi-
ence  in  Ag?  Are  you  a
strong  leader  focused  on
teamwork? If you said “yes”
to all of these questions, we
want  to  hear  from  YOU!
Grow  your  career  with
Wilbur-Ellis,  a  strong  and
profitable industry leader of-
fering  competitive  compen-
sation,  tremendous  growth
and development opportuni-
ties, and a people-first work
environment.  Come  grow
with us! 
Apply  online  at:
http://www.wilburellis.com/
Careers/Jobs/Pages/Agri
cultural-Branch-Manager,-
Helm-CA-.aspx  OR  email
your resume to:
ddefreece@wilburellis.com.

Automotive  Technician/  Farm
Mechanic:  California,  3  years
experience  as  automotive
$50k. 308-382-7399,
www.hansenagriplacement.com

 www.minerpolebuildings.com

 17825 Painter Loop NE
 Hubbard, OR 97032
 Oregon ccb# 133899

 WA License #ronmisc975ja

 •  Custom buildings

 •  Personal riding arenas

 •  Shops and garages

 •  Clearspans up to 100’

 The scope of our service offering 
 ranges from building only the 
 shell to completing a turnkey 
 project. If you don’t already have 
 a design or plan, we’re happy to 
 create a design that fits your 
 needs and specifications.

 •  Boarding facilities

 •  Stall barns

 •  Warehouses

 •  Hay storage

 Post Frame Kits  •  Installation  •  Design
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 888.453.5964

Martin Cisneros Pole Build-
ings  &  Concrete:  Shops,
garages,  arenas,  hay  stor-
age.  Agriculture/  Residen-
tial,  additions  and  repairs.
Serving  Oregon  CCB#
135771.  Licensed,  bonded
and insured. Excellent refer-
ences.  503-375-9273  or
503-507-2847

HAMPTON FARMS 
CHRISTMAS TREES: 

Wholesale or  Retail.  Open
10am daily to dark. NOBLE
FIRS:  5-12',  fresh  cut  and
U-cut  $9.98-$29.98.  11114
James Way, Aumsville, OR.
503-749-2113  or  503-508-
9054

FARM MANAGER: Oregon.
5+ Years Management Ex-
perience With Larger Farm.
$90,000.  308-382-7351
www.hansenagriplacement.com

Farm Hand Needed: perma-
nent position, self motivated
person, needs to know how
to  operate  hay  and  tillage
equipment, maintenance all
types  of  equipment,  some
cattle  experience.  Housing
provided.  Eastern  Oregon
541- 493-1920

ORCHARD MANAGER
NEEDED:

For (40) acre cherry orchard
in  Pasco,  WA.  Duties  in-
clude  supervision  of  crews
(pruning  crews,  harvest
dock crews, picking crews);
pruning  experience  pre-
ferred;  pesticide application
(pesticide license is a plus);
ability to operate all orchard
equipment  and  tools  (me-
chanical  ability  to  repair
equipment is  a plus);  bilin-
gual  required;  Salary
$18.50/  hour  or  more  de-
pending on experience and
qualifications.  Complete job
description available on re-
quest. Contact Alma at 509-
266-4205, or e-mail:
pherr@pocketinet.com
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