
Market Quotations 1,163.16
2,740.00

806.99
310-3-

590.75
36.00

Edwin Knapp
Dies Tuesday
At Enterprise

ENTERPRISE ( Special
Benjamin Knapp, 98, a retired
businessman, died Tuesday, June 9
in Pendleton after several-mont- hs

of failing health.
Funeral service? will be held

Wells Gets Award
o Summer Session
CENTRAL WASHINGTON COt- -'

LEGE OF (EDUCATION, Ellens-bur- g

William ' P. Wells of La
Grande has been awarded a schol-

arship to attend Uie Educational
Television and Radio workshop to

be held July 7 on the Central

Washington College of Education

campus, Robert Slingland, work-

shop director, announced today.
The scholarship, for $100, - was

provided by the Blonder-Tongu- e

foundation.- Mr. Wells is director
of Audio Visual Aids at Eastern

today (Friday) at 2 p.m. from the
Bollman Funeral Chapel, with the
Rev. John Munsey officiating.
Burial wiU be in the Enterprise
cemetery beside the grave of his
wife who died a few months ago.

Survivors include three sons:
Paul of Salem, Morris of Walla
Walla, and Archie of Portland;
and two grandchildren: Bette Jean
Knapp, of. Portland, and Stephen
Knapp, of Walla Walla.

Mr. Knapp was born in New
York February 20, 1961. and had
lived in Wallowa County since
1907 where he farmed, raised live-
stock and operated grain ware-
houses. . .

PORTLAND DAIRY
PORTLAND UPI)Dairy mar-

ket: ...
Eggs To retailers: Grade AA

large, do.; A large,
medium, AA small, 25I

27c; cartons additional.
Butter To retailers: AA and

Grade A prints, 65c lb.; carton,
lc higher; B prints, 63c.

Cheese (medium cured) To re-
tailers: A grade Cheddar single
daisies, processed Ameri-
can cheese, loaf,

Oregon College.
The workshop is for all educators

and others interested in educa-
tional TV and radio. Experts in
the field will be included on the
program.

LEGAL NOTICE LEGAL NOTICE LEGAL NOTICE

. PORTLAND LIVESTOCK
PORTLAND (UPI (USDA)

Livestock:
Cattle for week 2235; steers

steady to 50c lower; load average-choic- e

1062 lb. steers 29.75 Mon-

day, other choice under 1175 lb.

good under 1100 lb. 27.50-2-

standard heifers 24.50 - 26.50;
utility commercial cows

canners - cutters 14 - 16;
Utility bulls 23.50-25.2-

Calves for week 375; vealers
closed l.oo - 2.00 lower, heavy
calves weak to 1.00 lower; e

vealers late utility-standar- d

culls down to 15.

Hogs for week 2435; sows
lower; 1 and 2 butcliers 5

lb. 18.75-1- mixed 1. 2 and 3
lots lb. sows

lb. few early 15.
Sheep for week 3800 spring

slaughter lambs 50c ' 1.00 lower;
choice spring lambs 0 lb.

few lots 22.65 - 22.75; few
good e .lb.
feeders cull - good ewes

PORTLAND GRAIN
White wheat 1.98. -
Soft white hard applicable 1.98.
White club 1.98.
Hard red winter, no bid.
Hard white Baart ordinary no bid.
Oats no bid. - -

Barley no bid.

NOTICE OF 1959-6- 0 BUDGET MEETING
In accordance with the provisions of the "'Local Budget Law" (ORS 294.305 to 294.415), notice is hereby given that the budget com-

mittee of Union County, Oregon, in compliance with said law, prepared and adopted on May 25th, 1959, the budget estimates for Oregon,for the ensuing fiscal year July 1,1959, to June 30, 1960, as set forth in the accompanying schedules I, II, M and IV. All persons are'
hereby notified that on Friday, the 26th day of June, 1959, at 10:00 A.M., in the office of the County Judge in La Grande, Union Coun-
ty, Oregon, said budget estimates may" be discussed with the County Judge and Commissioners, the levying board for Union County,
Oregon, and any person subject to the proposed tax levy or levies will be heard in favor of or against said proposed tax levy or tax levies'
or any part thereof. , ,. - ... ,

The outstanding indebtedness of Union County, Oregon, at or on May 25th, 1959, was NOTHING,
v. Signed: C. K. MeCormick. Rav C. Baum, H. J. Speckhart, Dean Puekett, M. J. Goss, James MeKinnis. Budiiet Committee
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520.00 Sanitarian's' Salary - 2,640.00
- 3,060.00 Stenographer 3,120.00

100.00 Travel Expense for Health Officer 100.00

750.00 Travel Expense for 1st P. H. Nurse 750.00

750.00 Travel Expense for Sanitaria 750.00
1,000.00 Office Supplies, Expense; etc 1,000;00

200.00 - 200.00
immunizations 1,500.00

19,780.00 17,500.00
7,500.00 Circuit Court 8,500.00
3,733.00 Court Reporter Salary , 3,733.00

200.00 Court Reporter Expense ' 200.00
5,640.00 Emergency Expense 5,000.00

48,079.00 Old Age Assistance & Medical Care 34,084.00
492.00 Blind Assistance & Medical Care. 360.00

6,254.00 Dependent Children & Medical Care 4,279.00
1,627.00 Foster Care 3,129.00
8,043.00 General Assistance & Medical Care 7,298.00
5,000.00 Emergency Relief . 15,000.00
9,469.00 Perm. Disabled Persons & Medical Care 7,788.00
1,500.00 Board of Prisoners 2,000.00

100.00 Jail Supplies 100.00
5,500.00 Elections 4,500.00
1,800.00 Advertising, Notices, etc. 2,000.00
1,000.00 Advertising County Resources 1,000.00

400.00 Advertising, Booth at Fair 400.00
13,100.00 Co. Agt. Home Dem. Agt., Club Adviser 13,100.00

200.00 Examination of Mentally 111 Persons '200.00

1,840.00 Auditing Records 1,840.00
400.00 Coroner, Inquests, etc 500.00

400.00 Child Caring Institutions 400.00

350.00 Juvenile Department - 350.00

Indemnity on Diseased Cattle
500.00 Control of Bangs Disease

3,000.00 Destruction of Predatory Animals 3,000.00

1,000.00 Salvation Army for Relief Use 1,000.00
125.00 Public Lands Committee 150.00

225.00 Assn. of Oregon Counties 400.00
250.00 First Aid Car

50.00 Fire'Patrol Tax
' 25 00

s

2,500.00 Circulating Library - 2,500.00
2,400.00 Veterans' Service Officer 2,400.00
3,000.00 Social Security - 3,000.00

100.00 Planning Commission - 100.00

1,500.00 Civilian Defense Expense 1,500.00
4,000.00 La Grande Airport Maintenance '

1,500.00 Fruit Inspector 1,500.00
250.00 Board of Equalization 250.00

15,000.00 Rebate on Taxes 15,000.00

Schedule I SUMMARY OF ESTIMATED EXPENDITURES, RECEIPTS AND TAX LEVIES FISCAL YEAR 1959-4-

12,817.26
7,036.03
3,199.92

125.82
3,449.01

53,732 25
363-7-

12,184.00
3,079.25

10,742.75

10,588.00"
780.90
. 15.30

4,574.19
1,338.82

600.00
400.00

iff,4u0.00
.242.50

1,990.00
k 15.00
213.30
629.13

1,179.55
3,68930
3,000.00

700.00
125.00
215.78
189.41'
r

1,625.00
1,800.00
2,171.42

21.00

1,334 24

18,408.38
25.00

6,778.77
3,688.62

70.40
4,905.96

49,885.00
332.25

5,824.50
2,590.75
9,264.00

8,643.25
1,369.50

13.48
4,128.31
1.137.05
1,000.00

.400.0
11,450.00

120.00
1,599.00

- 151.63
316.34
129.67

' .48.00
81.50

3,000.00
700.00
125.00
457.78
250.00

- 10.08
2,000.00
2,400.00

. 2,316.99

15.06

1,500.00

17,469.86
25.00

' v ; : f. 'Genenl Market Weed Indigent Reap.
Total of General Road Road Control School Soldier praiul

all Fund Fund Fund Fund Fund Fund Fund Fund
Total estimated expenditures $1,185,373.00 $276,513.00 $295,700.00 $435,000.00 $29,900.00 $55,260.00 $3,000.00 $70,000.00
Receipts other than 1959-6- taxes 715,072.00 131,872.00 273,200.00 236,000.00 8,100.u0 4,500.00 2.300.00 59.100.00
Amount necessary to balance budget .... 450,301.00 144,641.00 22,500.00 199,000.00 21,800.00 50,760.00 . 700.00 10,900.00
estimated amount ot 1959-6- taxes that

will not be received 46,700.00 22,000.00 2,500.00 15,000.00 2,000.00 5,000.00 100.00 100.00
Total levy needed for 1959-6- 497.001.00 166,641.00 25,000.00 214,000.00 23,800.00 55,760.00 800.00 11,000.00
Tox levies inside 6 limitation 473,201.00 166,641.00 25,000.00 214,000.00 55,760.00 800.00 11,000.00
Tax levies outside 6 limitation Z3,8uu.uu ... 23.8UU.U0

(Amount for Weed Control Fund authorized by voters at election on Nov. 5, 1946)
SUMMARY OF ESTIMATED EXPENDITURES, RECEIPTS AND TAX LEVIES FISCAL YEAR 1958-5- 9Schedule II

BYRNE Reap- -

praltal
Fund

$60,000.00
60,000.00

General Market Fund .Indigent
Total of-- Fund Road Road Weed School Soldier

all Funds General Fund Fund Control Fund Fund
Total estimated expenditures $1,099,601.00 $304,901.00 $278,800.00 $372,500.00 $27,900.00 $53,000.00 $2,500.00
Receipts other than 1958 59 taxes 662,790.00 113,990.00 257,300.00 216,000.00 10,000.00 3,000.00 2,500.00
Amount necessary to balance budget .. 436,811.00 190,911.00 21,500.00 156,500.00 17,900.00 50,000.00 .. ,
Estimated amount of 1958-5- taxes that - ,

will not be received i 48,400.00 24,000.00 2,500.00 15,000.00 1,900.00 5,000.00
Total levy needed for 1958-5- 485,211.00 214,911.00-

-
24,000.00 171,500.00 19,800.00 55,000.00

Tax levies inside 6 limitation 465,411.00 214,911.00 24,000.00 171,500.00 55,000.00
Tax levies outside 6 limitation 19,800.00 19,800.00

(Amount for Weed Control Fund authorised by, voters at election on Nov. 5, 1940)

Schedule III EXPENDITURES (General Fund)
Actual for

50,280.00
jC- --

4,200.00
7,851.84

249.69
9,673.50

fiscal year
Actual for
fiscal year

July 1, 1957
Estimated for

4,200.00
7,794.00

272.56
8,685.94
1,845.00

July 1, 1956 Fiscal Year
Budget for Year

July 1, 1958
to

June 30, 1959

Continued from front page.

est total value of gifts ever re-

ceived. A total of some $21,000
has been given by various organ-
izations, including some $19,000
in fellowships, scholarships, and
grants-in-ai-

The audience warmly applaud-
ed' Miss Eva .Ware, professor who
i? retiring this spring after 28
years on' the- EOg faculty. She
was granted the rank of Profes-
sor Emeritus of - Education by
President Bennett.

Six of the graduates includ-
ing three from La Grande were
awarded degrees with honors.
Susan Peterson, La Grande, was
graduated Summa Cum Laudc,
and Dorothy Kncchtel and Rich-
ard Arends, both of La Grande,
were awarded degrees Cum
Laude.

Others graduating with honors
were Josephine Ward, Forest
Grove, Magna Cum Laude; Wil-

liam -- Hawks, Pendleton, Cum
I nude, and Normal Nelson, Boody,
III.,, Cum Laude. , .' : ,. ,,

Bachelor of Science degrees in;

1959-4- 0C testification
SHERIFFS OFFICE 19,797.50

$ Sheriff's Salary $ 4,800.00
22,074.47

333.08 i

Deputy's Salary 4,200.00

to June
30, 1957

4,200.00
3,580.00

376.82
100.00

188.91
210.74
250.04

to
June 30, 1958

$ 4,200.00
3,600.00

711.93
100.00

48.16
221.00
249.90

Travel Expense 1,400.00 613.50100.00

First Major Forest
Fire Of Year Reported

MEDFORD (UPI) The State
Department of Forestry Thursday
reported the first major forest
fire in this; area for the year.

The blaze started in the early
afternoon and covered about 50

acres by evening, a spokesman
said.

The Forestry Department dis-

patched 20 men and a bulldozer
tractor to fight the flames. A

plane loaded with borate flurry
solution was sent out by the For-
est Service.' v

The fire. was reported in a dry,
steep area covered with brush
and scattered timber. '

100.00

4,800.00
4,200.00
1,400.00

100.00
100.00
200.00
250.00
300.00

2,500.00

200.00

Bond Premium
Criminal Service outside county
Office Supplies
Telephone & Telegraph
State Ind. Accident Insurance
Automobile

390.00
390.00

11,900.008,906.51

3,980.00
- 3,180.00

2,223.00
1,187.90

9,130.59
'

3,600.00
3,400.00
1,674.00
1,730.13

3,900.00
3,720.00

13,850.00

3,900.00
3,720.00
2,150.00
1,800.00

TAX COLLECTING DEPARTMENT
Tax Department Deputy
Regular Assistant
Extra Help
Supplies, bond, etc

education were awarded to 81?
2,150.00
2,000.00

persons. Two received Master of
Science degrees in education, GIFT EXCHANGE

GENEVA (UPI) - Mrs. Marythree were awarded Bachelor oft J0.170.90- - 10,04.13 .11,570.00 - . 11,770,00
rx v'A.. ...- -. , COUNTY CLERK'S OFFICESiiencfe .djaacw..iu,.giineral-.tudnH,e:te1r- ' i(e of Sccaelw of .State

iesJana:threii .were awarded Cer-- Christian Herter, and Mrs. Lydla

25.00 County Surveyor's Bond

Total $275,513.00
Estimated Dei. Taxes on 1959-6- Roll

'

22,000.00
EXPENDITURES Schools

53,000.00 Total 5,526 children at $10.00 each 55,260.00
EXPENDITURE Weed Control Fund .

4,500.00 Inspector's Salary 4,500.00
12,000.00 Labor 13,000.00

400.00 Social Security 400.00
8,500.00 Materials & Other Expense 8,500.00
2,500.00 Equipment - 3,500.00

27,900.00 29,900.00
Estimated Del. Taxes on 1939 60 Roll 2,000.00

EXPENDITURES Indigent Soldier Fund
2,500.00 Relief for Veterans 3,000.00

Estimated Del. Taxes 1959-6- Roll 100.00
EXPENDITURES Property Reappreiial Fund

60,000.00 Partial cost of reappraisal of property 70,000.00
Estimated Del. Taxes 1959-6- Roll 100.00

EXPENDITURES General Road Fund -
ROADS AND BRIDGES . '

I. Maintenance and Operation
31,000.00 Personal Services ' 31,900.00
40,000.00 Materials and Supplies 44,000.00

3,500.00 Apportionment to Cities 3,500.00
1,600.00 Social Security 1,600.00
1,000.00 Other Expense ! ' 1,000.00

' II. Construction and Improvements .

63,000.00 Personal Service , 67,000.00
73,000.00 Materials and Supplies 77,000.00
60,000.00 Equipment : .' 64,000.00

2,700.00 Social Security 2,700.00
3,000.00 Other Expense : ' 3,000.00

278,800.00 295,700.00
Estimated Del. Taxes on 1959-6- Roll - 2,500.00

EXPENDITURES Market Road Fund

!... MARKET ROADS . '

I. Maintenance and Operation
35,000.00 Personal Services - 35,000.00
80,000.00 ' Materials and Supplies , 90,000.00

2,500.00 Rent of Equipment 2,500.00
II. Construction & Improvements:

90,500.00 Personal Services 90,500.00
122,000.00 Material and Supplies 174,500.00
42,500.00 Rent of Equipment 42,500.00

372,500.00 435,000.00
Estimated Del. Taxes on 1959 00 Roll 15,000.00

RECEIPTS
Budget far Estimated far

Year ' Fiscal Year
July 1, 1958 July '

to Classification to "

June 30, 1959 J" 30, 1960
J 1 !

General Fund
10,500.00 Fines 9,500.00

1,300.00 Sheriff's Fees .V........ 1,200.00
12,000.00 Clerk's Fees 12,300.00

1,050,00 Motel & Restaurant Licenses 1,000.00
IniUWlAA A1m.linlin Dn.iavnMn TnV Q Mfl.Dfl

4,750.00 4,800.00 5,400.00 Clerk's Salary 5,400.00
Gromyko, wife of Soviet ForeignlilicatesVot-Associat- e in science
Minister Andrei Gromyko, have 3,580.00 3.600.00 3,900.00 Gonl. & Receiving Deputy 3,900.00

3,400.00 3,420.00 3,720.00 Recording Deputy 3,720.00
2,468.52 2,950.00 3,300.00 Recording Assistant 3,300.00

50.00 50.00 50.00 Bond Premium 80.00
2,496.83 2,677.61 2,200.00 Office supplies 2,400.00

172.25 171.50 165.00" Telephone & Telegraph 180.00

234,646.39 182,827.75

exchanged gifts it was disclosed
today. Mrs. Herter started it off
with an unidentified gift, informed
sources said. Mrs. Gromyko re-
turned the gesture with a bottle
of vodka, a wooden box full of

APPOINTMENTS EXPECTED
TEHRAN, Iran UPI) Gov-

ernment sources said today that
three new ministers will be
named next week to replace the
cabinet members who resigned
Thursday in an "internal" Russian candy, and a book about

the Soviet Union.

18,735.00

5,000.00
3,900.00
3,420.00

ASSESSOR'S OFFICE
Assessor's Salary
1st Office Deputy
2nd Office Deputy

17,669.11

4,200.00
3,600.00
3,120.00
4.192.0O

526.50
360.44

1,303.31
156.05
253.71

16,917.60

4,200.00
3,580.00
3,110.00
4,078.66

748.25
190.23

1,346.41
161.05
803.75

8,400.00(2) Field Deputy (1)Why

18,950.00

5,000.00
3,900.00
3,420.00
4,200.00
1,200.00

800.00
1,800.00

160.00
200.00

S

25.00

Extra helpvou i.' I'
1,000.00

600.00
1,800.00

160.00
1,000.00
2,500.00

25.00

235,371.98 150,981.19

Auto expense rr--

Office supplies
Telephone
Spl. appraisals & inventory check
Automobile
Assessor's Assn. Dues

SCHEDULE IV

Actual Actual

Receipts Receipts
Julyl,195 July 1,1957

fd to'

need Allstate
collision

insurance:
June 30, 1957 June 30, 1958

20,505.00

' 4,200.00
V 250.00

250.00
350.00

. 120.00

17,712.01

'

3,000.00
250.00
21t.ll
218.00

- 115.20

18,218.35

3,600.00
105.38
295.70
272.50
106.75

27,805.00

. 4,200.00
250.00
250.00
350.00
120.00

TREASURER'S OFFICE
Treasurer's Salary
Bond Premium
Office Supplies
Extra Help
Telephone tc Telegraph

5,170.00

1,150.00
125.00

'765.00

4,380.33 4,394.31 5,170.00
-

. SCHOOL SUPERINTENDENTS OFFICE
3,983.29 8,999.90 " 4,600.00 Superintendent's Salary ;

338.31 . ,,324.00 500.00 Travel Exense '. ...r...!.....:..:....
2,753.90 2,718.50 . 3,060.00 Stenographer i ..:

314.41 352.00 , 500.00 Office Supplies ,-'.

200.00 205.00 400.00 Institute & Workshops v......
5.00 ' 5.00 . Bond Premium

50.00 Attendance Officer
136.60 174.05 150.00 Telephone

9,883.25 10,178.35
"1.069.38 . 1.122.36
10,520.58 12,240.79

918.50 590.00
--10,079.75 8,705.10

942.32
'l,487!47 1,338.00

682.50 595.00
402,00

17,970.39 27,104.28
I - 3,274.48
3,528.99 15,397.05
1,629.49 . 835.14

670.06

58,730.58 82,452.61

iu,iWiUU niLuiiuui. ucicaaG - ,

300.00 Tax Property Sales 200.00

1,400.00 . Amusement Device Tax . 1,200.00
, 840.00 State of Oregon (Service Officer) 672.00

County Health Dept. (copies of records) 300.00

15,000.00 Delinquent Taxes (prior years) 22,000.00
. Interest Deposits 4,000.003,000.00. . .

on
. . ... ,. . : ! A nir

125.00
400.00

25.00
50.00

1.' Your modern car costs
more to repair

Fancy fins and grillwork can
turn even a small accident into
an expensive repair job. Sim-

ply repairing a smashed rear
end could easily cost you $150
. . . more than three yearly
average premiums for Allstate
collision insurance.

2,640.00

6.000.00

7,778.51

4,800.00
35.35

3,463.54
148.80

9,260.00

6,000.00
60.00

4,800.00
160.00

7,731.51

4,800.00
,3.20

3,851.39
166.65

v
COUNTY COURT & COMMISSIONERS

County Judge's Salary
Office Supplies
Commissioners' Fees ..!

Telephone i Telegraph

60.00
4,800.00
. 160.00

2. .There may be no "other guy" to foot the bill

Your parked car may be damaged by a
driver . r. and you'd be stuck with the repair bill. Or

perhaps a blowout or a skid ebuld wreck your car, no
matter how carefully you drive.

5,564.23
77,043.91

129,160.59
6,550.08
1,644.39
2,506.33

35,000.00

8,004.75
30,0O0.00

128,820.80
C123.94
2,141.80'
2,098.18

25,000.00

8,447.69

84.40
110.72
300.00
932.71
107.64
.40.00

8,821.24

91.75.
92.27

300.00
1,015.00

55.20
33.00

11,020.00

120.00
147.00
300.00

1,020.00
150.00
100.00
23.00

11,020.00

120.00
129.00
300.00

1,020.00
150.00
100.00
25.00

DISTRICT ATTORNEY'S OFFICE
Postage, Printing & Supplies
Telephone $ Telegraph; i

Office Rent
Stenographer
Travel Expense .'. ,

Labratory Tests
Association Dues 201,189.47 256,469.89

4,000.00 Ketund Dy state weuare ; i,uuu.
1,500.00 Advalorem Tax (Car Companies) 1,000.00

600.00 Public Land Sales - '
6M9obo

'

es.872.6o

52,500.00 Available Cash Balance 65000.00.
"

113,990.00 131,872.00
Road Fund '". ' !

6,000.00 Fines 6,200.00
40,000.00 Seventy-fiv- e percent Forest Rental
80,000.00 State Highway Fund - 80,000.00

8,000.00 Gasoline Refunds 3,000.00
1,000.00 Rentals & Sale of Materials 1,000.00 -

1,700.00 Delinquent Taxes (prior years) 2,000.00
45,000.00 Market Road Fund, Rent of Equipment 43,000.00

' '
178,700.00 . 139,200.00
78,600.00 Availablel Cash Balance 134,000.00

257,300.00 . . , 273,200.60
. Market Road'Fund

45,000.00 State Highway Fund v 43,000.00
30,000.00 Forest Rentals 58,008.00
15,000.00 Delinquent Taxes (prior years) 10,000.00

I Sale of Matorlals - 2,000.00

90,000.00 , 111,000.00

126,000.00 Available Cash Balance 125,000.00

216,000.00 ' 236,000.00
Weed Control Fund

2,000.00 Materials and Labor '-'-' 1,600.00
1,000.00 Delinquent Taxes, prior years : 1.600,08
7,000.00 Available Cash Balance - - 5,000.00

'"
10,000.00 .. - . 8.100,00

School Fund '

' ' Available Cash Balance ..: ' : 4,300.00
otnnnnn iv....h,.riuo nnrt,t kWocf Rentals 18.600.00

1,862.00

7,165.00
600.00

1,575.47

6,865.00
600.00

8,045.00

1,844.00

7,165.00
600.00

2,350.00

1,587.22

8,815.20
600.00

1,849.31

JUSTICE OF THE PEACE COURTS'
Justice of the Peace Salaries .....i..
Constable Salaries -- .....
Jurors, Witnesses and Supplies ... - 2,350.00

40.901.37" .
--

18,582.30 17.4l2.4T
, ,- '- ,.; 3,279.79

Find out how Allstate can help yoa
protect your investment in your car

Talk to an Allstate Agent."Ask him to show you how
Allstate Collision insurance helps you pay for damage
to your car caused by collision or upset . . . and how
Allstate's Comprehensive insurance covers practically
any other hazard that could damage your car.

Be sure to ask about Allstate's low rates too. Allstate
protection, low rates, and fast claim service

have convinced nearly 4,000,000 car owners that Allstate
is their best buy in auto insurance, , '- - i

Why not stop in or call today?

10,115.009,510.00

20,692.23

10,11500

4,820.00
1,490.00

57,453.87

9,264.51
: .

4,334.25
1,410.01

WATERMASTER DEPARTMENT
La Grande & Vicinity, Salary, Ini t Expense .

North Powder area: Salary, Ins. & Expense .,1..

4,860.00
1,670,00

8,530.00

3,051.98
1,401.47

1,360.18
1,164.48

6,310.00
.

3,540.00
200.00

1,200.00
1,400.00
2,200.00
3,000.00

5,744.26

3,240.00
192.27
880.56

1,012.33
. 2,054.60

1,104.61

3,240.00
115.00
928 08
874.41

1,941.82
983.22

COURTHOUSE . .

Janitor
Extra Janitor Help
Furniture 4 Fixtures
Fuel ..: :

Water, Lights, Insurance & Supplies .

Building Repairs - -
Appraisal Court House for Insurance .

3,540.00
200.00

1,200.00
1,40000
2,400.00
3,000.00. 600.00

ALL STATE INSURANCE COMPANIES
P.O. Box 677

Observer Building
La Grande, Oregon

. Phoney VVO 3.2205

You're' In good hands wilh

4,453.4a

17,412.47

2,524.68

'
23,633.79

11,540.00 12,340.008,082.538,484.37
877.87

m Juvenile Counselor's Salary It Expense .

. (not deductible from budget expense) .
, ...

,. , , . Indigent Soldier Fund ,
: , ; ., , , ,,.

2,500.00 Available Cash Balance .'. - 200.00

Property Reappraisal Fund .

60,000.00 Available Cash Balance .... '59,100.00
M . 2,400.00

COUNTY HEALTH UNIT
2,400.00 County Health Officer's Salary .'.

4,800.00 1st Public Health Nurse's Salary
4,200.00 2nd Public Health Nurse's Salary

2,400.00
4,770.00Foundaa by Scars. Ro.DueR and Co. with IntXp.nel.Bt 5,040.00
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