

Market Quotations

PORTLAND DAIRY

PORTLAND (UPI)—Dairy market:
Eggs—To retailers: Grade AA large, 37-38c doz.; A large, 36-38c; AA medium, 32-34c; AA small 27-28c; cartons, 1-3c additional.
Butter—To retailers: AA and Grade A prints, 65c lb.; carton, 1c higher; B prints, 62c.
Cheese (medium cured)—To retailers: A grade cheddar single daisies, 41-51c; processed American cheese, 5-lb. loaf, 40-43c.

PORTLAND GRAIN

White wheat 2.02.
Soft white hard applicable 2.02.
White Club 2.02.
Hard red winter, ordinary, no bid.
Hard white hard, ordinary, no bid.
Cats no bid.
Barley no bid.

PORTLAND LIVESTOCK

PORTLAND (UPI)—(USDA)—Livestock:
Cattle for week 1650; fed steers 25-50c higher; four lots choice steers 978-1134 lb. 30.25; other choice 29.50-30; good 28.25; good heifers 27-28; few standard cows 23-24; canners-cutters 14.50-16.50; utility bulls 23-24; light cutters 20-22.50.
Calves for week 410; vealers 1-2 lower; good-choice 29-34.50 late; utility-standard calves 19-28.
Hogs for week 2275; butchers steady to 25c lower; 1 and 2 butchers 180-220 lb. mostly 19; mixed 1, 2 and 3 butchers 17.50-18.50; mixed sows 300-500 lb. 12.50-15; small lots good-choice feeder pigs 17-18.
Sheep for week 2400; spring lambs 25-50c higher; ewes weak to 50c lower; mostly choice spring lambs 85-100 lb. 23.25-23.75; mostly good old crop shorn lambs with 1 and 2 pelt 17-18.25; ewes 3-6

N. Y. STOCKS

NEW YORK (UPI)—Strength in a half dozen blue chips lifted the Dow-Jones industrial average to a record high in a quiet stock market session today.

These issues—American Telephone up 5 1/2 at its high; General Foods up 3/4; Westinghouse Electric up 3/4; DuPont up 2 1/4; Eastman Kodak up 1 1/2; and General Electric up 1 1/2—far more than offset small losses in leading steels and irregularity in oils and motors.

Traders sought out many special issues. They gave International Business Machines another whirl which carried that stock up 38 points to a new top at 488 at its best.

The electronics met further demand that sent them up 1 to more than 3 points in Hoffman, Zenith at its high was up 6 1/4 points. Goodrich ran up 4 at its high in the tires.

Chuckles In The News

United Press International ORLANDO, Fla. (UPI)—Margaret Carr paid a 50-cent fine for a parking violation, and then went to work with a red face.
Miss Carr checks parking meters, and writes parking tickets.

LOS ANGELES (UPI)—FBI agents had no trouble identifying William Donald McKeown, 41, when they arrested him Wednesday.
He had a "wanted" circular for himself—in his pocket.

Albert Paddock Dies Thursday

Dr. Albert George Paddock, 75, a retired Union veterinarian living in Brawley, Calif., died Thursday in Enterprise where he was visiting.

Funeral services will be held at 1 p.m. Monday at Daniels Funeral Home with Bishop Arnold Kohler officiating. Burial will be in Union cemetery.

Mr. Paddock was born in South Dakota, Oct. 2, 1883 and lived in Union a number of years before his retirement and moving to Brawley.

He is survived by his widow, Mrs. Ida Paddock; two daughters, Mrs. Frank Orton and Mrs. Elmer Edvalson, both of Union, and 11 grandchildren.

Jess Coppers Funeral Set

Jess John Coppers, 49, of Hilgard, died in a local hospital yesterday. Funeral services will be held at 2 p.m. Saturday at the Dempsey-Snodgrass Chapel. Father Wecherle will officiate, and burial will be in the Hilgard cemetery.

He was born Jan. 21, 1910 in Denver, Colorado and lived in Hilgard the past six years. He was a member of the Elks lodge. Survivors include his widow Mrs. Margrita Coppers, daughter Patricia Susan Willis of La Grande and three grandchildren.

WINDOWS
Complete Units To Your Order

Miller's Cabinet

ANN LANDERS

Answers Your Problems



Dear Ann: My husband was a liar and a cheat. When I couldn't stand it any longer I divorced him.

He comes over once in a blue moon, takes the children to the amusement parks, stuffs them full of hot-dogs and caramel-corn and buys them a lot of junk. Then he dumps them on the porch and forgets about them for another five months.

Funeral Monday For Maude Baker

Mrs. Maude Rayburn Baker, 76, La Grande, died yesterday in a local hospital and funeral services will be held at 3 p.m. Monday at Daniels Funeral Home.

The Rev. Victor Zacharias will officiate and burial will be in the city cemetery.

She was born March 23, 1883 in Stockton, Mo., and lived in La Grande the past 12 years. She was a member of the First Baptist church.

Boss Doing Fine

PARKER
Sheet Metal Works
2705 No. 1st. Ph. WO 3-4824

I'm the one who must administer the discipline, take care of them when they're sick, and worry about them when they aren't home on time. I can't afford gifts and treats. It's a struggle to keep them properly clothed and fed.

When I come home from work dead-tired, and they rave about how wonderful their daddy is, I could scream. I can't tell them he's a rat—that he broke my heart and wrecked my life. I don't know how much longer I'll be able to keep the real story to myself. Tell me, Ann, is it

worth the struggle? Sometimes I think I'm cracking up. Help me.—R.T.F.

Dear R.T.F.: Of course it's worth the struggle. And don't tell the children the score—even though at times you may be sorely tempted.

Don't you know that love can't be bought with a few roller coaster rides and a sack of candy? It's the day-in, day-out attention that counts. As your children grow older, they'll be less bedazzled by their father's superficial attempts to curry their favor.

Don't downgrade your ex-husband or try to compete with him. When the kids are old enough to understand, they will and they'll admire you the more for your silence.

Dear Ann: We bridge players

of America are distressed, disturbed, disheartened and dismayed to find that you lump bridge with "boyfriends, bottles, barbiturates and back-fence gossip."

Do you REALLY feel that bridge is as unrewarding as the other four "vices" mentioned, or was it just for the sake of alliteration? Bridge is a game that requires brains and skill. We feel you've done us bridge players an injustice.—Auntie APP.

Dear Auntie: Anything in excess is bad, and THIS is the point I tried to make. Bridge certainly is not in a class with "boyfriends, bottles, barbiturates and

back-fence gossip." I apologize for the grand slam against this grand game. (Fifty-two lashes with a wet noodle for me)

Are your parents too strict? You can benefit from the experiences of thousands of teen-agers if you read ANN LANDERS' new booklet, "How To Live With Your Parents," enclosing with your request 20 cents in coin and a large, self-addressed, stamped envelope.

(Ann Landers will be glad to help you with your problems. Send them to her in care of this newspaper enclosing a stamped, self-addressed envelope.)

YOUR FRIENDLY LOAN MANAGER

is a clock watcher to make sure you get

Cash
IN A HURRY
\$25 TO \$1500

City
FINANCIAL COMPANY
OREGON

Fast service is the law with your friendly loan manager. Prompt, private loans are made on Signature only, car or furniture.

Life insurance available on all loans at low group rates

Robert L. Barnes, Manager
111 Elm St. — WO. 3-2144, LaGrande

Barium
INSURANCE

HOSPITAL
BONDS
AUTO
FIRE
LIFE

Advice about insurance needs will be thoroughly sound — when you are served LOCALLY by your Independent Insurance Agent.

Let us handle your Insurance Problems. Your BEST INTERESTS WILL BE SERVED FIRST.

WO 3-2125
105 DEPOT

YOUR INDEPENDENT INSURANCE AGENT

at **GLOBE**... better carpet for the homes of the Grande Ronde!



GULISTAN CARPET

Staunton ... that hand-crafted, elegant look at a low, low price!

GULISTAN STAUNTON Carpet means you can afford that sculptured custom-sheared look you've always wanted! Thanks to new tufting machines, Staunton achieves a rich three-dimensional look at a price you can pay! And what you pay for is unquestioned quality—an all-wool looped pile with incredible long-life. See and select STAUNTON in today's most wanted colors: mellow gold, cocoa, natural, foam beige, green, beige or venetian blue.

11⁹⁵ Square Yard
Pay as little as \$00. per week to carpet an 11x14 room. Available also in room-size rugs. Call us today for a free estimate.



Your Home Can Look Like This

NOW! OWN Seascope GULISTAN CARPET ON OUR EASY BUDGET PLAN

Seascope Gulistan Carpet will give your home the comfort, quiet and beauty you've been seeking. A beautiful swirling pattern in thick all-wool pile accented by several shades of color gives this carpet a really striking look. In addition, Seascope

has a latex back that grips the floor and helps prevent dangerous skids. Loomed of thick, virgin wool, this carpet is as durable as it is beautiful. And now, you can own it so easily. Just a few dollars down will do. Come in and see us today.

- Seascope gives you the things you want most in carpet
1. DURABILITY
 2. LOVELY COLOR
 3. SMART DESIGN
 4. NON-SKID BACK
 5. RIGHT PRICE

... Convenient Credit Terms ...

GLOBE



FURNITURE and APPLIANCES

Adams and Hemlock

FREE ESTIMATES... EXPERT INSTALLATION

WO 3-4144