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Long, long before the continent we call America was
discovered a mighty river was pouring its waters through
our western country. Aboriginal man gazed upon it in
awe, and wild animals crept to its banks to quench their
thirst. The same river is sweeping through those regions

.sun.Hliine mis week. I.'armern ,o ut
Tlie four Hindi-li- who nro
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tilings uselul and necessary to the existence ot man and
. beast. Its waters irrigate vast regions devoted to the pro-
duction of foodstuffs, of fabrics, for clothing, and of ma-

terials needed in the construction of homes, and churches,
and schools, and mills, and all other structures essential to
the welfare of mankind. For the water course along which
this river flows is about' 2,550 miles in length.
.

VTo trace this mighty river to its source one must begin

I.. .1. I'hndwlek and fainllv. whohave all been slek with the finthat have heen turned in, proinlHe
best Mlinirs ever pun- - Improving slowly.one or In,
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of the win-i- weather, when

T. It. Johnson wan over from
(irande on Frldny. Are You Prepared for the;tered, there being about 100,000 such streams, large 'and

small. Northward, ever northward, the source seeker
travels, until at last, he finds it in Itasca Lake, a small body

.'of water in northern Minnesota the beginning' place of
BIDS ARE OPENED ON THREE COUNTY ROADSi

(Continued from pngo 1) Easter DayImbler to Humor
Sumniervi He I.ane

Mucailani Mnoailam
'A pile 11.75 milps

Columbia Construction

Island City Island
to Cove City-Cov- e

Macadam i miles
lit.:! miles Puvem't

0 ft. wi. &
7 ft. ma.

$ni,417.SO
.t!l.'l,7l!i;.()0

!Mi,470.uo ir.7,rir,8.oo
no bid

117,47.G0 iri2,O('.R.O0
no bid

J75.070.OO xKrR,8'J2.00

1'oiier & Conley ....
r;. i;. Kihiic

Co.. . no hii
$2i;,o'jl). 00

.......$24,fiiK). 00
.f.'i.MO.

nu hid

the tremendous Mississippi, the rather of Waters.
;Since long before the discovery of our continent there

.Has been another and mightier river a river of lore, car--'
frying spiritual healing to the nations' of the world. It
Stops not at oceans, but crosses them. It sweeps over
mountains and down into valleys, through cities and com-

munities of all lands, and even penetrates tho jungles of.
darkest Africa, carrying to barbarians and savages the
message of love, and hope and faith. Its tributaries must
lie reckoned by millions, for they flow from every hamlet
and village and city in the world.

- To trace this mighty river of love to its source one must
.goback, through the history of the human race. Back
through modern eras, back through ancient times, back

$.10,071.00
?;!;i(ifi.0

17.284.00
no liiil
no bid

S41,2-.'5.0-

535,920.00

There's Your Dress Or Your Suit, or Your Coat !

This is your reminder not to forget to start your Spring
attire tomorrow, and if you have not already selected
yours, the very best style, color and cloth you like best
can lie found in our department at a moderate price.

20 to 5500

Hioan Construction to. .

United ('ontrurt Co
.1. I'resft hSisikitne Wash.
Security Construction Co,

no bid
$17,070. 00

Concrete pavement.
x llituminou.s pavement.
Average cost per mile; macadam, $5,441.08;

$24,72(i.5U; Uituininous pavement, 22,j84.07.
Concrete pavement,

0 CI COlif COURTthrough the ruins of forgotten civilizations; back, and on
back nearly 2,000 years, and then the seeker of the source
of this wonderful river finds it in an empty tomb in the
land of Palestine. For there, and not in the manger, at MAKES RECORD PROCEEDINGS
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Me-n-
Are You Prepared
for the Easter
Day

In r ullownnrn of nlUa
UKNKUAJ, KL'NIX

Bethlehem, the mighty stream of Christianity had its be-

ginning in the Resurrection.
And thus it comes about that at Eastertide the thought

of the world turns to that empty tomb and its meaning:
"Death is swallowed up on victory. O death, where is thy
sting? O death, where is thy victory?"

Gall to Prayer .

A very creditable record of milk
and butter production of a purebred
llolstein cow of tbis community is
announced by the Advanced Registry
office of The Holstein-l'riesia- n Asso-

ciation of America.
At the rkc of four years and five

months, Huzclwood Josephine Korn-dyk-

owned by W. T. I'hv, Hot
I, on r.Trir. ii,u

La (Jrurnle IMj?. Co., supHeH....$ 13.50
Westi i n l.nion Tel. Co., Borvtro 7.17
Hed ri'QHfT Druff Store, mipjilleH l.llit
Hush on and Co.,, do. ...i s.o't
Kilhum Ktiitlonory Co., do :u. 44
(llfiKs and l'rudhommc Co., do 14!t.0f

,,f mill, ,.7,.l II, ..f l,iio,fnf Ul. Ii- - Huron, P. .M., do. 27.40
1.05
S.7S

in three hundred and sixty-fiv- e duvs. !w, !," r" ' "lo11 ,,l- - " """ lee

This butterfat production is cquivu- - ln-ll- Wore, supplies
lent to !):I8.7 lbs, of butter. Is"1'- - Awni-y- , insnrunee

The Advanced Registry office su- - premium, etc
pervises official und i,,u" AIlriiiU. wood
milk und butter tests made of pure-,r""- k neavlngeivdrnynKe and
bred llolstein cows. A certain stun-- freight

Our departments are fully
supplied with new Spring
items to' meet your require-
ments,

Shirts Ties Shoes

Sox Suits Hats

73.00
40.0.)

7.77
4.IJ5
1.40
6.64
2.40
R V"

third or production is required, nc- - '" "" ''ilior and supplies
cording to age and length of test, Hooverl.ed (iroe., supplies
helore the cow is admitted to the' . ' no
Advanced Regi.-'tr- A lotul of 115 K- J- - I'onohue. do
000 llolsteins have produced the re- - fhnw und Horden Co.. do.

quired standard and are listed in the ' O. I., and P. Co.. lights 112.45!

nt..Advanced Registry year books. These '"' of li (irande, water .16.57
36.411l''re,l Spaeth, iilumblng ..

rlrecords ot production are a good
guide ns to the worth of an animal. II. It. llanna, trunserlpt of tes-- ,

tlinony ';.... m I II 8
.a)'iil,l;Tin a. vi. - mi fi n

Hulls are admitted to the Advanced
Registry by having four Advanced

' .:Registry' daughters.
..ii j I'i,

A l'las.ll'1,-,- Ad Will llo It.

Anthony's Itest., ,misils-- 'for , ,V'
.iiiror ..oli.. ''.,:,...:v.;,.., ; .i:i.'1

iid..'l'i-l- ,hfl. Inv. :prenilurt K, lSl?M'if

The Easter season is one of more than usual sacred-nes- s

to the adherents of the Christian .religion. Easter
marks the close of the Lenten season, the period of self-deni- al

practiced generally by the Catholic bodies and part- -

ly by some Protestant denominations. It recalls the re-

corded events accompanying the resurrection of Jesus
Christ.

It is in keeping with the spiritual needs and demands
of the Easter season that a call to prayer has been issued
by the association of Protestant churches known as the
Federal Council of the Churches of Christ in America, in
order to aid in overcoming the national hatreds and bring

1

greater security and peace to the world.
The time has passed when men may scoff at the effec-

tiveness of prayer in the national and individual life and
' at the same time maintain a reputation for sound judg-

ment. Whatever may be the explanation for prayer,
, whether it be the response of a supreme being to the re-

quests of men or whether the effect is purely psycholo-
gical, results of unequivocal character are seen in the lives
of men.

- All the sin and injustice in the world is the result of
' selfishness in the hearts of men. No individual can cntei-sincerel-

into the practice of prayer without the surrender
of the mind and disposition that would prompt the doing
of things that would work harm in tho lives of others.

Prayer as it is revealed in the Holy Scriptures, makes

The foundation of your fin

boancial structure

liaTk4JtW .MyU,..
Ore. State Highway Coin., ffis
C O. Coueh. truck licenses ....
Kred T. lUirgess. battery work
l.ftifflit Welding Wks., supplies
J. W. lterr', hlucksmltblnif
Mitchell and Perriue, do

3.30 Mrs. JohBora Fisher. $26.00i Mod.- -

.oni'inler, 121.00; Catherine Herrmujin
;;,7.i(i: Amelia Hlidebrant.
,0 JUns Jeaseu, llo.Ou; cbss .11. Jouea.

il.SO '"''0: Ney Lewis, lio.oo; opal
64.10 M,',e. lio.oo: Almeda McCurry.

Nelson Pig. Co.. supplies 6.CU

t;. It. I.Ur. Co., lumber S7.:i;

W. II. llolinenkamp Co., burial
of Indigent 30.00

SkngRS I'nlon Store, supplies
for Indigent 10.00

stronr; or weak according In

the bank you rbnose to ban-d- b

your neeonnt.

oi'R n.wic
Is finanrtally n sound Inslltn-tlo-

Hut will be Rind to ren-

der you every service consist-

ent with good bnnklng.

We arc naturally Interested

In VOl' as an enterprising cit-

izen, because you na an In-

dividual have your sbaro In

making this a prosperous

community.
Let our bank work with

you. that all of us mny bo

mutually benefitted for hav-

ing done our share.

i.mi: u. w. I'arker, 110.00; CarolineIal O. Iron Wks., labor and re.
pairs

..' . 12.4o'r"'l,,5r' "00o; AlpUens Patterson.7.9J
3. 25

1.. and I.. Urug Store, supplies
for prisoners

I.ee Warnlck. do
Hill's Dept. Store, Supplies tor

13.00'"V'ui rainer rowers, 17.60," MargarrW. A. McCull, road worlc
(J. lluckmaD. do ei IIU.OO) America noberV,

116.00; riuib Itynearson. 116.00; Mm.
3.00
4.37

, lis" all rift
build air Costly

.but
keep your

J. K. Mitchell, do35. SO

4.90
J

Ih'tnndard Jill n, in', jail laundry j. ii .sare. t2.60; 13. W. (louder.llagey. do
llafrey. Jr.. Uo rt, 1 6. 00: Kurah TbomDaoa. IT. an. .lohn

27.44i ' iv.wv; sbq j. niaod. Jlo.oo;Cbas. Weagle. do
K. O. Uepubllcan publlsblntf

proceedings
MAltKKT HOAIIS

Reblen II. Stonedahl. road work lfi.0,1

la re approval of Widows' P..

for a .security of mind and a fixedness of purpose to do
righteously that can not be easily destroyed by the ordin-

ary experiences of life. The most outstanding men and
women in history have practiced prayer' for themselves
and for tho interests to which they gave themselves.

A Connecticut clock-mak- er retires with a fortune esti-
mated at several millions, accumulated on account of his
habit of studying the clock.

Bariuim was considered daring in his time, but his
best known remark sounds in a day of
:?2,000,00() private bank failures.

- Theoretically, the gate of the Gatun locks of the Pan-
ama. Canal was smashed by a bomb, but so long as it is only
theoretical no great harm is done.

loss: Approved,
la re appro tal of Monthly lienort

17.9a
S.49

S3. 4i
69.16

R H. Snider, do.
John Hayden, do.
ohn Llndsey, do

Lloyd Carter, dopou.ncaiiof John Mitchell, blueksmthe.
of County Treasurer: Approved.Win. llosewall, road work

Io re approval of MSaUity iieBOrtllrend Sturgill, doon the ftound" of Scalp Hounty Warrants Issued bv
nOXDKD hoaph.

It. n. Coueh. freight paid liS.OO
Tral. Winfree. rt al, boad sale

7.50
10.00
15.0(1

.7
5. 74

I.4
S.00

County Clerk: Approved.
'.I. 14, Trlppler. do
Hurt Pevore. do
Charles Connor, do
Klmer Millman. do
Cluster Oodsey, do
J. F. Koster, do

legal advice
O. K. l.br. Co.. supplies
W. II. nohnetikamp Co.. do. ..

6.00 L. XT. Vaughn, do

401.01)
109.40

!.:
44.00

4.15
I

2304.10
24.0"

Ia re approval of bond of CountyP.oa.dinaatr: Approved. ,

In re application of Andrew rto.s
for County Aid: Allowed In the sum
of 116.00 per month unUl furth-- r or-
ders of tbls Court.

In re consideration of order made,
Feb. 2ltb. Miliar for bids on Island

llowinan-lllck- a T.br. Co., do. ...

Coast Culvert and Flume Co.
culverts

Harold lluslck, do 12 00
Utohert lluslck, do 17. 00

Miles, do
OKNEItAI. ItOAPS ;Ray Kyers. road work

Ctty-Cov- s road: Hoadmanter directed.5 Pucketl Bros., do 44. 7i
IS.SS'j. I'. Plank, do J.S

!.4 !'Georffe Clay. do. .. ; 4.55
Is call for bids on remainder of da.
Unce for strip of oavmr in.

1.7wt In re mo. allowance to various ba- Islead of strip of oncr.lt and

John W. (Irahani CO., supplies
Nelson. IMg. Co.. do
K. U Lilly, do
W illis Wright, do
Howard Cooper Corp., do
Milne Klectrle Co.. do

iW. 11. Itobnenkanip Co., do
Playle Oil Co.. do

The higher sugar prices rise the harder they fall on
(he consumer.

-- .j,. i .i
Oh well, things in Europe may pick, up again after the

variscr.
vjouhd --reliable -- prqgrzssivE' rive notice tait bids will be received

set later than March 5Hb, 19,'j. at t
p. la.. Instead of Match totii. as u
formerly ordered.

J.'.ll dlrot persons. Allowed as follows:
S.loiMrs. U M Attrherry. 110: Jeosle lyr.14.i'Ji.nn: Jennie Cone. J16.00; Netttn

17.61 rallln. t5.nn; Susun Knloe. $15.0
I

. ........ c 4 L. X. ... ...I
.1
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