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Wrestlers win Oregon Classic, two in California 
By Robert Weber 
Emerald Sports Reporter 

Oregon's wrestling team 
notched its second mad win in 
three days by trouncing Fresno 
State 25-10 on Saturday. 

The victory, which comes on 

the heels of Thursday's road 
triumph at Cal Poly-San l.uis 

Obispo, left the Ducks with a 

2-0 mark in Pacific.-10 Confer- 
ence meets and 5-0 overall. 

Calling it a "pretty good 
meet”, Oregon Coach Ron Fin- 

ley praised Duck junior Dan 
Vidlak for getting the team go 

ing 
Vidlak. the nation's top- 
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were named to the men's first 
team cross country team while 
the Duck women were repre- 
sented by senior Liz Wilson 
and sophomore Carol Dolmen 

Oregon was also represented 
by junior Lisa Karnopp on the 
second team and junior Lucy 
Nusrala and sophomore Kricka 
Klein were honorable mention 

picks. 
On the volleyball teams, ju- 

nior Molly McCrath and red- 
shirt freshman Nicole Hedberg 
were the Ducks’ two represen- 
tatives. 
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ranked 118-pound wrestler, 
won a 23-H decision over Fres- 
no State’s Tony Trujillo 

"Vidlak's 2:1-0 win really got 
us rolling." Finley said. "Once 
we got off to a good start, they 
never had a chance." 

The win was an important 
one for the Ducks who are in 
the middle of a five-match, sev- 

en-day trip that concludes at 

Stanford on Wednesday 

Mat Sprague. wrestling .it 

167 pounds, earned the Ducks' 
only fall when he pinned the 
Itulldogs' Robbie Dicks 

In a 19-15 win at Cal I’oly- 
SI.O on Thursday, the Ducks 
built an early lead on the 
strength of victories by Vidlak, 
Sprague. Pat Craig (150 
pounds). Curt Strahm (190) and 
a pin by HTpound Scott Cleon 
and then held on for the road 

win 

While Oregon's footb.ilI te.nn 
was busy in Anaheim, Calif 
with Colorado Stale and the 
Freedom Howl, the l)m:k wres- 

tlers found themselves in Cor- 
vallis at the Ash s Tiger Oregon 
Wrestling C.'lassie. Dec 20 

Again it was Vidlak leading 
the wav with three victories as 

the Ducks claimed the team ti 
tie with 14HVi points. 

(ilenn. Strahm and Rob Slone 
(KI4) provided additional wins 
for Oregon and Slrahm earned 
the meet's outstanding wrestler 
award 

The Ducks face Cal State Ba- 
kersfield (Mondayl. Oal-State 
Fullerton (Tuesday) and .Stan- 
ford (Wednesday) Results from 
the (ad State Ifakersfield match 
were unavailable at press time 
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