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Code changes to be aired today 
By Dan Eisler 
Emeraia Report?' 

A publh hearing on pro 
posed ( flanges to the Cniversi 
tv St mil ■ n t Conduct Code will 
be held todav .it t p m in KMC 
Walnut Room 

The pmpos<ils include sever 

al amendments to the code 
about reorganizing student con 

duct tribunals and appeals 
boards and establishment id 
"unwanted sexual attention" 
as an offense subjet I to disci 
plinary action 

In addition, another proposal 
involves reorganization and re- 

numbering ot the code "Stu- 
dents can have input that di 
red 1 y affei t students. said 
Marlene Drescber director ot 
the Office of Student Advoca 
\ 

Mu riel |ai kson l' n i \ ersilv 
assistant vice president tor ad- 
ministration. will be the bear 
mg offit er 

I he offenses rule amend- 
ment. proposed bv the Student 
Conduct Coni m it tee defines 

unwanted sexual attention 
as "sexual attention when a 
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reasonable person would know 
that it vv.o unw .1 iited iiml 
would expet I tinit such behas 
ior would i.iust' signifir ant 
emotional distress, on t imer 

sits propertv or at t niversitv 
sponsored or supervised ectisi 
ties 

The proposed amendment 
would spet iticallv address se\ 

u.il misi undue I which isn't 

urrenth defined or punishable 
in the code. Ifrescher said 

I he urrent code isn't clear 
about rape or sexual assault, 
hut Oregon law is, said Suzie 
Hunter, chairvvornan ot the 
Hniversitv l-nwanted Sexual 
Attention Task I on e's polu \ 

subcommittee 'The task tone 
felt a provision needed to be 
added 

Work on the amendment, a 

new provision began in late 
fall and was proposed last 
term, said task fort e member 
kirk Hailes 

I list iplinarv sain lions that 
can be imposed for code viola 
lions range from a written rep 
liinand to suspension or expul 
sion from I lie I ni versits 

In addition, the ommittee 

concluded the rules governing 
the tribunals operated indepen 
denth In the resident e halls, 
fraternities and sororities, un 

del its authoritv are umber 
some and difficult to read un 

derstand and follow 

The proposed amendments 
would place tribunals and ap 
peals boards operated bv the In 
tertratermU and I'anhellenii 
count.its and minor tribunals 

perated In the Residence Hall 
(an finance t ioiuntittee under 
the supervision of the Student 
I ondui I ( aimmittee 

ll\ also requiring the three 
tribunals to incorporate opera! 
mg procedures into respective 
governing constitutions the 
need for three separate admin 
islrative rules would be eliiui 
natei I 

l rn i vers it \ admin ist rators 
will review am testimoin sub 
milted prior to and during the 
hearing for a period of not less 
than two weeks altei the hear 
ing 

The rules will go into otter t 

onh after tiling n itii the (lo- 

gon Secretary of Stale's oflu e 

t 
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