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FRESHMEN EXCEL 
IN SWIMMING m 

Athletic Clubs and Y. M. 
Held Responsible 

LIFE SAVING IS TAUGHT 

More Babes Swim This 

Year Than Last 

The freshmen may be considered 

the underdogs by the sophomores 
but they can justly defend them- 

selves in the art of swimming. Ac- 

cording to records recently com- 

piled by Rudolph Fahl, swimming 
instructor in the school of physi- 
cal education, a larger number of 
the present freshman class could 
swim upon entering the University 
than the present sophomore class. 
The freshman test consists of two 

lengths of the tank on the stomach 
and one-half on the back, free style. 

Frosh Beat Sophomores 
This year’s freshman class had 

438 men when school started last 
fall. At the end of the winter 
term, March 20, 1925, it was found 
that there were only 67 who could 
still be classed as non-swimmers. 
This made a percentage of 15.3 
who could not swim, out of a class 
of 438. This is about 1.3 per cent 

greater than the per cent of sopho- 
mores who could not swim, al- 
though they have had a years in- 
struction. At the end of the past 
winter term, 813 sophomores were 

taking physical education, and it 
was found that only 44 could, be 
still classed as non-swimmers. This 
makes a 14 per cent of sophomores 
who were unable to swim. 

It is the belief of Fahl that the 
T. M. 0. A.’s, Summer camps for 
boys, athletic clubs and other such 
organizations can be responsible 
for the large number of excellent 
swimmers. Another thing that lias 
helped is the fact that nearly every 
small town or city has a municipal 
pool of its own with a paid in- 
structor during the summer months. 

Life Saving Taught 
Bed Cross Life Saving instruc- 

tions are given by the University 
of Oregon’s Bed Cross Life Sav- 
ing Corps. This is being done un- 

der the auspices of the physical 
education department. A large 
number of the swimmers taho this 
life saving course and find it very 
profitable in acting as life guards 
during the summer months at some 

of the bathing resorts throughout 
the state. The physical education 
department believes that it will be 

only a matter of a few years until 
all men entering the University 
will be expert swimmers. 

VISITING EXECUTIVE 
TO TALK AT ASSEMBLY 

Ur. Aurelia Henry Beinhardt, 
president of Mills college at Oak- 
land and president of the Ameri- 
can Association of University Wo- 
men, who will be on the campus 
next week for the Woman’s Leagmx 
convention, is considered by Dean 
Uirginia .Tudy Esterlv to be the 
foremost woman of the West. 

“Ur Bcinlmrdt is probably the 
most representative woman the 
West lias ever had,” Dean Estorly 
said yesterday when asked for an 

estimation of the visiting president. 
“She speaks remarkably well and 
is in demand as a public speaker.” 

The whole student body will have 
an opportunity to hear Ur. Bein- 
hardt at next week’s assembly, 
when she will make her first ap- 
pearance since she made the dedica- 
tory address for the Woman’s 
building about five years ago. 

Ur. Beinhardt is a graduate of 
the University of California, but 
received her degree as doctor of 

philosophy at Yale in 1905. She 
received a LL.U. degree at the Uni- 
versity of California in 1919. Sh 
ims been connected with the Eng- 
bsli department at the University 
of Idaho and taught also at the 
Lewiston (Idaho) State Normal 
school. She has been president of 
Mills since 1910. 

Inter-mural Baseball 
Begins Wednesday: 

Gaine Schedule Out 

{Continued from pnije one) 
and Friday evening, a formal din- 
ner will lie held at the Anchorage. 
A formal dance, in charge of Paul- 
ine Bondurant, will follow, at the l 

Woman’s building. Saturday morn- 

ing, the delegates and a few hos- 
tesses will leave for the McKenzie 
river, where they will picnic at 
Nimrod, returning in the early af- j 
ternoon. 

Registration hours will he from I 

8:30 to 10:00 Wednesday morning. 
Business sessions will last from 

8:30 to 11:30, and from 1:00 to 

3:30. As many girls as care to 

jhear the discussions are invited to 

[attend the business sessions which 

[will be held in the Woman’s 

League room in the Woman’s 

building. 
Oregon delegates will be Anna 

DeWitt, junior; and Edwina Rich- 

en, senior delegate. 

CO-EDS DEMONSTRATE 
NEW GROCERY PRODUCT 

Eight University girls, members 
of the advertising seminar group, 
are demonstrating Creme-O-BIend, 
a substitute for corn starch, at lo- 
cal stores this week-end. They be- 

gan their work yesterday after- 
noon and are continuing their de- 
monstrations today. Kap Kuhn, 
head of the seminar, is acting as 

sales manager of the product in 

Eugene, Creme-O-Blend is being 
introduced to Eugene buyersj for 
the first time. 

Eugenia Strickland and Geneva 
Eoss are working at the Dice gro- 
cery, Margaret Vincent and Mildred 
Dunlap at the Edwards grocery, 
Mildred Berkeley and Frances San- 
ford at the Grocorteria, and Norma 
Wilson and Sybil McKnight ate 
demonstrating the product at the 
Underwood and Elliott store. 
Creamed crab and tomato soup are 

served to patrons of these grocery 
stores. 

PROFESSOR WILCOX 
LEAVES FOB EAST 

Will Attend 'Architecture 
School Convention 

Professor W. R. B. Willcox, in- 

structor in the school of architec- 

ture has left for the east, where he 

will attend the American Institutes 

of Architecture convention to. be 

held in New York city. The con- 

vention which is an annual one, 

will be bigger this year than ever 

before. A large exhibition of work 

of various architects and students 

of architecture throughout the 

country will be shown at tho con- 

vention in tho Palace of Fine Arts, 
this university being represented by 
the work of five of tho students 

whose drawings were sent back last 

week. Mr. Wilcox is a member of 

tho Jury of Fellows of tho associ- 

ation and for that reason has had 

to leave early for the convention 

whose opening dato is April 24. 

Dean Ellis F. Lawrence of the 

school of architecture and allied 
arts is vice-president of the asso- 

ciation, but was unable to leave be- 

cause of recent illness. 
Mr. Wilcox will also attend the 

Convention of Collegiate Schools of 
Architecture which meets just prior 
to the Architectural Institutes con- 

vention. He expects to be gone 
two or three weeks. 

KLAMATH HIGH PRINCIPAL 
LAUDS OREGON DEBATERS 

In a recent letter to Dr. Dan E. 
Clark, of the extension division, 
the principal of the Klamath Falls 
high school writes that ho was 

among the thousands who listened 
in to the Oregon-Stanford debate. 
“Is casting my vote for the Uni- 
versity team,” he wrote, “I want to 

say the Oregon boys did much bet- 
ter than the Stanford men. An- 
other interesting point, too, is that 
radio KGW of the Morning Ore- 

gonian came in much better here 
at Klamath Falls than radio KLX 
of Oakland.” 

RADIO MEN TO STUDY 
TOR COMMERCIAL JOBS 

Preparation of men for commer- 

cial radio licenses will lie the ob- 
ject of a new group being formed 
in the physics department. Four 
men interested in the work met at 
I>oadv hall Thursday afternoon un- 

der the direction of Paul Hoppe to 
discuss plans. It is thought that 
the class will probably meet in the 
evenings, beginning some time next 
week. Another meeting of this 
group will be held early next week, 
and those interested in commercial 
operating are requested to bo pres- 
ent. 

RECENT CAMPUS VISITOR 
PROMOTES OH, COMPANY; 

Word lias boon received by the 
geology department that Dorsey 
Hagar, a recent campus visitor, is 
promoting a petroleum company in 
western Washington. Mr. Hagar, 
who is recognized as an authority 
on oil and gas, has written two 
books on the subject, which are 

used as college textbooks. In his l 

recent visit to the geology depart-1 
ment ho came to consult as to the [ 
possibilities of oil in eastern Ore- | 
gen. 

HOCKEY TOURNAMENT 
ROUND ROBIN AFFAIR 

I < 

All Star Teams tc^6 Play 
Game on Field Day 

Women ’9 hockey will be played 
in round-robin tournaments be- 

tween the four classes this season, 

according to Miss Barbara Page, 
coach. The tournament will begin 
May 18. 

Official practice is scheduled to 

begin April 27 and to continue un- 

til May 15. A minimum of six 

practices is required of all except 
senior majors in the physical edu- 
cation. Four practices will suffice 
for these girls. Unofficial prac- 
tice may begin at once, it has been 
announced. Girls should go out on 

the field and play with the classes 
in this sport for practice. Regular 
classes in hockey are given on Mon- 

day, Wednesday, and Friday at 

four o’clock. 
Teams for the tournaments will 

be chosen May 16 by Miss Page, 
coach; Ruth Melsome, head of 

hockey, and class managers. 
Two all-star teams will be select- 

ed from the class teams to play a 

special demonstration game as an 

event of Field Bay. 
Girls should sign up for this 

work at once so that they may be- 

gin working off their required prac- 
tices. A special chart has been 

placed in Miss Page’s office for 
this purpose. There is a separate 
sheet for each class. It is further 

requested that girls signing for this 

sport designate the position on the 
team for which they wish to try 
out. 

RUSSIAN EDUCATOR 
EMINENT SCIENTIST 

Dr. A. A. Goldenweiser to 

Teach in Summer 

Dr. Alexander A. Goldenweiser, 
anthropologist, author, and sociol- 

ogist, will be a member of the Uni- 

versity summer school faculty at 

the Eugene session this summer 

running from June 22 to July 31. 

His home is in New York, having 
been a member of the faculty of 
Columbia university for many 

years. In the summer session of 
1923 Dr. Goldenweiser was profes- 
sor of anthropology at the Uni- 

versity of Washington summer ses- 

sion. 
Born in Kiev, Russia, he was 

educated in the Kiev gymnasium. 
He was a student at Harvard in 
1901-2. He received his bachelor's 
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and master’s degrees from Colum- 
bia. In 1910 he received his doc- 
tor of philosophy degree from that 
institution. 

Since 1919 he has been a lec- 

turer on anthropology and sociol- 
ogy in the new school for social 
research in New York. Since 1915 
he has been a lecturer in the Rand 
school of social science in anthro- 
pology and psychology. He is a 

public lecturer and has written 
books and articles. He is sched- 
uled to speak in one of the as- 

semblies at the summer session. 

Nine Houses Will Vie 
At April Frolic 

For Loving Cup 

(Continued from paoe one) 
tFIrich, cleanup; Edith Sorenson, 
cup; Elizabeth Cady, publicity; Lil- 
lian Luders, stage manager; Mary 
Donaldson, food; Marian Horsfall, 
patronesses. 

Assistants to those committee 
heads are, Noreen Burke, Elizabeth 
Latham, Louise Buchanan, Kather- 
ine Kubli, Edith Shell, Mary Clark, 
Mabel Fransen, Barbara Edmunds, 
Alta Knips, Florette Janelle, Bil- 
lie Shields, Helen Coplan, Myra 
Belle Palmer, Alice McKinnon, 
Virginia Lee Richardson, Eleanore 
Glass, Katherine Graef, Doris Ken- 
dall, Alice Douglas, Ellen McClel- 
lan. 

OREGON MEN TO MEET 
STANFORD TRACKMEN 

Hayward Takes Athletes 
On Southern Trip 

This afternoon, under the -warm 

California sun, the Oregon track- 
men will vie with the Stanford 
runners, leapers and, throwers,, in 

the first Coast conference meet of 
the year. Oregon is 'conceded hut a 

slight chance for victory, but Hay- 
yard’s men are expected to pile up 
a tidy sum of points. 

A team of 19 men accompanied 
Bill Hayward on the trip south. 
The experience gained in this com- 

petition is expected to stand the 
men in good stead in the meets to 

be held during the season. 

The men participating in the 
Stanford meet are: Wistar Eosen- 

PHONE 
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Your New Hat 
Dress and Necklass 

This^year Easter necklaces are fashion’s supreme dic- 
tate. A supplement to your new hat and dress,, it 
will add a touch of color and sparkle to your fashion 
ensemble for Sunday morning. 
Chokers of crystal, pearls (both white and tinted) and 
amber still lead in popularity. Nowhere could you 
find a better assortment from which to pick than here. 

J. A. Hoffman 
Jeweler 

790 WILLAMETTE STREET 

berg, ’25, captain, polevault and 

javelin; Irving Weaterman, ’27, 
100-yard dash; C. W. Stonebreak- 

er, ’27, 100-yard dash, 220-yard 
dash; E. G. Extra, ’27, 220-yard 
dash; J. E. Kinney, ’25, 440-yard 
dash, relay team; W. P. Wilbur, 
’27, 440-yard dash, relay team; G. 
G. Mauney, ’26, 880-yard run; F. 
V. Gerke, ’26, 880-yard run; T. V. 
Holder, ’26, mile run; P. M. Swank, 

’27, mile run; J. R. Keating, '26, 
two-mile run; H. E. Tetz, ’25, two- 
mile run; W. R. Kelsey, '26, hur- 
dles; R. T. Carruthers, ’25, hur- 
dles; R. D. Eby, ’26, high jump; J. 
P. Flanagan, ’26, high jump; A. 
Johnston, ’27, shot put and discus; 
G. L. Hermance, ’26, relay team; 

P. J. Price, ’27, relay team. 

PATRONIZE 
EMERALD ADVERTISERS 

EXCELSIOR GETS GAMMA POI’S GOAT 

w 
MARY CAUGHT IN A 

PLAYFUL MOOD 

Mary was a little goat. 
She belonged to Gamma Phi, 

And ,upon her they did dote. 
Until the goat did die. 

Bah, Bah, Bah. 

Now comes our story. The Gamma 
Phis were feeding their goat, Mary, 
a very palatable diet of nice fresh 

hay, but the cost was found to be 

prohibitive. So, as all the sisters 
had become deeply attached to their 

quadraped garbage incinerator, Lil- 
lian Tingle Luders originated the 

I idea of mixing excelsior in Mary’s 
fodder. The only trouble experienc- 
ed in this experiment'was that the 
goat died—the poor little dear. Lil- 
lian is very sorry that the goat 
died, because she wanted to find 
the exact amount of nutrtion con- 

tained in excelsior. Obak extends 
sympathy to the Gamma Phis. 

MYSTERY SQUEAKS OUT 

Obaks wishes to correct the er- 

roneous impression that the noise 
on the southwest corner of Willam- 
ette and Ninth is caused by the 

“squeak” from collegians’ English 
brogues. Obaks is remodeling. 
Such symphonies which issue forth 
are the rythm and beat of the 
saw and hammer—But at that—the 

gang hangs around and plays a 

little pool. 

Kampus OLLUM 

Smoking on the campus has 
caused a great deal of trouble at 
the University lately, but the boys 
at Obak’s still are able to put on 

their smoke screens without any in- 
terference. 

The April Frolic will be staged 
tonight, which means that the boys 
will have to spend a no date eve- 

ning at Obak’s. The annual Obak’s 
April Frolic pool tournament will 
start promptly at seven thirty. 

* * * « 

Just think, a Frosh court. The 
only court necessary for Frosh is 
a good cold mill-race or a solid oak 
paddle. 

The Greatest Historian 
Of Them All 

Homer wove history into his songs. The Pharaohs carved 
it in stone. Julius Caesar painstakingly penned it on 

papyrus. * 

Today, history is written and given to you simultaneously 
with its occurence. Every day, the important events of 
the world are summed up fully and comprehensively in 
your newspaper. You are able to keep abreast of history 
in its making. 
And not the legist important phase of modern history lies 
in the realm of industrial progress. You find this chron- 
icled in the advertisements. 

Advertising is a priceless boon to those who use it prop- 
erly. It keeps their information up-to-date on the great 
variety of things that make life what it is today. It tells 
them of the thousand and one things they need in order to 

live profitable, happy and useful lives. 

The consistent advertiser pays money to tell you about 
his wares. He knows they are good—he backs them with 
his money because he is confident that they will satisfy. 
For only merchandise that is consistently good can be con- 

sistently advertised. 

KEEP UP WITH HISTORY—IT PAYS 
READ THE ADVERTISEMENTS 

Oregon Daily Emerald 


