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LOOKS FOR JOB

LONDON (UPI) - An "intel-
ligent and experienced secre rrrT '

EXPERIENCED DIESEL log truck dr--

(7

ABSOLUTELY no hunting on L. H. Bell

properly, Dlxonville. Please don't ask.
NO HUNTtNG. (ishlno. tresoasilna on mv

property e. oi wnbur .Bernard Gmbbe.

i

NO HUNTING or trespasslngT Julian Hal- -

Held. Roberts Creek.
NO HUNTING or trespassing on the Bar.

- "9"
CUST0M CUTTING on diSTI ind

Gift Is Optional
By ABIGAIL VANBUREN

tary" advertised in the Times
of London for a job "where a
quiet poodle could sit at herl
feet."

Movie Showtime

Thursday, Oct. 17, 1961

' w.. waone'r ii-.T'V.l- ,

" JXi'"i. 7:3S only

moose, al Byrd's Market Meat Dept.;Upln WnnfArl Wntnota 1 C

MUSIC GROUP TO MEET

The Myrtle Creek Music" As

...... .

"'"
room. Production dotal S of the
forthcoming KomillUnity Kap- -

ers prod .ction will be discus -
'

.......
Entertainment will be rovid

, . ,
cu iur uie ttvvuiux b urugrain.... i,..,j ,. .j' , p "lst"

LEGAL
Cast No. 7993

NOTICE
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT

,' ....ucsn audi; n reiauve cau-.uv- c
NO HUNTING or tresoasslna on tn. O. P.

D f7Z
.r:-'-'.-- " " i""- -.

NO HUNTING or trespassing on my
ranch on Roberts Crock. L. V. Weber,

NO TRESPASSING i

The Looker Ranch, Look ingg lass
NO HUNTING or trespassing on my prop- -

erty. Parley E. Were.
ABSOLUTELY NO huntina ar lrenx;ttr.a

. . j ..,n j.i ,,anu .uiiuuv.... i
... . .1 .,,i . .,.. ,..Ids icveuuj muviu iu uu. w...

1H UllitV . Her husband, an exe- -

jutive with a large firm,
oeen transferred here. This
woman was given a warm wet- -

come by all of US Old residents.
it is natural ior a newcomer

"SZ " wm Frl e said if we didn't intend to
pine DRivE Frisai-su- she wouldn't send oneiCR S! SrZXSSNause they are very expen,
TrTcITY .iK.' DRIVE-I- Gates open I,!, on propernes ownea or leased by M. o."una- "wr wercy nospnei, noseourg.

lO talk about her experiences of a wood frame structure of approxi-an-

friendships "back home," 'dassMlca'tlowlll "."'covered under
but this woman lias divulged the the General Contract Proposal.

-.: :r : Attention Is called to Ihe bidders Pre- -

er. Ph. evenings.
LONG LOGGERS

Call

If you are of age, married, have
good car and a high school diploma.)
this is po'Tlble. For Interview phone

between 7 and 9 p.m. '

.

BABY SITTER TO LIVE IN.
(.an 3.7917 atter 3 p.m.

RELIABLE baby sitter needed. Rose
scnool area, call between 8
a.m. na i p.m.

REG. NURSE for operating room, must
be available for call. Good wages and
uenem. miso need KN'S ior Oiner posi-

nuuacrvccrcix ior eiaeriy man. Live
in. Slight disability no drawback. S.
rear son, j Log taDin St., independ-
ence, Ore.

Registered Nurses
WANTED. Aoply D J. Logue, administra

tor, Myrtle Creek Hospital, Myrtle
ure,

Part Time Job
Opening for woman with
good typing ability. Horn-
ing hours. Writo, giving pre-
vious experience, qualifica-
tions to box 728, News-Revie-

ALTERATION
LADY

Part Time
Apply at the General Office

me and asked if she should
send us a wedding invitation

to my husband about it (they
are his side of the family,
wouldn't you know?) he said,
"Oh, don't be so formal! Ask
her to read the invitation over

line teiepnone anu ten ner yes
or no!

"ill the proper way to be
invited to a church wedding?
Do you think we should go?
And if We decide hot to EO, do

uflVA tn cwnri aifi n-.v "j

0F E nnnI?,SRrt00N F0R N0 HUNTING or trespassing without writ-- .

t ten permission on property near Mel- -
the metier of the application for ) rose Dairy. Donald Lewis.

the Change of Name of LINDA-- ) ,r,:,J.ELLEN FRIOLUND and WILLIAM N0 HUNTING or trespassing on French
FRANCIS FRIDLUND, j Creek Ranch, Glide. Bill Stradcr and
TO ALL PERSONS CONCERNED: ' P.h.". S,rader'

NOTICE li hereby given to all persons NO HUNTING or trespassing, F. W.
to appear in the court on; Emmllt. Ken Rleke, E. C. Woodward,
or before thirty (30) days from the date Agee, D.C. Roberts.
of publication hereof, which date of pub- - NO HUNTING or trespassing on our
llcalion Is October 10, 1963, to appear, property In Brockway, Tenmlle, and,
and show cause. If any they may have,1 Olalla. Nichols Brothers,
why a decree ol this Court should not Vn unwTiwrbe granted changing Ihe name of LINDA Winston Section.ELLEN FRIDLUND to LINDA ELLEN Vl
CHAMBERLAIN; and changing the name roroe.Br05'-
of WILLIAM FRANCIS FRIDLUND to N0 HUNTING or trespassing on

FRANCIS CHAMBERLAIN, as ,,on ranches. No permission, J. C. Liv- -

prayed lor In the application on tile Ingston, Glide.
herein. NO HUNtlNG, trespassing or crossing1

s IRENE ELLEN CHAMBER- - over on the Scoit, Roth or Smith
erlles In the Melrose area.

111 O S I muiliuie iiuuriimuuu
about her friends in her for- -

mer community things which
Could only have been told to
her in confidence. Mie has even
iiKprt thpir nuines. Chances are
we will never meet them. But
we keep wondering....what she
will say about us if she leaves

" "(.-- "-rl"'.... . . .... i 1.1

?l f y Vh'r 7"ult"
be ueuer UKUU ll Miu uiuii (
talk so much.

OLD RESIDENTS

CONFIDENTIAL TO J AND
Sarrv but what vou sua ties t

is illegal, Immoral and extreme- -

DISGUSTEDjherC. If J'OU Will print U1IS pcr-.- j

f MONTGOMERY WARDlrj
'X
.

V"9"""' ' "r9e...v,?.1. M'S"! "'"?".
contractor's

'?o.
form

.himAeL1'1
ol en.

ibS BDimiiMn E.T?....
FRANCIS FRIDLUND

CASE NO. 370S1
5UMMONS

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR

DOUGLAS COUNTY

NAncy c EEDl
Plaintiff,

e REED,

T. ..?!S""'-- ' --j'NT,"6 ?w? .? S.T.AIEJ.F1

appear and answor the complaint filed
against you In the cause
within bp d of six weeks from the
date ot the first publication ol this sum-
mons, once a week for four weeks. Ifi

DEAR DISGUSTED: Y O U

relative has much to learn
about etiquette. Don't go to the
wedding unless you wartf to,
And a gift is optional whether
you go or not.

DEAR ABBY: Our family is
.11 ? , ;,on iuii, ouu m nave niitiij' sin- -

Blo" friends (bachelors, divor- -

cees and widows) whom we fre
quently invite to share a meal
or an outing. Our children have
often asked why the single men
and women we invite so often
never invite us for anything.'
At first we told them it was'
nniflinc nannccQ...r nn..
V, .T.
Bui the more We thought about
it, the more we began to won- -

der why don't they? They
wouldn't have to include our
Children. I wonder Why "sin- -

gles" think nothing of repeat--:

edly accepting invitations from
their married friends, bur rare- -

ly reciprocate.

,19 u anything as Toonn a

your considered plan, pArani.
are your best friends. Please
tell them everything tonight.

STEALS TROUSSEAU
'

rnEBTSEV. Enrlnnrt rllPU
. . ... .

Elaine Walter, 19, was fined
5140 Wednesday for stealing 85

itcms irom the underwear shop
she managed to make up her
wprlrlinu fvniiKm.an

TrvTiLtCjAL

you fail so to answer, lor want thereof, WALNUT PICKERS wanled-go- od
plaintiff will apply lo the court for. in,. Denlon 0rchards-.73.S5- M.

the relief prayed for In said complaint,' waruiiT'-pi- rir cota succinct statement ol which is as lot- -

N. Stephens at Garden Valley

Work Wanted 17

CARPENTER WORK and remodeling.
rn. aiicr a p.

JOB WANTED lor 3 log trucks.
Ph.

BABY SITTING, my home.
10,4 S. E. Main

IRONING 90c hour. Pickup, deliver. Call
6f3j775S belore 12 or alter S p.m.

cRp,ErNTE,RM v?1.Ka.ln,lng ,nd
?Falr' '))

SEWING AND ALTERATIONS
73.Sa2S

.
u starching very

L

r!LL Cleaning, day work by day or
hour. Experienced. Call 672.3292.

Cftkf tn I fcK WORr AND RPPAIRS
Hatfield.

" - - - MANAGEMENT, MEDT T, :T.
JUST WONDERING! SI?? ZIrtm'ent 0?.F.ORD T.

DISTRICT.
. .

Oral
. .

auction..
UtAK JUST! Many do. OnlyxHE INTERIOR, BUREAU OF," HOUSEWORK, $1,25 nr. Neat, clean, ca.

T amfi ht AWAr'irtl.tir'WT l,IT?n
FORD DISTRICT Oral auction'sale room- - Armory Drlve (mail-- i

bids will be received by the in8 address 1133 S. Riverside),
nictrint Mnnnaoi- - nt thp timhor Medford, Oregon at 9:30 A.M.,

sale room. Armory Drive (mail -

ins? address 1133 S. Riverside).
Medford. Oregon at 0:30 A.M.,
P.S.T. on Thursday, Novemberisubmitted, full information con- -

'. EGAL

ERTISEMENT FOR BIOS
Seated biiis In duplicate (or Ihe con- -

wrcqon
ior scnoo uinnci ijv-- WCounly, will be received by Mr. A. L.
Loerti. District Clerk, at the District
Office at 110 E. Central Street, Suther- -
lin. Oregon until 8:00 p.m.. Pacific
Standard Time. November 5, 1963.
i ne plans, specifications ana oiner con- -

"?fumen,s mayk M "fTi""1. V'copies inereor may De oorainea ai me
office of Payne and Stnjble. A.I.A., Ar- -

.,IOOS Eas, str.., Med.
lord, Oregon, and from the Olflce ol ,

and specifications' will be required. Any

wMi be Teiunded hi? deposit in? inj .
upon returning his set will1

be 'e'unded of his deposit.
Th or.i iviv ih consiructiom

guafc,on rsquiremenl. ol Secllons
279.010 to 379.036, inclusive, Oregon Re- -

Ivlsed Statutes, which must be Hied with
,he c,rk ,0 davs be(ore dJ,e ,or ooe.
'no of bids and for which forms may be
obtained at the off'-- e of the Architect.
A , 6ld ira ,wo ,iter0, ,r,
puired. All proposals must be accom.
Panled by a certified check, cashier's
CnKi,, or bid mad, p,VJbi, i
school District c m an amount 01
tint . Ihin 10- - nl thai MM

the successiui bidder will b. required

Jranm0un7h-",c- f"
accordance wi.n uregon Kev.sed statute
9TO tin
V he 'successful bidder shall carry WorK- -
men's Compensation Insurance protect
ing his employees, and will be required

erlrtg himself, his employees, also SctiooM
District Its officers, agents and
employees to the minimum amount of
$50,000 tor injuries to one person end
SI 00,000 minimum (or one accident.
He shall carry property damage Insur- -
ance in a minimum amount of $50,000

nib cmpioyoes, bcnooi uisincr ,

its olticors, agents and employees. All,
SUCn Insurance policies shall have on- -

dorsemenls thereon reoulrlno notice to
scnooi uistrict im-- ot at least 10 days,
prior lo cancellation of any such
surance.

'He shall file with the Board of Dire-
ctors of the School District evidence that

all such Insurance Is being carried prior
to me commencement ot any work.

.'The Board of Directors of School DIs- -

Irlcl reserves the rloht to relect
any or all bids end to waive any In- -

tormahties
h

directors douglas coun- -

JJthIrlPn0L Oregon" l3'C'

A. L. Loerts, District Clerk

TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED-
STATES DEPARTMENT OF
'HE INTERIOR, BUREAU OF

,w"l, e "'""'r ,
Ulsirici Aianuger ai nits umuui

P S.T. on Thursday, November
14, 1963 for all timber designat-

led for cutting. Before bids are

me umucr, me luiiui -

bids should be obtained from
iJlsinci Aiauaier. lite llgllll

is hereby reserved to reject anyl
0r all bids and ,

iu waive
:

any
technical defects in this adver
tisement and to waive any in- -

forrnality in bids received when
ever such waiver is in the inter
cst f , UnUcd SM m
DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON
O&C: All timber designated for

"ww, nirvjonvf
32 S., R. 3 W. Will Mer. estimat- -

ed for the purpose of this sale
to be 5,444 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- ,
28 M bd. ft. ponderosa pine, 56

in .... j oiIU lur u,e H"""e'u! 1'"".6: pcr M bd it for the sugar
10 per M bd. ft. for!

!,. :'. ,t a kk iinn f

, 7.7. ...V?!' , .
OU. 11. 10T IUC WI1UB 111, Ol t

"""" whii um

ALTERAT0NS - SEWING
A,., .g..Ti. ..

single. S19.95, attentions.

APPLIANCE REPAIR

. maytag
We service am Home Appliances
bergh s appliance

BOOKKEEPING

ROSKE'S
Bookkeeping Service

Specializing In small business accounts '
NOTARY PUBLIC TYPING

nnc w HADUAPtl' - ' .....n.'.o
DMI-1-

BUILDERS,CARPENTERS
carpentry and cabinets. Harry""CUSTOM BUILT homes, remodels, cabin-- ,

ets, carports, garages. Free est. lOOa'
finance. Grady Rooerson.

GENERaITconsTruCTION, repair and
welding. Free estimates. Call Bob Bol- -

J4, lubd ior an iimoer
nated for cutting. Before bidsitions of sale and submission of
are submitted, full information
uuuuci mug mi; uiiiMci, iiic ..uu-jin- e

aitions ot sale ana suDmission
ti i ne ue irumm snuiiiu uuiauieu

the District Manager. The right
is nereuy reserveu iu reject,
any or all bids and to waive

1 ".' "
auve usement. ami; iu wa ve,

. v.ui

!int !, Tir.ii,t cioio.

OrFICE RENTAL. 345 S. E. Jackson,
Approximately 16'x55'. Owner.

GARAGF or many other usage building
tor rem or lease, 3500 sq. ti. Also store

Mark's No. 2. 6734193, eves.

iir 1 .
Wanted lO Kent 25
CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT dt.

lfes 3 Mrm home. PO Box 775, City.

1st. 673.5405.

WANT TO rent or lease small acre-
age, house and barn in or around

Apartments for Rent 26
FURNISHED APT., water and garbage

lncluded. Inq:1303 Pine, Apt. 7.

ATTRACTIVE redec, furn. lncTutlT.
S65to $M817 W.Hayd672.,462.

3MPLE"tELY FURNISH 2D housekeeping
unlts.WinrtesterVlllage,
14 KARAT APTS 2 bedrooms,"$l6o, Bach- -

elor apt. $75. Brand new. Call for in- -
Iorm lion II no answer

SUTHERLTN UNION GAP APTS. 2bdrm.
S50. br.n, $40 mo. Furn. Including
water, L 99C. Suth. .

NEWturnlshed apts. ready by October
lith. Maid and linen service available
lldesired. Hoijl Umpqua.

ONE bedroom pTrtiyturnished apartments
Couple oniy. See at 737 Wharton SI.
alter 5 p.m.

FOUR ROOM furnished apartment on
ground floor, children allowed. $52.

-A1 LX..7.2.6?? n ingj673-5- W.
LOVELY 2 bedroom apt., IVi baths fur-

nace heat, formal dining room, large
living room, part basement. Downtown
location. Couple only, no pels. $$5
month. Helen Glenn Real Estate, 4B5 SE
Kane, or phone

Kohlhagen Apts.
Modern. Reasonable Rent.

St. at Lane Ave.
.73.1744

Good Place To Live'

Privacy, Peace & Quiet!
In t'ls nicely furnished bedroom
apt. Hot water and garbage service
paid. Automatic laundry facilities.
Adults. Sorry, no pels. $65. See or
call

Shady Point Trailer Sales
Mile S. on B.R. n

TODD APARTMENTS
Bdrm. apts., furnished or unfurn.

Water, garb. serv. provided, also heat
in some. Rents from $70 up.

SWIMMING POOL
Terrace Apts., gas equipped
Winchester CI., Hot water heat, '

Vista Homes, ot water heat,
wesivue waryer
oaklhlll Apts., Radiant heat

Completely Furnished
Beautiful 10 wide mobile homes compar- -

able In slie to most apts. yet the
convenience of a private yard and park-

ing adolnlng trailer. Also smaller trail-
ers Timber Town Trailer
Park. 3310 NE Stephens.

.rw73-850- 6

Rooms for Rent 27
SLEEPING 817 S.E.

Blakely. lW oiks SE Greyhound Depot.
NEW ROOM'S Including telephone and"

linen service. $60 per month and up,
'

Hotel Umpqua,

Room and Board - 28
ROOM AND BOARD and lunches packed.

ou per martin,

Houses for Rent 29
TWO BEDROOMS, fireplace, paneling.

Close In. No pels.
ONE BEDROOM duplex, $40 month.

part utilities paid. Call
ONE BEDROOM house, 3 acres, suitable

ior coupie. wu.
TWO BDRM turn, house at 6)3 SE Kane.

Desirable for 2 men, $S5.

NICE one bedroom duplex, close to busi-
ness district. Adults only. Call

FURNISHED CABINS, weekly rates. 4620
we aiepneni. racinc Morei.

ONE TO FC 'R Bdrm. homes for famll-le- s

or eingle elderly. Phone
TW6BEDROOM rental. $47. Rt. 1, Box

250. (E. Douglas).
PARTLY FURNISHED 2 bedroom house.

AOUIfl. Pil.
NICE 3 bedroom house, 2 or 3 children.

Linn Kiver ho., oiiae. 955 mo. call

TWO bedroom unfurn. duplex, double
carport, basement. Economical heat.
S80. 1324 NE Freemont.
URNISHED CABINS. Utilities paid.
Weekly rates or by the month. Close to
stores and bus line. Roseland Courts.
2050 HE Stephens. or

THREE BEDROOM house, partly fur- -

nijntjD. mm Dearoom rurnisnea api.
1 block from new Safeway Store on
Rose St. Ph.

FOUR bedroom home, available Nov.
sr. uu furnace, s diocks trom Elks

Club. S85. McAneney Real Estate,
Phone

VERY NEAT and clean 2 bedroom
nace, garage and carport. Immediate
house, block from Benson School.
Separate dining room, sawdust

$80. McAneney Real Es-
tate, 6720371.

LEASE OPTION
SMALL furnished 2 bedroom
home, large lot and garage.
Easy terms. Price, $6500.

Phone 672-447- 7

Mobile Home Rentals 30
VACATION TRAILERS FOR RENT

Sutherlln
EXTRA NICE or 2 BR modern turn.

trailers. Adults only. Timber Town
Trailer Park, 2010 NE Stephens

Mobile Home Parks 31

SPACE TOR 35' trailer.
1451 SJJShorl SI.

TRAILER SPACE AVAILABLE
Winchester Village

FREE TRAILER rent on Doris St. In

change for patio work or will rent rea
able. Phone 4953495.

Mobile Homes 32.

ANGELUS
Great Lakes

Traveleze '
New and Used Trailers

j & J TRAILER SALES

491 NE Garden Valley Blvd.
672-344- 1

Gl LLEY
Trailer Sales

FLEETWOODS
COLUMBIA

Travel Trailers By

ARISTOCRAT
Used Trailers - Supplies
Complete Trailer Insurance

BANK FINANCING

980 NE Stephens 673-33-

(Formerly Earl smim i raiier nomesi

'IN DOUGLAS COUNTY, ORE.'culn8 n h0J- - Se,'?n 4j hL
GON, O&C: All timber dcsig-l- . SV4NEV,. SEW Section

for cutting on NV4, EV4- - V4SWV4 Section 8; W4jNWV4
SEV. Sec. 11, T. 33 S., R. 7 W.,Section 9; and WV&NEli.NE'.- -

will Mer, estimated tor tne pur- -
nose of this sale to be 2.614 M
bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 7 M bd. ft.
ponderosa pine, 574 M bd. ft.
sugar pine, 5 M bd. ft. incense -

6:00. Show at 7:00. "King Kong vs.
Godzilla" and East ol Kllimanlaro"

Friday, Oct. II, 1963

INDIAN THEATRE Doori open at 7.00.
Wayne Wagner 7:10 to 7:30. "Law-
rence of Arabia" at 7:35 only

STARLITE DRIVE.IN Open 6:30. Show
starts at dusk. "Don't Give Uo thn
Ship" and "Rockabye Baby"

"2& .D.RI7V:E.'N,aemond6:r?ead"Sh.:d!i

..Rom?J Hlday"
TR6!oo.C,sVowDaR,'V7N-iKle- gS SS

Godzilla" and "East of Kllimanaro" '

C4VEAFDR'VEIN (Sutherlin)
nox omce opens ai 6:45. snow at 7:00.1
TheNutty Protessor" and "Auntie

BENETTA THEATRE (Wlnslon) -
tar." " "nd "The

FRI. and
6:30-Sho- at 7:00

CHARLTON HESTON
F. Nuyon-- Mimieux

in "DIAMOND HEAD"
in Color plus

GREGORY PECK
AUDREY HEPBURN

In "ROMAN HOLIDAY"

Tonight

"THE NUTTY

PROFESSOR"

Jerry Lewis

plus

"AUNTIE MAME"
Rosalind Russell

Box Office Opens at 6:45
i Show Starts ot 7:00

Thursday thru Saturday

"KING KONG vs.

GODZILLA"

plus

"EAST OF

KILIMANJARO" .

Marshall Thompson

Gates Open 6:00
Show at 7:00

Fridoy & Saturday
"FCLLOW THE

BOYS"
Connie Francis - Paula
Prentiss - Rus Tamblyn

plus
"THE TARTARS"

Orson Welles --

Victor Mature
plus

'

Color Cartoon

Coming Next Week!
Wolf Disney's

"THE SON OF
FLUBBER"

DOORS OPEN 7:00NOW "Lawrence" 7:40

BEST PICTURE
OF THE YEAR!

WlnMIt OF (jTl7tEMt f '.., TmT.

Techni-COLO-

OFAIUS11
wwALiC &.W55 j',TrC'.T OLV'I

jCt 5 JC fEPPi

.-. fw:t OMAft vs

Extra!
WAYNE WAGNER

at the Console
Niqhtlv 7:10 . 7:30

$1. 25- - $1. CO -- 50c

Knapp.

N HUNTING. trespassing or crossing
over on the Lillian Bushnell ranch on
Reston Road.

NO HUNTING" or trespassing onthe
Robertson Ranch west of Cole Road.
Emery A. Allen, Manager.

Lost and Found 12

L0ST Female German Shorthnlr, Mel- -

rose area. C. H. Parks. Rl. 3, Box 710.

msi cat, vicinity or'Rose".
burg Rural Fire Station, Garden Vollev
Rd. Anyone finding a Siamesoe cat
please phone

Help Wanted 14

rnone
WALNUT PICKERS wanted at Umpqua.,

Call M. O. Knapp, 672.361. evenings.
OPENING FOR Portland ReDort.r de.l.l

ership or motor routes In Roseburg.i

i iti , r,. i
wvwvn.

II I II r .1 HI ifnelD VYaniea llleil K

....... .,r,,TTn r.

Chain Pullers and Lumbar Handlers.i
txpenence preterreo. Must be able to
snow B wo recoro. sieaoy year

lice Weyerhaeuser Company, Spring -
!IO 10, ure.

SALESMAN
To Sell

Frigidaire Appliance
Contact Mr. West

UMPQUA VALLEY
. , , . ..

635 SE Stephens

CAREER
OPPORTUNITY

WE ARE looking for a man age 31 or:
over, who is sincere, honest, industrious
and wants to Increase his earnings. Have1
an automobile, 's willing to work In this
area of the state and know It takes
work to do It. We will train man re-

ceded. Excellent salary and bonus be
gins Immediately. Must work five lull
days a week, dome on weekends In

reply state your past employment, your
age and telephone number. Writs Pen
sonnel Box .1594, Portland, Ore.

AUTOMOBILE

WANTED
SALARY and

COMMISSION

HANSEN
CHEVROLET CO.

SAW SERVICE

SAW SHARPENING
Circular Band Chain

Handsaws Saw bar reconditioned
ALL WORK GUARANTEED

SAW SERVICE
& SUPPLY CO.

384 NE Chunnon Ave.
Near N. Saleway Market

SEPTIC TANKS SEWERS
.

AJAX sep"c 5crylce' ,,5'!?"ea
prompt service. Reasonable.

septic TANKS CLEANED. Roseburg
sanitary service, pnone,www-- ,

TOOLS - RENTALS - SERVICE

PLOW SHARPENING, welding. 2353 SW
Castle Ave. Machine Shop.

FOR RENT
McCulloch chain saws any size

McCulloch post hole auger
McCulloch stump auger

HUNT'S CHAIN SAW
Soles & Service

Garden Vly Jet. Across from MWards

TREE JURGERY
TREE TRIMMING, topping removlno. In"

sored. Free est. 459.2973, Oakland.
ATTENTION Slump removal. Call lor

tree estimates Carl Jenkins.

COOK'S TREE SERVICE
TRIMMING TOPPING REMOVING

673.7061 Roseburg

Venetian bund service
VENETIANi BLINDS

Sales & Service
SERVICE MASTER

Of Roseburg 672-460- 1

We Give S&H Gret?n Stamps

WELL DRILLING

f Water Well Drilling
Nothing down on approved credit

MOHR WELL DRILLING
Phone or Sutherlln

TuZT""EL"!"1-- ' .

WELDING
alum, welding. Motor blocks to

fry prins. Also special welding.
WINSTON CHAIN SAW

winston, ore. w$w

cedar. No bid for less man $za.- - M bd. ft. sugar pine, 128 Al bd.
00 per M bd. ft. for the Doug- - ft. incense-ceda- 101 M bd. ft.
las-fi- $14.40 per M bd. ft. for!white fir. No bid for less than
the ponderosa pine, $19.60 perS25.55 per M bd. ft. for the
ni do. xi. ior uie sugar pine,irjougias-fir- , $19.15 per M bd.
SHMD npr M hit ft fnr flip in.

V...T ....V.. - -cense-ceda- or a
price of $76,742.70, will be con
sidered. Minimum deposit with
bid $7,700.00. AU timber desifi -

, ..i,.; ,,,eHrw.
' of $ 42,SEV? Purchase priceStc. 4, SEW Sec. 5,

SEW, Lot 6 Sec. 6, NEV4, Lots'635 15 bf cr,sldued- -

,.
That upon the prayer of the plaintiff,

a dnerei. b. nun and .nl.rnt n.antmn
unto her an absolute decree of divorce
from Vu' ,he defendant; and for suchj

mv J.Vn .miii.i.1.
This summons Is served upon you bv

oubllcallon In accordance with an order
of the court made and en- -

..red on in. 30, day o. SepmbernatH nH flr.t n..KIIehaH n,nKBr IrH

ucwuc., rt.i.iM:K, yvuiun a.
RICHMOND
Attorneys lor Plolntllf '

Post Olflce Box 1265

Roseburg, Oregon

Personals

DRINKING PROBLEM? Coll Alcoholics
Anonymous, '

YOUR AETNA Life agent Is Vlnce
scnueize. lan s.-jv- or o,.bit.
contioenuai aovice may contacinr d,.0. L,"

IN DEBT!
DON't let bills cost your ob, your
credit, everything you own!
IF you are In debt beyond your abil-

ity to pay and sincerely want to get
out of debt, see BUDGET CONSULT-
ANTS and have us explain our DEBT
REDUCTION PLAN to you. One place

' to pay all bills, at a payment you
can aflord. No security, no cosign-
ers.

NOT A LOAN COMPANY

BUDGET CONSULTANTS

Licensed and Bonded
Roseburg, Oregon

Ph. 433 SE Main St.

Hunter's Attention
NO HUNTING or trespassing on the late

Charley Dysert Ranch in Lookingglass
or the Hidden Valley Ranch In Ten- -

mile. Hoyt J. Robinson.
1NO HUNTING or trespassing on

Bacon, Henry, Haines, wlnnllord, Bros-- i
zlo, LaRaut ranches in Umpqua, Wilbur,
Garden vauey area.

NO HUNTING trespassing or crossing
0VB.r ' .".""?.eJ,La" Glengary
and Roberts Mountain area

Merle H. Doerlng
Carl J. Doerlng
J. W. (Jack) Holmgren
Mrs. M. M. Cooper
Hattle L. Wilson,

Adm. M. M. Cooper estate

HEARING AIDS i

HENRY A. KIRKLAND Certified Hearing
Aid Audlologist. Service on all makes
of hearing aids. Phone 679.5074.

HEATING EQUIPMENT

COMPLETE Inst, and service of oil and
gas fired furnaces. Heat pumps and re-

frigeration. Woody's Healing,
and Refrigeration.

LANDSCAPING'TILLING-DOZIN-

PETERSON'S custom tractor work tlll -

"
Sub soiling. Leveling."",; anytime.

CUSTOM ROTOTILLING, weed and brush
.v u, IET.IHI9 aim bibuiiv. ....,
M. H. Poss.

Sprinkling System
Lawn and Field Irrlagtion

JACUZZI PUMPS
Parts Sales Service

VALLEY PUMP &
IRRIGATION SERVICE

ORNAMENTAL

WJT.."mr5ir.
FREE ESTIMATES

ROSEBURG FORGE WORKS
Res.

PAVING
. .. -: : r. ..,"rcR1 fc.me.i. m". .,w..

patios. Free estimates.

PLUMBING
'LICENSED PLUMBER. Bill Wylle, L.n

son Rd., Rt. 4, Box 1145. Cell

RADIO & TV REPAIR

Johnny's TV Service
All work Guaranteed, call 672.2454

RUBBER-STAM-

DO. CO. Ruber Stamp Supply. P.O. Box
698. Usually overnight service.

Read for Profit Use for

Results! Dial 672-332-

those Singles Who feel fhev
have been invited out of "char--
ity" do not consider them-- !

selves obliaated. and
make no effort to reciprocate.l

DEAR ABBY: A verv attranJ

"V
FRIT0 PIES
Get em at the

DAIRY QUEEN
1144 W. Harvard Y

BAMBOO HOUSE

Home of Foot Stomping, Hand

Clapping Music, Presents . . .

THE LAB0HA Trio
Borcher, Hart, Langevin

FRIDAY, OCT. 18th
9:30 PM 2:00 AM

A $neak preview of what's
in store for you

SAT., OCT. 19, 9:30-2:0- 0

i'-v-I sell the houie?

ft v Ov

iivi
Better idea would be to t I:

with ui where o constant itrean
of buyers means that you will

have a good chance for some fast
action. Call usl

DIAL 672-165- 9

Lcckev Real Estate

CSV ot 6:30

.RI-SAT-S-

Shows start at 7:00
Lookie! Looktet Lookie!

fjEnnriEHts
fun festival

for the whole Vf.
familyl

I-- 1 Br aa.

DoiftCIro
UPThai

9"

POCKA ol

BAB

paoie. .

BABY SITTING, hour or dav. mv home.

ALTERATIONS, restyling, fur, cloth coats
' vi n yuar.

SUCCESSFULLY employed businessman.
yrs. oio, aesires return to Oregon.

Pleasant, dependable, conscientious. Ex-
perienced In ALL phases of manaoe
ment; purchasing, operation, admin

sales, etc. Heavy experience In
hardline field. Small Investment pos-
sible. Anything considered. W. O. Walls,
J unver Ave. 5., Minneapolis 5, Minn.

Instruction 19
PRIVATE piano lessons. Studio at

Music. Sharon Wagner,
PRIVATE DRIVING INSTRUCTIONS

(.all
ACCORDION LESSONS Six weeks trial
wnn accordion furnished.

Piano Lessons
BEGINNERS and ADVANCED

Home Studio B40 S.E. Kana
Call Virginia Young

Loans and Finance 21
WANTED small discounted land contracts

ana equities, can eves 6734091,

Family Finance
Home Owned and Operated

Loans Up to $1500
On motor vehicles and furniture

729 SE Washington

AGRICULTURAL
LOANS

Southern Oregon
Production Credit Assn.

202 Medical Arts Bldg.
Phone 673-324- 8

SAVE

WEEKLY
So Easy This Way)

1. CONFERI Hold a family
Decide how much each of you can
save per week.

2. COMMENCE! Come on In. Get a
Signature Application Form for each
big or little saver.

3. CONTINUE! Keep on target by de
positing iixeo amounts every week.
Watch those accounts growl

DOUGLAS COUNTY
STATE BANK

6f2 SE Jackson 1

Businesses for Sale 22
FRblGHT AGENCY, apt., 1400 sq. ft.

business area, on Hwy 99, In town.
$7900. Phone 6798442.

FOR SALE Immediately Blacksmith
snop. Nice terming community, write
Carl Flagle, Rt. 1, Wilder, Idaho.

MIDDLE AGED MAN
TO CONTRACT for News
It e view Motor Route Carrie-c- r.

Should live in Roseburg
area. Contact A. Fuller
Johnson, circulation mgr..
News Review,

REVENUE PRODUCERS

HERE'S AN OPPORTUNITY to
go Into buitness tor yourself
with the acquisition of one of two
trouble-tree- , laun-

dry One has 22
washers, 7 dryers, end 4 dry
cleaners; the other, 18 washers
6 dryers. Equipment is 3 lo 4
yrs old, runs on gas (even cheap-
er now that natural gas Is here.)
All this equipment (plus hot wa-
ter system and change machino)
and lease tor these two

BUSINESS-
ES ere for tele at 8 reasonable
$9,000 each, $3500 down, bal. to
be worked out. Call Lackey Real
Estate now and let one of his
salesmen give you more details
to help you into business for
yourself.

LACKEY REAL ESTATE
368 SE Jackson

FOR SALE
4 DUPLEXES

ALL OCCUPIED
2 bedrooms, close in.

Monthly income $560 per month.
Priced to sell. A Good invest
ment for anyone able to person-all-

supervise. See

GERRETSEN
Building Supply
PHONE

1 & 2, NEV.SEW Sec. 7, NEW- -

NEW, SEWNEW, SWWNWW,
S'A Sec. 8, SWWSWW, NWW-NW-

Sec. 9, T. 32 S., R. 9 W.,
Will Mer, estimated foi the pur-
pose of this sale to be 5,266 M

bd ft. Douglas-fir- , 106 M bd. ft.
sugar pine, 10 M bd. ft. incense-ceda-

57 M bd. ft. western
hemlock. No bid for less than
$24.20 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas-fir- , $24.25 per M bd. ft.'
for the sugar pine, S6.70 per
M bd. ft. for the incense-cedar- ,

$12.05 per M bd. ft. for the
western hemlock, or a total pur- -

chase price of $130,761.55, will
be considered. Minimum deposit
with hid $13,100.00. All timber
designated for cutting on Lots
1 & 2, SVSNEW, NEWSEW Sec.
3, T. 33 S., R. 5 W., Will Mer,
estimated for the purpose of
this sale to be 104 M bd. ft.
Douglas-fir- , 6 M bd. ft. incense-ceda-

No bid for less than $30.-8-

per M bd. ft. for the Dougla-

s-fir, $13.30 pcr M bd. ft. for
the incense-ceda- nr a total
purchase price of $3,283.00, will
he considerfd. Minimum de- -

nn.lt ivilh 11H

i

SHIRLENE
BRAZIE'S

FOOD FOR
THOUGHT

The ability to carve is more
than an art; it is a necessity
for everyone who is a lover of

good food, a beautifully carved
roast looks better but the gour--

met claims that looks don't mat- -

ter as long as the flavor is
there. . . .that the taste IS the
thine. Correctly carved meat
(t.c Kattot- - A Cuirl Mrvnr

rf-L-
f if,"i"gS,l,atr,P,t

letting as little as possible run
nnln tho nlattor Thic ic tho roa.
son why certain cuts of meat
are carveo one way wnue oin -

ers are carved another. When
in doubt, always carve with the
least amount of loss of juice

For Fine Feed and Fast
Service, dine at . . .

THE TIMBER GRILL
732 S.E. Can 9

ing ai aner 5 p.m. ,AAsrvwfvslv
CABINETS, patio, carports. Remodeling.) UACOMDY WADhf

No ob too small. Reasonable rates. No 'wr:Jli.Vw?!l
bus. Sundays. Ph. after 4 p.mv MASONRY, fireplaces, veneer, stone,:

block. Free est. Calvin Mergel,
REMODELING

HOUSE LEVELING, now foundations, ORNAMENTAL IRON SERVICE
garages, carports. Free ESI. ioo o fi

nancing. Gunter Construction

"
CHILD CAREj

KAntinpr Gcvkp iNursery
. vw.WWv

ELECTRICAL WORK
g l ectr ic h eat ing syst EMScfeanei

cnecked and repaired. Reasonable prlc- -

es. All work guaranteed. Call PETE or
ED at Trnwhrirta. Pltrif SERVICE
UrOT ri..Ol

Fi EQUIPMENT
FIRE EXTINGUISHER

Sales and Service

n!5 ,,6,??, w.nl:t)y!e.rn on n n

GARDEN Eouh MENT

SMALL AIR COOLED ENGINES
Jacobson Mowers e Tillers

Briggs & Stratton Clinton
Lauson Pover Product. Wisconsin, Etc.

Le Bleu Motors
,1 319 S.E. Jacxson


