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CLASSIFIED

SECTION

Loans and Finance 21 !

WANTED small oiscounted land contracts
and oovHioi. Call or ees

"
Family Finance

Horn Cw,M antf Operated
Lorni L'p 10 S1S0C

On not or vehicle and rurnlturt
7 SE Washington

I : i I. I

iiveb.uK Luani
Southern Oregon

PRODUCTION CREDIT ASSN
202 Medical Arts Bltlg.

Phone 673-324- 8

SAVE

WEEKLY
So Easy This 123 Way!

TIMBER FOR SALE, I'NITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OK THE,
INTERIOR. BUREAU OF LAND fee
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
flS hereinafter desienated will h.
received by the District Manager.

,Blreau of Land Management, 2583
nest Harvard Avenue, Roseburg,

'Oregon at 9:00 A.M., PACIFIC
DAYLIGHT SAVING TIME, on
Friday, August 9, 1963 for all tim-- !
ner niarKed or designated for cut--

unc, Beiore bids ar stihmiHfv. las
""formation concerning the!

HmhAl. ,.ia ,.:,; jii""-"- - iummiuuj ui ..-- aim ,isubmission of bids should be ob- -

lred ,ro tl,e above Dislril'
Manager. The right is hereby re- -

served to waive technical defects the.. .

u.r.iuscuiciii, aim lo I e- -

mcnt No. with Kenneth and
Hallie Eord. No preset road use

has been determined, (b) by
Government controlled road. A

maintenance fee of S49.67 will be
required, (c) By Public Road. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY. OREGON:
O&C: All limber designated for
cutting on: W. W'jV'jY'.-..SE.i- ,

Sec. 17 T. 23 S., R. 4 W W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be: 2S53 M bd.ft. Doug- -

- fir. 4S M hd ft Western Hod- -

cedar, 12 M bd.ft. White Fir. 30
ua . . nmi..i- - x.u.ti. ursin u iiriiuuvn, i .i

bd.ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for
less ,han 518 10 M " for ,he i

Douglas-fir- , $7.45 per M bd.ft. for
Western Redcedar. S4.60 .ner M..... . -

uu.ll. llir Ule K niie Mr. 51U.75 per I

.Minimum deposit with bid: $5.300
00. Access to the sale area is avail--
able: (a) Under the terms and
conditions of Agree- - .

ment No. 670 with Mt. Baldy Lum-- I

ber Co. A fee of SO 15 tier M hd ft
is cited anionc niher ennditinns

irh 1'n.t-.-- . n... .....i n..,i.

old Boucock. A fee of $0.32 per
M bd.ft. is cited amone other con- -

trolled mart A fno
$30.20 will be chanted, and (di

Public nnnrt iv nniint as

Personals 71

YOUR AEtno Lite agent is Vinci Sctiuttie.
Call or Ret.

no ink pqqbiPwj Call Aicohol.ei Aral

.onymoui. ..
lUUtu vylwci 01 any iim neroinj mhi- -

fiaential advice may contact Catholic Char
iiies, 271 W. Broadway, Eugene, Oiegotv
Diamond JOMl

Notices 11!
will not be responsible tor any deOti other!
than my oyi. Johnny Lee Counts-

TwiLL not be responsible lor debit other
than my own. Lester FlOei.

Lost and Found 12

Help Wanted 14

CARRIER ROUTES open In Roseburg, Win-
ston. Suthertiri rt - Th Pnrll.inH

i anv or an mas. ine Lnuca .11 Da. it. lor the western Hemlock.
States reserves the right to waive! $7.55 per M bd.ft. for the Incense
any informality in bids received Cedar, or a total purchase pricewhenever such waiver is in the 'of $52,948.40 will be considered.

1. CONFERI Hold a family pow.ow. Oe- Bdrm. toll., furnished or unfurn.
how much each ot you can save ter and oarb. serv. provided also heat

per Meet.. in some. Rents trom S70 up.
SW.MM.NG POOL

?. COMMENCE, Come on In. Ge, a Sign..
twre Apphcation Form for each big or Terrace Apts., gas eoupoed 67MM4
i.m Winchester CI., Hot water heat

--fjufls County Court solicit! prppo&als J
tor the removal ot aoariconea

3g id v Ma intenance tx. toi rg toe aig If
,3es east 0 Canvonville on Tuier Trait
Jjna at St. Johns Creek. Frame building

removed from "ine prem.Ms and area
" ' nViSlX1 SL'--

I "P"0'?
erves irte rigni to relect " ,HZ

f DOUGLAS COUNTY COURT
By EARL PLUVMER
Executive Assistant

ed July 23.

I NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
I NOT iCE IS HEREBY GIVEN that tw-

fv!ittitlZ nm 5? jSTtti at i00'

fjxjr or iv:w g ciock a.m.. as tha time, and
Coortrcm A' of me Doooias Coontyi

S'S Vgu'STSiZEtfSli
iai Account ot in Aomimstrator Herein.

Dated and first published the 2itn dayi June. ioj. :

HALLIE HENNING, Aoministrator

j ot the Estate ot ALFREO
I tsKuwn , Deceased.

JAYNE 1 MURPHYSrULTS. at Law
4t S E. Main Street

ciepurg. urcgon

File No. 7M
NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

(N THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE
or-- ukcuui run uuuciLAS COUNTY

a irrooaie ueparimenllit THE MATTER OF THE ESTATE ...
LOSSIE O. CARSTENSi Deceased. )
Notice Is hereby oiven that Monday, th

n.rccttXJrh the oouoias county Courthouse, Roseburo.
IJresc-n- . has been fixed as the lime and

.riT' .kI' " "VJL
estate of Flossie O. Carslens. deceased,

4o.v pending In said Court.
' !' PUD"!BM "", ",h davjuiy" ..

william a car st ens.
Executor of the Estate of
FLOSSIE O. CARSTENS, Deceased,JIT

call for bids for insurance
Sealed bids will be received bv the under- -

i qitcd up to 7:30 o'clock p.m. on Monday,
ine 29th day of July, 1963, for general -
aunny insurance coverage and collision cov- -

rane tor ine city ot Winston in the sum ot
liDO.000 and $200,000 personal liability. S25.O0O

roper ty dnmage covering the City's policetat, pickup truck, and dump truck, and $100

interest of the United States. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON:
O&C: All timber designated for
cutting on: Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6,
7, 8, 9, 11, 12, 13, Sec. 23, Lots 4,
5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11. 12, Sec. ?7,
All of See. 35, T. 25 S., R. 4 W.,
W.M.. Itts 0 10. 1? I.'l 14

- ,,8i, Sec;. ,9;T-t- of Somidetailcd Agreement'
W.M., for the No. 710 with Jeanette and Har- -

. t if ri I
luOOIle alOme 1 STriS 31

LOVELY SECLUDED
Space tor up to at)

"THE WILLOWS" -

Mobile Homes 32!
I9W 1050 Fleetwood lor sale or trade.

Pti. 673 5636 after 4 p.m.
$3000 'equity in I960 10x55 Kit trade tor"older

Clear trailer. Call 459 2166 alter 4 pm.
x 10 New Moon, with washer and dryer.

Maka Oiler.
'59 "10x50 HENSi.EE." 2 BR. ii300. consider

Older pickup as oarl Oowtv 473 (774.

REX trailer, excellent condition. 7 large
rooms buitt on. all removable. Call alter
5 P Tl,

E 2 AWN
SILVERTOP

LEADING names in mobile home awnings.
YES WE CAN FINANCE!

Town 1 Country Mobil Park

"giTley."
Trailer Seles

FLEETWOODS
10 Wide 42 to 60 ft. long
Troilmaster Travel Trailers

By Roadma-.le- r

USED TRAILERS - SUPPLIES

Complete Trailer Insurance
BANK FINANCING

1980 NE Stephens 673-335- 6

(Formerly Earl Smllh Trailer Homes)

ANGELUS

Great Lakes
Traveleze

New and Used Trailers

) Cr J TRAILER SALES

491 NE Garden Valley Blvd.

672-344- 1

Sell tfuv Rn Hint
To Pioce Your Ad Dial OA

REYNOLDS
806 SE Cass

Real

Reporter. Henry Sherlock,, dealer, SE Jacksun
SCHOOL BUS DRIVERS WANTED Men or

women. Contact. In person, Luther Ellison,! n f OO
corner Fuller Ion and Houck St.. Monday DUSllieSS UpPOrtUnitieS LL
or Tuesday, noon.

purpose of this sale to be: 12.--

27B 11 bd.ft. Douglas-fir- , 270 M

bd.ft. Western Redcedar. 557 Mlditinn. fpt Rv nnvprnint-n- l ran.

r'ri . A,,,,nT. . ... . .ifj.l llf.l n f

CLEAN 3 room furnished Apt. Water and
gartuoo paid. U7 p,ne St.

3 RW. turn, apt- - water and garbage paid.
carder vaiiev Blvd. at 1433 Nrt Fairmount

3 ROOM turn apt. Heat, water, garbage serv.
Inc. Adults. alter s P M.

FURNiSHEO'APTS , ADULTS ONLY. 40 and
SSO montniy. Close convenient location.
4, S E. Brocfcway Ave. 672.9C3,.

NEW 3 bedroom WeilsloVapt. Partlv'"rurn
istted. Heal, water, garbage serv. SII3.
Phono

COMPLETELY FURNISHED
Beautiful lb wide mobile homes comparable

55

in tlie to most apti., yet the convenience ot

a private vara, and parking adjoining trail-

er Also smaller trailer! available. Timber
Town Trait' Park. Nit) KB Stephens.

673-850- 6

TODD APARTMENTS

Westvue Ct., W. dryer
OaKlnill Apts. Radlanl Hejl

Rooms for Rent 27
CLEAN furnished housekeeping room. 135

mo. 151 SE Short St.
LIGHT HOUSEKEEPING and steeping rooms.

Reasonable. Phone 51.
NEW ROOAf.S lr.liKftng telephone and inert

servlco $60 per month and up Hotel
Umpqua,

Room and Board 28
HOME ANO CAR for elderly people. Nice

rooms. 5 miles south.
ROOM and board, lunches packed. WO per

month. Call
ELDERLY or Invalid care, shared or private

room. Modern home. Phone Box
788. Mvrtte Creek. Ore.

Houses for Rent 29
TWO BEDROOM furnished home, SIOO. 742

S ELChadwick.
THREE BEDROOM HOUSE

Ph.
THREE BEDROOM house, 'tS" mo230

Castle Avenue still available.
THREE BEDROOM house, 185

PH.
SMALL, clean 3 bedroom, unfurnished house.

S65. 296 Hall St. No pets, no Sunday calls.
TWO bedroom duplex, garage, yard. .

Phone
FURNISHED ) bedroom duplex near store.

Clean, nulet, reaeonabl. Adults.
TNE TO FOi.R Bdrm homes for families

or single elderly.
twcTBEOROOM house, furnished, Clover-dal-

disl. See at 1656 NE Jacobsen.
UNFURNISHED 3 bedroom house. E1ec. hent

carport, adults preferred. 1019 SE Roberts
FURNiSHro cabin." Weekly ratetT'iaiC N.E.

Stephens. Pacific Mole!
SMALL HOUSED 5" miles west of Glide.

Phone
ONE BEDROOM duplex, $45 mo." Furnished.

Phone
ONE bedroom unlurnlshed house, $35,

with slove and refrigerator 140.

NICE unfurnished bedroom duplex, close
Newly decorated. Phone

TWO BEDROOM home, large lot. N. E. Vine
Clean S75. Ph.

ONE BEDROOM partly furnished house. Wa
ter and garbage paid. S47. call

FURNISHED cabin, large Iron! room, kll- -

chen, bath, V, laundry service, aouii.
S45 month. Trailer Court.

FURN. t and 2 bedroom cabins. Water and
garbage disposal turn. WOS60.
248S Diamond Lake Blvd.

WESTS1DE duplex, close to Marks, bed
room, tile bnlh, utmiy room, controlled
heal. Range In. Newly decorated. $65. Call
evenings

TWO BEDROOM, new duplex, lull base

E .flpQucTiD.e collision, coverage on the City's
vehicles which consist ot a pickups Sruck and a Ford police car and for general

iv liabillly insurance coverage for the City in
; j'e same amounts not Involving the oper--

a ion ot motor vehicles.i Further details and information as to said

S igned. The city council reserves m. rfont

OFFICES IN BEND & ROSEBURG

3. CONTINUE! Keep on target bv deposit-
ing fixed amounts every wec. Watch
those accounts grow!

DOUGLAS COUNTY
STATE BANK

FOR SALE OR TRADE Store and attached
living quarters. Phone

BUY from owner choice business Ids,
lOO'xIOa', Close In.

SMALL RESTAURANT good location, do-

ing excellent business. For Information
phone

FOR SALE Used furniture and appliance
store, doing good business. Good location.
Slock, lease, business. Priced righl. Write

Box 682.

TIME Oil dlstrlbulorship"and" "cut rate sta-

tion tor sale or lease. Ideal lor partner-
ship. Delivery truck needed. Will assist In

establishing wholesale gasoline, healing oil

routes. 347 Garden Valley Road, or phone

'
Auto Trim & Upholstery Shop

Well known lor custom work and furniture
designing. Apl. Plus rental. Serving 5 ca
lots 2 lurniture stores. Grossing over
$17,000 yearly. Call

Investigate Before You Invest!
OUR NATIONAL clients are seeking qualified

men now. A Protile can assure you success
In your own business. Write tor free list ol
current opportunities. Reply to: PARTAKE
OF SOUTHERN OREGON. Box 677, The

Commercial Rentals 24
COMMERCIAL RENTAL. 345 S.

Approx. 16x55. $S0 month. Owner,
FOR LEASE equipped restaurant In

Oakland. Phone-
FOR RENT

SMALL SHOP IN SOUTHGATI;
W. Mellger

vVanted to Rent 25
LOCAL executive of national firm needs a

3 or 4 bedroom home. day or night,
WANTED to rent 3 bedroom home. In Green

School Dist. Have reterences. Call
TEACHER" Coach Roseburg High desires

nice two or 3 bedroom home. Relerences.
Call collect alter 6 p.m. Monmouth

THREE
' or more bedroom house, large lot,

References. No children or pels. Write
Box 684.

THREE or tour bedroom home In good con
dition, preferably on Westsido. No small
children. Inquire al the Coast lo Coast
Store. Gene Ockcri, Pn. i

family of 4 wishes to rent 3 bedroom
house by Sept. 1. 590 to H0. References.
Write lo Carl Williamson, PO Box 420,

The Dalles, Ore.

Dept. Of Agriculture" Employe
WANT S Id lease with or without op ion,
bedroom home with barn and large or small
acreage. Roseburg area or north. Need pos
session immeaiaieiy. musr rooionouie,
Phone Yoncana vi

Apartments For Rent. 26
UNFURN SHt D 2 Bdrm apt. Slove. relria

water, gorbsgu service furnished.

NICE (urn. large Mr. Also 2 bdr. Car.
port. Near Wards. Week or nionlh.

VERY nice furnished apt. 2 bedrooms, car
port. Couple only. IJJ 5. t. uougm.

FURNISHED APT," garbage and wale? Inc.

Inq. at 1303 SE Pine Apl. 7. 473 J73.
UNFURNISHED l' room apt. Adults only.

Waler and garbage serv paid. US. 21J3

NE Klamath, call
NEWLY rcdecoralod 2 BR apt., ground

floor. Slove, relrig., water and garb. turn.
Call Or eves.

(ATTRACTIVE redecorated i bfidroo'm "apis",
ulnrlrlr hent. nil utllilies furnished. Priced
tram Mb to SBO. 2Q17 W H.irvfird

SUTHERLIN UNION GAP APTS. 2 bdm. SS0.

t bdm. S40 mo. Furn. Including wnler and
nlnr 1nlht?rll(, or

NICE 3 room duplex only tor elderly couple,
man nr wnmxn Buna, relrloerator. oil

heater. Water and rjnrbage service paid.

NEW 14 Karat Apis. Winchester SI.
tuun Karlrnrtm. liuinn rrwim. waII In WAll car

pels. Slove. refrigerator furnished. Lots ot

,toraae oace. Free use of

Pat.o and yards for some apts. Water
and garbage disposal free. Call

Kohlhagen Apts.
Mr oci 1, reasonable rent

Jacksjn SI at Lant Ave.
ADULTS

"A Goon Place To Live"

AAA-- COMPANY now hiring in Roseburg
area, no experience necessary, vve wUI
train you. Must be able to start work im
mediately. Phone

nCID r aniea MCll 13
WANTED experienced diesel log truck drlv

er. can
LOGGING and road" building cat driver lor

Iftle model D8. Steady work. Ph.
alter 7 p.m.

FAMILY man to seil FullerBrush Products.
On part time basis, or full lime.
alter 7 p.m.

COMBINATION-WELDE-
R,

BPO'y"in person
Valley Welding a. Machine, 1790 NE Steph-
ens. Phone

COMPANY has openingln olllce"toryoung
man some experience preferred. Write

Box 6S3.

WANTED Bureau certified iumberorader.
with sfud chain experience. Call
or

EXPERlENCEDlTvestockman'"'to "workat
auction. Pcfer single man. Trailer house
furnished. Contact Tom Flndlay, Douglas!
Livestock Market. Wilbur. Ph. or

FIREFIGHTER
HIGH SCHOOL graduate or equivalent. Sal-- !

ary range $383 to $463 per month. Deadline
tor app.ications is August 15. Selection made
by test and oral interview. Apply City Fire
uepi.. Mr. aeirjoia, hire cruet.

ASSISTANT MANAGER
For Sherwin Williams Paints

Must be 21 or over. Call for an
appointment. 518 SE Jackson.

Phone 672-352- 8

WANTED!
fllVlU K A Cff I A K. I I

UlNL YlL.l lINI.i
and

ONE BODY MAN
HANSEN CHEVROLET

-- ': Wanted 17

RECEPTIONIST, PBX operator, general of
lice, sec. 15 years exp. Call

JUNIOR ACCOUNTANT years experience
Call SutiwJin

HEAVY equipment and diesel mechanic, also
operator.

IRONING", pickup and deliver
Ph.

IRONING 90c hour. Pickup, deliver. Call
before 12 or after S p.m.

ALTERATIONS, restyling, tur,"ctofh "coati
suits, dresses. Work guaranteed.

CARPENTER WORK Painting or Qenera
repair Call

CARPENTER WORK AND REPAIRS
C. M. Hatlield.

DEPENDABLE college" qirl wishes" live In

housekeeping and or baby silting position.
Ph.

Instruction 10

PRIVATE DRIVING INSTRUCTIONS

Loans and Finance 21

SMALL, furnlstied apt MO month. Sheridan
and Mosher St.

LOANS
AUTO, furniture, salary, etc. Wally Smith,

mtyr. LAURENT IDE FINANCE. 813 SE

Oak, phone

REACH RIGHT HOME to

prospects for things you'd
like to sell or buy. Phone a
Classified Ad to OR

Mobile Homes 32
VACATION TRAILERS FOR RENT

Sutherlln 4393133

I9S ALOHA CAMPER', sala or" trade for
small trailer. Call 7?.M44.

VAN DYKE
SIXTY FEET of spacious rnobila home hv

Ing now on display. T to and i bedrooms
with private dining room.

TOWN COUNTRY MOBILE PARK
3777 N.W. Mulholland 672151

TIRED
of your present trailer?

NEED
more space?

WANT
to your dollar?

SEE
the new expando

DETROITER
wllh bay window, complete

, with awning

ONLY $6490
DRIVE OUT TO

RAINBOW
Trailer Sales
RELIABLE TOWING

WINCHESTER, ORE.
CALL 673-727- 2

Real Estate 34

FOP SALE BY OWNER S room house,
957 SE Pine SI. Roseburg. Ore

FIVE rooms, retlnlshed, parity furnished.
Just out of city. $5,995, 471 N. E. Russell.

WESTSIDE 3 bedroom home, fireplace, car-- I

pcted, diapes, lots ot storage. Landscaped,
large covered pallo. $13,700. Ph.

and BAUER
Phone 672--1 41 3

Estate

Lou Uiissett
II. J. H lie
(i. V. Reynolds

Eurlc Soudun, Days Cr.

mm

RADIO 1 TV REPAIR

ZENITH
Sales & Seivice

liihiMiitecd work on all makes

FREE TUBE TESTING
25M W. Hurvard Ave.

SEPTIC TANKS SEWERS

AfAX Septic Service. tnl cleaned. Porrpf
Reasonable. 673B47..

SCPTIC TANKS CLEANED Roieburg ..Hi-

lary Service. Phone

SAW SERVICE

SAW SHARPENING
Circular band - Chain

hanci-ivi- - Saw bar Honed
Ail WOPK OU ARAN 1 1 D

SAW SERVICE
& Supply Co.

381 NB Channun Ave.
.'tear ti Saieway Market

TOOLS - RENTALS SERVICE

PLOW SHARPENING, welding 7333 5'

Cavlle Ave. WdChi.tc Shop. 473

j FOR RENT
McCulloch chaii awl nv U9

McCulioch poji hole auger
Mcculloch ilump auaer

HUNT'S CHAIN SAW
Sales & Service 672-127- 2

Garden vaney Jet - Across fioni l

IOR RENT

CAR TOP TRUNKS
j Going ort vac t too Treie all metal lock

trunM til all cart, (even foreign carst
Ratet by oay, week or montn.

LANSING & OLIVER

DELIGHTFULLY YOURS
THIS C1.0SU1N suburban home has everything to warm the
heart of tlie most iliscriininalinu home-seeke- r l'ii aercs, 3

nice bedrooms, lovely livini! mom, separate dining room,
1 and baths, fireplace. Double garage. There's huppy liv-

ing in this well built home. $17,800, 10 per cent down.

600 ACRES PERMANENT PASTURE
ALMOST ALL seeded and cleared and about 15 acres of

young timber. Hood fences and plenty ot water. Ample bot-

tom ground for hay. 2 bedroom home anil 1 barns. This is
a good stock ranch. $50,000, $14,000 down.

GREEN DISTRICT
GOOD RETIREMENT HOME

2 UKDHOUMS, built-i- n appliances in kitchen, hard wo u iloori.
An extra building on this 80 X 100 ft. lot that could be im-

proved for a rental. Owner will take car or what have you
for part of down payment, $7500 full price.

4 Bedroom Home
OX 2 ACHES. 7 miles to Hoseburg on black lop road. City
water plus well for irrigation. Uarn, work .shop, fruit room
and storage spucv. $10,000, $1500 down.

ment, Watklnq distance lo town. 867 Flint.
St. S100 per monlh. Ted Smallt Real Estate.

bd.ft. White Fir. 310 M bd.ft. Pon- -

dorosa Pine. 1 M bd.ft. Sugar PineJ of
(17 M bd.ft. Western Hemlock. 884 Rv

l h,l ft lnnAnPA il v
for less than $14.45le per Mit'tbd.ft. for
ihe Douulas-fir- . S4.50 per M bd.ft.
for the Western Redcedar, S3. 10 per T.
M M il. for the White Fir. S17.25

per M bd.ft. for the Ponderosa
Pine, $22.80 per M bd.ft. for the
Sugar Pine, S7.40 per M bd.ft. for
the Western Hemlock, S4.30 per M

bd.ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a

total purchase price of S189, 137.20

will be considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid: S19.000.00 Access
to the sale area is available: (a)
Ij ndcr the terms and conditions of ft.
Caseinem 10. aim

wi,h Chaunccy G. and Lau- -

ia E. Hunt. No fee., (b) Under the
terms and conditions of Easement
Nos. and with
Sidney and Thora J. Lciken. No

fee., (c) Under the terms and con-

ditions of Easement No.
with Leo 11. and Louise Beckley.
No fee., (d) Under the terms and
conditions of Easement No.

with Maggie Departicr
No fee., (e) Under the

terms and conditions of Easement
No. with Richard L. and
Josephine Carr. No. lee. IN DOUG-

LAS COUNTY, OREGON: O&C: T.
All timber designated for cutting ed
Oil! NW'lSW'a , Sec. 4, IV. a. PU
V'i, Sec. 9, WMlNWW, Sec. 10,

Sec. 15, T. 25 S., R. 1 W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose
of this sale to he: 8025 M bd.ft
Douglas-fir- , 340 M bd.ft. Western
Redcedar. 371 M Del. It. sugar Pine,
1034 M bd.ft. Western Hemlock. 51

M bd.ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for
less than $15.30 per M bd.ft. for
the Douglas-fir- , $5.15 per M bd.ft.
for the Western Redcedar, S28.G5

per M bd.ft. for the Sugar Pine.
S8.25 per M bd.ft. for the Western
Hemlock, S5.25 per M bd.ft. for the
Incense Cedar, or a total purchase
price of S153.140.90 will Xic. consid-
ered. Minimum deposit with bid:
$15,400.00. Access to the sale area
is available: (a) Under the terms
and conditions of Easement No.

with National Plywood,
Inc. No fee., (b) Under the terms
and conditions of Agreement
with U. S. Plywood Corp. A main-

tenance fee of $0.03 M payable
prior to the removal of timber
and a road use fee of S947.87 is

ciled among oilier conditions, (cl
Under the terms and conditions of

Agreement with Evans Prod-- i

nets Co. No fee., and (d) By Can
ton Creek Access Road. A road
maintenance fee of $0.7011 and a

maintenance fee of S0.22M will
be charged. If the Purchaser elects
to use the Rock Creek Access
Road an additional maintenance
fee will he charged. IN DOUG- -

LAS COUNTY, OREGON O&C:
All timber designated for cutting

SW"4NEi. SEHNW'i. Lot :i

(SW'jNWU), EMiSW'i, Lois 12 It;
13 (W'sSW'il. Sec. 19, T. 23 5., R.
4 W., SE'i. Sec. 13, T.
23 S., R. 5 W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to he:
4026 M bd.ft. Douglas-fir- . "3 M

bd.ft. Western Itedeedar. 301 M

bd.ft. While Fir. 82 M bd.fl. West-

ern Hemlock, 61 M bd.ft. Incense
Cedar. 1 M bd.fl. Ponderosa Pine.
No bid for less than $18.35 per M

bd.ft. for Ihe Douglas-fir- . $8.10 per
M bd.fl. for the Western Redcedar.
$5 10 per M bd.ft. for the White

Fir. S10.30 per M bd.ft. for the

Western Hemlock. $8.05 per M bd.
ft for the Incense Leoar. si.i.bu

per M bd.ft. for the Ponderosa
Pinn flf a totfl DUt'CliaSC PHIC
$77 354 9t will be considered, Min-- -

in.;. m r,.mM
Access to tlie sale area is a ail-

d i.ifl. (ai fnder tllO terillS and

conditions',. of Lascment Y U. IM'.H.

331 'itll Ko" and Eva l)odl and
'

uv In(rr (he terms and
Vn

COnuUHMls vi nuin'1"-"- "

with Ml. Baldy Lumber Co. A fee

nf to l.s ner, M bd.n. is cuco
nmnnf ot lPf COIldltlOnS. tC) 111

dor the terms aim coniuuuna n

Agreement No. with Harold

h and Jeanetle H. Boucock A fee

of SO 39 por M bd.ft is cited

among other conditions, idi By

Goernment controlled road, A

maintenance feo of S26 .fi: is cited,
e Bv Public Road IN HOI (.

"S COUNTY. OKKGON: O&C:

All timber designated for cutting
on: Lots 1. 2. S'::NE Lot 3.

SK'NV4. SW. Sec. 3, Nr.1. bee.
9 T 25 S., R. 7 W.( W.M., esti
mated fr the purpose of this sale,
to he 4150 M bd.ft. Douglas-fir- .

19 M bd ft Western Redcedar. WW

M N1 ft. White Fir. 51 M bd.ft.

Western Hemlock, K18 M bd ft In

fVriar. NO Dia lor W umii

31

'
- r ' bd.ft. for the Doug

las flT. S5 .tO per M bd ft fnr the

Luy.M 3 . unutuA: viccl.: n I I

timber designated for cutting on
E!2. NEVjNWU. SEvaSVYtt, See. ,

22 S., R. 4 W., W.M., estimat-
ed for the purpose of this sale to be
2481 M bd.ft. Douglas-fir- , 480 M

bd.ft. White Kir. IB M bd.ft. West
ern Hemlock, 14 M bd.ft. Western
Redcedar, 301 M bd.ft. Incense Ce
dar. No bid for less than $21.85
per M bd.ft. for the Douglas-fir- ,

S7.35 per M bd.ft. for the White
Fir, S13.70 per M bd.ft. for the
Western Hemlock, $10.60 per M bd.

for the Western Redcedar, $11.-4- 0

per XI bd.ft. for the Incense Ce
dar, or a total purchase price of
$61,580.95 will be considered. Mini-

mum deposit with bid: $6,200.00.
Access to the sale area is avail-
able: (a) Under the terms and
conditions of Arbitration Agree-
ment No. It 51 with Mountainside
Lumber Co. No preset fee has
been determined, (b) By Govern-
ment controlled road. A mainten-
ance fee of $131.02 will be charged,
and (c) Bv Public Road. IN DOUG-

LAS COUNTY, OREGON: O&C:
All timber designated for cutting
on: EViSWKi. Sec. 5,

28 S.. R. 4 W., W.M., estimat
for tlie purpose of this sale to

be: 317 M bd.ft. Douglas-fir- . 7 M

bd.ft. Grand Fir, 8 M bd.ft. In--

cense Cedar. No bid for less
than S20.50 per M bd.ft. for the
Douglas-fir- . S4.65 per M bd.ft. for
the Grand Fir. $9.30 per M bd.ft.
for the Incense Cedar, or a total
purchase price of $6,605.45 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid: $700.00. Access to the sale
area is available: (a) across the
NV, of Sec. 8, T. 28 S., R. 4 W.,
under the terms and conditions of

Agreement No. with Long-vie-

Fibre Company. A fee of

$0.40 per M bd.ft. is cited among
other conditions, (b) access from
the county road across the N'j.
NV4SEV4, SWV4SEV4, Sec. 5, T. 28

S., R. 4 W.. W.M., must be provid-
ed by Ihe Purchaser, and (c) By
Public Road.

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING

DIAL 672-332- 1

CASH RATES

A(i'ft:i.n FOf Pusnips; Vi.tri.n Roittuij
Trade Aea

Cord of Thanks S2.00
rate 2 lines SI. 00
rote 2 lines $2.00
rote 2 lines $2.75
rate 2 lines $6.00

I Day rats 3 lines $1.50
rats 3 lines $2.75
rale 3 lines S3. 75
rate 3 lines $8.00

CREDIT
AbOY rates suhie-- t to 50 cents

s'lv.c charge for tieou

DEADLINES

fn:-- Party r.ttrt.iif 2 '. tn "tor to

t lo classify. t or reiect ,nf classified
Aj Copt.

ADJUSTMENTS
If tout appears tncone:lly,
notify us itr.mecidtely. We aill not oe

lor mo'e Man tit t msettion.
Such responsibility is limitcl to , correct
insertion ot adverl'Stmenl
RetuBtl Will Nit Ge Keif Mir, Tun u Days

CLASSIFIED INDEX

AIRCRAPT .

APARTMENTS FOR RENT 36

AUCTIONS
AUTO INSURANCE '
AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE 7

AUTOMOTIVE WANTED
AUTOS FOR SALE 11

AUTO TRUCK PARTS . 7S

BOATS ANO VOTORS SS

MATERIALS 41

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES 77

BUSINESS PERSONALS
CARD OF THANKS S

COMMERCIAL RENTALS 34

EXCHANGE RF L ESTATE 2!

FARM EQUIPMENT 7C

FARMS AND RANCHES . 36
FLORISTS
FUEL
MAY AND GRAIN ...... 61

HEAVY EQUIPMENT 73

HELP WANTED 14

HELP WANTED MEN IS
HELP WANTED VvOMEN 16
HOUSCS FUR RENT ... 29
HUNTERS ATTENTION
INCO'E PROPERTY V
INSTRUCTION
LIVESTOCK
LOANS AND FINANCE 31

LOGGING EQUIPMENT 7ai

LOST AND FOUND . 13
LOTS AND ACREAGES ... 3S

MARKET BASKET 57
MISCELLANEOUS FOR SALE 45
MISCELLANEOUS RENTALS 33
MISCELLANEOUS AANTED ..
MOBILE HO'E PARKS 31
MOBILE HOMES ti
MOBILE HOMES FOR RENT ..
MOTORCYCLES 77
MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS V)

NOTICES II
CPPtCE EQUIPMENT 5'
PERSONALS 7

PET5 AND PET SUPPLIES 7

POULTRV AND RABBITS t
POAER Sw..S ... 71

PEAL ESTATE 34
REAL ESTATE WANTED 3J
ROOM AND BOARD ?
ROOMS FOR RENT .... 77

STOCK
SPORTING GOODS . 11
TIMBER AND SAWMILLS ,.
TRADE MISCELLANEOUS
TRUCKS FOR SALE H
WANTED TO RENT 31
WORK WANTEO 17

WHERE TO GO 10

IT PAYS TO
PA I hONUE

NEWS REVIEW
ADF. nitSEKS

jiio reieci any ano an bias.

city Recorded

Winston. Oregon

mr..i.;"n77'.
(Sale of Real Prooertvl

iSealed bids will be received by Ihe Board
lot Directors of School District No. 12, Glide,
uougias county, uregon, at the office of the
Superintendent of Schools in fhe Hloh School
at Glide, Oregon, until August 13, ,1963 at
7:30 P.M., POT for Iht following described
real propeny:

A part of the South Va ot fhe S. E. quar-
ter of the S. E. quarter of section 11.
Township 27, Range I, W WM, 5.37
acres more or less, known as the

Bungalow School Site located on
Ihe Buckhorn Road.

Sale will be for cash In hand or upon
such terms as the Board ot Directors may
approve.
Information may be obtained concerning the
sail of the described property by contacting
Ihe office ot the School SunerinUnd.nl
The School District reserves the right lo re--
iect any or all bids and to waive Informali-
ties.
Dale ot Publication:
First: July 26, 1963
Second: August 2, 1V63

Signed: OPAL McCLURE
Clerk

CASE NO. 36S2S
SUMMONS

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OP THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR

DOUGLAS COUNTY
CHARLES D. COLEGROVE and SHIR

LEY ANN COLEGROVE, husband and
wife.

Plaintiffs,
vs.

ARTHUR E. PRICE and JANE DOE
PRICE, his wife; DORA MAE JONES
and JOHN DOE JONES, her husband;
CHARLES RAY PRICE and JANE DOE
PRICE, II, his wife; FRED V. PRICE
and JANE DOE PRICE, III, his wife;
PEARL FROUDE and JOHN DOE
FROUDE. her husband; MARGUERITE
MERSKOETTER and JOHN DOE

her husband; CHARLES
FAYE NOBLE and JANE DOE NOBLE,
his wife; THE UNKNOWN HEIRS OF
CHARLES PRICE, DECEASED; DYRMA
STRADER and PHIL STRADER, her hus-
band; DORIS DeSHIELDS and P. K.

her husband; MARGERY
and JACK M. REVILLE, her hus-

band; THE UNKNOWN HEIRS OF W. F.
PRICE. DECEASED; ALBERT PRICE
and JANE DOE PRICE. IV, his wife;
ROBERT PRICE and JANE DOE
PRICE, V, his wife; THE UNKNOWN
HEIRS OF JOHN PRICE, DECEASED;
BONN IE STIER end JOHN DOE

ZELLA WHALEY and JOHN DOE
WHALEY, her husband; THE UNKOWN
HEIRS ot IDA PRICE COX, DECEAS-
ED; Also, all other persons and parties
unknown claiming any righl, title or
terest In the real property described In
the Complaint herein and The unknown
Heirs of Any Deceased Defendants.

n.nrii.l.
TO: ARTHUR E. PRICE and JANE DOE

PRICE, his wife; DORA MAE JONES
and JOHN DOE JONES, her husband;
CHARLES RAY PRICE and JANE DOE
PRICE, II, his wife; FRED V. PRICE
and JANE DOE PRICE, III, his wife;
PEARL FROUOE and JOHN DOE
FROUDE, her husband; MARGUERITE
MERSKOETTER and JOHN DOE MER-
SKOETTER, her husband: CHARLES
FAYE NOBLE and JANE DOE NO-

BLE, hi wife; THE UNKNOWN HEIRS
OF CHARLES PRICE, DECEASED;
MARGERY REVILLE and JACK M.
REVILLE, her husband; THE UN-

KNOWN HEIRS OF W. F. PRICE, DE-

CEASED; THE UNKNOWN HEIRS OF
JOHN PRICE, DECEASED; BONNIE
STIER and JOHN DOE STtER, her
husband; ZELLA WHALEY and JOHN
DOE WHALEY, her husband; THE UN-

KNOWN HEIRS OF IDA PRICE COX,
DECEASED; Alio all other persons and
parties unknown claiming any right,
title or interest in the real property
described in the Complaint herein and
THE UNKNOWN HEIRS OF ANY DE-

CEASED DEFENDANTS. Defendants
IN THE NAVE OF THE STATE OF ORE'

GDN. Vnil ABP HFDFRY PFOIIIRn tn
aocear end answer the complaint fMed

tzi vs.!; .r r,5
ot this summons, and (i you tan

o aoar and answer, tor want
D'.Knt.its win aooiy to the
Court for a dtcre as orayed tor in said
tomtalaint. determining ownerihip and quiet- -

'9 till thsreto against the claims ol the
defendants or any other person unknown

o piaintilf claiming any fnterejt in and
'0 'he followtnq descrilied real oroperty:

All that portion of the land hereinafter
aesertbed lying soutn of tne Deer cref

rt honinninn .1 1" a tCl" C Dioa

on the North line ol the Samuel s

Donation Land Claim No. n. in

Township V South, Range West 0t
the Willamette Meridian, DougM Coun-

ty. Oreoon, said beginning point bears
South 89 iy Eat I6.S7 chains from
fhe Northwest corner of laid Claim No,

t: thence Soutn t 33' bast aionq tne
Nrth line of Claim No 41 a distance ot
IS 17 chains to a 1" t 34' O l. coe;
'hence South 0' S7' East MM Chams
'o the South line c 'he Claim Nc.
trenc North f' 37' Vfet along the
South line of Calm No o a distance
of 16 13 Chaini to a 1" 36" G.I
O'Oe. thx: North 5' Eat 44 ft?

chains to the oiace of bgmnino. ail
in Section 16 aboe Townsh-- and Rani,
SMbjecf to rightj of way and easement
O' record.

ccorflino to th Bwnershfp as determined:
partitioning said prooerty in accordsnce Witti
h resoec'ive ngtj c pit int. Mi and

and, in the event a pari.tion
hd, for tfe faie of M'd real

e'ty, and for a'tornevs' fees, nd 'or wch
chr and further relief as to Ihe Court

seem jyst and erjuitaoie
rsuant to the order cf the 3fh day

Man;c Martin
C. W. "Hill" Tipton
Cecil

K. II. "Doc" Pocock

cultlnq, levelinu and grading. Call tve.
IA. H. Fusi.

CUSTOM TILLING. New Ferguton 3o Dleiel,
new SO" rolovalor, Vlrf.a "Pal" Savage,

Glide.

BEEBE & BOWMAN
CALL ANYTIME

673-373- 8 - 673-813- 5

TILLING LKVKLINC: LAWNS
WICKIJ IIIIU.SI' LOTS MOWK!

Sprinkling Systems lnslalled
3 Tractors lo Serve You

PETERSON'S
Custom Troctor Work

Tilling
Weed. BrUSTI Ol

a
(jTOSS LUttinq

r c I r
tuning - uevuiiiiy

UT3 t.t48 ANYTIME

SPRINKLING SYSTEMS
Lvirn ftirtd FieW lrfigliori
JACUZZI PUMPS
Parti Saiei Service

VALLEY PUMP &

IRRIGATION SERVICE

ORNAMENTAL IRON SERVICE
"

ornamental iron"
WrouQht Iron railings Columns Posts

Ki'slilcnti.il and Ciimmrrciiil
FIIEK KSTI.MATES

1173 4(102 B". B73 3805

ROSEBURG FORGE WORKS

PAINTING

prices. Excellent rferencei. Color match
mg a ipecialty. or ;jlM4,

Phono
FURNISHED cabins. Utilities paid. Weekly

rales or by the month. Close to stores nnd
bus line. Rosoiand courts, zumi Nt 510

pheni or
SMALL furnished' duplex,' walking distance

from town, Hot and cold water, and garbage
disposal furnished. Adults, $50. Inquire
at 124 Mosher.

A BETTER place to live. Modem 2 bedroom
duplex, available August 1st. Cass & Kane
Sts. Garaqe, large rooms and cupboard
spnee. Adults, no pels. For appolntmertl
call

Mobile Homes (or Rent 30
EXTfM NICE or 1 bedroom modern fur

nlshed treilerl. Adulli only. Tiirber Town

Trailer Park, 2010 NE Stephen!.

APPLIANCE REPAIR

MAYTAG
Paris Slet Service

Nf Service Ail Home Appliance
BERGH'S APPLIANCE

BOOKKEEPING

ROSKES"""7
BOOKKEEPING SERVICE

Specializing In imall buiine:s accourtli

1225 W. HARVARD

PHONE 672-247- 1

BUILDERS, CARPENTERS

CARPENTRY And cnbln.lt. Harry E. Young

CUSTOM P.UHT hoires. remodel!, cabin.fi,
ariorf. oarage! Free ell. mates. IU

finance. Ph. Grady Roberion.

FOUNDATIONS, house ralnrto Itvellng, f

pair Worh F MA approved Cemirtl, btrKk

vof lieptce Frtt eslimaiti.
CAL MERGEL

Custom Built Homes
PfcMOOEMNC. carportj, patios, etc

buildert Bias Convl , 67J Ui9
. -

CHILD CARE

Mother Goose Nursery
6)8J61

EXCAVATING, SAND. GRAVEL

007ING. lovna; alio gravnt rock, river
loan- - ana rwrt maienali. Chartm Kteiy

FLOOR FINISHING COVERING

CUSTOM FLOORS and cabinet top by P t

Dav't '..Inoirum Til.? Formica, Ff(
climate. Sutherlm

FIRE EQUIPMENT

"fire"" extinguisher"
Sale! ft Service

J. B Nelion ' 493 NE W.nchfiler

GARDEN EQUIPMENT

Sales - Parts - Service
S'ALL AIR COOLED ENGINES

Jacornwi (Voweri Tille'l
Brlggj tV Stralton Clinton

Luon Power Product! Wico, sm. Etc.

Le Bleu Motors
31 SE Jw !JLJtL

j HEARING AIDS

HENRY A KIRKLANO crrtifio' hearlrsg ld

aidoog t f iltinf Bffi'tone I'Ciuiiyeiy
Service en all matt. Phong 7TJOI4.

Mobile Homes 32

WHAT WOULD YOU
KXPKCT lo pay fur a lovely liiuml nru, 2 bctlroom Immf

with hath and a half, completely nnd tastefully furnished in

your choice of Contemporary or the popular Karly American
decor uilh Ihe beauty of hardwood panclinij Ihru out Luxur-

ious Eastern Cak, Walnut, satin finish Birch and llinls eye
Maple

fa I)t curator culni s. name brand appliances MIK. West

invbousc, etc.) built in surface burners or M" Peek thru men
door

jf liriiiss pastel bathruoni fixtures. Armstrong lloois ami

ccihnys

jf Oodles of cupboaifl, drawer and wardrobe splice. . . .

Highest standard of construction, com-

pletely insulated and ceiled, radiant type heal, fiberiilass
"blanket-rap- and vapor barrier, maximum insulation thru-out-

. . 7 .

jf Prelmished aluminum exterior sidiiiii, wirinK. plumb-in-

and heating inspected anil approved to Oregon's stringent
code requirements, including circuit breakers

jf Plumbed for washer and drjer
jt Covered patio areas

Scieens and storms for all windows. .....
....?????

AM. THIS Pl.L'S low maintenance and taxes anil the con-

venience of being able to can lie VOl US in a MO-

BILE HOME!!! The fastest growing housing industry today!
You can expect to pay approximately S14 a sq. ft. for a

"good" home, one of these TOP VAMT.. deluxe, mobile

homes can be delivered to VOt' complete as described for

a low $8,100, OH LESS, depending on size, model, and optio-
nal selected. Almost a 1000 so,, ft of living area1!!

Convenient terms and financing readily aiailable.
Why not see us now. .....

SHADY POINT TRAILER SALES
Mile South Oid wy BR Phone

ratM Will latie mt lurnilurt al perl, 1561 SE Stephens 673-663-

payment.
PAINTING, exlerlor lnferior, Repair work, j t,,.rtDyReaionable ralei or hourly bam, phone 1 Ktt

TREE TRIMMING, looping, removing,
injured Free eMimale OaKland.

or njnm
PAVING

EXPERT cement work, Sidewalks, drive.
patiot Frfe eitlmatet.

PLUMBING

WELDING

WCLOING end mlal tabrkation. 3i44 N.W.

Bower.

tlCENSEO PLUWPcR, Bill Wylic, Larion

o June. 1943. dvty md and entered heren western Hedcedar. S2.9S per .M iKl
Honorable Oon $9wr. Jupe e . Fir. $9.10 per M

the Cir:i.,l CDrf of h State O Oregon II. Ir Hit """.'.
for oo.at Cou"tv. this wrrmon imm m hd.ft. fnr the W cstcrtl HemlncR.
oyi.red tr-- a wee for fewr weeesrve ( T y hd.ft. for the IncenSC

nd of 'ts pvt'- -ccmecuve ets Di'e or a total purcnase P""llar.i"ca.! 0f is,, imu t
t o .vne. ins of $67. 421.03 wilt be considered.

nVla'dTe6 CAtEr Minimum deposit ith bid:
Access to the sale area

i - s e og-a- ax a,.-bl- ( a I nder the xcrm? and
Ict.JrS vonditions of Arbitration Agree !

WELL DRILLING

Water Well Drilling
Nothing clown on aporovrtt Crtdit.

MOHR WELL DRILLING
horn or Sullstrlin

To List Your Firm Here,
DIAL OR


