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SOFTCHOCOMTEill Blank Suit

Complicates
Every Day

At the
DAIRY QUEEN

1144 W. Harvard

If Your Paper Hat Not
Arrived By 6:15 P.M.

Dial OR Between

6 & 7 P.M.

Cilt NO. U4
CITATION

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT
OF THE STATS OP OREGON

FOR OOUOLAS COUNTY
IN THE MATTER OF THE ADOPTION

OF
LAURA MARIE WILLARO, minor.

TIMBER FOR SALE. UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
as hereinafter designated will be
received by the District Manager,
Bureau of Land Management, 2583
West Harvard Avenue, Roseburg,
Oregon at :00 A.M., PACIFIC
DAYLIGHT SAVING TIME, on
Friday, July 12, 1963 for all tim-
ber marked or designated for cut-

ting. Before bids are submitted,
full information concerning the
timber, the conditions of sale and

By OSWALD JACOBY

(Written For NEA)

125 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 3 M bd.
ft. White Fir. No bid for less than
$24.05 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-

-fir, $7.45 per M bd. ft. for the
White Fir. or a total purchase

'price of S3.02S.6O will be consider-- I

ed. Minimum deposit with bid:
$350.00. Access to the sale area
is to be provided by the Purchaser
from the public road. IN DOUG-ILA-

COUNTY, OREGON: O&C:
All timber designated for cutting

Ion: SaSVV, SWV.SEU, See. 3,
T. 13 S., R. 4 W., W.M., esUmated
for the purpose of this sale to be
903 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- . 19 M bd.

TO: MICHAEL BERT WILLARD nd
ELIZABETH WILLARO, now known MRS
JAMES AELLETT.

GREETINGS: You ' hereby cited to
ppar in tht Court on lh

You should never use Blackwood
when you are void in a suit. But
what do you do when your part-
ner uses Blackwood and you are
void somewhere?

The approved procedure is to

the deuce of trumps after West
played low, ruffed dummy's last
diamond high, led his last trump
overtaking in dummy, cashed dum-
my's last trump and paused while
East considered a discard.

At this nnint Fact une in

22nd day or July. 1963. to tnow can it, If any
Inert appears, why your child, Laura Marie
miiaru, &nouid not ot adooted bv Homer
Haskell Newiom and Lorraine Nadina Newsubmission of bids should be ob-

tained from the above District
Manager. The right is hereby re

torn, husband and wife, punuanl to a pell
tion tiled In this said Court.

Tht petition provides thai the Dttmoners.squeeze. He was down to six cards
and had to jettison a spade in or--
dpr In hnn0 nn in tha ndj. nf liin.

Homer Haskell Newson. and Lorraine Na- -served to waive technical defects
in this advertisement, and to re-
ject any or all bids. The United This made all dummy's spadesStates reserves the right to waive

gooa ana gave coutti pis slam.

CASE NO. I45U
SUMMONS

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT O THE
STATE OF OREGON FOE

DOUGLAS COUNTY
CHARLES O- COLEGROVE and SHIR-

LEY ANN COLEGROVE, husMnO And
Witt.

Ptalniiffi.
VI.

ARTHUR E. PRICE and JANE OOE
PRICE. His wife; DORA MAE JONES
ana JOHN DOE JONES, her huiband;
CHARLES RAY PRICE and JANE OOE
PRICE, II, hii wife; FRED V. PRICE
and JANE DOE PRICE, 111, hl wife;
PEARL FROUDE and JOHN DOE
FROUOE, her husband; MARGUERITE
MERSKOETTER and JOHN DOE MER
SKOETTER, her husband; CHARLES
FAYE NOBLE and JANE DOE NOBLE,
his wife; THE UNKNOWN HEIRS OF
CHARLES PRICE, DECEASED; DYRMA
STRADER and PHIL STRADER, her hut
band; DORIS DeSHIELDS and P. K.

her husband; MARGERY RE
VILLE and JACK M. REVILLE, her hus-
band; THE UNKNOWN HEIRS OF W. F.
PRICE. DECEASED; ALBERT PRICE
and JANE DOE PRICE, IV, his wife;
ROBERT PRICE and JANE DOE
PRICE. V. his wife; THE UNKNOWN
HEIRS OF JOHN PRICE, DECEASEDl
BONNIE STIER and JOHN OOE STL
ER; ZELLA WHALEY and JOHN DOE
WHALEY. her husband; THE UNKOWN
HEIRS Of IDA PRICE COX, DECEAS-
ED; Also, all other persons and parties
unknown claiming any right, title or in
terest In the real property described in
the Complaint herein and The Unknown
Heirs of Any Deceased Defendants,

Defendants.
TO: ARTHUR E. PRICE and JANE DOE

PRICE, his wife; DORA MAE JONES
and JOHN DOE JONES, her husband;
CHARLES RAY PRICE and JANE DOE
PRICE. II, his wife; FRED V. PRICE
and JANE DOE PRICE, III, his wile;
PEARL FROUDE and JOHN DOE
FROUDE, her husband; MARGUERITE
MERSKOETTER and JOHN DOE MER-
SKOETTER, her husband; CHARLES
FAYE NOBLE and JANE DOE NO-

BLE, his wire; THE UNKNOWN HEIRS
OF CHARLES PRICE, DECEASED;
MARGERY REVILLE and JACK M.
REVILLE, her husband; THE UN-
KNOWN HEIRS OF W. F. PRICE. DE-
CEASED; THE UNKNOWN HEIRS OF
JOHN PRICE. DECEASED; BONNIE
STIER and JOHN DOE STIER, her

any informality in bids received
whenever such waiver is in the in-

terest of the United States. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON:
O&C: All timber designated for
cutting on: SWSEVi, Sec. IS, E'-s- ,

EWWVj. NWMNW4, Sec. 23, T.
13 S., R. 4 W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
6195 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 254 M
bd. ft. Incense Cedar. 169 M bd.
ft. White Fir, 73 M bd. ft. West-
ern Redcedar. 35 M bd. ft. West

J g j acini cmihi
ill 1 "uTo I I uwt i I

Improve, your bridge gamtlorder your copy of "Win at
Bridge With Oswald Jacoby."

Just send your name, address,
and SO cents to: Jacoby Bridge,

P. O. Box 1248,
Roseburg, Oregon and a copy
will be mailed to you. Or If you
prefer, copies may be purchased
at the office.

ome Newsom, reside al 4407 N. E. Stephens
Street, Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon.
They art both over the ago of twenty-on-

years and art resldenls and Inhabitants of
the Statt ot Oregon, and have been and
are now duly married and art husband and
wife. Tht petition lurlher provides that the
said Laura Merle Wlllard Is presently tight
() years ot age and has resided with tht
petitioners since March 14, I960.

The petition further provides that tht natur-
al parents of the Laura Marie
Wlllard, Michael Bert Wlllard and Elltabeth
Willard, now known as Mrs. James Mellell,
were divorced on October 13. 1954 In King
County. Washington. That tht said natural
parents have deserted and neglected the

minor child tor a period of
more than one year prior to tht filing of tht
petition on tilt herein and have not pro-
vided support, cart or maintenance for tht
support of tht said child.

DATED this Ulh day of June, 1963
C. D. MYLLENBECK
County Clerk
by ! Helen Anderson
Deputy Clerk
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ern Hemlock. No bid for less than

jump right to six in the suit that
shows the exact number of aces
you hold unless you are afraid that
your void suit is one in which
your partner is strong. In that
case you merely show how many

Q The bidding has been:
South West North East
1A Pass 1A Pass
4 A Pass 4N.T. Pass
5 A Pass 8 A Pass

You, South, hold:
AAQ65 VKSS AQJ A!

What do you do?
A Bid six spades. Your part

ner has placed the slam In clulx
but you should overrule him.

TODAY'S QUESTION
Instead of bidding four

over your lour spades,
your partner bids five hearts.
What do you do in this case?

Answer Tomorrow i

nusoana; ifcLLA WHALEY and JOHN
uue whallt, ner husband; THE UN
KNOWN HEIRS OF IDA PRire rnv aces you hold.

North s jump to six hearts showDECEASED; Also all other persons and
parties unknown claiming any right,

30 MORE EFFICIENT ON RUGS

2-- TIMES MORE POWER WITH TOOLed two aces and a void suit. Southc r micresi in ine real property
described in the ComnlAlnt hrin h assumed that the void suit would IS

THE
THE UNKNOWN HEIRS OF ANY DE-
CEASED DEFENDANTS, Defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATF nc no.

ii. incense veuar, 9 ai uu. u. mine
Fir, 3 M bd. ft. Western Red-
cedar. No bid for less than $20.95
per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir- ,

$9.95 per M bd. ft. for the Incense
Cedar, $9.40 per M bd. ft. for the
White Fir, $0.85 per M bd. ft. for
the Western Redcedar, or a total
purchase price of $19,221.05 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid: $2,000.00. Access to the sale
area is to be proided by the Pur-
chaser from the public road to the
contract area. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY, OREGON: PD: All Um-
ber designated for cutting on:
NE'SE', Sec. 34, a portion of
NWttSWW, Sec. 35, T. 22 S.,R
4 W., W.M., estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 240 M bd.
ft. Douglas-fir- , 1 M bd. ft. Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than S21.80

per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir- ,

$9.00 per M bd. ft. for the Incense
Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $5,241.00 will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid: $550.-0-

Access to the sale area is
available: (a) Under the terms
and conditions of Easement No.

with Weyerhaeuser Com-

pany, no fee, (b) Under the terms
and conditions of Easement No.

with Douglas County, no
fee, and (c) by Public Road. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON:
O&C: All timber designated for
cutting on SWMNWV4, Sec. 23, T.
26 S., R. 3 W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
254 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 3 M bd.
ft. Western Redcedar, 239 M bd.
ft. White Fir, 6 M bd. ft. Western
Hemlock, 7 M bd. ft. Incense Ced-
ar. No bid for less than $21.60 per
M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir- , $10.-7- 5

per M bd. ft. for the Western
Redcedar, $6.75 per M bd. ft. for
the White Fir, $13.65 per M bd. ft.
for the Western Hemlock, $12.65
per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar,
or a total purchase price of

will be considered. Minimum
deposit with bid: $600.00. Access
to the sale area is to be provided
by the Purchaser. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY, OREGON: O&C: All
timber designated for cutting on:
NV4SWy4, SEy4SVy, Sec. 23, T.
26 S., R. 3 W W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be:
2151 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 4 M bd.
ft. Western Redcedar, 46 M bd. ft.
White Fir, 2 M bd. ft. Sugar Pine,
3 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock, 57
M bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid
for less than $21.70 per M bd. ft.
for the Douglas-fir- , $10.55 per M
bd. ft. for the Western Redcedar,
$6.55 per M bd. ft. for the White
Fir, $29.40 per M bd. ft. for the
Sugar Pine, $12.90 per M bd. ft. for
the Western Hemlock, $12.05 per
M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, or
a total purchase price of $47,804.55
will be considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid: $4,800.00. Access
to the sale area is available: (a)

be clubs. It did not seem likely that
it would be diamonds and obvious 90wun, iuu ake hereby requird to ly it wasn't spades.

A conservative bouth would prob
oKKr ma answer ine complaint filed
against you In the d action with-
in four weeks from in dal or ihi. fi. 122ably have settled for the small

slam on the theory that if East

Cleans tugs as only a Hoover can because it beats,
as it sweeps, as it cleans.

King size bag completely enclosed.

New styling with motor in the back lets cleaner go
under low, low furniture.

Attach hose at knee height lit Dack of cleaner. ..just

insert, twist and you're leady to go.

publication of this summons, and If you fallto appear and answer, for want thereof,
plaintiffs will apply to tho
Court for a decree as prayed tor In said
complaint, determining ownership and quiet-
ing title thereto against the claims of the
defendants or any other persons unknownto plaintlfs claiming any Interest In and

HORN TREES HORSE

NIBE, Denmark (UPI) Work-
ers used a hoist Wednesday to
free a horse from the branches
of a tree about six feet off the
ground.

Farmer Peter Nyborg said his
animal jumped up and got stuck
between the branches when fright-
ened by an automobile horn.

With
Attachments

held the club ace there would be
no real play for seven, but this
particular South was an optimist.
He believed that aces were always
where they should be in this best
of all possible worlds so South went
right to seven hearts.

ah ,u"owm acriDea real property:
TO CALL FOR THE BEST
BUY ON YOUR INSURANCE

NORM WICKS
978 NE Stepheni OR

In tha Hillereir Motel

He did not like it when the king
of diamonds was opened, but ev-

erything worked out nicely.
south took dummy s ace of di

amonds, ruffed a diamond high.

SWIMMING POOLS
All typM

Doran Taylor, Contractor
517 N.C. Dean Drive, Granti Past

Phone 5

led a heart to dummy's eight, ruff-
ed another diamond high, led the

635 South East Stephens

OPEN FRIDAYS UNTIL 9 P.M.

S19.80 per H bd. ft. for the Dougla-
s-fir, $6.60 per M bd. ft. for the
Incense Cedar, $3.80 per M bd. ft.
for the White Fir, S6.65 per M
bd. ft. for the Western Redcedar,
S10.40 per M bd. ft. for the West-
ern Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $125,829.05 will be consid-
ered. Minimum deposit with bid:
$12,600.00. Access to the sale area
is available: (a) Under the terms
and conditions of Easement Nos.

with Weyerhaeuser Com-

pany and with Percy
Langdon. No fees are required,
and (b) by Public Road. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON:
OfcC: All timber designated for
cutting on: Lot 4 (NWUNEM),
WV4SEK, Sec. 5, T. 24 S., R. 4 W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 2230 M bd. ft.
Douglas-fir- , 282 M bd. ft. White
Fir, 34 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar.
No bid for less than S21.70 per
M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir- , $6.-1- 0

per M bd. ft. for the White Fir,
$11.80 per M bd. ft. for the In-
cense Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $50,512.40 will be consid-
ered. Minimum deposit with bid:
$5,100.00. Access to the sale area
is available: (a) Under the terms
and conditions of Easement No.

with Lloyd D. Pinkston
and Ida E. Pinkston. A fee of $0.-2- 5

per M bd. ft. is cited among
other conditions, (b) Under the
terms and conditions of Easement
No. with Archie and
Louise McCullouch. A fee of $0.05
per M bd. ft. is cited among other
conditions, and (c) By Public Road.
IN DOUGLAS COUNTY, ORE-
GON: O&C: AU timber designated
for cutting on: Lots 3, 4, 5, 6, 11,
12, 13, Sec. 29, Lots 5, 6, Sec. 31,
T. 23 S., R. 6 W Lots 2, 3, Sec. 5,
NEV4NEV4, Lot 3, Sec. 7, T. 24 S.,
R. 6 W., W.M., estimated for the

of this sale to be 2932 M
fiurpose Douglas-fir- , 38 M bd. ft.
White Fir, 11 M bd. ft. Western
Hemlock, 37 M bd. ft. Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $16.-1- 0

per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fi- r,

$3.10 per M bd. ft. for the
White Fir, $7.95 per M bd. ft. for
the Western Hemlock, $7.20 per M
bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, or
a total purchase price of $47,676.-8- 5

will be considered. Minimum
deposit with bid: $4,800.00. Access
to the sale area is available: (a)
Under the terms and conditions of
Arbitration Agreement No.
with Kenneth and Hallie Ford. No

present road use fee has been de-

termined, (b) By Federal access
road. A rockwear fee of $0.09 per
M bd. ft. will be charged, and (c)
By Publio Road. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY, OREGON: O&C: All
timber designated for cutting on:
SWMNWW, NWWSWV4, Sec. 23, T.
23 S., R. 4 W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be

pu nun or me iana nereinatter
described lying South of the Deer Creek
Rpad beginning at a 1" x 40" G.I, pipon the North Una of the Samuel Hark,ness Donation Land Claim No. 41, in
Township 27 South, Range 5 West of
the Willamette Meridian, Douglas Coun-
ty, Oregon, said beginning point bears
South 89' 23 East 16.57 chains from
the Northwest corner of said Claim No,
41; thence South W 23 East along the
North line of Claim No. 41 a distance of
15.17 chains to V x 34" G.I. pipe;thence South 0" 57 East 46.66 chainsto the South line of the Claim No. 41
thence North 89' 27 West along tha
South line of Claim No. 41 a distance
of 16.83 chains to a 1" x 36" G
pipe; thence North ) 5 East 46 67
chains to the place of beginning, all
in Section 16 above Township and Range,
tubiect to rights of way and easements
of record,

ISTATE FARM
I Imuranc ComptnlM
I Homi Ollicaii Btoomlnston, Illinois

king of clubs just to see if the
ace would cover and ruffed with

according to the ownenhln riararmi.
r" m, D,U M'wpeny in accoraance withthe respective rights of plaintiffs and de-
fendants and. In the event a onrminn .in.
not be had, for the sale of said real prop-
erty, and for attorneys fees, and for such
other and further relief as to the Court
may seem just and equitable.

Pursuant to the order of th iaik huof June, 1963, duly made and entered herein
by the Honorable Don Sanders. Jurta nf
the Circuit Court of the State of Oregonfor Douglas County, this summons shall be
published once a week lor four successiveUnder the terms and conditions of

Arbitration Agreement No.
with Evans Products Company. A

ana consecutive weeKg. Date of first pub I-

lea (ton of this summons shall be the 28th
aay or June,

LONG, NEUNER, DOLE . CALEY
BY UUriALU A. LtULb
Attorneys tor plaintiffs
110 S. E, Douglas
P.O. Box 1205

Roseburg, Oregon

fee of $0.22 per M bd. it, is cited
among other conditions, and (b)
Under the terms and conditions of
Arbitration Agreement No.
with William C. Lindsell, Jr., no
preset fee has been determined,
and by Bureau of Land Manage-
ment controlled road, a rockwear
fee of $0.02 per M bd. ft. will be
charged.

NOT EVERYTHING

MILWAUKEE (UPI) Henry
F. Bilek, Richmond, Va., sent a
$5,000 check to the county board
ot puDiic weltare Wednesday for
ine care of indigents with the
note:

IT PAYS TO PATRONIZE

ADVERTISERS "Now I am old. in August 88.
alone, last of my line. Money is
not every tmng."

BREATWE EASY!

Bar the doer of your home to dust, pollens, heat ALara3l--
.A,

Bottom lejt: (JhttroM lmpaltt ConmhkU ruxl to a Chny II Nota iOO ConmtMtTop UJU ContUt Slini Ray Sport Coup near a Cortair Alonza Cmmtiblt
and humidity this summer. Keep the air you breathe clean, cool,
invigorating . . . with modern electric air conditioning. Many
models. Reasonable cost. Excellent terms.

air-conditi- on

MAP SHRINKERS
Chevrolet's got four different kinds of them

For health . . . for comfort

See your favorite Colore
Electrical League dealer.

sprightliness. The sporty CORVAIR'S rear-engin- a

traction and sensitive steering will have you seek-

ing ml secondary roads. And CORVETTE, of

course, is America's only sports car.

Quite a difference, right? But lots in common lika

Chevrolet dependability and the Trade 'N' Travel

f CHEVROLET j

1 uM I

TVhich way do yem rzrA a new kick out; of going

places? Everything about our H

CHEVROLET says luxury car except the price-ri- ch,

roomy interiors, Body by Fisher craftsman-

ship, choice of engines up to 425 hp. CHEVY II
is a thrifty one with lots of upkeep savers. But

you could never tell from its stylish looks or AT YOUR CHEVROLET DEALER'S deals now at your dealer's. 'Opthndai mm eot

CHECK HIS TNT DEALS ON CHEVROLET, CHEVY I, CORVAIR AND CORVETTE

ROSEBURG:
if Miri ipfuiMi timet 0HMII1
MUTCH tilt CO OH Mill
MONTCOMf RY Kill I CO OR Mil
HIMI0HS HCiTIHt III ll C0MITIOle 0I1WM
Miri IWIIKCt 0IM7M
SOUTH IHHIIHI IWIDWW M imilHCI 0 1 1711

Tortus smect mitu on miii
TOUT" t COUHTIY MFIIMUTIM OH Mitt
TIOWIIIOCE titCTmc 0HIH11
umpoui mur armaHCf omuii
yhiiiw tin it Mm

MYRTLE CREEK:
CIOOMI lllllCt ctmtt
HU'I WIUM UT ,.,., Ill-u-

iturt rgnmvti niut
SUTHERLINi

tittcrwiY imiutf

HANSEN MOTOR CO.
OAK and STEPHENS ROSEBURG, OREGON ORchard


