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RETAIN IMPORT LIMIT

WASHINGTON (UPI) The
House has approved an adminis-

tration bill to retain for two more
vears the $100 duty-fre- e limit on

CARNIVAL CONSTRUCTION OF SMALL BOAT DOCK
AT WINCHESTER BAY,

DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON
SEALED bids will bt rtctlvM by th County

der the terms and conditions of
Arbitration Agreement No.
with U. S. Plywood Corporation. A
fee of $0.52 per M bd.ft. is cited
among other conditions, and (b)
Bv Public Road. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY, OREGON: 04tC & PD:
All timber designated for cutting
on: Lot 14, See. 17, Lot 2, Sec. 20, ."

foreign goods brought into the

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned

has been by the Circuit Court of the State
of Oregon for Dougles County appointed

with the will annexed of the
estate of FREDERICK HERMAN SCHULZE,
Deceased. All persons having claims against
said estate re hereby notified to present
the seme verified as required by law lo the
undersigned at the Lew Offices of Keitey &

Garrlun. Arfomevt et Lew, 205 Douglas

Court of Doug lbi County at tn Courthouse
in Rottburg, Oregon et 10:30 A.M., P.D.T..

DOWN

1 Rampart
2 Wmgi
3 Stranger in

Modern land
4 Creator ot Mr.

Pickwick
Old i

6 Valley 'poet)

July 1. ioj, tor tne construction ot smell

ACROSS

t Alteram
f Author of

"Fable, in
SUnf"

t Creator of
"Major
Barbara"

liAsiaue

boet dock et Wlnctvtsier Bey. Oregon.
The Ko consists ot furnishing labor, mater-
iel, equipment end all things pertaining to
construction ot e00 feet of small boet dock

United States oy American tour-
ists.

By a voice vote Thursday, the
House passed legislation to pre-

vent the duty-fre- e allowance from
rising to $500 on July 1. The Sen-ot- o

is ovnootpd tn comDie te ac- -

complete with approach ramp, finger pier
piling end water lne.7aignt organ

County State Bank Bui Wing, Roseburg, Ore-

gon, within six months from the date of this
notice.

Dated June 31st, 1H3.

mouniaroa
Lots 5, 6, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 18, .

19, 20, Sec. 19, T. 21 S., R. W.,
W.M.. estimated for the Duroose

Bidders will be required to submit prequalifl- -13AUinoros " "

nh Father- - Small dirUnc cafiona statement.AOHret LUCY SCHATTENKIRK of this sale to be 4086 M bd.ft.10 Summit 27 French river
. u'.-- u . Htknl 9JI Knlilarv.4 Ctn tion on the bill before the deadAdministratrix with the Will AnSpecifications are on file with the County

Clerk of Douglas County, and copies thereof
may be obtained et the office of the County nexed Of the Estate of FRED

lOUndmeaiun 2 Limerick line.
41 Spreadi hay
42 Delay
43 Ollihore
44 Sinewy
4 Fr.rt

.tithor20 Thli place Court, Room 317, Courthouse, Roseburg,
Oregon.

15 Sonllat
10 Brew
17 While frort
IB Seepage
20 Employed
21 Beloro

31 Club ivar.)
34 Bridge Oougies County reserves the right to reject

ERICK HERMAN SCHULZE, De-

ceased.
K el ley & Garrison
Attorneys for Administratrix
205 Douglas County State Bank Building
Roseburg, Oregon

LEGAL23 Imitator
24 Wild (oat 46 Marine eagleoo endeavor any or ail bids or lo weive ny informality

in piddig.nna.hlir lT1ltni20 KOW
38 Wai Riled 4t F.ntbuaiaat

23 "Pooh" aeator 28 Tim
DOUGLAS COUNTY COURT
V. T. Jeckson, County Judge
E. R. M tiger. Commissioner
Rey E. Doerner, Commissioner
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-
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IT PAYS TO PATRON'ZE

ADVERTISERS

3 Creator of
Jabberwocky

30 Sacred bird
, (Kgypt)
:M Moderate
32 Caviar
33 Male.
34 Rational
35 Feminine

anocllltiotl

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL ACUTION
as hereinafter designated will be
received by the District Manager.
Bureau of Land Management, 2583

West Harvard Ave, Roseburg, Ore-

gon at 9:00 A.M., PACIFIC DAY-

LIGHT SAVING TIME, on Friday,
June 28, 1963 for all timber mark-
ed or designated for cutting. Be-

fore bids are submitted, full infor-

mation concerning the timber, the
conditions of sale and submission

r hiHe chnnM hn nhtained from

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT, MEDFORD DIS-
TRICT. Oral auction bids will be
received by the District Manager
at the timber sale room, Armory
Drive (mailing address 1133 S. Riv-

erside) Medford, Oregon at 9:30
A.M. on Thursday, July 11, 1963,
or all timber designated for cut-

ting. Before bids are submitted,
full information concerning the

J Free, from
lUbility

MOX
39 Grain

- l3 a ! k" It IJ I It 'li Il6 III.

n rr b
IS IT IT

pro-a- r rf? vw

iria ur CrZ L- -
"51 H 53

g-- I I Mil

40 Headpiece
41 He Invented a

fnmnino frotf
44 irrigated

the above District Manager. Thetimber, the conditions of sale and
submission of bids should be ob-

tained from the District Manager.

Friday & Saturday

"IT'S ONLY MONEY"
Jerry Lewis

plus
"THE PIGEON THAT

TOOK ROME"
Charleton Hetton

Elsa Martinelli .

plus
Cartoon

40neiauuuu
40 Evergreen
50 Only thla
51 rood reglnwa
52 Skill
MCritlehM

(llang)
iMUgal
I luipentioii
1st Bill .
I humoriat
M Migrate

"And this, believe it or not, is a Giant Hybrid

Everblooming Strawberry bush!"

right is hereby reserveu to waive
technical defects in this advertise-

ment, and to reject any or all bids.

The United States reserves the
right to waive any informality in

bidi received whenever such wai-

ver is in the interest of the United
States. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY,
OREGON: O&C: All timber desig-
nated for cutting on: Lot 5 (SW4-NWV.- ;,

See. 31, T. 25 S., R. J W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose of

this sale to be 635 M bd.ft. Douglas-fi- r,

35 M bd.ft. Western Redcedar,
63 M bd.ft. White Fir, 2 M bd.ft.
Western Hemlock 23 M bd.ft. In-

cense Cedar. No bid for less than
$20.50 per M bd.ft. for the Douglas-fir- ,

$10.30 per M bd.ft. for the West-

ern Redcedar, $5.95 per M bd.ft.
for the White Fir, $10.80 per M
hH fl for thp U'pslprn Hemlock.

The right is hereby reserved to re-

ject any or all bids and to waive
any technical defects in this ad-

vertisement and to waive any in-

formality in bids received when-

ever such waiver is in the interest
of the United States. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY, OREGON: O&C: All
timber designated for cutting on
NtaNEW Section 25, T. 31 S., R. 9

W., Will Mer, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 550 M

bd. ft. Douglas-fir- , 9 M bd. ft.
white fir, 11 M bd. ft. sugar
pine and 2 M bd. ft. incense-cedar- .

No bid for less than $21.50 per M
bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir- , $5.20 per
M bd. ft. for the white fir, $32.30
per H bd. ft. for the sugar pine,
$9.25 per M bd. ft. for the incense-ceda-

or a total purchase price of

$12,245.60 will be considered. Min-

imum deposit with bid $1,300.00.

Douglas-fir- , 92 M bd.ft. Incense
Cedar, 33 M bd.ft. Western Hems
lock, 26 M bd.ft. White Fir, 25 M
bd.ft. Western Redcedar. No bid
for less than $14.75 per M bd.ft.
for the Douglas-fir- , $5.05 per M
bd.ft. for the Incense Cedar, $6.25
per M bd.ft. for the Western Hem-- "'

lock, $3.00 per M bd.ft. for the
White Fir, $4.00 per M bd.ft. for
the Western Redcedar, or a total
purchase price of $61,117.35 will
be considered. .Minimum depositwith bid: $6,200.00. Access to the
sale area is available: (a) Under
the terms and conditions of Agree-
ment No. with Woolley Log.
ging Co. A fee of $0.56 per

is cited among other condi.
tions, (b) Under the terms and con.
ditions of Road Easement No. RE.

with Kenneth W. and Hallie
E. Ford. No fee, (c) By .Govern-
ment controlled road, and (d) Bv
Public Road. IN DOUGLAS COUN
TY, OREGON: O&C: All

for cutting on NMSWK.
SEW, Sec. 21, T. 22 S., R. 4 W.)
W.M., estimated for the purpose of
this sale to be 2548 M bd.ft. Douglas-
-fir, 3 M bd.ft. Western

7 M bd.ft. White Fir, 5 M
bd.ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for'
less than $21.50 per M bd.ft. for
the Douglas-fir- , $9.40 per M bd.ft."
for the Western Redcedar, $6.90
per M bd.ft. for the White Fir,
$8.95 per M bd.ft. for the Incense
Cedar, or a total purchase price of
$54,903.25 will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid $5,500.00.
Access to the sale area is available
by public road. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY, OREGON: O&C: All
timber designated for cutting on

.NEV4SWV4, W44SEW, Sec. 7, T.
21 S., R. S W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
197 M bd.ft. Douglas-fir- , 8 M bd.ft.
Western Hemlock, 1 M bd.ft.

Cedar. No bid for less than
$21.60 per M bd.ft. for the Douglas-fir- ,

$11.45 per M bd.f:. for the
Western Hemlock, $11.50 per M
bd.ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $4,358.30
will be considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid: $450.00. Access to
the sale area is available: (a) By
Government controlled road, and
(b) By Public Road. IN DOUG-
LAS COUNTY, OREGON: O&C:
All timber designated for cutting
on SEWSEVa, Sec. 35, T. 29 S., R.
9 W., W.M., estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 29 M bd.ft,
Douglas-fir- , 11 M bd.ft. Grand Fin
No bid for less than $17.75 per M
bd.ft. for the Douglas-fir- , $6.55 per
M bd.ft. for the Grand Fir, or i
total purchase price of $586.80
will be considered. Minimum de- -

$10.90 per M bd.ft. for the Incense

Tonight
"COME SEPTEMBER"

Rock Hudson --

Gina Lollobrigida
Sandra Dee - Bobby Darin

Walter Slezak

plus
"OPERATION BIKINI"
Tab Hunter-Franki- e Avalon

Scott Brady

Gates Open 8:00
Shows at 9:00

Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $14,025.15 will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid: $1,500.-00- .

Access to the sale area is to be

provided by the 'Purchaser. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON:
O&C: All timber designated for
cutting on: SV4SWV4, SWMSEV4,
Sec. 29, T. 24 S., R. 2 W., W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 260 M bd.ft. Douglas-fir- ,

21 M bd.ft. Western Redcedar, 18

M bd.ft. White Fir, 18 M bd.ft.
Sugar Pine, 24 M bd.ft. Western
Hemlock, 7 M bd.ft. Incense Cedar.
No bid for less than $16.90 per M

bd.ft. for the Douglas-fir- , S6.45 per
M bd.ft. for the Western Redcedar,
S5.25 per M bd.ft. for the White
Pii-- SMI 55 npr M bd.ft. for the

TOMtHtT & SATUKPAY

JAMES STEWART
and Janet Leigh in

THE NAKED SPUR
2 Technicolor Hits

King Solomon's Mines
Stewart Granger

Deborah Kerr
OPEN S ot DUSK

Sugar Pine, $7.35 per M bd.ft. for
the Western Hemlock, Sb.aa per ai
bd.ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a

total purchase price of $5,398.90
will be considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid: $550.00. Access to
the sale area is available: (a) Un- -

lyr.VnH,!
' i I J 5 WE HAVE .A CAPACITy I I

VS, 1 NOTICED that, too.J I (the SEAT 15 jammed)
'

firj ciwpto x'1

f Iaj II (JUST LOOKING ) I I V YOU N -- T
' '

' l. 1 Llr" 'el
T 1 1 sues verv evasive ABOUf Tn I I WHtRi;i)r?ll I Bk - V

fwTA,w V.wcMmwwiB5yiwy that manuscri biazesa.! I Vit, isaidv,""J A JfcwL. I

If aff 'isTTt mjnPf Vrula uiruTjrloT-Jf1- " WUR FRIENPS NO, NOT EVERYTHING, -- ! UnO--
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thru SATURDAY only

HiThP bMmcoLORiL.-.i- f

posit with bid: $75.00. Access to

UGLYAMERiCAN
plui . . .

Tonight

"IT'S ONLY MONEY"
Jerry Lewis - Zachary Scott

Joan O'Brien

plus

Billy Rose's

"JUMBO"
In Color

Doris Day - Jimmy Durante

Box Office Opens at 8:15
Show Starts at Dusk

1960 Great Lakes

TRAILER HOUSE

46' long, 10' wide
2 bedrooms.
Small down.

Take over payments.
Will taka older
trailer or car in

trade.

MAC WOOD
CHEVRON STATION

910 West HorvordLaSKiYMICHEL RAY

6 tjKy
The following radio and television ptogrami ere printed free public service (or
readers. AH program listings are published at received tram the respective stations. The

does not accept responsibility for variation from original schedules furnished this newspaper.

the sale area is available: (a) Fed,
cral access road, and (b) By Pub-
lic Road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY,
OREGON: O&C: All timber

for cutting on SV4, W'--

SEW, Sec. 17, T. 31 S., R. ( W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 126 M bd.ft,
Douglas-fir- , 6 M bd.ft. Sugar Pine,
4 JI bd.ft. Incense Cedar. No bid
for less than $21.70 per M bd.ft.
for the Douglas-fir- , $11.90 per M
bd.ft. for the Sugar Pine, $12.35
per M bd.ft. for the Incense Ce-

dar, or a total purchase price of
$2,855.00 will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid: $300.00. Par-ti-

access to the sale area is
available: (a) Under the terms
and conditions of Arbitration Agree-
ment No. with Roseburg
Lumber Co., through Sections 8 Si

17, T. 31 S., R. 6 W., W.M., no
preset fee has been determined.
The Purchaser will have to obtain
access across Sections 4 & 5, T.
31 S., R. 6 V W.M., and (b) By
Public Road. IN DOUGLAS COUN-

TY, OREGON: O&C: All timber
designated for cutting on: NE'.i,
NW'4, SWVa, SWMSEV4, Sec. 25,
T. 31 S., R. t W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to bo
1012 M bd.ft. Douglas fir. 58 M

bd.ft. Sugar Pine, 9 M bd.ft. In
cense Cedar, 9 M. bd.ft Grand
Fir. No bid for less than $18.25
per M bd.ft. for the Douglas-fir- ,

$15.10 per M bd.ft. for the Sugar
Pine, $6.60 per M bd.ft. for the
Incense Cedar, $2.75 per M bd.ft.
for the Grand Fir, or a total pur-
chase price of $19,428.95 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid: $2,000.00 Access to the sale
area is available: (a) Under the
terms and conditions of Agreement
No. with C. & D. Lumber Co.
A fee of $2.00 per M bd.ft. is
cited among other conditions, (b)
Bv Government controlled road,
and (c) By Public Road.

KPIC-T- V Ch. 4
CHANNEL 2 ON CABLE

MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY
00 Today

f:00 Yoga for Health
?: Plav Your Hunch Color

10:CO Price Is Right Color

9:30 Make Room for Daddy
3:30 Be My Guest (Tues (V Thurs)
2:30 Bav's Kitchen (Frl)
3:00 TV home Journal (Mon. only)
3:00 Spectator Mallnee l
3:15 Social Security (Mon only)
3:30 Wire Servlco (Mon only)
4:30 Lone Ranger
5:00 Capt. Shipwreck

FRIDAY
5:30 Csrtoon
6:00 Northwest News
6:15
4:30 Perry Mason
7:30 Interna l lore Showtime

:30 Mitch AM lie' Color
9:30 Price Is Right Color

10:00 Jack Pear
11:00 Reoort

ont Row Center

SATURDAY

1:30 Ruff end Redy Color
9:00 sharl Lewis Color
9:30 King Leonardo Color

!0:00-F- ury

10:30 Make Room For Daddy
10:30 Major League Baseball

1:30 USGA Open Championship
1:00 Saturday Matinee
5:15 Hollywood Feature Races
5:45 industry On Parade
6:00 Saturday Night Report
4:15 Feature Shorts
6:30 Navy Log
7:00 Mr. Ed
7; 30 Sam Benedict
1:30 Joey Bishop
9:00 Movie

11:00 Saturday Cinema

10: 30 Concentration
11:00 Your Pirsl Impression Color
11:30 Truth or Consequences

av Repor
11:00 Ben Jerrod
U:3$-N- ew

12:30 The Doctors
1:00 Lorelta Young
1:30 You Oor't Say
J:00 Match Game

2 35 Afternoon Report

11:00 News
11:15 Stage

SATURDAY
10:50 News
11:05 Baseball Preview
11:15 Baseball
2:30 Movie
5:00 Cheyenno
4:00 Dan Smoot Report
6:15 Forum
6:30 Fllntstor.es
7:00 I've Got a Secret
7:30 Jackie Gleason
6:30 The Delenders
9:30 Have Gun Wilt Travel

I0:C0 Gunsmoke
ll:fo News Final
11:15 Slag. S

KBES-T- V Ch. 5
MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY

1:00 Cnotaln Kangaroo
9:00 Calendar
9 30 Love Lucy

10:00 The McCor
10:30 Pete and Gladys
'1:00 Love ot Lite
1t:-C- Bi News
11:30 Search For Tomorrow

Light
II: ol the Air
17:30 As The World Turns

1:00 Password
1:30 Houjo Party
J;00 To Tell The Truth

mews

2:30 Jane Wyman
3:00 Secret Storm
3:30 Edge ot Night
4:00 American Bandstand
4: 30 Discovery '43
4:54 American Nevstnd

FRIDAY
Unci, Bll

5:30 Huckleberry Hflund
l:0o-Y- TV Weatherman

:05 Channel 5 Report
6:15 CBS News with Waller Cronkltt

30 Story Ol
7:00 Leave it To Beaver
7:30 Rawhide
1:30 Route it
f:30 I'm Dlckem He' Femter

10:00 Alfred Hitchcock

VVMATSVOMOLUTELV NOTHINK.'J ITAhat's "N rA SLOBBOVIAN )
i T LflOKS TFHtHW. F IT 5MILL V I so coon J

Movie ShowtimeS HUH.GOOD ) ROTTEM, IT GCfT A MASTr
? - rv c rvC 1T1A1.I Ail' (T" C. ) - l

i iv rA Tutri u wr
i wrHi i nrwk,, I msfr

, V J i.'

KOIN-T- V Ch. 6
CHANNEL 83

MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY

7:30 Wearr Forecast
7 35 Cartoon Time
a 00 Captain Kanea--
e 00 Calendar
t 30 I Love Locv

tO McCoys
10:30 Pete and Gladys
1100Lovo Ot Life
11:30 Search For Tomorrow

Light
11:00 New?
11:05 Hi, Neighbor

As The World Tutne
1:00 fcOIN Kitchen
1:30 House Party
l To Tell The Trvtti

f:00 Captain Kangaroo
10:CO Alvin Show
10:30 Laurel a. Hardy
t!:CO-C- BS Nrs
11:15 Baseball

1:30 TV Hour of stars
Laurel and Hardy

3:00 Mighty Mouse Playhouse
3:30 R.n Tin T.n
4 00 Roy Rooers
4 30 Sky K"io
5:00 Red Dunning
5:15 Hollywood Park Part
5:15 Tim. OlI For Soortl
4:00 r.an Frem Cochise
6 33 Ffcerat Men
7:00 Highway Patrol
7:30 Jackie Gieason Show
1:30 Th. Defenders

30 Have Gun, Will Travel
0:0o Gvnsmoke

:00 Saturday Reporter
11:15 Theater

1:30 The Millionaire
3:00 Secret Storm

Edge ot Night
6:00 Cartoon Circus
4:15 Early Show
5:i5 Newscene
4:15 Walter Cronkire

FRIDAY
4 30 M Souad
7 00 Death Valley Days

I 30 Route 44
30 Alfred Hitchcock

10:30 Eyewitness
11:00 Niqhtscene
11:15 Portland Wrestling
12:00 Theater

SATURDAY
7 I
4 06 Cartoon time .
1:30 Sky King

Friday, June 31, 1943
STARLITE DRIVE-I- Ooen at 1:00. Shows

start at dusk. 'The Ugly Americen" and
'The Brave One."

PINE DRIVE-I- Open at I 00. Shows Start
at dusk. "King ScNjmon's Mints" end
"Naved Spur."

CL0V6RLEAF DRIVE IN (Suther'ln) Box
office opens at 1:15. Show starts at dusk.
"it s Only Money" and "Billy Rose's Jum-
bo"

TRl CITY DRIVE IN Gates open 1:00. Show
at 9:X-- "Come September" and "Opera-
tion Bitcini"

Saturday, June ft, 1943
STARLITE DRIVE-I- Ooen at I 00 Shows

start at Ojik. "The Ugly American" and
"1 he Breve One "

PISE DRIVE-I- Op" at t 00. Shows start
at cusfc. "King Solomon's Mines" end
"Naved Sour"

CLOvt RLEAF DRIVE IN (Sutherlin) Box
c"ce open at 1:15. Show starts t dusk.
Out to Dawn Show. "It's Only Money. "
"Jwrr&o". "The Hovnd Dog Man", "Sner- -
I" 0 Fractured Jaw"

TRl CITY DRIVE ooen at I
Sho-- a: ". "Come September" and "Oo- -
eat-o- Bikini"

BESET t'i, iMtATRE (Winston) I'S
-i Voney" and -- The Pigeon That Too

Rome"

v I hop Tocrrsiesl r.oH..n.ErTT,tTlil r,M LUCK KEZI-T- V Ch. 9 j SATURDAY

11 30 Matttcs Furnlrt

i JO J ae Wyman
3 X Qvttn f or A Da
3' 30 Oeen House
4 C0 Arrnfcan 6andjta.-- J

Discovery
Kit con C&nouse

JO Mickey Mouse
FRIDAY

4 News

h lr I -hn xaar; J
I 1 I X 2 QOOO ii3f! I sis. ? ' fcSrn

CHANNEL 6 ON CABLE .

MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY
ll (Monl

for Your Intimation (TueO
Frontiers in Soence (ttedl
Tec't (Thvrsl
Adventures In Living (Fri)

11 )0 Se. nevs
II CO Tcnetsee E'ne Fvi
17 Knows BSt

CO NesSital
1; JO TBA

m Court
1:75 Midday News

tj 00 Buss Benny
17 JO Ataaiem

1:J v Flk-
Roir Deroy

xF.im Fere
S:00 Wtde WerW f Sports
4 x XevNWe
; ooW'Vtf ot Th wee

Mae Tat
I TO Death Vsiier OiT
I JO MOAjfenanov

CO L swfee rtet
10 eo ..Jitiart Ven
11. CO Npws Nine
11:15 Moi

4 JO R.verboef
J X) C vetoes

jv-- W Flint store
0O O'CVens 4 Finite?

77 Svisef $tr.o
o jo One Steo fteyonen coASc

Itlrl Atews Nme
11:30 Cncore Treater

HAMBURGERS1
Mode frem pure choice

e round chuck beef.

THE DAIRY QUEEN
RADIO PROGRAM

KRNR 1490 KC. r Prtsgrommincj j KQSN 1240 KC. 6 A.M. to Midniqlitl KYES 950 KC. Down To Djik
CBS Network fnuin, raws, sysuthor ABC Network imnie rxwi, weather lnocrdnt muuc, ntws, wtothtr. 1144 W. Harvard


