

LEGAL

Acct. No.	Name of Owner and Description of Property	Section or Lot	Tr. S., or Block	Year	Taxes	Interest	Total
85081-3	Birchfield, J D & Neva Glendale Tax Lot 081-3	Pc 9	7	1957-58	\$ 6.33	1.77	\$ 8.10
				1958-59	46.48	10.69	57.17
				1959-60	48.71	7.31	56.02
				1960-61	45.00	3.15	48.15
					\$ 140.52	\$ 22.92	\$ 163.44
85542-2	Gilbert, Madeline A Tax Lot 542-2 M8 V61 176 pg 459 D	4	33	1957-58	101.85	31.57	133.42
				1958-59	92.09	21.18	113.27
				1959-60	110.28	16.54	126.82
				1960-61	101.88	7.13	109.01
					\$ 406.10	\$ 76.42	\$ 482.52
86018-1	Hayes, Alex & Mildred W Clarsia Tax Lot 018-1	Pc 7	2	1957-58	46.66	14.46	61.12
				1958-59	43.43	10.45	53.88
				1959-60	48.90	7.34	56.24
				1960-61	42.74	2.99	45.73
					\$ 180.73	\$ 35.24	\$ 215.97

Date of First Publication: April 20 1962
Date of Last Publication: May 16 1962

IRA C. BYRD
Sheriff and Tax Collector for Douglas County, Oregon
AVERY M. THOMPSON
District Attorney - Attorney for Plaintiff

Justice Department Intervenes In Hospital Segregation Suit

GREENSBORO, N.C. (AP)—The Department of Justice, seeking a federal court order outlawing racial segregation in hospitals built with federal aid, has intervened in a suit filed here by 11 Negro physicians, dentists and patients.

The suit, filed Feb. 12, was among the first steps by the National Association for the Advancement of Colored People to end hospital segregation in the South.

The Department of Justice asked court permission recently to join in the suit against two hospitals that have received \$2.8 million in federal aid for construction.

The department contended that a provision in the Hill-Burton Act of 1946—which permits grants for hospital construction—was unconstitutional.

The challenged provision allows grants "where separate hospital facilities are provided for separate population groups."

A Justice Department attorney filed a motion in U.S. District Court here to intervene in the suit against Moses Cone Hospital and Wesley Long Hospital.

The suit is directed against the separate-but-equal provisions in the Hill-Burton Act, which has been used to distribute hundreds of millions of dollars for construction of hospitals.

The suit charged the two hospitals with discriminating against Negroes in violation of the 14th Amendment to the Constitution. It

also asks that Negro doctors and dentists be allowed to practice at the hospitals.

Herbert S. Falk, attorney for Moses Cone Hospital, declined to comment on the Justice Department move. He said, "We will say what we have to say at the time of the trial."

LEGAL

National Forest Timber For Sale

Black Squaw Salvage Sale (6-62)

Oral auction bids will be received by the forest supervisor, or his authorized representative at the office of the forest supervisor, Federal Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 P.M., June 11, 1962, for all merchantable timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing 156 acres, more or less, within sections 14, 15, 16, 17, 21, 22, 23, 29, 32 and 33, T. 30 S., R. 1 E., W.M., surveyed, in the Umpqua National Forest, Oregon. The estimated volumes are: 770 M board feet of Douglas-fir and pine, 60 M board feet of white fir and other species. The minimum acceptable bid per M board feet is as follows: Douglas-fir and pine \$8.80, white fir and other species \$3.65. This includes the following rates per M board feet for stumpage including deposit for sale area betterment: \$5.00 base rate plus an additional \$2.15 for Douglas-fir and pine, \$2.00 base rate plus an additional \$0.90 for white fir and other species and \$1.65 for slash disposal for all species. The prices bid for stumpage shall be considered as tentative rates, subject to quarterly calendar adjustment upward or downward by 0.5 of the difference between the average of the monthly Douglas-fir region indices, as calculated by the Forest Service for the three previous months, and the following base indices: Douglas-fir and pine 96.68(B), white fir and other species 89.54(A). Such adjustments in the price for stumpage shall be applicable to timber scaled during the three-month period following the quarter for which the adjustment is computed. In no event, however, shall the payment rates for each quarter be less than the base rates as stated above. When the adjusted rates by species are lower than the base rates, the difference between the total dollar value of the timber cut at adjusted rates and at base rates will be recorded for each species. The stumpage rate for a species will not be increased above the base rate until the subsequent adjusted rates above the base rate will develop an accumulated total dollar value for the species in excess of the recorded accumulated difference. Sealed bids will be publicly opened and posted, at the office of the forest supervisor, at 2:00 P.M., on June 11, 1962. All those who submitted a satisfactory sealed bid will be permitted immediately to continue auction bidding. A money order, bank draft, cashier's or certified check in the sum of \$4,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied to the purchase price, refunded, or retained for application to any claim for damages, according to the conditions of sale. If requested by the purchaser, contract terms will permit felling of timber in advance of payment up to the value of the performance bond. If an oral bid is declared to be high at the closing of the auction, the bidder must immediately confirm the oral bid by submitting it in writing on a Forest Service bid form. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Forest Service bid forms for use in submitting sealed bids and full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and the submission of bids should be obtained from the district ranger, Cow Creek Ranger District, Tiller, Oregon, or the forest supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are submitted.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned has been appointed Administrator with Will annexed of the Estate of Albert M. Rowe, deceased. All persons having claims against the estate are required to present them, with the proper vouchers, within six (6) months from the date of the first publication hereof, to the undersigned at the offices of Yates & Murphy, 420 S.E. Jackson Street, Roseburg, Oregon. Dated and first published this 4th day of May, 1962.

ALBERT M. ROWE

Administrator of the Estate of ALBERT M. ROWE, Deceased

Fire Ants May Soon Eat Final Meal Of Grits

GAINESVILLE, Fla. (AP)—Fire ants in north and west Florida may soon eat a last meal of Southern grits.

State Plant Inspector William Cowperthwaite said the meal, to be served by aircraft and ground equipment, will include grits, soybean oil and a poisonous chemical.

He said fire ants are attracted to the deadly meal by the soybean oil and feed the preparation to their queens and larvae. The state is aiding farmers in an intensive eradication campaign against the destructive pests.

Dental Society Leader Lauds Fluoridation Plan

PORTLAND (AP)—Water fluoridation is the greatest contribution the dental profession has made to the dental health and general health of the country, the president-elect of the American Dental Association said recently. He is Dr. Gerald D. Timmons, who addressed the annual meeting of the Oregon State Dental Association in Portland.

Reports from St. Louis, Mo., which has had fluoridation for six years, show a 50 per cent drop in children's cavities, Timmons said.

LEGAL

National Forest Timber For Sale

Crooked Creek Sale

Oral auction bids will be received by the forest supervisor, or his authorized representative at the office of the forest supervisor, Federal Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 P.M., June 11, 1962, for all merchantable timber marked or designated for cutting on an area embracing 156 acres, more or less, within sections 11, 12 and 13, T. 30 S., R. 1 E., W.M., surveyed, in the Umpqua National Forest, Oregon. The estimated volumes are: 6,900 M board feet of Douglas-fir, 1,100 M board feet of ponderosa pine and other species of pine, 500 M board feet of white fir and other species. The minimum acceptable bid per M board feet is as follows: Douglas-fir and pine \$10.70, western hemlock and other species \$2.95. This includes the following rates per M board feet for stumpage including deposit for sale area betterment: \$5.55 base rate plus an additional \$5.50 for Douglas-fir, \$9.00 base rate plus an additional \$1.95 for ponderosa pine and other species of pine, \$2.00 base rate plus an additional \$1.00 for white fir and other species and \$0.35 for slash disposal for all species. The prices bid for stumpage shall be considered as tentative rates subject to quarterly calendar adjustment upward or downward by 0.5 of the difference between the average of the monthly Douglas-fir region indices, as calculated by the Forest Service for the three previous months, and the following base indices: Douglas-fir and pine 103.82(C), western hemlock and other species 89.54(A). Such adjustments in the price for stumpage shall be applicable to timber scaled during the three-month period following the quarter for which the adjustment is computed. In no event, however, shall the payment rates for each quarter be less than the base rates as stated above. When the adjusted rates by species are lower than the base rates, the difference between the total dollar value of the timber cut at adjusted rates and at base rates will be recorded for each species. The stumpage rate for a species will not be increased above the base rate until the subsequent adjusted rates above the base rate will develop an accumulated total dollar value for the species in excess of the recorded accumulated difference. Sealed bids will be publicly opened and posted, at the office of the forest supervisor, at 2:00 P.M., on June 11, 1962. All those who submitted a satisfactory sealed bid will be permitted immediately to continue auction bidding. A money order, bank draft, cashier's or certified check in the sum of \$4,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied to the purchase price, refunded, or retained for application to any claim for damages, according to the conditions of sale. If requested by the purchaser, contract terms will permit felling of timber in advance of payment up to the value of the performance bond. If an oral bid is declared to be high at the closing of the auction, the bidder must immediately confirm the oral bid by submitting it in writing on a Forest Service bid form. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Forest Service bid forms for use in submitting sealed bids and full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and the submission of bids should be obtained from the district ranger, Cow Creek Ranger District, Tiller, Oregon, or the forest supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are submitted.

NOTICE OF ADMINISTRATRIX SALE OF REAL PROPERTY

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that by Order of the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for Douglas County, dated April 16, 1962, the undersigned, as administratrix of the Estate of Olive S. Johnson, deceased, will from and after the 21st day of May, 1962, at the offices of Stultz and Jayne, 414 S. E. Main Street, Roseburg, Oregon, offer and sell at private sale for cash in hand, or upon such terms as the Court may approve, subject to the confirmation of said Circuit Court, all of the following described real property belonging to said deceased: Lots 4 and 7, Block 2, Hamilton Addition to the City of Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon. Written bids will be accepted but the administratrix reserves the right to reject any and all bids received.

OLIVE S. JOHNSON, Deceased

LEGAL

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION as hereinafter designated will be received by the District Manager, Bureau of Land Management, 2583 West Harvard Avenue, Roseburg, Oregon at 9:00 A.M., PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on Friday, June 1, 1962, for all timber marked or designated for cutting. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and submission of bids should be obtained from the above District Manager. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement, and to reject any or all bids. The United States reserves the right to waive any informality in bids received whenever such waiver is in the interest of the United States. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on SW1/4NW1/4, NW1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 13, T. 25 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 929 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 7 M bd. ft. White Fir, 22 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$21.75 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$9.15 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, \$12.45 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$20,543.70 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$2,100.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) under the terms and conditions of Arbitration Agreement No. R-257 with Dean Henry. No fee has been established; (b) under the terms and conditions of Arbitration Agreement No. R-124 with Kenneth and Hallie Ford. No fee has been established; (c) by Federal Access Road; and (d) by Public Road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on Lots 1, 7 and 8, Sec. 3, T. 21 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 607 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 2 M bd. ft. Western Redcedar. No bid for less than \$19.65 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$11.85 per M bd. ft. for the Western Redcedar, or a total purchase price of \$11,951.25 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,200.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) under the terms and conditions of Arbitration Agreement No. R-75 with Woolley Logging Company. No fee has been established; (b) by Government controlled road. No fee; and (c) by Public road. IN DOUGLAS

LEGAL

COUNTY: OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on SW1/4NE1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 11, T. 22 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 413 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 39 M bd. ft. Western Redcedar, 71 M bd. ft. White Fir, 53 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock, 3 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$24.05 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$12.60 per M bd. ft. for the Western Redcedar, \$10.75 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, \$14.10 per M bd. ft. for the Western Hemlock, \$14.00 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$11,976.60 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,200.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) by Federal access road; and (b) by Public road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on SW1/4NW1/4, NW1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 3, T. 22 S., R. 4 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1,301 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 62 M bd. ft. Western Redcedar, 124 M bd. ft. White Fir, 39 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock, 301 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$21.25 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$10.15 per M bd. ft. for the Western Redcedar, \$9.25 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, \$13.00 per M bd. ft. for the Western Hemlock, \$11.55 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$35,318.60 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$3,600.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) under the terms and conditions of Easement No. RE-R-201 with Leonard M. and Pauline Brown. A fee of \$0.50 per M bd. ft. is cited among other conditions; (b) Agreement No. E-103 with Weyerhaeuser Company. No fee; and (c) by Public road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on SW1/4NE1/4, NW1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 17, T. 21 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1,324 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 226 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 76 M bd. ft. Ponderosa Pine, 42 M bd. ft. Sugar Pine, 26 M bd. ft. Western Redcedar, 20 M bd. ft. White Fir, 1 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock. No bid for less than \$18.25 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$8.90 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, \$17.45 per M bd. ft. for the Ponderosa Pine, \$25.40 per M bd. ft. for the Sugar Pine, \$8.35 per M bd. ft. for the Western Redcedar, or a total purchase price of \$13,985.55 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,400.00. Access to

LEGAL

or a total purchase price of \$28,911.20 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$2,900.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) under the terms and conditions of Arbitration Agreement No. R-251 with Roseburg Lumber Company. Fee is subject to arbitration; (b) by Government controlled road; and (c) by Public road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON: CBWR: All timber designated for cutting on SW1/4, Sec. 19, T. 28 S., R. 8 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 519 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 50 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock. No bid for less than \$25.10 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$14.15 per M bd. ft. for the Western Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$13,734.40 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,400.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) by Federal access road. A maintenance fee of \$35.99 will be charged; and (b) by Public road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on SW1/4NW1/4, NW1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 3, T. 28 S., R. 3 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 751 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 206 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 52 M bd. ft. White Fir, 15 M bd. ft. Western Redcedar, 13 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock, 179 M bd. ft. Sugar Pine. No bid for less than \$19.35 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$11.10 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, \$7.50 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, \$10.05 per M bd. ft. for the Western Redcedar, \$10.95 per M bd. ft. for the Western Hemlock, \$26.20 per M bd. ft. for the Sugar Pine, or a total purchase price of \$22,191.35 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$2,300.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) by Federal access road. A road maintenance fee of \$97.28 will be charged; and (b) by Public road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on NW1/4, NW1/4NW1/4, Lot 3 (NW1/4SW1/4), Sec. 19, T. 27 S., R. 3 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 581 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 10 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 1 M bd. ft. Western Redcedar. No bid for less than \$23.80 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$14.50 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, \$12.75 per M bd. ft. for the Western Redcedar, or a total purchase price of \$13,985.55 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,400.00. Access to

LEGAL

the sale area is assured the Purchaser via Road No. 27-4-14, which is under: (a) the jurisdiction of the Bureau of Land Management; (b) the terms and conditions of Arbitration Agreement No. R-220 with Wilbur Lumber Company. The conditions of use of the road owned by Wilbur Lumber Company will be subject to negotiation and arbitration between the Purchaser and Wilbur Lumber Company; (c) the terms and conditions of Semi-detailed Agreement No. R-477 with United States Plywood Corporation. No fee; and (d) by Public road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on NW1/4NE1/4, NW1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 31, T. 20 S., R. 6 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2,635 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, No bid for less than \$17.40 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, or a total purchase price of \$45,849.00 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$4,600.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) by Government controlled road; and (b) by Public road. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON: O&C: All timber designated for cutting on NW1/4NE1/4, NW1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 9; SW1/4NW1/4, NW1/4NW1/4, Sec. 11; Lot 4 (NW1/4NW1/4), Sec. 15, T. 30 S., R. 2 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 682 M bd. ft. Douglas-fir, 134 M bd. ft. Sugar Pine, 7 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock, 27 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 74 M bd. ft. Grand Fir. No bid for less than \$20.85 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas-fir, \$28.50 per M bd. ft. for the Sugar Pine, \$10.10 per M bd. ft. for the Western Hemlock, \$10.95 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, \$7.45 per M bd. ft. for the Grand Fir, or a total purchase price of \$19,164.85 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$2,000.00. Access to the sale area is available: (a) under the terms and conditions of Arbitration Agreement No. R-193 with Stomax Lumber Company. No pre-set road use fee has been determined; (b) under the terms and conditions of Semi-detailed Agreement No. R-656 with Longview Fibre Company. A road use fee of \$93.40 is cited among other conditions; (c) by Government controlled road. A special use permit will be needed across U.S. Forest Service lands; and (d) by Public road.

1481 N. E. Stephens OPEN MON. & FRI. NIGHT 'TIL 9 OR 2-4811

MONTGOMERY WARD

GUARANTEED NATIONWIDE AGAINST ROAD HAZARDS!

SALE PRICES EFFECTIVE
FRIDAY 2 PM - MONDAY 9 PM



RIVERSIDE
4-SQUARE GUARANTEE
1. Agreed road hazards for the specified time. Adjustments provided on monthly basis.
2. Agreed deflation, punctures, workmanship for life of tread. Adjustments provided on tread wear.
3. Nationwide service at all branches.
4. Satisfaction guaranteed. Adjustments based on safe price when returned.

Riverside
AIR CUSHION
NYLON
1188*
6.70-15 tube-type blackwall

NO MONEY DOWN
GUARANTEED 18 MOS.

- 4-ply Nylon cord body for extra blowout protection
- Hundreds of deep, road-grIPPING edges in tread

Drive with confidence coast to coast! Your nationwide Riverside guarantee covers such hazards as chuck holes, railroad ties, jagged concrete, broken glass.

Tube-type blackwall	Tubeless blackwall
6.70-15 11.88*	6.70-15 or 7.50-14 13.88*
7.10-15 12.88*	7.10-15 or 8.00-14 15.88*
7.60-15 15.88*	7.60-15 17.88*

Whitewalls \$3 more *plus excise tax and your old tire

FREE MOUNTING!

SPECIAL! MICRO-PRECISION WHEEL BALANCING
Balanced wheels add extra mileage to your tires, give smoother rides, easier steering, eliminate vibration too.

1.40
per wheel incl. weights