
Frl. Junt 13, 1958 The News-Revie- Rpseburg, Ore. 11Two Districts To Cer Fluoridated WaterAnswer to Previous Puzili LEGALLEGAL
Flower Show

LEGALLEGAL
the boards approved It. The two
dislricts draw water from four
deep wells located near Spring-- I

field.

Na. 1U
NOTICE OF ailEElJrT'l

AI.K OF REAL PROPKKTT
IN THE CltU'UT COLRT OF
TIIR STAIR OF ORFUUN FOR
TUB CO I. STY OK DOI ULA1

INVESTMENT SERVICE CO.,
an Oregoa eorporatton,

Plaintiff,

CALL FOR Bins
Tht UnHraignd will rt.v Mated

bids for tht initAllatlon and conetruciionot S Mercury Vapor LihU in ih City of
Wimlon, Oregon, to b ronalrucied on
M foot treated wood polea, bid. to In-

clude 5 Mercury Vapor Luminalrei
iWeitinghoiu ul or compar-abl- e

fixture, Wait Mercury Va- -

TIMBER FOR SAI.E, UNITED $7.30 per M bd. (t. fur the Incense
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE Cedar, $7.10 per M bd. ft. lor the
INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND Western Red Cedar, $9.15 per M

MANAGEMENT, ORAL AUCTION bd. ft. for the White Fir, or a ta

gIEN EiMtllL RETg.Jlil
EINITjE 5J "RE P'.ciL.

S.PIAIR gg g y KJ AIMIO
cian Lg5 rIeIp
AUE kAE MAIT
gETl Re'tIl O IN S

I UAIN gr -
g age- ATpT x pel aoe

B D S E R V E5 J.TOEIRlsl MrIeIsIm IpIeIn

VI. bids as hereinafter designated will':"' Premise price oi ...

SPRINGFIELD, Ore. (AP) -S-

ome 2,500 customers of the su-

burban Rainbow and McKenzie
Highway water districts will prob-

ably start receiving fluoridated
water by September, Jay C. Hicks
Jr., superintendent of tlie two dis-
tricts said here. .

He said directors of the two dis-

tricts asked him to get bids on
purchase of fluoridation equip-
ment, which will take about 60

days lo install.
Hicks said petitions signed by

600 water users were received
recently, urging fluoridation, and

FLOYD C. WEST, a ainglt man, be received bv the District Man-and IJUNHA LUVtU, Dtfmdanu. ayer. Bureau of Land Management. area is available under the terms
and conditions of (a) easement

NAMED SUPERVISOR

SALEM (AP) Leonard A.
Portland, was appointed

Thursday as supervisor of the Tax
Commission's industrial appraisal
section.

He was a heating contractor be-

fore joining the Tax Commission
as an appraisal engineer three
years ago.

On May II. 1.S8. the pUinliff obLmrd ... li.r..ftr.i AenUe, Hose- -
peru,n.l Judgment in th .bov.-ci- . r'WJ

pur umpi, 9 lamp Dauaiu complete,5 - 35 foot full treated wood polea, 3
electric eyea for automatic control, pow-
er tervice. including metering, weath--
er proof disconnect. 5 maUrrm, and bid
should b in the alternative for 14 foot

lor IS foot arms, bid to include the necea-- I
sary labor and equipment for makingthe installation of complete operatingunits for each Hint, the asm to h

RE with C. G. & L. t. Hunt
N" fee rerl I and ( l aurcennd.nt Kiojd c ,n.i. nd emxIA. M.. PACIFIC STANDARD 18 req

DOWN

1 Endure
2 Passage in

tbe brain
3 Solitary
4 Collection

of sayings
5 Chemical

hydrocarbon
6 Entreaties
7 Division of

geological
time

8 Ellipsoidal
9 Thread

(comb, form;
10 River in

Belgium
12 Lease
13 Fawns
18 Habitation
20 Inset
21 Stretch

of lorecioturt of npuu ri P'"-- : Tii f on Fridav Julv 11 1958 for "tent wnn empire .niuwui
moriguic nereioioro liven ay uiu ; ' I iirnfln Ionf,,d c. ., whieh mor,.... all Umber marked or dcs.sna.ed ,fjnn,T "limber do- -cated within the City of Winston, Oregon.

22 Fondles
23 Chicago's

business
district

24 Feminine
appellation

27 Gaelic
28 Get up
29 Sheaf
31 Different

have

40 Straighten
41 Hollow

cylinder
42 Work units
4.1 Saucy
44 Genus of

shrubs
46 Location
47 River in

Germany
48 Trial

location inereor may be deter
mined by making Inquiry of tht under- -
signed, and bids will be received up io
7 SO o'clock, pm , Monday. June 10
latH In that nf ,k. a i.

judirnwnt l lo-- Iho principal .urn o( m.,i.,j Signaled for CIltllllR on SEWNtH,"'"nation C ontern-- 1
1."J plui ir.lete.t thereon . I th. r.l. S,e- - 17. NW4,

of S per cenl per annum from December inR the timber, the Conditions of,e""' If'1 p jyy WMFROM NINE TO FIVE By Jo Fischer
estimated for the purpose of this.11 m of tJ3 50. dIui UM 00 attorne:City of Winston, Oregon. be obtained from the above Dis

feet, plui plaintiff's com and ditbur-men-

in tha amount of $22 0..
Said decrte of foreclour order! mat

H j. Kieve.
City Recorder
City of Winston
City Hall
Winston, Oregon

thr following real proiwrly, to wil:varied flower: s 50 Air (comb.

trict Manager. The ripht is here-
by reserved to waive technical
defects in this advertisement and
to reject any or all bids. The Unit-
ed States reserves the risht to
waive any informality in bids re

sale to be 2,407 M bd. It. Doug-
las fir, 110 M bd. ft. incense Ce-

dar. 77 M bd. ft. White Fir, 80
M bd. fl. Wpslern Red Cedar, 39
M bd. ft. Western Hrmlock, 9
M bd. ft. Sucar Pine. No bid for
less than $22.95 per M bd. ft. for

36 Genus of
herbs

form)
52 Light brown

Republicans Offer ceived whenever such waiver is in

ACROSS

1 Fragrant
flower

6 Hybrid (lower
11 One who

makes amends
13 East Indian

flower buds
14 Legislative

body
15 Title again
16 Cornish

town (prefix)
17 Abstract

beings
19 Gibbon
20
22 Carpenter's

implement
25 National

guard (ab )

26 Dry (comb,
form)

30 Eternities
31 Sheepfold
32 You should

dead
parts
from flowers

33 Musical
quality

34 Measures
of type

35 Essential
being

36 Mast
37 Goddess of

the earth
3B Flout

!39 Stained'
42 Roof finial

;45 Chinese
flower

46 Harden
149 Keep

51 Befall
53 Golf course
54 Puffs up
55 Look fixedly
56 Indolent

the interest tlie Dtn,Klas " fir Sh 60 Pcr M h(1--

Ai TJi?.!?. MeJ-- ft. for the Incense Cedar, $3.40 perCompromise Bill ... wwwwk.j wviiiii ORE ... t 4i- .- urui ec ift
ill mi, u. lm uie iihc in,
per M bd. ft. for the Western Red
Cedar and Western Hemlock, $10.-B- 0

per M bd. ft. for the Sugar
Pine, or a total purchase price ot

I Mr.WUMP I f
' pptmT Arr Vi - ! I I

"

CON: O&C LAND: ORAL BID:
GREEN: All timber designated for
cutting on NEVa, EVaSW'a, W'2SE

NEV4SEV4, Sec. 25, T. 29 S.f
R. 3 W., W. M estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 4.5ti6 M
bd. ft. Douglas - fir, 12 M bd. ft.
Sugar d'me, 88 M bd. ft. Incense
Cedar, 2 M bd. ft. Hemlock, 1 M
bd. ft. White Kir. No bid for less
than $20.20 per M bd. fl. for the
Douglas - fir, $23.40 per M bd. ft.
for the Sugar Pine, $9.30 per M
bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar. K4

WASHINGTON (AP) - Repub-
licans offered a compromise
which they said was acceptable to
President Eisenhower on the

issue of Defense
reorganization this

week.
The offer was made in the

House, where the reorganization
bill was tinder final debate, by
Rep. Leslie B. Arends of Illinois,
senior Republican on the Armed
Services Committee.

Beginning at a point in in
Road which bari North 4

dtfreea 10 minulM Eatt 2705 0 frvt
and South 7 drgreea Wrl 64 0 frl
from the quarter irctton corner
between Sections 29 and 36, Town-hi- p

:i0 South, Kange fl WeM, WlUam-t- t
Mendan, Douglaa County, Ore-

gon. Thence South 68 degrees 42

minute Weit 326.94 feet along g

fioad to the moit easterly
corner of the Clifford and Nellie
Pleasant property as described in
Volume 244. Recorder'a No. 1(H142,

Douglas County Died Records.
Thence along the easterly and
northerly boundaries of aaid Pleat-an- t

property North 20 degrees West
200.00 feet, South 77 degrees West
190.0 feet, and North 'iS degrees
West 81 5 feet. Thence North de-

gree HO minutes East 4ti:t.O feet
long the southeasterly boundary and

the westerly extension of said south-
easterly boundary of the Mike Wal-

ter and Edith Florence Bozeck pro-

perty as described in Volume 2M,
Recorder'! No. 215926. Douglas Coun-
ty Deed Records, to the most west-

erly corner of the William and Helen
Anderson property as described in
Volume 241, Recorder's No. ltt.JB24.

Douglas County Deed Records.
Thence South 32 degrees 15 minutes
Ei lit 423.0 feet along the westerly
boundary of said Anderson property
to the place of beginning, in Doug-
las County, Oregon,

should be sold as upon execution al
law and the proceeds applied as fol
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$57,805.55 will be considered. Ac-

cess to the sale area is available
under the terms and conditions of

(a) agreement with Conifer
I.osgiim Company (b) easement
Rli with Western Battery
Separator Company. A total fee
of $673.00 is cited among other
conditions, (c) easement RE
Willi Harbor Plywood Corporation.per M bd. ft. for the $9.- -Just before Arends took the per M oil. ft. for the WhitPfloor. Chairman Carl Vinson ID Kir, or a total nurclmsR nvioa nfGa) of the armed services group

had delivered a speech
$93,351.15 will bo considered. Ac-
cess to the sale area is available
under the terms and conditions of
easement RE with Daniel Per-
due and easement HE with
Cmpciua PI v wood ( .'nrnnrat inn A

Free use is cited ainonR other con-

ditions. (A) casement RE with
Umpqua Plywood Corporation. A
fee of $.15 per M hd. ft. is cited
among other conditions, (e) per-
mit with Conifer Logging Com-

pany. Minimum deposit with hid
$5,800.00. SALVAGE: All timber
designated for cutting on Loti 1,

J, 3, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, See. 13,

T. 27 S R. 4 W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
459 M bd. ft. Douglas - fir, 5 M

foe of $.10 per M hd. ft. for RE !
"If you can't understand the words and its no good for

dancing,' then its opera."SUBSCRIBE TO THE NEWS-REVIE- ana $.75 pcr M bd. ft. for RE
is cited amnnc nihr.r pnnii.

tions. Minimum deposit with bid
$9,400.00. All timber designated for hd. ft. Western Hemlock. 23 M bd.

blistering the objections Eisen-
hower had raised to the commit-
tee's version of the hill.

Under the compromise, it would
take the protests of two heads of
armed services, instead of only
one, to appeal to Congress a de-

cision of the secretary of defense
abolishing or transferring a maj-
or fighting function of one of the
services.

Rep. Paul Kilday one
of the principal architects of the
committee version of the legisla-
tion, asked Arends whether he
could say if Eisenhower would ac-

cept the three amendments Ar-
ends suggested. Arends said he
could give that assurance.

. . . . .

r"Sl, ' " J:"". ?.D' SVjNB , inconse Cedar. 14 M bd. ft.

P, but, Keepers; v--. nvITi pont even Jl
R I ; It,' PRISCILLA!' ( I DON'T KNOW ) h fcX.-d- KNOW MOWyWMAT SHAUW V (IT'S SUPPOSED S WHAT TO r-- t' 3 (MUCH VOUW
I I GIVE YOU FOR) 77rf TO BE A --r BUY..! i All 5S VJNANT TO r?'c fathers dax V1 iv' c. -- .!'?" Western Red Cedar. No hid for less

lows:
Firit: To tn payment of costi of
sale and other coiU and disburse-
ments taxed herein amounting to
122 05. and to payment of plaintiff's
attorneys' fees allowed herein
amounting to $150 00; and
Second: To the payment of the
amounts due and owing to the,
plaintiff set forth above: and
Third: To the amounts due and ow-

ing by defendant Floyd C. West to
Donna Lovett in accordance with
the following: principal sum of
$317.31, plus interest thereon at the
rate of 3 per cent per month from
November 19, 1957, until paid, plus
the further sum of S21.21; and
Fourth: Any balance remaining
thereafter is to be paid to the clerk
of this court to be disposed of aa
this court may direct.
An execution was issued out of said

court on May 28. 1958, directed lo me
and commanding me to sell ?atd proper-
ty, and pursuant thereto and by virtue
of the judgement and decree of fore-
closure and said execution, I will on
Friday, the 11th day of July,
1(158, at the front door of the Countv

than $13.25 pcr M bd. ft. for the
Douglas - fir, $3.50 pcr M bd. ft.
for the Western Hemlock, $3.60 per
M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar
and Western Red Cedar, or a total
purchase price nf $6,232.45 will be
considered. Access to the sale area
is available under the terms and
conditions nf easement RE
with E. L. Paris. A fee of $.35 per
M bd. ft. is cited among other con-

ditions. Minimum deposit with bid
$650.00.

7.7.. ' " ' 5
W.M., estimated for the purposeof tins sale to be 792 M bd. ft.
Douglas - fir. 19 M hd. ft. White
Mr, 35 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar,
4 M bd. ft. Western Red Cedar,3 M bd. ft. Western Hemlock. No
bid for less than $23.45 per M bd
ft. for the Douglas - fir, $11 25 perM bd. ft. for the White Fir, $9
25 per M hd. fl. for the Incense
tedar, $8 55 per M bd. ft. for the
Western Red Cedar, S8 40 per M
bd. ft. for the Western Hemlock, or
a total purchase price of $19,169 .10
will be considered. Access lo the
sale area is available under the
terms and conditions nf oomn.

Judge Awards $75 Claim
To Consulting Engineer

District Judge Warren A. Wood-
ruff has ordered a $75 judgment
for plaintiff Arthur James, Port-
land consulting engineer, against
Industrial Supply Corp. of Rose
burg.

James alleged in the civil suit

Courthouse in Douglas County, Oregon,
at 3:00 P M.. sell at public auction,
to the highest bidder for cash In hand,
alt of the right, title and interest which
any of the defendants herein had hi

ment with Nyberg LumberTHAT'STOUOH.

NO TICK OF HAlJt
For ante by mealed bid tht following

rticribd property locitrrl In the City of
Rnsehurg. County of Douglas, Stat of
Ore Ron,

Thoe portions of properly described
In County Clerk' Record tn Volume
US, pnRe 32.1, which U described Rt
follows: Beginning at an Iron pipe on
the east line of said recorded prop-
erty, which ta North 'I degree 3V

I f THEKS 15 UTTLE HE WA5 OKI
and to said real property or any part

ami Willi lioseburgLumber Company. Minimum de-
posit with hid $2.000 00 nir

thereof on July 28. 11158. or any timeTHff POINT
OP

MHOPB OF COWNS OUT

OFHISCOMA.SIfiNCKE, W --A
VI rtll'T Et.ll TUP llllllto

the local company owed his
firm a $405 fee for preliminary
building plans, and that thev had
paid only $75 on a $485 bill, indus-
trial Supply contested the claim.

LAND: All timber designated for
cumng on wvjNEV., NVjNW4, S
'23W'4, NWV45EV4, Sc. 9, T. 22'
S., R. 4 W., W.M., estimated for
the purpose ot this sale to be 2
M9 M bd. ft. Douglas . fir, 215

thereafter. Such sale shall be made to
satisfy said execution, Judgement and
decree of foreclosure, interest, costs and
accruing costs, and the real property
so sold shall he subject to redemption
according to law.

Dated this 6th dav of June, 1958.
IRA C. BYHD
Sheriff of Douglas County,
Oregon
Ry Nova Bates
Deputy

First Publication: June A, IffB
Last Publication: June 27, 195B

... m. ii. wmie e ir, 5 M bd. ft.
Incense Cedar. 13 M hd rt w.i.ern Red Cedar, and 13 M hd. ft.
Western Hemlock. No bid for loss
than $22.00 pcr M bd. ft. for the
Douglas - fir, $10.45 per M bd ft

Wet 13 feet from th Southeast
corner of in id properly and 237.1.1

feet North 7:U feet west of the
Snuthcmt corner of snld Lehnherr
Donation Land Claim, thenca running
South ftft degrees :V West 100 feet
to an Iron pipe; thence North 2

39' Weil 100 fret on a Una
pitrallel with the East line of said
recorded property to an Iron pipe;
thence Noilli fl!) degree 33' F.ast
100 feet to an Iron pipe on the East
line of said recorded property on the
West line of road, thence South a
rieRrees !tV Ensl 100 feet along said
rout. In the pNice of heclnnltig. and
situated (n Sertlon 14, Township 37
South, Rang fl West. Wlllametle Me-

ridian, Doitglai County, Oregon,
neiirlngii bused on East line of said
recorded property being North 3 de-

grees ,1V West according lo said
deed records. Reserving unto F. T.

Betts and Fannie F. Belts, husband
and wife, Ihe South IS feet of above
described property for roadway.
Prooerlv conslsls of X WH Ft. lot and

'

COMMODORE HOTEL
S. W. MORRISON at 16th

PORTLAND

Undsr tht partonal

monagtmint of

FRANK G. BODIN

Moke The Commodore
Your Portland Headquarters

For reiervotioni, call

CApital

;ne, Wmle 8 !W Per M
nri. fl. for the Incense Cedar, $8.- -

MAINTENANCE SHOPS
LEBANON (AP) Maintenance

shops to serve fyational Guard
units in a wide area will be built
here by September, Mayor Ralph
Scroggfn said Tuesday.

The shops will serve guard units
in Eugene. Albany. Redmond.

.i j.i un. ii. Kir tlie Western
Red Cedar, $8.05 per M hd. fl. for
Ine Western Hemlock, or a total
purchase price of $59,164.10 will be
considered. Access to the sale area
is available under the termsLlSTerjtT But if I cam keep

THAT ALARM Newport, Cottage Grove, Bend, dillon". of c, wi"
Corvalhs and Lebanon. Mountainside Lumber Comply!

f DAD,DOYA HAVE To)
SET YOUR ALARM?
IT WAKES MEJOO,

BUIER LET HIM CON-
TINUE WORON6 FOR.
THE SAKE OF My

a home with del ached gar

MAY BF
SUMMER.

VACATION
FOtYfXI,

i.i milium deposit wilh bid $6,000.00.
All timber designated for cuttingIM THE MORNING I ALLOWANCE

BUT I STiLU .m. nvmE.'4, SCHNt'i, NE'.SEVaLAWN SPRINKLER SYSTEMHAVE TO SO To R. 7 W.. W Mec. 13, I, li 51
WORK.'

age. Separale utility room plumbed for
washer and drier. Plastered interior,
large kitchen, hardwood floor In living
room, screens. On paved street City
water Located at 13U2 N.W. Keasey
Road. Rosehurg.

Sale will be hy sealed bid. Envelops f
rnntaining bid must he plainly marked
"Sealed Rid." Please refer to
In all correspondence A good and suffi-
cient bond or certified check for ten
per cent H0' of bid must accompany

cstiiniilctl for thp purpose of this

t ( Ijost Mope the lump
VDOESNT PUT HIM sj A

jjjg . u a. f.t. on.1

sdie io np i.ny M hd. ft, Doticlas- -

fr;.3?JAIebd- ft- Iac,,,sp Ce(Iflr.
bd. ft. Western Hemlock, 42

M d. ft. Weslirn IfoH riUn n
any

'aa
M hd. ft. While '"ir o hirl

'
ff.r hld R"I,,t 11 r",'rv'l ,n reject

less than " birt" P"P"ty will he snldtH .

1,1 PT M bd. ft. for Is" Minimum price It Fifty Six Hum

YOU CAN INSTALL A A ff D J
COMPLETE SYSTEM AT T".UU rQt VXQQ

SAVE TIME AND HAVE A LUXURIOUS LAWN.
Termi if desired See us for particular,.

COEN SUPPLY CO.
Hoed & Mill Srt. Phone OR

dred
Flflv Dollars iS.WSO not. Minimum acne I'uuKia - nr. per M bd

ft. for the Incense Cedar and West-
ern !icd Cedar. Sl.ih nor to ht ft

ceptable terms ten percent i.O'i.1 down,
twelve '12' vrars to pay balance on con

Interest will be charged at the
for the Western Hemlock $9 15 ncr !' "f five percent t5rn per annum on

unnairl h.lanre..! I'll. II. lor IMP Whip Kir nr
a total purchase price of $40.43!).-7- 5

will be considerpfl. Arfp. in
Ihe sale area is available under
Hie terins anil ronililions of

PARKING ot CHURCH'S ment with II. R. & Amv

Kubipct In an nntilandlnr rieht of
until February i4. 19!.

Btd will b op.ned In thp offlra of
1h. uitrirrilsntd on Juno 20, 19.1a at
100 p m.
Dnle of flr.t puhllcatinn: May 3. loM
Data of IhkI nubliratlon: June 13, loss

nmKc'Ton
OK VF.TKHANS AFFAIRS
Rlalp Finanrp Bulldlnf
8altm, Orpann

(I? UP'V4 MEATEVOUR ' J ( NOW, 1 )
For FATHER'S DAY
MATTOX' FIRESIDE

PIPE MIXTURE -S?t-i

League. .Minimum deposit with
M $1,100 011. All timlier riesicnat-e-

fur cuttinR on Loti 12, 13, 15
ft H, See. 7, T. 25 S., R. 3 W.,
W.M.. estimated for tlie purpose
of this sale to be 727 M hd. ft.
DoiiKlas . fir, 108 M bd. ft. In

Eatremcly Mild
RECORDING SECRETARY

CINCINNATI (AP)-M- rs.
L. Rcacan. Salem, Ore.,

2.50-1.- 25; cense Cedar, 29 M bd. ft. West
ei n Hed Cedar, 8 M bd ft. While Thursday was reelected recording
Kir. No bid for less than $22.10 lecretary of the National Council

per M bd. ft. for the Uouclas - fir, 'of Baptist Women.

" Kk ' n

wood! sawdust

BLOWER r SERVICE TjI I I Open Evening,
'xvN--- f 00"i 'Til 10 P.M. : ROSEBUR&i: LBR. CO.

1HF.N IHE Bui TWO YES... THEV MADE T- - I OrJvlOUSLV NOW ) ONLY A TW V" fC3B 1 Y

HC4DED IM( UEJ AM ATTEMPT" TO ..THEY TRiED TO ITD'DMT. NO HEAOEP SOOTA f J,,'
FOUDOMTHAT CO'. ONCF. B.lT CA5CV OM B' 1 AND THAT V TRACE A iSOO AMO D6PRE3iN5. I YES.. IT

PV'lfiC 1! AMP ( MOST CP THEM SVAKIM MCi EARTH I WA5 CMLV I REKAINS7 A FEW V SNTI1? RfcALlY' FREE! PIPE HOLDER for your car

SillrEOW-- E OF AN- - fV Or THcx UUNlLM.N LV'N'T THINK. IT YtAlO S M 1 III J I J jCsliilainiiire 1IMHP.H Haai
Ont ta ht cuitomcr while thy last.

Excluiively in Koicburg (

CHURCH'S DRUG STORE Rose Hotel Annex
OTHER PLANET? ' rVEP OUT- - brlT ' rJMIU

ini Summer Rates on Planer Ends Now

Phone OS 41

Peeler Core Oak Green Slob Sawduir For Mulch

5

liiissmrnm Warehouse Sale!
PUBLIC AUCTION

June 14th 9 A.M.
Household Goods and Personal Effects

CORRECTION
An incorrect price appeared in Thurtdjy't
advertisement- of the City Drivo-l- n Market.

ii!.J.
...iH AT A 3 vCj) tcvS
v0 Bcv,5TEAro) H,CCUPS- -

i1
Sravtt

Rifrlgtrarort
Corroni
Bedroom Furniture

Weahing Mochinei

Trunin
Borreli
And Mony Other)

LETTUCE 25cWoi Adverting Large Hcod

IT SHOULD HAVE BEEN

--J HOW DO VOL) LIKE VJELL.ANVWAV, lljll1 i
(, MY NEW SAC DQSS. 'T CuPFD MY J

-- V DAGwOOO ' ( HiCCuPS j

?J --"- i

if ;m ;

'

Flegel's Warehouse
Across From Benson School

LETTUCE 3;25cLarge
Headi


