
LEGAL LEGAL LEGAL LEGAL LEGAL LEGAL FrI., June 21, 1957 The News-Revie- Roseburg, Ore. 7

Timber For SaleRoseburg Garbage $17.00: Ameri
KOTK'K Or KIIKIllFr s HAI.E

In the Circuit Court of the state of
Oretion for the County of Douglas, Casa

19IB2.
NATIONAL I.IKE INSURANCE COM-

PANY, a Vermont Corporation, plain-
tiff, VI. JACK O. PALMER and LOLA

PALMER, husband and wife, de-
fendant!.

By virtue of an execution Issued out

COUNTY COURT PROCEEDINGS
FOR THE MONTH of MAY, 19S7

Mty
1 Order made Accepting Deeds

in re Widening of Edenbower--
ill wood Bd No. 6.

Release of Mortgage was Ac-

cepted on strip of land for
Widening Council Creek Rd.
No. 93.

3 Certain Portion of Winches-
ter Bay Tidelands Park &

ONLY Westinghouse
FROST-FRE- E

DOES ALL THREE!

67; C. Gaylor $262.74; E. Roop
$239.97; R. Fuller $259.97; L. Heath
$381.47; G. Bodine $252.10; E. No-le- n

$289.82; T. Martin $144.22; W.I
Matson $59.25; E. Melton $344.47;
T. Beall $267.67; I. Carlton $257.62;
W. Smith $300.85; T. Brinigar $262.-7-

J. Lynch $278.36; R. Spalding
$322.52; F. Hedrick $280.52; J.
Thornton $292.74; J. Monroe $262.-7-

B. Gurney $293.89; G. Rockwell
$278.99; J. Engle $262.82; F. Mead
$279.12; A. May $754.98; H. Morrill
$384.45; W. Paulin $362.25; D.
Garrett $316.49; M. Ikelton $286.87;
A Mortensen $342.22; L. Hamilton
$168.83; D. McWhorter $266.25; J.
Hess $265.57; W. Bulmer $234.57;
D. Johnston $281.23; W. Glenn
$266.24; C. Perry $262.08; D. d

$361.46; L. Maddox $343.15;

Pemberton 4 Son $4612.86; Co.
Surveyor $42.00; ISt Church Naia-ren- e

$65.00; B. F. Shearer Co. $56.-2-

DOGS: Roseburg Book Store
$8.10; Pac. T & T $34.15; Union
Oil Co. $62.36; D Ware et al $20.-0-

Animal Indemnity: C. E. Mab-le- y

et al $468 00; Citv of Rose-
burg $502.40; Vital Statistics: V. R.
Thomas $137.00.
DATED THIS 7th DAY OF JUNE
1957.

GENERAL ROADS
WARRANTS DRAWN IN PAY-

MENT OF: Culverts, Concrete,
Freight, Capital, Asphalt Paving,
Grease, Oil, Gas, Insurance, Lum-

ber, Tires, Equipment Rental,
Rocks, Tools, Parts, Supplies and
Expense for the month of May
1957: GENERAL ROADS:- West
Coast Steel Works $5464.80; Todd
Building Co. $23649.04; L. F. Glenn
$279.51; Central Lincoln Peoples
Utilitv $11.50: J. C. Compton

TM PATS. NOS. ,45,I73 and I.124.W.

.JO.?
FROST FREE automatically dejrostt the
FREEZER only when needed . . , thanks
to the magic counter button !
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$139.40; Drain Chain Saw Service
$3.40; Mark Hatfield See. of State
$20.00; Lockwood Motors $8.50; OK
Rubber Welders $13.65; Oregon
Nevada Calif. Freight $2.00; Pac
T & T $57.80; Pierce Freight Lines
$4.09; Reedsport Motel $60.00;
Shell Oil $74.79; Signal Oil $440.47;
Standard Oil $1788.68; Texas Co.
$300.80; Trowbridge Electric $350.- -

W; Umpq.ua Valley. Appliance $3&

75; Shell Oil $4120.70; Do. Co.
Lumber $1238.27; Western Auto As-

sociate Store $1.59; Pac. T & T

$24.80; A. Green $270.32; R. Briggs
$20.61; Balzer Machinery $7.20;
COPCO $176.48; Consol. Freight
$2.00; Lockwood Motors $878.10;
Pierce Freight $61.61; Rays
Truck Parts $18.58; Union Oil Co.

$592.38; Roseburg Paving $9606.55;
1st Nat'l Bank of Portland Kla-

math Falls' Br. $1336.20; Armco
Drainage & Metal Prod. $15255.84;
L. E. Hillock et al $1650.00; U.S.
Nat'l Bank $6363.30; St. Tax Com-

mission $1395.68; PERS $1339.00;
Soc. Sec. $1559.62; SIAC $1289.70;
So. Pac. $1632.96; 1st Nat'l Bank

Klamath Falls Br., $1293.60;
Todd Bldg. $17627.64; American
Steel and Supply $214.02; Joe book- -

shnis $984.81; Capital Saw Shop
$2.00; City of Canyonville sb.uo;
City of Reedsport $3.00; Co. Sur-

veyor $46.30; Do. Electric Coop-

erative $18.38; E. I. DuPont De Ne
mours & Co. $153.30: Fire Equip.
$2.50; Fishers Supply $307.45; Ger- -

retsen Bldg. Supply sasz.ui; L.. r.
Glenn $219.61; Harolds Chevron
Station $46.76; Harvey Hdw. $1.23;
J. E. Haseltine $97.61; Hydraulics
Unlimited $11.42; Lockwood Mo-

tors $919.79; Printing
$59.72; Motor Supply Co. $194.01;
Nelson & Pvle Woodworking $959.-8-

Norris-Walk- Paint $43.87;
Oregon Agricultural Chemicals
$164.96; Pacific Machinery & Tool!
Steel $135.24; Pac. T & T $14.45;

No clocks ... No timers ... No dials to set !

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE No.

INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
or SEALED BIDS as hereinafter M.

designated will be received by the
District Forester, Bureau of Land of

Management, at the Knights of
Pythias Hall. 638 S.E. Rose Street. a
Roseburg. Oregon, beginning at
9:00 A.M. PACIFIC STANDARD
TIM E on July 12, 1957 for all tim-
ber marked or designated for cut-

ting.
O.

Before bids are submitted,
full information concerning the of

timber, the conditions of sale and
submission of bids should be ob-

tained from the above District For-
ester, 2583 West Harvard Avenue,
Roseburg, Oregon. The right is
hereby reserved to waive techni-
cal defects in this advertisement
and to reject any or all bids. The
United States reserves the right

waive any informality in bids
received whenever such waiver is

the interest of the United States.
IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: ORE-
GON: O&C LAND: ORAL B I D:
GREEN: All timber designated
for cutting on NENW1,

Stc. 25, T. 31 S R. 3 W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose

tnis sale to be z.lil M txl. It
Douglas Fir, 42 M bd. ft. Ponde- -

rosa I'ine, 9 At oa. tt. unite Fir,
M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 2 M

bd. ft. Sugar Pine, 10 M bd. ft.
Hemlock. No bid for less than
$25.55 per M bd. ft. for the Doug
las nr, 528.05 per nl bd. ft. for
the Pondcrosa I'ine, $7.40 per M
bd. ft. for the White Fir and Hem-

lock, $4.90 per M bd. ft. for the
Incense Cedar, $26.35 per M bd.
ft. for the Sugar Pine, or a total
purchase price of $55,322.15 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $3,400.00. All timber designated
for cutting on SMjNEVi, SEWNWH,
N(4SWM, SEV4SW4, SWMSEH,
Sec. 25, T. 31 S., R. 6 W., W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 5,559 M bd. ft. Douglas
Fir, 8 M bd. ft. Pondcrosa Pine,
116 M bd. ft. White Fir, 242 M
bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 447 M bd.
ft. for the Sugar Pine, 31 M bd.
ft. Hemlock. No bid for less than
$26.75 per M bd. ft. for the Doug-
las Fir, $44.10 per M bd. ft. for
the Pondcrosa Pine, $8.20 per M
bd. ft. for the White Fir, $5.70 per
M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar,
$33.50 per M bd. ft. for the Sugar
Pine, $8.80 per M bd. ft. for the
Hemlock, or a total purchase price
of $106,633.95 will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid $7,600.-0-

All timber designated for cut-

ting on Lot 3 (NE'jNWW,) Lot 4

(NWMNWV4), SViNWVi, N!4SW',
Sec. 5, T. 22 S., R. 6 W., W.M.,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 602 M bd. ft. Douglas
f ir, 12 M bd. ft. White Fir. 7 M
bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 7 M bd. ft.
Western Red Cedar, 2 M bd. ft.
Hemlock. No bid for less than
$21.45 per M bd. ft. for the Doug-
las Fir. $7.40 per M bd. ft. for the
wnite Mr, incense Cedar, Western
Red Cedar, and Hemlock, or a
total purchase price of $13,120.10
will be considered. Minimum de-

posit with bid $1,300.00. SALVAGE:
All timber designated for cutting
on iivisii;"4. svMft4. sec. 5. T.
31 S R. 5 W.. W.M.. estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
775 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 3 M
bd. ft. Hemlock. No bid for less
than $18.50 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas Fir, $8.65 per M bd. ft.
for the Hemlock, or a total pur-
chase price of $14.363 45 will he
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $1,350.00.

POLICY CONSIDERED

PORTLAND Ml Policy pro-- 1

posals on natural resources are
being considered here by the Na-- .
tional Assn. of Manufacturers'
committee on conservation.

Several members of the com- -
mittee are meeting Thursday and
Friday. The chairman is Thomas
W. Delzcll, chairman of the board
of 1'ortland General Electric Co.

FROST FREE defrost, the FREEZER
so fast even ice cream always stays firm.
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Pape Bros. $713.23; rniiiips uinceiS287.67; u. Thaekrey S282.74: G

can Linen $30.00; Umpqua Valley
now. S4u.su; Koscourg Lumber Co.
$115.50; Cal. Pac. Utilities $4.72;
Pac. T & T $591.55; DISTRICT
ATTORNEY: Do. Fir $27.00; IBM
$2.85; Pac. T it T $32.30; Rose-
burg Bk. Store $15.00; Sun Print-
ing $112.10; Bert Burgoyne $16.46;
Bancroft - Whitney $25.00; Drs.
Monroe & Hutson $100.00; D n

$15.00; J. Pardon $10.00;
Winston Studio $33.00; ELEC-
TIONS: M & M $10.00; Pac. T &
T $1.45; FURNITURE & FIX-
TURES: Remington Rand $51.52;
HEALTH: Postmaster $30.00; Ber-

gerons Refr. $5.00; Simmons tfc Co.
$7.79; Pac. T & T $42.00; Phillips
Office Supply $193.69; Dr. Mary
souies $74.62; Nurses Travel; B.
C. Smith et al $367.52; Sanitarians
Travel; A. Woody et al $377.16;
West Coast Tel. $16.70; Pierce
Freight Lines $2.17; Surgical Sales
$22.52; Oregon St. Medical $51.50;
New Service Laundry $20.13; Do.
Supply $4.90; Standard Oil $205.91;
Photo Lab. $120.48: Farm Bureau
$60.05; Riverside Motors $519.73;
HOME: G Hinsdale $33.00; Rsbg.
Venetians $10.00: Farm Bureau
$16.14; COPCO $179.73; Oregon Wa-

ter $38.13; Roseburg Garbage $7.- -

00; Gerretsen $4.20; racKer Scott
$36.72; Hudson House $12.68; Farm
Bureau $39.71; The Oregonian $15.-6-

Goettels Supply $29.99; Hudson
House 5113.97; umpqua Kaciio &
Telev. $6.50; DuBois Co. $90.36;
Mt. Hood Soap Co. $66.15; Merck
Sharp & Dohme $16.71; McKay
Drugs $33.54; McKesson & Bobbins
$126.69; Cal. Pac. Utilities $25.84;
Boyd Coffee $36.56; Farmers Brot-
hers $20.20; City Drive In $105.53;
R Johnson $99.60; Melrose Dairy
$161.04; Milani Instit Foods $31.30;
Pac. Fruit & Produce $283.01;
Pattersons Bakery $79.68; Hudson
House $168.66; Umpqua Dairy
$266.80; Valley Wholesale $173.87;
Van Dine Meat $56.61; I'ete veen-str- a

$56.00; Weber's Bakery $5.40;
Roseburg Meat Co. $19.05; JAIL:
Pac. T & T $0.35: Roseburg Gar
bage Disposal $8.00; Hudson House
$9.62; Roseburg Welding & Ma
chine $47.75: Trowbridge blectnc
$18.90; Ira Byrd - Sheriff $1,116.00;
Skylark Cafe $8.35; Do. Comm.
Hospital $6.00; D Jeppesen MD
$34.50; LANDS: Pac. T & T $13.30;
R Kischel $12.00: Lockwood Slo- -

tors $8.01; General Roads $4.82;
Standard Oil $2.89; County Clerk
$2.60; Land Department $10.00;
LIBRARY: Petty Cash $15.00;
Postmaster $20.00; Yakima Stamp
Works $12.50; Roen Office Equip-
ment $2.25; Gaylord Bros. $28.52;
Bros. Dart Industries $99.00; Pac.
T & T $1.60; Rsbg. Bk. Store $42.-6-

Shary Hakanson $24.95; Char
lotte Hyre $24.25: Carol Trimble
$24.75; General Roads $34.26; Sig
Fett $29.02; Shell Oil $19.90; Amer-
ican Book - Prices Current $15.69;
Book of the Month $14.72; Double-da-

& Co. $53.31; Chas. M. Gard-
ner & Co. $23.29; Hertzbergs Wash
Bind $33.34; McNaughton Li-

braries $112.50; Mac Millan Co.
Pub. $85.10; Nat'l Baseball Con.
$1.28; J. K. Gill Co. $1910.36; Rose-

burg Book Store $2.25; PARKS:
Garrett & Eppley $3.00; M & M

$14.25; Rsbg. Bk. Store $3.69; Ore-

gon Water Corp. $1.75; Hotel Ump-
qua $4.00: Shell Oil $3.29; Gerret-se- n

Supply $3.60; Sig Fett $0.54;
Orchard Auto Parts S1.00: Ed
Short Co. $23.47; Taylors Battery
Elec. $3.00; Umpqua Valley Hdw.
$7.95; Do. Mach. & Welding $1.25;
COPCO $26.67; Park Maintenance
$3.00; Moore Steel Service $16.12;
Umpqua Vallev Hdw. $2.34; Chry-stali-

Tile $9.80; Paul Casey $17.-0-

Co. Surveyor $2.10: Moore
Steel Service $10.00; Crane Co.
$13.38; Marshall - Wells $151.95;
Farm Bureau $2.75: Co. Clerk
$3.00; PUBLICATIONS: Myrtle
Creek Mail $91.65; INSURANCE:
Commercial Ins. Agency S332.37;
SUPERINTENDENT: F. Beards-le- y

$10.00; Business Equipment
Center $82.80; Pac. T 4 T $32.87;
K. Barneburg $146.81; W. Dodd
$41.52; SHERIFF: Cal. Pac. Utili
ties $24.78; Pac. T & T $38.80;
Rsbg. Bk. Store $9.05; West Coast
Tel $19.35; Photo Lab. $21.00;
Western Union $12.01; Carl Smith
et al $225.00; Sterling Oil $6.07;
Gen. Petroleum $71.05; Carter Tire
$63.00; Hansen Motor $327.91; Love
Pontiac $47.40; Union Garage $11.-5-

Young Chev. $2.50; Standard
Oil $69.12; Union Oil $45.52; Rich-

field Oil $159.21; General Petrol
$31.02; Shell Oil $122.94; Tidewater
Oil $113.73; The Texas Co. $52.-8-

Harlan Melton $7.50; Ben Zen-o- r

$10.00; I. Byrd $20.00; O. Shana-fel- t

$17.84; H Donnelly $11.00; H
Eaton $20.00; Suiters Bldg. Supply
$1.44; Photo Lab $14.28; CIVILIAN
DEFENSE: E Roelle $196.97;
Planning Comm $4.00; Pac. T &
T $16.05; J Pierce $25.00; COPCO:
$17.52; D Bennett $20.00; Felts
Flying Service $15.00: Secretary of
State $3.00; TAX DEPARTMENT:
Koke Chapman $292.08; M & M
$32.10; Rsbg. Bk. Store $16.40;
Tidewater Oil $3.89: Pitney Bowes
Inc. $82.19; SOLDIER'S SAILOR'S
ASSISTANCE: Pac. T & T SO. 70:
Anderson Market $35.00; Camas
Vallev Store $8.00; City Drive In
$55.00; Drager Food Center $8.00;
Hotel Grand $7.00; Harris Cafe
$15.00; Rhoads Grocery $45.00;
City Drive In Mkt. $161.00; Pear-
sons Market $15.00; Nielsens Mar-
ket $75.00; Safeway Store $103.00:
Rsbg. Meat $10.00; Model Market
$18.00; SUPPLIES: Rsbg. Bk.
Store $2.94; SURVEYOR: Pac. T
& T $5.15; Rsbg. Bk. Store $5.80;
Rsbg. Prtg. $49.75: F Darby $19.- -

10 oianaara un D2.4a ksde. bk.
S'ore $66.50; Farm Bureau $1.53;
U m Va"cy "dw $9J.5;
TREASURER: Do. Fir Prtg. Co.
$45.50; Koke Chapman $13.57; Fri- -

oen Calculating Machine 532.00;
Pac. T it T $0.50; WATER RE-
SOURCES: Co. Clerk $8 00; Pac.
T 4 T $21.20; Rsbg. Bk. Store
$0.23; Gerretsen Supply $1.50;
Rsbg. Bk. Store $0.80; Photo Lab.
$8.88; Co. Surveyor $19.90; Glen-dal- e

Tel. $2.90; Carter Tire $23.70;
Kilham Stationery $7.09: Railway
Kxpress $3.37; Rsbe. Book Store

Knight $116.50; WATERMASTKR:
.hrhcr $9.28; WELFARE A(S -

ENCIES: Louise Home $5.00; St.

Boat Basin was Leased to
Gcrhardt E Kaufman et ux
of Reedsport by Order.

6 Deed of Correction was Ex-
ecuted to Jacobsen Lumber
Company

7 County Treasurer Ordered to
pay $50.00 from Liquor Law
umorcement Mind for rec
ording tape.
R-- Deed Accepted from J
D Myers et ux in Sec 28
T26S R6W WM

10 Franchise for Water Conduit
granted E G Nelson across
County Kd No. 13

13 Indemnity Claim of Wal
ter t, Reiser ADDroved.

IS Notice of Estimated Assess-
ment for Improvements on
Reston Ave Ordered sent to
Property Owners.
Deed Issued to Marion C

Winebarger for part Lts 1 &
2 Oabbert s Addition to Myr-
tle Creek.
Ordered that Deed be Exe
cuted to Kiwanis Club of
Glide, the Contract having
been completed.

15 Order made and signed by
the Court Dividing Douglas
County into Five Districts
and Appointing a fifth Vet-
erinarian.

20 Order filed Vacating a Cer-

tain Designated Portion of
the Townsite of Gardiner.
Supplemental Rules and Re-

gulations for the Use and
Administration of Winchester
Bay & Boat Basin were Ap-

proved by the Court.
25 Claim of Ray Wright for In-

demnity Approved.
Property Owners Ordered
Notified of Estimated As-

sessments for Improvement
of Eden Lane.
Completed Improvements of
Lombardy Drive duly Accept-
ed by the Court.

29 Reappointment of D. L. Tay-
lor to the Housing Authority
and Lester F Nielsen Ap-

pointed to fill an unexpired
term of the same Board Ap-

proved.
31 A R-- Deed Accepted to

Correct former Deed.
Order Giving Notice of As-

sessment to Property Own-

ers signed.
Dated June 11, 1957.

CHAS. DOERNER
County Clerk

GENERAL COUNTY
WARRANTS ISSUED FOR
MONTH OF MAY 1957: ASSES-
SOR: Abrams Aerial Survey $320.- -

00; Co. Surveyor $54.85; Pierce
Freight Lines $2.00; Simmons Car-
bon S4.59; Koke - Chapman $24.-3-

IBM Corp. $2.85; Kilham Stry.
& Prtg. $11.88; Marshall Valuation
$20.00 F. Harvey $2.00; Pac. T &
T $11.25: Rsns. Bk. Store $5.59:
Rsbe. Prtg. $209.15: Standard Oil
$27.56; Union Oil $12.38; Shell Oil
$7.08: Tidewater Oil $24.87: Han.
sen Mtr. $4.00; Phillips Office Sup
ply $3.25; State Tax t'omm; 53700.-00- ;

BOUNTY & PREDATORY AN
IMALS: Bobcats at $2.50 ea. paid
to each of the following: D Rush-to-

V. Anderson; G Cutlip; D

Mowry; J Ivey $5.00; E Oldfield
$7.50: J Bratton $7.50: V Ander
son $10.00; J Jackson $45.00; G
Bonnev $7.50: Mrs. G. Dyer $7.50;
J Friend $10.00; R Camp $7.50; D
ruckett S7.50; u Kusnton ss.uu;
Coyotes at $10.00 ea. paid to each
of the following: R Bonney; W

Henry; R Weaver; G Looney; J
Jackson S20.00; G Bonney $60.00;
S Long $70.00; Cougars at $10.00
ea. paid to eacn of tne following:
N Combs $10.00; A Roberts $20.00;
J Jackson $30.00; N Combs;
CLEKK: Atlas Stamp & Die $41.-4-

D & L Stationers $18.50; Dun-

ham Printing $300.50; n

$1.48; M & M $14.15; Recordak
$53.78; Pac. T4T $6.60: Rsbg. Bk
St. $19.74: Sun Printing $51.65;
Roens Office Equipment $11.25;
Chas. Doerner $15.00; CORO-

NER'S: L Powers $27.40; R Ganz
$0.60; V Little $3.50; L Powers $4.-0-

J Grabow MD $50.00: W Hunt-
er $25.00; G Lenci MD $50.00;
Munroe & Hutson MDS $75.00; Do.
Comm. Hospital $40.00; CIRCUIT
COURT: Postmaster $1.93; M &

M $53.46; Pac. T & T $2.65; Rsbg.
Bk. Store $1.07; Sun Printing $7.-2-

Wayne Sterns $8.75; Trial
Jurv Fees & Mileage; Geo. Dame-woo- d

et al $493.52; Trial Witness
Fees $6.00; Hotel Umpqua $14.75;
Dr. Wainscott $30.00; R Mooers
MD $35.00; B Shoemaker MD $10.-0-

E Stewart MD $10.00; D Dole
$15.00; Wm. Green $15.00; J Horn
$30.00; COUNTY COURT: M & M

$46.40; Moriarty's Service $18.00;
Pac. T & T $14.20; F Ashley $3.90;
Co. Surveyor $46.40; W Garrett

i $.15.00; Nissen Motor $21.34; Union
Oil $6.36; Richfield Oil $3.25; Shell
Oil $3.28; DISTRICT COURT: Ko-k- c

Chapman $233.40; M & M $27.-1-

Pac. T & T $1.35; Roseburg
Book Store $13.28; Roseburg Print-in- ?

$25.65; Jury Fees & Mileage
$228.98; Witness Fees & Milcace
$63.60: DISTRICT COURT CON-

STABLE: Pac. T & T $2.05; Rsbg.
Bk. Store $5.08: Hansen Motor $16

16; Richfield Oil $20.89; Shell Oil
ti hi. r iiTCTirp
PEACE - Cala'pooia: 'V Watson
$40 00; DRAIN: Drain Enterprise,
S4.50; De La Vergne $40.00; GLEN
DALE: A Mohr $40.00: REEDS
PORT: West Coast Tel. $21.05; J

t R Office Appliance $2.90; R
Goodwin $40.00; SOUTH DOUG-

LAS DISTRICT: Cal. Pac. Utilities
$7 15; Nina Pietzold $8 39; N Piet-zol-

$40 00: JUVENILE: Co. Sur-

veyor $1.30: Sutherlin Sun $64.40;
Pac. T & T $25.95; Roseburg Book
Store $11.21; Roens Office Equip-
ment $139; Myrtle Creek Mail

the above entitled court in the above
entitled cause, to me directed and dated
the 6th dav of June. Ias7. based UDOn

Default Judgment and Decree render-
ed and entered In said court on the 5th
dav of June. 1957, in favor of National
Lite Insurance Company, a Vermont
corporation, plaintiff, and aKaliul Jack

Palmer and Lola M. Palmer, hus-
band and wife, defendants, for the sum

S10.:iO2.Hl), with interest thereon at
the rate of 4'i'i per annum from
March 1. lDM, to date nf payment; plus
the further sum of S9 00 late fees, and
for the further sum of 127.00 title ex-

pense involved In the suit, and for the
further sum of $750.00 for attorney's
fees, and for Its costs and disburse-
ments herein Incurred, less the sum of
$46.70. the remaining balance of $120.09
previously paid by the mortgagors aft-
er the payment of $113.20 for fire in
surance renewal premium therefrom as
required Dy tne Mortgage and complainton file, and the costs of and upon this
writ, commanding me to make sale of
the following described real properly
situated in the County of Douglas, state
of Oregon, legally described as follows,

All of Lot Three HI, Block Two C21.

AMENDED PLAT OP SOUTH
SLOPES, within the corporate limits
of the City of Winston, Douglas
County, Oregon.
NOW. THEREFORE, by virtue of

said Execution and Default Judgment
and Decree In compliance with the com
mands of said writ. I will on the 15th
day of July. 1957, at 2:i0 pa, at the
south front door of the Douglas County
Court House in Roseburg, Oregon, sell at
public auction and subject to redemption.
to tne highest hinder for cash In hand,
all the right, title ami interest which
the above named defendants had on the
5th day of June, 1957, the date of said
judgment, or thereafter had in and to
the above described real property or
any part thereof, to satisfy said Execu-
tion and Default Judgment and Decree
and interest costs and accruing costs.

Dated at Rosetuirg, Oregon, this 14th
day of June, 1957.

IRA C. BYRD
Sheriff of Douglas County, Ore.
Ilv Margaret Emmitt, Deputy

Date of First Publication: June 14, 1957
Date of Last Publication: July 5, Hl.i7

House Approves Water
Project- - Funds Bill

WASHINGTON IA Legislation
carrying funds for construction of
water projects in the coming year
moved to he Senate Thursday,

The bill 'passed late Wednesday
by the House earries a total of
$814,813,023, which is 7 per cent
under President fciscnhnwcr s
budget recommendations and

under last year's appro-
priation.

in passing it on a voice vote,
the House took the bill exactly as
it was reported last week by its
Appropriations committee.

Hie bulk of tne lunds m the
measure is for construction and
operation of reclamation, flood
control, navigation, and hydroelec
tric projects.

TO DESTROY PEACHES

SACRAMENTO. Calif. Wl --The
Slate Agriculture Department ap
proved Wednesday the destruction
of 16 per cent of California's 1957

cling peach crop to counteract an
anticipated Heavy surplus.

The Cling Peach Advisory Board
recommended the elimination aft-

er surveys indicated the 1957 crop
will total 680,000 tons or an esti-

mated 20 per cent more than
market demands.

SEE OUR BARGAIN
DEPARTMENT AND

SAVE!!
Wo hova many items available
in floor covering, plumbing,
cabinets, hardware, ceramic
tile, counter topping, paint,
fireplace sets, etc.

COEN COMPANY
SUPPLY

Flood and Mill Sts.

Just Spray tho Stems or
Foliage

Full Pint Size Treats Up
to 400 Plants

Ready Mixed

Easy to Use

Contains 10 PPM
(10 Parts Per Million)

African violets grew more erect,

produced lovely, hcolthy, more

pointed leaves. House and gar-

den flowers, ornomentolt, tree

seedlings, even turf grassot re-

spond more vigorously to tho
first treatment of t. Just

sproy it on foliage or the stems
and too how fott they grow,

with Gibberellins is

making revolutionary horticul-

tural news. It's not a hormone
. not a fertilizer , . . but

0 culture grown in o liquid
medium similor to the process
used in production of ontibiotict.

Stop in at Pay Less today and

buy , . . take it home
and try it . . , you'll tee the
difference in your plants ond
flowers.

V.VCU I"Q2H
FROST FREE

disposes of FRECZER
defrost water automatical "m

& --.A'

W. Swan $328.92; D. Swinehart
$350.65; O. Fox $320.52; J. Baker
$300.52; H. Kaiser $342.43; V. Jen-
nie $316.07; H. Couey $326.07; W.
Hyde $326.89; W. McCraw $328.92; to
C. Coffell $323.15: R. Kinyon $329.- -
92; R. Green $255.17; R. Davie in
$48.26; F. Hogg $68.83; F. Under-
wood $285.36; R. Earp $312.12; B,
Beal $247.81; Ed Johnson $279.97;
W. Smithee $262.82: J. Stubbs $175..

64; E. Rand $368.00; A. Olson $201.- -
76; C. Brown $282.55; C. Baker
$296.23; J. Harp $306.87; H. Peach ot
$287.34; W. Elliott $252.74; F. Moss
$391.09; T. Cox $270.05; L. Starnes
$289.42; D. Owens $412.52; L. Olson! 3

$281.74; F. Alberding $301.04; D.
Carnes $285.59; W. Cooper $267.49;
J. Davis $252.74; A. Hall $281.75;
C. Holteen $287.19; A. Moore $291.-3-

J. Pine $262.74; J. Sojka $257.-1-

F. Willhoit $169.31; B. Chasteen
$118.65; H. Gallap $386.23; G. Kin-cai- d

$374.17; C. Packer $279.72;
K. Neavoll $286.87; J. McClinton
$281.75; J. Stigers $316.02; J. Pack-
er $284.13; D. Johnston $284.04; R.
Langholff $355.29; O. Powell $301.-3-

D. Sand $315.10; W. Wilson
$286.87; E. Duerksen $319.72; O.
Polk $289.72; Ed Thiele $299.72; W.
Corn $376.85; S. Darby $359.02;
P. Maresch $298.23; L. Swinford
$285.75; P. Backlund $347.43; D.
Bolsinger $277.26; D. Coffell $354.-2-

E. Erickson $339.74; O. Garrett
$317.98; J. Gilliland $297.97: R.
Griffin $351.86; D. Hardman $347.- -

04: L. Johnston $315.42; F. Koehler
$269.14; M. Ludwig $351.88: F. Mill-
er $325.25; G. Murphv $307.28; A.
Oliver $348.55; C. Payne $370.00; S.
Price $320.32; B. Starnes $230.84;
I. Stembridge $338.38: T. Swinford
$193.80; J. Toi $326.55; R. Turpin
S3.i5.yi: is. vance S283.31: v. Win
dom $360.78; II. Eaton $219.68; V.
Anderson $147.63; II. Goodmanson
S339.20; S. Colley $324.65; F.
Moore $259.16; L. Surgeon Jr.
$267.00; C. Minter $270.93; E. Cox
$233.75; C. Palmatcer $242.50; W
Hughes $347.31; M. Goin $314.88;
F. Rountree S256.67; H. Arrowood

Ducharme $262.10: W. Maurer
$305.49; B. Idema $285.59: R. Gav-
nor $254.65; J. Pepper $239.97; V.
Wolfer $289.82; J. Hughes $279.42;
L. Hughev S347.31; J. Davidson
$208.44; L. Murphey $267.71: J.
Hamrick $270.85; H. Hyde $277.93;
D. Morgan $275.04; F. Bowles
S254.72; M. Eearle $67.55: R.
Springer S66.34; G. Casebeer $308.-6-

D. Chasteen $299.85; D. Earl
$320.81; A. Erwin $336.23; R. Gaug-le- r

$290.94: J. Gribble $321.97; K.
Leonard $301.49; G. Odam 5288.08;
J. Pennington $313.77; E. Sander-
son $355.37; M. Stone $310.91; E,
Weber $282.52; C. Wulff $333.20; W.
Cooper $337.31; C. France $252.55:
H. Lander, K. Conn $287.36; N.
uonn $249.21; W. Carter S272.74;
D. Fast $266.38; S. Swanson $267.-6-

H. Teller $286.86; A. Jones
5249.97; H. Trent $250.92; A. Green
$270.32.
Dated This 11 Ih Day of June, 1957

Charles Doerner
Douglas Co. Clerk

notice of sale of
ki:ai. property

Notice U hereby given that tinder and
pursuant to an order of the Circuit
Court of the Stale of Oregon for Douglas
County, duly made and entered of rec-
ord In the matter of the guardianship
of the estate of Glen W. Shook, a men-

tally diseased person, authorizing the
undersigned as guardian of said Glen
W. Shook, to sell the real property here-
inafter described.

NOW, THEREFORE, I. D maid S. Kel-le-

guardian of the estate of Glen W.

Shook, a mentally diseased person, will
at the law office of Donald S. Kellev.
205 Douglas County State Bank Building.
Hoseburg, Oregon, on and alter the 15th
day of July, 1957, offer at private sale
either for rash in hand or on conditional
contract of sale subject to the confir-
mation by the court, the following de- -

scribed real properly belonging to said
lien w. anook,

The Easterly Fifteen H5 feet of Irt
Eighteen IISI, and all of Lot Nine-
teen U9I and Twenty (201, of Block
20. of the Amended Plat of the Town- -
site of Sutherlin, Oregon

and the following described real prop-
erty:

Beginning at the Northeast corner of
the tract, at an iron rod set In the
ground from which the Northeast
property line corner of Lot 7. Block
2. Plat "A" of Sutherlin Land and
Water Co., the official Plat of which
Is on file and of record In the office
of the County Clerk of Douglas Coun-
ty; Oregon hears North degree 56'
West 500.5 feet: thence South 1 de- -
gree 36' East 100 feet to an Iron rod
set In Hie ground; thence South K8

degrees :i4' West 217 8 feet to an
iron rod set in the ground: thence
North 1 degree 36' West 100 feet to
an Iron rod set In the ground, ihenre
North 118 degrees 34' East 2178 feet
to the place of beginning containing

acre: excepting therefrom
the lane, along the Easterly end nf
the trart, said lane being the South-
erly extension of the lane known as
St. John's Lane in Ixt 8, Block 1 of
said Plat "A" having a width of 25
feet as shown by concrete curbing
on the North side nf Central Avenue
but not shown on said Plat "A".
This one. half acre tract Is a part
and parcel of that tract of land con-

veyed under Certificate of Title No.
8709, Deed No. 12098 as of record In
the office of Ihe County Clerk of
Douglas Countv, Oregon

DONALD S. KF.LT.KY
Guardian of the Estate of
Glen It'. Shook, a mentally
diseased person.

NOTirr OF FINAL KKTTI.EMKNT
NOTICF IS If KKRHV GIVEN that the

u n ft r signed dm in lit rut or of th estate
or td M. Mnl ley, Decerned, hnn filed
In th Cirruit Court of the State of n

for Douglas County nil Finil
in iMtlement of laid estate, and

Monday, June 24. 1937, at 10.00 o'clock
In the forenoon nf laid day, in Circuit
Court Room A in the Con r thou In
Roneburg. Douglm County, Oregon, haa
been fixed the time and the place
for hearing ohltctlon, If anr there be,
to naid final account and for the .settle-
ment thereof.

Dated Mffv 24, 1&V7

JOHN W. SHAFFER. Admlnti-- t
re tor of the Estate of Ida M.

Bailey, Deceased.

NOT ICR OF FIN Al, HFTTI.KM KN'T
Notice it hereby given that the under- -

Igned adminnlrator of the etale nf
F.'lelJe Cainille hpaulding. deceased, hai
filed In the Circuit Court of the State

VcrJttSZfWZX,V.and Mondav. Jun 24. 197. at 10 00
oclork In Ui fo'no'in of said day. In
Ih Circuit Court Room A In the Court-
house In Rnbur(. Douflas County,
Oregon, has been fixed as the lime and
place for hearlnf objections. If any there
he. to said Final Account and for the
settlement thereof.

Dated Msv 34. 1V
PAI'l. K (ir.nrjM. Admlnn.
trator nf Ihe F.itate of Plell
Camilla Spauldlng, Deceased.

A'o mossy defrost
water to empty or
spill !

NEW PLANT GROWTH STIMULANT
THE REFRIGERATOR-FREEZE- R THAT

GIVES YOU COMPLETELY AUTOMATIC

DEFROSTING OF THE FREEZER I

AND THERE'S NO FROST EVER IN THE

REFRIGERATOR SECTION

SEE A WES77NGHOUSE FROST-FRE- DEMONSTRATION Ar

jf
Sro-Fa- st

lUV $ 39
I (rnO'Thst I U Pint

Supply $124.47; Pierce t rcight
Lines $2.00: Pre-Mi- Concrete
$364.74; Reedsport Logging $336.52;
Roens Office Supply $431.50; Rose-

burg Book Store $68.09; Roseburg
Color Center S1.18; Roseburg Glass
Co. $105.16; Roseburg Office Ma-

chines $4.50; Roseburg Sand and
Gravel $5.49; Roseburg Supply
$121.83; Specialized Parts & Equip-
ment $755.23; Stearns Hdw. $2.60;
Frank L. Taylor Hdw. $30.39; Imp-nu- a

Bide. S6.67: UmDO.ua Diesel
Service $31.00; Umpqua Industrial
SuddIv $5.30: Umpqua Valley Hdw.
$17.65; Van Waters and Rogers
$616.00; Walts $8.25; Charles W.

Payne $3.50; Van M. Windom $3.50;
Orville Fox $28.00; L. L. Heath
$65.00; L. Maddox $31.50; Wiley

$35.00; Alaska Junk $3482.-00- :

Do. Supply $1295.35; Jackson
& Giles Motor $1329 96; Allen
Parts & Equip. $99.30: Brent's Ex-

change $61.97; W. J. Burke $28.41;
Clyde Equipment $35.93; Columbia
Equip. $9.54; Consolidated Freight
S3.55; Contractors Equip. S920.92;
Davis Industrial Products $160.41;
"Si" Dillard Motor $21.25; Hansen
Motor $23.16; Howard Cooper $254.-2-

Industrial Supply $264.66; M &

M $53.20; Pac. Chain Saws Inc.
$1.10; Parker Tirecap $864.98;
Pearce Upholstering $20.00; Rays
Truck Parts $122.12; Southern Ore-

gon Battery & Supply $196.95;
Auto Parts $6.12; Barcus Sales
$782.52; J. H. Baxter $528.56; Bcar-in- t

Sales St Service $364.32; Bear
ing Supply $2.40; P. C. Briggs
$5.65; James D. Carter $12.25; City
of Drain $1.00; Cummins Automo-
tive $39.; Electric Steel Foundry
$92.37; Sig Fett $181.68; General
Paint Corp. $84.80; interstate Trac
tor $177.10; Premier Autoware
$39.11; Richfield Oil $3.62; Don
Smith Plumbing $187.73; Sna.j On
Tool $9.15; Timber Tractor $815.68;
Tokheim Pump Agency $185.00;
Underwood Corporation $348.00;
Walts Radiator Shop $43.00; Beck-le- y

& Thomas $15,000.00; Castors
Mixed Concrete $1964.40; Cutler
Mfg. $1188.00; Roseburg Paving
$13003.91; Shell Oil Co. $5790.49;
Whipple Logging $1083.75 Travel
Expense $896.78.
Dated This 7th Day of June, 1957

Charles Doerner
Douglas Co. Clerk

GENERAL ROADS
Miller & Cox Sales Service $421.-1-

Armco Drainage & Metal
Prod. $2771.76; Beckley & Thomas
$1122.85; Cal. Pac. Utilities $98.18;
Carter Tire $3.70; Clark and Und-
er $391.84; Farm Bureau $36 44;
Flegel Supply $266.90; Freightliner
Corp $0.64; Gerretsen Bldg. $14.74;
Rav Harris $85.00; J. E. Hazcltine
4 Co. $166.70; Industrial Electric
$18.86; Loggers & Contractors $981.-1-

C. M. McDermott $89.74; Mar-
shall Wells Co. $537.73; Moore Steel
Service $181.99; Orchard Auto Pts.
$179 04; Oregon Nevada Calif. Frt.
$13.10: Oregon Water $22.29; Pierce
Freight $8.50; Reedsport Motel
$108.00; R i L Service $403.65;
Bill Stock Motors $508 94; Sun
Printing $39.69; Tire Service Co.
$13 61; Union Oil Co. $581.31; J. D.
Wallin $14.00; Wishart Tire Co.
$562.79; Howard Kaiser $35.00.
Dated This 11th Day of June 1957

Charles Doerner
Douglas Co. Clerk

GENERAL ROADS
WARRANTS DRAWN IN PAY- -

jMKNT Or r OK KM AN AND
t'KEWS FOR MONTH OF MAY
1957 FOR GENERAL. ROADS: R

Hasenyawer $301 50; J. (.alley
$271.86; B. Schrank $2.13 47; Wm.
Johnson $2.53 47: A. Smith $267.92:

. Williams $216.12; A. Berkshire
S242 38; K. Bryant $276 23: L. Kand
$219 64 ; 1. Schwrppe $188 03; 1).

pfaff $237.42; H. Koberson $219 97;
L. Patterson $298 60 ; 0. Mote $267.- -

REG.

69.95
CHARCOAL

BRAZIER
Complete with hood and elec-

tric spit with purchaso of any

1957 Westinghouse Frost-Fre- e

Refrigerator.

LIMITED TIME

ONLY

WtflUlTHitVTi UN

0

6

How! . , . tht ntw wonder for
mulo that make! your plant
grow foil, mora beautiful, deep
green leaves and mora erect
stems. Amazing "GroFoit" with
Gibberellic Acid. Science for

years has known that Gibber-

ellic Acid wot a phenomenal
plant growth Substance, But it
couldn't be produced in sufficient

quantities. After intense study
and research, scientists come up
with a practical, effective form
of this plant growth stimulant.
It's the latest horticultural find.

Spectoculor results hove been

reported by leading horticultural
end agricultural scientists. Rote
bushes bloomed and shot up to
twice their normal height, ger-

anium plants to giants.

See A Westinghouse Frost-Fr- c Demonstration at$45.85; Western Inion $6 24: Jl1' ?Ja V

Hollcck $3.95; A Pitchford $25 87; 'rea i $39 .53; Impqua alley
1, Carstensen $10.85; Junction CitvWWR'verside Motors $V- -

Mtr. $100; Dallas Bennett $12.40; 6t9 ;L S,: D.

Hansen Motor $50 90; Standard Oil Jones 1449.25; Dr. Bailey 83520;
t it rin nil i07. ckmi nil Dr. D. Rone $243.50: R. C. Mc- -

$28 45; Tidewater Oil' $10.77: Mrs.
B. Crav $118 00; Mrs. C. Masters
$0 00; Mrs. L. Marshal) $37.50:
Mrs. K. Wellnn $50.00; Wm. Wi-
lliams $10.00: W. Marshall $12 00;
Photo Lab $12 90; COURTHOUSE:
Petty Cah - $3 00; Roseburg Bk.
Store $4 85; COPCO $561.21: Ore-Ro-

Water $33.10; Farm Bureau
$3 78: Oti Elevator $62 21- - Packer
Scott $45 21; Gerretsen $10 00;

Hose Industrial School $3.00; ( till-- ' Iluienbark $176.13; 11. Brown s

Farm Home $15.00; PLAN- - 21; C. Erskine $70 34; II. Carev
NING COMMISSION: County Sur--! $332.96: M. Ormsby $270 52; C.

veyor $1.00; Hoseburg Book Store (joxk $267.67; R. Abcene $263.38;
$2 93; Standard Oil $9.16: Merlford A. Donoho $290.26; I). Thoman
Mail $4.50: The Oreeonian $9 .12: soc? a- .1 fhanr-niin- tou nv 622 S. E. Jackson Phone OR
BU.MJb: K. I., nnippie iM.&;
SPECIAL IMPROVEMENT: Wm.


